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ANORDINANCE 2014-12-11-1006

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL
COST OF $155,000.00: (A) ADVANCED FILTRATION PRODUCTS, LLC,
ALL MATERIALS CONSTRUCTION, LLC, DUSTLESS AIR FILTER CO.
AND JF FILTRATION FOR HVAC DISPOSABLE AIR FILTERS, (B)
WESTERN BRW PAPER FOR COPIER AND PRINTER PAPER, AND (C)
ALAMO DISTRIBUTION, LLC D/B/A ALAMO IRON WORKS FOR
REINFORCED STEEL AND MESH WIRE.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A)
Advanced Filtration Products, LLC, All Materials Construction, LLC, Dustless Air Filter Co.
and JF Filtration for HVAC disposable air filters, (B) Western BRW Paper for copier and printer
paper, and (C) Alamo Distribution, LLC d/b/a Alamo Iron Works for reinforced steel and mesh
wire; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves two contracts awarded to the lowest bidder, and 4
contracts awarded to other than the lowest bidder(s), as the lowest bidder(s) failed to meet the
City’s specifications and/or requirements; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Advanced
Filtration Products, LL.C, All Materials Construction, LLC, Dustless Air Filter Co. and JF
Filtration for HVAC disposable air filters, (B) Western BRW Paper for copier and printer paper,
and (C) Alamo Distribution, LLC d/b/a Alamo Iron Works for reinforced steel and mesh wire on
an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted,
subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance
certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated
herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the contract documents are available for
inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2015 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal
year expenditures are contingent upon future City Council budget approvals.
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SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the bids from Dustless Air Filter Co. (Item 5),
and JF Filtration (Item 5) for HVAC disposable air filters did not meet the specifications.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED AND APPROVED this 11" day of December, 2014.

M A Y O R
Ivy R. Taylor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

ﬁlmﬂv @ MO g T A

aM Vacdk, City C)rk Martha G. Sepeda Actiig City Attorney
y




Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item:

9 (in consent vote: 8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20A, 208, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27,
28, 29, 30, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36A, 36B, 37A, 37B, 38A, 38B, 39A, 39B, 41 )

Date: 12/11/2014
Time: 02:45:24 PM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an
estimated annual cost of $155,000.00: (A) Advanced Filtration Products, LLC, All Materials
Construction, LL.C, Dustless Air Filter Co. and JF Filtration for HVAC disposable air filters, (B)
Western BRW Paper for copier and printer paper, and (C) Alamo Distribution, LLC d/b/a Alamo Iron
Works for reinforced steel and mesh wire. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director,
Finance]
Result: Passed
Not . .
Voter Group P Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X
Keith Toney District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldaria District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X X
http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx 12/12/2014
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

EXHIBIT I

Opened: October 22, 2014
For: Annual Contract for Reinforced Steel & Wire Mesh
Local Non-Local
Alamo Distribution, LLC  [McCoy's Building Supply
d/b/a Alamo iron Works
6100005189 Al 943 AT&T Center Pkwy. [1200 IH 35 North
o Estimated San Antonio, TX San Marcos, TX
Item Description Quantity 78667-1028
210-704-8509
1 Reinforcing Steel
Bar Size No. 3 (3/8") 10,000
Price per 20' each $3.31 $3.29
Extended Price $33,100.00 $32,900.00
Bar Size No. 4 (1/2") 3,000
Price per 20' each $5.48 $5.59
Extended Price $16,440.00 $16,770.00
Bar Size No. 5 (5/8") 300
Price per 20' each $8.55 $8.99
Extended Price $2,565.00 $2,697.00
Bar Size No. 6 (3/4") 20
Price per 20' each $12.32 $13.99
Extended Price $246.40 $279.80
Bar Size No. 7 (7/8") 10
Price per 20' each $16.98 $22.00
Extended Price $169.80 $220.00
Bar Size No. 8 (1) 10
Price per 20' each $22.43 $29.49
Extended Price $224.30 $294.90
Estimated Reinforcing Steel Total $52,745.50 $53,161.70
2 Welded Wire (Flat Sheet)
6" x 6", W2.9 x W2.9 10
Price Each $46.00 $39.99
Extended Price $460.00 $399.90
8' x 20"
Deleted
Estimated Welded Wire Total $460.00] $399.90
3 Smooth Dowels
#4 20
Price per each $0.68 $1.59
Estimated Price $13.60 $31.80
Estimated Smooth Dowel Total $13.60 $31.80
Delivery 5 days 2 Days
Business Hours 7:30 am - 5:00 pm 8am-5pm
Business Days 5 days per week| 6 days per week
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $53,219.10 $53,593.40
Estimated Annual Award $53,219.10,

Item deleted will be re-bid at a later date




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened. September 15, 2014 Non-Local Local
For: Annual Contract for Copier and Printer Paper Western BRW Paper Clampitt Paper
6301 E. Stassney Lane, 3550 Ridgeside Drive
6100004904 CE Bldg. 9, Suite 200
Estimated |Austin,
Item Annual |TX 78744 San Antonio,
Quantities |877-274-0968 TX 78217
9 Color Copy Paper, Assorted Colors, Sub 20# text
9a 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 20# text weight 25,000 ea $7.71 $9.88
9a Price Total $192.75 $247.00
9b 11" x 17" Sub 20# text weight 12,500 ea $16.33 $20.82
Sb Price Total $204.13 $260.25
Item Sub-Total $396.88 $507.25
10 Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital Printers,
2 Part NCR
10a 8 1/2" x 11" reversed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $13.12 $15.73
10a Price Total $656.00 $786.50
10b 8 1/2" x 14" reversed sequence, 20# 25,000 ea $16.68| $20.01
10b Price Total $417.00] $500.25
10c 9" x 11" vertical perforation, reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $13.82 $29.30
10c Price Total $138.20 $293.00
10d 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, 10,000 ea $13.82 $28.74
20#
10d Price Total $138.20] $287.40
Item Sub-Total $1,349.40] $1,867.15
1 Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital Printers,
3 Part NCR
11a 8 1/2" x 11" reversed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $14.77 $17.70
11a Price Total $738.50] $885.00
11b 8 1/2" x 14" reversed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $18.79 $22.53
11b  |Price Total $939.50] $1,126.50
11¢c 9" x 11" vertical perforation, reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $15.53 $32.87
11c  |Price Total $155.30 $328.70
11d 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, 10,000 ea $15.53 $32.25
204#
11d Price Total $155.30 $322.50
[tem Sub-Total $1,988.60 $2,662.70
12 Digital Carbonless Paper for High Speed Digital Printers,
4 Part NCR
12a 8 1/2" x 11" reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $15.77 $18.62
12a Price Total $157.70 $186.20
12b 8 1/2" x 14" reversed sequence, 20# 50,000 ea $20.09 $23.68
12b  {Price Total $1,004.50 $1,184.00
12c 9" x 11" vertical perforation, reversed sequence, 20# 10,000 ea $16.62 $35.19
12¢ Price Total $166.20 $351.90
12d 8 1/2" x 11 1/2" horizontal perforation, reversed sequence, 10,000 ea $16.62 $34.52
20#
12d Price Total $166.20] $345.20
Item Sub-Total $1,494.60] $2,067.30
Sub-Total $48,094.88, $53,049.25
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 1%
Sub -Total with Prompt Payment Discount $48,094.88 $52,518.76
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 9.20%
Price Difference $4,423.88
Payment Term Net 30 1% 10 Days
Estimated Annual Total $48,094.88 $53,049.25
Estimated Annual Award $48,094.88

Deleted: items 2A-F, 4C, and 4D will be rebid at a later date.




City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: August 13, 2014 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for HVAC Disposable Air Filters Advanced Filtration All Materials Construction  [Dustless Air Filter JF Fiitration Inc. Filtration Products Pure Air Filter Co. inc.
Products
3101 Longhorn Blvd. #116 {1532 Lorelei Lane 11515 N. Weidner Rd. 4707 NW Industrial 1218 North Hackberry 4743 Whirlwind Dr.
6100004680 SM Austin, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antenio, San Antonio, San Antonie,
Est. Annuaj [TX 78758 TX 78130 TX 78233 TX 78238 TX 78202 TX 78217
tem Description Quantity |512-834-2237 830-515-6623 210-653-5300 210-946-1688
1
DELETED
2 PLEATED TYPE AIR CONDITIONING
FILTERS, CARBON IMPREGNATED
16" x 20" x 2" 125
Price Each $6.75 $16.57 $6.16 $6.70 No Bid $5.41
Price Total $843.75 $2,071.25 $770.00 $837.50 $676.25
16" x 25" x 2" 125
Price Each $8.70 $19.49 $7.41 $6.95 No Bid $6.58
Price Total $1,087.50 $2,436.25 $926.25 $868.75 $822.50
17 7/8" x 17 718" x 2" 125
Price Each $13.25 $21.95 $5.10 $10.75 No Bid $9.20
Price Total $1,656.25 $2,743.75 $637.50 $1,343.75 $1,150.00
24" x 24" x 2" 250
Price Each $10.59 $24.78 $6.22 $10.99 No Bid $9.09
Price Total $2,647.50 $6,195.00 $1.555.00| $2,747.50 $2,272.50
Total item 2 $6,235.00 $13,446.25 $3,888.75: $5,797.50 No Bid $4,921.25
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $6,110.30 $13,042.86 $3,888.75 $5,797.50 $4,921.25
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 0.00%
Price Differential $0.00
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model OdorBan/Quality Airguard Koch OdorKleen 250 Flanders/Pre Pleat AC Kleen Air/Kleen Carbon
3 SYNTHETIC MEDIA DUAL PLY ROLL
FILTERS, Avg. Eff. 15-20%
22"x 90" x 1" 5
Price Each $12.10 $11.85 $23.25 $66.00 No Bid $33.86
Price Total $60.50 $59.25 $116.25 $330.00 $169.30
32"x90"x 1" 5
Price Each $17.60 $17.25 $34.53 $96.00 No Bid $49.24
Price Total $88.00 $86.25 $172.65 $480.00 $246.20
36" x 90" x 1" 5
Price Each $19.80 $19.41 $37.67 $108.00 No Bid $55.40
Price Total $99.00 $97.05 $188.35 $540.00 $277.00
48" x 90" x 1" 5
Price Each $26.40 $25.86 $50.22 $144.00 No Bid $73.88
Price Totat $132.00 $129.30 $251.10 $720.00 $369.40
60" x 90" x 1" 5
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: August 13, 2014 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for HVAC Disposable Air Filters Advanced Filtration Al Materials Construction Dustless Air Filter JF Filtration Inc. Filtration Products Pure Air Filter Co. Inc.
Products
3101 Longhorn Blvd. #116 |1532 Lorelei Lane 11515 N. Weidner Rd. 4707 NW Industrial 1218 North Hackberry 4743 Whirlwind Dr.
6100004680 SM Austin, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Est. Annual {TX 78758 TX 78130 TX 78233 TX 78238 TX 78202 TX 78217
item Description Quantity  {512-834-2237 830-515-6623 210-653-5300 210-946-1688
Price Each $33.00 $32.35 $62.78 $180.00 No Bid $92.34
Price Total $165.00 $161.75 $313.90 $300.00 $461.70
72"x 90" x 1" 5
Price Each $39.60 $38.81 $75.33 $216.00 No Bid $110.80
Price Total $198.00 $194.05 $376.65 $1,080.00 $554.00
Total ltem 3 $742.50 $727.65 $1,418.90 $4,050.00 No Bid $2,077.60
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $727.65 $705.82 $1,418.90 $4,050.00 $2,077.60
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 101.03%
Price Differential $713.08
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model 0100 Media/FGI Airguard Green Leaf AFT/G4T Media Polyester Fibers/HP-100BT
4
DELETED
5 CAMSORB RIGA-CARB CARBON
FILTERS, or approved equal NAS NAS
12" x 24" x 12" 50
Price Each $277.56 $363.27 $98.00 $199.00 No Bid $308.67
Price Total $13,878.00 $18,163.50 $4,900.00 $9,9850.00 $15,433.50
24" x24"x 12" 50
Price Each $390.92 $420.04 $150.00 $285.00 No Bid $435.09
Price Total $19,546.00 $21,002.00 $7,500.00 $14,250.00 $21,754.50
Total tem 5 $33,424.00 $39,165.50 $12,400.00 $24,200.00 No Bid $37,188.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $32,765.52 $37,990.54 $12,400.00 $24,200.00 $37,188.00
Percentage between lowest responsibie bid
and local bid N/A 13.53%
Price Differential $4,432.48
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model CamSorb/Camfil Farr Airguard *Kach DuraKieen *Flanders/Surge Flow Airguard/Vari-Klean
6 TRI-DEK 3 PLY LINK FILTERS, 15/40, or
approved equal
16" x 40" 25
Price Each $5.90 $8.15 $7.55 $7.44 No Bid $7.13
Price Total $147.50 $203.75 $188.75 $186.00 $178.25
16" x 64" 50
Price Each $11.78 $25.10 $11.32 $11.75 No Bid $14.04
Price Total $589.00 $1,255.00 $566.00 $587.50 $702.00
20" x 45" 50
Price Each $10.40 $12.16 $8.80 $9.50 No Bid $10.44
Price Total $520.00 $608.00 $440.00 $475.00 $622.00
20" x 60" 25
Price Each $11.45 $13.74 $11.59 $12.39 No Bid $12.47
Price Total $286.25 $343.50 $289.75 $309.75 $311.75
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: August 13, 2014 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for HVAC Disposable Air Filters Advanced Filtration All Materials Construction Dustless Air Filter JF Filtration Inc. Filtration Products Pure Air Filter Co. Inc.
Products
3101 Longhorn Blvd. #116 {1532 Lorelei Lane 11515 N. Weidner Rd. 4707 NW Industrial 1218 North Hackberry 4743 Whirlwind Dr.
6100004680 SM Austin, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antanio,
Est. Annual |TX 78758 TX 78130 TX 78233 TX 78238 TX 78202 TX 78217
tern Description Quantity |512-834-2237 830-515-6623 210-653-5300 210-946-1688
20" x 86" 25
Price Each $16.73 $32.75 $17.64 $18.59 No Bid $21.00
Price Total $418.25 $818.75 $441.00 $464.75 $525.00
20" x 90" 25
Price Each $20.82 $24.32 $17.64 $18.59 No Bid $21.00
Price Total $520.50 $608.00 $441.00 $464.75 $525.00
25" x 45" 25
Price Each $13.23 $25.10 $9.89 $10.50 No Bid $12.47
Price Total $330.75 $627.50 $247.25 $262.50 $311.75
25" x 112" 50
Price Each $29.67 $33.49 $25.05 $27.50 No Bid $29.04
Price Total $1,483.50 $1,674.50 $1,252.50 $1,375.00 $1,452.00
25" x 140" 300
Price Each $36.43 $39.15 $30.98 $29.50 No Bid $35.51
Price Total $10,929.00 $11,745.00, $9,294.00 $8,850.00 $10,653.00
Total ltem 6 $15,224.75 $17,884.00 $13,160.25| $12,975.25 No Bid $15,180.75
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $14,920.26 $17,347.48 $13,160.25 $12,975.25 $15,180.75
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 1.43%
Price Differential $185.00
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model 3 Ply Link/FGI ATI Koch Maxi-Grid Columbus/Surge Stop G3/Ultimate Panel 3ply
Local Preference Award $13,160.25
7
DELETED
8
DELETED
5 KOCH MULTI-PLEAT XL8-HC, MERV 8,
Avg. Eff. 30-35%, or approved equal
20"x25"x 2" 24
Price Each $3.08| $4.06 $4.31 $5.24 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $73.92 $97.44 $103.44 $125.76
16" x 25" x 2" 24
Price Each $2.78 $3.36 $3.64 $4.44 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $66.72 $80.64 $87.36 $106.56
Total ltem 9 $140.64 $178.08 $190.80 $232.32 No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $137.83 $172.74 $190.80 $232.32
Percentage between lowest responsible bid
and local bid 38.43%
Price Differential $52.97
Manufacturer/Brand andfor Model NovaPleat/FGi Airguard Koch Multi-Pleat Green Glassfloss/Huxun
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: August 13, 2014 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for HVAC Disposable Air Filters Advanced Filtration All Materials Construction  |Dustless Air Filter JF Filtration Inc. Filtration Products Pure Air Filter Co. Inc.
Products
3101 Longhorn Blvd. #116 1532 Lorelei Lane 11515 N. Weidner Rd. 4707 NW Industrial 1218 North Hackberry 4743 Whirlwind Dr.
6100004680 SM Austin, New Braunfels, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Est. Annual |TX 78758 TX 78130 TX 78233 TX 78238 TX 78202 TX 78217
tem Description Quantity |512-834-2237 830-515-6623 210-653-5300 210-946-1688
10 KOCH MULTI-PLEAT GREEN 13, Avg.

Eff. 80-85%, or approved equal
24"x 24" x 4" 140
Price Each $17.64 $24.35 $20.20 $16.37 No Bid No Bid
Price Total $2,469.60 $3,409.00 $2,828.00 $2,291.80]
Total tem 10 $2,469 .60 $3,409.00 $2,828.00 $2,291.80 No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 3% 0% 0%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $2,420.21 $3,306.73 $2,828.00| $2,291.80
Percentage betwaen lowest responsible bid 23.40%
Price Differential $536.20
Manufacturer/Brand and/or Model DP13/Airguard Airguard{ Koch Multi-Pleat Green 13 Flanders/Merv 13 Pleat
Payment Terms 2% 10 Days 3% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Days Net 30
Delivery 3 days 10 days 5 days 5 days 14 days 21 days
Estimated Annual Total $32,893.35 $705.82 $17,049.00 $2,291.80 $0.00 $0.00
Estimated Annual Award $32,893.35 $705.82 $17,049.00 $2,291.80 $0.00 $0.00

* lem 5: The first and second lowest bidders did not meet the required specifications. Item awarded to third lowest bidder, which met the specifications.

ltems 1, 4, 7, and 8 were deleted (no longer required) and will not be re-bid at a later date.
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:. September 15, 2014 Non-Local Local
For: Annual Contract for Copier and Printer Paper Western BRW Paper Clampitt Paper
6301 E. Stassney Lane, 3550 Ridgeside Drive
6100004904 CE Bldg. 9, Suite 200
Estimated |Austin,
Item Annual [TX 78744 San Antonio,
Quantities |877-274-0968 TX 78217
1 #1 Grade Color Copy Smooth 96 Brightness, White
1a |8 1/2" x 11 Sub 28/70# text weight 250,000 ea $15.64 $11.64
1a Price Total $3,910.00 $2,910.00
1b 11" x 17" Sub 28/70# text weight 125,000 ea $32.53 $24.40
1b Price Total $4,066.25 $3,050.00
1c 12" x 18" Sub 28/70# text weight 85,000 ea $37.56] $28.19
1c Price Total $3,192.60 $2,396.15
1d 13" x 19" Sub 28/70# text weight 85,000 ea $42.96 $39.97
1d Price Total $3,651.60 $3,397.45
Item Sub-Total $14,820.45] $11,753.60
2 Deleted
3 Color Copy "Bright Hue", Assorted Colors, Text Weight
3a 8 1/2" x 11" Sub 24/60# text weight 20,000 ea $12.60 $16.55
3a Price Total $252.00 $331.00
3b 11" x 17" Sub 24/60# text weight 20,000 ea $26.26| $33.10
3b Price Total $525.20 $662.00
Item Sub-Total $777.20 $993.00
4 Color Copy "Bright Hue", Assorted Colors, Cover Weight
4a 8 1/2" x 11" 65# cover weight 50,000 ea $25 .46 $32.73
4a Price Total $1,273.00] $1,636.50
4b 11" x 17" 65# cover weight 125,000 ea $53.03 $65.46
4b Price Total $6,628.75 $8,182.50
Item Sub-Total $7,901.75 $9,819.00
4c Deleted
4d Deleted
5 Economy Color Copy, White, 80# text
5a 11" x 17" Sub 80# text weight 25,000 ea $22.09 $26.66
5a Price Total $552.25) $666.50
5b 12" x 18" Sub 80# text weight 25,000 ea $25.65 $30.47
5b Price Total $641.25 $761.75
Item Sub-Total $1,193.50 $1,428.25
6 Economy Color Copy Gloss, White, 100# text
6a 11" x 17" Sub 100# text weight 50,000 ea $27.79 $33.01
6a Price Total $1,389.50 $1,650.50
6b 12" x 18" Sub 100# text weight 25,000 ea $32.07 $38.09
6b Price Total $801.75, $952.25
Item Sub-Total $2,191.25 $2,602.75
7 Economy Color Copy Gloss, White, 80# cover
7a 11" x 17" Sub 80# cover weight 75,000 ea $43.31 $51.32
7a Price Total $3,248.25 $3,849.00
7b 12" x 18" Sub 80# cover weight 50,000 ea $49.28 $58.81
7b Price Total $2,464.00 $2,940.50
7c 13" x 19" Sub 80# cover weight 25,000 ea $56.75 $67.72
7c Price Total $1,418.75 $1,693.00
ltem Sub-Total $7,131.00 $8,482.50
8 Economy Color Copy Gloss, White, 100# cover
8a 11" x 17" Sub 100# cover weight 75,000 ea $53.76 $67.36
8a Price Total $4,032.00 $5,052.00
8b 12" x 18" Sub 100# cover weight 50,000 ea $61.98 $73.95
8b Price Total $3,099.00 $3,697.50
8c 13" x 19" Sub 100# cover weight 25,000 ea $68.77 $84.65
8c Price Total $1,719.25 $2,116.25
Item Sub-Total $8,850.25] $10,865.75




