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10/15/15
Item No. 6

ANORDINANCE 2015-10-15-0868

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $2,110,000.00: (A) SAN ANTONIO BELTING &
PULLEY CO., INC. FOR HYDRAULIC, AIR, WATER, FUEL, &
INDUSTRIAL HOSE & FITTINGS, (B) PARADIGM TRAFFIC
SYSTEMS, INC. FOR TYPE 170E CONTROLLER ASSEMBLIES &
EQUIPMENT, (C) SOUTHWEST COMPANIES LTD. D/B/A
SOUTHWEST WHEEL AND GENUINE PARTS COMPANY FOR
MEDIUM & HEAVY TRUCK TRAILER DRUM & BRAKE PARTS, (D)
DECCAN INTERNATIONAL, INC. FOR DECCAN COMPUTER
AIDED DISPATCH (CAD) COMPONENT MAINTENANCE AND
SUPPORT TO INCLUDE ADDITIONAL SOFTWARE LICENSES,
AND (E) US DIGITAL DESIGNS, INC. FOR FIRE STATION
ALERTING SYSTEM (FSAS) MAINTENANCE & SUPPORT TO
INCLUDE FUTURE BUILD-OUT UPGRADES AND COMPUTER
AIDED DISPATCH (CAD) SYSTEM COMPONENT MAINTENANCE
& SUPPORT.

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) San
Antonio Belting and Pulley Co., Inc. for hydraulic, air, water, fuel and industrial hose & fittings,
(B) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. for type 170E controller assemblies and equipment, (C)
Southwest Companies, Ltd. d/b/a Southwest Wheel and Genuine Parts Company for medium
and heavy truck trailer drum and brake parts, (D) Deccan International, Inc. for Deccan
computer aided dispatch (CAD) component maintenance and support to include additional
software licenses, and (E) US Digital Designs, Inc. for fire station alerting system (FSAS)
maintenance and support to include future build-out upgrades and computer aided dispatch
(CAD) system component maintenance and support; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves one low bid contract, one contract awarded to other than
the low bidder(s) because the low bidder(s) did not meet the City’s specifications or
requirements, and two sole source contracts; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) San Antonio
Belting and Pulley Co., Inc. for hydraulic, air, water, fuel and industrial hose & fittings, (B)
Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. for type 170E controller assemblies and equipment, (C)
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Southwest Companies, Ltd. d/b/a Southwest Wheel and Genuine Parts Company for medium and
heavy truck trailer drum and brake parts, (D) Deccan International, Inc. for Deccan computer
aided dispatch (CAD) component maintenance and support to include additional software
licenses, and (E) US Digital Designs, Inc. for fire station alerting system (FSAS) maintenance
and support to include future build-out upgrades and computer aided dispatch (CAD) system
component maintenance and support on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid
tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required
bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets
are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2016 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals.

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the low bids from O’Reilly Auto Enterprises,
LLC d/b/a O’Reilly Auto Parts for medium and heavy truck trailer drum and brake parts failed to
meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 15" day of October, 2015.

&ua .

M A Y O R

Ivy R. Taylor
ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:
[:’ . { [\ /
Yy i IO %
fjk\ticia M. Vacgk, City Cly{‘k %Martha G. Sepeda, Actir@ City Attorney



Agenda Item:

6 (in consent vote: 5,6,8,9,10,11A, 11B, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 19, 20, 22A, 22B)

Date: 10/15/2015
Time: 10:05:50 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for
an estimated annual cost of $2,110,000.00: (A) San Antonio Belting & Pulley Co., Inc. for hydraulic,
air, water, fuel, & industrial hose & fittings, (B) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. for type 170E
controller assemblies & equipment, (C) Southwest Companies LTD. d/b/a Southwest Wheel and
Genuine Parts Company for medium & heavy truck trailer drum & brake parts, (D) Deccan
International, Inc. for Deccan computer aided dispatch (CAD) component maintenance and support to
include additional software licenses, and (E) US Digital Designs, Inc. for fire station alerting system
(FSAS) maintenance & support to include future build-out upgrades and computer aided dispatch
(CAD) system component maintenance & support. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott,
Director, Finance]
Result: Passed
Not . .
Voter Group Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X X




Agenda Item:

6 (in consent vote: 5,6,8,9,10,11A,11B, 12,13, 15,16, 17, 19, 20, 22A, 22B )

Date: 10/15/2015
Time: 10:50:31 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Reconsider
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for
an estimated annual cost of $2,110,000.00: (A) San Antonio Belting & Pulley Co., Inc. for hydraulic,
air, water, fuel, & industrial hose & fittings, (B) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. for type 170E
controller assemblies & equipment, (C) Southwest Companies LTD. d/b/a Southwest Wheel and
Genuine Parts Company for medium & heavy truck trailer drum & brake parts, (D) Deccan
International, Inc. for Deccan computer aided dispatch (CAD) component maintenance and support to
include additional software licenses, and (E) US Digital Designs, Inc. for fire station alerting system
(FSAS) maintenance & support to include future build-out upgrades and computer aided dispatch
(CAD) system component maintenance & support. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott,
Director, Finance]
Result: Passed
Not 5 i s
Voter Group Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X
Alan Warrick District 2 .4
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 5.3 X
Cris Medina District 7 %
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X X




Agenda Item:

6 (in consentvote: 5,6,8,9,10,11A, 11B, 12, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 22A, 22B )

Date: 10/15/2015
Time: 10:51:02 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for
an estimated annual cost of $2,110,000.00: (A) San Antonio Belting & Pulley Co., Inc. for hydraulic,
air, water, fuel, & industrial hose & fittings, (B) Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. for type 170E
controller assemblies & equipment, (C) Southwest Companies LTD. d/b/a Southwest Wheel and
Genuine Parts Company for medium & heavy truck trailer drum & brake parts, (D) Deccan
International, Inc. for Deccan computer aided dispatch (CAD) component maintenance and support to
include additional software licenses, and (E) US Digital Designs, Inc. for fire station alerting system
(FSAS) maintenance & support to include future build-out upgrades and computer aided dispatch
(CAD) system component maintenance & support. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott,
Director, Finance]
Result: Passed
Not : :
Voter Group Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

EXHIBIT I

Opened: August 26, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Hydraulic, Air, Water, Fuel, & Industrial
Hose & Fittings Local Local Local
San Antonio Belting & |Genuine Parts Poppe Automotive
Pulley Co. Inc. Company Warehouse, Inc.
6100006448 MAB 211 West Cevallos 6374 Rittiman Rd 716 S. Frio Street
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual |[TX 78204 TX 78218 TX 78207
Usage |210-225-2671
1 Hydraulic Hoses
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 77.6% 15% 12%
Product identification (mfr.): Eaton-Aeroquip Gates Gates
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List] Jobber Jobber
Price schedule number: A-Prov-PLO01-E11 RP7086 GAT-0815
Date of price schedule 8-1-2015 2015 8/4/2014
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List] Jobber Jobber
net, wholesale, etc.):
Eaton Limited Warranty| s Py Limited Lifetime - See
. ted Lifeti
Warranty: on Disk| (iyies Liine page A3 in catalog
1B. Specified ltems for bid evaluation purposes only
1C. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
1D. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
1E. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
1F. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
1G. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
1H. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
Air & Multi-Purpose Hose, Red (Minimum PS| Rating Not Less
2 Than 300):
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 70.5% 15% 12%
Product identification (mfr.): Thermoid Gates Thermoid
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List, Jobber Jobber
Price schedule number: RP7086 GAT-0815
Date of price schedule July 2, 2012 2015 8/4/2014
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Jobber Jobber
net, wholesale, etc.):
Warranty: Limited Lifetime Limited Lifetime
Item 2B: Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
3 Quick Couplers
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 61.2% 15% 12%
Product identification (mfr.): Dixon| Gates Gates/Dixon
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List] Jobber Jobber
Price schedule number: Dixon 2014 Catalog RP7086 GAT-0815
Date of price schedule July 2014 2015 8/4/2014
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List| Jobber Jobber
net, wholesale, etc.):
. Limited Lifetime Limited Llfet!me - See
Warranty: page A3 in catalog
3B. Specified Items for bid evaluation purposes only
Payment Term Net 30 2% 10 Days 2% 30 Days
Estimated Annual Total $190,000.00
Estimated Annual Award $190,000.00

Prepared by Purchasing 9/8/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 22, 2015
For: Type:t 10E Controller Gabingt Assembliesii Eguipment Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. |Brown Traffic Products, Inc. McCain Inc. Peek Traffic Corporation Texas Highway Products Trafficware Group, Inc.
6100005858 DS 2201 E. Division St. 109 W. 55th Street 2365 Oak Ridge Way 5401 N. Sam Houston Pkwy W. | 1308 Clark 522 Gillingham
Estimated |Arlington, Davenport, Vista, Houston, Round Rock, Sugarland,
Item Description Annual TX 76011 IA 52806 CA 92081 TX 77086 TX 78681 TX 77478
Quantity  |817-831-8406
1 Type 332 Cabinet 40
Brand and Model: Safetran 332 Eagle 332SA McCain 332 M30154 Peek 332 Henke Enterprises 332 Trafficware P.332-CF-ALUM
Price per Item $6,344.00) $5,000.00 $5,250.00 $4,999.00 $8,750.00 $6,695.00
Extended Price $253,760.00 $200,000.00 $210,000.00 $199,960.00 $350,000.00 $267,800.00
2 Type 336 Cabinet 40
Brand and Model: Safetran 336 Eagle 336SA McCain 336 M26178 Peek 336 Henke Enterprises 336| Trafficware P.336-CF-ALUM-01
Price per Iltem $5,187.00) $4,500.00 $4,402.00 $4,099.00 $8,400.00 $6,342.00
Extended Price $207,480.00] $180,000.00 $176,080.00 $163,960.00 $336,000.00 §253,680.00
3 Load Switches 100
Brand and Model: PDC Model 200 PDC $5S-88 G01 Model 200 Peek EDI-200 PDC S55-88
Price per ltem $17.00] $22.00 $16.50 $25.00 $18.00 $20.00
Extended Price $1,700.00} $2,200.00 $1,650.00 $2,500.00 $1,800.00 $2,000.00
4 EDCO Surge Protector #°C 642C-020D,
or approved equal 50
Brand and Model: EDCO PC 642C-020D| EDCO PC642C-020D EDCO 642C-020D EDCO PC 642C-020D Hesco HE1750
Price per ltem $35.00 $24.00 $32.00 No Bid $45.00 $102.50
Extended Price $1,750.00 $1,200.00 $1,600.00 $2,250.00 $5,125.00
5 Controller Cabinet Fan, Axial, Safetran
0721810210, or approved equal 100
Globe Motors A47-B15A-15T3-
Brand and Model: Safetran 072180210 000 Fan 115VAL 100CFU Henke Enterprises Trafficware P.332-1101
Price per Item $9.00| $10.00 $8.50 No Bid $16.50 $19.00
Extended Price $900.00| $1,000.00 $850.00 $1,650.00 $1,900.00
6 Flasher Unit, GDI 204, or approved equal 50
Brand and Model: PDC Model 204 PDC SSF-88 GDI 204 EDI-204 PDC SSF-88
Price per Item $17.00 $22.00 $16.50 No Bid $18.00 $20.00
Extended Price $850.00) $1,100.00 $825.00 $900.00 $1,000.00
7 DC Isolators GDI 242, or approved equal 50
Brand and Model: PDC Model 242, PDC Model 242 GDI DIM242 EDI-242 PDC Model 242
Price per ltem $26.00| $25.00 $24.50 No Bid $33.00 $30.00
|Extended Price $1,300.00 $1,250.00 $1,225.00] $1,650.00 $1,500.00
8 Base for EDCO Isolator #°C BIB/WKEY, or
approved equal 100
Brand and Model: EDCO #PC BIBAWKEY| EDCO PC BIB/WKEY EDCOB1B EDCO BIB/wkey HESCO HE 1750-BASE
Price per ltem $20.00| $9.00 $11.50 No Bid $12.00 $26.00
Extended Price $2,000.00 $900.00 $1,150.00 $1,200.00 $2,600.00
9 EDCO #CX05-BNCYL, or approved equal 50
EDCO CX06-M1 replaced CX05-|
Brand and Model: EDCO CX-06-MI EDCO CX06-MI BNCYL
Price per Item $64.00 $43.00 No Bid No Bid $57.00 No Bid
Exteneded Price $3,200.00) $2,150.00 $2,850.00
10 EDCO #CX06-M, or approved equal 50
Brand and Model: EDCO CX06-M| EDCO CX06-M EDCO CX06-M EDCO CX06-M
Price per Item $55.00 $30.00 $42.50 No Bid $54.00 No Bid
Extended Price $2,750.00 $1,500.00 $2,125.00 $2,700.00

Prepared by Purchasing 9/8/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 22, 2015
fiors TypestioE GontollerGatinst Asesmbiiss & Eruiprent Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc. |Brown Traffic Products, Inc. McCain Inc. Peek Traffic Corporation Texas Highway Products Trafficware Group, Inc.
6100005858 DS 2201 E. Division St. 108 W. 55th Street 2365 Oak Ridge Way 5401 N. Sam Houston Pkwy W. {1309 Clark 522 Gillingham
Estimated |Arlington, Davenport, Vista, Houston, Round Rock, Sugarland,
Item Description Annual TX 76011 IA 52806 CA 92081 TX 77086 TX 78681 TX 77478
Quantity |817-831-9406
11 P Base Adapter, to 332 Cabinet Foundation,
AQC11186P004, or approved equal 10
Henke Enterprises 8" Adapter
Brand and Model: Safetran 083859Q332-00 Eagle AQC11186P004 McCain M60288H Base| Trafficware 12" P to 332
Price per item $235.00, $215.00 $208.00 No Bid $950.00 $380.00
Extended Price $2,350.00 $2,150.00 $2,080.00 $9,500.00 $3,800.00
12 AC Isolators, Model 252 or Approved equal 100
Brand and Model: PDC Model 252 PDC ACI 88-252 PDC AC1-88 PDC-AC1-88-252 PDC Model 252
Price per ltem $31.00 $30.00 $26.50 No Bid $33.00 $35.00
Extended Price $3,100.00) $3,000.00 $2,650.00 $3,300.00 $3,500.00
13 Econolite 2070-4 VME 10 AMP Power Supply
P/N 35190G1 or approved equal 30
Intelight INT-YCT-4APS-2070-4A
Brand and Model: Econolite 35190G1 Siemens 20704 McCain 2070-4A Module Trafficware 2070-4A
Price per Item $322.00 $275.00 $450.00 No Bid $397.00 $320.00
Extended Price $9,660.00 $8,250.00 $13,500.00 $11,910.00 $9,600.00
14 Class-ltem 550-81, Type 2070-1C CPU
Module Board (Fully compliant with ATC
Standard version 5.2b, w/ 64 MB of RAM and
64 MB of flash memory) 1,000
Econolite Exception 32MB| Intelight INT-YCT-1CTX-CP4
Brand and Model: Flash Memory] Siemens 2070-1C McCain 2070-ATC Peek: 2070-1C CPU Module Trafficware 50232-2100 (ic)
Price per item $480.00) $630.00 $700.00 $875.00 $535.00 $822.00
Extended Price $480,000.00 $630,000.00 $700,000.00 $875,000.00 $535,000.00 $822,000.00
15
1st year only - Pelco Products (No Exceptions)
Proprietary City of San Antonio Lock 3,900
Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX Pelco SM-1026-OK-SPXXXX-
Brand and Model: BRS| Pelco SiM-1026-SK-BRS-SA Pelco SM-1026 BRS] Pelco SM-1026-OK
Price per ltem $35.25 $35.00 $34.50 No Bid $38.17 $47.00
Extended Price $137,475.00 $136,500.00 $134,550.00 $148,863.00 $183,300.00
15a After 1st year only, Pelco Products (No
exceptions) Proprietary City of San Antonio
Lock 25
Pelco SM-1026-0K-SPXXXX Pelco SM-1026-OK-SPXXXX-
Brand and Model: BRS| Pelco SM-1026-SK-BRS-SA Pelco SM-1026 BRS Pelco SM-1026-OK
Price per ltem $36.00 $50.00 $36.00 No Bid $40.40 $48.50
Extended Price $900.00) $1,250.00 $900.00 $1,010.00 $1,212.50
16 1st year only additional keys for Pelco
Products (No Exceptions) Proprietary City of
$San Antonio Lock 100
Pelco SM-1026-0K-SPXXXXA
Brand and Model: BRS| Pelco SM-0198-2-CRM-SA| Pelco SM-0198 Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX-BRS Pelco SM-0198-2
Price per Item $4.75 $20.00 $4.80 No Bid $5.25 $6.45
Extended Price $475.00) $2,000.00 $480.00 $525.00 $645.00
16a After 1st year only, Additional Keys for Pelco
Products (No Exceptions) Proprietary City of
San Antonio Lock 25
Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX
Brand and Model: BRS| Pelco Si1-0198-CRM-SA Pelco SM-0198 Pelco SM-0198-2-SPXXXX-BRS Pelco SM-0198-2
Price per Item $5.00) $20.00 $5.00 No Bid $5.50 $6.80
Extended Price $125.00) $500.00 $125.00 $137.50 $170.00
Delivery 45 days| 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days 45 days
Payment terms Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total

$1,109,775.00)

$1,174,950.00

$1,249,790.00

$1,241,420.00

$1,411,245.50

$1,558,832.50

Estimated Annual Award

$1,109,775.00]

Prepared by Purchasing 9/8/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opensar — SUneic, 2013 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Cc LTD |Genuine Parts Company Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises | Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual |TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78218
Usage [210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
NAS
1 Brake Shoe Hardware Kits & Accessories:
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: +5% (Distributor x 1.05) 15% +5% (Distributor X 1.05) -41% +5% (Distributor x 1.05)
» Sirco World America, National,
Product identification (mfr.): Napa Traction / Haldex Sirco Brake Best HD Sirco
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, efc.): Distributor Net Jobber Distributor Net List Distributor Net
Price schedule number: 100112WD RP7086 / L40115 100112WD N/A (Online) 100112WD
Date of price schedule 41183 3-2015/1-5-2015 41183 N/A (Online) Oclober 1, 2012
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, Net Price Jobber (Blue) Net Price List Net Price
net, wholesale, efc.): '
Various by product type,

Warranty: 80Days 12 Months 60 Days see 60 Days
B. Specified ltems - Brake Shoe Hardware Kits and Accessories
Part Number : EF-2 70
Manufacturer: Sirco
Manufacturer offered: Sirco NAPA Sirco No Bid Sirco
Part number offered: EF-2 BHKO078 EF-2 EF-2
Price per each: $5.15 $13.37 $5.15 $5.15
Extended Price: $360.50 $935.90 $360.50 $360.50
Part Number : QK1HD 130
Manufacturer: Rockwell
Manufacturer offered: Sirco! NAPA Sirco World America HD Sirco
Part number offered: QK1-HD| BHK051 QK1-HD WAD8-5099 QK1-HD
Price per each: $4.94 $5.94 $4.94 $6.08 $4.94
Extended Price: $642.20 $772.20 $642.20 $790.40 $642.20
Part Number : ES-2 250
Manufacturer: Eaton
Manufacturer offered: Sirco NAPA Sirco World America HD Sirco
Part number offered: ES-2 BHK077 ES-2 WAE10244 ES-2
Price per each: $3.36 $4.41 $3.36 $4.90 $3.36
Extended Price: $840.00 $1,102.50 $840.00 $1,225.00 $840.00
Part Number : B8648 20
Manufacturer: Eaton
Manufacturer offered: Sirco! NAPA Sirco World America HD Sirco
Part number offered: B8648 CSK1024 BB8648 WA-08-5024 B8648
Price per each: $3.68 $4.30 $3.68 $6.62 $3.68
Extended Price: $73.60 $86.00 $73.60 $132.40 $73.60
Part Number : 3004009 30
Manufacturer: Stemco
Manufacturer offered: Sirco; Stemco Sirco National Sirco
Part number offered: $9,009.00 3004009 $9,009.00 HUO09A 9009
Price per each: $4.99 $9.84 $4.99 $18.10 $4.99
Extended Price: $149.70, $295.20 $149.70 $543.00 $149.70

Prepared by Purchasing 7/31/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Openeds  June'8; 2085 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Pars Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Companies, LTD |Genuine Parts Company Southwest Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises  |Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patierson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
ftem Description Annual [TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage [210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
Part Number : S2002 30
Manufacturer: Great Dane
Manufacturer offered: Sirco Haldex| Sirco WAH Sirco
Part number offered: $2002| CQ36543 $2002 WAD7-6000 $2002
Price per each: $6.30 $18.51 $6.30 $6.15 $6.30
Extended Price: $189.00 $555.30 $189.00 $184.50 $189.00
Part Number : MF-2 20
Manufacturer: Sirco
Manufacturer offered: Sirco NAPA Sirco WAH Sirco
Part number offered: MF-2 BHKD20 MF-2 WAD8-5019 MF-2
Price per each: $6.97 $20.03 $6.97 $11.01 $6.97
Extended Price: $139.40 $400.60 $139.40 $220.20 $139.40
Part Number : RK1 1
Manufacturer: Leland
Manufacturer offered: Sirco NAPA Sirco WAH Sirco
Part number offered: RK1 BHK1003 RK1 WAD8-5029 RK1
Price per each: $15.21 19.33 $15.21 $22.58 15.21
Extended Price: $167.31 $212.63 $167.31 $248.38 $167.31
Part Number : MKT4515QHDN 40
Manufacturer: Meritor
Manufacturer offered: Sirco NAPA Sirco WAH Sirco
Part number offered: QK1-HD BHK051 QK1-HD WAD8-5099 QK1-HD
Price per each: $4.94 5.94 $4.94 $6.08 4.94
Extended Price: $197.60 $237.60 $197.60 $243.20 $197.60
Estimated Annual Total - item 1 $2,759.31 $4,597.93 $2,759.31 $3,587.08 $2,759.31
2 Brake Shoes:

A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: -75% (List x .25) 26% -75% (List x .25) -41% -75% (List x .25)
Product identification (mfr.): Neo Brake Haldex Neo Brake Brake Best Heavy Duty Neo Brake:
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, elc.): List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price List List Price
Price schedule number: LP 012015NB L40115] LP 012015NB N/A (Online) LP 012015NB
Date of price schedule 41913 1/5/2015 41813 N/A (Online) 10/1/2014
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price List List Price
net, wholesale, etc.):
Warranty: 1 Year 12 Months 1 Year Varies, see attached 1 Year
B. Specified Items - Brake Shoes
Part Number : 4515Q 25
Manufacturer: Rockwell
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake Haldex] Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Part number offered: NB180-4515Q HV884515QR NB180-4515Q SF4515Q20 NB180-4515Q
Price per each: $12.30 $13.00 $12.30 $41.40 $12.30
Extended Price: $307.50 $325.00 $307.50 $1,035.00 $307.50
Part Number : 4707Q 370
Manufacturer: Rockwell
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake Haldex Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Parl number offered: NB180-4707Q HV884707QR! NB180-4707Q SF4707QP20 NB180-4707Q
Price per each: $13.50 $13.83 $13.50 $41.40 $13.50
Extended Price: $4,995.00 $5,117.10 $4,995.00 $15,318.00 $4,995.00
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opencdic  June8ii2015 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Companies, LTD |[Genuine Parts Company Southwest Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises | Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel|
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual [TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage |210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
Part Number : 4709E2 180
Manufacturer: Eaton
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake| Haldex Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Parl number offered: NB180-4709EN/S HV884709 NB180-4709EN/S SF4709E20 NB180-4709EN/S
Price per each: $14.70 $14.18| $14.70 $45.08 $14.70
Extended Price: $2,646.00 $2,552.40 $2,646.00 $8,114.40 $2,646.00
Part Number : 4709ENS 75
Manufacturer: Eaton
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake Haldex| Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Part number offered: NB180-4709EN/S HV884709ES2R| NB180-4709EN/S SF4709E20 NB180-4709EN/S
Price per each: $14.70 $14.18 $14.70 $45.08 $14.70
Extended Price: $1,102.50 $1,063.50 $1,102.50 $3,381.00 $1,102.50
Part Number : 4711Q 165
Manufacturer: Rockwell
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake| Haldex] Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Part number offered: NB200-4711Q GD4711QR NB200-4711Q PF4711QP20 NB200-4711Q
Price per each: $24.90 $19.76 $24.90 $65.94 $24.90
Extended Priice: $4,108.50 $3,260.40 $4,108.50 $10,880.10 $4,108.50
Part Number : 4715Q 40
Manufacturer: Rockwell
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake Haldex| Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Part number offered: NB200-4715Q GD4715QR NB200-4715Q PF4715QP20 NB200-4715Q
Price per each: $19.80! $19.23 $19.80 $64.46 $19.80
Extended Price: $792.00 $769.20 $792.00 $2,578.40 $792.00
Part Number : 4726E2 700
Manufacturer: Eaton
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake Haldex] Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Part number offered: NB200-4726EN/S! GD4726ES2R NB200-4726EN/S PF4726E20 NB200-4726EN/S
Price per each: $24.30 $24.21 $24.30 $77.10 $24.30
Extended Price: $17,010.00 $16,947.00 $17,010.00 $53,970.00 $17,010.00
Part Number : 4726EN 200
Manufacturer: Eaton
Manufacturer offered: Neo Brake: Haldex] Neo Brake Brake Best HD Neo Brake
Part number offered: NB200-4726EN/S GD4726ES2R NB200-4726EN/S PF4726E20 NB200-4726EN/S
Price per each: $24.30 $24.21 $24.30 $77.10 $24.30
Extended Price: $4,860.00 $4,842.00 $4,860.00 $15,420.00 $4,860.00
Estimated Annual Total - item 2 $35,821.50 $34,876.60 $35,821.50 $110,696.90 $35,821.50
3 Brake Drums and Spoke Wheels:
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 65% (List Price X .35) 15% 65% (List Price X .35) -41% 65% (List Price X .35)
Product identification (mfr.): Webb Wheel NAPA Traction Webb Wheel, Gunite, KIC KIC Webb Wheel, Gunite, KIC
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, elc.): List Price Jobber List Price List List Price
(Webb 060115LP) (KIC (Webb 060115LP) (KIC
060115 LP KICLPL-0515) (Gunite KICLPL-0515) (Gunite
Price schedule number: RP7086/ GUNITE/ACCURIDE 2015) N/A (Online)| GUNITE/ACCURIDE 2015)
(Webb 06/01/2015) (KIC (Webb 06/01/2015) (KIC
06/01/2015 05/01/2015) (Gunite 05/01/2015) (Gunite
Date of price schedule 3-2015 01/01/2015) N/A (Online) 01/01/2015)
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, Suggested List Jobber (Blue) Suggested List List Suggested List
net, wholesale, etc.):
Warranty: Limited Lifetime. 12 Months|| Limited Lifetime 1 Year Limited Lifetime
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 8, 2015 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Companies, LTD [Genuine Parts Company Southwest Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises |Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
item Description Annual |TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage [210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
B. Specified Items - Brake Drums and Spoke Wheels:
Part Number : 66884F 140
Manufacturer: Webb
Manufacturer offered: Webb| NAPA Gunite KiC Gunite
Part number offered: 66884F20 X60794| 3600AX 54261-018 3600AX
Price per each: $144.92 $91.68 $105.04 $187.55 $105.04
Extended Price: $20,288.80 $12,835.20 $14,705.60 $26,257.00 $14,705.60
Part Number : 65152B 22
Manufacturer: Webb
Manufacturer offered: Webb! NAPA KIiC KiC KIC
Part number offered: 651528 X612218B 54248-018 54248-018 54248-018
Price per each: $180.81 $150.74 $143.50 $217.52 $143.50
Extended Price: $3,977.82 $3,316.28 $3,157.00 $4,785.44 $3,157.00
Part Number : 668268 140
Manufacturer: Webb
Manufacturer offered: Webb! NAPA (Webb): Webb No Bid Webb
Part number offered: 668268 668268 66826B 668268
Price per each: $210.62 $251.26 $210.62 $210.62
Exiended Price: $29,486.80 $35,176.40 $29,486.80 $29,486.80
Part Number : 66854F 500
Manufacturer: Webb
Manufacturer offered: Webb! NAPA KiC KIC Kic
Part number offered: 66854120 X61363 54229-018 54229-018 54229-018
Price per each: $182.48 $147.96 $162.17 $202.32 $162.17
Extended Price: $91,240.00 $73,980.00 $81,085.00 $101,160.00 $81,085.00
Part Number : 666618 40
Manufacturer: Webb
Manufacturer offered: Webb Gunite KIC No Bid KIC
Part number offered: 66661B: 3576X| 54267-018 54267-018
Price per each: $199.71 $165.08 $154.29 $154.29
Extended Price: $7,988.40 $6,603.20 $6,171.60 $6,171.60
Estimated Annual Total - ftem 3 $152,981.82 $131,911.08 $134,606.00 $132,202.44 $134,606.00
4 Air Brake Components - Parts
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 55% (List X .45) 15% 55% (List X .45) -41% 55% (List X .45)
Product identification (mfr.): Haldex & Bendix| NAPA Traction / Haldex] Haldex & Bendix| Brake Best HD Haldex & Bendix|
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price, List List Price
(Haldex HAL-010115) (Haldex HAL-010115)] (Haldex HAL-010115)
Price schedule number: (Bendix BEN1115) RP7086 / L40115 (Bendix BEN1115)| N/A (Online) (Bendix BEN1115)
Date of price schedule 01/01/2015 3-2015/1-2015 01/01/2015 N/A (Online) 01/01/2015
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price List List Price
net, wholesale, etc.):
Haldex & Bendix 1 year, Haldex & Bendix 1 year,| Haldex & Bendix 1 year,
Bendix 3 years on ABS| Bendix 3 years on ABS] 1 Year (items listed) can Bendix 3 years on ABS
Warranty: valves 12 Months valves| vary by part type valves
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
Opanedt Jungig; 2095 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Companies, LTD |Genuine Parts Company Southwest Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises  |Southwest Companies, LTD
3 d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Ritliman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
tem Description Annual |TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78218
Usage |210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301

B. Specified Items - Rebuilt Air Brake Valves
Part Number : 103028N 40
Manufacturer: Bendix
Manufacturer offered: Bendix NAPA Haldex| Brake Best HD Bendix
Part number offered: 103028N H103028 103028X 103028CX 103028N
Price per each: $68.04 $40.98 $36.54 $46.52 $68.04
Exiended Price: $2,721.60 $1,639.20 $1,461.60 $1,860.80 $2,721.60
Part Number : 286171N 56
Manufacturer: Bendix
Manufacturer offered: Bendix| NAPA Haldex| Brake Best HD Bendix
Part number offered: 286171N H286171 286171X] RB286171 286171N
Price per each: $77.51 $54.19 $44.24 $42.16 $77.51
Exiended Price: $4,340.56 $3,034.64 $2,477.44 $2,360.96 $4,340.56
Part Number : KN31527 30
Manufacturer: Haldex
Manufacturer offered: Haldex Haldex| Haldex| No Bid Haldex
Part number offered: KN31527 KN31527 KN31527 KN31527
Price per each: $11.99 $11.11 $11.99] $11.99
Extended Price: $359.70 $333.30! $359.70] $359.70
Part Number : 800486 10
Manufacturer: Bendix
Manufacturer offered: Bendix| NAPA Bendix No Bid Bendix
Part number offered: 800486 BEN800486 800486 800486
Price per each: $69.49 $74.99 $69.49 $69.49
Extended Price: $694.90 $749.90 $694.90 $694.90
Part Number : 801481 10
Manufacturer: Bendix
Manufacturer offered: Bendix NAPA Bendix| No Bid Bendix
Part number offered: 801481 BEN801481 801481 801481
Price per each: $179.94 $202.76 $179.94 $179.94
Extended Price: $1,799.40 $2,027.60 $1,799.40| $1,799.40
Estimated Annual Total - item 4 $9,916.16 $7,784.64 $6,793.04 $4,221.76 $9,916.16
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opensds  Jl0neis, 2015 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Cor LTD |G Parts Company Southwest Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises  [Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S, Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
ftem Description Annual |TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage [210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
5 Governor - Parls
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 55% (List X .45) 10% 55% (List X .45) -41% 55% (List X .45)
Product identification (mfr.): Haldex| Haldex| Haldex| Brake Best HD Haldex
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, eic.): List Price Jobber| List Price| List List Price
Price schedule number: HAL-010115 L40115] HAL-010115 N/A (Online) HAL-010115
Date of price schedule 01/01/2015 1-5-2015 01/01/2015 N/A (Online) 01/01/2015
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price, List List Price
net, wholesale, etc.):
ear 1 Year (items listed) can
Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year vary by part type 1 Year
B. Specified ltems - Governor
Part Number : KN18530 72
Manufacturer: Haldex
Manufacturer offered: Haldex Haldex| Haldex| Brake Best HD Haldex
Part number offered: KN18530 KN18530 275491RX] RB18530 KN18530
Price per each: $16.42 $16.11 $13.38 $14.09 $16.42
Extended Price: $1,182.24 $1,159.92 $963.36 $1,014.48 $1,182.24
Estimated Annual Total - item 5§ $1,182.24 $1,159.92 $963.36 $1,014.48 $1,182.24
6 Air Brake Chamber - Parts
A. Parts Discount
Add 18% (Distributor Net X| Add 18% (Distributor Net X Add 18% (Distributor Net X
Percent of discount offered: 1.18) 15% 1.18) -41% 1.18)
Product identification (mfr.): Ranger Brake Products NAPA Traction, Ranger Brake Products Brake Best HD Ranger Brake Products
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Distributor Jobber (Blue) Distributor List Distributor
Price schedule number: RBP2014PF| RP7086 RBP2014PF N/A (Online) RBP2014PF
Date of price schedule 10/01/2014 3-2015 10/01/2014 N/A (Online) 10/01/2014
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, Dist Net Jobber (Blue); Dist Net List Dist Net
net, wholesale, efc.):
1 Year] 1 Year on items listed, may
Warranty: 4 12 Months 1 Year| vary by product type 1 Year
B. Specified ltems - Air Brake Chamber
Part Number : GC3030P40 103
Manufacturer: Haldex
Manufacturer of part offered Ranger Brake NAPA Ranger Brake Brake Best HD Ranger Brake
Manufacturer part number offered BTS3030 SB3030 BTS3030 3TS3030LS BTS3030
Price per each $38.42 $37.72 $38.42 $67.39 $38.42
Extended Price $3,957.26 $3,885.16 $3,957.26 $6,941.17 $3,957.26
Part Number : SC24 10
Manufacturer: Haldex
Manufacturer of part offered Ranger Brake NAPA| Ranger Brake Brake Best HD Ranger Brake
Manufacturer part number offered BSC-24 HO0245 BSC-24 BSC24 BSC-24
Price per each $18.60 $19.89 $18.60 $27.46 $18.60
Extended Price $186.00 $198.90 $186.00 $274.60 §$186.00
Estimated Annual Total - tem 6 $4,143.26 $4,084.06 $4,143.26 $7,215.77 $4,143.26
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened;  dune8;2015 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parls Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Companies, LTD |Genuine Parts Company Southwest Companies. LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises | Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d’b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 243 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual [TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage [210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
7 Gladhand & Accessories - Parts
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 0% 15% 0% -41% 0%
Phillips Grote (NAPA Traction) /
Product identification (mfr.): P: Phillips Phillips Brake Best HD Phillips
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Distributor| Jobber (Blue) Distributor| List Distributor|
Price schedule number: UDP-0115 RP7086 UDP-0115 N/A (Online) UDP-0115
Date of price schedule 01/01/2015 3-2015 01/01/2015 N/A (Online) 01/01/2015
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, W.D. 1-1-15 Jobber (Blue) W.D. 1-1-15 List W.D. 1-1-15
nel, wholesale, etc.):
1 Year] 1 Year on items listed, may
Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year, vary by product type 1 Year
B. Speci ltems - &A ies
Parl Number : 12-010 10
Manufacturer: Phillips
Manufacturer of part offered Phillips Grote Phillips Brake Best HD Phillips
Manufacturer parl number offered 12-010] 810001 12-010 GT5330 12-010
Price per each $2.57 $2.40 $2.57 $2.90 $2.57
Extended Price $25.70 $24.00 $25.70 $29.00 $25.70
Part Number : 12-012 180
Manufacturer: Phillips
Manufacturer of pari offered Phillips Phillips Phillips Brake Best HD Phillips
Manufacturer part number offered 12-012 12-012 12-012 GT2600 12-012
Price per each $0.16 $0.22 $0.16 $0.32 $0.16
Extended Price $28.80 $39.60 $28.80 $57.60 $28.80
Estimated Annual Total - item 7 $54.50 $63.60 $54.50 $86.60 $54.50
8 Slack Adjusters with Clevis - Parts
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: Add 5% (Distributor X 1.05) 15%| Add 5% (Distributor X 1.05) -41%| Add 5% (Distributor X 1.05)
Product identification (mfr.): Sirco NAPA Traction Sirco Brake Best HD Sirco
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Distributor Net! Jobber (Blue) Distributor Net List Distributor Net
Price schedule number: 100112WD, RP7086 100112WD N/A (Online) 100112WD
Date of price schedule October 1, 2012 3-2015 October 1, 2012 N/A (Online) October 1, 2012
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, Net Price Jobber (Blue) Net Price List Net Price
net, wholesale, etc.):
5Yi 1 Year on items listed, may

Warranty: b 12 Months 5 Years, vary by product type 5 Years
B. Specified ltems - Slack Adjusters with Clevis
Part Number : 21102 50
|Manufacturer: Crewson
Manufacturer of par offered Sirco NAPA Sirco Brake Best HD Sirco
Manufacturer part number offered SA21102 ASA106 SA21102 RB21102 SA21102
Price per each $40.01 $79.81 $40.01 $71.95 $40.01
Extended Price $2,000.50 $3,990.50 $2,000.50 $3,597.50 $2,000.50
Part Number : 21103 50
Manufacturer: Crewson
Manufacturer of part offered Sirco NAPA Sirco Brake Best HD Sirco
Manufacturer part number offered SA21103 ASA105 SA21103 RB21103 SA21103
Price per each $40.01 $79.81 $40.01 $71.85 $40.01
Extended Price $2,000.50 $3,990.50 $2,000.50 $3,597.50 $2,000.50
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened:  Jung8,2m5 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Companies, LTD |Genuine Parls Company Southwest Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises  [Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005846 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
ftem Description Annual [TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage |210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
Part Number : 22102 50
[Manufacturer: Crewson
Manufacturer of part offered Sirco; NAPA Sirco Brake Best HD Sirco
Manufacturer part number offered SA22102, ASA111 SA22102 RB22102 SA22102
Price per each $40.01 $79.81 $40.01 $71.95 $40.01
Extended Price $2,000.50 $3,990.50 $2,000.50 $3,597.50 $2,000.50
Part Number : 22103 50
Manufacturer. Crewson
Manufacturer of part offered Sirco NAPA Sirco Brake Best HD Sirco
Manufacturer part number offered SA22103 ASA112 SA22103 RB22103 SA22103
Price per each $40.01 §79.81 $40.01 $71.95 $40.01
Extended Price $2,000.50 $3,990.50 $2,000.50 $3,597.50 $2,000.50
Estimated Annual Total - item 8 $8,002.00 $15,962.00 $8,002.00 $14,390.00 $8,002.00
9 Air Dryer - Parts
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: -55% (List X .45) 15% -55% (List X .45) -41% -55% (List X .45)
Product identification (mfr.): Haldex & Bendix| NAPA Traction / Haldex| Haldex & Bendix| Brake Best HD Haldex & Bendix|
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, efc.): List Price, Jobber (Blue) List Price List List Price
(Haldex HAL-010115)| (Haldex HAL-010115) (Haldex HAL-010115)
Price schedule number: (Bendix BEN1115) L40115 (Bendix BEN1115) N/A (Online) (Bendix BEN1115)
Date of price schedule 01/01/2015 1-2015 01/01/2015 N/A (Online) 01/01/2015
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Price| Jobber (Blue), List Price List List Price
net, wholesale, etc.):
Bendix 3 years New Air| Bendix 3 years New Air Bendix 3 years New Air|
Dryers, Haldex 3 years New| Dryers, Haldex 3 years New| 1 Year on items listed, may| Dryers, Haldex 3 years New|
Warranty: Dryers 12 Months. Dryers vary by product type Dryers
Specified ltems - Air Dryer
Part Number : DA34100 22
Manufacturer: Haldex
Manufacturer of part offered Haldex| Haldex| Haldex Brake Best HD Haldex
Manufacturer part number offered DA34100 DA34100 DA34100 108991 DA34100
Price per each $250.25 $221.46 $250.25 $216.99 $250.25
Extended Price $5,505.50 $4,872.12 $5,505.50 $4,773.78 $5,505.50
Part Number :065225 10
Manufacturer: Bendix
Manufacturer of part offered Bendix NAPA Haldex Brake Best HD Bendix
Manufacturer part number offered 065225 H065225 109685X 065225 065225
Price per each $274.20 $179.82 $134.76 $180.57 $274.20
Extended Price $2,742.00 $1,798.20 $1,347.60 $1,805.70 $2,742.00
Estimated Annual Total - item 9 $8,247.50 $6,670.32 $6,853.10 $6,579.48 $8,247.50
10 Loose Wheel-Nut Indicator - Parts
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: 50%] 15% 50% No Bid 50%
NAPA Traction (Wheel
Product identification (mfr.): Whesl Chedk Check) Wheel Check Wheel Check
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price List Price
Price schedule number: WLC-010315 RP7086 WLC-010315 WLC-010315
Date of price schedule 01/03/15 3-2015 01/03/15 01/03/15
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Price| Jobber (Blue) List Price List Price
net, wholesale, etc.):
Warranty: 30 Days! 12 Months 30 Days 30 Days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
Opened;|  JUNsi€, 2015 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Ci ies, LTD [Genuine Paris Ci C ies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises |Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antonio,
ftem Description Annual |TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage [210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
P ftems - Loose Wheel-Nut Ind
Part Number : 33MM Orange 20,000
Manufacturer: Wheel Check No Bid
Manufacturer of part offered Wheel Check| NAPA Wheel Check Wheel Check
Manufacturer part number offered WCHT-B WCH7B WCHT-B WCHT-B
Price per each $0.56 $0.68 $0.56 $0.56
Extended Price $11,200.00 $13,600.00 $11,200.00 $11,200.00
Part Number : 38.1MM 200
Manufacturer: Wheel Check No Bid
Manufacturer of part offered Wheel Check| NAPA Wheel Check Wheel Check
Manufacturer part number offered WLCH-AA WCHT7AA WLCH-AA WLCH-AA
Price per each $0.44 $0.68 $0.44 $0.44
Extended Price §88.00 $136.00 $88.00 $88.00
Parl Number : 40.5MM 200
Manufacturer: Wheel Check
Manufacturer of part offered Wheel Check NAPA Wheel Check No Bid Wheel Check
Manufacturer part number offered WLCH-H WCH70H WLCH-H WLCH-H
Price per each $0.44 $0.68 $0.44 $0.44
Extended Price $88.00 $136.00 $88.00 $88.00
Estimated Annual Total - item 10 $11,376.00 $13,872.00 $11,376.00 $11,376.00
11 Disc Brake Rotors - Parts
A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: -55% (List X .45) 20% -55% (List X .45) No Bid -55% (List X .45)
Product identification (mfr.): Meritor/Bendix| NAPA Traction Meritor/Bendix| Meritor/Bendix|
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price List Price
Meritor MLP 12114 Price Meritor MLP 12114 Price
Sheet / Bendix BEN1115 /, Sheet / Bendix BEN1115 /|
Meritor MLP 12114 Price| Gunite GUNITE/ACCURIDE-| Gunite GUNITE/ACCURIDE-
Price schedule number: Sheet / Bendix BEN1115 RP7086 2015 2015
. " Meritor 12/01/2014 / Bendix Meritor 12/01/2014 / Bendix
Memor 121014/ Bendy 01/01/2015 / Gunite 01/01/2015 / Gunite
Date of price schedule 3-2015 01/01/2015 01/01/2015
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price List Price
net, wholesale, etc.):
Warranty: 1 Year| 12 Months 1 Year| 1 Year
Specified ltems - Disc Brake Rotors
Part Number : 3218K167 58
Manufacturer: Meritor No Bid
Manufacturer of part offered Meritor| Gunite Gunite Gunite
Manufacturer part number offered 3218K167 R6198 R6198 R6198
Price per each $192.03] $182.44 $236.75 $236.75
Extended Price $11,137.74 $10,581.52 $13,731.50 $13,731.50
Parl Number : 32182156 10
Manufacturer: Meritor No Bid
Manufacturer of part offered Meritor| Gunite Gunite Gunite
Manufacturer part number offered 32182156 R6200 R6200 R6200
Price per each $190.68 $178.82 $232.05 $232.05
Extended Price $1,906.80 $1,788.20 $2,320.50 $2,320.50
Part Number : 3218A1145 20
Manufacturer: Meritor No Bid
Manufacturer of part offered Meritor| Meritor Meritor Meritor
Manufacturer part number offered 3218A1145, 3218A1145 3218A1145 3218A1145
Price per each $475.77 $586.58 $475.77 $475.77
Extended Price $9,515.40 $11,731.60 $9,515.40 $9,515.40
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: June'8, 2015 Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #3 Alternate Bid #2
For: Annual Contract for Medium & Heavy Trailer Drum & Brake Parts Local Local Local Local Local
Southwest Companies, LTD |Genuine Parts Company Southwest Companies, LTD |O'Reilly Auto Enterprises  |Southwest Companies, LTD
d/b/a Southwest Wheel d/b/a Southwest Wheel LLC d/b/a O'Reilly Auto d/b/a Southwest Wheel
Parts
6100005946 MB 343 Gembler Road 6374 Rittiman Rd 343 Gembler Road 233 S. Patterson 343 Gembler Road
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield, San Antenio,
ftem Description Annual |TX 78219 TX 78218 TX 78219 MO 65802 TX 78219
Usage |210-226-0301 210-661-7700 210-226-0301
Parl Number : 1137415N 40
Manufacturer: Bendix No Bid
Manufacturer of part offered Bendix| Bendix| Bendix Bendix!
Manufacturer parl number offered 1137415N Ben1137415N 1137415N 1137415N
Price per each $338.75 $359.28 $338.75 $338.75
Extended Price $13,550.00 $14,371.20 $13,550.00 $13,550.00
Estimated Annual Total - item 11 $36,109.94 $38,472.52 $39,117.40 $39,117.40
12 Disc Pads - Parts

A. Parts Discount
Percent of discount offered: -55% (List X .45) 5% -55% (List X .45) No Bid -55% (List X .45)
[Product identification (mfr.): Bendix| NAPA Traclion Bendix Bendix|
Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, elc.): List Price Jobber (Blue) List Price List Price
Price schedule number: BEN1115 RP7086 BEN1115 BEN1115
Date of price schedule 01/01/2015 1-2015 01/01/2015 01/01/2015
Price schedule column on which discount is based: (distributor, List Price Jobber (Blue). List Price List Price
nel, wholesale, etc.):
Warranty: 1 Year| 12 Months' 1 Year 1 Year|
Specified ltems - Disc Pads
Part Number : 5013257 40
Manufacturer: Bendix No Bid
Manufacturer of part offered Bendix| NAPA| Bendix' Bendix
Manufacturer part number offered 5013257 GFP1203KV| 5013257 5013257
Price per each $214.64 $133.00 $214.64 $214.64
Extended Price $8,585.60 $5,320.00 $8,585.60 $8,585.60
Estimated Annual Total - tem 12 $8,585.60 $5,320.00) $8,585.60 $8,585.60

Delivery
A. Deliveries will be made within __ calendar days after receipt of
order

B. Business hours are from __ A.M. to __ P.M. __ days per week

Payment Terms

it
8:00 A.Mto 5:00 P.M; 5

Net 30

1
7:30 AMto 7:00 P.M; 5

2% 10 days

1

8:00 A.Mto 5:00 P.M; 5

Net 30

1
7AMto 10 P.M; 6

2% 10 days

1
8:00 A.Mto 5:00 P.M; 5

Net 30

*O'Reilly's was determined to be non-responsive due to
strikethroughs on parts of the Terms and Conditions
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 14, 2015

Annual Contract For Deccan Computer Aided Dispatch

Sole Source

Deccan International, Inc.

For: (CAD) Component Maintenance & Support To Include
Additional Software Licenses
5935 Cornerstone Court W,
6100006471 WF |Suite 230
Iltem Description Qty [San Diego,
CA 92121
858-764-8324
Initial Annual Maintenance
1 CADA/ADAM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2015 - 10/31/2016
Price Each $36,626.00
Price Total $36,626.00
2 LiveMUM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2015 - 10/31/2016
Price Each $27,435.00
Price Total $27,435.00
3 BARB Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2015 - 10/31/2016
Price Each $15,620.00)
Price Total $15,620.00,
4 DIVA Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2015 - 10/31/2016
Price Each $2,541.00
Price Total $2,541.00
Initial Term Annual Maintenance $82,222.00
Additional Licenses
5 User Licenses for CAD Analyst/ADAM 3
Price Each $2,500.00
Price Total $7,500.00
6 User Runtime Licenses for Mapinfo 3
Price Each $1,000.00
Price Total $3,000.00
7 User Licenses for CAD Analyst + Runtime Licenses for 3
Mapinfo
Price Each $3,500.00
Price Total $10,500.00
Total Additional Licenses $21,000.00
TOTAL INITIAL COST $103,222.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 14, 2015
Annual Contract For Deccan Computer Aided Dispatch

Sole Source

Deccan International, Inc.

For: (CAD) Component Maintenance & Support To Include
Additional Software Licenses
5935 Cornerstone Court W,
6100006471 WEF |Suite 230
Item Description Qty [San Diego,
CA 92121
858-764-8324
Year 2 - 5 Annual Maintenance
8 CADA/ADAM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2016 - 10/31/2017
Price Each $38,457.00
Price Total $38,457.00
9 LiveMUM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2016 - 10/31/2017
Price Each $28,807.00
Price Total $28,807.00
10 BARB Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2016 - 10/31/2017
Price Each $16,401.00
Price Total $16,401.00
11 DIVA Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2016 - 10/31/2017
Price Each $2,668.00
Price Total $2,668.00
Term 11/1/2016 - 10/31/2017 Total $86,333.00,
12 CADA/ADAM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2017 - 10/31/2018
Price Each $40,380.00
Price Total $40,380.00
13 LiveMUM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2017 - 10/31/2018
Price Each $30,248.00
Price Total $30,248.00
14 BARB Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2017 - 10/31/2018
Price Each $15,620.00
Price Total $17,221.00
16 DIVA Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2017 - 10/31/2018
Price Each $2,801.00]
Price Total $2,801.00
Term 11/1/2017 - 10/31/2018 Total $90,650.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 14, 2015
Annual Contract For Deccan Computer Aided Dispatch

Sole Source

Deccan International, Inc.

For: (CAD) Component Maintenance & Support To Include
Additional Software Licenses
5935 Cornerstone Court W,
6100006471 WF [Suite 230
Item Description Qty |San Diego,
CA 92121
858-764-8324
16 CADA/ADAM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2018 - 10/31/2019
Price Each $42,399.00
Price Total $42,399.00
17 LiveMUM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2018 - 10/31/2019
Price Each $31,760.00
Price Total $31,760.00
18 BARB Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2018 - 10/31/2019
Price Each $18,082.00
Price Total $18,082.00
19 DIVA Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2018 - 10/31/2019
Price Each $2,942.00
Price Total $2,942.00)
Term 11/1/2018 - 10/31/2019 Total $95,183.00
20 CADA/ADAM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2019 - 10/31/2020
Price Each $44,519.00,
Price Total $44,519.00,
21 LiveMUM Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2019 - 10/31/2020
Price Each $33,348.00
Price Total $33,348.00
22 BARB Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2019 - 10/31/2020
Price Each $18,986.00
Price Total $18,986.00
23 DIVA Annual Maintenance 1
Term 11/01/2019 - 10/31/2020
Price Each $3,089.00
Price Total $3,089.00
Term 11/1/2019 - 10/31/2020 Total $99,942.00
Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Contract Total $475,330.00
Estimated Contract Award $475,330.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Sole Source

Opened: August 24, 2015

Annual Contract for Fire Station Alerting System (FSAS) Maintenance & Support including Future Build-
For: Out Upgrades and Computer Aided Dispatch (CAD) System Component Maintenance & Support for US

Digital Products

US Digital Designs, Inc.

6100006495 WF |1835 Sixth St., Suite 27
Item Description Tempe,
AZ 85281
602-687-1730
1 EQUIPMENT & LABOR PRICING
Future Year Buildouts per Fire Station FY16 2 $75,000.00]
Future Year Buildouts per Fire Station FY17 2 $75,000.00]
Future Year Buildouts per Fire Station FY18 2 $75,000.00
Future Year Buildouts per Fire Station FY19 2 $75,000.00]
Total Equipment & Labor Pricing Buildout $600,000.00
2 Maintenance & Support
Maintenance & Support FY 16 1 $145,496.27|
Maintenance & Support FY 17 1 $157,496.27
Maintenance & Support FY 18 1 $169,496.27|
Maintenance & Support FY 19 1 $181,496.27|
Total Maintenance & Support $653,985.08|
Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $315,000.00]
Total Contract Years 4 $1,260,000.00

Estimated Total

$1,260,000.00

Estimated Award

$1,260,000.00
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