
LOC 
6/12114 
Item No. 14 

AN ORDINANCE 20 14 - 0 6 - 1 2 -0 4 1. 
AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING 
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL COST OF $1,992,000.00: (A) TXTOW CORP D/B/A TEXAS 
TOWING FOR TOWING SERVICES FOR VEHICLES & EQUIPMENT, 
(B) CASARES SAND PIT & TRUCKING FOR BLACK SOIL PRODUCTS, 
(C) NESCO, LLC FOR AERIAL LIFT TRUCK RENTAL, (D) AIR FLITE, 
INC. FOR HELICOPTER PARTS, ENGINES, AND REPAIRS, (E) AGH20 
HOLDINGS, LLC FOR SUPPLY OF TREES, F) JOHN DEERE 
LANDSCAPES, WHITE DOVE DISTRIBUTING AND WINFIELD, LLC 
FOR HERBICIDES, (G) AIRPORT LIGHTING SYSTEMS, INC. FOR 
AIRPORT LIGHTING PARTS, SIGNS, AND ACCESSORIES AND (H) 3M 
COMPANY FOR 3M RFID SERVICE AGREEMENT. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) TxTow 
Corp. d/b/a Texas Towing for towing services for vehicles & equipment, (B) Casares Sand Pit & 
Trucking for black soil products, (C) Nesco, LLC for aerial lift truck rental, (D) Air Flite, Inc. 
for helicopter parts, engines, and repairs, (E) AgH20 Holdings, LLC for supply of trees, F) John 
Deere Landscapes (item 8), White Dove Distributing (items 10, IIa, lIb, and 12, and Alternate 
Bid, item 6) and Winfield, LLC for herbicides (items 1, 2, 3,4, 5, and 9), (G) Airport Lighting 
Systems, Inc. for airport lighting parts, signs, and accessories and (H) 3M Company for 3M 
RFID service agreement; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves six low bid contracts, four contracts awarded to other than 
the low bidder(s) because the low bidder(s) failed to meet the City's specifications and/or 
requirements, and one sole source contract; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) TxTow Corp. 
d/b/a Texas Towing for towing services for vehicles & equipment, (B) Casares Sand Pit & 
Trucking for black soil products, (C) Nesco, LLC for aerial lift truck rental, (D) Air Flite, Inc. for 
helicopter parts, engines, and repairs, (E) AgH20 Holdings, LLC for supply of trees, F) John 
Deere Landscapes (item 8), White Dove Distributing (items to, IIa, lIb, and 12, and Alternate 
Bid, item 6) and Winfield, LLC for herbicides (items 1, 2, 3,4, 5, and 9), (G) Airport Lighting 
Systems, Inc. for airport lighting parts, signs, and accessories and (H) 3M Company for 3M 



LOC 
6112114 
Item No. 14 

RFID service agreement on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation 
sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, 
perfonnance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are 
attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are 
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bids from John Deere Landscapes 
(item 1), White Dove Distribution (items 1,2,3,4), Red River Specialties, Inc. (items 1,2,3,4, 
and 6) for herbicides, Alfaro Tree Sales, Inc for supply of trees, and Graybar Electric Co. for 
airport lighting parts, signs, and accessories failed to meet the City's specifications and/or 
requirements. 

SECTION 3. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will 
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2014 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal 
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals. 

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affinnative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage hereof. 

PASSED and APPROVED this lih day of June, 2014. 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

, ity Attorney 
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Voting Results Interface Page 12 of39 

Agenda Item: 14 (in consent vote: 4,5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,14,16,18,19,21,22,23,24,25, 26, 29, 30, 31, 
32,33,34,35,36,37,38,39,40,41) 

Date: 06/12/2014 

Time: 09:30:08 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an 
estimated annual cost of $1,992,000.00: (A) TXTOW Corp d/b/a Texas Towing for towing services for 
vehicles & equipment, (B) Casares Sand Pit & Trucking for black soil products, (C) Nesco, LLC for 
aerial lift truck rental, (D) Air Flite, Inc. for helicopter parts, engines, and repairs, (E) AgH20 Holdings, 
LLC for supply of trees, F) John Deere Landscapes, White Dove Distributing and Winfield, LLC for 
herbicides, (G) Airport Lighting Systems, Inc. for airport lighting parts, signs, and accessories and (H) 
3M Company for 3M RFID Service Agreement. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, 
Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Julian Castro Mayor x 

Diego Bemal District 1 x x 

Ivy R. Taylor District 2 x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x 
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EXHIBIT I 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 28, 2014 LOCAL LOCAL 
For: Annual Contract for Towing Services for Vehicles TxTow Corp. d/b/a Texas Towing Automotive Support Corp. 

& Equipment 

6100004110 CE 4702 Center Park Blvd. 7510 Grissom Road 
Estimated San Antonio, San Antonio, 

Item Description Annual TX 78218 TX 78251 
Quantities 210-220-1000 

1 Light-Equipment 1 
Flat Rate Normal Tow Unit Price $49.00 $49.00 
Flat Rate Expediated Tow Unit Price $56.00 $59.00 
Vehicle Transporation Method Light Duty Flatbed or Tow Truck Flat Bed 

2 Light-Duty Vehicles (including motorcycles) 1 
Flat Rate Normal Tow Unit Price $49.00 $49.00 
Flat Rate Expediated Tow Unit Price $56.00 $59.00 
Vehicle Transporation Method Light Duty Flatbed or Tow Truck Flat Bed or Recovery w/ Dollys 

3 Hybrid Vehicles 1 
Flat Rate Normal Tow Unit Price $49.00 $49.00 
Flat Rate Expediated Tow Unit Price $56.00 $59.00 
Vehicle Transporation Method Medium Duty Flatbed or Tow Truck Flat Bed 

4 Medium-Duty Vehicles 1 
Flat Rate Normal Tow Unit Price $95.00 $125.00 
Flat Rate Expediated Tow Unit Price $115.00 $180.00 
Vehicle Transporation Method Medium Duty Flatbed or Tow Truck Recovery Trk or Tractor/Landoll 

5 Heavy-Duty Vehicles 1 
Flat Rate Normal Tow Unit Price $165.00 $225.00 
Flat Rate Expediated Tow Unit Price $195.00 $300.00 
Vehicle Transporation Method Heavy Duty Tow Truck Recovery Trk or Tractor/Landoll 

6 Heavy-Equipment 1 
Flat Rate Normal Tow Unit Price $165.00 $299.00 
Flat Rate Expediated Tow Unit Price $195.00 $325.00 
Vehicle Transporation Method Heavy Duty Tow Truck or Landoll Tractor/Landoll Combination 

7 Heavy-Duty Emergency Fire Vehicles 1 
Flat Rate Normal Tow Unit Price $300.00 $325.00 
Flat Rate Expediated Tow Unit Price $300.00 $350.00 
Vehicle T ransporation Method Heavy Duty Wrecker Recovery Trk or Tractor Landoll 

Prompt Pay Discount Net 30 2% 10 Days 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 28, 2014 Local Local 
For: Annual Contract for Black Soil Products Casares Sand Pit & TruckinQ New Earth Inc 

6100004266 AJ 21651 SI. Hwy 16 South 7800 IH10 East 
Estimated Von Ormy, San Antonio, 

Item Description Annual TX 78264 TX 78219 
Quantitv 210-624-2443 

1 Top Soil 
F.O.B. Pit Site (picked up by City) 3,000 
Price by cubic yard $9.75 $15.00 
Total Price $29,250.00 $45,000.00 

F.O.B. Destination (delivered) 2,000 
Price per cubic yard $13.75 $25.00 
Total Price $27,500.00 $50,000.00 

2 Top Dressing 
F.O.B. Pit Site (picked up by City) 750 
Price by cubic yard $10.50 $22.95 
Total Price $7,875.00 $17,212.50 

F.O.B. Destination (delivered) 750 
Price by cubic yard $14.50 $28.83 
Total Price $10,875.00 $21,622.50 

Delivery 24 hours 48 hours 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $75,500.00 $133,835.00 
Estimated Annual Award $75,500,00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 9, 2014 

For: Annual Contract for Aerial Lift Truck Rental NON-LOCAL 
Nesco, LLC 

6100004268 JG 3112 E. State Road 

Estimated Annual 
Bluffton, 

Item Description 
Quantity 

IN 46714 
260-824-7150 

1A Versalift SHV-36P1 or approved equal 
Rental Price Per Day (24 Hour Period) $500.00 
Make Terex 

TL38, LT38, LT40, TPL, L13i,4x2 
or other approved equivalent based 

Model upon availability 

1B Versalift SHV-36P 1 or approved equal 12 
Rental Price Per Month $2,850.00 
Extended Cost $34,200.00 
Make Terex 

TL38, LT38, LT40, TPL, L13i, 4x2 
or other approved equivalent based 

Model upon availability 

2A T elelect 5FC55 or approved equal 
Rental Price Per Day (24 Hour Period) $600.00 
Make Terex 

5FC55, TL50P, TC55P, 5TC55, 
FC55, 4x2 or other approved 

Model equivalent based upon availability 

2B T elelect 5FC55 or approved equal 12 
Rental Price Per Month $3,300.00 
Extended Cost $39,600.00 
Make Terex 

5FC55, TL50P, TC55P, 5TC55, 
FC55, 4x2 or other approved 

Model equivalent based upon availability 

Payment Terms Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $73,800.00 
Estimate Annual Award $73800.00 



City of San Antonion Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 18,2014 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

For: 
Annual Contracrt for SAPD Helicopter Air Flite, Inc. Hill Country Helicopters, LLC. 
Parts, Engines and Repairs 

6100004304 AAS 2320 Airport Drive 29640 Bulverde Lane 
Shawnee, OK 74804 Bulverde, TX 78162 

Item Description U/M 405-275-4388 

1 Turbomeca Engine 

Captive OEM Parts Each Cost Plus 15% 
Discount off Mfr. Price List 0% 0% 

Captive OEM Overhauls and Labor Each Cost Plus 15% 

Discount off Mfr. Price List 0%, See Catalog Pricing 0%, See Catalog Pricing 

Competitive (Incentive/PMA) Parts Each 
Cost Plus Percentage' 10% 15% 

Overhauls and other outside labor Each 
Costs Plus Percentage' 10% 0% 

Hourly Labor Rate _Per Hour Hour $85.00 Per Hour $95.00 Per Hour 

2 Schweizer Helicopter 

Captive OEM Parts Each 
Discount off Mfr. Price List 15% 0% 

Captive OEM Overhauls and Labor Each 
Discount off Mfr. Price List 7.5% 0% 

Competitive (Incentive/PMA) Parts Each 
Cost Plus Percentage' 10% 15% 

Overhauls and other outside labor Each 
Costs Plus Percentage' 10% 15% 

Hourly Labor Rate _ Per Hour Hour $85.00 $95.00 

3 Rolls Royce Engine 

Captive OEM Parts Each 
Discount off Mfr. Price List 0% 2% 

Captive OEM Overhauls and Labor Each 
Discount off Mfr. Price List 0% 0% 

Competitive (Incentive/PMA) Parts Each 
Cost Plus Percentage' 10% 15% 

Overhauls and other outside labor Each 
Costs Plus Percentage' 10% 15% 

Hourly Labor Rate _ Per Hour Hour $85.00 $95.00 

Delivery Delivery 14 Calendar Days Delivery 15 Calendar Days 
(Subject to parts in stock (Unless not availabe at supplier 

beyond their control) 

Payment Terms NET3C NET 30 

Estimated Annual Total $350,000.00 
Estimated Annual Award $350,000.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened' April 21. 2014 
For: Annual Contract for Supply of Trees NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

AgH20 Holdings, LLC Alfaro Tree Sales Inc. 
6100004211 RS 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 10755 Pearsall Road 

Estimated Round Rock. Atascosa, 

Item Description Annual TX,78664 TX,78002 

Quantities 512- 484-7611 

Supply of Trees NAS 

1 Deleted 

2 Deleted 

3 Deleted 

4 Deleted 

5 Deleted 

6 Deleted 

7 Deleted 

8 Deleted 

9 Deleted 

10 Deleted 

11 Deleted 
5 Gallon Size Trees 

12 Burr Oak 100 
Price per Tree $35.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $3,500.00 

13 Cedar Elm (TX Fall Elm) 500 
Price per Tree $36.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $18,000.00 

14 Chinquapin Oak 100 
Price per Tree $40.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $4,000.00 

15 Desert Willow 50 
Price per Tree $41.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $2,050.00 

16 Eve's Necklace 50 
Price per Tree $45.25 No bid 
Extended Price: $2,262.50 

17 Lacey Oak 100 
Price per Tree $45.25 No bid 
Extended Price: $4,525.00 

18 Live Oak 500 
Price per Tree $40.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $20,000.00 

19 Mexican Buckeye 50 
Price per Tree $48.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $2.400.00 

20 Mexican Olive 100 
Price per Tree $35.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $3,500.00 

21 Mexican Plum 50 
Price per Tree $45.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $2,250.00 

22 Mexican White Oak 100 
Price per Tree $49.00 No bid 
Extended Price" $4,900.00 

23 Pecan 300 
Price per Tree $70.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $21,000.00 

24 Texas Mountain Laurel 500 
Price per Tree $44.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $22,000.00 

25 Texas Red Oak 100 
Price per Tree $45.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $4,500.00 

26 Texas and Mexican Redbud 50 
Price per Tree $45.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $2250.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: April 21,2014 
For: Annual Contract for Supply of Trees NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

AgH20 Holdings, LLC Alfaro Tree Sales Inc. 
6100004211 RS 3817 Bent Brook Dr. 10755 Pearsall Road 

Estimated Round Rock, Atascosa, 

Item Description Annual TX,78664 TX,78002 

Quantities 512- 484-7611 

27 Texas Persimmon 50 
Price per Tree $50.00 No bid 
Extended Price: $2,500.00 

15 Gallon Size Trees 
28 Burr Oak 100 

Price per Tree $80.00 $115.00 
Extended Price" $8,000.00 $11,500.00 

29 Cedar Elm 500 
Price per Tree $75.00 $110.00 
Extended Price: $37,500.00 $55,000.00 

30 Chinquapin Oak 100 
Price per Tree $85.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $8,500.00 $11,500.00 

31 Desert Willow 25 
Price per Tree $100.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $2,500.00 $2,875.00 

32 Deleted 

33 Lacey Oak 50 
Price per Tree $125.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $6,250.00 $5,750.00 

34 live Oak 500 
Price per Tree $75.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $37,500.00 $57,500.00 

35 Mexican Buckeye 50 
Price per Tree $90.00 $110.00 
Extended Price: $4,500.00 $5,500.00 

36 Mexican Plum 50 
Price per Tree $82.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $4,100.00 $5,750.00 

37 Alamo Sycamore 150 
Price per Tree $85.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $12,750.00 $17,250.00 

38 Mexican White Oak (Monterrey Oak) 150 
Price per Tree $75.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $11,250.00 $17,250.00 

39 Mexican Wild Olive 50 
Price per Tree $,$100.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: 5000.00 $5,750.00 

40 Deleted 

41 Sierra Red Oak 50 
Price per Tree $90.00 $120.00 
Extended Price: $4,500.00 $6,000.00 

42 Texas Red Oak 50 
Price per Tree $85.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $4,250.00 $5,750.00 

43 Texas Mountain Laurel 200 
Price per Tree $85.00 $110.00 
Extended Price: $17,000.00 $22,000.00 

44 Texas and Mexican Redbud 100 
Price per Tree $76.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $7,600.00 $11,500.00 

45 Texas Persimmon 150 
Price per Tree $98.00 $115.00 
Extended Price: $14,700.00 $17,250.00 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 

stlmated Annual Award 305537,50 
Deleted. Items 1 -11,32 and 40 will be re-bld at a later date 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tab 

Opened: March 10, 2014 
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local, Alternate Bid Non-Local 

For: Annual Contract for Herbicides John Deere Landscapes Red River Specialties, Inc. White Dove Distributing White Dove Disltributing Winfield, LLC. 

1385 East 36th Street 1324 N. Hearne Avenue, 9520 Ridgeline Rd. 9520 Ridgeline Rd. 6085 Corridor Parkway #150 
6100003726 DS Suite 120 

Estimated Cleveland, Shreveport, New Braunfels, New Braunfels, Schertz, Item Description Annual OH 44114 LA 71107 TX 78132 TX 78132 TX 78154 
Quantities 800-321-5325 830-608-2903 830-608-2903 210-590-2932 

1 Turbulence Methylated Vegetable Oil Plus 
Organosilicone Surfactant or approved equal 20 NAS NAS NAS 
Manufacturerer: Monterey Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto Red River Specialties No Bid Winfield 
Product No: 34-00-MS02.5G Sunrise Elite Supreme 1433752 
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 Qallon 2.5 Qallon 2.5 Qallon 
Price per gallon: $20.66 $30.00 $37.00 $37.50 
Extended Pnce: $413.20 $600.00 $740.00 <7.n nr 

2 Droplex Deposition Aid, Canopy Penetrating 
& Drift Control Agent or approved equal 50 NAS NAS 
Manufacturer: No Bid Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto Red River Specialties No Bid Winfield 
Product No: Elite Velocity Elite Velocity 1414380 
Container Size: 1 gallon 2.5 Qallon Qallon 
Price per gallon: $30.00 $38.95 ~? ~~~.~~ c.xtended Price: ~1,bUU.UO $1,947.50 

3 Gulfstream Spreader-Activator with Buffering 
Agents or approved equal 15 NAS NAS 
Manufacturer: No Bid Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto-RRSI No Bic Winfield 
Product No: Elite Devine White Dove 90 
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2 .. 5 Qallon 
Price per gallon: $20.00 $18.00 

~~~~g? l:::xtenCleCl Price: $300.00 $270.00 

4 Plus Spreader-Activator with Buffering 
Agents for use w/Aquatic herbicide appl or 
approved equal 60 NAS NAS 
Manufacturer: No Bid Red River Specialties, Inc. Exacto-RRSI No Bid Winfield 
Product No: Elite Amplify White Dove 90 
Container Size: 2.5 Qallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 
Price per gallon: $22.00 $18.00 

~1~~~~? I::.xtenCleCl Price: $1,320.00 $1,080.00 

5 Roundup Custom Herbicide, Broad Spectrum 
Turf, AquatiC, Ornamental and Right-of-Way 
or aooroved eaual 80 
Manufacturer: Nufarm Monsanto Monsanto-Roundup Custom No Bid Monsanto 
Product No: 10021225 Aqua Neat Roundup Custom EPA #524-343 
Container Size: 2.5 Qallon 2.5 Qallon 2.5 Qallon 2.5 Qallon 
Price per gallon: $28.38 $21.00 $19.75 

~1~~~'~r ExtenCleCl Price: $2,270.40 $1,680.00 $1,580.00 

6 Herbicide, Woody Plants, Broadleaf Weeds 
in ROWS, Non-irrigation Ditch Banks, 
roadsides and aauatic or aooroved eaual 100 NAS 
Manufacturer: Dow AgroScience Dow Dow AgroSciences-Garlon 3A Dow AgroSciences-Garlon 3A Dow AgroSciences 
Product No: 502180 Garlon 3A Element 3A EPA #62719-37 EPA #62719-37 
Container Size: 2.5 Qallon 2.5 Qallon 2.5 qallon 2.5 qallon Garlon 3A 2.5 Qallon 
Price per gallon: $102.44 $47.50 $66.50 $52.00 $60.00 
Extended Price: $10,244.00 $4,750.00 $6,650.00 $5,200.00 $6,000.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tab 

Opened: March 10,2014 
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local, Alternate Bid Non-Local 

For: Annual Contract for Herbicides John Deere Landscapes Red River Specialties, Inc. White Dove Distributing White Dove Disttributing Winfield, LLC. 

1385 East 36th Street 1324 N. Hearne Avenue, 9520 Ridgeline Rd. 9520 Ridgeline Rd. 6085 Corridor Parkway #150 
6100003726 DS Suite 120 

Estimated Cleveland, Shreveport, New Braunfels, New Braunfels, Schertz, Item Description Annual OH 44114 LA 71107 TX 78132 TX 78132 TX 78154 
Quantities 800-321-5325 830-608-2903 830-608-2903 210-590-2932 

7 Deleted 75 

8 Herbicide, annual and perennial weeds and 
unwanted woody plants, ROWS, ditch banks 
or dry drainaqe ditches or approved equal 25 
Manufacturer: Dupont AQsurf Dupont-Excort XP No Bid Dupont 
Product No: 503421 Escort XP Metcel VMF EPA # 352-439 
Container Size: 160z. 16 oz 16 oz Escort 1 Ib 
Price per pound: $43.62 $80.00 $111.20 $99.36 t:xtended t-'nce: $1 o~o ~o ~l,UUU.UU $2,780.00 $2,484.00 

9 Agro Sciences - Vista XRT Herbicide, annual 
and perenial broadleaf weed and woody 
brush ROWS, Non-irrigation, ditch banks 
and roadsides or acoroved eaual 75 
Manufacturer: No Bid Dow Dow AgroSciences - Vista XRT No Bid Dow AgroSciences 
Product No: Vista XRT EPA #62719-586 
Container Size: 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 2.5 gallon 
Price per gallon: $180.00 $172.35 $171.9E 
Extended Price: $13,500.00 $12,926.25 $12897.00 

10 Outsider Herbicide, selective control of 
annual and perennial grasses and broadleaf 
weeds pasture grasses, rangelands, non-
crao areas or aooroved eoual 600 
Manufacturer: No Bid Monsanto Monsanto-Outrider No Bid Monsanto 
Product No: Outrider EPA # 524-500 
Container Size: 20 ounce 20 oz 20 oz 
Price per gallon: $14.00 $13.99 $15.58 
Extended Price: $8,400.00 $8,394.00 $9,348.00 

11a Perspective Herbicide, broaleaf weeds, 
terrestrial and riparian invasive and noxious 
weeds ROWS, Non-irrigation ditch banks or 
approved equal 25 
Manufacturer: No Bid Dupont Dupont - Perspective No Bid Dupont 
Product No: Perspective EPA # 352-846 
Container Size: 1.25 pound 1.25 pound 1.251b 
Price per pounds: $73.60 $73.55 $73.60 Extended Price: $1,840.00 $1,838.75 $1,840.00 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tab 

Opened: March 10,2014 
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local, Alternate Bid Non-Local 

For: Annual Contract for Herbicides John Deere Landscapes Red River Specialties, Inc. White Dove Distributing White Dove Disttributing Winfield, LLC. 

1385 East 36th Street 1324 N. Hearne Avenue, 9520 Ridgeline Rd. 9520 Ridgeline Rd. 6085 Corridor Parkway #150 
6100003726 OS Suite 120 

Estimated Cleveland, Shreveport, New Braunfels, New Braunfels, Schertz, 
Item Description Annual OH 44114 LA 71107 TX 78132 TX 78132 TX 78154 

Quantities 800-321-5325 830-608-2903 830-608-2903 210-590-2932 

11b Perspective Herbicide, broadleaf weeds, 
terrestrial and riparian invasive and noxious 
weeds ROWS, Non-irrigation ditch banks or 
approved equal 25 
Manufacturer: No Bid Dupont Dupont-Perspective No bid Dupont 
Product No: Perspective EPA # 352-846 
Container Size: 5 pound 5# 51b 
Price per pounds: $73.60 $73.55 $73.60 
Extended Price: $1,840.00 $1,838.75 $1,840.00 

12 Streamline Herbicide, broad leaf weeds, 
woody species, terrestrial and riparian 
invasive and noxious weeds ROWS non-
irriQation ditch banks and roadsides. or 30 
Manufacturer: No Bid Dupont Dupont-Streamline No Bid Dupont 
Product No: Streamline EPA # 352-848 
Container Size: 3 pound 3# 31b 
Price per pounds: $82.40 $82.35 $82.40 
Extended Price: $2,472.00 $2,470.50 $2,472.00

1 

Delivery after order 5 days 7 days 1 - 3 days 1 - 3 days 2 days 

Payment Term Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $14,018.10 $40,202.00 $42,515.75 $5,200.00 $43,884.60 
Estimated Annual Award $1,090.50 $14542.00 $5,200.00 $19900.60 

Deleted . Item 7 will be rebid at a later date. 
• Items Identified NAS in this Bid Tabulation did not meet COSA's Integrated Pest Management Program requirements. 
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Opened: April 21,2014 
Annual Contract for Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and 

For: Accessories 

6100003923 

Item Description 

1 
Crouse-Hinds by Eaton Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and 
Accessories Catalog 
Percent of discount offered 
Type of price schedule/catalog (dealer, jobber, etc.) 

Price schedule/catalog number 

Date of price schedule/catalog 

Price schedule/catalog column on which discount is based 
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale,etc.) 

Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only: 

62 Watt Sign lamp # 20590 

Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

45 Watt Taxiway Lamp #10047-1497 

Unit Price Before Discount 

% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

1.5" Frangible Coupling #50049 

Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Sign Panel Size 3-2 Model #60667-7 
Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Guidance Sign Size 3-1 Model #85831-5-1-20 
Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 

Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

2 ADB Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and Accessories Catalog 

Percent of discount offered 
Type of price schedule/catalog (dealer, jobber, etc.) 

Price schedule/catalog number 

Date of price schedule/catalog 
Price schedule/catalog column on which discount is based 

Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only: 

18 watt Sign Lamp # 48A0376 
Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

48 watt Runway lamp # 48A0420 
Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Runway TDZ Light # 44A4763-211 
Unit Price Before Discount 

% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Sign Panel Size 3 -2 Mod # 44A60841/320 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

NON-LOCAL 

Airport Lighting Systems, Inc. 

SM 931 S. Church St. 

Evaluation 
Grapevine, 
TX 76051 

Quantity 817-912-0400 

12';' 

Manufacturer' 
201 
201 

list Pric 

1 
$42.0 

12';' 
$36.96 

2014 

1 
$11.2~ 

12';' 
$9.90 

201 

1 

$11.25 

12';' 
$9.90 

201 

1 
$1,232.18 

12';' 
$1,084.32 

201 

1 
$3,454.70 

12';' 
$3,040.14 

201 

1';' 
Manufacture(s 

201 

201 
List Price 

1 
$13.85 

1';' 
$13.71 

201 

1 
$14.76 

1';' 

$14.61 

201 

1 
$303.09 

1';' 
$300.06 

201 

1 
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NON-LOCAL 

ADB Airfield Solutions, LLC Graybar Electric Co. 

977 Gahanna Parkway 4503 Perrin Creek 

Columbus, San Antonio, 
OH 43230 TX 78217 

NAS 

No Bid 20% 

N/A 
N/A 

2013 

N/A 

No Bid $43.47 

20% 
$34.78 

N/A 

No Bid $11.64 

20% 
$9.31 

N/A 

No Bid $11.64 

20% 
$9.31 

N/A 

No Bid $1,275.31 

20% 

$1,020.25 
N/A 

No Bid $3,575.61 

20% 
$2,860.49 

N/A 

0% No Bid 

Price List 
Price List 

2013 
Price List - 2013 

$13.85 No Bid 

0% 
$13.85 

Price List 2013 

$14.76 No Bid 

0% 
$14.76 

Price List 2013 

$303.09 No Bid 

0% 
$303.09 

Price List 2013 



Opened: April 21,2014 
Annual Contract for Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and 

For: Accessories 

6100003923 

Hem Description 

Unit Price Before Discount 

% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Guidance Sign Size 3 -2 Mod # SF33-3240230 
Unit Price Before Discount 

% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 

Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

3 Liberty Airport Lighting Parts, Signs, and Accessories Catalog 

Percent of discount offered 

Type of price schedule/catalog (dealer, jobber, etc.) 

Price schedule/catalog number 

Date of price schedule/catalog 
Price schedule/catalog column on which discount is based 

Specified Items for Evaluation Purposes Only: 

DMCU, CCR interface Megger# WBC-801-111 
Unit Price Before Discount 

% Discount 

Unit Price After Discount 

Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

HV Monitoring Assembly # WBC-023-1 02 
Unit Price Before Discount 

% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Power Supply for D518 120 volt # E348315 

Unit Price Before Discount 

% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Industrial PC Core i5 # TCP-5120-BTO 
Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 

Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

AC input Module 480 volt # WBC-021-480 
Unit Price Before Discount 
% Discount 
Unit Price After Discount 
Price Schedule/Catalog Information and Date 

Payment Terms 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

NON-LOCAL 

Airport Lighting Systems, Inc. 

SM 931 S. Church St. 

Evaluation 
Grapevine, 

Quantity 
TX 76051 
817-912-0400 

$792.5 
1';' 

$784.6 

201 

1 

$4,762.3 

1';' 

$4,714.72 

201 

No Bid 

1 No Bid 

1 No Bid 

1 No Bid 

1 No Bid 

1 No Bid 

Net 30 
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NON-LOCAL 

ADB Aimeld Solutions, LLC Graybar Electric Co. 

977 Gahanna Parkway 4503 Perrin Creek 

Columbus, San Antonio, 
OH 43230 TX 78217 

$792.57 No Bid 

0% 
$792.57 

Price List 2013 

$4,762.34 No Bid 

0% 
$4,762.34 

Price List 2013 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 

Net 30 Net 30 



Opened: 

For: 

May 5,2014 

3M RFID Service Agreement 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

6100004480 

Item Description 

1 Digital Library Assistant 
2015 Price Each 
Total Price 

2016 Price Each 
Total Price 

2017 Price Each 
Total Price 

Total Digital Library Assistant 

2 RFID Workstations and Ancillary Products/Services 
2015 Price Each 
Central Library 
Bazan 
Brookhollow 
Carver 
Cody 
Collins 
Cortez 
Forest Hills 
Great Northwest 
Guerra 
Igo 
Johnston 
Landa 
Las Palmas 
Maverick 
McCreless 
Memorial 
Mission 
Pan American 
Parman 
San Pedro 
Semmes 
Thousand Oaks 
Tobin 
Westfall 
COSA 
Total Price 

Page 1 of 3 

Sole Source 
3M Company 

3M Center 
VF Bldg 225-4N-14 

Annual St. Paul, 

Estimated MN 55144 

Quantity 651-733-1196 

34 
$870.98 

$29,613.32 

34 $893.00 
$30,362.00 

34 $893.00 
$30,362.00 

$90,337.32 

1 $36,907.42 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $9,401.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $11,984.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $7,187.00 
1 $11,984.00 
1 $8,984.00 
1 $11,984.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $6,401.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $11,984.00 
1 $9,401.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $12,722.00 
1 $7,187.00 
1 $5,294.00 
1 $4,604.00 
1 $16,837.00 
1 $9,813.00 
1 $9,770.00 
1 $9,401.00 
1 $4,428.00 

$253,999.42 



Opened: May 5,2014 

For: 3M RFID Service Agreement 

6100004480 

Item Description 

2016 Price 
Central Library 
Bazan 
Brookhollow 
Carver 
Cody 
Collins 
Cortez 
Forest Hills 
Great Northwest 
Guerra 
Igo 
Johnston 
Landa 
Las Palmas 
Maverick 
McCreless 
Memorial 
Mission 
Pan American 
Parman 
San Pedro 
Semmes 
Thousand Oaks 
Tobin 
Westfall 
COSA 
Total Price 

2017 Price 
Central Library 
Bazan 
Brookhollow 
Carver 
Cody 
Collins 
Cortez 
Forest Hills 
Great Northwest 
Guerra 
Igo 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Page 2 of 3 

VF 

Annual 
Estimated 
Quantity 

1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 

1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 

Sole Source 
3M Company 

3M Center 
Bldg 225-4N-14 
St. Paul, 
MN 55144 
651-733-1196 

$37,237.00 
$6,818.00 
$9,401.00 
$6,818.00 

$11,984.00 
$6,818.00 
$6,818.00 
$7,187.00 

$11,984.00 
$8,984.00 

$11,984.00 
$6,818.00 
$6,401.00 
$6,818.00 

$11,984.00 
$9,401.00 
$6,818.00 

$12,722.00 
$7,187.00 
$5,294.00 
$4,604.00 

$16,837.00 
$9,813.00 
$9,770.00 
$9,401.00 
$4,428.00 

$254,329.00 

$37,237.00 
$6,818.00 
$9,401.00 
$6,818.00 

$11,984.00 
$6,818.00 
$6,818.00 
$7,187.00 

$11,984.00 
$8,984.00 

$11,984.00 



Opened: 

For: 

May 5,2014 

3M RFID Service Agreement 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

6100004480 

Item Description 

Johnston 
Landa 
Las Palmas 
Maverick 
McCreless 
Memorial 
Mission 
Pan American 
Parman 
San Pedro 
Semmes 
Thousand Oaks 
Tobin 
Westfall 
COSA 
Total Price 

Total RFID Workstations and AnCillary Products/Services 

Terms 

Estimated Annual Total 

Estimated Total Award 

Page 3 of 3 

Sole Source 
3M Company 

3M Center 
VF Bldg 225-4N-14 

Annual St. Paul, 

Estimated MN 55144 

Quantity 651-733-1196 

1 $6,818.00 
1 $6,401.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $11,984.00 
1 $9,401.00 
1 $6,818.00 
1 $12,722.00 
1 $7,187.00 
1 $5,294.00 
1 $4,604.00 
1 $16,837.00 
1 $9,813.00 
1 $9,770.00 
1 $9,401.00 
1 $4,428.00 

$254,329.00 

$762,657.42 

Net 30 

$852,994.74 
$852,994.74 


