City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 20, 2013
For: Mobile Application Development for the
’ San Antonio Public Library NAS*
BiblioCommons, Inc. Boopsie, Inc. MindKube, LLC Numeric Technologies Corp.
119 Spadina Ave, Suite 1000 (157 So. Murphy Ave., 542 Marian Ct. 470 Old Worthington Rd.
6100003779 IM
Toronto, Sunnyvale, Titusville, Westerville,
ltem Description ON, M5V2L1 CA, 94086 FL, 32780 OH 43082
647-436-6381
MOBILE APP
1 License and Implementation, Year 1 $77,580.00 $45,690.00 $48,000.00 No Bid
2 Service & Support for Year 2 $27,690.00 $42,995.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
3 Service & Support for Year 3 $29,630.00 $44,995.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
4 Service & Support for Year 4 $31,700.00 $45,995.00 $25,000.00 No Bid
Total $166,600.00 $179,675.00 $123,000.00 No Bid
Total Estimated Award $166,600.00

*NAS - Vendor offered custom solution.
City required off the shelf customizable
solution.



