
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 21, 2014

For: Local Local

Facilities Solutions Inc. One Stop Services, Inc.               

d/b/a One Stop Floor Covering
6100003689 JG 11339 Woodridge Forest 5401 Bandera Road

Item Site Location
Estimated Annual 

Quantity (Cycle)

San Antonio,                                            

TX 78249                                     

210-389-9761

San Antonio,                                                 

TX 78238

INTERIOR CLEANING CYCLES:

1A Municipal Plaza: First Level and Mezzanine Level 2
Price (Per Cycle) $800.00 $650.00
Extended Cost $1,600.00 $1,300.00

1B Municipal Plaza: Level 2 - Level 11 1
Price (Per Cycle) $2,500.00 $1,400.00
Extended Cost $2,500.00 $1,400.00

2 City Hall 2
Price (Per Cycle) $1,500.00 $1,400.00
Extended Cost $3,000.00 $2,800.00

3 Plaza de Armas 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,550.00 $450.00
Extended Cost $1,550.00 $450.00

4 Municipal Court Building 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,550.00 $700.00
Extended Cost $1,550.00 $700.00

5 Public Safety Headquarters 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $2,800.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $2,800.00

6 Public Safety & Technology Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $300.00

7 Police Academy 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $1,000.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $1,000.00

8 International Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $750.00 $2,900.00
Extended Cost $750.00 $2,900.00

9 One Stop Building 1
Price (Per Cycle) $750.00 $1,500.00
Extended Cost $750.00 $1,500.00

10 Visitor’s Information Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $750.00 $100.00
Extended Cost $750.00 $100.00

11 Fire Training Academy 1
Price (Per Cycle) $750.00 $100.00
Extended Cost $750.00 $100.00

12 Emergency Operations Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $750.00 $500.00
Extended Cost $750.00 $500.00

13 Public Safety Answering Point 1
Price (Per Cycle) $900.00 $800.00
Extended Cost $900.00 $800.00

14 SAPD Property & Evidence Facility 1
Price (Per Cycle) $750.00 $700.00
Extended Cost $750.00 $700.00

Annual Contract for Window Cleaning Services



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 21, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Window Cleaning Services Local Local

Facilities Solutions Inc. One Stop Services, Inc.               

dba One Stop Floor Covering
6100003689 JG 11339 Woodridge Forest 5401 Bandera Road

Item Site Location
Estimated Annual 

Quantity (Cycle)

San Antonio,                                            

TX 78249                                     

210-389-9761

San Antonio,                                                 

TX 78238

15 Central Library 1

Price (Per Cycle) $2,000.00 $5,000.00
Extended Cost $2,000.00 $5,000.00

16 Bazan Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $600.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $1,200.00

17 Brook Hollow Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $325.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $650.00

18 Carver Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $325.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $650.00

19 Cody Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $400.00

20 Collins Garden Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $600.00

21 Cortez Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $600.00

22 Evans Road Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $600.00

23 Forrest Hills Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $600.00

24 Great Northwest Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $450.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $900.00

25 Guerra Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $600.00

26 Igo Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $450.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $900.00

27 Johnston Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $275.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $550.00

28 Landa Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $400.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $800.00

29 Las Palmas Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $400.00



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 21, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Window Cleaning Services Local Local

Facilities Solutions Inc. One Stop Services, Inc.               

dba One Stop Floor Covering
6100003689 JG 11339 Woodridge Forest 5401 Bandera Road

Item Site Location
Estimated Annual 

Quantity (Cycle)

San Antonio,                                            

TX 78249                                     

210-389-9761

San Antonio,                                                 

TX 78238

30 Maverick Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $400.00

31 McCreless Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $400.00

32 Memorial Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $250.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $500.00

33 Mission Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $650.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $1,300.00

34 Pan American Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $400.00

35 Parman Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $650.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $1,300.00

36 San Pedro Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $400.00

37 Semmes Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $600.00

38 Thousand Oaks Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $150.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $300.00

39 Tobin at Oakwell Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $125.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $250.00

40 Westfall Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $100.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $200.00

41 District 2 New Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 No Bid
Extended Cost $300.00

42 District 6 New Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 No Bid
Extended Cost $300.00

43 Deleted

44 San Antonio Natitorium 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $225.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $450.00



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 21, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Window Cleaning Services Local Local

Facilities Solutions Inc. One Stop Services, Inc.               

dba One Stop Floor Covering
6100003689 JG 11339 Woodridge Forest 5401 Bandera Road

Item Site Location
Estimated Annual 

Quantity (Cycle)

San Antonio,                                            

TX 78249                                     

210-389-9761

San Antonio,                                                 

TX 78238

45 Parking Administration Building 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $150.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $300.00

46 Parking Garages (Short and Long Term) 2
Price (Per Cycle) $150.00 $2,500.00
Extended Cost $300.00 $5,000.00

EXTERIOR CLEANING CYCLES:

47A Municipal Plaza: First Level and Mezzanine Level 2
Price (Per Cycle) $500.00 $600.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $1,200.00

47B Municipal Plaza: Level 2 - Level 11 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,500.00 $1,850.00
Extended Cost $1,500.00 $1,850.00

48 City Hall 2
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $1,000.00
Extended Cost $2,000.00 $2,000.00

49 Plaza de Armas 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $300.00

50 Municipal Court Building 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $600.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $600.00

51 Public Safety Headquarters 1
Price (Per Cycle) $4,000.00 $8,800.00
Extended Cost $4,000.00 $8,800.00

52 Public Safety & Technology Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $200.00

53 Police Academy 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $1,200.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $1,200.00

54 International Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $1,800.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $1,800.00

55 One Stop Building 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $1,000.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $1,000.00

56 Visitor’s Information Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $100.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $100.00

57 Fire Training Academy 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $100.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $100.00

58 Emergency Operations Center 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $550.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $550.00



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 21, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Window Cleaning Services Local Local

Facilities Solutions Inc. One Stop Services, Inc.               

dba One Stop Floor Covering
6100003689 JG 11339 Woodridge Forest 5401 Bandera Road

Item Site Location
Estimated Annual 

Quantity (Cycle)

San Antonio,                                            

TX 78249                                     

210-389-9761

San Antonio,                                                 

TX 78238

59 Public Safety Answering Point 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $300.00

60 SAPD Property & Evidence Facility 1
Price (Per Cycle) $1,000.00 $850.00
Extended Cost $1,000.00 $850.00

61 Central Library 4
Price (Per Cycle) $4,000.00 $7,000.00
Extended Cost $16,000.00 $28,000.00

62 Bazan Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $600.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $1,200.00

63 Brook Hollow Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $600.00

64 Carver Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $275.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $550.00

65 Cody Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $125.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $250.00

66 Collins Garden Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $125.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $250.00

67 Cortez Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $600.00

68 Evans Road Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $225.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $450.00

69 Forrest Hills Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $600.00

70 Great Northwest Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $500.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $1,000.00

71 Guerra Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $350.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $700.00

72 Igo Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $500.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $1,000.00

73 Johnston Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $125.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $250.00



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 21, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Window Cleaning Services Local Local

Facilities Solutions Inc. One Stop Services, Inc.               

dba One Stop Floor Covering
6100003689 JG 11339 Woodridge Forest 5401 Bandera Road

Item Site Location
Estimated Annual 

Quantity (Cycle)

San Antonio,                                            

TX 78249                                     

210-389-9761

San Antonio,                                                 

TX 78238

74 Landa Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $600.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $1,200.00

75 Las Palmas Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $600.00

76 Maverick Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $400.00

77 McCreless Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $400.00

78 Memorial Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $600.00

79 Mission Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $750.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $1,500.00

80 Pan American Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $600.00

81 Parman Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $750.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $1,500.00

82 San Pedro Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $200.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $400.00

83 Semmes Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $600.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $1,200.00

84 Thousand Oaks Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $125.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $250.00

85 Tobin at Oakwell Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $125.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $250.00

86 Westfall Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 $300.00
Extended Cost $600.00 $600.00

87 District 2 New Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 No Bid
Extended Cost $600.00

88 District 6 New Branch Library 2
Price (Per Cycle) $300.00 No Bid
Extended Cost $600.00

89 Deleted



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 21, 2014

For: Annual Contract for Window Cleaning Services Local Local

Facilities Solutions Inc. One Stop Services, Inc.               

dba One Stop Floor Covering
6100003689 JG 11339 Woodridge Forest 5401 Bandera Road

Item Site Location
Estimated Annual 

Quantity (Cycle)

San Antonio,                                            

TX 78249                                     

210-389-9761

San Antonio,                                                 

TX 78238

90 San Antonio Natitorium 2
Price (Per Cycle) $250.00 $225.00
Extended Cost $500.00 $450.00

91 Parking Administration Building 2
Price (Per Cycle) $750.00 $100.00
Extended Cost $1,500.00 $200.00

92 Parking Garages (Short and Long Term) 2
Price (Per Cycle) $3,000.00 $2,100.00
Extended Cost $6,000.00 $4,200.00

93 San Antonio International Airport Terminal A 2
Price (Per Cycle) $4,000.00 $9,500.00
Extended Cost $8,000.00 $19,000.00

94 San Antonio International Airport Terminal B 2
Price (Per Cycle) $4,000.00 $4,900.00
Extended Cost $8,000.00 $9,800.00

Payment Terms 2%, 10 Days 2%, 10 Days

Estimated Annual Total $105,300.00 $143,050.00
Estimated Annual Award $105,300.00

Deleted: Items 43 and 89 will not be re-bid.


