
City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 27, 2015

For: Annual Contract Two-Way Radio Batteries and Chargers NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL

Global Technology Systems, 

Inc.

d/b/a Honeywell Batteries

Interstate All Battery Center Multiplier Industries LLC SAT Radio 

Communications, LTD

d/b/a Industrial 

Communications

VF 550 Cochituate Rd

Ste 15

8143 Agora Parkway, Suite 

125
2170 Brandon Trail 1019 East Euclid Ave

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantity

Framingham,

MA  01701

508-907-6676

Selma,

TX  78154

Alpharetta,

GA  30004

San Antonio,

TX  78212

NAS NAS

A1 SPECIFIED ITEMS

1 NeoCell LiP Battery for P7100/P7200 2,000

Unit Cost $73.50 $50.00 $58.30 $88.28

Total Cost $147,000.00 $100,000.00 $116,600.00 $176,560.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HMA2104-LIP RAD0174 MX1912LIP 4100mAh GTS-HMA2104-LIP

2 NeoCell LiP Battery for XG75/P7300 350

Unit Cost $65.00 $69.35 $58.30 $71.50

Total Cost $22,750.00 $24,272.50 $20,405.00 $25,025.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HNPA9-LIP RAD0571 MX234361LIP 4100mAh 

with belt clip
GTS-HNPA9-LIP

3 Single Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for P7100/P7200 5

Unit Cost $96.25 $39.90 No Bid $105.88

Total Cost $481.25 $199.50 $529.40

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101-CHG RAD0198 GTS-HCH-P7101-CHG

4 Single Bay Desktop Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Cig 

Lighter Adapter for P7100/P7200
25

Unit Cost $96.25 $43.50 No Bid $105.88

Total Cost $2,406.25 $1,087.50 $2,647.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101DCC-CHG RAD0251 GTS-HCH-P7101DCC-CHG

5 Single Bay Desktop Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Hard-

Wire for P7100/P7200
50

Unit Cost $96.25 No Bid No Bic $105.88

Total Cost $4,812.50 $5,294.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101DCH-CHG GTS-HCH-P7101DCH-DC

6 4-Slot Battery Only VehicleTri-Chemistry Charger with Hard 

Wire for P7100/P7200
5

Unit Cost $398.00 No Bid No Bid $438.90

Total Cost $1,990.00 $2,194.50

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7104DC-CHG GTS-HCH-P7104DC-CHG

6100005167
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7 4-Slot Battery Only Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for 

P7100/P7200
2

Unit Cost $398.00 No Bid No Bid $438.90

Total Cost $796.00 $877.80

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7104-CHG GTS-HCH-P7104-CHG

8 6-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for P7100/P7200 2

Unit Cost $590.00 $388.50 No Bid $656.43

Total Cost $1,180.00 $777.00 $1,312.86

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7106-CHG RAD7532 GTS-HCH-P7106-CHG

9 Single Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for XG75/P7300 25

Unit Cost $77.00 $48.00 $28.70 $88.08

Total Cost $1,925.00 $1,200.00 $717.50 $2,202.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7301-CHG RAD9969 TWC1-HA1 GTS-HCH-P7301-CHG

10 Single-Bay Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Cig Lighter 

Adapter for XG75/P7300
5

Unit Cost $77.00 No Bid $37.70 $88.08

Total Cost $385.00 $188.50 $440.40

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7301DCC-CHG TWC1M-HA1 GTS-HCH-P7301DCC-CHG

11 Single-Bay Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Hard-Wire for 

XG75/P7300
5

Unit Cost $77.00 No Bid $47.70 $88.08

Total Cost $385.00 $238.50 $440.40

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7301DCH-CHG TWC1M-HA1, TWC6M-HW GTS-HCH-P7301DCH-CHG

12 6-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for XG75/P7300 25

Unit Cost $465.50 $418.50 $229.00 $512.05

Total Cost $11,637.50 $10,462.50 $5,725.00 $12,801.25

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7306-CHG RAD9970 TWC6M-HA1 GTS-HCH-P7306-CHG
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13 Universal Single-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for 

XG75/P7300/P7100/P7200
50

Unit Cost $77.00 No Bid No Bid $105.88

Total Cost $3,850.00 $5,294.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-XG1-CHG GTS-HCH-XG1-CHG

14 Universal 6-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for 

XG75/P7300/P7100/P7200
13

Unit Cost $465.50 No Bid No Bid $512.05

Total Cost $6,051.50 $6,656.65

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-XG6-CHG GTS-HCH-XG6-CHG

15 Single-Bay Vehicle Charger Mounting Bracket 60

Unit Cost $15.00 No Bid $8.90 $14.44

Total Cost $900.00 $534.00 $866.40

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101DC-BKT TWC1M-MBH GTS-HCH-P7101DC-BKT

16 Wall Mounting Bracket - 25 Degree Angle 10

Unit Cost $15.00 No Bid No Bid $16.50

Total Cost $150.00 $165.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-W2MNT-BKT GTS-HCH-W2MNT-BKT

17 Power Supply Mounting Bracket for HCH-W2MNT-BKT 5

Unit Cost $10.00 No Bid No Bid $16.50

Total Cost $50.00 $82.50

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-PS-BKT HCH-PS-BKT

18 Upgrade/Modifications/Installations to Enhanced Vehicular 

Charger
250

Unit Cost $45.00 No Bid No Bid $14.30

Total Cost $11,250.00 $3,575.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeywell / GTS

Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7191DC-BKT HCH-P7101DC-BKT
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19 Removal of Enhanced Vehicular Chargers from Vehicles 250

Unit Cost $45.00 No Bid No Bid $85.00

Total Cost $11,250.00 $21,250.00

Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Industrial Comm.

Manufacturer Part # EVC Removal R1

Catalog Discount, Radio Batteries and Supplies

Percent of Discount Offered 50% 25% Not Specified 5%

Catalog / Price List and / or Number GTS 2-Way Radio Price List N/A Not Specified Two-Way Radios 2014 Price 

ListPrice Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based List Price N/A Not Specified GTS Batteries List Price

Date of Catalog / Price List February 26, 2015 N/A Not Specified July 16, 2014 (Current Price 

Book)

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Total $229,250.00 $268,214.16

Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0%

Estimated Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $229,250.00 $268,214.16

Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 14.53%

Price Differential $38,964.16

Non-Local Preference Award $229,250.00

Estimated Total Award $229,250.00
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