LOC
4/30/15
Item No. 9

ANORDINANCE 2015-04-30-0335

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $417,000.00: (A) NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT
FOR WIRTGEN RECLAIMER & MILLING MACHINE PARTS AND
SERVICE, (B) GLOBAL TECHNOLOGY SYSTEMS, INC. FOR
TWO-WAY RADIO BATTERIES AND CHARGERS, (C)
STANBIO/EKF DIAGNOSTICS FOR HEMOPOINT H2 CUVETTES
AND ACCESSORIES FOR SAMHD, AND (D) UTEC FOR LEMCO
CRANE PARTS AND SERVICE.

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Nueces
Power Equipment for Wirtgen reclaimer & milling machine parts and service, (B) Global
Technology Systems, Inc. for two-way radio batteries and chargers, (C) Stanbio/EKF
Diagnostics for HemoPoint H2 cuvettes and accessories for SAMHD, and (D) UTEC for Lemco
crane parts and service; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves one low bid contract, one contract which provides for a
procurement necessary to protect the public health or safety, and two sole source contracts; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Nueces Power
Equipment for Wirtgen reclaimer & milling machine parts and service, (B) Global Technology
Systems, Inc. for two-way radio batteries and chargers, (C) Stanbio/EKF Diagnostics for
HemoPoint H2 cuvettes and accessories for SAMHD, and (D) UTEC for Lemco crane parts and
service on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby
accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits,
insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection
in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2015 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals. The combined
estimated cost for the contracts listed on this ordinance is approximately $417,000.00.



LOC
4/30/15
Item No. 9

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the offers from Interstate All Battery Center
and Multiplier Industries, LLC for two-way radio batteries and chargers failed to meet the City’s
specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight or more
affirmative votes; otherwise, it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

beuﬂt- c')?-zf-m

M A Y O R
Ivy R. Taylor

PASSED and APPROVED this 30" day of April, 2015.

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

M {l)(m\ ey U\T/\&/hfh

5< Martha G. Sepeda, AvcﬁngJ City Attorney




Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item: 9 (in consent vote: 6,7,8,9,11, 12, 13, 14, 15A, 15B, 16A, 16B, 16C, 16D, 17, 18, 19A, 19B, 20,
21, 22, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30 )
Date: 04/30/2015
Time: 11:00:22 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for
an estimated annual cost of $417,000.00: (A) Nueces Power Equipment for Wirtgen reclaimer &
milling machine parts and service, (B) Global Technology Systems, Inc. for two-way radio batteries
and chargers, (C) Stanbio/EKF Diagnostics for HemoPoint H2 cuvettes and accessories for SAMHD,
and (D) UTEC for Lemco crane parts and service. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott,
Director, Finance] |
Result: Passed
Not . .
Voter Group Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X
Alan Warrick District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X X
http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx 4/30/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

EXHIBIT I

Opened: March 6, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Wirtgen Reclaimer & Milling
’ Machine Parts & Service NON-LOCAL
Nueces Power Equipment
4697 FM 1516
6100005538 M
Estimated |Converse,
Item Description Annual |TX 78109
Usage ]210-310-0066
1 Wirtgen Reclaimer & Milling Machine,
Iitem 1A, Parts Discount
A Percent of discount offered 0
B Product identification (Manufacturer) Wirtgen
C Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Retail
D Price schedule number N/A|
E Date of price schedule Current|
F Price Schedule Column on which Discount is N/A|
Based (i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G Warranty As described by the Manufacturer
18 Specified ltems for evaluation purposes only
2 Labor and Service
A Labor and Service Rate (Per Hour) $120.00
B Mileage Charge, if applicable (Per Mile) Not Specified|
C Expedited Labor and Service Rate (Per Hour) N/A]
D Vendor Business Days Are Mon - Fri
E Vendor Hours of Operation Are 8AM - 5PM
F Parts and Service Facilities Name Nueces Power Equipment|
G Parts and Service Facilities Address 4697 FM 1516 Converse 78109

Payment Terms

Net 30|




Opened: February 27, 2015
For:

City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract Two-Way Radio Batteries and Chargers NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
Globai Technology Systems, [interstate All Battery Center |Multiplier industries LLC SAT Radio
Inc. Commiunications, LTD
d/b/a Honeywell Batteries d/b/a Industrial
Communications
6100005167 VF gfg “Ctsochltuate Rd ?;;13 Agora Parkway, Suite 2170 Brandon Trail 1019 East Euclid Ave
Estimated |Framingham, Selma, Alpharetta, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual MA 01701 TX 78154 GA 30004 TX 78212
Quantity  [508-907-6676
NAS NAS
A1 SPECIFIED ITEMS
1 NeoCell LiP Battery for P7100/P7200 2,000
Unit Cost $73.50 $50.00 $58.30 $88.28
Totat Cost $147,000.00] $100,000.00 $116,600.00 $176,560.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HMA2104-LIP| RADO0174 MX1912LIP 4100mAh GTS-HMA2104-LIP
2 NeoCell LiP Battery for XG75/P7300 350
Unit Cost $65.00] $69.35 $58.30 $71.50
Total Cost $22,750.00] $24,272.50 $20,405.00 $25,025.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems] Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HNPAS-LIP RADO0571 MX234361LIP 4100mAh GTS-HNPAS-LIP
3 Single Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for P7100/P7200 5
Unit Cost $96.25 $39.90 No Bid $105.88
Total Cost $481.25 $199.50 $529.40
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Interstate Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101-CHG| RADO0198 GTS-HCH-P7101-CHG
4 Single Bay Desktop Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Cig 25
Unit Cost $96.25 $43.50 No Bid $105.88
Total Cost $2,406.25 $1,087.50 $2,647.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems] Interstate Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101DCC-CHG RADO0251 GTS-HCH-P7101DCC-CHG
5 Single Bay Desktop Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Hard- 50
Unit Cost $96.25] No Bid No Bic $105.88
Total Cost $4,812.50] $5,294.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems] Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101DCH-CHG GTS-HCH-P7101DCH-DC
6 4-Slot Battery Only VehicleTri-Chemistry Charger with Hard 5
Unit Cost $398.00 No Bid No Bid $438.90
Total Cost $1,990.00 $2,194.50
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7104DC-CHG

GTS-HCH-P7104DC-CHG
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Opened: February 27, 2015

For:

City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract Two-Way Radio Batteries and Chargers NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
Global Technology Systems, |Interstate All Battery Center [Multiplier Industries LLC SAT Radio
Inc. Communications, LTD
d/b/a Honeywell Batteries d/b/a Industrial
Communications
6100005167 VF gf: 1Csochnuate Rd ?;‘453 Agora Parkway, Suite 2170 Brandon Trail 1019 East Eudlid Ave
Estimated |Framingham, Selma, Alpharetta, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual  |MA 01701 TX 78154 GA 30004 TX 78212
Quantity |508-907-6676
7 4-Slot Battery Only Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for 2
Unit Cost $398.00 No Bid No Bid $438.90
Total Cost $796.00] $877.80
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7104-CHG GTS-HCH-P7104-CHG
8 6-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for P7100/P7200 2
Unit Cost $590.00 $388.50 No Bid $656.43
Total Cost $1,180.00 $777.00 $1,312.86
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems; Interstate Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7106-CHG| RAD7532 GTS-HCH-P7106-CHG
9 Single Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for XG75/P7300 25
Unit Cost $77.00 $48.00 $28.70 $88.08
Total Cost $1,925.00 $1,200.00 $717.50 $2,202.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7301-CHG| RAD9969 TWC1-HA1 GTS-HCH-P7301-CHG
10 Single-Bay Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Cig Lighter 5
Unit Cost $77.00 No Bid $37.70 $88.08
Total Cost $385.00 $188.50 $440.40
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7301DCC-CHG TWC1M-HA1| GTS-HCH-P7301DCC-CHG
1 Single-Bay Vehicle Tri-Chemistry Charger with Hard-Wire for 5
Unit Cost $77.00 No Bid $47.70 $88.08
Total Cost $385.00 $238.50 $440.40
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems] Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7301DCH-CHG TWC1IM-HA1, TWCBM-HW/| GTS-HCH-P7301DCH-CHG
12 6-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for XG75/P7300 25
Unit Cost $465.50 $418.50 $229.00 $512.05
Total Cost $11,637.50] $10,462.50 $5,725.00 $12,801.25
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Interstate Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7306-CHG RAD9970 TWC6M-HA1 GTS-HCH-P7306-CHG
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Opened: February 27, 2015

City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

For: Annual Contract Two-Way Radio Batteries and Chargers NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
Global Technology Systems, [Interstate All Battery Center [Multiplier Industries LLC SAT Radio
Inc. Communications, LTD
d/b/a Honeywell Batteries d/b/a Industrial
Communications
6100005167 VF gf;) 1C:Sochnu.:-)te Rd ?;gs Agora Parkway, Suite 2170 Brandon Trail 1019 East Euclid Ave
Estimated |Framingham, Seima, Alpharetta, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual MA 01701 TX 78154 GA 30004 TX 78212
Quantity  1508-907-6676
13 Universal Single-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for 50
Unit Cost $77.00] No Bid No Bid $105.88
Total Cost $3,850.00 $5,294.00
Manufacturer Name Globat Technology Systems| Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-XG1-CHG GTS-HCH-XG1-CHG
14 Universal 6-Bay Desktop Tri-Chemistry Charger for 13
Unit Cost $465.50 No Bid No Bid $512.05
Total Cost $6,051.50] $6,656.65
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-XG6-CHG GTS-HCH-XG6-CHG
15 Single-Bay Vehicle Charger Mounting Bracket 60
Unit Cost $15.00 No Bid $8.90 $14.44
Total Cost $900.00 $534.00 $866.40
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems] Multiplier Industries LLC Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7101DC-BKT| TWC1M-MBH| GTS-HCH-P7101DC-BKT
16 Wall Mounting Bracket - 25 Degree Angle 10
Unit Cost $15.00 No Bid No Bid $16.50
Total Cost $150.00 $165.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-W2MNT-BKT] GTS-HCH-W2MNT-BKT
17 Power Supply Mounting Bracket for HCH-W2MNT-BKT 5
Unit Cost $10.00 No Bid No Bid $16.50
Total Cost $50.00 $82.50
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Honeywell / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-PS-BKT] HCH-PS-BKT
18 Upgrade/Modifications/Installations to Enhanced Vehicular 250
Unit Cost $45.00 No Bid No Bid $14.30
Total Cost $11,250.00 $3,575.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems Honeyweli / GTS
Manufacturer Part # HCH-P7191DC-BKT] HCH-P7101DC-BKT
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Opened: February 27, 2015

For:

City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Annual Contract Two-Way Radio Batteries and Chargers NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL

Global Technology Systems, |interstate All Battery Center [Muiltiplier Industries LLC SAT Radio

Inc. Communications, LTD

d/b/a Honeywell Batteries d/b/a Industrial

Communications
6100005167 VF gf;) 1Csochnuate Rd 3223 Agora Parkway, Suite 2170 Brandon Trail 1019 East Euclid Ave
Estimated |Framingham, Selma, Alpharetta, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual  |MA 01701 TX 78154 GA 30004 TX 78212
Quantity  [508-907-6676
19 Removai of Enhanced Vehicular Chargers from Vehicles 250

Unit Cost $45.00 No Bid No Bid $85.00
Total Cost $11,250.00] $21,250.00
Manufacturer Name Global Technology Systems| Industrial Comm.
Manufacturer Part # EVC Removal R1
Catalog Discount, Radio Batteries and Supplies
Percent of Discount Offered 50%) 25% Not Specified 5%
Catalog / Price List and / or Number GTS 2-Way Radio Price List N/A Not Specified| Two-Way Radics 2014 Price
Price Schedute Column on Which Discount is Based List Price N/A Not Specified GTS Batteries List Price
Date of Catalog / Price List February 26, 2015] N/A Not Specified] July 16, 2014 (Current Price
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Total $229,250.00 $268,214.16
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0%
Estimated Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $229,250.00] $268,214.16
Percentage between lowest responsible bid and local bid 14.53%
Price Differential $38,964.16
Non-Local Preference Award $229,250.00
Estimated Total Award $229,250.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 12, 2015
For Annual Contract for Hemopoint H2
) Cuvettes and Supplies for SAMHD
Sole Source
Stanbio/EKF Diagnostics
6100005268 KzZ 1261 N. Main Street
Estimated |Boerne,
Item Description Annual [TX 78006
Quantity 866-782-6246
1 HemoPoint H2 Cuvettes 428
Price Each $152.00
Total Price $65,056.00
2 HemoPoint H2 Photometers 5
Price Each $500.00
Total Price $2,500.00
3 HemoPoint H2 Optics Cleaner 12
Price Each $28.00
Total Price $336.00
4 HemoPoint H2 Bi-Level Hgb Controls 6
Price Each $48.00
Total Price $288.00
Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $68,180.00
Estimated Annual Award $68.180.00]|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 13, 2015
Sole Source
For: Annual Contract for Lemco Crane Parts and Service UTEC
6100005784 HH|5860 Pfeil Rd
Schertz,
Item Description TX 78154
210-566-2704
1A Lemco Crane Parts
Cost Plus Percent Markup 25%
Products Identification (Manufacturer) Lemco
Type of Price Schedule Dealer
Price Schedule Number
Date of Price Schedule
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based Net
1B Specified ltems for Evaluation Purposes Only
2 Labor and Service

Labor and Service Rate per Hour $65.00
Expedited Labor and Service Rate per Hour $85.00
Vendor Business Days Monday-Friday
Vendor Hours of Operation 8AM - 5PM
Parts and Service Facilities Name UTEC
Parts and Service Facilities Address 5860 Pfeil Rd
Prompt Payment Discount 1%, 10 days

Prepared by Purchasing 3/24/2015
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