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ANORDINANCE 2015-05-07-0363

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $433,000.00: (A) PRINCETON MEDICAL
SOLUTIONS, LLC. FOR MEDICAL VACCINES & BIOLOGICALS, (B)
PETROLEUM SOLUTIONS, INC. FOR TANK LEVEL SENSING AND
LEAK DETECTION PARTS & SERVICE, (C) RDO EQUIPMENT
COMPANY FOR JOHN DEERE INDUSTRIAL PARTS & SERVICE,
AND (D) CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC,
ELECTROTECHNICS CORPORATION, K & K SYSTEMS, INC,
PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC., TEXAS HIGHWAY
PRODUCTS, AND TRAFFIC PARTS, INC. FOR SOLAR SCHOOL
FLASHER AND PARTS.

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A)
Princeton Medical Solutions, LLC. for medical vaccines & biologicals, (B) Petroleum Solutions,
Inc. for tank level sensing and leak detection parts & service, (C) RDO Equipment Company for
John Deere industrial parts & service, and (D) Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc.,
Electrotechnics Corporation, K & K Systems, Inc., Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc., Texas
Highway Products, and Traffic Parts, Inc. for solar school flasher and parts; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves three low bid contracts, and three contracts awarded to
other than the low bidder(s) because the low bidder(s) did not meet the City’s specifications or
requirements; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Princeton
Medical Solutions, LLC. for medical vaccines & biologicals, (B) Petroleum Solutions, Inc. for
tank level sensing and leak detection parts & service, (C) RDO Equipment Company for John
Deere industrial parts & service, and (D) Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc., Electrotechnics
Corporation, K & K Systems, Inc., Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc., Texas Highway Products,
and Traffic Parts, Inc. for solar school flasher and parts on an annual contract basis as shown on
the attached bid tabulation sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the
deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The
bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I.
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Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the
Finance Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bids of Electrotechnics Corporation
(Items 7, 16, and 20), K & K Systems, Inc. (Items 16 and 20), and Traffic Parts Inc. (Item 17)
for Solar School Flasher and Parts failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 3. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of a purchase order, and payment
is authorized to various vendors. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal Year
2015 and subsequent budgets that fall within the term period of this contract approved by City
Council.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight or more affirmative

votes; otherwise, it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

M A Y O R
Ivy R. Taylor

PASSED and APPROVED this 7" day of May, 2015.

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

{\ﬂ (\)(m L 1%?\4«@

\QJMart\ha G. Sepeda, Adtirﬁg City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 7 (in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9,10,12,13,15,17,18, 19,22, 24, 25B)

Date: 05/07/2015

Time: 09:27:20 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for

an estimated annual cost of $433,000.00: (A) Princeton Medical Solutions, LLC. for medical vaccines
& biologicals, (B) Petroleum Solutions, Inc. for tank level sensing and leak detection parts & service,
(C) RDO Equipment Company for John Deere industrial parts & service, and (D) Consolidated Traffic
Controls, Inc., Electrotechnics Corporation, K & K Systems, Inc., Paradigm Traffic Systems, Inc.,
Texas Highway Products, and Traffic Parts, Inc. for solar school flasher and parts. [Ben Gorzell, Chief
Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance]

Result: Passed
Voter Group Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldaiia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X

http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx 5/7/2015



City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 5, 2014

EXHIBIT I

For:
Annual Contract for SAMHD-Medical Vaccines & Biologicals
rinceton Medical
Solutions, LLC.
6100005192 SC 425 W. Glendale St.
Estimated |Princeton,
Item Description Annual |IN 47670
Quantity |888-519-4077
A. MISCELLANEOQUS MEDICAL VACCINES AND
Catalog/List Title/Number COSA Vaccines
Product Identification (Mfr.) Merck & Co.
Date of Price Schedule 12/05/14
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based (i.e., Distributor, Wholesale]
Net, Wholesale)
Percent of Catalog Discount 10%)|
. SPECIFIED ITEMS
1) Varivax (Varicella Virus Vaccine Live) Package containing (450 45
doses) 10 single-dose 0.5 mL vials with diluent—- NDC # 00006-4827- | Packages
00, or approved equal.
Manufacturer & NDC NO. Merck & Co.
Unit Price Before Percent Discount $1,340.00
% Discount 10%)|
Net Price After Discount $1,206.00]
Extended Price $54,270.00]
2) RotaTeq (Rotavirus Vaccine, Live, Oral, Pentavalent) Package 5 Packages
containing (50 doses) 10 single-dose 2 mL tubes — NDC # 00006~
4047-41, or approved equal.
Manufacturer & NDC NO. Merck & Co|
Unit Price Before Percent Discount $1,000.00
% Discount 10%
Net Price After Discount $900.00,
Extended Price $40,500.00]
3) Gardasil (Human Papillomavirus Quadrivalent (Types 6,11,16 and 18 25
(250 doses) Vaccine, Recombinant) Package containing 10 single- Packages
dose 0.5 mL vials-NDC # 00006-4045-41, or approved equal.
Manufacturer & NDC NO. Merck & Co|
Unit Price Before Percent Discount $1,957.00]
% Discount 10%
Net Price After Discount $1,761.30
Extended Price $79,258.50
4) Zostavax (Zoster Vaccine Live) Package containing 10 single-dose 15
0.65 (150 doses) mL vials with diluent — NDC # 00006-4963-41, or Packages
approved equal.
Manufacturer & NDC NO. Merck & Co|
Unit Price Before Percent Discount $2,316.00
% Discount 10%
Net Price After Discount $2,084.40
Extended Price $93,798.00,
5) Pneumovax 23 (Pneumococcal Vaccine Polyvalent) Package 15
containing 10 (150 doses) single-dose 0.5 mL vials — 00006-4943-00, | Packages
or approved equal.
Manufacturer & NDC NO. Merck & Co.
Unit Price Before Percent Discount $963.00
% Discount 10%|
Net Price After Discount $866.70)
Extended Price $39,001.50
Payment Terms 5% 10 Days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Tank Level Sensing & Leak Detection Parts & Service Local
Petroleum Solutions, Inc.
6100005547 MB|14833 Bulverde Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX, 78247
210-661-2489
1A Veeder Root TLS 350 and TLS 350R Parts
Percent of discount offered 5%
Product identification Veeder Root|
Type price schedule Jobber
Price schedule number 577013-621 rev. AK
Date of price schedule 2-1-2015]
Price schedule column on which discount is based List
Warranty Parts Only - 1 Year|
1B Specified ltems for evaluation purposes only
2 Annual Preventive Maintenance
Preventive Maintenance for Fleet Service Centers
Southeast Service Center (TLS 350R) $201.00
Callahan Service Center (TLS 350R) $201.00,
Northwest Service Center (TLS 350R) $260.00
Northeast Service Center (TL.S 350R) $201.00
Preventive Maintenance for Police Substations
Public Safety (TLS 350R) $201.00
Patrol North (TLS 350R) $201.00
Patrol East (TLS 350R) $201.00
Patrol South (TLS 350R) $201.00
Patrol Northwest (TLS 350) $260.00
Police Training Academy (TLS 350R} $142.00
Preventive Maintenance for Airport
Airport Maintenance (TLS 350R) $201.00
Preventive Maintenance for Generators
Alamodome (TLS 350) $142.00
Airport West Cargo (TLS 300) $142.00
Information Services Department (TLS 300) $201.00
HB Gonzales Convention Center (TLS 350 Plus) $142.00
3 Repairs and Service
Labor Rate-Standard Hours $58.50
Labor Rate-Overtime Hours $87.75
4 Emergency Repairs and Service
Emergency Repairs - Labor Rate $88.50
Prompt Payment Discount Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $20,000.00

Estimated Annual Award

$20,000.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 11, 2015
For: Annual Contract for John Deere Industrial Parts & Service
Non-Local
RDO Equipment Co.
6100005687 MB 19275 IH 35 N.
Estimated |New Braunfels,
Annual |TX, 78132
Item Description Usage |830-632-3106
1A John Deere Industrial Equipment Parts
Percent of Discount Offered 0%,
Product Identification (Manufacturer) John Deere
Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.) Dealer|
Price Schedule Number N/A
Date of Price Schedule Varies (John Deere Weekly)
Price Schedule Column on Which Discount N/A
is based (i.e. distributer, net, wholesale, etc.)
90 Days (New Parts) 1 Year|
Warranty (Reman Parts
1B Specified Items for evaluation purposes only
2 Labor and Service

Labor and Service Rate - In Shop

Labor and Service Rate - Field

Expedited Labor and Service Rate

Restocking orders are placed every_ days on __ (day of week)
Parts and Service Facilities Name

Parts and Service Facilities Address

$120.00

$135.00

$186.50

5; Everyday

RDO Equipment Co.
19275 1H 35 N.

New Braunfels, TX 78132

Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $30,000.00
Estimated Annual Award $30,000.00

*Capstone Solutions is non-responsive due to no signature and no labor provided



Opened: December 3, 2014

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

For: Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts Alternate Bid 1
’ Non-Local Non-Local Non< ocal Non-Local Nondocal Non-Local Non-Local
C li Traffic | Ef hni K&K Systems, Inc Paradigm Traffic Texas Highway Traffic Parts Inc. Consolidated Traffic
Controls, Inc. Corporation Systems, Inc. Products Controls, Inc.
6100005145 N 1016 Enterprise Place 1S::r1e(ltCommerce 687 Palmetto Road 2201 E. Division St. 1309 Clark P.O. Box 837 1016 Enterprise Place
Estimated | Adington, Marshall, Tupelo, Ardington, Round Rock, Spring, Adington
ITEM Annual TX 76001 TX, 75672 MS, 38801 TX 76011 TX 78681 TX 77383 I 7600i
DESCRIPTION Quantities 817-265-3421 800-227-1734 662-566-2025 817-831-9406 512-255-7633 800-345-6329
12" Amber LED Solar traffic signal lens, to
comply with ITE specifications, TXDOT
1 approved, warranted against defects for (5)
years, and 16W LED maximum, Leotek TSL-
12Y-LX-1L1-B1 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $58.80, $62.50 $97.00 No Bid $110.00 No Bid $58.80
Extended Price $2,940.00 $3,125.00 $4,850.00 $5,500.00 $2,940.00
Leotek] Trastar, Duralight Diatight| Leotek
Manufacturer & Product No. TSL-12Y-LX-1L1-B1 JXC300HFTDCYL JXC-300DCYLS Di-433-3230-905XL TSL-12Y-LX-1L1-81
Warranty (years) 5] 2 5 5 5
2 Gelled-electrolyte solar battery, Deka #8G27
or approved equat 100
Net Unit Price $289.41 $142.28 $180.00 No Bid $250.00 No Bid $289.41
Extended Price $28,941.00 $14,228.00 $18,000.00 $25,000.00 $28,941.00
Deka Universal Weida MK Battery| Deka
Manufacturer & Product No. 8G27| UB121000 WB 121100 MK-E-278L.DG 8G27
3 Cabinet, School Zone Flasher 50
Net Unit Price $864.71 $464.70 $225.00 No Bid $325.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $43,235.50 $23,235.00 $11,250.00 $16,250.00
RTC Eltec] K&K Systems, Inc PI-CO Precision
Manufacturer & Product No. 501302 830244 KKSL 241515 2 Battery Cabinet.
4 DPC-2000 Controller, Precision Solar
#864100 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $192.29 $318.52 $788.00 No Bid $140.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $9,614.50 $15,926.00 $39,400.00 $7,000.00
RTC|
502598LCB +| Eltec (Prostar & Eltec K&K Systems, Inc THP|
Manufacturer & Product No. 500451P4 Fs2) 730256 Cross Talk-4 DPC2000-24hr-dual|
50
5 Guss Tube W/ Vinyl insert, threaded on both
sides, Pelco #AB2007-58 or approved equal
Net Unit Price $31.35 No Bid $60.00] $29.40 $33.00 No Bid $31.35
Extended Price $1,567.50 $3,000.00 $1,470.00 $1,650.00 $1,567.50
Pelco T-Parts Pelco; Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. AB-2007-58 NIPL-Y58-TIT-INN| AB-2007-58-PNC AB-2007-58-PNC AB-2007-58




Opened: December 3, 2014

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

For- Annual Contract Solar Schoot Flasher and Parts Alternate Bid 1
. Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-ocal Non-Local Non- ocal
C i Traffic  |El hnics K&K Systems, Inc Paradigm Traffic Texas Highway Traffic Parts Inc. Consolidated Traffic
Controls, Inc. Corporation Systems, Inc. Products Controls, Inc.
5100005145 a 1016 Enterprise Place ;?:e(:::ommerce 687 Palmetto Road 2201 E. Division St. 1308 Clark P.O. Box 837 1016 Enterprise Place
Estimated  |Adington, Marshall, Tupelo, Arlington, Round Rock, Spring, Addington
ITEM Annual TX 76001 TX, 75672 MS, 38801 TX 76011 TX 78681 TX 77383 I 7600i
DESCRIPTION Quantities 817-265-3421 800-227-1734 662-566-2025 817-831-9406 512-255-7633 800-345-6329
6 Post Top, Acorn type, Pelco #5401 or
approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $11.94 No Bid $17.60 $11.15 $13.00 $14.00 $11.94
Extended Price $597.00 $880.00 $557.50 $650.00 $700.00 $597.00
Pelco Akron| Pelco Pelco CH Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5401 8879 PB 5401 PB-5401-PNC 5811 PB-5401
7 Wiring Hamess for DPC-2000 Controller 50 NAS
Net Unit Price $25.88 $21.26 $35.00 No Bid| $25.00] No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $1,294.00 $1,063.00 $1,750.00 $1,250.00
RTC Eltec K&K Systems, Inc| THP|
Manufacturer & Product No. 503518 700330 Cross Talk-4W| solar harness|
8 Cabinet Mounting Bracket Mast Arm, Pelco
#SE0126 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $12.06 No Bid $13.50, $11.35 $13.00 No Bid $12.06
Extended Price $603.00 $675.00 $567.50 $650.00 $603.00
Pelco T-PARTS Pelco Peico| Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-0126 7533 SE-0126 SE-0126-PNC SE-0126
9 Astro Sign Brac, Stellar for Overhead Street
Sign, AS-0128-24-29 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $89.53 No Bid $136.00 $84.00 $93.00 No Bid $89.53
Extended Price $4,476.50 $6,800.00 $4,200.00 $4,650.00 $4,476.50
Pelco AS. T-PARTS EZBRC] Pelco| Pelco Pelco AS.
Manufacturer & Product No. 0128-24-29 877-Y24-BIN-NNP AB-0128-24-29] AS-0128-24-29-PNC 0128-24-29
10 Notched Coupling, 1-%" X 2", Pelco #SE0346
or approved equal 200
Net Unit Price $5.53 No Bid $12.00 $5.25 $5.75 $9.00 $5.53
Extended Price $1,106.00 $2,400.00 $1,050.00 $1,150.00 $1,800.00 $1,106.00
Pelco T-PARTS| Pelco| Pelco CH Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-0346 5140) SE-0346} SE-0346-PNC 5140 SE-0346
” One Way Signal Mounting Kit, Pelco
#SE3003 or approved equal 60
Net Unit Price $7.76 No Bid $12.50] $7.25 $8.00 $9.15 $7.76
Extended Price $465.60 $750.00 $435.00 $480.00 $549.00 $465.60
Pelco T-PARTS! Pelco Pelco CH Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-3003 5083, SE-3003 SE-3003-P01 5083 SE-3003
12 Aluminum Square Base w/ Plastic Door,
Pelco #PB5335 or approved equal 150
Net Unit Price $110.59 Ne Bid $136.00 $109.00 $120.00 No Bid $110.59
Extended Price $16,588.50 $20,400.00 $16.350.00 $18,000.00 $16,588.50
Pelco Akron Pelco| Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5335 PB-BAS-1-PX PB-5335( SP-1014-TX-PNC PB-5335




Opened: December 3, 2014

Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Alternate Bid 1

For Non-Local Non-lLocal Non-Local Non-Local Non-local Non-Local Non-Local
Consoli d Traffic  |Electr hni K&K Systems, Inc Paradigm Traffic Texas Highway Traffic Parts Inc. Consolidated Traffic
Controls, Inc. Corporation Systems, Inc. Products Controls, Inc.
6100005145 A 1018 Enterprise Place 1s::r1eoe‘Commerce 687 Palmetto Road 2201 E. Division St. 1309 Clark P.O. Box 837 1016 Enterprise Place
Estimated Adington, Marshall, Tupelo, Arlington, Round Rock, Spring, Adington
ITEM Annual TX 76001 TX, 75672 Ms, 38801 TX 76011 TX 78681 TX 77383 ' 76001’
DESCRIPTION Q iti 817-265-3421 800-227-1734 662-566-2025 817-831-9406 512-255-7633 800-345-6329
13 Anchor Bolts, 4 per Set, Pelco #PB5306 or
approved equal 150
Net Unit Price $26.94 No Bid $45.00] $25.00 $28.00 No Bid $26.94
Extended Price $4,041.00 $6,750.00 $3,750.00 $4,200.00 $4,041.00
Pelco Ziggler| Pelco) Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5306 PAB-24 PB-5306 PB-5306-61V PB-5306
14 Signal Mntg. Assy. Tri Stud for 8" or 12" only
signal, Pelco #SE-0567 or approved equal 50
Net Unit Price $35.59 No Bid $45.00 $32.00 $37.00 $29.95 $35.59
Extended Price $1,779.50 $2,250.00 $1,600.00 $1,850.00 $1,497.50 $1,779.50
Pelco! T-PARTS Peleo Pelco CH Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. SE-0567 7328 SE-0567] SE-0567-P29 (yellow)| 73284 SE-0567
15 4" Sign Clamp, Pelco#AB0287-04 or
approved equal 100
Net Unit Price No Bid No Bid $12.50 $9.45 $19.00] $8.45] No Bid
Extended Price $1,250.00 $945.00 $1,900.00 $845.00
T-PARTS Pelco Pelcol CH
Manufacturer & Product No. 1064 AB-0502-04-PNC SH-0206-4-PNC| 1063 3" x 6" surface|
Unbreakable Solar Panel with mounting
bracket for 4" pole, preset at 37 degrees and
16 .090 gauge aluminum back plate. Service
entries to junction box shall be weathertight.
70 W solar panel supplied w/ mounting
hardware for 4" side of pole installation 150 NAS NAS
Net Unit Price $383.851 $286.20 $283.00 No Bid $465.00 $444.95 $383.85
Extended Price $57,577.50 $42,930.00 $42,450.00 $69,750.00 $66,742.50 $57,577.50
Solar Tech & CH
384 is SPM085P-TS-F
RTC| Eftec (80-watt (85 watt); 475 is RTC
1S-70-12 + 1S Industrial Solar) K&K Systems, Inc PS85W-21F-pole Salar| mounting hardware for| 18-70-12 + IS-
Manufacturer & Product No. 50/1408PM PBSOLO8OTPO1| DS-A1-70 & SMSP-70 Harness not included 8-0-P 50/140SPM
17 Pole and Base Collar Assembly, for square
base, Pelco #PB-5325 or approved equal 150 NAS
Net Unit Price $50.88 No Bid $74.00 $47.70 $53.00 $45.00 $50.88
Extended Price $7.632.00 $11,100.00 $7,165.00 $7,950.00 $6,750.00 $7,632.00
CH
7794 for CPI or Akron
Pelco Akron Pelcoll Pelco PB{ bases; 6700 for Pelco Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5325 1000-15) PB-5325 5325-PNC|  or Permacast bases PB-5325




Opened: December 3, 2014

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

For- Annual Contract Solar School Flasher and Parts Alternate Bid 1
: Non-l.ocal Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Nondocal Non-Local Non-Local
Consolidated Traffic  [Electrotechnics K&K Systems, Inc Paradigm Traffic Texas Highway Traffic Parts Inc. Consolidated Traffic
Controls, Inc. Corporation Systems, Inc. Products Controls, Inc.
6100005145 N 1016 Enterprise Place 1s:::el:tCommerce 687 Palmetto Road 2201 E. Division St. 1309 Clark P.O. Box 837 1016 Enterprise Place
Estimated Adington, Marshall, Tupelo, Arington, Round Rock, Spring, Afington
ITEM Annual TX 76001 TX, 75672 Ms, 38801 TX 76011 TX 78681 TX 77383 ™ 7600i
DESCRIPTION Quantities 817-265-3421 800-227-1734 662-566-2025 817-831-9406 512-255-7633 800-345-6329
18 Cabinet Mounting Brackets, two (2) per set,
Pelco #SP 5293 or approved equal 150
Net Unit Price $57.18 No Bid $55.00 $54.00 $60.00] $47.00 $57.18
Extended Price $8,577.00 $8,250.00 $8,100.00 $9,000.00 $7.050.00 $8,677.00
Pelco T-PARTS Pelco|Pelco SPECH 2 Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. SP-5293 6368 SP-5293 5293-PNC| of 6368 SP-5293
19 Spun Aluminum Pole, 17', Pelco #PB-5100-
17 or approved equal 120 No Bid
Net Unit Price $274.82 $230.00 $269.00 $320.00 No Bid $274.82
Extended Price $32,978.40 $27.600.00 $32.,280.00 $38,400.00 $32,978.40
Pelco K&K Systems, Inc Pelco Peico Pelco
Manufacturer & Product No. PB-5007-17 CTR-17] PB-5100-17 PB-5100-17-PNC PB-5007-17
Unbreakable Solar Panel with mounting
bracket for mast amm installation, preset at 37
degrees and .090 gauge aluminum back
20 plate. Service entries to junction box shall be
weathertight. 70 W solar panel supplied w/
mounting hardware for mast arm pole
installation 150 NAS NAS
Net Unit Price $528.25 $386.21 $293.00 No Bid $540.00 $449.950 $528.25
Extended Price $79,237.50 $57,931.50 $43,950.00 $81,000.00 $67.492.50 $79,237.50
Solar Tech & CH|
Picker] 384 is SPM085P-TS-F|
Eltec (80-watt PS85W-2F-mast armfl (85 watt); 468 is Mast
RTC Industrial Solar) K&K Systems, Inc| solar harness notf Arm Mounting Harware RTC
Manufacturer & Product No. 1S-70-12-MA PBSOL080SPB01| DS-A1-70 & SMTP-70 included 66" cable 18-70-12-MA
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $60,517.50 $14,228.00 $38,850.00 $35,535.00 $8,250.00 $76,885.00
Esti d Annual Award $60,517.50 $14,228.00 $38,850.00 $35,535.00 $8,250.00 $76,885.00

items identified NAS in the bid tabulation did not meet specifications.




