City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual [TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Qty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
1 White T-Shirt NAS NAS
11 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 2,250
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $1.35 $1.92 $2.09 $2.50
Extended Price (per each) $3,037.50| $4.320.00 $4,702.50 $5.625.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55
12 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 2,250
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $1.50 $2.52 $2.59 $2.25
Extended Price (per each) $3.375.00| $5.670.00 $5,827.50 $5.062.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55
13 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 1,200
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $2.60) $4.03 $4.21 $3.70
Extended Price (per each) $3.120.00) $4.836.00 $5,052.00 $4.440.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586. 5450, 6850 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55
14 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 150
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $2.60) $4.03 $4.21 $3.70
Extended Price (per each) $390.00) $604.50 $631.50 $555.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586. 5450, 6850 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55
15 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 75
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $2.60) No bid $4.31 $3.70
Extended Price (per each) $195.00) $323.25 $277.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,|
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55
16 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 75
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $2.60) No bid $4.32 $3.70
Extended Price (per each) $195.00) $324.00 $277.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,|
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55
17 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 750
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.45 $3.99 $4.16 $4.35
Extended Price (per each) $2,587.50] $2,992.50 $3,120.00 $3,262.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,|
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55LS
1.8 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 750
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.90) $4.81 $4.55 $4.10
Extended Price (per each) $2,925.00) $3,607.50 $3,412.50 $3,075.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,|
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55LS




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Oty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
19 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 400
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $5.25 $6.31 $6.24 $5.60
Extended Price (per each) $2,100.00| $2.524.00 $2,496.00 $2.240.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55LS
1.10 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 50
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.25 $6.31 $6.39 $5.60
Extended Price (per each) $262.50) $315.50 $319.50 $280.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55LS
111 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 25
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $5.25 No Bid No Bid $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $131.25) $162.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586. 5450, 6850 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55LS
1.12 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 25
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $5.25) No Bid No Bid $7.50
Extended Price (per each) $131.25) $187.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586. 5450, 6850 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend G840B, 29BL| PC55LS
113 1 Color Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
114 2 Color Imprint $0.75| $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
115 3 Color Imprint $0.90) $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
1.16 4 Color Imprint $1.05| $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
117 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
118 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00] $15.00
119 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00] $15.00
Line 1 subtotal $18,473.90| Incomplete Incomplete| $25,476.70
2 Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt NAS NAS
21 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 6,000
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $1.95) $3.04 $3.45 $2.70
Extended Price (per each) $11,700.00| $18.240.00 $20,700.00 $16.200.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55
22 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 6,000
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $1.95) $3.27 $3.56 $2.50
Extended Price (per each) $11,700.00| $19.620.00 $21,360.00 $15.000.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55
2.3 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 750
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $3.25| $5.59 $5.84 $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $2,437.50| $4,192.50 $4,380.00] $3.112.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55
2.4 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 375
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $3.25) $5.59 $5.84 $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $1,218.75] $2,096.25 $2,190.00 $1,556.25
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL]| PC55




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Oty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
25 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 200
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $3.25) No bid $5.86 $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $650.00) $1,172.00 $830.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55
2.6 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 200
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $3.25) No bid $6.00 $4.75
Extended Price (per each) $650.00) $1,200.00 $950.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55
27 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 2,000
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $4.45) $5.60 $5.76 $4.75
Extended Price (per each) $8.900.00) $11,200.00 $11,520.00 $9,500.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Hanes, Jerzees. Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
2.8 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 2,000
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $4.80| $6.44 $6.13 $4.60
Extended Price (per each) $9.600.00) $12,880.00 $12,260.00 $9,200.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Hanes, Jerzees. Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
29 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 250
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) $8.28 $8.08 $6.00
Extended Price (per each) $1,750.00) $2,070.00 $2,020.00 $1,500.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
2.10 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 125
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $7.00 $8.28 $8.08 $6.00
Extended Price (per each) $875.00) $1,035.00 $1,010.00 $750.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
211 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00 No Bid| No Bid $7.00
Extended Price (per each) $350.00) $350.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
212 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 50
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) No Bid| No Bid $7.50
Extended Price (per each) $350.00] $375.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
213 1 Color Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
214 2 Color Imprint $0.75] $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
215 3 Color Imprint $0.90) $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
2.16 4 Color Imprint $1.05| $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
217 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
218 Art Charae (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
219 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
Line 2 subtotal $50,205.15 Incomplete Incomplete $59,355.45




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Oty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
3 White T-Shirt (Tall) NAS NAS
3.1 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult Large
Price (per each) $3.50) $5.29 $4.39 $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $262.50) $396.75 $329.25 $311.25
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T]| PC61T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55T|
3.2 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $3.50) $5.29 $4.39 $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $262.50) $396.75 $329.25 $311.25
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T]| PC61T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55T|
33 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) $5.29 $4.39 $6.75
Extended Price (per each) $412.50| $396.75 $329.25 $506.25
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T]| PC61T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55T|
34 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) $5.29 $4.39 $8.00
Extended Price (per each) $412.50| $396.75 $329.25 $600.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T]| PC61T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55T|
35 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) No Bid No Bid $9.00
Extended Price (per each) $412.50) $675.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T]| PC61T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55T|
36 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) No Bid No Bid $10.00
Extended Price (per each) $412.50) $750.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G200T]| PC61T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PCS55T)|
37 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult Large
Price (per each) $4.50 $6.37 $5.25 $6.15
Extended Price (per each) $112.50) $159.25 $131.25 $153.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G200T]| PC61LST|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55LST|
3.8 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $4.50 $6.37 $5.23 $6.15
Extended Price (per each) $112.50) $159.25 $130.75 $153.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G200T]| PC61LST|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55LST|
3.9 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) $9.33 $6.91 $8.75
Extended Price (per each) $137.50) $233.25 $172.75 $218.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T| PC61LST|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55LST|
3.10 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) $9.81 $7.07 $10.00
Extended Price (per each) $137.50) $245.25 $176.75] $250.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T| PC61LST|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55LST|
3.11 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) $11.29 $7.47 $11.00
Extended Price (per each) $137.50) $282.25 $186.75] $275.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T| PC61LST|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST] PC55LST




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Oty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
3.12 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) No Bid No Bid $12.00
Extended Price (per each) $137.50) $300.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T| PC61LST
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55LST
313 1 Color Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
3.14 2 Color Imprint $0.75] $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
3.15 3 Color Imprint $0.90) $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
3.16 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
317 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
3.18 Art Charae (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00] $15.00
3.19 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
Line 3 subtotal $2,973.90| Incomplete Incomplete| $4.536.70
4 Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall) NAS NAS
4.1 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult Large
Price (per each) $4.70) No Bid No Bid $5.15
Extended Price (per each) $352.50) $386.25
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCB1LST| PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55
4.2 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 125
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $4.70) $6.60 $6.15 $5.15
Extended Price (per each) $587.50| $825.00 $768.75] $643.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST| PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55
43 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 150
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $6.75) $6.60 $6.15 $7.75
Extended Price (per each) $1.,012.50] $990.00 $922.50 $1,162.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCB1LST| PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55
4.4 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 150
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $6.75) $6.60 $6.15 $9.00
Extended Price (per each) $1,012.50] $990.00 $922.50 $1.350.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCB1LST| PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55
4.5 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 150
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $6.75) No Bid| No Bid $10.00
Extended Price (per each) $1,012.50| $1,500.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCB1LST| PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST|
4.6 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 125
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $6.75) No Bid| No Bid $11.00
Extended Price (per each) $843.75) $1.375.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCB1LST| PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55
4.7 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult Large
Price (per each) $5.80) $8.09 $6.81 $7.15
Extended Price (per each) $145.00) $202.25 $170.25 $178.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST| PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55LS
4.8 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $5.80) $8.09 $6.81 $7.15
Extended Price (per each) $145.00) $202.25 $170.25] $178.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST| PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55LS
4.9 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) $11.09 $8.55 $8.15
Extended Price (per each) $350.00] $554.50 $427.50] $407.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST| PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST] PC55LS




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Oty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
4.10 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) $12.04 $8.75 $9.15
Extended Price (per each) $350.00) $602.00 $437.50 $457.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST| PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC5B5LS
4.11 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) $13.44 $9.15 $12.15
Extended Price (per each) $350.00) $672.00 $457.50 $607.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/polv blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST| PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PCB5LS
4.12 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) No Bid No Bid $13.15
Extended Price (per each) $175.00) $328.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCB1LST| PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Polv Blend Port & Companv. Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PC55LS
4.13 1 Color Imprint $0.60)| $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
4.14 2 Color Imprint $0.75] $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
4.15 3 Color Imprint $0.90| $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
4.16 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
4.17 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
4.18 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
4.19 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
Line 4 subtotal $6.,360.15| Incomplete Incomplete| $8.607.95
5 White Wicking T-Shirt
5.1 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 1,500
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.35) $3.83 $3.83 $3.75
Extended Price (per each) $5.025.00) $5.745.00 $5,745.00 $5.625.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Augqusta Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit 790, 791 G420B G420B PC380
52 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 1,500
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.35) $4.53 $4.53 $3.75
Extended Price (per each) $5,025.00] $6,795.00 $6,795.00 $5,625.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqustal Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polvester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
53 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 800
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $4.80] $5.67 $5.67 $5.25
Extended Price (per each) $3,840.00 $4,536.00 $4,536.00 $4,200.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqustal Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polvester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
54 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 100
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.85| $5.67 $5.67 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $585.00| $567.00 $567.00 $650.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqustal Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polvester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
55 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00 No Bid| No Bid $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $350.00) $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqustal Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polvester Wicking Knit 790, 791 PC380
5.6 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 50
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $8.25) No Bid| No Bid $7.50
Extended Price (per each) $412.50 $375.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wicking Knit Auqustal Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polvester Wicking Knit 790, 791 PC380
5.7 1 Color Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
5.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75| $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
5.9 3 Color Imprint $0.90) $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
5.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05| $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
511 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
5.12 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00] $15.00
513 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
Line 5 subtotal $15,261.40| $17,664.81 $17,664.81 $16,831.70
6 Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt
6.1 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 4,000
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.35) $3.83 $3.83 $3.75
Extended Price (per each) $13,400.00| $15,320.00 $15,320.00 $15,000.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augusta| Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit 790, 791 G420B G4208 PC380




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
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Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Oty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
6.2 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 4,000
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.35) $4.53 $4.53 $3.75
Extended Price (per each) $13,400.00| $18,120.00 $18,120.00 $15,000.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqusta Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
6.3 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 500
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $4.80) $5.67 $5.67 $5.25
Extended Price (per each) $2,400.00| $2,835.00 $2,835.00 $2,625.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqusta Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
6.4 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 250
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.85) $5.67 $5.67 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $1.462.50) $1,417.50 $1,417.50 $1,625.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqusta| Gildan Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
6.5 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 125
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) No Bid No Bid $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $875.00) $812.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqusta Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wickina Knit 790, 791 PC380
6.6 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 125
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $8.25) No Bid No Bid $7.50
Extended Price (per each) $1,031.25| $937.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Auqusta| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wickina Knit 790, 791 PC380
6.7 1 Color Imprint $0.60)| $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
6.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75] $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
6.9 3 Color Imprint $0.90| $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
6.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
6.11 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
6.12 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
6.13 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
Line 6 subtotal
$32,592.65| $37.714.31 $37.714.31 $36.031.70
7 White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall)
7.1 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult Large
Price (per each) $5.65| $6.65 $6.65 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $282.50] $332.50 $332.50] $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350 TST350
72 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $5.65| $6.65 $6.65 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $282.50] $332.50 $332.50] $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350) TST 350 TST 350 TST350
73 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $6.80] $7.99 $7.99 $7.75
Extended Price (per each) $340.00] $399.50 $399.50 $387.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350) TST 350 TST 350 TST350
7.4 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $9.05) $10.65 $10.65 $10.00
Extended Price (per each) $452.50 $532.50 $532.50 $500.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350 TST350
75 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $10.20| $10.99 $10.99 $11.00
Extended Price (per each) $510.00]| $549.50 $549.50] $550.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350) TST 350 TST 350 TST350
7.6 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $10.20| No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price (per each) $510.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek|
Style Number for 100% Polvester Wicking Knit TST350|
77 1 Color Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
7.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75| $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
7.9 3 Color Imprint $0.90) $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
7.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05| $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
711 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
712 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00] $15.00
713 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00; $15.00
Line 7 subtotal $2,401.40) Incomplete Incomplete| $2,119.20




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
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Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Oty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
8 Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall)
8.1 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult Large
Price (per each) $5.65) $6.65 $6.65 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $282.50) $332.50 $332.50 $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit TST350| TST 350 TST 350 TST350
8.2 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $5.65) $6.65 $6.65 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $423.75) $498.75 $498.75 $487.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit TST350| TST 350 TST 350 TST350
8.3 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 100
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $6.80) $7.99 $7.99 $7.75
Extended Price (per each) $680.00) $799.00 $799.00 $775.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit TST350| TST 350 TST 350 TST350
8.4 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 100
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $9.05| $10.65 $10.65, $10.00
Extended Price (per each) $905.00) $1.065.00 $1,065.00 $1.000.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit TST350| TST 350 TST 350 TST350
8.5 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 100
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $10.20| $11.99 $11.99 $11.00
Extended Price (per each) $1.020.00] $1.199.00 $1.199.00 $1.100.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit TST350| TST 350 TST 350 TST350
8.6 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $10.20| No Bid| No Bid $13.50
Extended Price (per each) $765.00) $1.012.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polvester Wickina Knit Sport-Tek| Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polvester Wickina Knit TST350| TST350
8.7 1 Color Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
8.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75| $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
8.9 3 Color Imprint $0.90) $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
8.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
8.11 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
8.12 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00| $10.00 $10.00] $15.00
8.13 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00] $15.00
Line 8 subtotal $4,100.15| $3,916.06 $3,916.06 $4,731.70
Payment Terms Net 30| Net 30 Net 30| Net 30
Annual Total $132,368.70) Incol Incomplete $157,691.10

Estimated Annual Award

$132,368.70]




