
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2015

For: Riding Mowers and Utility Trailers Bid 2 - Local Bid 1 -Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local   Local Local

DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment San Antonio Southwest 

Trailers, Ltd

C&M Golf & Grounds 

Equipment

John H. Sorola, Inc Moridge 

Manufacturing, Inc

Professional Turf 

Products

Watts 

Equipment:DBA 

Mustang Equipment

6100005693 AJ
11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 10302 IH35 North 13250 Lookout Rd 523 W. Cypress 105 S. Hwy 81 5026 Service Center 

Drive

16331 Pleasantville 

Rd.

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantities

San Antonio,                       

TX,  78250                     

210-684-5296            

San Antonio,                       

TX,  78250                 

San Antonio,                            

TX, 78233                                                                

210-657-5828                                             

San Antonio,                        

TX, 78233                                                       

San Antonio,                            

TX, 78212                        

Moundridge,                       

KS, 67107                      

620-345-8621                                                               

San Antonio,                            

TX, 78218                                                                                 

San Antonio,                       

TX,  78233                                   

1 Deleted  

2 Zero Turn Riding Mowers, Diesel with ROPS, 

minimum 60" cutting width with side discharge 3 NAS  NAS NAS

Price each $12,749.25 $11,642.74 No Bid $13,000.00 $13,599.00 $11,590.00 $15,695.86 $7,435.08

Total $38,247.75 $34,928.22 $39,000.00 $40,797.00 $34,770.00 $47,087.58 $22,305.24

Year, Make & Model Offered

2015 Exmark Lazer S 

Diesel Model # 

LZS902dku6051

2015 Gravely Pro-Turn 

460 Diesel 

Model#992236

2015, SCAG,    

STT61V-25KBD

2015 Exmark  

LZS902DKU6051A1

2015 Grasshopper 

325D/61

2015 Toro 

Grandmaster 7200

2015 John Deere 

Z920M

Specific make & model of engine offered 

(include HP)

Kubota Diesel Model 

#D902 25HP

Kubota Diesel Model 

#D902 25HP

Kubota, D902E4B-

SCG-1, 21.6 HP 

@3200 Tier IV Final 

Diesel

Kubota Diesel Model 

D902 25HP 898CC

Kubota D902; 25hp 

Liquid-Cooled Diesel GM7200 (30495) Kawasaki 23.5hp Gas

Authorized Warranty Provider

DeWinne Equipment 

Company

DeWinne Equipment 

Company

C&M Golf & Grounds 

Equipment John H. Sorola, Inc

DeWinne Equipment 

Co.

Professional Turf 

Products

Watts Equipment 

DBA:Mustang 

Equipment  

Warranty Provider Address

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

13250 Lookout Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78233

523 W. Cypress, San 

Antonio, TX  78212

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

5026 Service Center 

Drive, San Antonio, 

TX 78218

John Deere, 16331 

Pleasantville Rd., San 

Antonio, TX  78233

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days 

after issuance of purchase order 30 30 30 21 30 15-30 30

3 Zero Turn Riding Mowers, 48" cutting width 

with Roll-Over Protective Structure (ROPS) 1  NAS

Price each $7,039.00 $6,518.14 No Bid $7,055.00 $7,759.00 $6,347.00 $6,906.77 $6,098.55

Total $7,039.00 $6,518.14 $7,055.00 $7,759.00 $6,347.00 $6,906.77 $6,098.55

Percentage between lowest responsive bid 

and local bid 2.70%

Price Differential $171.14

Year, Make & Model Offered

2015 Exmark Lazer E 

Model # 

LZE600gka484a2

2015 Gravely Pro-Turn 

148 Model#991079

2015 SCAG,     

STC48V-23CV

2015 Exmark 

LZS651CKA484A2

2015 Grasshopper 

226V/48 Toro Lce 74952

2015 John Deere 

Z915B

Specific make & model of engine offered 

(include HP)

Kawasaki Gas Model 

#FX600V 20Hp

Kawasaki 

Model#FX691V Gas V-

Twin 22Hp Kohler Twin, 23 HP

Kawasaki Gas Model 

FX651V 20.5HP 726cc

Briggs & Stratton 

Commercial Turf, 26hp 

(810cc)

Toro Lce 74952, 

20.5HP Kohler 25Hp Gas

Authorized Warranty Provider

DeWinne Equipment 

Company

DeWinne Equipment 

Company

C&M Golf & Grounds 

Equipment John H. Sorola, Inc

DeWinne Equipment 

Co.

Professional Turf 

Products

Watts Equipment 

DBA:Mustang 

Equipment  

Warranty Provider Address

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

13250 Lookout Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78233

523 W. Cypress, San 

Antonio, TX  78212

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

5026 Service Center 

Drive, San Antonio, 

TX 78218

John Deere, 16331 

Pleasantville Rd., San 

Antonio, TX  78233

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days 

after issuance of purchase order 30 30 30 21 30 15-30 30

4 Deleted



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2015

For: Riding Mowers and Utility Trailers Bid 2 - Local Bid 1 -Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local   Local Local

DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment San Antonio Southwest 

Trailers, Ltd

C&M Golf & Grounds 

Equipment

John H. Sorola, Inc Moridge 

Manufacturing, Inc

Professional Turf 

Products

Watts 

Equipment:DBA 

Mustang Equipment

6100005693 AJ
11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 10302 IH35 North 13250 Lookout Rd 523 W. Cypress 105 S. Hwy 81 5026 Service Center 

Drive

16331 Pleasantville 

Rd.

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantities

San Antonio,                       

TX,  78250                     

210-684-5296            

San Antonio,                       

TX,  78250                 

San Antonio,                            

TX, 78233                                                                

210-657-5828                                             

San Antonio,                        

TX, 78233                                                       

San Antonio,                            

TX, 78212                        

Moundridge,                       

KS, 67107                      

620-345-8621                                                               

San Antonio,                            

TX, 78218                                                                                 

San Antonio,                       

TX,  78233                                   

5

Dual Axle Gooseneck 15-20K Trailer 1

Price each No Bid No Bid $8,478.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total $8,478.00

Year, Make & Model Offered
2015, Southwest 

Gooseneck, GE2586210E

Authorized Warranty Provider Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Provider Address
343 Gembler Rd, SA TX 

78219

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days 

after issuance of purchase order 60

6 Trailer - 7K 2

Price each No Bid No Bid $3,944.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total $7,888.00

Year, Make & Model Offered

2015, Southwest 

Gooseneck, BU2083235

Authorized Warranty Provider Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Provider Address

343 Gembler Rd, SA TX 

78219

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days 

after issuance of purchase order 60

7 18' Landscape Utility Trailer 7

Price each No Bid No Bid $5,049.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Total $35,343.00

Year, Make & Model Offered

2015, Southwest 

Gooseneck, BUL1877252E

Authorized Warranty Provider Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Provider Address

343 Gembler Rd, SA TX 

78219
Delivery will be made within __ calendar days 

after issuance of purchase order 60

8

Zero Turn Riding Mowers, Diesel Engine with 

ROPS, minimum 72" cutting width with side 

discharge 7 NAS NAS NAS NAS

Price each $13,049.25 $12,168.34 No Bid $10,050.00 $13,919.00 $11,990.00 $15,541.27 $8,439.32

Total $91,344.75 $85,178.38 $70,350.00 $97,433.00 $83,930.00 $108,788.89 $59,075.24

Year, Make & Model Offered

2015 Exmark Lazer S 

Diesel 

Lzs902dku725a1

2015 Gravely Pro-Turn 

472 Diesel Model 

#992240

2015, SCAG,          

STT72V-35BVAC

2015 Exmark  

LZS902DKU725A1

2015 Grasshopper 

325D/72

Toro 2015 Grounds 

Master (30495)

2015 John Deere 

Z950M 

Specific make & model of engine offered 

(include HP)

Kubota Diesel Model# 

D902 25Hp

Kubota Diesel Model# 

D902 25Hp

Briggs Vanguard 35HP 

with metal canopy

Kubota Diesel Model 

D902 25HP 898cc

Kubota D902; 25hp 

Liquid-Cooled Diesel

Toro GM 7200 - 

30495 Kawasaki 27.0HP 

Authorized Warranty Provider

DeWinne Equipment 

Company

DeWinne Equipment 

Company

C&M Golf & Grounds 

Equipment John H. Sorola, Inc

DeWinne Equipment 

Co.

Professional Turf 

Products

Watts Equipment 

DBA:Mustang 

Equipment  

Warranty Provider Address

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

13250 Lookout Rd., 

San Antonio, TX  

78233

523 W. Cypress, San 

Antonio, TX  78212

11002 Bandera Rd, 

San Antonio, TX  

78250

5026 Service Center 

Drive, San Antonio, 

TX 78218

John Deere, 16331 

Pleasantville Rd., San 

Antonio, TX  78233

Delivery will be made within __ calendar days 

after issuance of purchase order 30 30 30 21 30 15-30 30

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total Award $129,592.50 $6,518.14 $51,709.00

* NAS - bidders did not meet minimum specifications

Item 1 and 4, deleted to be re-bid at a later date


