LOC/fpr
5/28/15
[tem No. 9

ANORDINANCE  2015-05-28-04 66

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS
ESTABLISHING UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR
AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL COST OF $634,000.00: (A) BANKSON
GROUP, LTD. D/B/A ALAMO TEES & ADVERTISING FOR
PROMOTIONAL SHIRTS, (B) ZAMORANO ENTERPRISES, INC.
FOR DECORATIVE METAL RECYCLING & DUAL METAL
TRASH RECEPTACLES, (C) BROWN TRAFFIC PRODUCTS, INC.
FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS, AND (D) DIVERSIFIED
INSPECTIONS/ITL FOR INSPECTION OF AERIAL APPARATUS
AND GROUND LADDERS.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Bankson
Group, Ltd. d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising for promotional shirts, (B) Zamorano Enterprises,
Inc. for decorative metal recycling & dual metal trash receptacles, (C) Brown Traffic Products,
Inc. for traffic signal heads, and (D) Diversified Inspections/ITL for inspection of aerial
apparatus and ground ladders; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves three low bid contracts and one contract on the basis of
low qualifying bid; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Bankson Group,
Ltd. d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising for promotional shirts, (B) Zamorano Enterprises, Inc. for
decorative metal recycling & dual metal trash receptacles, (C) Brown Traffic Products, Inc. for
traftic signal heads, and (D) Diversified Inspections/ITL for inspection of aerial apparatus and
ground ladders on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets, are
hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance
deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto
and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for
inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2015 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals. The combined
estimated cost for the contracts listed on this ordinance is approximately $634,000.00.
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SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the bids from Allied Advertising Agency, Inc.,
Bid 1 and Bid 2, for Promotional Shirts, failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or
requirements and/or were incomplete.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight or more
affirmative votes; otherwise, it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

o g

M A Y O R
Ivy R. Taylor

PASSED and APPROVED this 28" day of May, 2015.

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

1 IL\\[ M M’QWLW

Lt M Vace(({hty Cle# @Mart\l{a G. Sepeda, Actlln%ICity Attorney




Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item:

9 (in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9,10,11, 12,13, 14)

Date: 05/28/2015
Time: 10:31:19 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for
an estimated annual cost of $634,000.00: (A) Bankson Group, Ltd d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
for promotional shirts, (B) Zamorano Enterprises, Inc., for decorative metal recycling & dual metal
trash receptacles, (C) Brown Traffic Products, Inc., for traffic signal heads, and (D) Diversified
Inspections/ITL for inspection of aerial apparatus and ground ladders. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial
Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance)
Result: Passed
Not . .
Voter Group Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldaiia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X
http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx 5/28/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

EXHIBIT |

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotionat Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Lid. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc
d/bla Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 4G 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite $-155
Est [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
tem Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Qf 210-699-3800 ext. 231
1 White T-Shirt NAS NAS
11 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 2,250
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $1.35] $1.82 $2.09 $2.50
Extended Price (per each) $3,037.50| $4.320.00| $4,702.50| $5,625.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton| 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 8850 PCe1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 20B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 296L | PC55
12 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 2,250
Adult Small - XLarge
Price {per each) $1.50] $2.52 $2.59 $2.25
Extended Price (per each) $3,375.00] $5,670.00 $5,827.50, $5,062.50|
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G2008, 54500, G2408|
Style Number for 100% Cotton (240, 5586, 5450, 6850) PC81
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes. Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G8408, 298BL| PC55|
1.3 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 1,200
Adult 2X Large
Price {per each) $2.60} $4.03 $4.2¢ $3.70]
Extended Price (per each) $3,120.00] $4,838.00 $5,052.00 $4,440.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G2008B, 54500, G240B, -
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850) PC81
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 20M6860, 5370, 208, G840,
Style Number far 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G8408, 298L| PC55|
1.4 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 150
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $2.60) $4.03 $4.21 $3.70
Extended Price (per each) $390.00] $604.50 $631.50 $555.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Giidan 100% cotton 50/5Q cotton/pdly blend Port Authority]
5250, G200, G2008, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC81
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 20M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G8408, 29BL| PC55|
15 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 75
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $2.6] No bid $4.31 $3.70]
Extended Price (per each) $195.00| $323.25 $277.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cottorvpoly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PC81
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan) Port Authority
5170, 20M8860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL| PCB5
16 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt: 75
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $2.60) No bid $4.32 $3.70]
Extended Price (per each) $195.00] $324.00 $277.50]
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
’ 5250, G200, G2008, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850) PCé1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 20M8880, 5370, 208, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 26BL, PCS5
1.7 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 750
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price {per each) $3.485| $3.99 $4.16 $4.35
Extended Price (per each) $2,587.50| $2,992.50| $3.120.00] $3,262.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority,
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G2408B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850) PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Harnes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 20M6860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend (8408, 20BL| PCE5LS
18 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 750
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.90 $4.81 $4.55 $4.10
Extended Price (per sach) $2,925.00| $3,607.50| $3,412.50] $3,075.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan) 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton (3240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 298, G840,
(G840B, 20BL PC55LS

Style Number for §0/50 Cotton Poly Blend




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Styte Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite 5-1565
Est |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Qty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
1.9 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 400
Aduit 2X Large
Price (per each) $5.25| $6.31 $6.24 $5.60
Extended Price (per each) $2,100.00| $2,524.00| $2,496.00 $2,240.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton (240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PCBILS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Autharity|
5170, 20M6860, 5370, 20B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Catton Poly Blend G840B, 20BL PCs5LS
1.10 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 50
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.25 $6.31 $6.39 $5.60
Extended Price (per each) $262.50, $315.50 $319.50 $280.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan; 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority,
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G2408B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6850 PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Biend Hanes, Jerzees, Gilda Port Authority]
. 5170, 20M6860, 5370, 298, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 20BL| PC55LS
111 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 25
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $5.25] No Bid No Bid $6.50
Extended Price (per sach) $131.25] $162.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| Port Authority{
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 55686, 5450, 8850 PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan) Port Authority|
5170, 29M6860, 5370, 20B, G840,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 29BL PCSE5LS|
1.12 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt: 25
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $5.25| No Bid No Bid $7.50|
Extended Price (per each) $131.25 $187.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G2408,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 55886, 5450, 6850 PCE1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan, Port Authority|
5170, 29M8860, 5370, 29B, G840,
Styte Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G840B, 20BL| PC55LS
113 1 Color imprint $0.60] $0.25 $0.25, $0.35
1.14 2 Color imprint $0.75| $0.34 $0.34: $0.40
1.15 3 Color Imprint $0.90} $0.46 $0.481 $0.45
1.16 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
117 2nd Location imprint $0.60} $0.25 $0.25) Priced as cotors above
1.18 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00] $10.00 $10.00| $15.00
1.18 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00| $15.00
Line 1 subtotal $18,473.90 Incomplete Incomplete $25,476.70
2 Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt NAS NAS
21 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 6,000
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price {per each) $1.95] $3.04| $3.45| $2.70]
Extended Price (per each) $11,700.00, $18,240.00 $20,700.00 $16,200.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan, 100% cotton, 50/60 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G2408,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PCB1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority,
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 298,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G8soB, 29BL] PCSS
22 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Calored T-Shirt: 6,000
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each} $1.95| $3.27 $3.56 $2.50|
Extended Price (per each) $11,700.00 $19,620.00 $21,360.00 $15,000.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 catton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G2008, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PCe1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan, Port Authority|
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 298,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G8aoB, 29BL] PCS55|
23 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 750
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $3.25) $5.59 $5.84 $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $2,437.50] $4,192.50| $4,380.00 $3,112.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton| 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G2008B, 54500, G2408B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton (G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PCé1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 26M, G800, G800B, 5370, 208,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55|
24 Shert Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 375
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $3.25) $5.59 $5.84 $4.15)
Extended Price (per sach) $1,218.75] $2,006.25| $2,190.00| $1.556.25|
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC81
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,|
PC55

(G880, G880B, 20BL|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2018
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/bla Alameo Tees & Advertising
6100005298 JG 12814 Cogbum Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite $-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Itemn Description Annuat |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
210-699-3800 ext. 231
25 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 200
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $3.25] No bid| $5.86 $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $650.00f $1,172.00 $830.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G2008, 54500, G2408,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840| PCé1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan)| Port Authority|
5170, 20M, G800, G800B, 5370, 208,
Style Number for 50/50 Catton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55|
26 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 200
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $3.25| No bid| $6.00| $4.75
Extended Price (per each) $650.00] $1,200.00 $950.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G2408,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC81
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 28B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55
27 Long Sieeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 2,000
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $4.45) $5.60 $5.78 $4.75|
Extended Price (per each) $8,900.00] $11,200.00 $11,520.00| $9.500.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cottorvpoly blend Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,|
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 8840} PCB1LS,
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority,
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 298,
Style Number for 50/50 Cottan Poly Blend G880, G8808B, 29BL| PCB5LS
28 Long Sieeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 2,000
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $4.80] $6.44 $6.13| $4.60
Extended Price (per each) $9,800.00} $12,880.00 $12,260.00 $9,200.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cottan Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton| 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G2408,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 8840} PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Manes, Jerzees, Gildan)| Port Authority|
5170, 29M, G800, GBOOB, 5370, 298,
Style Number for 50/5¢ Cotton Poly Blend G880, G88OB, 29BL| PCB5LS
29 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 250
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each} $7.00] $8.28 $8.08| $6.00
Extended Price {per each) $1,750.00| $2,070.00| $2,020.00 $1,500.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton! 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5260, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6340 PCBILS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan Port Authority,
5170, 26M, G800, GBOOB, 5370, 20B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
210 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 126
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $7.00} $8.28 $8.08| $6.00|
Extended Price (per each) $875.00] $1,035.00| $1,010.00 $750.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Biend Hanes, Jerzess, Gildan Port Authority;
5170, 26M, G800, G80OB, 5370, 29B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 20BL PCB5LS
m Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00| No Bid Nao Bid $7.00
|Extended Price (per each) $350.00/ $350.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan Port Authority|
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton G240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 29B,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL| PC55LS
212 |Long Steeva Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt: 50
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $7.00} No Bid No Bid| $7.50
Extended Price (per each) $350.00] $375.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Hanes, Gildan| Port Authority
5250, G200, G200B, 54500, G240B,
Style Number for 100% Cotton 3240, 5586, 5450, 6840 PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Hanes, Jerzees, Gildan| Port Authority|
5170, 29M, G800, G800B, 5370, 298,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend G880, G880B, 29BL) PC55LS
213 1 Color Imprint $0.60] $0.25) $0.256 $0.35
214 2 Color Imprint $0.75] $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
215 3 Color Imprint $0.90} $0.46 $0.48. $0.45
216 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
217 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25) Priced as colors above
218 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00f $10.00 $10.00| $15.00
2.19 Set Up Fee $10.00f $10.00; $10.00| $15.00;
Line 2 subtotal $50,205.15| Incomplete| $59,355.45




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annuat Contract for Promational Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. |Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual [TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Q 210-609-3800 ext. 231
3 White T-Shirt (Tall) NAS NAS
3.1 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult Large
Price (per each) $3.50] $5.29, $4.39, $4.15
Extended Price (per each) $262.50 $396.75| $320.25 $311.25
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cottan/poly blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G200T)| PC61T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC5S5T, G200T, PC55LST] PCS5T,
3.2 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $3.50) $5.29 $4.39 $4.15
Extended Price (per sach) $262.50 $306.76 $329.25 $311.25]
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cottorvpoly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T| PCB1T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC5S5LST] PCSE5T|
3.3 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $5.50) $5.29) $4.39) $8.75
Extended Price (per sach) $412.50 $396.75 $329.25 $506.25/
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton| 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T]| PC81T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PCS5LST| PC55T|
3.4 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.50] $6.29° $4.39)] $8.00
Extended Price (per each) $412.50] $396.75! $320.25 $600.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cottor/poly blend| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T. G200T]| PC81T
Brand Name for 50/60 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Styte Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PCSELST) PCB5T|
3.5 Short Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tal): 75
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $5.50| No Bid No Bid $9.00
Extended Price (per each) $412.50] $675.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority,
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T| PCB1T
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Part Autharity|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCS55T, G200T, PC55LST| PC55T
36 Short Sleave White T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $5.50 No Bid No Bid $10.00|
Extended Price (per each) $412.50 $750.00
Brand Name for 100 % Catton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T| PCB1T|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCS5T, G200T, PCS5LST| PCS5T|
37 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult Large
Price (per each) $4.50] $6.37| $5.25 $6.15
Extended Price (per each) $112.50) $159.26 $131.25 $153.75]
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/60 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T] PC61LST
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC5S5LST] PC8&5LST
38 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $4.50| $6.37| $65.23| $6.15
Extended Price (per each) $112.50] $159.25) $130.75| $153.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T| PCB1LST|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCS55T, G200T, PCE5LST] PCH5LST
3.9 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $5.50| $9.33] $6.91 $8.75
Extended Price (per each) $137.50) $233.25 $172.75 $218.75|
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan) 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T]| PCBILST
Brand Name for 50/50 Catton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan; Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCS55T, G200T, PCSSLST| PC55LST
3.10 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.50 $9.81 $7.07 $10.00
Extended Price (per each) $137.50 $245.25/ $176.75 $250.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cottorvpoly blend Port Authority,
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T] PCB1LST
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCB5T, G200T, PC55LST| PCSESLST
31 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $5.50 $11.29 $7.47 $11.00]
Extended Price (per each) $137.50 $282.25| $186.75| $275.00,
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T| PCB1ILST)|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
PC55T, G200T, PC55LST] PCE5LST

Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/blfa Alamo Tees & Advertising
8100005296 JG 12814 Cogbum Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
ftem Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Qf 210-699-3800 ext. 231
3.12 Long Sleeve White T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $5.50} No Bid No Bid $12.00
Extended Price (per each) $137.50) $300.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Part Authority,
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G200T]| PCB1LST)|
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, G200T, PC55LST| PCS55LST
3.13 1 Color Imprint $0.60 $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
3.14 2 Color Imprint $0.75) $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
3.15 3 Color Imprint $0.90 $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
3.16 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
3.17 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25i Priced as colors above
3.18 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00f $10.00| $10.00| $15.00;
3.19 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00| $10.00| $15.00|
Line 3 subtotal $2,973.90] Incomplete| Incomplete $4,536.70
4 Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall} NAS NAS
4.1 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Adult Large
Price {per each) $4.70] No Bid No Bid $5.15
Extended Price (per each) $362.50] $386.25
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T, PCE1LST PC61
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority,
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PCE5LST| PC55
4.2 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 125
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $4.70] $6.60 $6.15 $5.16
Extended Price (per each} $587.50) $825.00 $768.75, $643.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T, PC61LST| PCe1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PCS5LST) PC55
4.3 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 150
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $6.75] $6.60 $6.15 $7.75
Extended Price (per each) $1,012.50] $990.00 $922.50 $1,162.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan; 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G20QT, PCE1LST PCé1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Biend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority,
Style Num ber for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCB8T, PCS5LST] PC85
4.4 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Talt): 150
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $6.75| $6.60 $6.15 $2.00
Extended Price (per each) $1,012.50] $990.00 $922.50 $1,350.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST]| PC81
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Catton Poly Blend PC55T, PCS5LST)
4.5 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 150
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $6.75 No Bid| No 8id $10.00
Extended Price (per each) $1,012.50| $1,500.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC617, G200T, PCB1LST]| pPce1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PCS5LST] PCs5
a8 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 125
Adult 5X Large
Price {per each) $6.75) No Bid No Bid $11.00
Extended Price (per each) $843.75| $1,375.00
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G200T, PC81LST] PCe1
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCS5T, PCS5LST| PCS&5,
47 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult Large
Price (per each) $5.80 $8.09 $6.81 $7.15
Extended Price (per each) $145.00 $202.25: $170.25 $178.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan] 100% cotton| 50/50 cotton/paly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T, PCE1LST] PCB1LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Biend PCS5T, PCS5LST] PCE5LS
48 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $5.80| $8.09 $6.81 $7.15
Extended Price (per each) $145.,00} $202.25 $170.25 $178.75
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company. Gildan| 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCBILST| PCBILS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cottan Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan)| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PCSST, PCS5LST| PC55LS
49 Long Sleave Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 5¢
Aduit 2X Large
Price (per each) $7.00 $11.09] $8.55 $8.15]
Extended Price (per each) $350.00) $554.50 $427.50 $407.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton| 50/50 cottor/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC81T, G200T, PCE1LST] PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
PC85T, PCEELST] PCS5LS

Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. |Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite $-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antanio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual [TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 76247
Q 210-899-3800 oxt. 231
4.10 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each} $7.00] $12.04) $8.75 $9.15
Extended Price {per each) $350.00] $802.00 $437.50 $457.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| 100% cotton| 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Autherity,
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PC61LST] PC8ILS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/5¢ Cotton Poly Blend PCSST, PCSELST] PCE5LS
4.11 Long Sieeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00} $13.44] $9.15 $12.15
Extended Price (per each) $350.00 $672.00 $457.50 $607.50
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildany 100% cotton 50/50 cotton/poly blend Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PC61T, G200T, PCEILST] PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST] PCS5LS
4.12 Long Sleeve Light and Dark Colored T-Shirt (Tall): 25
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $7.00] No Bid. No Bid $13.15|
Extended Price (per @ach} $175.00| $328.75|
Brand Name for 100 % Cotton Port & Company, Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Cotton PCB1T, G200T, PCB1LST] PC61LS
Brand Name for 50/50 Cotton Poly Blend Port & Company, Gildan Port Authority
Style Number for 50750 Cotton Poly Blend PC55T, PC55LST| PCS55LS
413 1 Color Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
4.14 2 Color Imprint $0.75] $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
4.15 3 Color Imprint $0.90| $0.46 $0.46 $0.45|
4.18 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
417 2nd Logcation Imptint $0.80} $0.256 $0.25] Priced as colors above
4.18 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00f $10.00| $10.00| $15.00|
4.19 Set Up Fee $10.00} $10.00| $10.00| $15.00
Line 4 subtotal $6,360.15| Incomplete| Incomplete| $8,607.95
5 White Wicking T-Shirt
5.1 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 1,500
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.35) $3.83 $3.83 $3.75
Extended Price (per each) $5,025.00] $5,745.00 $5,745.00 $5.,825.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augusta Gildan Gildan Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420B; G420B PC380|
5.2 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 1,500
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each} $3.35] $4.53 $4.53 $3.75
Extended Price (per each) $5,025.00] $6,795.00 $6,795.00 $5,625.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Gildan Gildan Port Authority]
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380|
5.3 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 800
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $4.80 $5.67 $5.67 $5.25
Extended Price (per each) $3,840.00f $4,536.00 $4,536.00 $4,200.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Gildan Gildan Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 7 G420 G420 PC380|
5.4 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 100
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.85| $5.67| $5.67 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $585.00] $567.00 $567.00 $650.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Gildan Gildan Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
5.5 Short Sleave White Wicking T-Shirt: 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00) No Bid No Bid $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $350.00] $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 PC380
56 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt: 50
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $8.25) No Bid| No Bid $7.50
Extended Price (per each) $412.50} $375.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 PC380
57 1 Color Imprint $0.60 $0.25 $0.25 $0.35
5.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75 $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
59 3 Color Imprint $0.90) $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
5.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05 $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
5.11 2nd Location imprint $0.60} $0.25) $0.25! Priced as colors above
5.12 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00f $10.00| $10.00| $15.00;
513 Set Up Fee $10.00} $10.00| $10.00| $15.00|
Line 5 subtotal $15,261.40 $17,664.81 $17,664.81 $16,831.70
L] Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt
6.1 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 4,000
Youth Xsmall - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.35] $3.83 $3.83 $3.75
Extended Price (per each) $13,400.00 $15,320.00 $15,320.00 $15,000.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augusta Gildan| Gildan Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 54208 G4208 PC380




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 16, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 JG 12814 Cogbumn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est |San Antonio. San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual |TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Q 210-699-3800 ext. 231
6.2 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 4,000
Adult Small - XLarge
Price (per each) $3.35) $4.53 $4.53 $3.75
Extended Price (per each} $13,400.00] $18,120.00 $18,120.00 $15,000.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augusta Gildan| Gildan| Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
6.3 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 500
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $4.80 $5.67 $5.67 $5.25
Extended Price (per each) $2,400.00| $2,835.00 $2,835.00 $2,625.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Gildan Gildan Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
6.4 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt 250
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $5.85! $5.67 $5.67 $8.50
Extended Price (per each} $1,462.50] $1.417.50 $1,417.50| $1.625.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Gildan Gildan| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 G420 G420 PC380
6.5 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 125
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $7.00 No Bid No Bid| $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $875.00) $812.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Port Authority|
Style Number far 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 701 PC380|
6.6 Short Slesve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt: 125
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $8.25] Na Bid| No Bid $7.50
Extended Price (per each) $1,031.25) $937.50.
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Augustal Port Authority,
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit 790, 791 PC380
8.7 1 Color Imprint $0.69) $0.25 $0.25| $0.35)
6.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75| $0.34 $0.34/ $0.40!
8.9 3 Color Imprint $0.90} $0.46 $0.46 $0.45/
8.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05| $0.51 $0.51 $0.50|
8.11 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above|
8.12 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00} $10.00 $10.00| $15.00|
6.13 Set Up Fee $10.00] $10.00 $10.00 $15.00|
Line 6 subtotal
$32,592.65 $37,714.31 $37,714.31 $36,031.70
7 White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall)
71 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult Large
Price (per each) $5.65 $6.65| $6.65| $8.50
Extended Price (per each) $282.50] $332.50 $332.50 $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350] TST350
7.2 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult XLarge
Price (per each) $5.65| $6.65 $6.65 $6.50
Extended Price (per each) $282.50| $332.50 $332,50| $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek! Port Authority]
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350 TST 350 TST 350 TST350|
73 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 2X Large
Price (per each) $6.80] $7.99 $7.99 $7.75
Extended Price (per each) $340.00| $399.50 $390.50 $387.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek Sport-Tek. Sport-Tek Part Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350 TST350
7.4 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $9.05| $10.85| $10.65 $10.00|
Extended Price (per each) $452.50 $532.50 $532.50 $500.00|
Brand Namae for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350 TST350]
7.5 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $10.20] $10.99, $10.99 $11.00
Extended Price (per each) $510.00] $549.50| $549.50 $550.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority!
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350] TST 350 TST350
7.6 Short Sleeve White Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $10.20] No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price (per each) $510.00)
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350]
7.7 1 Color Imprint $0.60| $0.25 $0.25, $0.35
7.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75) $0.34 $0.34 $0.40
7.9 3 Color imprint $0.80 $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
7.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05] $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
71 2nd Location Imprint $0.60 $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
712 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00) $10.00 $15.00
713 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $15.00
Line 7 subtotal $2,401.40) Incomplete $2,119.20




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2015
For. Annual Contract for Promotional Shirts LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Bankson Group, Ltd. Allied Advertising Agency, Inc. Allied Advertising Agency, tnc. Promotional Designs, Inc.
d/b/a Alamo Tees & Advertising
6100005296 4G 12814 Cogburn Ave 3700 Blanco 3700 Blanco 8150 Brookman Drive, Suite S-155
Est San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Dallas,
Item Description Annual [TX 78249 TX 78212 TX 78212 TX 75247
Qty 210-699-3800 ext. 231
8 Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall)
8.1 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 50
Adult Large
Price (per each) $5.65) $6.65 $6.65 $6.50
Extended Price (per each} $282.50| $332.50 $332.50 $325.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Part Authority|
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350] TST 350, TST350|
8.2 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 75
Aduit XLarge
Price {per each) $5.65 $6.65 $6.85 $6.50|
Extended Price (per each) $423.75| $498.75 $498.75 $487.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority
Stvle Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350 TST350]
8.3 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 100
Adult 2X Large
Price (per sach) $6.80} $7.09 $7.99, $7.75
Extended Price (per each) $680.00| $799.00; $799.00 $775.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Port Authority
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350 TST350
8.4 Shart Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 100
Adult 3X Large
Price (per each) $9.05] $10.65 $10.85 $10.00|
Extended Price (per each) $905.00| $1,085.00 $1,065.00] $1,000.00|
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Sport-Tek Sport-Tek Port Authority,
Style Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350 TST350
85 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 100
Adult 4X Large
Price (per each) $10.20| $11.99| $11.99 $11.00|
Extended Price (per each) $1,020.00} $1,199.00| $1,199.00] $1,100.00
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek; Sport-Tek Sport-Tek| Port Authority|
Style Number for 100% Palyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST 350 TST 350] TST350]
8.8 Short Sleeve Light and Dark Colored Wicking T-Shirt (Tall): 76
Adult 5X Large
Price (per each) $10.20} No Bid No Bid $13.50
Extended Price (per each) $765.00| $1,012.50
Brand Name for 100 % Polyester Wicking Knit Sport-Tek| Port Authority
Stvte Number for 100% Polyester Wicking Knit TST350] TST350;
87 1 Color (mprint $0.60] $0.25 $0.25| $0.35]
8.8 2 Color Imprint $0.75 $0.34 $0.34) $0.40|
8.9 3 Color Imprint $0.90] $0.46 $0.46 $0.45
8.10 4 Color Imprint $1.05| $0.51 $0.51 $0.50
8.11 2nd Location Imprint $0.60) $0.25 $0.25 Priced as colors above
8.12 Art Charge (per hour) $10.00} $10.00 $10.00| $15.00
8.13 Set Up Fee $10.00| $10.00 $10.00 $15.00
Line 8 subtotal $4,100.15| $3,016.08| $3,916.06] $4,731.70
Payment Terms Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total Ir Incom pls $157,691.10

Annual Award

$132,368.70)
$132,368.70]




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 27, 2015 Local Local Local Local Local

For: Annual Contract for Decorative Zamorano Enterprises, |A. Bargas & Associates, |Garces Enterprises Inc. |Office Furniture Interiors Office Resource Center
Metal Recycling & Dual Metal Trash Inc. LL.C.
Receptacles

6100005447 GG 8603 South Flores 10622 Gulfdale 2915 S. Zarzamora, Bldg |1901 Shipman Drive 10751 Sentinel

Estimated | San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual |TX 78221 TX 78216 TX 78225 TX 78219 TX 78217
Quantity |210-924-2320
1 Decorative Dual Metal Trash 150
Receptacles
Model/Product Number ZE-TRR200] Maglin#CMLWR911696 Custom|{ MLWR550 CMLWR9116696] MLWR550 CMLWR9116696
Unit Price $750.00 $1,538.89 $3,066.00 $1,517.50 $1,542.50
Total Price $112,500.00 $230,833.50 $459,900.00 $227,625.00 $231,375.00
2 Decorative Metal Recycling 500

Receptacles
Model/Product Number ZE-RECZOOJ Maglin# CMLWR911695 Custom| MLWR550 CMLWR911695] MLWR550 CMLWR911685
Unit Price $349.00 $905.56 $1,533.00 $892.50 $917.50
Total Price $174,500.00) $452,780.00 $766,500.00 $446,250.00 $458,750.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $287,000.00 $683,613.50 $1,226,400.00 $673,875.00 $690,125.00
Estimated Annual Award $287,000.00)

Prepared by Purchasing 4/10/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 1, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Traffic Signal Heads
Non-Local Non- Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Brown Traffic Products, |Consolidated Traffic General Traffic McCain Inc, Paradigm Traffic Peek Traffic Corporation |Texas Highway Products |Tiger Electric Supply dba
Inc. Controls. Inc. Eauioment Coro. Svstems. Inc. Wildeat Electric Suoolv
6100005709 Ds 109 W. 55th Street 1016 Enterprise Place 259 Broadway 2365 Cak Ridge Way 2201 E. Division St. 5401 N. Sam Houston 1309 Clark 5535 Harvey Wilson Dr.
Pkwv W.
stimated | pavenport, Arlington, Newburgh, Vista, Arlington, Houston, Round Rock, Houston,
Annual 1A 52806 TX 76001 NY 12550 CA 92081 TX 76011 TX 77086 TX 78681 TX 77020
ITEM DESCRIPTION Quantities |563.323.f
One-way, 12 inch three-section signal head,
1 complete with 3 visors.
Net Unit Price 1000 $78.50 $120.43 $97.00 $120.00 $137.00 $115.00 $130.00 $104.00
Extended Price $78,500.00| $120,430.00 $97,000.00 $120,000.00 $137,000.00 $115,000.00 $130,000.00 $104,000.00
[Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products, McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. Econolite| Peek Traffic McCain Peek
Inc,
Product No.: SG103A1C11YYY30-25] M45753| T30-POLY-N-EMPTY-T-Y] M45763 . M19275 (visor) PS583*003F0)
Y-Y| TP31HJYV0000-Sig Head M45753 (signal)
106-1001-012-Visar,
One-way, 12 inch four-section signal head,
2 complete with 4 visors.
Net Unit Price 300 $105.00 $161.29 $129.00 $158.00 $179.00 $154.00 $170.00 $144.00
Extended Price $31,500.00 $48,387.00 $38,700.00 $47.400.00 $53,700.00 $46,200.00 $51,000.00 $43,200.00
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products, McCain GTE Corp.
Inc, McCain Inc. Econolite Peek Traffic McCain Peek
Product No.: SG104A1C11YYY40-25] M42410| T40-POLY-N-EMPTY-T-Y] M42410] TP41HJYV0000-Sig Head M19275 (visor) PS584*004F0
Y-Y] 106-1001-012-Visor, M42410 (signal),
One-way, 12 inch five-section “cluster”,
3 complete with 5 visors.
Net Unit Price 50 $150.00 $194.62 $465.00 $193.00 $230.00 $193.00 $200.00 $183.00
Extended Price $2,500.00 $9.731.00 $23,250.00 $9.650.00 $11,500.00 $9,650.00 $10,000.00 $9,150.00
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products, McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. Econalite Peek Traffic McCain Peek
Inc,
Product No.: SG1ASH1C11 YYY50-25 M4241| T56-POLY-N-EMPTY-T-Y; M44515] TP55HJYV0000 - Sig M19275 (visor} PS585*005F0
Y-Y) Head 106-1001-012 -| M42410 (signal)
Visor]|
Nominal, § inch back plate compatible with
4 ltem 1.
Net Unit Price 1000 $35.00 $36.56 $26.00 $27.00 $53.00 $50.00 $38.00 $49.00
Extended Price $35,000.00] $386,560.00 $26,000.00 $27,000.00] $53,000.00 $50,000.00 $38,000.00 $49,000.00
er Name: Brown Traffic Products, McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. PELCO PELCO McCain PELCO
Product No.: PPM07917-001 M18216D)| BP-A-1003 GTE| M18216D| BK-1003-L4 P/N BK-1003-A M18216D)| BK-1003-C-PNC|
Nominal, § inch back plate compatible with
5 lem 2.
Net Unit Price 300 $56.00 $44.09/ $34.50 $33.00 $60.00 $58.00 $45.00 $62.00
Extended Price $16,800.00) $13,227.00] $10,350.00 $9,900.00 $18,000.00 $17.400.00 $13,500.00 $18,600.00
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products, McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. PELCO PELCO McCain| PELCO
Inc,
Product No.: PPM07918-001 M18218D; BP-A-1004GTE M18218D BK-1004-1L4 P/N BK-1004-A| M18219D| BK-1004-C-PNC
Nominal, 5 inch back plate compatible with
6 Item 3.
Net Unit Price 50 $50.00 $44.09; $65.00 $60.00 $96.00 $128.00 $75.00 $70.75
Extended Price $2,500.00 $2,204.50; $3,250.00 $3,000.00 $4,800.00 $6,400.00 $3,750.00 $3,537.50
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products, McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. Econolite PELCO McCain PELCO
Inc, .
Product No.: BPAS505HNF| M18095 BP-A-12-PLN-5CLVS M42514D E159G5-14 Cluster| P/N BK 1005-A M42514D BK-1005-C-PNC
Nominal, §inch back plate compatible with a
7 one section, 12 inch signal
Net Unit Price 100 $38.50 $9.68 $18.00 $27.00 $53.00 $40.00 $35.00 $41.00
Extended Price $3,850.00 $968.00 $1,800.00 $2,700.00| $5,300.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $4,100.00
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. Econolite PELCO McCain Peek
inc,
Product No.: PMR08187-001 M18162 BP-A-12-PLN-1001 M18213D]| E1590P41 P/N BK-1001-A) M18213D| BK-1001-C-PNC

Prepared by COSA 4/28/2015
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City of San Antenio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 1, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Traffic Signal Heads
Non-Local Non- Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Brown Traffic Products,  [Consolidated Traffic General Traffic McCain Inc. Paradigm Traffic Peek Traffic Corporation |Texas Highway Products |[Tiger Electric Supply dba
Inc. Controls. Inc. Eavioment Corp. Svstems. Inc. Wildcat Electric Supolv
6100005709 Ds 109 W. 55th Street 1016 Enterprise Place 259 Broadway 2365 Oak Ridge Way 2201 E. Division St. 5401 N. Sam Houston 1309 Clark 5535 Harvey Wilson Dr.
Pkwv W.
stimated pavenport, Arlington, Newburgh, Vista, Arlington, Houston, Round Rock, Houston,
Annual 1A 52806 TX 76001 NY 12550 CA 92081 TX 76011 TX 77088 TX 78681 TX 77020
ITEM DESCRIPTION Quantiti 563-323-0009
Twelve inch tunnet visor compatible with
8 Items 1,2 and 3
Net Unit Price 300 $5.00] $6.45 $9.65 $7.00 $12.00 $3.00 $7.00 $7.00
Extended Price $1,500.00] $1,935.00 $2,895.00 $2,100.00 $3,600.00 $2,400.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products, McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. Econolite Peek Traffic McCain Peek
Inc)
Product No.: AT70012004 M19275 TV-12P-AT7-Y| M19275| 106-1001-012, M19275 0700027
9 [Pedestrian signal, international type
Net Unit Price 100 $73.00| $78.49 $78.00 $77.00] $94.00 $93.00 $65.00 $70.65
Extended Price $7,300.00] $7,849.00 $7,800.00 $7.700.00 $9,400.00 $9,300.00 $6,500.00 $7,065.00
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products McCain GTE Corp. McCain Inc. Econolite Peek Traffic McCain Peek
Inc
Product No.: AT70011904] M31825| P7-HM-EMPTY-GV-PO- M32029| M32029| M31941 4302
Y|
10 One Way 12 inch, 1-Section Signal Heads
Net Unit Price 200 $27.00] $36.56 $36.00 $31.00 $39.00 $40.00 $42.00 $36.00
Extended Price $5.,400.00 $7,312.00 $7,200.00 $6,200.00 $7,800.00 $8,000.00 $8,400.00 $7.200.00
Manufacturer Name: Brown Traffic Products.| McCain GTE Corp. MccCain Inc. Econolite Peek Traffic McCain Peek
Inc.|
Product No.: SG101A1C11YYY10-25) M86145| T10-POLY-N-EMPTY-T-Y; M66156| TP11HJYV0000 M18275| PS581*001F0)
Y-Y| M66156|
Delivery within: 45 days| 45 days 45 days| 45 days. 45 days 45 days| 45 days| 45 days|
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total 248, 603.50 $218 245.00 $235.650.00 $304,100.00 $268,350.00 $266.750.00 $247,952.50
i d Annual Award $1 84,850.00!

Prepared by COSA 4/28/2015
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 3, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Inspection of Aerial
: Apparatus and Ground Ladders Non-Local Non-Local
Diversified Inspections/ITL UL, LLC.
6100005717 LM 7777 North Black Canyon Hwy 333 Pfingsten Rd.
Phoenix, Northbrook,
Item Description Estimated Annual |AZ 85021 IL 60061
Quantity 800-992-1111
1 Annual Inspection of Aerial Apparatus 27
Unit Price per Inspection $550.00__'| $750.00
Total Price $14,850.00 $20,250.00
2 Annual Inspection of Ground Ladder 8,000
Unit Price per Foot $1.50] $2.15
Total Price $12,000.00 $17,200.00
3 Labor 10
Unit Price per Hour $85.00 $125.00
Total Price $850.00| $1,250.00
4 Heat Sensor Labels 1,000
Unit Price $2.00) $2.75
Total Price $2,000.00 $2,750.00
Manufacturer Name Lerhalcrest] Ladder Technologies, Ltd.
Product No 7230 HS-1000
5 Danger Warning Labels 100
Unit Price $2.50] $3.50
Total Price $250.00] $350.00
Manufacturer Name Screentech 8D
Product No F91 -
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $29,950.00 $41,800.00
Estimated Annual Award $29,950.00] $41,800.00




