City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened:  April 3, 2015
For: Annual Contract for Office Supplies LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Office Depot, Inc. A & W Office Supply B & H Foto & Electronics Gateway Printing & Office MSC Industrial Supply
Corp. Supply, Inc.
6100005505 VF 6600 North Military Trail 222 S. Staples St. 420 Ninth Ave 11889 Starcrest 121 Interpark Blvd., Ste 1203
Efcg;;ztgn’ Corpus Christi, New York, San Antonio, San Antonio,
tem Description 800-685-5010 TX 78401 NY 10001 TX 78247 TX 78216
A General Office Supplies
Category % Discount Offered 65% 40% No Bid 50.20% 12.00%
Category Price $93,933.36 $158,118.03 $135,210.15
Market Basket % Discount Offered 66% - 93% 30% - 82% Not Provided 32% - 84% Not Provided
Market Basket Price $48,672.01 $106,089.27 $89,074.94
B Breakroom and Maintenance Supplies
Category % Discount Offered 50% 20% No Bid 25.10% 12.00%
Category Price $23,927.53 $43,667.01 $36,527.58
Market Basket % Discount Offered 50% - 89% 17% - 75% Not Provided 44% - 74% Not Provided
Market Basket Price $15,946.16 $36,298.30 $20,812.79
C Calendars/Planners
Category % Discount Offered 65% 25% No Bid 45.20% No Bid
Category Price $3,974.74 $9,408.41 $7,593.99
Market Basket % Discount Offered 53% - 85% 13% - 71% Not Provided 53% - 61% Not Provided
Market Basket Price $4,575.98 $7,516.85 $5,888.58
D Computer Supplies and Accessories
Category % Discount Offered 45%) 20% 1% 25.20% No Bid
Category Price $24,783.57 $37,146.88 $32,308.75
Market Basket % Discount Offered 25% - 91% 5% - 71% Not Provided 6% - 92% Not Provided
Market Basket Price $16,309.63 $29,795.46 $27,534.42
E First Aid Supplies
Category % Discount Offered 50% 20% No Bid 15.10% 12.00%
Category Price $2,581.48 $4,259.08 $4,423.11
Market Basket % Discount Offered 56% - 88% 12% - 52% Not Provided 42% - 70% Not Provided
Market Basket Price $1,707.69 $3,539.91 $2,395.74
F Toners
Category % Discount Offered 32% 20% 1% 30.20% No Bid
Category Price $154,659.26 $181,259.06 $153,756.00
Market Basket % Discount Offered 7% - 90%) 24% - 80% Not Provided 1% - 73%
Market Basket Price $123,304.47 $131,518.85 $132,999.47
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $514,375.88 $748,617.10 NAS $648,525.53 NAS
Estimated Annual Award $514,375.88 $748,617.10 NAS $648,525.53 NAS

Page 1 of 2




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened:  April 3, 2015 LOCAL
For: Annual Contract for Office Supplies Alternate NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
N R. W. Gonzalez Office San Antonio Lighthouse for Staples antract & .
Office Depot, Inc. . Commercial Inc. operating as
Products, Inc. the Blind
Staples Advantage
6100005505 VF 6600 North Miltary Trai iggg Longhom Blvd., Ste. 15305 Roosevelt Avenue  |4353 Interstate Way
Boca Raton, Austin, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description FL 33496 TX 78758 TX 78210 TX 78219
A General Office Supplies
Category % Discount Offered Minimum 30% 30% 66%
Category Price $188,994.17 $189,561.17 $83,847.17
Market Basket % Discount Offered 30% - 87% 11% - 89% 24% - 91%
Market Basket Price $111,742.47 $104,632.78 $89,667.00
B Breakroom and Maintenance Supplies
Category % Discount Offered Minimum 25% 30% 40%
Category Price $41,238.91 $38,292.41 $33,025.20
Market Basket % Discount Offered 25% - 65% 23% - 66% 0% - 73%
Market Basket Price $29,616.59 $29,675.74 $24,076.84
C Calendars/Planners
Category % Discount Offered Minimum 35% 30% 66%
Category Price $7,679.91 $8,178.28 $3,862.28
Market Basket % Discount Offered 35% - 37% 31% - 60% 30% - 60%
Market Basket Price $7,668.21 $6,989.99 $6,235.95
D Computer Supplies and Accessories
Category % Discount Offered 25% 15% 40%
Category Price $38,951.91 $37,147.64 $26,075.22
Market Basket % Discount Offered 25% - 91% 0% - 57% 7% - 82%
Market Basket Price $35,979.29 $31,067.55 $29,302.25
E First Aid Supplies
Category % Discount Offered 20% 30% 40%
Category Price $4,187.59 $4,258.69 $2,985.85
Market Basket % Discount Offered 20% - 57% 5% - 70% 14% - 85%
Market Basket Price $3,028.23 $2,762.25 $2,784.99
F Toners
Category % Discount Offered 15% 20% 37%
Category Price $176,936.54 $172,180.49 $140,380.90
Market Basket % Discount Offered 15% - 53% 3% - 72% 7% - 70%
Market Basket Price $133,826.28 $138,908.25 $138,038.77
Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 Days
Estimated Annual Total NAS $779,850.10 $763,655.22 $580,282.43
Estimated Annual Award NAS $779,850.10 $763,655.22 $580,282.43
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