City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Duty Trucks and Vans Bid #1 Bid #2
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Grapevine DCJ Brasada Ford, LTD Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Grande Truck Center Caldwell Country Ford | Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet
6100005682 IM [1211 US Hwy 96 N PO Box 27 2601 William Tate 12300 San Pedro 12602 IH 35 N 4562 IH 10 East PO Box 27 2601 William Tate
Silsbee, Caldwell, Grapevine, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, Caldwell, Grapevine,
TX 77656 TX 77836 TX 76051 TX 78216 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 77836 TX 76051
Item Description Qty 1409-988-9377 979-567-6116 817-410-7541 210-477-3435 210-599-5000 210-666-7112
1 1/2 Ton Compact Extended Cab Pickup Truck 8
Price Each $21.137.16ﬁI $21,845.00 No Bid No Bid $22,668.26 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $169,097.28 $174,760.00 $181,346.08
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 7.24%
Price Differential $12,248.80
Make & Model & Year Offered 2015 Ford F-150 Ext.| Chevrolet Colorado 4X2 Chevrolet Colorado Ext|
Cab Buv Board| Ext Cab12M53 Cab 2016
Production Cut-Off Date 7/31/2015| 4/15/2016 All of 2016 Production
Schedule
Last Day to Place Order 7/31/2015| 4/11/2016 No. May-June 2016
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No Yes No
Delivery Not Specified 120 120
2 1/2 Ton Full Size Regular Cab Pickup Truck 10
Price Each $19,924.16 $19,845.00 $23,459.00 $21,021.00 $20,381.35 $20,585.16 $20,335.00 $24,163.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 2.5% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $22,872.53
Price Total $199,241.60 $198,450.00 $234,590.00 $210,210.00 $203,813.50 $205,851.60 $203,350.00 $241,630.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 5.93%) 2.70%) 3.73%
Price Differential $11,760.00]| $5,363.50 $7,401.60
Make & Model & Year Offered 2015 Ford F-150 Reg. Chevrolet 1500 2015 Ram 1500 Ford F150. F1C 2015[ Chevrolet Reg Cab CC{2015 Ford F150 R/C Ford F150 4X2 Reg Cab| 2016 Ram 1500 DS1261
Cab, Buy Board| Silverado 4X2 Reg Cab Option 2015 DS1261 15703 2016 SWB F/C, 2015
SWB CC15703, 2015
Production Cut-Off Date 7/31/2015 7/23/2015 7/10/2015 TBD|  All of 2016 Production 8/31/2015 12/30/2015 Apprx 7/16
Schedule
Dump Insert Make & Model N/A None N/A N/A| None N/A N/A N/A
Last Day to Place Order 7/31/2015 Yes, 7/23/2016 4/20/2015 TBD| May-June 2016 8/31/2015 12/30/2015 Approx 4-15-16
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No Yes 150 No No No Yes No
Delivery Days Not Specified 120 80-100 75 110] 75-120 120 80-100
3 1/2 Ton Full Size Extended Cab Pickup Truck (Blue) 1
Price Each $21,137.16 $20,920.00 $22,982.00 $22,564.00 $23,246.16 $21,798.16 $21,510.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 2.5% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $22,407.45
Price Total $21,137.16 $20,920.00]| $22,982.00 $22,564.00 $23,246.16 $21,798.16 $21,510.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 7.86% 11.12% 4.20%
Price Differential $1,644.00 $2,326.16 $878.16
Make & Model & Year Offered Ford F-150 Ext. Cab Buy| Chevrolet 1500/ 2015 Ram 1500 DS1L41 Ford F150. X1C, 2016 Chevrolet Double Cab| 2015 Ford F150 R/C Ext| Fiord F150 4X2
Board| Silverado 4X2 Double| 2nd 2016 Cab Supercab X/C, 2015
Cab CC15753. 2015
Production Cut-Off Date 7/31/2015 7/23/2015 8/6/2015 TBD| All of 2016 Production 8/31/2015 12/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order 7/31/2015 7/23/2015 5/29/2015 TBD May-June 2016 8/31/2015 12/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No Yes| No No No No Yes
Delivery Not Specified 120 80-90 90 95-110 75-120 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Duty Trucks and Vans Bid #1 Bid #2
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Grapevine DCJ Brasada Ford, LTD Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Grande Truck Center Caldwell Country Ford | Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet
6100005682 IM [1211 US Hwy 96 N PO Box 27 2601 William Tate 12300 San Pedro 12602 IH 35 N 4562 IH 10 East PO Box 27 2601 William Tate
Silsbee, Caldwell, Grapevine, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, Caldwell, Grapevine,
TX 77656 TX 77836 TX 76051 TX 78216 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 77836 TX 76051
Item Description Qty 1409-988-9377 979-567-6116 817-410-7541 210-477-3435 210-599-5000 210-666-7112
4 1/2 Ton Full Size Crew Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck 1
Price Each $26,812.16 $26,630.00]| $22,261.00 $28,392.00 $29,170.40 $27,393.16 $27,439.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 2.5%| 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $21,704.48
Price Total $26,812.16 $26,630.00]| $22,261.00] $28,392.00 $29,170.40 $27,393.16 $27,439.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 27.54%) 31.04%) 23.05%
Price Differential $6,131.00) $6,909.40) $5,132.16
Make & Model & Year Offered 2015 Ford F-150 Crew Chevrolet 1500|| 2015 Ram 1500 DS6698 Ford F 150. W1E| Chevrolet Crew Cab 4X4| 2015 Ford F150 Crew Ford F150 4X4|
Cab 4X4 Buy Board| Silverado 4X4 CrewCab 2016 Cab 4X4 Supercrew W/E, 2015
CK15543. 2015
Production Cut-Off Date 7/31/2015 7/23/2015 8/6/2015 TBD All 8/31/2015 12/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order 7/31/2015 7/23/2015 5/29/2015 TBD Not Specified 8/31/2015 12/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No Yes No No No No Yes
Delivery Not Specified 120 80-90) 90 95-110 75-120 Not Specified
5 3/4 Ton Extended Cab Pickup Truck 3
Price Each $24,363.24| No Bid No Bid $26,424.00| $27,151.10 $25,652.24 $25,460.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $73,089.72 $79,272.00 $81,453.30 $76,956.72 $76,380.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 8.46% 11.44% 5.29%
Price Differential $6.182.28 $8.363.58 $3,867.00
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Ford F-250 Ext| Ford F250. X2A 2016 Chevrolet 2500 Double 2016 Ford F250|Ford F250 4X2 Supercab
Cab Buy Board| Cab 2016 Extended Cab SWBX2A, 2016
Production Cut-Off Date 10/1/2015 TBD| All of 2016 Production 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order 10/1/2015 TBD May-June 2016 8/31.2015 8/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Not Specified No No No Yes
Delivery Not Specified 90 95-110 75-120 120 Days
6 3/4 Ton Extended Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck 1
Price Each $27,149.24] No Bid No Bid $29,699.00 $30,182.60 $29,089.28 $28,530.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0%) 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $27,149.24 $29,699.00 $30,182.60 $29,089.28 $28,530.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 9.39% 11.17% 7.15%
Price Differential $2,549.76 $3.033.36 $1,940.04
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Ford F-250 Ext. Ford F250. W2B 2016  Chevrolet 4X4 Double 2016 Ford F250|Ford F250 4X4 Supercab
Cab 4X4 Buy Board Cab 2016 Extended Cab 4X4 LWB X2B, 2016

Production Cut-Off Date

Last Day to Place Order

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Delivery

10/1/2015
10/1/2015
No
90

TBD
TBD
No
90

All of 2016 Production
May-June 2016

No

95-110

8/31/2015
8/31/2015
No
75-120

8/30/2015
8/30/2015
Yes
120
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Duty Trucks and Vans Bid #1 Bid #2
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Grapevine DCJ Brasada Ford, LTD Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Grande Truck Center Caldwell Country Ford | Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet
6100005682 IM [1211 US Hwy 96 N PO Box 27 2601 William Tate 12300 San Pedro 12602 IH 35 N 4562 IH 10 East PO Box 27 2601 William Tate
Silsbee, Caldwell, Grapevine, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, Caldwell, Grapevine,
TX 77656 TX 77836 TX 76051 TX 78216 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 77836 TX 76051
Item Description Qty 1409-988-9377 979-567-6116 817-410-7541 210-477-3435 210-599-5000 210-666-7112
7 3/4 Ton Crew Cab, Short Bed Pickup Truck 5
Price Each $25,216.24| No Bid $26,677.00 $27,513.00 $28,419.91 $26,988.24| $26,945.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2.5% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $26,010.08
Price Total $126,081.20) $133,385.00 $137,565.00 $142,099.55 $134,941.20 $134,725.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 9.11% 12.70% 7.03%
Price Differential $11,483.80 $16,018.35 $8,860.00
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Ram 2500 DJ2291| Ford F250. W2A 2016| Chevrolet 2WD 3/4 Crew| 2016 Ford F250 Crew| Ford F250 4X2 Crewcab
Cab 2016 Cab SWB W2A, 2016
Production Cut-Off Date 10/1/2015) Est July 2016 TBD May-June 2016 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order 10/1/2015| Est April 2016 TBD May-June 2016 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No No No No Yes
Delivery 90 80-90 90 120 75-120 120
8 3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4x4 Long Bed Diesel Pickup Truck 6
Price Each $35,760.40]| No Bid $41,026.00| $37,641.00 $39,041.16 $37,247.44 $36,588.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2.5% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $40,000.35
Price Total $214,562.40 $246,156.00 $225,846.00 $234,246.96 $223,484.64 $219,528.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 5.26% 9.17% 4.16%
Price Differential $11,283.60 $19,684.56 $8,922.24
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Ford F-250 Crew| 2016 Ram 2500 DJ7L92|  Ford F250. W2B 2016| Chevrolet 3/4 LWB Crew| 2016 Ford F250 Crew| Ford F250 4X4 Crewcab
Cab 4X4, Buy Board| Cab 2016 Cab 4X4 LWB W2B, 2016
Production Cut-Off Date 10/1/2015 Est July 2016 TBD| All of 2016 Production 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order 10/1/2015) Est April 2016 TBD May-June 2016 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No No No No Yes
Delivery 90| 80-90 90 120 75-120 120
9 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Long Bed with Lift Gate Pickup Truck 1
Price Each $36,282.24 No Bid $27,428.00] $31,605.00 $31,335.60 $30,339.74 $30,335.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2.5% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $26,742.30]
Price Total $36,282.24 $27,428.00| $31,605.00 $31,335.60 $30,339.74 $30,335.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 15.23%) 14.25% 10.62%
Price Differential $4,177.00 $3,907.60 $2,911.74
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Ford F-250 Crew 2016 Ram 2500 DJLL92| Ford F250. W2A 2016 Chevrolet 2500 LWB 2016 Ford F250 Crew Ford F250 4X2
Buy Board Crew| Cab WILift Gate CrewcabLWB W2A,
2016
Production Cut-Off Date Not Specified Est July 2016 TBD| All of 2016 Production 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order 10/1/2015 Est April 2016 TBD May-June 2016 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: 10/1/2015 No No Not Specified No Yes
Delivery 120-160 180-240] 150 120 120-140 150
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Duty Trucks and Vans Bid #1 Bid #2
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Grapevine DCJ Brasada Ford, LTD Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Grande Truck Center Caldwell Country Ford | Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet
6100005682 IM [1211 US Hwy 96 N PO Box 27 2601 William Tate 12300 San Pedro 12602 IH 35 N 4562 IH 10 East PO Box 27 2601 William Tate
Silsbee, Caldwell, Grapevine, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, Caldwell, Grapevine,
TX 77656 TX 77836 TX 76051 TX 78216 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 77836 TX 76051
Item Description Qty 1409-988-9377 979-567-6116 817-410-7541 210-477-3435 210-599-5000 210-666-7112
10 3/4 Ton Crew Cab Utility Bed with Lift Gate Pickup Truck 2
Price Each $36,832.24 No Bid $32,437.00] $34,846.00 $37,345.60 $37,303.24 $35,828.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 2.5%) 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $31,626.08,
Price Total $73,664.48 $64,874.00]| $69,692.00 $74,691.20 $74,606.48 $71,656.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 7.43% 15.13%) 15.00%)
Price Differential $4,818.00 $9,817.20 $9,732.48
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Ford F-250 Crew 2016 Ram 2500 DJLL92|  Ford F250. W2A 2016 Chevrolet 2500 Crew| 2016 Ford F250 Crew| Ford F250 4X2 Crewcab
Cab, Buy Board Cab W/Service Body &| Cab W/Utility Bed & Lift W/UTL W2A, 2016
Lift Gate Gate
Production Cut-Off Date 10/1/2015 Est July 2016 TBD| All of 2016 Production 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order 10/1/2015 Est April 2016 TBD May-June 2016 8/31/2015 8/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Not Specified No No No No Yes
Delivery 120-160 80-90] 150 120 120-140 150
11 3/4 Ton Live Animal Control/Transport Pickup Truck 5
Price Each $46,015.24| No Bid No Bid $46,222.00]| $53,081.11 $55,472.24] No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0%) 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $230,076.20 $231,110.00 $265,405.55 $277.361.20
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 0.45%) 14.84% 20.55%)
Price Differential $1,033.80 $34,295.55 $47,285.00
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Ford F-250 Reg. Ford F250. F2B 2016( Chevrolet 2500 Reg Cab| 2016 Ford F250 R/C 4X4
Cab 4X4, Buy Board 2016| W/Custom Control Bed
Production Cut-Off Date 10/1/2015 TBD| All of 2016 Production 8/31/2015
Last Day to Place Order 10/1/2015 TBD| May-June 8/31/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No No No
Delivery 240 120] 250-275 150-180
12 Deleted
13 1 Ton 5-Passenger Cargo Van 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,819.31 No Bid $33,919.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $28,819.31 $33,919.00

Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Make & Model & Year Offered

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Delivery

Chevrolet Express Cargo
2016

Could end as early as
Dec 2015

Not Sure

No

160-220)

Ford Transit 350 Wagon
W4X. 2016
4/15/2016

4/15/2016
Yes
150
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Duty Trucks and Vans Bid #1 Bid #2
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Grapevine DCJ Brasada Ford, LTD Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Grande Truck Center Caldwell Country Ford | Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet
6100005682 1211 US Hwy 96 N PO Box 27 2601 William Tate 12300 San Pedro 12602 IH 35 N 4562 IH 10 East PO Box 27 2601 William Tate
Silsbee, Caldwell, Grapevine, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, Caldwell, Grapevine,
TX 77656 TX 77836 TX 76051 TX 78216 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 77836 TX 76051
Item Description Y [409-988-9377 979-567-6116 817-410-7541 210-477-3435 210-599-5000 210-666-7112
14 1 Ton, 14ft Step Van wider dimensions /without Lift Gate
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,242.00 No Bid $44,404.24 $43,440.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $45,242.00| $44,404.24 $43,440.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 4.15% 2.22%)
Price Differential $1,802.00 $964.24]
Make & Model & Year Offered Ford E450. E4K 2016 2016 Ford E450 Chassis Ford E450 E4K
W Utilimaster Body|| W/Utilmaster, 2016 (No
Gate)
Production Cut-Off Date TBD 8/31/2015| 12/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order TBD 8/31/2015 12/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No Yes
Delivery 120 135-175] 180-240
15 1 Ton 14ft Step Van with Lift Gate
Price Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $48,600.00 No Bid $49,599.24 $48,335.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $97,200.00] $99,198.48 $96,670.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 0.55%) 2.62%
Price Differential $530.00 $2,528.48
Make & Model & Year Offered Ford E450. E4K 2016 2016 Ford E450 Chassis Ford E450 E4K|
W/Utilimaster Body| W/Utilimaster, 2016
(Liftoate)
Production Cut-Off Date TBD| 8/31/2015 12/30/2015
Last Day to Place Order TBD| 8/31/2015 12/30/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No Yes
Delivery 120 135-175 180-240|
16 1 Ton 15-Passenger Van (1 Blue, 1 Silver)
Price Each $28,037.16 $29,975.00 No Bid No Bid $29,128.01 No Bid $33,335.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $168,222.96 $179,850.00 $174,768.06 $200,010.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 3.89%
Price Differential $6,545.10

Make & Model & Year Offered

Production Cut-Off Date

Last Day to Place Order
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Delivery

2015 Transit Van, Buy|
Board 26 Gal Tank, 9000
GVWR

8/31/2015

8/31/2015
No
Not Specified

Chevrolet Express 3500
Ext CG33706, 2016

4/15/2016
4/15/2016

April 15, 2016, Yes
120

Chevrolet Express 1 Ton
Passenger Van 2016

Could be as early as Dec
2015

Not Sure

No

160-220

Ford Transit 350 Wagon
u4Xx, 2016

4/15/2016
4/15/2016

Yes
150
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Duty Trucks and Vans Bid #1 Bid #2
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Grapevine DCJ Brasada Ford, LTD Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Grande Truck Center Caldwell Country Ford | Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet
6100005682 IM [1211 US Hwy 96 N PO Box 27 2601 William Tate 12300 San Pedro 12602 IH 35 N 4562 IH 10 East PO Box 27 2601 William Tate
Silsbee, Caldwell, Grapevine, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, Caldwell, Grapevine,
TX 77656 TX 77836 TX 76051 TX 78216 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 77836 TX 76051
Item Description Qty 1409-988-9377 979-567-6116 817-410-7541 210-477-3435 210-599-5000 210-666-7112
17 2-Passenger Paddy Wagon (Black & White) 1
Price Each $23,342.16=" $29,945.00 No Bid No Bid $24,913.76 No Bid $28,210.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $23,342.16 $29,945.00 $24,913.76 $28,210.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 6.73%
Price Differential $1,571.60
Make & Model & Year Offered 2015 Ford Transit, Buy|| Chevrolet Express 3500 Chevrolet Express Cargo Ford Transit 350 Wagon
Board, 26 Gal. Fuel Tank| CG33406, 2016 3/4 Ton Van 2016 X27, 2016
Production Cut-Off Date 8/31/2015 4/15/2016 Could be as early as Dec 4/15/2016
2015
Last Day to Place Order 8/31/2015| 4/15/2016 Not sure 4/15/2016
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No Yes No Yes
Delivery 90-120 120 160-220 180
18 8-Passenger Van 1
Price Each $24,774.16 $28,300.00] No Bid No Bid $26,859.75 $27,149.16 $25,985.00 No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $24,774.16 $28,300.00] $26,859.75 $27,149.16 $25,985.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 8.42% 9.59%
Price Differential $2,085.59 $2,375.00
Make & Model & Year Offered Ford Transit Van, Buy|| Chevrolet 2500 Express Chevrolet 2500 Express 2015 Ford Transit| Ford 150 Transit Wagon
Board, 26 Gal. Fuel Tank| CG23406, 2016 Passenger Wagon 8 Passenger KIY, 2016
Production Cut-Off Date 8/31/2015 4/15/2016 Could be as early as Dec 6/15/2015 4/15/2016
2015
Last Day to Place Order 8/31/2015| 4/15/2016 Not sure 6/15/2015 4/15/2016
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No April 2016, Yes Not Specified No Yes
Delivery 90| 120 160-220 120-180 150
19 12-PassengerVan 3 NAS
Price Each $27,235.16 $28,245.00 No Bid No Bid $27,774.26 $29,206.16 $28,310.00] No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $81,705.48 $84,735.00] $83,322.78 $87,618.48 $84,930.00]
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 1.98%) 5.16%
Price Differential $1,617.30 $4,295.70
Make & Model & Year Offered 2015 Ford Transit, V6| Chevrolet 3500 Express Chevrolet Express 2015 Ford Transit| Ford 350 Transit Wagon
CG33406. 2016 Passenaer Van Waaon 12 Passenaer| X27.2016
Production Cut-Off Date 8/31/2015 4/15/2016 Could be as early as Dec 6/15/2015 4/15/2016
Last Day to Place Order 8/31/2015 4/15/2016 Not sure| 6/15/2015 4/15/2016
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No April 15, 2016, Yes No No Yes
Delivery 90 120 160-220) 120-180 150
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 22, 2015
For: Purchase of Light Duty Trucks and Vans Bid #1 Bid #2
Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Ford Caldwell Country Grapevine DCJ Brasada Ford, LTD Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Grande Truck Center Caldwell Country Ford | Grapevine DCJ
Chevrolet
6100005682 IM [1211 US Hwy 96 N PO Box 27 2601 William Tate 12300 San Pedro 12602 IH 35 N 4562 IH 10 East PO Box 27 2601 William Tate
Silsbee, Caldwell, Grapevine, San Antonio, Selma, San Antonio, Caldwell, Grapevine,
TX 77656 TX 77836 TX 76051 TX 78216 TX 78154 TX 78219 TX 77836 TX 76051
Item Description Qty 1409-988-9377 979-567-6116 817-410-7541 210-477-3435 210-599-5000 210-666-7112
20 Mini Van 1
Price Each No Bid No Bid| $23,984.00) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Prompt Payment Discount 2.5%) 0%
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount $23,384.40)
Price Total $23,984.00
Percentaage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Make & Model & Year Offered 2015 Dodge Grand
Caravan RTKH53
Production Cut-Off Date 7/31/2015|
Last Day to Place Order 4/29/2015
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No, Possible through 5-
15-15]
Delivery 80-90
Authorized Factory Dealer Name Red McCombs Ford Gunn Chevrolet Boerne Dodge (Any| Northside Ford| Chevrolet Motor Division Grande Truck Center Grande Ford Truck Boerne Dodge (Any|
authorized Dodge Sales authorized Dodge
dealen dealen
Authorized Factory Dealer Address 833 West Interstate 10 12601 IH35 North, 30300 IH 10 West, 12300 San Pedro, 16550 IH35 N, 4562 IH-10 East, 4562 IH 10 East, 30300 IH 10 West,
San Antonio, Tx. 78230 San Antonio, Tx. 78233 Boerne, Tx.| San Antonio, Tx. 78216 Selma Tx.| San Antonio, Tx. 78219| San Antonio, Tx. 78219 Boerne, Tx.
78154
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 2 1/2% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total Award 59 $826,319.12 $20,920.00 $138,547.00 $328,310.00 $315,955.59 $44,404.24 $0.00 $0.00

Items 12 was deleted and will be rebid at a later date.
Silsbee Ford was deemed NAS for item 19, offered a V-6 engine that does not meet the minimum specifications.
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