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AN ORDINANCE 

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING 
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL COST OF $1,573,200.00: (A) MIDWEST VETERINARY 
SUPPLY AND PATTERSON VETERINARY FOR VETERINARIAN 
PHARMACEUTICALS AND VACCINE SUPPLIES, (B) STRYKER 
SALES CORPORATION FOR THE PURCHASE & MAINTENANCE OF 
AMBULANCE STRETCHERS, COMBINATION CHAIRS & COT 
HOLDERS, (C) UNGERBOECK SOFTWARE INTERNATIONAL, INC. 
FOR UNGERBOECK MAINTENANCE & SUPPORT, AND (D) 
CARTE GRAPH SYSTEMS, INC. FOR CARTE GRAPH UPGRADES TO 
INCLUDE MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and 
services on an annual contract basis; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Midwest 
Veterinary Supply and Patterson Veterinary for veterinarian pharmaceuticals and vaccine 
supplies, (B) Stryker Sales Corporation for the purchase & maintenance of ambulance stretchers, 
combination chairs & cot holders, (C) Ungerboeck Software International, Inc. for Ungerboeck 
maintenance & support, and (D) Cartegraph Systems, Inc. for Cartegraph upgrades to include 
maintenance and support; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves two low bid contracts, one contract which provide for a 
procurement necessary to protect the public health or safety, and two sole source contracts; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: . 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids of the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Midwest 
Veterinary Supply and Patterson Veterinary for veterinarian pharmaceuticals and vaccine 
supplies, (B) Stryker Sales Corporation for the purchase & maintenance of ambulance stretchers, 
combination chairs & cot holders, (C) Ungerboeck Software International, Inc. for Ungerboeck 
maintenance & support, and (D) Cartegraph Systems, Inc. for Cartegraph upgrades to include 
maintenance and support on an annual contract basis as shown on the attached bid tabulation 
sheets, are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, 
performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are 
attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are 
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 
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SECTION 2. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders, and 
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will 
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2016 budget approved by City Council, and future fiscal 
year expenditures are contingent upon future City council budget approvals. 

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 14th day of January, 2016. 

~~~~ 
Ivy R. Taylor 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

2 
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~ndaItem: 8 ( in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9,10,11,12,13,16, 20A, 20B, 21A, 21B, 21C, 21D, 21E) 

e: 01114/2016 

'ime: 09:18:26 AM 

ote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for 
an estimated annual cost of$I,573,200,00: (A) Midwest Veterinary Supply and Patterson Veterinary 
for veterinarian pharmaceuticals and vaccine supplies, (B) Stryker Sales Corporation for the purchase 
& maintenance of ambulance stretchers, combination chairs & cot holders, (C) Ungerboeck Software 
International, Inc, for Ungerboeck maintenance & support, and (D) Cartegraph Systems, Inc. for 
Cartegraph upgrades to include maintenance and support. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy 
Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ivy R. Taylor Mayor x 

Roberto C. Trevino District 1 x x 

Alan Warrick District 2 x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

CrisMedina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x x 

http:// cosaweb/VoteInterfacelDefault.aspx 1114/2016 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

1 Aluspray, aerosol, Spray, 75g 
Unit Cost 
Prom pt Paym ent Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity 

2 Andis Pro clip Ultra edge, 2 speed detachable blade 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity 

3 Atipamazole 5mg/ml, Bottle, 10 ml 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

4 Enrofloxacin injectable solution 100mg/ml, Bottie, 500ml 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

5 Carprofen Tablets 75 mg, Bottle, 180 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

6 Carprofen Tablets 25 mg, Bottle, 180 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local -
Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

6 
$12.04 

$0.00 
$72.24 
$72.24 

Neogen 
193.02050. 

Each 

20 
$142.46 

$0.00 
$2,849.20 
$2,849.20 

Andis 
046.19525.2 

Each 

850 
$155.50 

$0.0 
$132,175.0 
$132,175.01 

Zoeti, 
193.02854 

Each 

12 
$95.85/ $.3834' 

$0.00 
$2,300.40 
$2,300.40 
Norbrook 

515.100005.3 
(24) 250ml bottles 

15 
$152.70 

$0.00 
$2,290.50 
$2,290.50 

Zoetis 
193.70125.3 

Each 

15 
$123.90 

$0.00 
$1,858.50 
$1,858.50 

Zoetis 
193.70110.3 

Each 
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EXHIBIT I 

Non Local - Non Local . 
Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$12.70 

$0.00 
$76.20 
$76.20 

Neogen 
1012009 

Each 

No Bid 
$149.95 

$0.00 
$2,999.00 
$2,999.00 

Andis 
22405 

Each 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 
$228.00 I $.456' 

$0.00 
$2,736.00 
$2,736.00 

Bayer 
83471752 

(12) 500ml bottles 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid No Bid 



Opened: November 23,2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

7 Carprofen Tablets 100 mg, Bottle, 180 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

8 CEFPODOXIME, Generic Simplicef 200 mg, Bottle, 250 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

9 CEFPODOXIME, Generic simplicef 100 mg, Bottle 100 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

10 Cephalexin 250mg capsules, Bottle, 500 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

11 Cephalexin 500mg Capsule, Bottle, 500 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per bottle 

12 Deleted 

13 Deleted 

14 Deleted 

15 Deleted 

16 Deleted 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-local 

Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

15 
$187.80 

Zoetis 
$2,817.00 
$2,817.00 

193.70145. 
Each 

12 
$533.00 1 $2.132 

$0.00 
$6,396.00 
$6,396.00 

Zoetis 
193.73446.3 

(12 bottles, 250 ctl 

12 
$110.051 $1.1005" 

$0.00 
$1,320.60 
$1,320.60 

Zoetis 
193.73440.3 

12 bottles, 100 ct 

24 
$24.0 

$0.00 
$576.72 
$576.72 

Orchid Pharma 
191,32020.3 

Each 

24 
$33.40 
$0.00 

$801,60 
$801.60 

191.3206 
orchidPh~ 
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Non-Local Non-Local 

Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid No Bid 

$123,851 $.4954 $113.281 $5.664" 
$0,00 $0.00 

$1,486.20 $16,992.00 
$1,486.20 $16,992.00 
Patterson Aurobindo Pharma Limited 

52343002001 65862-096-20 
(12 bottles, 250 ctl (150 bottles, 20 ctl 

$67.151 $.6715" $101.21 1 $5.0605" 
$O.OC $0.00 

$805,8C $6,072.60 
$805.8C $6,072.60 

Pattersor Aurobindo Pharma Limited 
52343881901 65862-095-20 

12 bottles, 100 C 60 bottles, 20 ct 

$25.70 $29,99 
$0,00 $0,00 

$616,80 $0.00 
$616.80 $719.76 

Patterson Teva Pharmaceuticals USA 
76439010150 00093-3145-05 

Each Each 

$35.65 $44.42 
$0.00 $0.00 

$855,60 $0.00 
$855.60 $1,066.08 

Patterson T eva Pharmaceuticals USA 
67877021905 00093-3147-05 

Each Each 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

17 Cotton Roll, Curity 12-112" x 56" cotton roll, 1 Rolllb, Each' 

Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

18 Curity laparotomy sponges, 12"x12" Sterile, Case 20x5 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Case 

19 Deleted 

Dexmedetomidine hydrochloride Injectable, 0.5mg/ml, 10 ml 
20 bottle 

Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Bottle 

21 Digital thermometer, read in 30 seconds 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

22 Deleted 

23 Deleted 

24 Deleted 

25 Feeding tube and Urethreal Catheter, 8 Fr 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local -
Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

12 
$3.77 
$0.00 

$45.24 
$45.24 

Covidien/Kendall 
366.18500.4 

Each 

6 
$47.60 

$O.OC 
$285.6C 
$285.6C 

Case 2 
covidien/~ 

730 
$155.50 

$0.00 
$113,515.00 
$113,515.00 

Zoetis 
193.13250.3 

Each 

40 
$7.72 
$0.00 

$308.80 
$308.80 

3M 
470.80015.2 

Each 

30 
$0.9 
$0. 

$28. 
$28. 

Covidien/Kend 
366.72200 

Eal 
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Non Local - Non Local -
Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$4.00 
$0.00 

$48.00 
$48.00 

Covidien 
2287 
Each 

No Bid 
$50.15 

$0.00 
$300.90 
$300.90 
Covidien 

6034 
Each 

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid 

$~:6~ $0. 
$96.00 
$96.00 

3M 
522871 

Each 

No Bid 
$1.00 
$0.00 

$30.00 
$30.00 

Covidien 
8890700811 

Each 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

26 Feeding tube/urethreal, Red Ruber 5fr x 16, Each 
Unit Cost 
Prom pt Paym ent Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

27 Feline combo Felv/Fiv Witnes or snap, Box, 25 Test 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

28 Gloves, Triflex Surgery sterile 8.5, Box, Each 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Num ber 
Quantity per Box 

29 SURFLO® ETFE I.V. Catheter 14G x 2" (Orange) Box 50 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

30 IV catheter 20gx1 ", Box 50 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

31 IV catheter 229X1", Box 50 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

32 IV catheter 24gx3/4", Box 50 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local 

Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

10 
$0.9: 
$0.0 
$9.5 
$9.5 

Covidien/Kenda 
366.72100.4 

Each 

24 
$337.50 

$0.00 
$8,100.00 
$8,100.00 

Zoetis 
555.80219. 

Eacr 

180 
$24.73 
$0.00 

$4,451.40 
$4,451.40 
Allegiance 

001.07017.2 
Each 

1 
$1.00 
$0.00 

$50.00 
$50.00 

Terumo 
193.75300.2 

Box 50 

24 
$41.501$.83 

$0.00 
$996.00 
$996.00 
Terumo 

193.75331.2 
Box 50 

30 
$41.50 1 $.83 

$0.00 
$1,245.00 
$1,245.00 

Terumo 
193.75361.2 

Box 50 

24 
$41.50 1 $.83 

$0.00 
$996.00 
$996.00 
Terumo 

193.75371.2 
Box 50 
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Non Local . Non Local 

Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$1.00 
$0.00 

$10.00 
$10.00 

Covidien 
8890700514 

Each 

No Bid 
$303.75 

$0.00 
$7,290.00 
$7,290.00 

Abaxis 
250-0000-25 

25 pack 

NAS No Bid 
$22.65 
$0.00 

$4,077.00 
$4,077.00 

Cardinal 
2DT256 

Each 

No Bid 
$1.05 
$0.00 

$52.50 
$52.50 

Terumo 
145102 

Each 

No Bid 
$45.00 1 $0.90' 

$0.00 
$1,080.00 
$1,080.00 

Terumo 
OX20254 

Each 

No Bid 
$45.00 1 $0.90' 

$0.00 
$1,350.00 
$1,350.00 

Terumo 
OX2225V 

Each 

$45.001$.90' No Bid 
$0.00 

$1,080.00 
$1,080.00 

Terumo 
OX2419 

Each 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

33 IV extension set, 30" Jorgensen Luer Lock, Each 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

34 Deleted 

35 IV Fluids-Plasma-Lyle A, 1000ml Bag, Each 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

36 Ivermectin 1%, Bottle, 250ml 
Unit Cost 
Prom pt Paym ent Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Bottle 

37 Kendall Curity Standard Porous Tape, 1" 12 per box 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

38 Kendall Sharps Container, 8 Gal 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

39 Kendall Surgi-Drape, 38.5" wide 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

40 Kwik stop 14g, Styptic powder with benzocaine, Each 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 

Quantity per Box 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local . 
Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877·507·6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

300 
$1.59 
$0.00 

$477.00 
$477.00 

Jorgensen 
350.10681.2 

Each 

500 
$1.76 
$0.00 

$880.00 
$880.00 
Hospira 

004.28015.2 
Each 

6 
$43.75 
$0.00 

$262.50 
$262.50 
Agri-Iab 

801.01942.3 
Each 

12 
$12.15 
$0.00 

$145.80 
$145.80 

Kendall/Covidien 
366.18100.2 

12ct 

156 
$11.13 

$0.00 
$1,736.28 
$1,736.28 

Covidien/Kendall 
366.71320.4 

Each 

180 
$75.72 
$0.00 

$13,629.60 
$13,629.60 

Covidien/Kendall 
366.21000.4 

Each 

12 $4.07 
$48.84 
$0.00 

$48.84 
$48.84 

153.00874.3 
Each 
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Non Local Non Local 

Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$1.68 
$0.00 

$504.00 
$504.00 

Jorgensen 
J0467P 

Each 

No Bid 
$1.85 
$0.00 

$925.00 
$925.00 
Hospira 

12672-28 
Each 

No Bid 
$47.14 

$0.00 
$282.84 
$282.84 

Norbrook 
6460810 

Each 

No Bid 
$12.80 

$0.00 
$153.60 
$153.60 
Covidien 

2531C 
Each 

No Bid 
$11.75 

$0.00 
$1,833.00 
$1,833.00 

Covidien 
8980 
Each 

No Bid 
$79.70 
$0.00 

$14,346.00 
$14,346.00 

Covidien 
2,345 
Each 

$4.30 No Bid 
$51.60 
$0.00 

$51.60 
$51.60 

463501 
Each 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

41 Liqui-tinic Gallon suspension, 1 Gallon 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Gallon 

42 Littmann Classic II S.E Stethoscope 28", Each 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

43 Mannitol 25%, Injectable, Bottle, 50 cc 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Bottle 

44 Maxon suture GS-11 2-0 half circle, Box, 36 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

45 Maxon suture with Reverse Cutting Needle POint, C-14, 3/0 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

46 Meloxicam Injectable 5 mg/ml10ml, BoUles, 10ml 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Bottle 

47 Monoject Sterile Syringe, 12 mL, Luer-Lock Tip 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per BoUie 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local -
Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

3 
$104.45 

$0.00 
$313.35 
$313.35 

PRN 
193.44001.2 

Each 

15 
$70.6i 

$O.OC 
$1,060.0( 
$1,060.0( 

470.00~ 

12 
$6.66 
$0.00 

$79.9 
$79.9 

Neoger 
193.46640. 

Eact 

360 NAS 
164.79' 

$0.00 
$59,324.40 
$59,324.40 
CP Medical 

193.61596.2 
1080 boxes, 12 ct 

200 NAS 
164.79 

$0.0 
$32,958.0 
$32,958.0 
CP Medic, 

193.51632.2 
600 boxes, 12 ct 

72 
$47.91 

$O.O( 
$3,454.5t 
$3,454.5t 

Bim~od~ 
193.49100 

Eac; 

100 
$17.28 

$O.OC 
$1,728.00 
$1,728.00 

Covidien/Kendal1 

366651~g~ 
80 
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Non Local - Non Local 

Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$103.05 

$0.00 
$309.15 
$309.15 

Zoetis 
10000499 

Each 

No Bid 
$74.40 
$0.00 

$1,116.00 
$1,116.00 

3M 
2,201 
Each 

No Bid 
$6.6C 
$0.0( 

$79.2C 
$79.2C 
Vedc( 

Vedc211 
100 ml eact 

No Bid 
$169.98 

$0.00 
$61,192.80 
$61,192.80 

Covidien 
8886675551 

360 boxes, 36 ct 

No Bid 
$174. 

$0. 
$34,990. 
$34,990. 

Covid 
8886664141 

200 bo) 

No Bid 
$62.25 
$0.00 

$4,482.00 
$4,482.00 

Putney 
26637-62-01 

Each 

No Bid 
$18.20 

$0.00 
$1,820.00 
$1,820.00 

Covidien 
881512878 

80 ct 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Deseri ption 

48 Monoject Syringe without needle, 6cc 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Bottle 

49 Deleted 

50 Nitenpyram tables> 251bs, Bulk, 60 Tables 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

51 Nitrofurazone, Vt1 1 Ib ointment, Each, 11b 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

52 Ophthalmic Gentamicin solution, Bottle, 5cc 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Bottle 

\ 

53 Deleted 

54 Penrose Drain, 7/16 x 1« x 12 in, Box, 50ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Paymenl Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

55 Pet Pillers white with blue tips, Packet, 12 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Packet 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local -
Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

191 
$8.7C 
$O.OC 

$1,661.7C 
$1,661.7C 

covidien/Ke~ 
366.640 

5 

36 
$180.0C 

$O.OC 
$6,480.0( 
$6,480.0( 

Nova£l 298.22000 
Ea 

24 
$6.69 
$0.00 

$160.56 
$160.56 

Squire 
193.53300.3 

Each 

100 
$1.88 
$0.00 

$188.00 
$188.00 

Pacific Pharma 

191 .4602~~~ 
Ea 

6 
$0.54 
$0.00 

$162.00 
$162.00 

Covidien/Kendall 
366.70000.4 

50ct 

4 
$10.26 

$0.00 
$41.04 
$41.04 

Dee Products 
198.55202.2 

12ct 
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Non Local - Non Local 

Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$9.20 
$0.00 

$1,757.20 
$1,757.20 

Covidien 
8881516937-CP 

Box 50 

No Bid 
$191.00 

$0.00 
$6,876.00 
$6,876.00 

Novartis 
604,155 

60ct 

No Bid 
$5.95 
$0.00 

$142.80 
$142.80 

Vedco 
VINV-NITRO-OILB 

Each 

$3.25 $2.75 
$0.00 $0.00 

$325.00 $275.00 
$325.00 $275.00 

PRS PRS 
60758018805 60758018805 

Each Each 

No Bid 
$0.60 
$0.00 

$180.00 
$180.00 
Covidien 

8888513002 
Each 

No Bid 
$10.85 

$0.00 
$43.40 
$43.40 

SCD DeeVet 
5200 

PK 12 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

56 Ponazuril Marquis Paste 127 Gram Syringe, Box, 4 tubes 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

57 Deleted 

58 Roll Gauze, Rolled gauze 2" bag/12 , Bag, 12 rolls 
Unit Cost 
Prom pt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

59 Silver sulfadiazine Cream, Jar, 400 GM 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Jar 

60 Skin stapler, 35 regular staples 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per box 

Slippery Sam, tom cat urethral catheter PTFE 3.5 fr x 11 cm, 
61 Each 

Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

62 Strongid (Pyrantel Pamoate) Lt, Each, 32 oz 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local 

Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

18 
$748. 

$0. 
$13,472. 
$13,472. 

Mer 
310.0210C 

18 boxes / 4 

360 
$1.15 
$0.00 

$34.50 
$34.50 
Dukal 

001.14250.2 
12 ct 

24 
$37.79 
$0.00 

$906.96 
$906.96 
Ascend 

191.59920.3 
Each 

50 
$9.09 
$0.00 

$454.50 
$454.50 

Dee Veterinary Products 
196.60000.2 

Each 

5 
$12.47 
$0.00 

$62.35 
$62.35 

Smith Medical 
685.70008.2 

Each 

24 
$20.79 
$0.00 

$498.96 
$498.96 

Columbia 
191.59034.3 

Each 
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Non Local Non Local 

Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$202.08/$808.32' 

$0.00 
$14,549.76 
$14,549.76 

Merial 
73148 

72 boxes / Each 

No Bid 
$2.30 
$0.00 

$69.00 
$69.00 

PVS 
PVS5402 

12ct 

$43.35 $43.74 
$0.00 $0.00 

$1,040.40 $0.00 
$1,040.40 $1,049.76 

PVS PVS 
67877012440 67877012440 

Each Each 

No Bid 
$11.35 

$0.00 
$567.50 
$567.50 
Covidien 

8886803512 
Each 

No Bid 
$13.15 

$0.00 
$65.75 
$65.75 

Covidien 
TTM35110F 

Each 

No Bid 
$22.70 

$0.00 
$544.88 
$544.88 
Neogen 

6233741532 
Each 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

63 Syringe end caps, Pkg 500 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Package 

64 Tattoo Ink, 1 oz tube paste, Tube, 5 ounce 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Nam e 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Tube 

65 Tongue Depressors, Box, 500 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

66 Vitamin K1, Tab Chew 50 mg, Bottle, 100 ct 
Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Bottle 

67 Vet Wrap, Case, 24 rolls assorted pack 
Unit Cost 
Prom pt Paym ent Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Case 

Winged infusion set, butterfly w12" tubing winged 199, Box, 
68 50 

Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non Local 

Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

12 
$8.931 $0.0893 

$0.00 
$535.80 
$535.80 

Mai 
474.56100.<: 

(60 packs) 100 ct 

50 
$15.441 $3.088· 

$0.00 
$154.40 
$154.40 

Jorgensen 
350.05767. 

502 

12 
$4.10 
$0.00 

$49.20 
$49.20 

Dukal 
001.41000.2 

500 ct 

6 
$11.10 
$0.00 

$133.20 
$133.20 

Vet Brands 
728.00040. 

(12 bottles) 50 ct 

24 
$20.10 
$0.00 

$482.40 
$482.40 

New Decade Laboratories 
259.25005.4 

36ct 

4 
$.35/ $17.50 

$0.00 
$70.00 
$70.00 

Terumo 
193.89500.2 

50 ct 
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Non Local - Non Local -
Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$23.75 1 $0.02375 

$0.00 
$142.50 
$142.50 

(1000 

No Bid 
$5.50 
$0.00 

$275.00 
$275.00 

Jorgensen 
J0276PGS 

102 

$3.70 No Bid 
$0.00 

$44.40 
$44.40 

PVS 
PV-3588 

500 ct 

No Bid 
$11.25 
$0.00 

$135.00 
$135.00 

Vet Brand 
70 

(12 bottles) 50 ct 

No Bid 
$30.25 

$0.00 
$726.00 
$726.00 

PVS 
TA3200GPWV 

36ct 

No Bid 
$.40 1 $20.00' 

$0.00 
$80.00 
$80.00 

Terumo 
1934 

200 Each 



Opened: November 23, 2015 

For: 
Annual Contract for Veterinarian Pharmaceutical And 
Vaccine Supplies 

6100006474 

Item Description 

Winged infusion set, butterfly w12" tubing winged 23g, Box 
69 50 

Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

Winged infusion set, butterfly w12" tubing winged 25g, Box 
70 50 

Unit Cost 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Box 

Payment Terms 

Estimated Annual Total 
Estimated Award 

• Totals changed for evaluation purposes 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 

Midwest Veterinary Supply 

11240 Grader Street Suite 300 

Dallas 
TX 75238 
877-507-6531 

Estimated 
Annual 

Quantity 

2 
$.35/ $17.50 

$0.00 
$35.00 
$35.00 

Terumo 
193.89515.2 

50 c 

2 
$17.50 

$0.00 
$35.00 
$35.0( 

Terume 
193.89520. 

50 c 

Net 30 

$425,205.31 
$315,658.68 
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Non-Local Non-Local 

Patterson Veterinary HyGen Pharmaceuticals, Inc. 

303 E San Antonio St B 8635 154TH Ave NE 

Marion Redmond 
TX 78124 WA 98052 
210-491-6703 877-630-9198 

No Bid 
$.40/$20.00' 

$0.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 

Terumo 
2334 

100 Each 

No Bid 
$20.00' 

$0.00 
$40.00 
$40.00 

Terumo 
2534 

100 Each 

Net 30 Net 30 

$174,679.78 $26175.20 
$106,578.85 $0.00 



Opened: 

For: 

6100006444 

Item 

1. 

1a. 

1b. 

1e . 

. 1d. 

1e. 

11. 

19· 

1h. 

1L 

1j. 

1k. 

11. 

2. 

A. 
B. 
C. 
D. 

3. 

November 20,2015 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

AlC Purchase & Maintenance of Ambulance Stretchers, 
Combination Chairs & Cot Holders 

Description 

& ACCESSORIES 

Power-PRO XT (Model 6506) 
List Price 
% Discount 
CaSA Net Price 

Price 

tair-PRO 6252-7 yr. Warranty 

Power Load Cot Fastening System (Model 6390} 
List Price 
% Discount 
GOSA Net Price 
Extended Price 

Prevent Power-Load 7 yr. Warranty 
List Price 
% Discount 
COSA Net Price 
Extended Price 

6500 Power Load Comp Upgrade Kit 
List Price 
% Discount 
COSA Net Price 
Extended Price 

6506 Power Load Camp Upgrade Kit 
List Price 
% Discount 
CaSA Net Price 
Extended Price 

EMS Prevent 
List Price 
% Discount 
GaSA Net Price 
Extended Price 

Subtotal 

STRYKER PARTS 

Parts % of discount offered 
Product identjfication (Mfr.) 
Price schedule number 
Effective date of price schedule 

LABOR 

Labor rate per hour 

Pa ment Terms 

SC 
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity 

25 

25 

25 

25 

20 

15 

15 

50 

$1,236.00 
10% 

$1,112.40 
$5,562.00 

$4,087.00 
21% 

$3,228.7 
$80,718.25 

$981.0 
10% 

$882.9 
$22,072.5 

20% 
$2,121.8 

$42,436.0 

$25,918.0 
20'% 

$20,734.4 
$41,468.8 

$8,109.0 
10% 

$7,298.1 
$14,596.2 

$3,214.5 
20% 

$2,571.62 
$38,574.30 

$1,750.55 
20% 

$1.400.44 
$21,006.6 

$1,523.0 

$903,597,1 

Net 3 



Opened: 

For: 

6100005979 

Item 

1 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

June 26, 2015 

Annual Contract for Ungerboeck Maintenance & 
Support 

CC 

Description Qty 

Upon award to 9-30-2016 
CVB User License Maintenance 31 licenses 
Price Each 
Price Total 

iEBMS Web Services Maintenance for CVB 1 
Price Each 
Price Total 

EmpowerMINT Interface Maintenance for CVB 1 
Price Each 
Price Total 

Convention Center User License Maintenance 31 licenses 
Price Each 
Price Total 

Alamodome User License Maintenance 7 licenses 
Price Each 
Price Total 

DCCD User License Maintenance 3 licenses 
Price Each 
Price Total 

Payment Terms 

Estimated Annual Total 
Estimated Annual Award 

Sole Source 
Ungerboeck Software International, 
Inc. 
100 Ungerboeck Park 
O'Fallon, 
MO 63368 
800-400-4052 

$22,318.00 
$22,318.00 

$1,035.00 
$1,035.00 

$1,118.00 
$1.118.00 

$22.318.00 
$22.318.00 

$5.040.00 
$5.040.00 

$2.159.00 
$2.159.00 

Net 30 

$53,988.00 
$53,988.00 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Sole Source 
Opened: November 24, 2015 Cartegraph Systems, Inc. 

For: 
Annual Contract for Cartegraph Upgrades to include 3600 Digital Drive 
Maintenance and Support 

6100006892 WF Dubuque, 
IA 52003 
800-688-2656 

Item Description Qty 

Initial Year 1: 
1 Software Products - Year 1 10 

Carte9raph OMS - Advanced Edition 
Per-user Subscription License, On-Premise, includes 
Scenario Builder 
Term Upon award - 2123/2017 (14 months) 
Price Each $3,650.00 
Price Total $36,500.00 

2 Field Services - Year 1 1 
Implementation Services 
Fixed Fee Service 
Term Upon award - 2/23/2017 (14 months) 
Price Each $50,300.00 
Price Total $50,300.00 

3 Estimated Expenses - Year 1 1 
Price Each $10,400.00 
Price Total $10,400.00 

Initial Year 1 Total $97,200.00 

Annual Maintenance & Support Years 2 and 3: 
4 Software Products - Year 2 10 

Cartegraph OMS - Advanced Edition 
Per-user Subscription License, On-Premise, includes 
Scenario Builder 
Term 2/24/2017 - 2/23/2018 
Price Each $3,650.00 
Price Total $36,500.00 

5 Software Products - Year 3 10 
Cartegraph OMS - Advanced Edition 
Per-user Subscription License, On-Premise, includes 
Scenario Builder 
Term 2/24/2018 - 2/23/2019 
Price Each $3,650.00 
Price Total $36,500.00 

Annual Maintenance & Support Years 2 and 3 Total $73,000.00 

Estimated Total $170,200.00 
Estimated Award II $170200.00 


