City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 2, 2015
For: Purchase of Trailers
Local Local Local Local Non-Local
Holt Texas Ltd. d/b/a Holt Cat Cooper Equipment Co. Grande Truck Center Southwest Trailers Verde, Inc.
6100006842 DS 3302 S. WW White Rd. 17474 Judson Rd. 4562 |H-10 East 10302 IH-35 N. 2300 N. Scenic Hwy.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Lake Wales,
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty TX 78222 TX 78247 TX 78219 TX 78233 FL 33898
210-884-7026 210-657-5151 210-666-7112
1 Flat Bed Dovetail Trailer >22,500 GVW 2
Price Each: $18,213.00| No Bid No Bid $18,360.00 $19,995.00
Total Price: $36,426.00| $36,720.00 $39,990.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016, Interstate 40 DLA| 2016 Southwest Gooseneck! Big Tex Trailers 2016
PHD25862225A 4X PH-20 + 5
Equipment Warranty: 1 yr from date of deliver 12 Months 1 year
Warranty Service Provider Name: Holt Cat| Southwest Wheel Any Big Tex Trailer Dealer]|
Nationwide
San Antonio - Southwest Trailers
San Antonio - Big Tex Trailer (Hwy
35 North 210-657-5828) or (Hwy)|
35 South, Lytle, TX 830-
772-5020M
Warranty Facility Address: 3302 S. WW White Rd. 343 Gembler Road See Above
San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78219
Production Cut-Off-Date: 6 Week Build Time from order| 01/31/16 50 days A.R.O.
Last day can place orders without missing
production cut-off date: 01/31/16 December 31, 2015
Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price
after nroduction cut off date? Yes
Delivery: 52 days| 60 days
28 Cubic Yard Live Bottom Trailer with hydraulic
2 Tarp Cover 2
Price Each: No Bid $69,465.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total Price: $138,930.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2015 Etnyre Falcon Live Bottom
Trailer|
Equipment Warranty: 1yr.
Warranty Service Provider Name: Cooper Equipment Co.
Warranty Facility Address: 17474 Judson Rd.
San Antonio, TX|
Production Cut-Off-Date: 2/1/16
Last day can place orders without missing February 28, 2016
production cut-off date:
Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price Yes
after production cut off date?
Delivery: 160 Days
3 Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulati

on

Opened: December 2, 2015
For: Purchase of Trailers
Local Local Local Local Non-Local
Holt Texas Ltd. d/b/a Holt Cat Cooper Equipment Co. Grande Truck Center Southwest Trailers Verde, Inc.
6100006842 DS 3302 S. WW White Rd. 17474 Judson Rd. 4562 |H-10 East 10302 IH-35 N. 2300 N. Scenic Hwy.
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Lake Wales,
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty TX 78222 TX 78247 TX 78219 TX 78233 FL 33898
210-884-7026 210-657-5151 210-666-7112
Semi-Rear Ejector Brush Trailer with Hydraulic
4 Tarp Cover 5
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $73,200.00, No Bid No Bid
Total Price: $366,000.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 Warren WHDT 3939-2
Horizontal Eiection Trailer|
Engine Offered: N/A|
Equipment Warranty: 12 Months;
Warranty Service Provider Name: Reliance Truck and Equipment|
Warranty Facility Address: 7200 S. W.W. White Road,|
San Antonio, TX 78222
Production Cut-Off-Date: Apr-16
Last day can place orders without missing March 31, 2016
production cut-off date:
Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price
after production cut off date? No|
Delivery: 150 - 180 days
5 Deleted
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $36,426.00 $138,930.00 $366,000.00 $36,720.00 $39,990.00
Total Award: $36,426.00 $138,930.00 $366,000.00

Iltems 3 & 5 are deleted and will be re-bid at later date.
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