Opened:	December 4, 2015		Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Nueces Power Equipment	Holt Cat	Associated Supply Company	Equipment Depot	Anderson Machinery Company
			Equipment		Company		Company
6100006830		LD	4697 North FM1516	3302 S. W. W. White Rd.	4146 I-10 East	5250 N. Loop 1604 E.	9415 NE Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse,	San Antonio,	San Antonio,	San Antonio,	San Antonio,
			TX 78109 210-310-0066	TX 78222 210-213-3143	TX 78219 210-333-6137	TX 78247	TX 78219
			210 010 0000	210 210 0110	210 000 0101		
1	Wheeled Articulated Loader w/ Minimum 4 Cubic Yard Bucket:	3					
	Price Each:		\$165,355.00	\$223,601.00	\$194,000.00	No Bid	No Bio
	Total:		\$496,065.00				
				35.2% \$174,738.00			
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2015 Hyundai HL960	2016 Caterpillar 950M	2016 Case 821F		
					Wheel Loader		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):		Cummins QSB6.7 SAE 222 HP	Cat C7.1 ACERT, 230 HP	FTP, F4HFE613, 205HP Net		
	(module OAL Het Fill).		OAL ZZZ III	230111	203111 1461		
	Warranty:		3 year 3000 hours		3 year / 3000 hour full		
				hours	machine		
	Warranty Service Provider Name:		Hyundai Support	Holt Cat			
			Warranty		Company		
	Warranty Facility Address:		4697 FM1516 North,	3302 S. W. W. White	4146 I-10 East,		
			Converse, TX 78109		San Antonio, Texas		
	Delivery:		90 days	TX 78222 125 Days			
	Production Cut-off Date:		12/31/16	Unknown at this time	10/1/16		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:		12/31/16	Unknown at this time	8/15/15		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off		No	Unknown at this time	No		
	date:						
2	Tracked Milling Machine:	1					
	Price Each:		\$528,355.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bio
	Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:		\$528,355.00 2015, Wirtgen W200i				
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered		Cummins QSX15				
	(Include SAE net HP):		SAE 580 HP				
	Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name:		12 month 1000 hours Wirtgen				
	Warranty Facility Address:		4697 FM1516 North,				
			Converse, TX 78109				
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:		120 days 12/31/16				
	Last day order can be placed without		12/31/16				
	missing cut-off date:						
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No				

Opened:	December 4, 2015		Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Nueces Power Equipment	Holt Cat	Associated Supply Company	Equipment Depot	Anderson Machinery Company
6100006830		LD	4697 North FM1516	3302 S. W. W. White Rd.	4146 I-10 East	5250 N. Loop 1604 E.	9415 NE Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-6137	San Antonio, TX 78247	San Antonio, TX 78219
3	Wheeled Motor Graders: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	3	No Bid	\$190,000.00 \$570,000.00 2016 Caterpillar 120M2 Cat C7.1ACERT, variable hp, 161 HP in 3rd gear, up to 189 hn in 8th nean 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine Holt Cat 3302 S. W. W. White Rd., San Antonio, TX 78222 130 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time		No Bid	No Bid
4	6 Ton Double Drum Vibratory Roller: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off	3	\$112,395.00 \$337,185.00 2015 Hamm D70VV Deutz TCD 2.9 SAE 74.2 HP 3 years 3000 hours Wirtgen America 4697 FM1516 North, Converse, TX 78109 120 days 12/31/16	\$280,794.00 2016 Caterpillar CB44B Cat C3.4B, 100 HP 12 months/unlimited hours Holt Cat 3302 S. W. W. White Rd., San Antonio, TX 78222 140 Days Unknown at this time		No Bid	\$110,037.00 \$330,111.00 2016 Bomag BW141D-5 Kubota V3307 CR-T 73.2 HP 12 months or 1,000 hours, whichever comes first Anderson Machinery Texas 9415 NE Loop 410, San Antonio, Texas 78219 90-120 Days 12-31-2016

Opened:	December 4, 2015		Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Nueces Power	Holt Cat	Associated Supply	Equipment Depot	Anderson Machinery
	aronado di ridary Equipmoni		Equipment	rion dat	Company	Equipment Dopet	Company
6100006830		LD	4697 North FM1516	3302 S. W. W. White Rd.	4146 I-10 East	5250 N. Loop 1604 E.	9415 NE Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-310-0066	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-6137	San Antonio, TX 78247	San Antonio, TX 78219
5	Deleted:						
6	Loader Backhoe with 12" Bucket and Telescopic Boom: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered ((Include SAE net HP):	2	No Bid	\$78,773.00 \$157,546.00 15.7% \$21,346.00 2016 Caterpillal 416F2 Cat C4.4 ACERT, 87 Net HP	\$136,200.00 2015 Case 580N Backhoe FPT, F5BFL413C,		
	Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			12 months/unlimited hours, total machine Holt Cat 3302 S. W. W. White Rd., San Antonio, TX 78222 150 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	1 year / 1000 hour full machine Associated Supply 4146 I-10 East, San Antonio, Texas 78219 60 Days 10/1/16 8/15/15	1 year unlimited hours Equipment Depot 5250 N. Loop 1604 E., San Antonio, TX 78247 60 Days 12-2-16 10-2-16	
7	Loader Backhoe with 24" Bucket and 1K Hydraulic Breaker: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price differential: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):	1	No Bid	\$98,670.00 \$98,670.00 16.8% \$14,170.00 2016 Caterpillar 416F2 with Caterpillar H75E Hammer Cat C4.4 ACERT, 87 Net HP	\$84,500.00 2015 Case 580N Backhoe	\$85,480.00 \$85,480.00 2016 New Holland B95C FPT, F5HFL413C*A, 95 Net HP	
	Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			12 months/unlimited hours, total machine Holt Cat 3302 S. W. W. White Rd., San Antonio, TX 78222 150 Days Unknown at this time Unknown at this time Unknown at this time	Company 4146 I-10 East, San Antonio, Texas 78219 60 Days 10/1/16 8/15/15	Equipment Depot 5250 N. Loop 1604 E., San Antonio, TX 78247 60 Days	

Opened:	December 4, 2015		1				
F	Dominion of House Emilion and		Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Nueces Power	Holt Cat	Associated Supply	Equipment Depot	Anderson Machinery
			Equipment		Company		Company
6100006830		LD	4697 North FM1516	3302 S. W. W. White Rd.	4146 I-10 East	5250 N. Loop 1604 E.	9415 NE Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse,	San Antonio,	San Antonio,	San Antonio,	San Antonio,
			TX 78109	TX 78222	TX 78219	TX 78247	TX 78219
			210-310-0066	210-213-3143	210-333-6137		
_		_					
8	Dozer Crawler:	1		* • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •			
	Price Each:		No Bid	\$161,455.00			No Bid
	Total:			\$161,455.00 35.3%			
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:			35.3%			
	Price differential:			\$42,105.00			
	Year, Make & Model Offered:			2016 Caterpillar D6K2			
	rear, make a moder offered.			LGP			
				20.	5020.		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered			Cat C6.6 ACERT.	FPT, F4HFE413P,		
	(Include SAE net HP):			128 Net HP	, ,		
	(moldde GAL Het Fill).			120 (4611)	112111 (04 KW)		
	Warranty:			12 months/unlimited	3 year / 3000 hour full		
	·			hours	machine		
	Warranty Service Provider Name:			Holt Cat	Associated Supply		
					Company		
	Warranty Facility Address:			3302 S. W. W. White			
				Rd., San Antonio,			
				TX 78222			
	Delivery:			140 Days			
	Production Cut-off Date:			Unknown at this time			
	Last day order can be placed without			Unknown at this time	8/15/15		
	missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off			Unknown at this time	No		
	date:			Onknown at this time	INO		
	Payment Terms:		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
	Total:		\$1,361,605.00	\$1,939,268.00	\$922.050.00	\$242,614.00	\$330.111.00
	Total Award:		\$1,024,420.00				

Item 5 was deleted and will be bid at a later time.

Opened:	December 4, 2015		Local	Local	Non-Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Cooper Equipment Co.	H & V Equipment Services, Inc.	RDO Equipment Co.	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.
6100006830		LD	17474 Judson RD.	3307 SE Loop 410	19275 N. IH 35	3740 S. E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	San Antonio, TX 78247	San Antonio TX 78222	New Braunfels, TX 78132	San Antonio, TX 78222
1	Wheeled Articulated Loader w/ Minimum 4 Cubic Yard Bucket:	3				
	Price Each: Total:		No Bio	\$207,956.00 \$623,868.00 25.8% \$127,803.00	\$624,151.80	
	Year, Make & Model Offered:			2016, Doosan, DL300 5 Wheel Loader 41,484lbs., Includes Ride Control	2016 John Deere 644K	2016 Komatsu
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):			Scania DC09 271HP per SAE J1995		
	Warranty:			1 year Parts & Service, Additional 2 years Parts & Service Powertrain & Major Hydraulics 3 total.	hours	,
	Warranty Service Provider Name:			Doosan MFG, H & V Equipment Services Inc.		. Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.
	Warranty Facility Address:			3307 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222	19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132	
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off			90-120 Days March 7, 2016 March 7, 2016 No	November 1, 2016 September 15, 2016	3-31-2016 3-31-2016
2	date: Tracked Milling Machine:	1				
2	Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address:	'	No Bio	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:					

Opened:	December 4, 2015		l			
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Local Cooper Equipment Co.	H & V Equipment Services, Inc.	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co.	Local Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.
6100006830		LD	17474 Judson RD.	3307 SE Loop 410	19275 N. IH 35	3740 S. E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	San Antonio, TX 78247	San Antonio TX 78222	New Braunfels, TX 78132	San Antonio, TX 78222
3	Wheeled Motor Graders: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):	3	No Bid	No Bid	\$591,017.07 2016 John Deere 670G John Deere Power Tech PSS 9.0L, 220	No B
	Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address:				HP 1 year, unlimited hours RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132	
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				45 Days November 1, 2016 September 15, 2016 Not Provided	
4	6 Ton Double Drum Vibratory Roller: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:	3	\$100,306.00 \$300,918.00 2016 Dynapac CC2200 Comfcab Deutz TCD 3.6 IIIB/T4i 1 yr.		No Bid	No Bi
	Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address:		Cooper Equipment Co., San Antonio, TX 78247 17474 Judson RD. San Antonio, TX 78247			
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		90 Days Oct. '16 June, '16 Yes			

Opened:	December 4, 2015		1			
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Local Cooper Equipment	Local H & V Equipment	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co.	Local Waukesha-Pearce
			Co.	Services, Inc.		Industries, Inc.
6100006830		LD	17474 Judson RD.	3307 SE Loop 410	19275 N. IH 35	3740 S. E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	San Antonio, TX 78247	San Antonio TX 78222	New Braunfels, TX 78132	San Antonio, TX 78222
5	Deleted:					
6	Loader Backhoe with 12" Bucket and Telescopic Boom: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price differential: Year, Make & Model Offered:	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$80,637.43 \$161,274.86 2016 John Deere 310SL	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:				John Deere Power Tech Plus 4045HT082 Turbocharged 99 HP 1 year, unlimited hours	
	Warranty Service Provider Name: Warranty Facility Address:				RDO Equipment Co. 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132	
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				45 Days November 1, 2016 September 15, 2016 No	
7	Loader Backhoe with 24" Bucket and 1K Hydraulic Breaker: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: Price differential:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$92,079.54 \$92,079.54	
	Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):				2016 John Deere 310SL John Deere Power Tech Plus 4045HT082 Turbocharged 99 HP	
	Warranty:				1 year, unlimited	
	Warranty Service Provider Name:				hours RDO Equipment Co.	
	Warranty Facility Address:				19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132	
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				45 Days November 1, 2016 September 15, 2016 No	

Opened:	December 4, 2015		1			
F	Position of Heavy Favings and		Local	Local	Non-Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Heavy Equipment		Cooper Equipment Co.	H & V Equipment Services, Inc.	RDO Equipment Co.	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.
			C0.	Services, inc.		industries, inc.
6100006830		LD	17474 Judson RD.	3307 SE Loop 410	19275 N. IH 35	3740 S. E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	San Antonio,	San Antonio	New Braunfels,	San Antonio,
	·		TX 78247	TX 78222	TX 78132	TX 78222
8	Dozer Crawler:	1				
	Price Each:		No Bid	No Bid	\$140,717.58	No Bio
	Total:				\$140,717.58	
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:					
	Price differential:					
	Year, Make & Model Offered:				2016 John Deere 650K	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered				John Deere Power	
	(Include SAE net HP):				Tech PWS 4045 104	
	Warranty:				1 year, unlimited	
	wanting.				hours	
	Warranty Service Provider Name:				RDO Equipment Co.	
	Warranty Facility Address:				19275 N. IH 35, New	
	Warranty Facility Addresss.				Braunfels, TX 78132	
	Delivery:				45 Days	
	Production Cut-off Date:				November 1, 2016	
	Last day order can be placed without				September 15, 2016	
	missing cut-off date:					
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off				No	
	date:					
	Payment Terms:		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
	Total:		\$300,918.00	\$623,868.00	\$1,609,240.85	\$626,220.00
	Total Award:					

Item 5 was deleted and will be bid at a later time.