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aNorpINANCE 2016-02-11-0065

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM H & V EQUIPMENT SERVICES, INC,,

* EWALD KUBOTA TRACTOR AND AG-PRO TO PROVIDE 11
REPLACEMENT AND 11 ADDITIONAL PIECES OF LANDSCAPING
EQUIPMENT TO THE CITY’S TRANSPORTATION & CAPITAL
IMPROVEMENTS, PARKS & RECREATION AND AVIATION
DEPARTMENTS FOR A TOTAL COST OF $673,717.52, FUNDED
FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND,
TRANSPORTATION AND CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS STORM
WATER OPERATIONS FUND AND AIRPORT OPERATIONS AND
MAINTENANCE FUND.

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with landscaping
equipment for the Transportation & Capital Improvements, Parks & Recreation and Aviation
Departments; and

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by H & V Equipment Services, Inc., for item 5 failed to meet the
City’s specifications and/or requirements; and

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Ewald Kubota Tractor for items 2, 4, and 5 failed to meet the
City’s specifications and/or requirements; and

'WHEREAS, H & V Equipment Services, Inc., was the lowest responsive bidder for items 1 and
2 for a total cost of $41,132.48; and

WHEREAS, Ewald Kubota Tractor was the lowest responsive bidder for item 6 for a cost of
$27,751.00; and

WHEREAS, Ag-Pro was the lowest responsive bidder for items 4 and 5 for a total cost of
$604,834.04; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The lowest, responsive bids described above from H & V Equipment Services,
Inc., Ewald Kubota Tractor, and Ag-Pro to provide the City of San Antonio’s Transportation &
Capital Improvements, Parks & Recreation and Aviation Departments with 22 pieces of
landscaping equipment for a total cost of $673,717.52 is hereby accepted, subject to and
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates
and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the
Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.
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SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bid from H & V Equipment Services, Inc.,
for item 5 failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the bids from Ewald Kubota Tractor for items
2,4, and 5 failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 4. Funding in the amount of $191,967.82 for this ordinance is available in Fund
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5501055 as part of the Fiscal Year 2016
Budget.

SECTION 5. Funding in the amount of $453,998.70 for this ordinance is available in Fund
29007000, Cost Center 2304020001 and General Ledger 5501050 as part of the Fiscal Year 2016
Budget.

SECTION 6. Funding in the amount of $27,751.00 for this ordinance is available in Fund
51001000, Cost Center 3305040008 and General Ledger 5501050 as part of the Fiscal Year 2016
Budget. .

SECTION 7. Payment not to exceed $41,132.48 is authorized to H & V Equipment Services,
Inc., and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 8. Payment not to exceed $27,751.00 is authorized to Ewald Kubota Tractor and
should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 9. Payment not to exceed $604,834.04 is authorized to Ag-Pro and should be
encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 10. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 11. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 11% day of February, 2016. ? i

M A O R
Ivy R. Taylor

ArfE.BT- f APPROVED AS TO FORM:
wua‘ : ‘a ; Mo d T
@@1 M. Vﬁk;Citwlerk 6Martha G. Sepeda, Acti’n@Cuy Attorney




Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item: 7 (in consent vote: 4,5, 6, 7, 8, 9A, 9B, 10A, 10B, 11, 12, 13A, 13B, 14A, 14B, 14C, 15,17, 18, 19,
20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 31, 32)
Date: 02/11/2016
Time: 09:19:59 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from H & V Equipment Services, Inc., Ewald Kubota Tractor and Ag-
Pro to provide 11 replacement and 11 additional pieces of landscaping equipment to the City's
Transportation & Capital Improvements, Parks & Recreation and Aviation Departments for a total cost
of $673,717.52, funded from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund, Transportation and
Capital Improvements Stormwater Operations Fund and Airport Operations and Maintenance Fund.
[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance]
Result: Passed
Not . .
Voter Group Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Present
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X
Alan Warrick District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X X
Cris Medina District 7 x X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X
http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx 2/11/2016
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City of San Antonlo Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 30, 2015
For. Landscaping Equipment Local Non '
H & V Equipment Services, Inc. Ewald Kubota Tractor Ag-Pro Hoit Texas Ltd. dba Holt Cat
6100006833 08 |3307 SE. Loop 410 1900 W. 1H-10 3030 N. Austin 3302 S. WW White Rd,
San Antonio, Seguin, Sequin, San Antonio,
ITEM DESCRIPTION Qty [TX 78222 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78220
210-848-5885. pwmm 830-372:5477.
1 Ground Mower Atachments 8
Price Each: $4.541.72 No Bid $4,550.00 No Bid
Total Price: $36,333.76 $36,400.00|
Year, Make & Model Offered: New, 2016, Modern AG Prodeuts] 2018 Modern 7' Super Predator|
LTD. 7" Predator WH Front Chain|
Equipment Warranty: 5 year imited warranty on gear] 1 year/5 year on Gearbox/10 year
box/10 year imited on Deck Rus rust through deck]
. Thi
‘Warranty Service Provider Name: Modern AG Products LTD & HaV| Ag-Pro|
‘Warranty Facility Address: H & V Equipment Services, Inc, 3030 N. Austin
3307 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, Sequin, TX 78155
Tavan 7RY))
Production Cut-Off-Date; 312016 12124118
Last day can place orders without missing
production cut-off date: 312018
Delivery: 50 days of Iessl 180 days|
NAS
2 84" Mower Deck 1
Price Each: $4,798.72 $3,589.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Price: $4.798.72 $3,589.00
Percentage betwesn lowest responsive bid and
focal bid: 33.7%
Price Differential: $1,208.72
Year, Make & Model Offered: New, 2016, Modem AG products! 2015 Landpride RCR 1884
LTD, 7 Predator WiH Front & Reay|
hain|
Ecquipment Warranty: 5 year Himited wartanty on gear bow/| 24 Months or 2,000 hrs|
10 year limited on deck rust theu
Wairanty Service Provider Name: Modern AG Products LTD, & H&V]| Eweld Kubota Tractor,
Equipment, Inc|
Warranty Facifity Address: H & V Equipment Services inc. 1800 W. 1-10
3307 S.E. Loop 410, Sequin, TX 78155|
San Antonlo, TX 78222
Production Cut-Off-Date: 3172016 None Planned|
Last day can place orders without missing
oroduction cut-off date: 31172018} 1213172015
Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price
after production cut off date? No
Delivery: 80 days or Iml 60 days|
3 Deleted
NAS
4 4X4 Utifity Tractors 7
Price Each: No Bid! $51,351.00] $75.417.67 $78.500,00
Total Price: $358,457.00 $527.923.69] $549,500.00|
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and
local bid: 4.09%
Price Differential: $21.678.31
‘Year, Make & Model Offered: 2015/2016 Kubota Model M5-111 2016 Jothee{e 61100 2016 Challenger MT455D)
HDC1)
Engine Offered: Kubota Diesel V 3800] 4.5L John Deere Power Tech PSS] AGCO Power 49AWI 4,01
Equipment Warranty: 2 Yif 2,000 Hours whichever| 2 years or 2000 Hours] 2 year, 2000 hour Total Machine|
oeours first
Warranty Service Provider Nama: Ewald Kubota Tractor| Ag-Pro - Seguin AGCO Corp via Holt Cat
3030 N. Austin, Seguin, TX 78155]
\Warranty Facility Address: 1800 1-10 Ag-Pro - Seguin 3302 8, WW White Rd.|
W. Seguin, TX 78155] 3030 N. Austin, Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 782221
Production Cut-Off-Date: None Planned 1212412018 1213172015
Last day can place orders without missing
production cut-off date; 1273172015 1212412018 12/3112018]
Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price
after production cut off data? Yes| Yes) Na|
Delivary: 60 days| 180 days| 140 days|
Prepared by COSA 1/12/2016
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City of San Antonic Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 30, 2015
d dscal ipment -
For Lendacaping Equipme Local Non-Local Non-tocal Local
H & V Equipment Services, inc. Ewald Kubota Tractor Ag-Pra Holt Texas Ltd. dba Holt Cat
16100006833 DS, 13307 S.E Loop 410 1800 W. tH-10 3030 N, Austin 3302 S. WW White Rd.
San Antonio, Seguin, Secuin, San Antonio,
1TEM DESCRIPTION Qty jTX78222 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78220
2 830.379.5477
NAS NAS
5 15' Batwing Mower Deck 5
Price Each; $16,728.27, $11.867.00 $15,382.07| $18,500.00
Totat Price: $78.641.35 $50,835.004 $76.910,35) $92,500.00
Percentage between lowsst responsive bid and
tocal bid: 20.27%
Price Differential: $15,589.65
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016, Modern AG Products LTD,, 2015/2016 Landpride RC 4015 2015 John Deers HX15] 2015, Woods MFG BW180XHD
15' Raptor]
Equipment Warranty: 1yt 1 year/5 year on Gear Box} 1 year fimited comprehensive]
5 years limited varranty on gear| warranty + 6 year fimited gear box
boxes, 10 year imited on Deck Rust warranty + 10 year deck rust]
Thiy] through warranty
Warranty Service Provider Name: Madern AG Products LTD & H
&V Equipment Services Inc.
{as servicing dealer) Evrald Kubiota Tractor| Ag-Pro - Seguin Woods Mig, via Holt Cat
Warranty Facility Address: H 8 V Equipment services, Inc.
3307, S.E. Loop 410, 1900 -10 W.| 3030 N, Austin Beguin. 3302 5, WW White Rd.
San Antonlo, TX 78222 Sequin, Texas 78155 TX78155] San Antonio, TX 78222,
Production Cut-Off-Date: 312016/ Norte Planned] 1212412018 January 1st, 2016
Last day can place orders without missing .
production cut-off date: 3172018 1243172015 1272412018 Decembier 31st, 2015}
Can Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price
after production cut off date? Noj Yes| Yes| No
Delivery: ©0 days or less| 60 days| 180 daysf £0 days)|
8 Mulcher Attachment for Skid Steer 1
Price Each; No Bid| $27.751.00 No Bid No Bid
Tatal Price: $27,751.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2015 Bradco MMS0S
Equipment Warranty. 1 yeay|
Warranty Service Provider Name: Eweld Kubota Tractor]
Warranty Facility Address: 1800 10 W.|
Sequin, TX 78155
Production Cut-Off-Date: None Planned|
L.ast day can place orders without missing
production cut-off date; 1213172015)
Car Bidder provide bid items, at the bid price
after production cut off date? Yes)
Delivery: 0 days|
7 Deleted.
Paymant Terms: Net 30! Net 30! Net 301 Net 30
Total; $119,773.83 $450,632.00! 3841 234.04[ $6842, 0004001
| Total Award: $41,132.48 $27,751.00' $604,834.04;

ltems 3 and 7 are deleted and will be rebid at a later date.

Prepared by COSA 111212016
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