
LC 
2/18/16 
Item No. 9 

AN ORDINANCE 2 0 1 6 - 0 2 - 1 8 - 0 0 9 8 

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM GRANDE TRUCK CENTER, 
DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, LLC AND SANTEX 
TRUCK CENTER, LTD TO PROVIDE 19 REPLACEMENT MEDIUM 
AND HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS TO THE CITY'S SOLID WASTE 
MANAGEMENT, TRANSPORTATION & CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS, 
AVIATION, AND PARKS & RECREATION DEPARTMENTS FOR A 
TOTAL COST OF $2,090,386.24, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT 
RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND AND AIRPORT 
OPERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio Solid Waste Management, 
Transportation and Capital Improvements, Aviation, and Parks and Recreation Departments with 
19 replacement medium and heavy duty trucks to support the transport of earth and materials for 
various operations across the City; and 

WHEREAS, the low bids submitted by Silsbee Ford for items 2, 3, and 9 and the low bid 
submitted by Santex Truck Center, LTD for item 7 failed to meet the City's specifications and/or 
requirements; and 

WHEREAS, Grande Truck Center was the lowest responsive bidder for items 2, 3, 7 and 9 for a 
total cost of$743,118.00; and 

WHEREAS, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC was the lowest responsive bidder for 
items 5,8, and 10 for a total cost of $1,246,996.00; and 

WHEREAS, Santex Truck Center, LTD was the lowest responsive bidder for item 6 for a cost 
of $100,272.24; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The lowest responsive bids described above submitted by Grande Truck Center, 
Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC and Santex Truck Center, LTD to provide the City of 
San Antonio Solid Waste Management, Transportation and Capital Improvements, Aviation, and 
Parks and Recreation Departments with medium and heavy duty trucks for a total cost of 
$2,090,386.24 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required 
bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets 
are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are 
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 



LC 
2/18/16 
Item No. 9 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bids from Silsbee Ford for items 2,3, 
and 9 and the low bid submitted by Santex Truck Center, LTD for item 7 failed to meet the 
City's specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. Funding in the amount of $2,016,079.24 for this ordinance is available in Fund 
72001000, Cost Center 350320001 and General Ledger 5501055 as part of the Fiscal Year 2016 
Budget. 

SECTION 4. Funding in the amount of $74,307.00 for this ordinance is available in Fund 
51001000, Cost Center 3305040008 and General Ledger 5501050 as part ofthe Fiscal Year 2016 
Budget. 

SECTION 5. Payment not to exceed $743,118.00 is authorized to Grande Truck Center and 
should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 6. Payment not to exceed $1,246,996.00 is authorized to Doggett Freightliner of 
South Texas, LLC and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 7. Payment not to exceed $100,272.24 is authorized to Santex Truck Center, LTD 
and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 8. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP 
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 9. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 18th day of February, 2016. 

Ivy R. Taylor 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

'ty Attorney 

2 



Agenda Item: 9 ( in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19,20,21,22,23,24,26,27,28, 30A, 
30e, 30D, 30E, 30F ) 

Date: 02/18/2016 

Time: 10:40:05 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Grande Truck Center, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas and 
Santex Truck Center, LTD to provide 19 replacement medium and heavy duty trucks to the City's Solid 
Waste Management, Transportation & Capital Improvements, Aviation, and Parks & Recreation 
Departments for a total cost of $2,090,386.24, funded from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement 
Fund and Airport Operations and Maintenance Fund. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy 
Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ivy R. Taylor Mayor x 

Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 x x 

Alan Warrick District 2 x x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldafia District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x 



a 
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 
December 7, 2015 Local Local 

Bid 1 Local Local Bid 2 Local Non·Local 
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett FreighUiner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Center Rush Truck Center SUsbee Ford 

South Texas, LLC 

6100006820 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH 10 East 8810 IH ·10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, SHsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX 78219 TX78109 TX78219 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 77656 

210-666·7112 210·277-4373 210·661-8371 

1 Deleted: 

2 19,501 ·26,000 GVWR 15' Brush Dump 
Body and Tarp: 1 NAS 
Price Each: $75,971.00 $88,902.00 $83,421.98 No Bid No Bid $71,904.00 
Total: $75,971.00 $88,902.00 $83,421.98 $71,904.00 

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2016 Ford F750 2017 Freighlliner M2·106 2017 International 4300 2016 Ford F650 Reg. Cab 
Offered: 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 270 HP Ford 6.7L Diesel Cummins ISB 6.7L, 260 Cummins ISB 260 HP 6.7L Diesel V8 Ford 
(Include SAE Net HP): 675 Ib ft Torque Hp· 660 Ibtft Torque Power Stroke(270 HP) 
Transmission Offered: Ford Torque Shift 6 Allison 3000 RDS Allison 3000 RDS 6 Spd Auto 

Speed Automatic w PTO 
Provision 

Cab and Chassis Warranty: 24 Months 2 Years Unlimited MUes 1 Year 36m/36,000 Bumper to 
Bumper· 5 yrs/250,000 

mUe oowertrain 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner 0 Santex Truck Center Red McCombs Ford, 
Name: South Texas, LLC 8333 IH·10 San Antonio, 

TX 78230 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 1380 Ackerman Rd., Red McCombs Ford, 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78216 Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 8333 IH·10 San Antonio, 

TX78230 

Year, Make & Model Dump Bed Offered: 2016 H150·P35 15' davis 2016 Warren ·15 BD· 2017 Warren Davis Truck & TraHer 
Brush Body With Tarp 

Dump Bed Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year· Unlimited MUes 1 Year 1 year Parts, Labor & 
Transportation 

Dump Bed Warranty Service Provider Name: Reliance Truck and San Antonio Brake & Wabash Davis Truck & TraUer, 
Equipment Clutch P.O. Box 4129, Little Rock 

Dump Bed Warranty Service Provider FacUity 7200 S. W.W. White 905 Avenue B, San 1605 Ackerman Rd., Davis Truck & Trailer, 
Address: Road, TX 78222 Antonio TX, 78215 San Antonio, TX 78219 P.O. Box 4129, Little 

Rock, AR 72214 

Delivery: 150·180 days 150·210 Days 180 Days 120·150 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31, 2016 10/30/2016 7·2016 2·28·16 
Last day order can be placed without missing March 31, 2016 9/30/2016 1·1·2016 2·28·16 
cut·off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut·off No Yes 3 months after P.O. date Not Provided 
date: 

Prepared by Purchasing 21112016 Pagel 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 
December 7, 2015 Local Local 

Bid 1 Local Local Bid 2 Local Non·Local 
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett FreighUiner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Center Rush Truck Center SMsbee Ford 

South Texas, LLC 

6100006820 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 45621H 10 East 8810 IH· 10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Silsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX78219 TX78109 TX78219 TX78219 TX 78219 TX 77656 

210-666·7112 210·277-4373 210·661-8371 

3 35,000 Minimum GVWR 7 Cubic Yard Dump 
Truck: 3 NAS 
Price Each: $79,634.00 $83,083.00 $91,696.23 No Bid $83,895.00 $75,479.00 
Total: $238,902.oo $249,249.00 $275,088.69 $251,685.00 $226,437.00 

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Offered: 2016 Ford F750 2017 Frelghdiner M2·106 2017 International 4300 2017 Hlno 338 2016 Ford F750 Reg. Cab 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.7L 270 HP Diesel Cummins ISB 6.7L, 250 Cummins ISB 250 HP Hlno J08E-VB, 260 HP 6.7L Ford Power Stroke 
(Include SAE Net HP): 6751b ftTorque HP • 660 Iblft Torque V8 Diesel (270 HP) 
Transmission Offered: Ford Torque Shift 6 Allison 3000 RDS Allison 3000 RDS Allison 3000 RDS 36m136,ooo Bumper to 

Speed Automatic w PTO Bumper· 5 yrs/loo,ooO 
Provis~n mls. 6 Sod Auto 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 24 Months 2 Years· Unlimited Miles 1 year 5 years or 250K miles (7 36m136,ooo Bumper to 
years 150K miles For Bumper· 5 yrs/250,ooO 

$295.00) mile powertraln 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Santex Truck Center Rush Truck Center Red McCombs Ford, 
Name: South Texas, LLC 8333 IH·l0 San Antonio, 

TX78230 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 1380 Ackerman Rd., 8922 IH • 10 East, Red McCombs Fond, 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 7821g Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78219 8333 IH·l0 San Antonio, 

TX78230 

Dump Bed Warranty: 2016 Davis TA· 7·10 1 Year· Unlimited Miles 1 Year 1 Year 1 year Parts, Labor & 
Transportation 

Dump Bed Warranty Service Provider Name: Reliance Truck and San Antonio Brake & Wabash 2016 Herrera Fabricating Davis Truck & Trailer, 
Equipment Clutch Inc. P.O. Box 4129, lillie Rock 

Service Body Warranty Service Provider 7200 S. W.w. White 905 Avenue B, San 1605 Ackerman Rd., 7118 John Ralston, Davis Truck & Trailer, 
Facility Address: Road, TX 78222 Antonio TX, 78215 San Antonio, TX 78219 Houston TX 77044 P.O. Box 4129, Little 

Rock. AR 72214 

Delivery 150·180 days 150·210 Days 180 Days 150 Days 120·150 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31, 2016 10/3012016 7·1·2016 Not Provided 2·28·16 
Last day order can be placed without missing March 31, 2016 9/3012016 1·1·2016 Not Provided 2·28·16 
cut·off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut·off No Yes 3 months after P.O. Not Provided Not Provided 
date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 
December 7, 2015 Local Local 

Bid 1 Local Local Bid 2 Local Non·Local 
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Frelghtllner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Center Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford 

South Texas, LLC 

6100006820 LD 45621H 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH 10 East 8810 IH· 10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Silsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX 78219 TX78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX77656 

210·666·7112 210·277-4373 210·661-8371 

4 Deleted 

5 >50,000 GVWR Fifth Wheel Tractors: 8 
Price Each: $113,350.00 $102,162.00 $103,063.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $906,800.00 $817,296.00 $824,506.16 

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2017 Volvo VHD64FT200 2017 Frelghtliner 114SD 2017lntemationaI7600 
Offered: 
SpecifIC Make & Model of Engine Offered Volvo D·13 475 HP 1650 Detroit DD13 470 HP @ International N13, 475 HP 
(Include SAE Net HP): Ib ft Torque 1650 Iblft Torque 
Transmission Offered: Eaton Fuller FRO 16210C Eaton Fuller FRO 16210C Fuller 10 Speed 

Cab and Chassis Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year Unlimited Miles 1 Year 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggel1 FrelghUiner 0 Santex Truck Center 
Name: South Texas, LLC 

1380 Ackerman Rd., Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 
Facility Address: AntoniO, TX 78219 Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 

Delivery 150·180 Days 120-180 Days 180 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31, 2016 10/30/2016 7·1·2016 
Last day order can be placed without missing March 31,2016 9/30/2016 1·1·2016 
cut·off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No Not Provided 3 months after P.O. 
date: 

Prepared by Purchasing 21112016 Page 3 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 
December 7,2015 Local Local 

Bid 1 Local Local Bid 2 Local Non·Local 
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Frelghtliner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Center Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford 

South Texas, LLC 

6100006820 LD' 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH 10 East 8810 IH· 10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Silsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX 78219 TX78109 TX 78219 TX78219 TX 78219 TX77656 

210-666-7112 210-2774373 210-661-8371 

6 >50,000 GVWR Dump Truck: 1 
Price Each: $106,955.00 $100,556.00 $100,272.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $106,955.00 $100,556.00 $100,272.24 

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2016 Western Star 4700 2017 Freightliner M2 106 2017 International 7500 
Offered: 
SpecifIC Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins ISL 350 HP • Cummins ISL 9 - 350 HP • Navistar N 1 0 350 
(Include SAE Net HP): 1000 - ftIIb Torque 1000 - ftIIt 
Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS with Allison 3000 RDS Allison 3000 RDS 

PTO Provision 
Cab and Chassis Warranty: 12 Months 2 Years· UnlimHed Mile 1 year 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightllner 0 Santex Truck Center 
Name: South Texas, LLC 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 1380 Ackerman Rd., 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78219 Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 7821~ 

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered: 2016 Davis FMT 11-14 2016 Warren 14' Frame 2017 Warren 
Type 

Dump Body Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year - Unlimited Mile 1 Yeat 
Dump Body Warranty Service Provider Reliance Truck and San Antonio Brake & Wabash 
Name: Equipment Clutct 
Dump Body Warranty Service Provider 905 Avenue B, San 1605 Ackerman Rd., 
Facility Address: Antonio TX, 78215 San Antonio, TX 78216 

Delivery 150-180 days 150-210 Days 180 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31,2016 1013012016 7-1-2016 
Last day order can be placed without missing March 31,2016 913012016 1-1-2016 
cut·off date: 
Can bidder provide bid Items after cut·off No Yes 30 days after P.O. 
date: 

Prepared by Purchasing 21112016 Page 4 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: December 7, 2015 Local Local 
Bid 1 Local Local Bid 2 Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Frelghtliner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Center Rush Truck Center SUsbee Ford 
South Texas, LLC 

6100006820 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Silsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX 78219 TX78109 TX 78219 TX78219 TX 78219 TXn656 

210-666-7112 210-2n-4373 210-661-8371 

7 >33,000 GVW UtRity BedlLube Body Trucks: 2 NAS 
Price Each: $176,969.00 $192,306.00 $171,978.52 $215,149.00 No Bid No Bid 
Total: $353,938.00 $384,612.00 $343,957.04 $430,298.00 

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2017 Western Star 4700 2017 Frelghtllner M2-106 2017 International 7400 2017 Western Star 4700 
Offered: 
SpecifIC Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins ISL 330 HP Cummins ISL 9 - 330 HP - Navlstar N9 330 HP Cummins ISL 330 HP 
(Include SAE Net HP): 1000 ftIIb Torque 1000 - ftIIb 1000 ftIIb Torque 
Transmission Offered: Allison 3500 RDS witt Allison 3500 RDS Allison 3500 RDS Allison 3500 RDS with 

PTO Provisior PTO Provision 
Cab and Chassis Warranty: 12 Months 2 Years - Unlimited MUes 1 Year 12 Months 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightllner 0 Santex Truck Center, Grande Truck Center 
Name: South Texas, LLC 1380 Ackerman Rd., San 

Antonio, TX 78219 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 1380 Ackerman Rd., 45621H 10 East, San 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78219 Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 Antonio, TX 78219 

Year, Make & Model Bed/Lubrication Body 2016 CTE Single AxlE 2016 Knaphelde -13.6 2017 2016 IMT Sitestar Lube 
Offered: Hydraulic Operated Lube Lube Platform Body Package 

Bed 
Bed/Lubrication Body Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year Unlimited Miles 1 Year 12 Months 
Bed/Lubrication Body Warranty Service Reliance Truck anc San Antonio Brake & CTB - Caseco Truck Body Cobalt Truck Equipment 
Provider Name: Equipment Clutch 
Bed/Lubrication Body Warranty Service 7200 S. W.W. White 905 Avenue B, San 1380 Ackerman Rd., 112181H-10 East, 
Provider Facility Address: Road, TX 78222 Antonio TX, 78215 San Antonio, TX 78219 for Converse, TX 78109 

routine war .. 19105 s. 
Hwy 66, Claremore, OK 

74017 for major warranty 

Delivery 180-210 days 180-240 Days 180 Days 210-250 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31,2016 10/30/2016 1-1-2016 March 31, 2016 
Last day order can be placed without miSSing March 31, 2016 9/30/2016 1-1-2016 March 31, 2016 
cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid Items after cut-off No Yes 30 days after P.O. No 
date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 
December 7, 2015 Local Local 

Bid 1 Local Local Bld2 Local Non·Local 
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Cenler Doggett Fre/ghUiner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Cenler Rush Truck Center SUsbee Ford 

South Texas, LLC 

6100006820 LD 45621H 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH 10 East 8810 IH· 10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Anlonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, SUsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX 78219 TX 78109 TX78219 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX77656 

210·666·7112 210-277-4373 210-661-8371 

8 >33,000 GVWR Grappler Truck (Turnkey 
Unit): 1 
Price Each: $179,850.00 $176,760.00 $200,077.00 
Total: $179,850.00 $176,760.00 $200,077.00 

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2017 Western Star 4700 2017 Fre/ghtllner M2·106 2017 Western Star 4700 
Offered: 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins ISL 330 HP Cummins ISL 9 • 330 HP • Cummins ISL 330 HP 
(Include SAE Net HPJ: 1000 fIIIb Torque 1,000·flllb 1000 fIIIb Torque 
Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS with Allison 3000 RDS Allison 3000 RDS with 

PTO Provision PTO Provision 
Cab and Chassis Warranly: 12 Months 2 Years· Unlimited MHElll 12 Monlhs 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggett Fre/ghWner 0 Grande Truck Center 
Name: South Texas, LLC 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 4562 IH 10 East, San 
FacUlty Address: Antonio, TX 78219 Converse, TX 78109 Antonio, TX 78219 

Year, Make & Model of Grappler/Hydraulic 2016 Rotobec Elate, 910 2016 Rotobec Elate, 910 2016 Epsoion M13A80 
Loader Body Offered: w/ GH Body/Trash Bucket Loader WithGH Body & 

Rotobec Model 045M Rotobec Model 045W 
Bucket 

Grappler/Hydraulic Loader Body Warranty: 12 Months· 2,000 Hours 12 Months· 2,000 Hours 12 Months 

Grappler/Hydraullc Loader Body Warranty Reliance Truck anc Fox's Truck World Heil ofTexas 
Service Provider Name: Equipmen 
Grappler/Hydraulic Loader Body Warranty 7200 S. W.W. White 1231 FM 1516, 503 Pop Gunn, 
Facility Address: Road, TX 7822. San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78219 

Delivery 210·250 Days 210·270 Days 180·250 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31,2016 10/30/2016 March 31, 2016 
Last day order can be placed without missing March 31,2016 9/3012016 March 31,2016 
cut·off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut·off Nc Yes No 
date: 

Prepared by Pur<:haslng 211/2016 Page 6 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 
December 7,2015 Local Local 

Bid 1 Local Local Bid2 Local Non-Local 
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett FrelghUiner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Center Rush Truck Center SUsbee Ford 

South Texas, LLC 
6100006820 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, SUsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX 78219 TX78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX78219 TX77656 

210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-661-8371 

9 26,000 Minimum GVWR 5 Cubic Yard Dump 
Truck: 1 NAS 
Price Each: $74,307.00 $84,500.00 $76,470.69 No Bid No Bid $67,936.00 
Total: $74,307.00 $84,500.00 $76,470.69 $67,936.00 

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2016 Ford F750 2017 FrelghUlner M2 106 2017 International 4300 2016 Ford F650 Reg. Cab 
Offered: 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.7 L Diesel 270 Cummins ISB 6.7,220 HP Cummins ISB, 220 HP Ford 6.7L Diesel v8 
(include SAE Net HP): H.P. 675 lb. ft. Torque 1520lblft Power Stroke (270 HP) 
Transmission Offered: Ford Torque Shift e Allison 2500 RDS Allison 2500 RDS e Spd Auto 

Speed wUh PTO Provision 

Cab and Chassis Warranty: 24 Months 2 Years - Unlimited MHes 1 year 36m136,000 Bumper to 
Bumper - 5 yrs/250,000 

mOe oowertrain 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggett FrelghUiner 0 Santex Truck Center Red McCombs Ford, 
Name: South Texas, LLC 8333 IH-l0 San Antonio, 

TX78230 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 1380 Ackerman Rd., Red McCombs Ford, 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78219 Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 83331H-10 San Antonio, 

TX78230 

Year, Make & Model Dump Body Offered: 2016 Davis TA -5-10 Herrera Dump Body, 2017 Warren 2016 Davis Body 
5 Yard 

Dump Body Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year - Unlimited Mile! 1 Year 1 yr Parts, Labor & Trans 

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider Reliance Truck and San Antonio Brake & Wabash Davis Truck & Trailer, 
Name: Equipment Clutch P.O. Box 4129, Little Rock 

Dump Body Warranty Service Provider 7200 S. W.W. White 905 Avenue B, San 1605 Ackerman Rd., Davis Truck & TraUer, 
Facility Address: Road, TX 78222 Antonio TX, 78215 San Antonio, TX 78219 P.O. Box 4129, Little 

Rock. AR 72214 

Delivery 150-180 days 120-180 Days 180 Days 120-150 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31, 2016 10-30-16 1-1-2016 2-28-16 
Last day order can be placed without missing March 31, 2016 9-30-16 7-1-2016 Not Provided 
cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No Yes 3 months after P.O. Not Provided 
date: 

Prepared by Purchasing 2/1/2016 Page 7 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: 
December 7, 2015 Local Local 

Bid 1 Local Local Bid 2 Local Non-Local 
For: Purchase of Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner of Santex Truck Center, LTD Grande Truck Center Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford 

South Texas, LLC 

6100006820 LD 4562 IH 10 East 8700 IH 10 East 1380 Ackerman Rd. 4562 IH 10 East 8810 IH - 10 East 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Silsbee, 
Item Description Quantity TX 78219 TX78109 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX78219 TX 77656 

210-666-7112 210-277-4373 210-661-8371 

10 60K Fifth Wheel Tractor Truck: 2 
Price Each: $149,200.00 $126,470.00 $132,783.15 No Bid N08id N08id 
Total: $298,400.00 $252,940.00 $265,566.30 

Year, Make & Model of Cab and Chassis 2017 Volvo VNX 84T300 2017 Freightliner 114SD 2017 International HX 620 
Offered: 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Volvo 016-500 HP 1850 Detroit 0013 505 HP / Cummins ISX 500 HP 
(Include SAE Net HP): Ib ft TorQUli 1850 Iblft Torque 
Transmission Offered: Eaton Fuller RTLO Eaton Fuller RTLO- Fuller 18 Speed 

189188 -18 Speed 189188 
Cab and Chassis Warranty: 12 Months 1 Year Unlimited Mile! 1 Year 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Doggett Freightliner 0 Santex Truck Center 
Name: South Texas, LLC 
Cab and Chassis Warranty Service Provider 45621H 10 East, San 8700 IH 10 East, 1380 Ackerman Rd., 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78215 Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX 78219 

Delivery 150-180 Days 150-210 Days 180 Days 

Production Cut-off Date: March 31,2016 10130/2016 1-1-2016 
Last day order can be placed without missing March 31, 2016 9/30/2016 1-1-2016 
cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off N~ Yes 3 months after 
date: 

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Total: $2 128 168.00 $2154 815.00 $1885861.12 $630375.00 $251685.00 $366277.00 
Total Award: $743.118.00 $1.246.996.00 $100.272.24 

Item 1 and 4 were deleted and will be bid at a later time 
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