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ANORDINANCE 2016~02-18~-0099

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT, HOLT
CAT AND ASSOCIATED SUPPLY COMPANY TO PROVIDE 14
REPLACEMENT HEAVY EQUIPMENT MACHINES TO THE CITY’S
TRANSPORTATION AND CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS, PARKS AND
RECREATION, AND SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENTS
FOR A TOTAL OF $2,215,264.00, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT
RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with heavy equipment to
provide essential services to the roads, highways and public parks of San Antonio; and

WHEREAS, the low bid was submitted by Nueces Power Equipment for items 1 and 2 for a
total cost of $1,024,420.00; and

WHEREAS, the low bid was submitted by Holt Cat for items 3 and 4 for a total cost of
$850,794.00; and

WHEREAS, the low bid was submitted by Associated Supply Company for items 6, 7, and 8 for
a total cost of $340,050.00; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Nueces Power Equipment (Items 1-2), Holt Cat (Items 3-4)
and Associated Supply Company (Items 6-8) to provide the City with heavy equipment for a
total cost of $2,215,264.00 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all
required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid
tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I.
Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the
Finance Department. :

SECTION 2. Funding in the amount of $2,215,264.00 for this ordinance is available in Fund
72001000, Cost Center 350320001 and General Ledger 5501055 as part of the Fiscal Year 2016
Budget.

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed $1,024,420.00 is authorized to Nueces Power Equipment,
and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed $850,794.00 is authorized to Holt Cat and should be
encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 5. Payment not to exceed $340,050.00 is authorized to Associated Supply Company
and should be encumbered with a purchase order.
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SECTION 6. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 7. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. , ‘

PASSED and APPROVED this 18" day of February, 2016.

%2!%
M AY O R
Ivy R. Taylor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

—

U Y -

thhia M. Vaceld City Clerk/




Agenda Item:

10 (in comsent vote: §5,6,7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 26, 27, 28,
30A, 30C, 30D, 30E, 30F )

Date: 02/18/2016
Time: 10:40:05 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Nueces Power Equipment, Holt Cat and Associated Supply
Company to provide 14 replacement heavy equipment machines to the City's Transportation and
Capital Improvements, Parks and Recreation, and Solid Waste Management Departments for a total of
$2,215,264.00, funded from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund. [Ben Gorzell, Chief
Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance]
Result: Passed
Voter Group P:\el::n " Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 b
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 4, 2015
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non:
For: Purchasa of Heavy Equipment Nueces Power Hoit Cat Associated Supply
Equipment Company
6100006830 LD (4897 Nosth FM1516 |3302 S. W. W. White 14146 |-10 East 5250 N, Loop 1804 E.[9415 NE Loop 410
Rd.
Iltem Description QTY |Converss, San Antondo, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78247 TX 78219
210-310-0068 210-213-3143 210-333-6137
1 Wheeled Articulated Loader w/ Minimum 4| 3
(Cublic Yard Buckst:
Price Each: $165,355.00 $223,601.00] $194,000.00} No Bid No Bid{
Total: $496,085.00 $670,803.00] $582,000,00
35.2%|
$174,738.00
Year, Make & Mode! Offered: 2015 Hyundal HL96(J2016 Caterpiiar 350M 2016 Case 821F|
Wheel Loader]
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offsred Cummins QSB8.7] Cat C7.1 ACERT, FTP, FAHFEB13,
(include SAE net HP): SAE 222 HF 230 HP| 205HP Net
Wariranty: 3 year 3000 hourd 12 months/uniimited] 3 year / 3000 hour ful
hours machine|
Wairanty Service Provider Name: Hyundai Supporf HoltCat]  Associated Supply
Warranty] Company
Warranty Faciity Address: 4697 FM1516 North,] 3302 S. W. W. Whits 4146 |-10 East,
Conversa, TX 781 Rd., San Antonio,| San Antonio, Texas
TX 78222 78219
Delivery: 90 da 125 Days| 60 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 12/3116] Unknown at this time| 10/116]
Last day order can ba placed without 12/31/18] Unknown at this time 8/15/15;
missing cut-off dats:
Can bidder provide bid itsms after cut-off Unknown at this time No|
date:
2 Tracked Miling Machine: 1
Prica Each: $528,365 No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid{
Total: $528,3565
Year, Make & Mode! Offered: 2015, Wirtgen W,
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins QSX1
(Include SAE net HP): SAE 580 H
Warranty: 12 month 1000
Warranty Servics Provider Name:
[Wairanty Faciity Address: 4697 FM1516 North
Converse, TX 781
Dslivery: 120
Production Cut-off Date: 12/311
Last day order can be placed without 121311
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid ltems after cut-off
date:

Preparad by Purchasing 1202016



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

date:

Opened: December 4, 2015
Non-Local Local Non-L.ocal Non-Local Local
For; Purchase of Heavy Equipment Nueces Power Hoit Cat Associated Supply  |Equipment Depot Anderson Machinery
Equipment Company Company
6100006830 LD . |4697 North FM1516  |3302 S, W. W. White |4146 |-10 East 5250 N. Loop 1604 E.[9415 NE Loop 410
. Rd.
Item Description QTY |Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78247 TX 78218
210-310-0066 210-213-3143 1210-333-6137
3 Wheeled Motor Graders: 3
Price Each: No Bid] $190,000.00 No Bid} No Bid| No Bid
Total: - $570,000.00
Year, Make & Mode| Offered: 2016 Caterpillaf
120M2)
Specific Make & Mode! of Engine Offered Cat C7.1ACERT,
(Include SAE net HP): variable hp, 161 HP i
3rd gear, up to 18
hn in Rth anray
Warranty: 12 months/unlimited
hours, total machine]
Warranty Service Provider Name: Holt Cat
Warranty Facility Address: 3302 S. W. W. White
Rd,, San Antonio,|
TX 78222
Delivery: 130 Days]
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown at this time]
iast day order can be placed without Unknown at this time]
missing cut-off date: ’
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown at this time]
date:
4 6 Ton Double Drum Vibratory Roller: 3
Price Each: o $112,395.00 $93,598.001 No Bidi No Bid| $110,037.004
Total: $337,185.00 $280,794.001 $330,111.00;
Year, Make & Mode! Offered: 2015 Hamm D70VV] 2016 Caterpiliaf 2016 Bomagj
CcB448] BW141D-5
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Deutz TCD 2.9 SAE] Cat C3.4B, 100 HP) Kubota V3307 CR-T]
(Include SAE net HP): 74.2 HP) 73.2 HP
Warranty: 3 years 3000 hoursy 12 months/unlimited 12 months or 1,000;
hoursji hours, whichever|
comes first]
Warranty Service Provider Name: Wirtgen Americaj Holt Cat} Anderson Machinery]
Texas
Warranty Facility Address: 4697 FM1516 North,§ 3302 S. W. W. White 9415 NE Loop 410,
Converse, TX 76109 Rd., San Antonio, San Antonio, Texas|
TX 78 78219,
Delivery: 120 days| 140 Day: 90-120 Days}
Production Cut-off Date: 12/31/16] Unknown at this tim 12-31-2016)
Last day order can be placed without 12/31/16] Unknown at this tim 12-31-2016
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Nofl Unknown at this timi Yes

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2016



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:
Warranty Facility Address:
Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

H75E Hammer|
Cat C4.4 ACERT, 87
Net HP|

12 months/ur
hours, total machine
Holt Caff

3302 S. W. W. White
Rd., San Antonio,
TX 78222

150 Days]

Unknown at this time]
Unknown at this time]

Unknown at this time]

FPT, F5BFL413C, 89
HP (66 kW)

1 year / 1000 hour fulll1 year unlimited hours

FPT, FEHFL413C*A,
95 Net HP|

maching

Associated Suppiy} Equipment Depot)
C

4146 |10 East,] 5250 N. Loop 1604
San Antonio, Texas{ E., San Antonio, TX
78219 78247
60 Days} 60 Days;
10/1/16] 12-2-16
8/15/15] 10-2-16
No| No

Opened: December 4, 2015
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Nueces Power Helt Cat Associated Supply 'Equipment Depot Anderson Machinery
Equipment Company Company
6100008830 LD {4697 North FM1516  |3302 S. W. W. White |4146 |-10 East 5250 N. Loop 1604 E.[9415 NE Loop 410
Rd.
Item Description QTY |Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
. TX 78100 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78247 TX 78219
210-310-0066 210-213-3143 210-333-6137
5 Deleted:
[] Loader Backhoe with 12” Bucket and 2
Telescopic Boom: :
Price Each: No Bid $78,773.00] $68,100.00 $78,567.00 No Bid|
Total: $157,546.00 $136,200.00 $1567,134.00,
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 15.7%|
and local bid:
Price differential: $21,346.00)
Year, Make & Mode! Offered: 2016 Caterplia] 2015 Case 580N 2016 New Holland]
A16F2) Backhoet B95C
Specific Make & Mode! of Engine Offered CatC44 ACERT,]  FPT, F6BFL413C,{ FPT, FSHFL413C*A,
(Include SAE net HP): 87 Net HP| 89 HP (66 kW) 95 Net HP|
Warranty: 12 months/unlimited] 1 year / 1000 hour fulll1 year unlimited hours]
hours, total machine] machine
Warranty Service Provider Name: Holt Cat]  Associated Supplyl Equipment Depot
Warranty Facility Address: 3302 S. W, W, White 4146 I-10 East] 5250 N. Loop 1604
Rd., San Antonio,j San Antonio, Texas E., San Antonio, TX
TX 782220 78219 78247
Delivery: 150 Days| 60 Days; 60 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown at this time] 1011716 12-2-16|
f.ast day order can be placed without Unknown at this time] 8/15/18| 10-2-16
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown at this time] No| No
date:
7 Loader Backhoe with 24" Bucket and 1K 1
Hydraulic Breaker:
Price Each: No Bid| $98,670.00) $84,500.00 $85,480.,00] No Bid
Total: $98,670.00) $84,500.00 $85,480.,00]
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 16.8%
and local bid: .
Price differential: $14,170.00)
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 Caterpillaf 2015 Case 580N] 2016 New Holland]
416F2 with Caterpiliai Backhoe B9sC

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2016
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 4, 2015
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Nueces Power Holt Cat Assoclated Supply  [Equipment Depot ~  |Anderson Machinery
Equipment [Company Company
6100006830 LD {4697 North FM1516 {3302 S. W. W. White |4146 I-10 East 5250 N. Loop 1604 E.[9415 NE Loop 410
Rd.
Item Description QTY |Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78247 TX 78219
210-310-0066 210-213-3143 210-333-6137
8 Dozer Crawler: 1
Price Each: No Bid $161,455.00 $119,350.00) No Bid; No Bid|
Total: $161,455.00 $119,350.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 35.3%]
and local bid:
Price differential: $42,105.00]
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 Caterpillar DK 2015 Case 850M) .
‘ LGP Dozen
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered CatC6.6 ACERT} FPT, FAHFE413P,
(include SAE net HP): 128 Net HP| 112 HP (84 kW),
Warranty: 12 months/uniimited; 3 year / 3000 hour full]
hours machine
V y Service Provider Name: Holt Ca Associated Supply
Company
Warranty Facility Address: 3302 S. W. W. White 4146 1-10 East,
Rd., San Antonio,] San Antonio, Texas|
TX 78222} 78219
Delivery: 140 Days 60 Days)
Production Cut-off Date: Unknown at this timg] 101118
Last day order can be placed without Unknown at this time] 8/15/15]
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Unknown at this time) No
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30, Net30l________ Net30 Net 30 Net 30
Total; $1,361,605.00] $1,939,268.00 $922,050.00f $242.614.00, $330,111.00f
Total Award: $1,024,420.00] $850,794.00) $340,050.00§

Item & was deleted and will be bid at a later time.

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2018
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: Ciicember 4, 2015
Local Local Non-Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Cooper Equipment  [H & V Equipment RDO E Co. [Wauk Pearce
Co. Services, Inc. Industries, Inc.
6100006830 LD 17474 Judson RD.  [3307 SELoop 410 [19275N.IH35 3740 S. E. Loop 410
Item Description QTY [San Antonio, San Antonio New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
1 Wheeled Articulated Loader w/ Minimum 4 3
Cubic Yard Bucket:
Price Each: No Bid| $207,956.00; $208,050.60 $208,740.00
Total; $623,868.00 $624,151.80 $626,220.00
25.8%| 26.2%
$127,803.00] $130,155.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016, Doosan, DL300 2016 John Deere| 2016 Komatsu
5 Wheel Loader| 644K WA380-8
41,484lbs., Includes
Ride Control
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Scania DC0Y 271HP]  John Deere Power| SAABD107E-3;
(Include SAE net HP): per SAE J1995| Tech PSX 6090, 232
HP
Warranty: 1 year Parts & 1 year, unt 1 yriunlimited|
Service, Additional 2| hours| Hourmeter hours
years Parts & Service
Powertrain & Major|
Hydraulics 3 total.
Warranty Service Provider Name: Doosan MFG, H & V| RDO-Equipment Co.| Waukesha-Paearce
Equipment Services| Industries, Inc.
Inc.
Warranty Facility Address: 3307 SE Loop 410,| 19275 N. [H 35, New| 3740 SE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX| Braunfels, TX 78132 San Antonio, TX|
78222 78222
Delivery: 90-120 Days 45 Days| 120-150 Days;
Production Cut-off Date: March 7,2016] November 1, 2016 3-31-2016)
L ast day order can be placed without March 7, 2016] September 15, 2016 3-31-201
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Noj No| Noj
date:
2 Tracked Milling Machine: 1
Price Each: No Bid| No Bid No Bid| No Bid
Total:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
{include SAE net HP):

Warmranty:

Warranty Service Provider Name:
Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off

date:

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2016
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 4, 2015
Local Local Non-Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Cooper Equipment  |H & V Equipment RDO Equipment Co. [Waukesha-Pearce
Co. Services, Inc. industries, inc.
6100006830 LD [17474 Judson RD.  [3307 SELoop 410  [19275N.IH 35 3740 8. E. Loop 410
item Description QTY [San Antonio, San Antonio New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
3 Whaeled Motor Graders: 3
Price Each: No Bid No Bid) $197,005.69 No Bid|
Total: $591,017.07|
Year, Make & Model Offered: 20186 John Deere|
670G
Specific Make & Mode! of Engine Offered John Deere Power]
(Include SAE net HP): Tech PSS 9.0L, 220
HP
Warranty: 1 year, unfimited
hours
Warranty Service Provider Name: RDO Equipment Co.
Warranty Facility Address: 18275 N. {H 35, New|
: Braunfels, TX 78132
Delivery: 45 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: November 1, 2016
i.ast day order can be placed without September 15, 2016,
missing cut-off date:
(Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Not Provided
date:
4 6 Ton Double Drum Vibratory Rofler: 3
Price Each: $100,306.00f No Bid| No Bid| No Bid
Total: $300,918.00]
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 Dynapac
CC2200 Comfcab,
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Deutz TCD 3.6
(include SAE net HP): IIB/T4i
Warranty: 1yr.
Warranty Service Provider Name: Cooper Equipment
Co., San Antonio, TX
. 78247
Warranty Facility Address: 17474 Judson RD.
San Antonio, TX
76247
Delivery: 90 Days
Production Cut-off Date: Oct. "186|
Last day order can be placed without June, '18|
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes|

date:

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2016
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City of San. Antonlo Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 4, 2015
Local Local Non-Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Cooper Equipment  {H & V Equipment [RDO Equipment Co. jWaukesha-Pearce
Co. Services, Inc. Industries, Inc.
6100006830 LD [17474 Judson RD. {3307 SE Loop 410 19275 N.1H 35 3740 S. E. Loop 410
Item Description QTY }San Antonio, San Antonio New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
5 Deleted:
] Loader Backhoe with 12" Bucket and 2
Telescopic Boom:
Price Each: No Bid| No Bid| $80,637.43 No Bid
Total: $161,274.86
Percentage between lowest responsive bid
and local bid:
Price differential:
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 John Deere
310SL]
Specific Make & Madel of Engine Offered John Deere Power]
(Include SAE net HP): Tech Plus
4045HT082
Turbocharged 99 HP|
Warranty: 1 year, uni
hours|
Warranty Service Provider Name: RDQ Equipment Co,
Warranty Facility Address: 19275 N. H 35, New
Braunfels, TX 78132
Dglivery: 45 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: November 1, 2016
Last day order can be placed without September 15, 2016
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Noj
date:
7 Loader Backhoe with 24" Bucket and 1K 1
Hydraulic Breaker:
Price Each: No Bid| No Bid| $92,079.54 No Bid
Total: $92,079.54

Percentage between lowest responsive bid
and local bid:

Price differential:

Year, Make & Mode! Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Name:

Warranty Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
Idate:

2016.John Deere|
310SL

John Deere Powerl
Tech Plus|
4045HT082
Turbocharged 99 HP
1 year, unlimited

hours|
RDO Equipment Co.

19275 N. IH 35, New|
Braunfels, TX 78132,

45 Days
November 1, 2016
September 15, 2016

No|

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2016
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 4, 2015
Local Local Non-Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy E t Cooper Equipment  |H & V Equipment RDO Equipment Co. |Waukesha-Pearce
Co. Services, inc. industries, Inc.
6100006830 LD [17474 Judson RD.  [3307 SELoop 410 [19275N.1H 35 3740 8. E. Loop 410
item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio New Braunfels, San Antonio,
TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78132 TX 78222
8 Dozer Crawler: 1
Ptce Each: No Bid No Bid $140,717.58 No Bid]
Total: $140,717.58
Percentage between lowest responsive bid
and local bid:
Price differential:
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 John Deere;
650K|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered John Deere Powerl
(Inciude SAE net HP): Tech PWS 4045 104
- HP
Warranty: 1 year, unlimited|
hours|
Warranty Service Provider Name: RDO Equipment Co.|
Warranty Facility Address: 19275 N. IH 35, New
Braunfels, TX 78132
Dé!lvery: 45 Days
Production Cut-off Date: November 1, 2016
Last day order can be placed without September 15, 2016
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Noj
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30} Net 30
Total: $300.918.00] $623,868.00] $1.609,240.85 $626,220.00;
Total Award:

Item & was deleted and will be bid at a iater time.

Prepared by Purchasing 1/26/2016
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