
City of San Antonio
 Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2016
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Non-Local Non-Local, Alternate Local Local, Alternate Local

Mission Golf Cars Ewald Kubota Tractor Ewald Kubota Tractor DeWinne Equipment 
Company

DeWinne Equipment 
Company

Bexar Golf Cars Etc, dba 
Golf Cars Etc.

6100007230 IM 18865 Redland Road 1900 W IH 10 1900 W IH 10 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 5560 N Loop 1604

Item Description  Qty

San Antonio,                                        
TX 78259
210-545-7868

Seguin,
TX 78155
830-305-4717

Seguin,
TX 78155

San Antonio,                                     
TX  78250

San Antonio,                                     
TX  78250

San Antonio,
TX 78247

1 Electric Golf Cart- Six Seater 1
Price Each $9,869.00 $10,353.05
Prompt Payment Discount
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount
Price Total $9,869.00 $10,353.05
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Cushman Shuttle 6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2016 Club Car Villager 6
Specific Make, Model & Engine Offered (Include SAE HP): Cushman Shuttle 6 48 Volt 

Elec.
48 Volt I.Q. Plus Electric (6-

Passenger)
Warranty 2 year 2 year limited vehicle 

warranty and 4-year limited 
battery warranty

Warranty Provider Name Mission Golf Cars Not specified
Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Rd. 

San Antonio Tx 78258
Not specified

Delivery Days 60 4-6 weeks
Production cut-off date Not specified Not specified
Last day to order June 1 Not specified
Bid price remains firm Not specified Not specified

2 Deleted

3 4x4 Off-Road Light Utility Vehicle with Winch & Brush 
Guard, Four seater

1

Price Each $15,182.00 $16,930.66 $16,998.00 $16,998.00 $15,449.06
Prompt Payment Discount 1.00% 1.00%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $16,828.02 $16,828.02
Price Total $15,182.00 $16,930.66 $16,828.02 $16,828.02 $15,449.06
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Cushman Hauler 4X4 

Crew
RTV 1140, 2016 No Bid 2016 Gravely Atlas Jsv-

6000 Crew 996203
2016 Gravely Atlas Jsv-

6000 Crew 996203
2016 Club Car Carryall 

1700 SE 
Specific Make, Model & Engine Offered (Include SAE HP): Cushman Hauler 4X4 Crew 

22 HP Diesel
RTV 1140, Kubota Diesel 3 

Cyl. 25 HP
Kohler Diesel 1003, 24Hp Kohler Diesel 1003, 24Hp 20 H.P. Kubota D-722 

Diesel Powered 4-
Passenger Utility Cart

Warranty One Year Warranty 12 months 1 Year 1 Year 2 year/2000 hour limited 
engine warranty

Warranty Provider Name Mission Golf Cars Ewald Kubota Tractor Dewinne Equipment 
Company

Dewinne Equipment 
Company

Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Road
San Antonio, Tx 78258

1900 W IH 10, Seguin Tx. 11002 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, Tx 78250

11002 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, Tx 78250

Delivery Days 60 30 30 30 4 to 6 weeks
Production cut-off date Not specified 90 days 6/1/2016 6/1/2016
Last day to order June 1st May 30, 2016 5/1/2016 5/1/2016
Bid price remains firm Yes 90 days No No



City of San Antonio
 Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2016
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Non-Local Non-Local, Alternate Local Local, Alternate Local

Mission Golf Cars Ewald Kubota Tractor Ewald Kubota Tractor DeWinne Equipment 
Company

DeWinne Equipment 
Company

Bexar Golf Cars Etc, dba 
Golf Cars Etc.

6100007230 IM 18865 Redland Road 1900 W IH 10 1900 W IH 10 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 5560 N Loop 1604

Item Description  Qty

San Antonio,                                        
TX 78259
210-545-7868

Seguin,
TX 78155
830-305-4717

Seguin,
TX 78155

San Antonio,                                     
TX  78250

San Antonio,                                     
TX  78250

San Antonio,
TX 78247

4 Off-Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 w/ Cargo Bed & Hitch-2 
Seater

6

Price Each $10,548.00 $8,512.96 $9,085.64 $12,050.00 $8,999.10 $10,749.52
Prompt Payment Discount 1.00% 1.00%
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount $11,929.50 $8,909.11
Price Total $63,288.00 $51,077.76 $54,513.84 $71,577.00 $53,454.65 $64,497.12
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 23.91% 40.13% 4.65%
Price Differential $12,210.24 $20,499.24 $2,376.89
Make & Model & Year Offered 2016 Cushman Hauler 4X4 RTV 400, 2016 RTV 500, 2016 2016 Gravely JSV-3000 

996200
2016 Volunteer 4X4 EFI 

RED
2016 Club Car Carryall 

1500 
Specific Make, Model & Engine Offered (Include SAE HP): Cushman Hauler 4X4 28 

HP Gas
Kubota Gas Eng. 16 HP Kubota 2 Cyl. Liquid 

Cooled Gas Hydrostatic 
Trans 15.8 HP (No Belts)

Polaris aires gas efi 570cc 
40hp peak

Kohler Aegis V-Twin 31 hp 20.1 H.P. Kawasaki Gas 
Powered Utility Cart

Warranty I Year Warranty 12 mos. 12 mos. 1 Year 1 Year 2 year/2000 hour limited 
engine warranty

Warranty Provider Name Mission Golf Cars, Ewald Kubota Tractor Ewald Kubota Tractor Dewinne Equipment 
Company

Dewinne Equipment 
Company

Not specified

Warranty Provider Address 18865 Redland Rd. 
San Antonio, Texas 78259

1900 W. IH 10 Seguin 1900 W. IH 10 Seguin 11002 Bandera Rd., 
San Antonio, Tx 78250

11002 Bandera Rd., 
San Antonio, Tx 78250

Not specified

Delivery Days 60 45 45 30 30 4 to 6 weeks
Production cut-off date Not specified 90 days 90 6/1/2016 6/1/2016 Not specified
Last day to order June 1st May 30, 2016 May 30, 2016 5/1/2016 5/1/2016 Not specified
Bid price remains firm Yes 90 Days 90 Days No No Not specified

5 Deleted

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 1.00% 10 Days 1.00% 10 Days Net 30
Total $25,051.00 $51,077.76
Total Award $25,051.00 $51,077.76

Items 2 and 5 have been deleted  and will be re-solicited at a later date


	Final

