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AN ORDINANCE 2016-05-12-0334 

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM MISSION GOLF CARS AND EWALD 
KUBOTA TRACTOR TO PROVIDE SIX ADDITIONAL AND TWO 
REPLACEMENT LIGHT UTILITY VEHICLES TO THE CITY'S PARKS 
& RECREATION, CENTER CITY DEVELOPMENT & OPERATIONS, 
AND AVIATION DEPARTMENTS FOR A TOTAL COST OF $76,128.76, 
FUNDED FROM THE GENERAL FUND, PARKING OPERATIONS & 
MAINTENANCE FUND, AND AIRPORT OPERATIONS & 
MAINTENANCE FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio's Parks & Recreation, 
Center City Development & Operations, and Aviation Departments with light utility vehicles for 
daily operations, grounds keeping maintenance, and project support throughout the City; and 

WHEREAS, Mission Golf Cars submitted the lowest bids for items 1 and 3 for a total cost of 
$25,051.00; and 

WHEREAS, the lowest bid for item 4 was submitted by Ewald Kubota Tractor for a cost of 
$51,077.76; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Mission Golf Cars (Items 1 and 3) and Ewald Kubota 
Tractor (Item 4) to provide the City with light utility vehicles for a total cost of $76,128.76 is 
hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance 
deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. Attached hereto and incorporated herein for all 
purposes as Exhibit I is the bid tabulation sheet. Copies of the bids are available for inspection 
in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. Funding in the amount of $76,128.76 for this ordinance is available per the table 
below as part of the Fiscal Year 2016 Budget: 

Amount General Cost Center Fund 
Ledger 

$8,512.96 5501055 1910030001 53001000 
$17,025.92 5501055 1902010001 11001000 
$25,538.88 5501050 2615040001 11001000 

$9,869.00 5501050 3305040006 51001000 
$15,182.00 5501050 3305040008 51001000 

Total Amount: 
$76,128.76 



LC 
5/12/16 
Item No. 4 

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed $25,051.00 is authorized to Mission Golf Cars and should 
be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed $51,077.76 is authorized to Ewald Kubota Tractor and 
should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP 
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 1ih day of May, 2016. 

Ivy R. Taylor 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

ty Clerk 

2 



Agenda Item: 4 ( in consent vote: 4,5,6,7,10,11,12,14,15,16,17,18,19 ) 

Date: 05112/2016 

Time: 09:26:39 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Mission Golf Cars and Ewald Kubota Tractor to provide six 
additional and two replacement light utility vehicles to the City's Parks & Recreation, Center City & 
Operations, and Aviation Departments for a total cost of $76, 128.76, funded from the General Fund 
and the Parking and Airport Operations & Maintenance Funds. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; 
Troy Elliott, Director, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ivy R. Taylor Mayor x 

Roberto C. Trevino District 1 x x 

Alan Warrick District 2 x x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x 



Opened: March 18, 2016 
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles 

6100007230 1M 

Item Description atv 

1 Electric Golf Carl- Six Seater 1 
Price Each 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Price each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
PercentaQ8 between lowest responsive bid and local bid 
Price Differential 
Make & Model & Year Offered 
Specific Make, Model & Engine Offered (Include SAE HP): 

Warranty 

Warranty Provider Name 
Warranty Provider Address 

Deliverv Days 
Production cut-off date 
Last day to order 
Bid price remains firm 

2 Deleted 

3 4x4 Off-Road Light Utility Vehicle with Winch & Brush 1 
Guard, Four seater 
Price Each 

Prompt Payment Discount 

Price each with Prompt Payment Discount 
Price Total 
PercentaQe between lowest responsive bid and local bid 
Price Differential 
Make & Model & Year Offered 

Specific Make, Model & Engine Offered (Include SAE HP): 

Warranty 

Warranty Provider Name 

Warranty Provider Address 

Deliverv Days 
Production cut-off date 
Last day to order 
Bid price remains firm 

Local 
Mission Golf Cars 

18865 Redland Road 
San Antonia, 
TX 78259 
h,n_~'~_70~O 

$9,869.00 

$9,869.00 

2016 Cushman Shuttle 6 
Cushman Shuttle 6 48 Vol 

Elec. 
2 yea 

Mission Golf Cars 
18865 Redland Rd. 

San Antonio Tx 78258 
60 

Not specified 
June 1 

Not .n"rj~"d 

$15,182.00 

$15,182.00 

2016 Cushman Hauler 4X4 
Crell 

Cushman Hauler 4X4 Crell 
22 HP Diesel 

One Year Warranty 

Mission Golf Cars 

18865 Redland Road 
San Antonio. Tx 78258 

60 
Not specified 

June 1s 
Yes 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 
Ewald Kubota Tractor 

1900 W IH 10 
Seguin, 
TX 78155 
I R'O_'OS-4717 

No Bid 

$16,930.86 

$16.930.66 

RTV 1140, 2016 

RTV 1140, Kubota Diesel 3 
Cyl. 25 HP 

12 months 

Ewald Kubota Tractor 

1900 W IH 10, Seguin Tx. 

30 
90 days 

May 30, 2016 
90 days 

Non-Local Alternate Local Local Alternate Local 
Ewald Kubota Tractor DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment Bexar Golf Cars Etc, dba 

Company Company Golf Cars Etc. 
1900WIH 10 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 5560 N Loop 1604 
Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78247 

$10,353.05 

$10,353.05 

No Bid No Bid No Bid 2016 Club Car VillaQer 6 
48 Volt 1.0. Plus Electric (6 

Passenaer) 
2 year limited vehicle 

warranty and 4-year limited 
batterv warranty 

Not specified 
Not specified 

4~ weeks 
Not specified 
Not specified 
Not specified 

$16,998.00 $16,998.00 $15,449.06 
1.00% 1.00% 

$16,828.02 $16,828.02 
$16,828.02 $16,828.02 $15,449.06 

No Bid 2016 Gravely Atlas Jsv- 2016 Gravely Atlas Jsv- 2016 Club Car Carryall 
6000 Crew 996203 6000 Crew 996203 1700 SE 

Kohler Diesel 1003, 24Hp Kohler Diesel 1003, 24Hp 20 H.P. Kubota D-722 
Diesel Powered 4-

Passenaer LJtilitv Cart 
1 Year 1 Year 2 year/2000 hour limited 

enaine warranty 
Dewinne Equipment Dewinne Equipment 

Comoanv Comcanv 
11002 Bandera Rd .. 11002 Bandera Rd .. 

San Antonio. Tx 78250 San Antonio. Tx 78250 
30 30 4 to 6 weeks I 

6/1/2016 6/1/2016 
5/112016 5/112016 

No No 
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Opened: March 18, 2016 
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles 

6100007230 1M 

Item Description Qty 
4 Off-Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 wi Cargo Bed & Hitch-2 6 

Seater 

Price Each 

Prompt Payment Discount 

Price each with Prompt Payment Discount 

Price Total 
PercentaQe between lowest responsive bid and local bid 
Price Differential 
Make & Model & Year Offered 

Specific Make, Model & Engine Offered (Include SAE HP): 

Warranty 

Warranty Provider Name 

Warranty Provider Address 

Deliverv Davs 
Production cut-off date 
Last dav to order 
Bid price remains firm 

5 Deleted 

Payment Terms 
Total 
Total Award 

Items 2 and 5 have been deleted and will be re-solicited at a later date 

Local 
Mission Golf Cars 

18865 Redland Road 
San Antonio, 
TX 78259 
?10_~4~_7RfiR 

$10,548.00 

$63,288.00 
23.91% 

$12,210.24 
2016 Cushman Hauler 4X4 

Cushman Hauler 4X4 28 
HPGas 

I Year Warranty 

Mission Golf Cars, 

18865 Redland Rd. 
San Antonio. Texas 78259 

60 
Not specified 

June 1 s 
Yes 

Net 30 
$25,051.00 
$25051,00 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Non-Local 
Ewald Kubota Tractor 

1900WIH 10 
Seguin, 
TX 78155 
IR~O_~O~-4717 

$8,512.96 

$51,077.76 

RTV 400, 2016 

Kubota Gas Eng. 16 HP 

12 mos. 

Ewald Kubota Tracto 

1900 W. IH 10 Seguin 

45 
90 davs 

Mav 39~ ~~:~ 

Net 30 
$51,077.76 
$51077,76 

Non-Local Alternate Local Local Alternate Local 
Ewald Kubota Tractor DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment Bexar Golf Cars Etc, dba 

Company Company Golf Cars Etc. 

1900 W IH 10 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 5560 N Loop 1604 
Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78247 

$9,085.64 $12,050.00 $8,999.10 $10,749.52 

1.00% 1.00% 

$11,929.50 $8,909.11 

$54,513.84 $71,577.00 $53,454.65 $64,497.12 
40.13% 4.65% 

$20,499.24 $2,376.89 
RTV 500, 2016 2016 Gravely JSV-3000 2016 Volunteer 4X4 EFI 2016 Club Car Carryall 

996200 RED 1500 
Kubota 2 Cyl. Liquid Polaris aires gas efi 570cc Kohler Aegis V-Twin 31 hp 20.1 H.P. Kawasaki Gas 

Cooled Gas Hydrostatic 40hp peak Powered Utility Cart 
Trans 15.8 HP INa Belts) 

12 mos. 1 Year 1 Year 2 year/2000 hour limited 
enaine warranty 

Ewald Kubota Tractor Dewinne Equipment Dewinne Equipment Not specified 
Comoanv Comoanv 

1900 W. IH 10 Seguin 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd., Not specified 
San Antonio. Tx 78250 San Antonio. Tx 78250 

45 30 30 4 t06 weeks 
90 6/1/2016 6/1/2016 Not specified 

Mav 30, 2016 5/1/2016 5/1/2016 Not specified 
90 Days No No Not specified 

Net 30 1.00% 10 Davs 1.00% 10 Davs Net 30 


