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Item No. 6

ANORDINANCE 2016-06-02-03886

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $3,602,000.00: (A) VULCAN CONSTRUCTION
MATERIALS, LLC FOR FLEXIBLE BASE AND FLEXIBLE BASE FOR
STABILIZATION, (B) POPPE AUTOMOTIVE WAREHOUSE, INC.
FOR AUTOMOTIVE AND TRUCK AIR CONDITIONING PARTS AND
SERVICE, (C) SIDDONS MARTIN EMERGENCY GROUP, LLC,
METRO FIRE APPARATUS SPECIALISTS, INC. AND FRAZER LTD.
FOR EMERGENCY VEHICLE PARTS AND SERVICE, (D) VALERO
MARKETING & SUPPLY COMPANY FOR SAFD FLEET FUELING
CARD SYSTEM, AND (E) SIEMENS INDUSTRY, INC. FOR HEATING,
VENTILATION, AND AIR CONDITIONING CONTROL SERVICES OF
APOGEE BUILDING AUTOMATION SYSTEM.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with commodities and
services on an annual basis for the terms of the contracts; and

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Vulcan
Construction Materials, LLC for flexible base and flexible base for stabilization, (B) Poppe
Automotive Warehouse, Inc. for automotive and truck air conditioning parts, (C) Siddons Martin
Emergency Group, LLC, Metro Fire Apparatus Specialists, Inc. and Frazer Ltd. for emergency
vehicle parts and service, (D) Valero Marketing & Supply Company for SAFD fleet fueling card
system, and (E) Siemens Industry, Inc. for heating, ventilation, and air conditioning control
services of APOGEE building automation system; and

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Martin Marietta failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or
requirements for flexible base and flexible base for stabilization; and

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not
required under section 252.022(a)(2), which provides for a procurement necessary to protect the
public health or safety, and under section 252.022(a)(7), which provides for a procurement of
items that are available from only one source; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves one low qualifying bid contract, four low bid contracts,
one contract procured on the basis of public health and safety, and one contract procured on the
basis of sole source; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: '
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Item No. 6

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) Vulcan
Construction Materials, LLC for flexible base and flexible base for stabilization, (B) Poppe
Automotive Warehouse, Inc. for automotive and truck air conditioning parts, (C) Siddons Martin
Emergency Group, LLC, Metro Fire Apparatus Specialists, Inc. and Frazer Ltd. for emergency
vehicle parts and service, (D) Valero Marketing & Supply Company for SAFD fleet fueling card
system, and (E) Siemens Industry, Inc. for heating, ventilation, and air conditioning control
services of APOGEE building automation system. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto
and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of bids are available for inspection
in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bid submitted by Martin Marietta failed to
meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 3. The amounts will be encumbered upon issuance of various purchase orders and
payment is authorized to the vendors identified herein. All current fiscal year expenditures will
be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2016 budget approved by City Council and future fiscal
year expenditures are contingent upon future City Council budget approvals.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon-passage by eight affirmative votes;

otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.
%?« %

M A Y O R
Ivy R. Taylor

PASSED and APPROVED this 2™ day of June, 2016.

ATTEST:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

(#
ceki City Cle} artha G. Sépeda, Acting th Attorney




Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item:

6 (in consent vote: 4,5, 6, 7, 8, 15, 16, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 25,27)

Date: 06/02/2016
Time: 09:14:43 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an
estimated annual cost of $3,602,000.00: (A) Vulcan Construction Materials, LLC for flexible base and
flexible base for stabilization, (B) Poppe Automotive Warehouse, Inc. for automotive and truck air
conditioning parts, (C) Siddons Martin Emergency Group, LLC, Metro Fire Apparatus Specialists, Inc.
and Frazer Ltd. for emergency vehicle parts and service, (D) Valero Marketing & Supply Company for
SAFD fleet fueling card system, and (E) Siemens Industry, Inc. for heating, ventilation, and air
conditioning control services of APOGEE building automation system. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial
Officer; Troy Elliott, Director, Finance]
Result: Passed
Not g 2
Voter Group P Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X
Alan Warrick District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X X
http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx 6/2/2016
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 11, 2016
Annual Contract for Flexible Base and Flexible Base for
For: Stabilization Local Local
Vulcan Construction Martin Marietta
Materials, LLC.
6100007352 DS 800 Isom Rd., Ste 300 5710 W. Hausman
Estimated |San Antonio, : San Antonio,
Item Description Annual |TX 78216 TX 78257
Quantity |210-524-3546
NAS
1A |Flexible Base Type A— City Picked Up Material 10,000
Price Per Ton $6.50)
Total Price $65,000.00)
1B Deleted
1c Deleted
1D Deleted *
1E Flexible Base Type A — JIT jobsite north of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton $12.00}
Total Price $7.,500.00}
1F Deleted
1G Deleted
1H Deleted
1 Flexible Base Type A — JIT jobsite south of Commerce 625
Price Per Ton $15.00
Total Price $9,375.00]
1 Deleted
1K Deleted
1L Deleted
2A Deleted
2B Deleted
2C Deleted
2D Deleted
26 Deleted
2F Deleted
2G Deleted
2H Deleted
2 Deleted
2J Deleted
2K Deleted
2L Deleted
Delivery - City Pickup Material 24 hours
Delivery - Just in Time Deliver (JIT) 3 days!
Payment Terms Net 30 days
IEsﬁmated Annual Total $81,875.00
Estimated Annual Award $81,875.00

Deleted - Items 1B thru 1D, 1F thru 1H, 1J thru 1L and 2A thru 2L, material no longer in production

Prepared by Purchasing 4-14-16

Exhibit I



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 30, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Poppe Automotive Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle |Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises,
Auto Air LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts
6100006620 HH|716 S: Frio Street 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield,
TX 78207 TX 78216 TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 MO 65802
Item Description 210-225-3657
1A A/IC COMPRESSORS
A|Percent of discount offered 0% Motorcraft,
20%j Net 10% Four Seasons| 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better,
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Omega/Global
Global/Four Products/Four
Seasons/Motorcrafff ~ Seasons/Delco Motorcraft Motorcraft, Four Seasons| NAPA Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft] Motorcraft/Murray
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber] Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale| List Price
D|Price schedule number: AC6620] AP502, Computer Printout| RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A, Online
E|Date of price schedule: 4/1/2016} 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16] N/A, Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber] NET Dealer Price, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost; List]
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year| 12 Months from purchase 24 month/24000, 24 month 24 months/24000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles 2 years limited warranty
1B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
2A A/C CLUTCHES AND COMPONENTS
A|Percent of discount offered 20%] 0% 0% Motorcraft, 10% AC Delco 20%) Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better|
B[Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Omega/Global NAPA, GATES/TECH
Motorcraft/Four| Products/Four| EXPERTS/ECHLIN/DORMAN| Dorman, Import Direct, Borg
Seasons/Standardl|  Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft] Motorcraft, AC Delco /FOUR SEASONS Motorcraft Warner|
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber] Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 JOBBER Wholesale List Price|
D|Price schedule number:; AC6620) AP502, Computer Printout| RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A, Online|
E|Date of price schedule: 4/1/2016 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, Jan 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A, Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber] NET Dealer Price, Price 4 JOBBER Dealer Cost, List|
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.) 12 Months from purchase 24 month/24000, 24 month Limited Lifetime| 2 years/Unlimited Miles| Limited Lifetime|
G|Warranty: 1 year
2B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
3A ACCUMULATORS
Al|Percent of discount offered 20%] 0%| 0% Motorcraft, 10% Four Seasons| 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better|
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Omega/Global
Products/Four|
Global/Four Seasons|f  Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Motorcraft, Four Seasons NAPA (FOUR SEASONS) Motorcraft| Murray, Motorcraft
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber] Provided NET File| Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber, Wholesale List Price|
D|Price schedule number: ACB8620) AP502, Computer Printout| RPTO086| FPS-3642 N/A, Online|
E|Date of price schedule: 4/112016}f 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016/ 3/2016 3/29/16, N/A, Online,
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber NET Dealer Price, Computer Printout JOBBER| Dealer Cost, List Price|
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 Standard Manufacturer|
1 year 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles| Warranty,
3B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
4A EXPANSION VALVES
A|Percent of discount offered 0% Motorcraft, 10%]
20%]| 0% Four Seasons 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better]|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 30, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Poppe Automotive Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle [Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln (O'Reilly Auto Enterprises,
Auto Air LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts
6100006620 HH|716 S. Frio Street 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield,
TX 78207 TX 78216 TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 MO 65802
item Description 210-225-3657
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Omega/Globall
Products/Four| Motorcraft, Four
Global/Four Seasons||  Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Seasons| Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber] Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price|
D|Price schedule number: AC8620) AP502, Computer Printout| RPTO086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online|
E|[Date of price schedule: 4/1/2016|| 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016! 3/29/16 N/A-Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber] NET Dealer Price, Computer Printout Jobber| Dealer Cost List Price
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles| 1 year limited warranty
4B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
5A OROFICE TUBES
A|Percent of discount offered 0% Motorcraft, 10%
20%) 0% Four Seasons 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better|
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Alf
' Conditioner/Santech/Global| Motorcraft, Four| Murray,
Globall Products/Four Seasons Seasons| Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft| Motorcraft|
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): . Jobber] Provided NET File! Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber| Wholesale List Price
D|Price schedule number: AC8620 AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online
E[Date of price schedule: 4/1/2016|f 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29116 N/A-Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber] NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber| Dealer Cost List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year| 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles Standard Mfr Warranty
5B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
6A AIC SWITCHES
A|Percent of discount offered
20%) 0%| 0% Motorcraft, 10%) 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better|
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Santech/Global
Products/Four|
Globall Seasons/ACDelco Motorcraft/AC Delco/Motorcraft| Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray!
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber] Provided NET File| Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale List Price
D|Price schedule number: ACB620) AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online|
E|Date of price schedule: 4/112016ff 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, Jan 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber Dealer Cost, List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month| Limited Lifetime| 2 years/Unlimited Miles 1 year limited warranty
6B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
7A IA/IC CONDENSERS
A|Percent of discount offered
20%j 0%| 0%, 10%) 15% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better|
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air}
Conditioner/Omega/Global,
Products/Four| Napa Condensers (Spectra
APDI/Motorcraftlf Seasons/APC/TYC] Motorcraft, OSC| - Premium), Motorcraft| Murray!
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobb: Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber Wholesale| List Price
D|Price schedule number: AC6620] AP502, Computer Printout RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online
E|Date of price schedule: 4/1/201 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobbe NET Dealer, Price 4| Jobber Dealer Cost List|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 30, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
l'l5oppe Automotive Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle [Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises,
Auto Air . LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts
6100006620 HH|716 S. Frio Street 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield,
TX 78207 TX 78216 TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 MO 65802
Item Description 210-225-3657
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year 12 Months from purchase 24/24k, 24 month 24 months/24,000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles, Standard Mfr Warranty
7B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
8A A/IC HOSES
A|Percent of discount offered
20%) 0%| 0%, 10%) 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better|
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air]
Conditioner/Omega/Global
Global/Delco/Four] Products/Four|
Seasons/Motorcraftff  Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft Motorcraft, AC Delco| Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft Murray, Motorcraft|
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobber Provided NET File| Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber| Wholesale List Price,
D|Price schedule number: AC6620) AP502, Computer Printout| RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online|
E|[Date of price schedule: 4/112016|f 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber] NET' Dealer, Price 4 Jobber| Dealer Cost| List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year| 12 Months from purchase| 24/24k, 24 month 24 Months/24,000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles Standard Mfr Warranty
8B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
9A AIC GASKETS
AlPercent of discount offered 20%) 0% 10% 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better,
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Omega/Global
Products/Four|
Four Season: Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft] Four Seasons| Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft| Murray!|
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobbel Provided NET File Jobber Jobber| Wholesale List Price
D|Price schedule number: AC662 Price 4 RPT086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online
E|Date of price schedule: 4/1/201 3/30/2016| 1-Mar-16 3/2016 3/29/16 N/A-Online
F|[Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobb NET Computer Printout Jobber| Dealer Cost List|
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year| 12 Months from purchase 24 months 24 Months/24,000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles| 1 year limited warranty
9B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
10A A/C O-RINGS
A|Percent of discount offered
20%j 0%| 0%, 10%) 30% Cost Plus 8% 41% or Better
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Omega/Global
Products/Four|
Four Seasonsff  Seasons/Delco/Motorcraft] Motorcraft, Four Seasons| Napa Temp (Four Seasons), Motorcraft Murray|
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobb: Provided NET File Distributor Net, Price 4 Jobber| Wholesale List Price
D|Price schedule number: AC6620 AP502, Computer Printout| RPTO086 FPS-3642 N/A-Online
E|[Date of price schedule: 4/1/2016|f 3/30/2016 Jan 1, 2016, March 1, 2016 3/2016 3/29/16, N/A-Online
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber] NET Dealer, Price 4 Jobber| Dealer Cost, List
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year| 12 Months from purchase| 24/24, 24 month 24 Months/24,000 miles| 2 years/Unlimited Miles! 1 year limited warranty’
10B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
11A A/IC ADDITIVES
A|Percent of discount offered 20%) 0%, 10% 30% Cost Plus 8% No Bid|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 30, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Automotive and Truck Air Conditioning Parts
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL ) LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Poppe Automotive Evapocore, Inc dba Carlisle |Full Service Auto Parts Genuine Parts Company North Park Lincoln O'Reilly Auto Enterprises,
Auto Air LLC dba O'Reilly Auto Parts
6100006620 HH|716 S. Frio Street 6411 San Pedro 4737 Broom St 6374 Rittiman Rd 9207 San Pedro Ave 233 S. Patterson
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Springfield,
TX 78207 TX 78216 TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 MO 65802
item Description 210-225-3657
B|Product identification (Manufacturer): Universal Air|
Conditioner/Omega/Global
Products/Four]
Seasons/Supercool/Johnson
Global/Four Seasons s-TCC Johnson AC Delco| Napa Temp (Four Seasons) Motorcraft|
C|Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.): Jobb Provided NET File Computer Generated Jobber Wholesale
D|Price schedule number: AC6620| Price 4 RPT086 FPS-3642
E|Date of price schedule: 4/1/2016}f 3/30/2016 Computer Printout 1/1/2016 3/2016, 3/29/16|
F|Price schedule column on which discount is based: Jobber NET Price-Jobber Jobber Dealer Cost
(i.e., distributor, net, wholesale, etc.)
G|Warranty: 1 year| 12 Months from purchase 24/24 12 Months| 2 years/Unlimited Miles
11B Specified Items for bid evaulation purposes only
Payment Terms Net 30 Days| 2%, 10 days| 2%, 10 days 2%, 10 days Net 30 Days 2%, 10 days




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Non-Local

Non-Local

Opened:
For:

6100007128

March 30, 2016

SAFD-Annual Contract for Emergency Vehicle Parts & Service

SC

Metro Fire Apparatus
Specialists
17350 SH 249

Item

Description

Est. Annual
Quantity

Houston,
TX 77064
713-692-0911

Frazer Ltd.

7227 Rampart Street,
Building A

Houston,
TX 77081
713-772-5511

Siddons Martin
Emergency Group, LLC
5511 Binz Engleman Rd.

Kirby,
TX 78219

1

1A,

1B.

1C.

1D.

1E.

Item 2

2B.

2C.

2D.

2E.

Emergency Parts
Deleted
Deleted

Pierce Fire Truck Parts

Percent of Discount Offered

Product Identification

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)
Price schedule number

Date of price schedule
distributor, net, wholesale, etc)

Spartan Fire Truck Parts

Percent of Discount Offered

Product Identification

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)
Price schedule number

Date of price schedule

distributor, net, wholesale, etc)

|Frazer Ambulance Parts

Percent of Discount Offered

Product Identification

Type of price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)
Price schedule number

Date of price schedule
distributor, net, wholesale, etc)

Labor

E-One Fire Truck Service
Labor Rate per Hour

Ferrara Fire Truck Service
Labor Rate per Hour

Pierce Fire Truck Service
Labor Rate per Hour

|Spartan Fire Truck Service

Labor Rate per Hour

Frazer Ambulance Service
Labor Rate per Hour

Payment Terms

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Cost x 1.88]
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A|

COST + 22%
Spartan Parts
N/A|
N/A
N/A

No Bid

No Bid|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$125.00

3%
Frazer Item/Part Number
OEM|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$111.50}

$111.50}

$111.50

$111.50

No Bid

$90.00]

Net 30

Net 30

$111.50

Net 30

Items 1A & 1B have been deleted and will be re-solicited at a later date
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation
Opened: March 25, 2016 Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for SAFD-Fleet Fueling Card System gﬁl:;; I\ézrketmg % :ze?asgkst\;z:ger Ve
P.O. Box 696000 |738 Highway 6 421 Creekside Dr.
6100007329 SC South Suite 650
Estimated |San Antonio, Houston, Downington,
Annual |TX 78269-6000 TX 77079 PA 19335
Item Description Quantity |[210-345-3721
1 ULTRA-LOW SULFUR NO. 2 DIESEL
FUEL 575,000
Rebate of 1.70% 65 Basis points
(Price of fuel at the| (Discount does not
pump) apply at Tier 1
Upcharge per Gallon $0.07500 Trucks Stops)
OPIS Composite Price for 3/25/2016 $1.24520)
US Energy Administration Weekly Retail
Gasoline and Diesel Prices for 3/28/2016 $1.99100 $1.99100
SUB TOTAL $1.32020 $1.99100 $1.99100
Discount per Gallon $0.03385 $0.01294
Fuel Cost $1.32020) $1.95715 $1.97806
Federal Excise Tax - ($0.24300) ($0.24300)
State Tax $0.20000 - -
Base Price Per Gallon $1.52020 $1.71415 $1.73506
State Enviromental/Delivery Fee $0.00073 $0.00073 $0.00073
Federal Environmental Fee $0.00190 $0.00190 $0.00190
Federal Lust Fee $0.00100 $0.00100 $0.00100
Total Fees $0.00363 $0.00363 $0.00363
Total Cost Per Gallon $1.52383 $1.71052 $1.73143
2 UNLEADED REGULAR GASOLINE 110,000
Rebate of 1.70% 65 Basis points
(Price of fuel at the| (Discount does not
pump) apply at Tier 1
Upcharge per Gallon $0.07500| Trucks Stops)
OPIS Composite Price for 3/25/2016 $1.28650
US Energy Administration Weekly Retail
Gasoline and Diesel Prices for 3/28/2016 $1.80600 $1.80600
SUB TOTAL $1.36150| $1.80600 $1.80600
Discount per Gallon $0.03070 $0.01174
Fuel Cost $1.36150 $1.77530 $1.79426
Federal Excise Tax - ($0.18300) ($0.18300)
State Tax $0.20000 - -
Base Price Per Gallon $1.56150 $1.59230 $1.61126
State Enviromental/Delivery Fee $0.00083 $0.00083 $0.00083
Federal Environmental Fee $0.00190 $0.00190 $0.00190
Federal Lust Fee $0.00100 $0.00100 $0.00100
Total Fees $0.00373 $0.00373 $0.00373
Total Cost Per Gallon $1.56523 $1.58856 $1.60753
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

April 12, 2016
Sole Source
For: Annual Contract for Heating, Ventilation, & Air-Conditioning Siemens Industry
(HVAC) Control Services of APOGEE Building Automation
System
6100007338 SM  |12001 Network Blvd., Suite 318
San Antonio,
TX 78249
Item Description QTY [210-529-7543

1 SYSTEM PERFORMANCE UPDATES, UPGRADES,
TECHNICAL SUPPORT SERVICES, CUSTOMER
SUPPORT SERVICES
Year 1 Unit Price 4 $5,702.00
Year 1 Extended Price $22,808.00]
Year 2 Unit Price 4 $5,873.25
Year 2 Extended Price $23,493.00
Year 3 Unit Price 4 $6,049.25
Year 3 Extended Price $24,197.00|
Year 4 Unit Price 4 $6,230.75
Year 4 Extended Price $24,923.00
Total for Item 1 $95,421.00

2 BILLABLE SERVICE CALLS (Automation Specialist)
Straight Time Hourly Price 16 $135.00
Straight Time Est. Annual Cost $2,160.00
Reg. Overtime Hourly Price 8 $202.50
Reg. Overtime Est. Annual Cost $1,620.00
Other Hourly Price 6 $270.00
Other Est. Annual Cost $1,620.00
Total for Item 2 $5,400.00]

3 SIEMENS PARTS
Overall Evaluation Purposes Only and represent
commonly used items
RTS, BAU HSNG, PT1K , 385A, FF, NC 10
Unit Price . $81.74
Extended Price $817.40
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

April 12, 2016
Sole Source
For: Annual Contract for Heating, Ventilation, & Air-Conditioning Siemens Industry
(HVAC) Control Services of APOGEE Building Automation
System :
6100007338 SM 12001 Network Blvd., Suite 318
San Antonio,
TX 78249
Item Description QTY [210-529-7543
IMM WELL SNSR, NI 1K OHM,SIEMS, 2.5" LG 10
Unit Price $39.54L
Extended Price $395.40)
PROG. BACNET FAN COIL TEC (LONG) 10
Unit Price $230.06I
Extended Price $2,300.60
ENCLOSURE ASSY,TEC 10
Unit Price $46.69
Extended Price $466.9
RTS, TEC DIG., F-F, NL 10
Unit Price $75.93|
Extended Price $759.30
Payment Terms Net 30
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