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AN ORDINANCE 2 0 1 6- 0 9 - 0 8 - 0 8 '7 6 

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING 
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED 
ANNUAL COST OF $165,000.00: (A) · PATHMARK TRAFFIC 
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC., IMPACT RECOVERY SYSTEMS, INC., 
AND SAFE LANE TRAFFIC SUPPLY FOR AIRPORT SAFETY 
TRAFFIC CONTROL PRODUCTS, (B) CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC 

. CONTROLS, INC. FOR AUDIBLE PEDESTRIAN SIGNALS, AND (C) 
EVERBRIDGE, INC. FOR SUBSCRIPTIONS FOR AVIATION 
EMERGENCY NOTIFICATION. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with commodities and 
services on an annual basis for the terms of the contracts; and 

WHEREAS, these bids are from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) 
PathMark Traffic Products of Texas, Inc. (Items lA and IB), Impact Recovery Systems, Inc. 
(Items 1 C, 2A and 2B), and SafeLane Traffic Supply (Item 3) for airport safety traffic control 
products, (B) Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. for audible pedestrian signals, and (C) 
Everbridge, Inc. for subscriptions for aviation emergency notification; and 

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Centerline Supply (Item 1 C) and N-Line Traffic 
Maintenance failed to meet the City'S specifications and/or requirements for airport safety traffic 
control products; and 

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code section 271.103 provides that a local 
government may purchase goods or services available under Federal supply schedules of the 
United States General Services Administration (GSA) and such purchase satisfies any state law 
requiring competitive bidding; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves three low qualifying bid contracts, one low bid contract, 
and one contract procured through a GSA contract; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids from the following companies to furnish the City with: (A) PathMark 
Traffic Products of Texas, Inc. (Items lA and IB), Impact Recovery Systems, Inc. (Items lC, 2A 
and 2B), and SafeLane Traffic Supply (Item 3) for airport safety traffic control products, (B) 
Consolidated Traffic Controls, Inc. for audible pedestrian signals, and (C) Everbridge, Inc. for 
subscriptions for aviation emergency notification. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto 
and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of bids are available for inspection 
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in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bid submitted by Centerline Supply (Item 
I C) and N-Line Traffic Maintenance failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders and payment is 
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the 
Fiscal Year 2016 budget and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through 
their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances. 

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 8th day of September, 2016. 

Ivy R. Taylor 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

~ City ttomey , ... \ 
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Agenda Item: 6 ( in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9,11, 11A, 11B, 11e, 11D, 11E, 11F, 11G, 12, 14, 15, 16, 16A, 16B ) 

Date: 09/08/2016 

Time: 09:17:27 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an 
estimated annual cost of $165,000.00: (A) PathMark Traffic Products of Texas, Inc., Impact Recovery 
Systems Inc., and Safelane Traffic Supply for airport safety traffic control products, (B) Consolidated 
Traffic Controls, Inc. for audible pedestrian signals, and (C) Everbridge, Inc. for subscription for 
aviation emergency notification. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief 
Financial Officer, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ivy R. Taylor Mayor x 

Roberto C. Trevino District 1 x x 

Alan Warrick District 2 x x 

Rebecca Yiagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x 

0 /0 /")01 C. 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 24, 2016 
Non-Local Local Local 

For: NC for Airport Safety Traffic Pathmark Traffic Impact Recovery Safelane Traffic 
Control Products Products Systems Inc. Supply 

P.O. Box 1066 4955 Stout Dr. 1206 W. Blanco 
6100007612 SM Rd. 

San Marcos, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78667 TX 78219 TX 78232 

Item Description aTY 800-547-0874 21 0-736-4477 512-847-0443 

1 DELINEATORS 

1A 36" White EFX Multi-Purpose 100 
Post 
Unit Price $31.68 No Bid $41.75 
Total Price $3,168.00 $4,175.00 
Percentage between lowest 31 .79% 
responsive bid and local bid: 
Price differential $10.07 

1B 36" Yellow EFX Multi- 100 
Purpose Post 
Unit Price $31.68 No Bid $41.75 
Total Price $3,168.00 $4,175.00 
Percentage between lowest 31.79% 
responsive bid and local bid: 
Price differential $10.07 

1C 36" Yellow Self-Righting Flex 200 
Post with Fixed Base 
Unit Price $48.78 $46.25 $49.00 
Total Price $9,756.00 $9,250.00 $9,800.00 

10 DELETED N/A N/A N/A 

Page 1 

Local 
Centerline Supply 

1731 S. San 
Marcos St. #932 

San Antonio, 
TX 78207 

$42.05 
$4,205.00 

32.73% 

$10.37 

$42.05 
$4,205.00 

32.73% 

$10.37 

NAS 
$45.99 

$9,198.00 

N/A 

Local 
N-Line Traffic 
Maintenance 

2482 S. Foster Rd. 

San Antonio, 
TX 78220 

NAS 

$36.97 
$3,697.00 

$36.97 
$3,697.00 

$57.42 
$11,484.00 

N/A 

Local 
Ram Tool & Supply 

610 Lanark St. 
#101 

San Antonio, 
TX 78218 

No Bid 

No Bid. 

No Bid 

N/A 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 24, 2016 
Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local 

For: AlC for Airport Safety Traffic Path mark Traffic Impact Recovery Safelane Traffic Centerline Supply N-Line Traffic Ram Tool & Supply 
Control Products Products Systems Inc. Supply Maintenance 

P.O. Box 1066 4955 Stout Dr. 1206 W. Blanco 1731 S. San 2482 S. Foster Rd. 610 Lanark St. 
6100007612 SM Rd. Marcos St. #932 #101 

San Marcos, San Antonio, San Antonio , San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
TX 78667 TX 78219 TX 78232 TX 78207 TX 78220 TX 78218 

Item Description QTY 800-547-0874 21 0-736-44 77 512-847-0443 

2 SOLLARDS 

2A 6" Diameter x 42" Tall, Yellow 20 
Bollard, Slow Stop brand or 
approved equal 

Unit Price No Bid $629.00 No Bid $872.00 No Bid No Bid 
Total Price $12,580.00 $17,440.00 

2B 4" Diameter x 42" Tall x 48" 10 
Wide Horseshoe Bollard, 
Slow Stop brand or approved 
equal 

Unit Price No Bid $269.00 No Bid $988.56 No Bid No Bid 
Total Price $2,690.00 $9,885.60 

3 CONES 

36" Cone with 4" & 6" White 250 
Reflective Collar and "SAT" 
Stencil NAS 
Unit Price $22.85 No Bid $21.50 $19.75 $23.24 No Bid 
Total Price $5,712.50 $5,375.00 $4,937.50 $5,810.00 

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total 

Estimated Annual Award $6,336.00 $24,520.00 $5,375.00 

Item 1 D deleted and no longer required 

Page 2 



Opened : 

For: 

6100007440 
, 

Item 

1 

2 

3 

August 1, 2016 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Annual Contract for Audible Pedestrian Signals Non-Local 
Consolidated Traffic Controls, 
Inc, 

AJ 1016 Enterprise Place 
Arlington, 
TX 76001 

Description Quantity 817-265-3421 
2 Wire Navigator pedestrian push 
button unit 120 
Brand Offered: Polara 
Model Offered: EN2 Navigator 
Unit Price $377,20 
Extended Price $45,264,00 

2 Wire Control Unit (One per 
intersection) 25 
Brand Offered: Polara 
Model Offered: CCU2EN 
Unit Price $2,310,00 
Extended Price $57,750,00 

Special Voice Message, user 
programmable software 1 
Brand Offered: CTC 
Model Offered: NIA 
Unit Price $24,00 
Extended Price $24,00 

Delivery 45 days 

Payment Terms Net 30 

Estimated Annual Total $103,038,00 

Estimated Annual Award $103,038.00 

1/1 

Non-Local 
'Paradigm Traffic Systems, 
Inc, 
2201 E, Division S1, 
Arlington, 
TX 76011 

Polara 
Navigator 

$515,00 
$61 ,800,00 

Polara 
Navigator 
$2,990,00 

$74,750,00 

Polara 
Navigator 

$385,00 
$385,00 

45 days 

Net 30 

$136,935,00 



Opened: 

For: 

6100007671 

Item 

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

July 1, 2016 
Annual Contract Subscription for Aviation Emergency 
Notification 

Description 

Subscription to Everbridge Mass Notification 

Period 1 Unit Price (Partial Year 9/14116-7/18/17) 
Period 1 Extended Price 

Period 2 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/17-7/18/18) 
Period 2 Extended Price 

Period 3 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/18-7/18/19) 
Period 3 Extended Price 

Subscription to Incident Management -Incident 
Communications 

Period 1 Unit Price (Partial Year 9/14/16-7/18/17) 
Period 1 Extended Price 

Period 2 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/17-7/18/18) 
Period 2 Extended Price 

Period 3 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/18-7/18/19) 
Period 3 Extended Price 

Subscription to Everbridge Interactive Visibility 

Period 1 Unit Price (Partial Year 9/14/16-7/18/17) 
Period 1 Extended Price 

Period 2 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/17-7/18/18) 
Period 2 Extended Price 

Period 3 Unit Price (Full Year 7/1 9/18-7/18/19) 
Period 3 Extended Price 

Usage Service: SO,OOO Non-Emergency Messaging 
Minutes 

Period 1 Unit Price (Partial Year 9/14/16-7/18/17) 
Period 1 Extended Price 

Period 2 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/17-7/18/18) 
Period 2 Extended Price 

Period 3 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/18-7/18/19) 
Period 3 Extended Price 

Everbridge ContactBridge (Mobile Member) 

Period 1 Unit Price (Partial Year 9/14/16-7/18/17) 
Period 1 Extended Price 

Period 2 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/17-7/18/18) 
Period 2 Extended Price 

Period 3 Unit Price (Full Year 7/19/18-7/18/19) 
Period 3 Extended Price 

Web Delivery Training Hourly Price 

On-Site Training Daily Price 

Payment Terms 

1/1 

GSA 

Everbridge, Inc. 

155 North Lake Avenue 

MFB Suite 900 
Pasadena 

Quantity CA 91101 
781-373-9845 

1 $8,394.20 
$8,394.20 

1 $10,073.00 
$10,073.00 

1 $10,073.00 
$10,073.00 

1 $2,518.3C 
$2,518.30 

1 $3,022.0C 
$3,022.0C 

1 $3,022.0C 
$3,022.00 

1 $2,518.30 
$2,518.30 

1 $3,022.00 
$3,022.00 

1 $3,022.00 
$3,022.00 

1 $5,313.00 
$5,313.00 

1 $5,313.00 
$5,313.00 

1 $5,313.00 
$5,313.00 

1 $1 ,259.20 
$1 ,259.20 

1 $1 ,511.00 
$1 ,511.00 

1 $1 ,511 .00 
$1 ,511 .00 

$170.00 

$3,294.00 

Net 30 


