
LC 
9129/16 
Item No. 6 

AN ORDINANCE 2 0 1 6 - 0 9 - 2 9 - 0 '7 2 4 

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM COOPER EQUIPMENT CO., 
DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, LLC, GRAPEVINE 
DCJ, LLC, GUNN CHEVROLET, LTD, H & E EQUIPMENT SERVICES 
AND VERMEER TEXAS-LOUISIANA TO PROVIDE 14 
REPLACEMENT LIGHT, MEDIUM AND HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS, 

.VANS AND HEAVY EQUIPMENT FOR A TOTAL COST OF 
$1,599,861.71, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND 
REPLACEMENT FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light, medium and 
heavy duty trucks, vans and heavy equipment; and 

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Doggett Equipment Services Group LTD (Item 2), Grande 
Truck Center Bid #1 (Items 4, 5 and 9), Ewald Tractor (Item 8), Griffith Ford Seguin, LLC 
(Items 9 and 12), Silsbee Ford (Item 9), and Gunn Chevrolet, LTD (Item 12) failed to meet the 
City's specifications and/or requirements; and 

WHEREAS, Vermeer Texas-Louisana was the lowest, responsive bidder for item 2 for a cost of 
$651,135.00; and 

WHEREAS, Cooper Equipment Co. was the lowest, responsive bidder for item 3 for a cost of 
$66,107.00; and 

WHEREAS, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC was the lowest, responsive bidder for 
items 4,5,6, and 9 for a total cost of$720,735.00; and 

WHEREAS, H & E Equipment Services was the lowest, responsive bidder for item 8 for a cost 
of$51,748.00; and 

WHEREAS, Grapevine DCl, LLC was the lowest, responsive bidder for item 12 for a cost of 
$46,664.00; and 

WHEREAS, the bid for item 14 for a cost of$63,472.71 submitted by Gunn Chevrolet, LTD, a 
City Business as defined by the City's Local Preference Program, is within 3 percent of the 
lowest bid, which was from Grapevine DCl, LLC, a bidder which is not a City Business; NOW 
THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bids from Vermeer Texas-Louisana (Item 2), Cooper 
Equipment Co. (Item 3), Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC, (Items 4, 5, 6, and 9), H & E 
Equipment Services (Item 8), Grapevine DCl, LLC (Item 12) and Gunn Chevrolet, LTD (Item 



14) to provide the City of San Antonio with light, medium and heavy duty trucks, vans and 
heavy equipment for a total cost of $1,599,861.71 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent 
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and 
endorsements. The bid tabulation is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as 

. Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing 
Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the low bids from Doggett Equipment 
Services Group LTD (Item 2), Grande Truck Center Bid #1 (Items 4, 5 and 9), Ewald Tractor 
(Item 8), Griffith Ford Seguin, LLC (Items 9 and 12), Silsbee Ford (Item 9), and Gunn 
Chevrolet, LTD (Item 12) failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that, pursuant to the City's Local Preference 
Program, passed by ordinance number 2013-03-21-0167 and as amended by ordinance number 
2014-11-13-0923, Gunn Chevrolet, LTD (Item 14), a City Business, is entitled to award. 

SECTION 4. Funding in the amount of $1,599,861.71 for this ordinance is available in Fund 
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5501055, as part of the Fiscal Year 
2016 Budget. 

SECTION 5. Payment not to exceed $66,107.00 is authorized to Cooper Equipment Co. and 
should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 6. Payment not to exceed $720,735.00 is authorized to Doggett Freightliner of South 
Texas, LLC and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 7. Payment not to exceed $46,664.00 is authorized to Grapevine DCl, LLC and 
should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 8. Payment not to exceed $63,472.71 is authorized to Gunn Chevrolet, LTD and 
should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 9. Payment not to exceed $51,748.00 is authorized to H & E Equipment Services 
and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 10. Payment not to exceed $651,135.00 is authorized to Vermeer Texas - Louisiana 
and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 11. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP 
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 
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SECTION 12. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 29th day of September, 2016. 

Ivy R. Taylor 

) APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
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Voting Results Interface Page 4 of46 

Agenda Item: 6 ( in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19,20,21,25,26,27,28,29,30, 
31,33,34,35,36,37,38,39,40, 42A, 42B, 43A, 43B, 43C, 43D) 

Date: 09129/2016 

Time: 09:18:41 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Cooper Equipment Co., Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, 
Grapevine DCJ, LLC, Gunn Chevrolet, LTD, H & E Equipment Services and Vermeer Texas-
Louisiana to provide 14 replacement light, medium and heavy duty trucks, vans and heavy equipment 
for a total cost of$I,599,861.71, funded from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund. [Ben 
Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ivy R. Taylor Mayor x 

Roberto C. Trevino District 1 x 

Alan Warrick District 2 x x 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 x 

Rey Saldana District 4 x 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 x 

Ray Lopez District 6 x 

Cris Medina District 7 x 

Ron Nirenberg District 8 x 

Joe Krier District 9 x 

Michael Gallagher District 10 x x 

http://cosawebN otelnterface/Default.aspx 9/29/2016 



Opened: July 8, 2016 
Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duly Venneer Texas· 
Trucks. Vans and Heavy Equipment Louisiana 

6100007554 LD 165931H-35 North 

Item Description QTY Selma. 
TX 78154 
210-337-7700 

1 DELETED: 

2 Brush Tub Grinder with Loader: 1 
Price Each: $651 ,135.00 
Total : $651 ,135.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 Vennee 

TG5000L 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cat C15 Tier 4 Final 
(Include SAE net HP): 540 hp Turbo 

Cha'lled after Cooled 
SAE J1995 

Warranty: 1 Year or 1,000 
HoUr! 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Venneer Texas . 
Louisiana 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 165931H-35 North, 
Selma, TX 78154 

Delivery: 90 Day, 
Production Cut-off Date: 12-31-11 
Last day order can be placed without 9-30-11 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Ye, 
date: 

3 Pneumatic, Tired Roller. 1 
Price Each: No Bid 
Total : 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Wanranly: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 
Production Cut-off Date: 
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date: 

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Local Local Local Non local Local 
Cooper Equipment Doggett Freighlliner H & E Equipment Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Gunn Chevrolet. L TO 
Co. ofSouth Texas, LLC Services 

17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 East 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 

San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio, Grapevine. Selma, 
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 TX 76051 TX 78154 
210-657-5151 210-277-4373 210-655-0048 210-599-5000 

NO Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid NO Bid 

$66,107.00 No Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid 
$68,107.00 

2016 Altas-Copac 
Dvnaoac CP1200 

Cummins aSF 2.8 
T4F 

1 Year on the RoIV2 
Year on Engine 

Cooper Equipment 
Co. 

17474 Judson Rd .. 
San Antonio, TX 

78247 
45-60 Days 

Not Provided 
Dec-1I 

Yes 

Prepared by Purchasing 91212016 

Non·Loeal 
Bane Machinery 

2449 Manana Drive 

Dallas, 
TX 75220 

$686,081 .41 
$686,081.41 

2016 Diamond Z 
DZT1352B 

Caterpillar C27 I Tier 
IV Interim 1 875 HP 

Structural warranty 
Expires 1 Year or 

1,000 Hours, 
Components warranty 

Expires 1 Year or 
1,000 Hours 

Not Provided 

Not Provided 

140 Days 
812212016 
8/2212016 

Prices are good for 45 
days 

No Bid 

Local 
Doggett Equipment 
Services Group L TO 

4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway 
San AntonkJ, 
TX 78219 

NAS 
$612,196.00 
$612,196.00 

2016, Morbark Model 
1100 shipped new 
direct from factory 

Caterpillar Model C-
18 F4 630 HP 

1 Year unlimited 
hours on tub grinder 

assembly, trailer, 
hammer mill assembly 

and clutch. 2 years 
on engine, 3 years 
major components 

Doggett Equipment 
Services Group, Inc. 

4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway, San 

Antonio , TX 78219 

30-90 Days 
January 1st, 2017 

December 20th, 2017 

No 

No Bid 

Yes 
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City of San AntoniO Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8,2016 

Non-Local Local Local Local Non Local Local Non-Local Local 
For: Purchase of Light. Medium, Heavy Duty Vermeer Texas · Cooper Equipment Doggett Freightliner H & E Equipment Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Gunn Chevrolet. L TO Bane Machinery Doggett Equipmenl 

Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment Louisiana Co. of Soulll Texas, LLC Services Services Group L TO 

6100007554 LD 16593 I K-35 North 17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 Easl 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 2449 Manana Drive 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway 

Item Description QTY Selma, San Antonio, Ccinverse, San Antonio, Grapevine, Selma, Dallas, San Antonio. 
TX 78154 TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 TX 76051 TX 78154 TX 75220 TX 78219 
210-337-7700 210-657-5151 210-277-4373 210-655-0048 210-599-5000 

4 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility Bed Crane 1 
Truck: 
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $115,791.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total : $115,791 .00 
Year. Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2017 Freightline 
Offered: M2-1OE 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins ISB 6.7. 
(Include SAE nel HPJ: 260 HP 1660 TO 

Transmission Offered: Allison.30oo RDS 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 2 years Unlimited . 
Mile 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Doggett Freightline 
Facility Name: of Soulll Texas, LLC 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Facility 8700 IH 10 East, 
Address: Converse, TX 78109 

Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane 2016 Warner Bodies -
I Offered: WS2132 - Stellar , 

EC6000 Crane with 
Telescopic Bo.om 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty: 1 Yea 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service Coball Truck 
Provider Facility Name: Equipment 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 112181H 10 East. 
Provider Facility Address: Converse, TX 78109 

I 
Delivery: 120-180 Day 
Production Cut--off Date: 1213112016 
Last day order can be placed without 1213112016 
missing cut--off date: 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut--off Ye 
date: 

-----L-
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City of San AnIiiIlo Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8 , 2016 
Non-Local Local Local Local Non Local ' Local Non-Local Local 

For: Purchase of Light. Medium, Heavy Duty VenneerTexas· Cooper Equipment Doggett Freightliner H & E Equipment Grapevine OCJ, LLC. Gunn Chevrolet, L TO Bane Machinery Doggett Equipment 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment louisiana Co. of South Texas, LLC Services Services Group L TO 

6100007554 LD 16593 I H-35 North 17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 East 5327 Tex -COn Rd. 2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 2449 Manana Drive 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway 

~em Description QTY Selma, San Antonio, Converse, San Antonio. Grapevine, Selma. Dallas, San Antonio. 
TX 78154 TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 TX 76051 TX 78154 TX 75220 TX 78219 
210-337-7700 210~57-5151 210-277-4373 210~55-0048 210-599-5000 

5 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility 8ed Crane 1 
Truck: 
Price Each: NO Bid NO Bid $1 13,234.00 No Bid NO Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid 
Total : $113,234.00 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2017 FreighUine 
Offered: M2-~~ 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins ISB 6.7, 
( Include SAE net HPJ: 260 HP 1660 TO 

Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 2 years - Unlimited 
Mile 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Doggett Freightline 
Facility Name: of South Texas, LLC 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 8700 IH 10 East, 
Facility Address: Converse, TX 78109 
Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane 2016 Warner FBA -
Offered: Stetlar EC6000 

Telescopic Crane 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty: 1 Yea 
Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service CobattTrucl 
Prov;der Facility Name: Equipmen 
Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 112181H 10 East, 
Provider facility Address: Converse, TX 78109 
Detivery: 120-180 Day 
Production Cut-off Date: 12/3112016 
Last day order can be placed without 12/3112016 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Ye, 
date: 

--
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8. 2016 
Non-Local Local Local Local Non Local Local Non-Local Local 

For: Purchase of Light. Medium. Heavy Duty Venneer Texas- Cooper Equipment Doggett Freightliner H & E Equipment Grapevine DCJ. LLC. Gunn Chevrolet. L TO Bane Machinery Doggett Equipment 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment Louisiana Co. of South Texas, lLC Services Services Group l TO 

6100007554 LD 16593 I H-35 North 17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 East 5327 T ex -Con Rd. 2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 2449 Manana Drive 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway 

Item DeSCription QTY Selma. San Antonia , Converse, San Antonk>, Grapevine. Selma. Dallas, San Antonio, 
TX 78154 TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 TX 76051 TX 78154 TX 75220 TX 78219 
210-337-7700 210-657-5151 210-277-4373 210-655-0048 210-599-5000 

6 1 ~.501-26.oo0 GVW Chipper Truck: 1 

Price Each: No Bid NO Bid $92,464.00 No Bid NO Bid NeBid NeBid N08id 
Total : $92,464.00 
Year, Make & Model Ca.b & Chassis 2017 Freightliner 
Offered: . M2-1(){ 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins ISB 6.7. 
(Include SAE net HP): 260 HP /660 TO 

Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS 

Cab & ChasSis Warranty: 2 years - Unlimited 
Mile, 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Doggett Freightline 
Facility Name: of South Texas. LLC 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 8700 IH 10 East. 
Address: Converse. TX 78109 

Year. Make & Model Catch Bodyl8ox 2016 Arbortech 
Offered: 

Catch Body/Box Warranty: 1 Yea 

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Provider Coban Truck 
Facility Name: Equipment 

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Provider 112181H 10 East. 
Facility Address: Converse. TX 78109 

Delivery: 120-180 Day 
Production Cut-off Date: 1213112016 
last day order can be placed without 1213112016 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
Idate: 

Ye, 
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City of s",n Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8, 2016 
No"..Local Local Local Local Non Local Local Non.Local Local 

For. Purchase of Ught. Medium, Heavy Duty Vermeer Texas· Cooper Equipment Doggett Freightllner H & E Equipmen1 Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Gunn Chevrolet, L TO Bane Machinery Doggett Equipment 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment Louisiana Co. of South Texas, LLC SeMces SeNices Group L TO 

6100007554 LD 165931H-35 North 17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 East 5327 Tex -COn Rd. 2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 2449 Manana Drive 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway 

Itom Descnptlon QTY Selma, San Antonio. Converse. San Antonio, Grapevine, Selma, p allas, San Antonio, 
TX 78154 TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 TX 76051 TX 78154 TX 75220 TX 78219 
21 0-337-7700 2 1 0~57-51 51 210-277-4373 2 1 ~55-oo48 210-599-5000 

7 DELETED: 

8 2,000 Gallon Trailer Mounted Water 
Tanker: 2 
Price Each: No Bkl No Bid No Bid $25,874.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $51 ,748.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 C&I Equipment, 

2035 Big Dog 

Wanranty: 1 Year on trailer. 2 
years on pump, 3 

years on tank 

Warranty Serv;ce Provider Facility Name: H & E Equipment 
Services 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5327 Tex-COn Rd., 
San Antonto TX 

78220 
Delivery: 30 Days 
Production Cut~ff Date: 12-1 -1E 
Last day order can be placed without 12-1-1€ 
missing cut..off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Nc 
Id.t~ : . __ . 

Prepared by Purchasing 91212016 5 of 16 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8, 2016 
Non-Local Local Local Local Non Local Local Non-Local Local 

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty VenneerTexas - Cooper Equipment Doggett Freighlliner H & E Equipment Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Gunn Chevrolet. L TO Bane Machinery Doggett Equipment 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment Louisiana Co. of South Texas, llC Services Services Group L TO 

6100007554 LD 16593 1H-35 North 17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 East 5327 T ex -Con Rd. 2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 2449 Manana Drive 4001 N. PanAm 
Expressway 

Item Description QTY Selma, San Antonio. Converse. San Antonio, Grapevine, Selma, Dallas, San Antonio. 
TX 78154 TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 TX 76051 TX 78154 TX 75220 TX 78219 
210-337-7700 210-657-5151 210-277-4373 210-65:;'0048 210-599-5000 

9 >33,000 GVW Utility Bed 65' Ground 2 
Reach Aerial Truck: 
Base Unit Price (Each): No Bid No Bid $197,653.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $395,306.00 

Additional Cost: 
Optional Bucket Rotator to Dump Water 
and Debris: 
Option 1: Deleted 
Total : 
Option 2: Hydraulic Controlled Rotator 2 $1 ,875.00 
Addrtional Cost: 
Total : $3,750.00 

Additional Cost 
Optional bucket cover: 
Option 1: Deleted 
Total : 
Option 2: Hard Bucket Cover Additional 2 $95.00 
Cost: 
Total : $190.00 

Total with Options: $399,246.00 

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2017 Freightline 
Offered: M2-1 01 Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins ISL 9. 270 
(Include SAE net HP): HP 1800 TO 

Transmission Offered: Allison 3000 RDS 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 2 years - Unlimited 
Mile 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Doggett Freighllin" 
Facility Name: of South Texas, llC 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 8700 IH 10 East. 
Address: Converse. TX 78109 
Year, Make & Model Catch BcidylBox 2016 Altee AA67 
Offered: 
Aerial lift and Platfonn Warranty: 1 Year Parts & latx> 
Aerial lift and Platform Warranty Service Altee Field Support 1 
Provider Facilitv Name: DOQQett FreiQhttiner 
Aerial lift and Platform Warranty Service 8700 IH 10 East, 
Provider Facility Address: Converse, TX 78109 

Delivery: 270-330 
Production Cut-off Date: 1213112016 
last day order can be placed without 1213112016 
missinQ cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

Idate: 
Nc 

Prepared by Purcha sing 912/20 16 6 of 16 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8, 2016 
Non-Local Local Local Local Non Local Local Non-Local Local 

For: Purchase of light, Medium, Heavy Duty Vermeer Texas· Cooper Equipment Doggett Freightliner H & E Equipment Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Gunn Chevrolet. L TO Bane Machinery Doggett Equipment 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment louisiana Co. of South Texas, LLC Services Services Group L TO 

6100007554 LD 16593 1H-:i5 North 17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 East 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 2449 Manana Drive 4001 N. PanAm 

Hem Description QTY Selma, San Antonio, Converse, 
Expressway 

San Antonio, Grapevine, Selma, Dallas, San Antonio, 
TX 78154 TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 TX 76051 TX 78154 TX 75220 TX 78219 
210-337-7700 210-657-5151 210-277-4373 210-655-0048 210-599-5000 

10 DELETED: 

11 DELETED: 

12 Mini Van (Cargo) 2 NAS 
Price Each: NO Bid No Bid No Bid NeBid $23,332.00 $21 ,411 .80 No Bid No Bid 
Total: $46,664.00 $42,823.60 
Prompt Payment Discount 2% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $45,730.72 
Discount 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017 ram Promaste 2017 Chevrolet City 

Ci~ Express LT 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 2.4 L, 14, 178 hp LQA, 2.0 Liter Gas 14, 
(Include SAE net HP): 131 HP 

• exception GVWR 
47~1 

Warranty: 3 yr./36,ooO Mile, 3 Yr or 36K BTB. 5 Yr 
5yrl100,ooO Mile or 100K Powertrain 

limited Powertrain 
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Any Dodge Chrysler, Gunn Chevrolet. L TO 

~eep. Ram Dealership 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Any Dodge Chrysler, 16550 IH 35 N. , 
~eep. Ram Dealership Selma, TX 78154 

Delivery: 120 Days 110 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: June 2017 5/17 Startof2017 

Last day order can be placed without Est. 4/15/17 
Production 9/17 

5/17 
missinQ cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
Idate: 

No No 

Prepared by Purchasing 91212016 7 of 16 



Opened: July 8, 2016 

For: Purchase of light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment 

6100007554 LD 

Item Description QTY 

13 DELETED: 

14 }\ Ton Full Size Regular Cab 4x2: 
Price Each: 
Total : 
Prompt Payment Discount 
T olal Cost with Prompt Payment 
Discount 
Percentage between lowest responsive 
bid and local bid 
Price Differential 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 
Production Cut-off Date: 

Last day order can be placed without 
mlssll1Q cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date: 

Payment Terms: 

Total: 
Total Award: 

ROO Equipment Co. submitled a No Bid. Item 10 was deleted 
and combined with item 9. Items 1, 7, 11 and 13 were deleted 
and will be bid at a later date. 
Ag-Pro Texas bid item number 7 only which is deleted. 

3 

Non·Local 
Venneer Texas -
Louisiana 

t65931H-35 North 

Selma, 
TX 78t54 
210-337-7700 

NO Bid 

$651135.00 

City 01 San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Local Local Local 
Cooper Equipment Doggett Freightliner H & E Equipment 
Co. of South Texas, lLC Services 

17474 Judson RD. 8700 IH 10 East 5327 Tex -Con Rd. 

San AntoniO. Converse, San Antonio , 
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 78220 
210-657-5151 2tO-277-4373 210-655-0048 

No Bid NO Bid No Bid 

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

$66107.00 $720735.00 $51 748.00 
S66.10·',OO S720.735,OO S. 748.00 

Prepared by Purchasing 91212016 

Non Local Local Non-Local Local 
GrapeVine DCJ, LLC, Gunn Chevrolet, l TO Bane Machinery Doggett Equipment 

Services Group L TO 

2601 William Tate 16550 IH 35 N. 2449 Manana Drive 40Ql N. PanAm 
Expressway 

Grapevine, Selma, Dallas, San Antonio . 
TX 76051 TX 78t54 TX 75220 TX 78219 

210-599-5000 

$21 ,531 .00 $21,157.57 NO Bid No Bid 
$64,593.00 $63,472.71 

2% 
$63,301.14 

0.27% 

$171 .57 
2017 Ram 1500 2017 Chevrolet 

DSiL61 , CC15703, 2WD 1/2 
Bedliner/Hitch Delete Ton Rea Cab 
Dodge 3.6 L V6, 305 GM L V3 V6, 265 HP 

He Ne 
3 yr. I 36,000 Mile, 3 Yror 36K BTB. 5 Y 

5yr/l00,OOO Mile or 100K Powertrain 
Limited Powertrain 

I Any Dodge Chrysler, Gunn Chevrolet. L TO 
Jeep. Ram Dealership 

Any Dodge Chrysler, 16550 IH 35 N., 
Jeep, Ram Dealership Selma, TX 78154 

75-90 Days 90-110 Days 
June 2017 6117 (2017 Starto( 

Production 9112/17) 
Est. 4/15/17 6/17 

Not Provided Nc 

2% Net 10 Days Net 30 

<111257.00 <106296.31 <686 081.41 <612196.00 
~ 4 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8. 2016 Local Local 
Non Local Bld.1 Bld.2 Non Local Local Non Local Local 

For: Purchase of Light. Medium. Heavy Duly Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment LLC. Industries, Inc. 

6100007554 LD 1900W. I-10 4562IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East 1850 W.IH·10 8922 IH 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 3740 S. E.Loop 410 

Hem DeSCription QTY Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, Seguin, Converse, Silsbee. San Antonio, 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219- TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 

830·303-3673 

1 DELETED: 

2 Brush Tub Grinder with loader: 1 
Price Each: NO Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total : 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranty: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 
Production Cut-off Date: 
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date: 

3 Pneumatic, Tired Roller. 1 
Price Each: No Bid NO Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO Bid $103.921 .00 
Total: $103.921.00 
Year. Make & Model Offered: 2016Bomag 

BW11RH5 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kubota V3307. 74 hp 
(include SAE net HP): 
Warranty: 1 Year Standard, 

Engine 2 Years 
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Waukesha-Pearce 

Industries. Inc. 
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 3740 S. E. Loop 410. 

San Antonio, 
TX 78222 

DeliverY: 9().120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: October 1. 2016 
Last day order can be placed without October 1. 2016 
missing cut-off date: 

I 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off NO

i date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8, 2016 Local Local 
Non LoCal Bld.l Bld,2 Non Local Local Non Local Local 

For: Purchase of light, Medium, Heavy Duty Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment llC. Industries, Inc. 

6100007554 lD 1900 W. 1-10 4562 IH-l0 East 4562 IH-l 0 East 1880 W. IH-l0 8922 IH 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 3740 S. E.loop 410 

Item Description QTY Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, Seguin, Converse, SiiSDee, San Antonio. 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 

830-303-3673 

4 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility Bed Crane 1 
Truck: NAS 
Price Each: No Bid $114,573.00 NO Bid Not Provided No Bid NO Bid No Bid 
Total : $114,573.00 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2017 Ford F750 RIC 2017 Ford F650 
Offered: 25,999GVW 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 6.7 Ford Diesel 270 6.7 Power Stroke, 
(Include SAE net HP): H.P. 675 lb. ft. Torque 270 H.P., 675 lb. 

Torque 
Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 Ford Torq Shift 6 Spd. 

Speed Automatic Automatic - Double 
Overdrive 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 24 Months Engine & Basic Unlimited 
Transmission 60 Milesl24 Months, 

Month or 250,000 Diesel Engine Trans, 
Miles 250,000 Miles - 60 

Mnnth~ 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, 
Facility Name: or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Facility 4562 I 10 East, San 1880 W. IH-l0, 
Address: Antonio, TX 78219 Seguin, TX 78155 

Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane 2016 Warren Select II Not Provided 
Offered: Body, Stellar Model 

EC6000 Crane 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty: 12 months Not Provided 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service CobattTruck Not Provided 
Provider Facility Name: Equipment 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 11218 IH 10 East, Not Provided 
ProVider Facility Address: Converse, TX 78109 

Delivery: 150-180 Days 180 days 
Production Cut-off Date: 1213012016 TBD 
Last day order can be placed without 1213012016 TBD 
missing cut-off date: 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No 
date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8,2016 Local Local 
Non Local Bld.l Bld.2 Non Local Local Non Local Local 

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment LLC. Industries, Inc. 

6100007554 LD 1900 W. 1-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562IH-10 East 1880 W. IH-10 89221H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 3740 S. E. Loop 410 

ttem Description QTY Seguin, San Antonio, , San Antonio, Seguin, Converse. Silsbee, San Antonio, 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 

830-303-3673 

5 19,501-26,000 GVW Utility Bed Crane 1 
Truck: NAS 
Price Each: No Bid $111 ,179.00 No Bid Not Provided $119,446.00 No8id No Bid 
Total: $111,179.00 $119,446.00 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2017 Ford F750 Reg 2017 Ford F650 2017 Hino 336 
Offered: Cab 25,999 GVW 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 6.7 Ford Diesel 270 6.7 Power Stroke, Hino JOBE-VC, 260 
(Include SAE net HP): H.P. 675 lb. ft. Torque 270 H.P., 675 lb. HP 

Torque 
Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 Ford Torq Shift 6 Spd. Allison 3000 RDS 

Speed Automatic - Double 
Overdrive 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 24 Months Engine & Basic Unlimited 5 Year Limited 
Transmission 60 Milesl24 Months, 

Month or 250,000 Diesel Engine Trans, 
Miles 250.000 Miles - 60 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, Rush Truck Center 
Facility Name: or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 I 10 East, San 1880 W. IH-10, 8922 I.H. 10 East, 
Facility Address: Antonio , TX 78219 Seguin, TX 78155 Converse, TX 78109 
Year, Make & Model Utility Bed & Crane Warner Flatbed and Not Provided 2017 Wamer Body & 
Offered: Stellar Model EC6000 Stellar Model EC6000 

Telescopic Crane 

Utility Bed & Crane Warranty: 12 months Not Provided 5 Year Limited 
Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service CobaHTruck Not Provided Cobalt Truck 
Provider Facility Name: Equipment Equipment 
Utility Bed & Crane Warranty Service 112181H 10 East, Not Provided 112181H10East, 
Provider Facility Address: Converse, TX 78109 Converse, TX 78109 

Delivery: 150-180 Days Not Provided 120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 12/3012016 Not Provided None 
Last day order can be placed without 1213012016 Not Provided None 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off .No Not Provided Yes 
date: , 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8, 2016 Local Local 
Non Local Bld.1 Bld.2 Non Local Local Non Local Local 

For: Purchase of Lighl, Medium, Heavy Duty Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment LLC. Industries, Inc. 

6100007554 LD 1900W. I-l0 45621H-l0 East 45621H-l0 East 1880 W. IH-l0 8922 IH 10 East 
~ 

1211 US Hwy96 N. 3740 S. E. Loop 410 

Item Description QTY Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, Seguin, Converse, Silsbee, San Antonio. 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 

. 830-303-3673 

6 19,501-26,000 GVW Chipper Truck: 1 

Price Each: No Bid $97,340.00 No Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $97,340.00 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2017 Ford F750 Reg 
Offered: Cab 25,999 GVW 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 6.7 Ford Diesel 270 
(Include SAE net HP): H.P. 675 lb. ft. Torque 

Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shift H.D. 6 
Speed Automatic 

Cab & Chassis Wanranty: 24 Months Engine & 
Transmission 60 

Month or 250,000 
Miles 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center 
Facility Name: 

Cab & Chassis warranty Provider Facility 4562 IH 10 East, San 
Address: Antonio, TX 78219 

Year, Make & Model Catch BodylBox 2016 Stahl Chipper 
Offered: Truck Body 

Catch Body/Box Warranty: 12 months 

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Pro.vider Axton Fleet Service 
Facility Name: 

Catch Body/Box Warranty Service Provider 4844 Whirlwind Dr. 
Facility Address: San Antonio, TX 

78217 
Delivery: 150-180 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 12/3012016 
Last day order can be placed without 12/3012016 
missing cut-off date; 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

Idate· 
No 
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City 01 San Antonio !lId Tabulation 

Opened: July 8,2016 Local Local 
Non Local Bld.1 Bld#2 Non Local Local Non Local Local 

For: Purchase of Light. Medium, Heavy Duty Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment LLC. Industries. Inc. 

6100007554 ~ lD 1900W. I-10 4562 IH-10 East 4562tH-10 East 1880 W. tH-10 8922 IH 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 3740 S. E. loop 410 

Hem Description QTY Seguin. San Antonio , San Antonio, Seguin, Converse, Silsbee, San Antonio, 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 

830-303-3673 

7 DELETED: 

8 2,000 Gallon Trailer Mounted Water 
Tanker: 2 NAS 
Price Each: $18,860.05 NO Bid No Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: ' $37,720.10 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2016 Wylie 02020 

10T -IH - BlK 

Warranty: 1 Yr Excluding Pump 
Seal 3 Yrs on tank 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Wylie Sprayers of 
EI Campo 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Wylie Trailers, 
2820 N. Mechanic, 

EI campo, TX 77437 
Delivery: 4Wks 
Production Cut-off Date: N/A 
Last day order can be placed without 1-Sep-16 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Not Provided 
date: 
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City 01 San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July 8, 2016 Local Local 
Non Local Bld.1 Bld.2 Non Local Local Non Local Local 

For: Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment LLC. Industries, Inc. 

6100007554 LD t900W. I-10 4562IH-10 East 4562 IH-10 East 1880 W. 1H-10 8922 IH 10 East i211 US Hwy 96 N. 3740 S. E. Loop 410 

~em Description QTY Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, Seguin, Converse, Silsbee, San Antonio . 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 

830-303-3673 

9 >33,000 GVW Utility Bed 65' Ground 2 
Reach Aerial Truck: NAS NAS NAS 
Base Unit Price (Each): No Bid $186,867.00 NO Bid $184,494.00 NO Bid $183,860.00 No Bid 
Total: $373,734.00 $368,988.00 $367,720.00 

Additional Cost: 
Optional Bucket Rotator to Dump Water 
and Debris: 
Option 1: Deleted 
Total : 
Option 2: HydrauliC ControUed Rotator 2 
Additional Cost: 

Included Included 

Total: 

Additional Cost: 
Optional bucket cover: 
Option 1: Deleted 
Total: 
Option 2: Hard Bucket Cover Additional 2 
Cost: 

$350.00 Included 

Total: $700.00 

Total with Options: 

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2017 Ford F750 Reg 2017 Ford F750 2017 Ford F750 Reg 
Offered: Cab 34.200 GVW Cab 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 6.7 Ford Diesel 330 Ford Power Stroke Ford 6 .7 Power 
(Include SAE net HP): H.P. 725 lb. n. Torque 6.7 Liter. 330 hp/ 725 Stroke V8 Diesel 330 

n. lb. Torque H.P. 
Transmission Offered: Ford Torq Shin H.D. 6 Ford TorqShin 6- Ford Torq Shin H.D. 6 

Speed Spd Automatic Spd 
w/power takeoff 

provision 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 24 Months Diesel & Basic Unlimited 36 Mo/36,000 Miles 

Transmission 60 Milesi24 Months, Bumper to Bumper, 
Month or 250,000 Diesel Engine & 5 Yr or 250,000 

Miles Trans, 250,000 Miles Powertrain 
60 Months 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Serv;ce Provider Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin, Red McCombs 
Facility Name: or any Authorized 

Ford Dealership 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 4562 110 East, San 1880 W. 1H-10, 83331-10 Frontage 
Address: Antonio . TX 78219 Seouin. TX 78155 Rd .. San Antonio . TX 
Year, Make & Model Catch BodylBox 2016 TC65 Terex 2016 Versalin VST 2017 Versalin 
Offered: Aerial Hi-Ranger 8800-1 Aerial 
Aerial lift and Platform Warranty: 12 months Not Provided 1 Year 
Aerial lift and Platform Warranty Service Terex Versalitt Southwest. Versalift Southwest 
Provider Facilitv Name: LLC 
Aerial lift and Platform Warranty Service 142 Gembler Road, 1200 Texas Central 1200 Texas Central 
Provider Facility Address: San Antonio, TX ParKway, Waco, TX ParKway, Waco, TX 

78219 76702 Drive Service Picks 
Up vehicle at San 

Antonia 
Delivery: 210-250 Days 340 Days 310-360 
Production Cut-off Date: 1213012016 Cab/Chassis TBA 4-15-17 
Last day order can be placed without 1213012016 TBA 4-15-17 
missinQ cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

Idate: 
No No No 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: July8. 2016 Local Local 
Non Local Bld,1 Bld.2 Non Local Local Non Local Local 

For: Purchase of light. Medium. Heavy Duty Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center Griffith Ford Seguin. Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
Trucks, Vans and Heavy Equipment LLC. Industries, Inc. 

6100007554 LD 1900W.I-10 4562 1H-10 East 4562IH-10 East 1880 W. IH-10 89221H 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 3740 S. E. Loop 410 

Hom Description QTY Seguin, San Antonio. San Antonio. Seguin. Converse, Silsbee. San Antonio, 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 

830-303-3673 

10 DELETED: 

11 DELETED: 

12 Mini Van (Cargo) 2 HAS 
Price Each: No Bid NO Bid No Bid $22.736.10 NO Bid $22.995.00 No Bid 
Total : $45.472.20 545.990.00 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment 
Discount 
Year. Make & Model Offered: 2017 Ford Transit 2017 Ford Transit 

Connect (57E) Connect 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 2.5 L- DOHC 1-4 Ford 2.5L 
(Include SAE net HP): 169 hp 

Warranty: Basic 3 Yr/36.000 36 Mo/36.000 Miles 
miles, Powertrain 5 Bumper to Bumper, 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 
Yr/60.000 Mile 

Griffith Ford Seguin. Red McCombs 
or any Authortzed 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 
Ford Dealershio 
1880 W. 1H-10. 83331-10. 

Seguin. TX 78155 San Antonio. TX 

Delivery: 180 Days 180-200 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: TBD 4-15-17 

Last day order can be placed without TBD 4-15-17 
missino cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

Idate: 
No No 
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Opened: July 8, 2016 

For. Purchase of Light, Medium, Heavy Duty 
Trucks. Vans and Heavy Equipment 

6100007554 LD 

Kern Descrtptton QTY 

13 DELETED: 

14 -:4: Ton Full Size Regular Cab 4x2: 
Price Each: 
Total : 
Prompt Payment Discount 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment 
Discount 
Percentage between lowest responsive 
bid and local bid 
Price Differential 
Year, Make & Model Offered: 

SpeCific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE net HP): 
Warranty: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 

Delivery: 
Production Cut-off Date: 

Last day order can be placed without 
missinQ cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date: 

Payment T enns: 

Total: 
Total Award: 

ROO Equipment Co. submiHed a No Bid. Item 10 was deleted 
and combined with item 9. Items 1, 7, 11 and 13 were deleted 
and will be bid at a later date. 
Ag-Pro Texas bid item number 7 only which is deleted. 

3 

City of San AntoniO Bid Tabulation 

Local Local 
Non Local Bld.1 Bld.2 

Ewald Tractor Grande Truck Center Grande Truck Center 

1900W. I-10 4562IH-10 East 4562IH-10 East 

Seguin, San Antonio. San Antonio, 
TX 78255 TX 78219 TX 78219 

No Bid No Bid $24,048.00 
$72,144.00 

13.97% 

2017 Ford F150 RIC 
4x2 6-112 ft. bed 

Ford V6, 282 H.P. 

36 Month or 36,000 
Miles 

Grande Truck Center 

4562110 East, San 
Antonio, TX 78219 

150-160 Days 
1213112016 

1213112016 

No 

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

137720.10 1696 826.00 172144.00 
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Non Local Local Non Local Local 
Griffith Ford Seguin, Rush Truck Center Silsbee Ford Waukesha-Pearce 
LLC. r Industries, Inc. 

1880 W. IH-10 8922 IH 10 East 1211 US Hwy 96 N. 3740 S. E. Loop 410 

Seguin, Converse, Silsbee, San AntoniO. 
TX 78155 TX 78109 TX 77656 TX 78222 
830-30~3673 

$21 ,397.75 NO Bid $21 ,996.00 No Bid 
$64,193.25 $65,988.00 

2016 Ford F150 Reg 2017 Ford F150 Reg 
Cab Cab 

Ford 3.5 Liter DOHC Ford 3.5 L V6 
V6. 282 hD 

Basic 3 Yrl36,OOO 36 Mof36,000 Miles 
miles· Powertraln 5 Bumper to Bumper, 

Yrl 60.000 Mile 
Griffith Ford Seguin, Red McCombs 

or any Authorized 
Ford Dealershio 
1860 W. IH-l0, 8333 1-10, 

Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 

90 days 120-150 Days 
711512016 4-15-17 

711412016 4-15-17 

No No 

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 

~78653.45 1119446.00 $479696.00 1103921 .00 
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