LC
04/06/17
Item No. §

AN ORDINANCE 20 17 - Oh - O 6 - 0 1 9 7

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $493,000.00: (A) A MARKETING & SERVICE CO.
FOR VARIOUS SMALL CELL BATTERIES, (B) STANDARD FUSEE
CORPORATION, DBA ORION SAFETY PRODUCTS FOR RED
BURNING FLARES, (C) DE LA GARZA FENCE & SUPPLY CO. FOR
CHAIN LINK FENCING MATERIALS AND ACCESSORIES, AND (D)
NESCO, LLC FOR AERIAL LIFT TRUCK RENTAL.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submltted to provide the City of San Antonio with commodltles and
services on an annual basis for the terms of the contracts; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves the following contracts: (A) A Marketing & Service Co.
for various small cell batteries, (B) Standard Fusee Corporation, dba Orion Safety Products for
red burning flares, (C) de la Garza Fence & Supply Co. for chain link fencing materials and
accessories, and (D) Nesco, LLC for aerial lift truck rental; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves four low bid contracts; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: '

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and
endorsements: (A) A Marketing & Service Co. for various small cell batteries, (B) Standard
Fusee Corporation, dba Orion Safety Products for red burning flares, (C) de la Garza Fence &
Supply Co. for chain link fencing materials and accessories, and (D) Nesco, LLC for aerial lift
truck rental. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all
purposes as Exhibit 1.

Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the
Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders and payment is
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the
Fiscal Year 2017 budget and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through
their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances.



LC
04/06/17
Item No.5

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;

otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

M A Y O R
Ivy R. Taylor

ATTEST: A APPROVED AS TO FORM:
. Vﬁ Roone CadIL o

Andrew Segovia, City Attorney

PASSED and APPROVED this 6™ day of April, 2017.




Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item: 5 (in consent vote: 4,5,6,7,9,10,11,12,13,14,15,16)
Date: 04/06/2017
Time: 09:51:51 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an
estimated annual cost of $493,000.00: (A) A Marketing & Service Co. for various small cell batteries,
(B) Standard Fusee Corporation, dba Orion Safety Products for red burning flares, (C) de la Garza
Fence & Supply Co. for chain link fencing materials and accessories, and (D) Nesco, LLC for aerial lift
truck rental. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer,
Finance]
Result: Passed
Not . .
Voter Group P Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Treviiio District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafa District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Cris Medina District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X
http://cosaweb/Votelnterface/Default.aspx 4/6/2017
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EXHIBIT |

City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 28, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries A336 . LOCAL NON-LOCAL
_ A Marketing & Service
6100008070 VF Co. Bulichase Inc.
5830 Cliffmont] 201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste
Annual San Antonio, 503
Item Descrlptlon Estimated - TX 78250-3937 Cedar Pafk,
. Quantity 210-684-1635 TX 78613
Group A[Specified ltems ‘
1 ALKALINE BATTERIES
1a |9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 1 per pack 5 $1.0 No Bid
Extended Cost $5.20
Manufacturer Rayovaci
Part Number AL-9V|
Quantity Per Pack 1
9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 2 per pack 5 $2.08] No Bid
Extended Cost $10.40;
Manufacturer Rayovad|
Part Number AL-9V]
Quantity Per Pack 2
9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 4 per pack 10 $4.16) No Bid
Extended Cost c $41.60
Manufacturer Rayovac|
Part Number AL-9V|
Quantity Per Pack :l
9 Volt Alkaline Baﬂéry, Energizer EN22, 12 per pack 10 $12.4 $12.00
Extended Cost $124.80] $120.00
Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer|
Part Number AL-9V] EN22
Quantity Per Pack 12 12
9 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN22, 72 per pack 15 $74.88 No Bid
Extended Cost $1,123.20
Manufacturer Rayovac|
Part Number AL-9V
Quantity Per Pack 72
1b |AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 2 per pack 5 $0‘58| No Bid
Extended Cost $2.90]
Manufacturer Rayovad|
Part Number AL-AA]
Quantity Per Pack 2
AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 4 per pack 5 $1.16] No Bid
Extended Cost $5.80
Manufacturer Rayovad|
Part Number AL-AA]
Quantity Per Pack 4
AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 8 per pack 5 $2.32 No Bid
Extended Cost $11.60
Manufacturer Rayovac]
Part Number AL-
Quantity Per Pack A/;t
AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 16 per pack 10 $4.64 No Bid
Extended Cost $46.40,
Manufacturer Rayovac|
Part Number AL-AA
Quantity Per Pack 16
1
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_City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 28, 2016 .
For: Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries A336 LOCAL NON-LOCAL
' A Marketing & Service
6100008070 . VF Co. Bulichase Inc.
5830 Cliffmont] 201 S Lakeline Bivd Ste
Annual San Antonio, 503
Item Description Estimated TX 78250-3937 Cedar Park,
. ' Quantity 210-684-1635 TX 78613
AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer ENS1, 24 per pack 10 $6.96 $6.00
Extended Cost $69.60 $60.00
Manufacturer ) Rayovac| Energizer
Part Number ) AL-AA] ENO1
Quantity Per Pack 24 24
AA 1.5 Volt.Alkaline Battery, Energizer ENS1, 36 per pack 15 $10.44 No Bid
Extended Cost ; : $156.60,
Manufacturer Rayovac
Part Number AL-AA
Quantity Per Pack : 36
AA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN91, 144 per pack 20 $41.76) No Bid
Extended Cost $835.20
Manufacturer ~ Rayovag
Part Number AL-AA|
Quantity Per Pack 144
1c  |AAA 1.5 Voit Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 4 per pack 5 $1.16 No Bid
Extended Cost $5.80]
Manufacturer ) Rayovag
Part Number AL-AAA]
Quantity Per Pack 4
AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 8 per pack 5 $2.32 No Bid
Extended Cost $11.60
Manufacturer ' Rayovad
Part Number AL-AA»;
Quantity Per Pack )
' AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 24 per pack 10 $6.96 $6.00
‘ Extended Cost $69.60 $60.00
Manufacturer : ' Rayovad Energizer|
Part Number " AL-AAA EN92
Quantity Per Pack 24 24
AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 36 per pack 15 $10.4 No Bid
Extended Cost y ¢ $156.60,
Manufacturer Rayovad]
Part Number : AL-AAA ;
Quantity Per Pack 364
AAA 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN92, 144 per pack 15 $41.76) No Bid
Extended Cost $626.40
Manufacturer Rayovad|
Part Number ’ AL-AAA
Quantity Per Pack % ’ 144
1
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: October 28, 2016 .
For: Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries A336 LOCAL NON-LOCAL
) A Marketing & Service
6100008070 VF Co. Bulichase Inc.
5830 Cliffmont| 201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste
Annual San Antonio, 503
Item Description Estimated TX 78250-3937 Cedar Park,
Quantity 210-684-1635 TX 78613
1d  |C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN93, 4 per pack 5 $2.08| No Bid
Extended Cost ' $10.40
Manufacturer Rayovad
Part Number AL-C
Quantity Per Pack 4‘
C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN93, 8 per pack 5 $4.16 No Bid
Extended Cost $20.80
Manufacturer Rayovad||
Part Number AL-C
Quantity Per Pack 8
1
C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer ENS3, 12 per pack 15 $6.24( $7.00
Extended Cost $93.60] $105.00
Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer
Part Number AL-C EN93
Quantity Per Pack 12 12
C 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN93, 72 per pack 15 $37.4 No Bid
Extended Cost $561.60
Manufacturer Rayovad
Part Number AL-C
Quantity Per Pack ° 72
1e |D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer ENS5, 3 per pack 5 $2.0 No Bid
Extended Cost $10.20
Manufacturer Rayovac|
Part Number AL-IgI
Quantity Per Pack
D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN95, 5 per pack 5 $3.40, No Bid
Extended Cost $17.00
Manufacturer Rayovac‘
Part Number AL-Dff -
Quantity Per Pack 9]
D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer ENS5, 8 per pack 10 _ $5. No Bid
Extended Cost $54.40
Manufacturer Rayovad
Part Number AL-D|
Quantity Per Pack 8
-|D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer ENS5, 12 per pack’ 15 $8.16] $8.48
Extended Cost $122.40 $127.20
Manufacturer Rayovad| Energizer
Part Number AL-D| EN95
Quantity Per Pack 12] 12
D 1.5 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN95, 72 per pack 20 $48.96 No Bid
Extended Cost $979.20
Manufacturer Rayovac|
Part Number AL-D]
Quantity Per Pack 7
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: October 28, 2016. ; .
For: Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries A336 LOCAL NON-LOCAL
) A Marketing & Service
6100008070 VF Co. Bullchase Inc.
5830. Cliffmont} 201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste
- o Annual San Antonio, 503
Item Description Estimated TX 78250-3937 Cedar Park,
Quantity 210-684-1635 TX 78613
1f  |J 6.0 Volt Alkaline Battery, Energizer EN539, 6 per pack 2 $33.60] $9.24/ $55.44
Extended Cost .$67.20 $110.88
Manufacturer Ultra Las! Duracell
Part Number J-Alkaline QUR7K67
Quantity Per Pack 6 1
2 LITHIUM BATTERIES
2a {9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife USLV, 1 per pack 5 $6.64 $9.24
Extended Cost $33.20 $46.20
Manufacturer Rayovac X2 Power
Part Number R9VL-1 PM010000
Quantity Per Pack 1 1
9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife UILV, 2 per pack 5 $13.28 No Bid
Extended Cost $66.40)
Manufacturer . ‘Rayovad
Part Number ROVL-1
Quantity Per Pack 2
9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife USLV, 4 per pack 5 $26.56) No Bid
Extended Cost $132.80
Manufacturer Rayovad
Part Number RIVL-1|f ,
Quantity Per Pack ) 4&
9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife USLV, 20 per pack 10 $132.80] No Bid
Extended Cost $1,328.00
Manufacturer Rayovad|
Part Number R9VL-1
Quantity Per Pack 20
9 Volt Lithium Battery, Ultralife USLV, 72 per pack 15 $478.08 No Bid
Extended Cost $7,171.20]
Manufacturer Rayovac
Part Number ROVL-1
Quantity Per Pack 72
2b |AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 2 per pack 5 $7.60 No Bid
Extended Cost $38.00
Manufacturer Eveready
Part Number L91
Quantity Per Pack 2
AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 4 per pack 5 $15.20 No Bid
Extended Cost $76.00
Manufacturer Eveready]
Part Number LSJJ
Quantity Per Pack v
AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 8 per pack 5 $30.40 No Bid
Extended Cost $152.00
Manufacturer Eveready
Part Number L91
Quantity Per Pack = 8
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: October 28, 2016
For: Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries A336 LOCAL NON-LOCAL
A Marketing & Service
6100008070 VF : Co. Bulichase Inc.
i 5830 Cliffmont] 201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste
o Anmal San Antonio, 503
Item Description Estimated TX 78250-3937 Cedar Park,
Quantity 210-684-1635 TX 78613
AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 16 per pack 10 $60.8 No Bid
Extended Cost : $608.00|
Manufacturer Everead
Part Number L91
Quantity Per Pack 16|
AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 24 per pack 15 $91.20, $46.40
Extended Cost $1,368.00, $696.00
Manufacturer - Evereadyf Energizer
Part Number L91 L91
Quantity Per Pack 24 24
AA 1.5 Volt Lithium Battery, Energizer L91, 144 per pack 20 $547.20 No Bid
Extended Cost $10,944.00
Manufacturer Eveready
Part Number L91
Quantity Per Pack 144
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR20186, 2
2c |per pack 5 $2.40; $6.16/%12.32
Extended Cost $12.00 $61.60
Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer
Part Number KECR2016-1 CR2016
Quantity Per Pack 2 1
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2016, 4
per pack 5 $4.80, No Bid
Extended Cost $24.00
Manufacturer Rayovac
Part Number- KECR2016-1
Quantity Per Pack 4
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2016, 20
per pack 10 $24.00 No Bid|
Extended Cost $240.00
Manufacturer Rayovad|
Part Number KECR2016-1
Quantity Per Pack 20
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2016, 24
per pack 15 $28.80] No Bid
Extended Cost $432.00
Manufacturer Rayovac]
Part Number KECR2016-1
Quantity Per Pack 24
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 2
2d |per pack 5 $2.40 $6.16/ $61.60
Extended Cost $12.00 $61.60
Manufacturer Rayovac| Energizer
Part Number KECR2032 CR2032
Quantity Per Pack 2 1
3.0 VoIt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 4
per pack 0 5 $4.80 No Bid
Extended Cost $24.00
Manufacturer Rayovac|
Part Number KECR2032
Quantity Per Pack
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: October 28, 2016 ‘
For: Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries A336 LOCAL NON-LOCAL
A Marketing & Service
6100008070 - VF Co. Builchase Inc.
5830 Cliffmont| 201 S Lakeline Bivd Ste
Annual San Antonio, 503
Item Description Estimated TX 78250-3937 Cedar Park,
Quantity 210-684-1635 TX 78613
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 20
per pack 10 $24.00 No Bid
Extended Cost $240.00]
Manufacturer Rayovac
Part Number KECR2032
Quantity Per Pack 20|
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Energizer CR2032, 24
per pack 15 $28.80 No Bid
Extended Cost $432.00]
Manufacturer Rayovac
Part Number KECR2032]
Quantity Per Pack 24
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Duracell DL2025, 1 .
2e |per pack ' 5 $1.35 No Bid
Extended Cost $6.75
Manufacturer Rayovac
Part Number 'KECR2025;
Quantity Per Pack 1
3.0 Volt Button Cell Coin Lithium Battery, Duracell DL2025, 6
per pack - 5 $8.10 $1.80/$5.40
Extended Cost $40.50 $54.00
Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer,
Part Number KECR2025 2025BP-2N
Quantity Per Pack | 2
3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP), 1
2f  |per pack 5 $1.49 $2.55
Extended Cost $7.45 $12.75
Manufacturer Rayovad] Energizer
Part Number RL-123A-1 EL123APBP
Quantity Per Pack 1 1
3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP), 6
per pack . 5 $8.94 No Bid
Extended Cost $44.70
Manufacturer- - Rayovaﬁ
Part Number RL-123A-1
Quantity Per Pack 6)
3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP), 20
per pack 10 $29.80 No Bid
Extended Cost $298.00
Manufacturer Rayovaci
Part Number RL-123A-1
Quantity Per Pack 204
3.0 Volt Photo Lithium Battery, Energizer 123 (EL123AP), 24
per pack . 15 $35.76 No Bid
Extended Cost ‘$536.40
Manufacturer Rayovaci
Part Number RL-123A-1
Quantity Per Pack 24
e
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: October 28, 2016 )
For: Annual Contract for Various Small Cell Batteries A336 LOCAL NON-LOCAL
A Marketing & Service
6100008070 VF Co. Bullchase Inc.
5830 Cliffmont]201 S Lakeline Blvd Ste
- o Annual San Antonio, 503
Item Description Estimated TX 78250-3937 Cedar Park,
Quantity 210-684-1635 _TX 78613
3 RECHARGEABLE BATTERIES
AA 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-15-BP, 4
3a [per pack ; 5 $10.92 $11.68
Extended Cost ' $54.60 $58.40
Manufacturer Rayova Energizer
Part Number PL715-4 GEN NH15BP-4
Quantity Per Pack 4
AA 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-15-BP, 8
per pack 5 $21.8 No Bid
Extended Cost $109.20
Manufacturer Rayova
Part Number PL715-4 GEN
Quantity Per Pack 8
AAA 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-15-BP,
3b |4 per pack 5 $10.92] $7.30/$14.60
Extended Cost $54.60 $73.00
Manufacturer Rayovac Energizer|
Part Number PL724-4B GEN NHISBP-2
Quantity Per Pack Not Specified 2
C 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-35-BP, 2
3c |per pack 5 $10.92 $9.08
Extended Cost $54.60, $45.40
Manufacturer Rayova& Energizer
Part Number PL714-2 GEND; NH358P-2
Quantity Per Pack 2 2
D 1.2 Volt Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-50-BP, 2
3d |per pack 5 $10.92] $9.08
Extended Cost $54.60 $45.40
Manufacturer Rayovac| Energizer
Part Number PL713-2 GEND NH50BP-2
Quantity Per Pack 2 2].
9V Rechargeable NiMH Battery, Energizer NH-22NBP, 1 per
© 3e |pack 5 $10.92 $9.08
Extended Cost $54.60; $45.40
Manufacturer Rayovac] Energizer
Part Number PL1604-1 GEND] NH22NBP
Quantity Per Pack 1 1
3f |Universal Chargers, Energizer CHFC2, 1 per pack 5 $20.8d $26.65
Extended Cost $104.40] $133.25
Manufacturer Rayovad Energizer
Part Number PS-203 GEND CHFC
Quantity Per Pack 1 1
Group B|Deleted
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $29,994.10
stimated Annual Award $29.994 10|
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 30, 2017 '
For: Annual Contract For Red Burning Flares for - .
' SAPD & SAFD . NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
: Standard Fusee Corporation, [AAA Fire and Safety
d.b.a. Orion Safety Products |Equipment Co. Inc.
6100008457 AAS 28320 St. Michaels Rd. 6700 Guadalupe Street
Estimated 1
Annual |Easton, Austin,
Item Description Quantity {MD 21601 [|TX 78752
: 410-822-8318
1 Red Burning Flares 4,400
Manufacturer Name: Each Orion Safety Products Orion Safety Products
Part Number: 0730 0730
Quantity per case 36 Each 36 Each
Price Each $48.07] $49.75
Price Total $211,508.00 $218,900.00
Warranty: 1 Year (Defective Only) 1 Year
2 Appointment Delivery Fee 24
Price Each Each $55.00 $100.00
Price Total $1,320.00 $2,400.00
3 Limited Access Delivery Fee 24
Price Each Each $125.00] $100.00
" |Price Total $3,000.00] $2,400.00
Delivvery 14 Days| 14 Days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total: $215,828.00 .$223,700.00
Estimated Annual Award: $215,828.00{ $223,700.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

January 23, 2017

Local -
For: Annual Contract for Chain Link Fencing Materials & Accessories de la Garza Fence & Supply Co.
6100008464 SM 16475 Old Hwy 90 West
Est. San Antonio,
Annual [TX 78227
Item Description Qty. |210-674-8302

1 Barbed Wire — Zinc coated — 12-1/2 Gauge, Double Strand twisted line wire

with 4 point barbs, Estimated Annual Quantity is based on 1300 ft. rolls.

Unit Price 25 $71.35

Total Price $1,783.75
2 Gates - 1-5/8" X SS 20 Welded Frame with 9 gauge fence filler and 3 strands

of barbed wire — 6’ X 6’ Single Panel Gate (to include all related installation

hardware: hinges, latches, screws/bolts, etc.)

Unit Price : 5 $215.45

Total Price $1,077.25
3 Gates — 1-5/8” X SS 20 Welded Frame with 9 gauge fence filler and 3 strands

of barbed wire — 6" X 12’ Double Drive Gate, plus 3 strands of barbed wire (to

include all related installation hardware: hinges, latches, screws/bolts, etc.)

Unit Price 3 $364.94

Total Price $1.004.82
4 Gates — 1-5/8” X SS 20 Welded Frame with 9 gauge fence filler and 3 sfrands

of barbed wire — 6’ X 16’ Double Drive Gate, plus 3 strands of barbed wire (to

include all related installation hardware: hinges, latches, screws/bolts, etc.)

Unit Price 10 $477.23

Total Price $4,772.30
5 Chain Link Fabric Fence - 50 ft. — 6' X 9 Gauge X 2” Diamond, Est. Annual

Qty. based on 50ft. rolls

Unit Price 10 $183.00

Total Price $1,830.00
6 Chain Link Fabric Fence — 50 ft. — 8' X 9 Gauge X 2” Diamond, Est. Annual

Qty. based on 50ft. rolls ] .

Unit Price 10 $237.50

Total Price $2,375.00
7 Pipe — Galvanized Pressed Steel — 2-3/8" X .130 Schedule 40 X 10’ 6”

Unit Price . : 150 $38.75

Total Price $5,812.50
8 Pipe — Galvanized Pressed Steel — 2-7/8” X .160 Schedule 40X 12’ .

Unit Price 75 $61.10

Total Price $4,582.50
9 Pipe — Galvanized Pressed Steel — 4" X .160 Schedule 40 X 12’

Unit Price : 50 $108.40

Total Price $5,420.00
10 Pipe — Galvanized Pressed Steel — 1-5/8" X Schedule 40 X 21’

Unit Price 75 $43.39

Total Price $3,254.25




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

January 23,2017

Local
For: Annual Contract for Chain Link Fencing Materials & Accessories de la Garza Fence & Supply Co.
6100008464 SM_|6475 Old Hwy 90 West
Est. San Antonio,
Annual |[TX 78227 .
Item Description Qty. |210-674-8302
1 4 FT. Chain Link Fabric Fence — 50 ft. 2.25" Mesh 12.5 GA, Est. Annual Qty.
based on 50ft. Rolls
Unit Price 12 $42.50
Total Price $510.00
12 21' Tubing 1-3/8" X .047 Swaged
Unit Price 28 $15.42
Total Price $431.76)
13 Tension Wire Galvanized steel 11GA, Unit price per ft.
Unit Price 600 $0.05
Total Price $30.00,
14 5'6" Galvanized Tubing 1-5/8 X .047
Unit Price 56 $4.98
Total Price $278.88
15 §'6” Galvanized Tubing 2-3/8 X .047
Unit Price 24 $8.00
Total Price $192.00
16 5/8" Tension Bar 48" Long )
Unit Price 40 $1.57,
Total Price $62.80,
17 14 GA Tension Band 3/4"x 2-3/8"
Unit Price 120 $0.30
Total Price $36.00
18 4’ x 4' Residential Gate 1-3/8” x .047” 12.5 GA (to include all related
installation hardware: hinges, latches, screws/bolts, etc.)
Unit Price é 5 $42.25
Total Price . $211.25)
19 Other Fencing Materials and Accessories
A: Fencing Materials Discount and Delivery
a) Percent of discount offered: 0%
b) Products Identification (Manufacturer): _ de la Garza Fence & Suppl'y
c) Type of Price Schedule/Catalog (dealer, jobber, etc.): Vendor]
d) Price Schedule/Catalog Number: 2017 Catalog
e) Date of Price Schedule/Catalog: 1/18/2017
f) Price Schedule/Catalog Column on Which Discount is Based: N/A
g) Warranty (minimum 90 days): 1 year|

Payment Terms

2%, 10 days|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

For:

6100008599

February 13, 2017

Annual Contract for Aerial Lift Truck Rental

DS

Non-Local

Item

Description

_ Estimated -
Annual Quantity

Nesco, LLC

3112 E. State Road 124
Bluffton, '

IN 46714

260-824-7150

1A

1B

2A

28

Versalift SHV-36P1 or approved equal

Rentat Price Per Day (24 Hour Period):

Extended Price:

Make: Terex 42'-45' INS Aerial 4x2

Model: TL38, LT38, LT40, TPL40, L13i, 4x2

Versalift SST37EIH, Versalift SST40-NE based on availability

Versalift SHV-36P1 or approved equal

Rental Price Per Month:

Extended Price:

Make: Terex 42'-45' INS Aerial 4x2

Model: TL38, LT38, LT40, TPL40, L13i, 4x2

Versalift SST37EIH, Versalift SST40-NE based on availability

Telelect 5SFC55 or approved equal

Rental Price Per Day (24 Hour Period):

Extended Price: i

Make: Terex 55'-60' INS Aerial 4x2

Model: TL50P, 5TC55, TC55P, 5FC55, FC55, LiftAlt LANS1, LANS5, Altec
AA755 based on availability

Telelect 5FC55 or approved equal

Rental Price Per Month:

Extended Price:

Make: Terex 55'-60' INS Aerial 4x2

Model: TL50P, 5TC55, TC55P, 5FC55, FC55, LiftAlt LAN51, LANSS, Altec
AAT755 based on availability

Payment Terms

Estimated Annual Total:

30

28

30

12

$986.00
$29,580.00

$2,958.00
$82,824.00

$1,128.00
$33,840.00

$3,385.00
$40,620.00

Net 30 days

$186,864.00

Estimated Annual Award:

$186,864.00]|

Prepared by Purchasing
3/9/2017
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