007 - SIGNATURE PAGE

By submitting a bid, whether electronically or by paper, Bidder represents that:

(s)he is authorized to bind Bidder to fully comply with the terms and conditions of City's Invitation for Bid for the prices
stated therein;

(s)he has read the entire document, including the final version issued by City, and agreed to the terms therein;
Bidder is in good standing with the Texas State Comptroller's Office; and
to the best of his/her knowledge, all information Is true and correct.

If submitting your bid by paper, complete the following and sign on the signature line below. Failure to sign and submit this
Signature Page will result in rejection of your bid.

Bidder Information:

Please Print or Type:

Vendor ID No.: 1026114

Signer's Name: Patrick LeClaire

Name of Business: Rush Truck Center

Street Address: 8922 |.H. 10 East

City, State, Zip Code: Converse, TX 78109

Email Address: leclairep@rushenterprises.com
Telephane No.: 210-380-6772

Fax No.: 210-901-7275

City’s Solicitation No.: 6100008495

Signature of Refson Authorized to Sign Bid
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City of San Antonio
Veteran-Owned Small Business Program Tracking Form

Authority. San Antonio City Code Chapter 2, Article XI describes the City’s veteran-owned small business
preference program.

Tracking. This solicitation is not eligible for a_preference based on status as a veteran-owned small
business (VOSB). Nevertheless, in order to determine whether the program can be expanded at a later date,
the City tracks VOSB patrticipation at both prime contract and subcontract levels.

Certification. The City relies on inclusion in the database of veteran-owned small businesses (VOSB)
maintained by the U.S. Small Business Administration to verify VOSB status; however, veteran status may
also be confirmed by certification by another public or private entity that uses similar certification procedures.

Definitions.

The program uses the federal definitions of veteran and veteran-owned small business found in 38 CFR Part
74,

» The term “veteran” means a person who served on active duty with the U.S. Army, Air Force, Navy,
Marine Corps, Coast Guard, for any length of time and at any place and who was discharged or
released under conditions other than dishonorable. Reservists or members of the National Guard
called to federal active duty or disabled from a disease or injury incurred or aggravated in line of duty
or while in training status.

e A veteran-owned small business is a business that is not less than 51 percent owned by one or
more veterans, or in the case of any publicly owned business, not less than 51 percent of the stock
of which is owned by one or more veterans; the management and daily business operations of which
are controlled by one or more veterans and qualifies as “small” for Federal business size stand
purposes.

The program uses the below definition of joint venture.

¢ Joint Venture means a collaboration of for-profit business entities, in response to a solicitation, which
is manifested by a written agreement, between two or more independently owned and controlled
business firms to form a third business entity solely for purposes of undertaking distinct roles and
responsibilities in the completion of a given contract. Under this business arrangement, each joint
venture partner shares in the management of the joint venture and also shares in the profits or
losses of the joint venture enterprise commensurately with its contribution to the venture.

The program does not distinguish between a veteran and a service-disabled veteran-owned business and is
not limited geographically.

COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING FORM AND SUBMIT WITH YOUR BID/PROPOSAL.
INSTRUCTIONS

e |F SUBMITTING AS A PRIME CONTRACTOR ONLY, COMPLETE SECTION 1 OF THIS FORM.

e |F SUBMITTING AS A PRIME CONTRACTOR UTILIZING A SUBCONTRACTOR, COMPLETE
SECTIONS 1 AND 2 OF THIS FORM.

Veteran-Owned Small Business Program Tracking Form 11/21/14
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City of San Antonio

Veteran-Owned Small Business Program Tracking Form

SOLICITATION NAME/NUMBER: 6100008485

Name of Respondent:

Rush Truck Center

Physical Address:

8922 I.H. 10 East

City, State, Zip Code:

Converse, TX 78109

Phone Number:

210-380-6772

Email Address:

Ieclairep@rushenterprises.gom\

Is Respondent certified as a VOSB with the U.S. Small
Business Administration?

(circle one)

Yes

D,

If yes, provide the SBA Certification #

If not certified by the SBA, is Respondent certified as a
VOSB by another public or private entity that uses similar
certification procedures? (circle one)

Yes

No

If yes, provide the name of the entity who has certified
Respondent as a VOSB. Include any identifying
certification numbers.

Participation Percentage:

Participation Dollar Amount:

Is Respondent subcontracting with a business that is
certified as a VOSB? (circle one)

Yes

Name of SUBCONTRACTOR Veteran-Owned Small
Business:

Physical Address:

City, State, Zip Code:

Phone Number:

Email Address:

Is SUBCONTRACTOR certified as a VOSB with the U.S.
Small Business Administration? (circle one)

Yes

If yes, provide the SBA Certification #

If not certified by the SBA, is SUBCONTRACTOR
certified as a VOSB by another public or private entity
that uses similar certification procedures? (circle one)

Yes

If yes, provide the name of the entity who has certified
SUBCONTRACTOR as a VOSB. Include any identifying
certification numbers.

Participation Percentage:

Participation Dollar Amount

Veteran-Owned Small Business Program Tracking Form
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City of San Antonio
Veteran-Owned Small Business Program Tracking Form

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

THE STATE OF TEXAS

| certify that my responses and the information provided on this Veteran-Owned Small Business Preference
Program Identification Form are true and correct to the best of my personal knowledge and belief and that |
have made no willful misrepresentations on this form, nor have | withheld any relevant information in my
statements and answers to questions. | am aware that any information given by me on this Veteran-Owned
Small Business Preference Program Identification Form may be investigated and | hereby give my full
permission for any such investigation, including the inspection of business records and site visits by City or
its authorized representative. | fully acknowledge that any misrepresentations or omissions in my responses
and information may cause my offer to be rejected or contract to be terminated. | further acknowledge that
providing false information is grounds for debarment.

BIDDER/RESPONDENT'’S FULL NAME:

Patrick LeClaire
(Print Nam rized Representative of Bidder/Respondent

Al —

(Signatare) Authorized Representative of Bidder/Respondent

Sales
Title
3-27-2017
Date
This Veteran-Owned Small Business Program Tracking Form must be submitted with the
Bidder/Respondent’s bid/proposal.
Veteran-Owned Small Business Program Tracking Form 11/21/14
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City of San Antonio
Finance Department - Purchasing Division
Local Preference Program Identification Form

The City of San Antonio Local Preference Program, described in the San Antonio City Code Chapter 2, Article
XIl, establishes a local preference for specific contracting categories. Each time a bidder or respondent submits
a bid for a solicitation, this Local Preference Program Identification Form must be completed and turned in with
the solicitation response in order to be identified as a City Business and receive the preference described below.
The City will not rely on Local Preference Program lIdentification Forms submitted with prior or
contemporaneous bids or proposals.

The Local Preference Program allows the City to grant a preference to a business meeting the definition of City
Business in the award of the following types of contracts, when selection is made based on price alone:

o Personal Property (Goods / Supplies): The local bidder's price must be within 3% of the price of the
lowest non-local bidder for contracts of $50,000 or more;

¢ Non-professional Services: The local bidder's price must be within 3% of the price of the lowest non-
local bidder for contracts of $50,000 to under $500,000;

o Construction Services: The local bidder's price must be within 3% of the price of the lowest non-local
bidder for contracts of $50,000 to under $100,000, excluding contracts awarded using alternative
delivery methods.

The Local Preference Program also allows the award of additional points, when multiple evaluation criteria
are used in the award of professional service contracts, where the selection process is not governed by
statute and in revenue generating and concession contracts. A business meeting the definition of City
Business stated below may be awarded 10 points for being headquartered within the city, or 5 points for
having a local office within the city.

Moreover, the program recognizes joint venture agreements and allows for apportioning of points based
upon the percentage of ownership of joint ventures by City Businesses responding to solicitations for which
discretionary points are applied. For solicitations where selection is made based on price alone, all
members of a joint venture must be City Businesses for the preference to be applied.

City Business is defined as a business headquartered within the incorporated San Antonio city limits for one
year or more OR one that meets the following conditions:

e Has an established place of business for one year or more in the incorporated limits of the City:

(a) from which at least 100 of its employees OR at least 20% of its total full-time, part-time and contract
employees are regularly based; and

(b) from which a substantial role in the business’ performance of a commercially useful function or a
substantial part of its operations is conducted by those employees.

A location utilized solely as a post office box, mail drop or telephone message center or any similar
combination, with no other substantial work function, is not a City Business.

For the purposes of this program, Headquartered is defined as the place where a business entity’s officers
direct, control, and coordinate the entity’s activities.

NOTE: Bidders / Respondents are required to submit documentation to substantiate that the requirements of a
City Business have been met. Examples of documentation may include, but are not limited to the following:

1. Existence of local headquarters or office: For corporations, Texas Comptroller's listing of
names/addresses of officers and directors. For partnerships, partnership agreement and any
documents identifying the current managing partners and their current work addresses

2. Evidence of local headquarters or office in existence for one year or more: Utility bills, real property
lease agreements, equipment leases, personal property taxes, real property taxes

3. Evidence of number of employees: Organizational charts, payroll records by location

Local Preference Program Identification Form 11/21/14
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City of San Antonio
Finance Department - Purchasing Division
Local Preference Program Identification Form

CITY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REQUEST ADDITIONAL INFORMATION TO VALIDATE
BIDDERS'/RESPONDENTS’ DESIGNATION AS A CITY BUSINESS.

COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING FORM AND SUBMIT WITH YOUR RESPONSE EVEN IF YOU ARE NOT
SEEKING A LOCAL PREFERENCE. THE BIDDER / RESPONDENT MUST COMPLETE THE FOLLOWING
FORM TO BE IDENTIFIED AS A CITY BUSINESS. IF BIDDER / RESPONDENT IS SUBMITTING AS A JOINT
VENTURE, EACH CITY BUSINESS THAT IS A MEMBER OF THE JOINT VENTURE MUST COMPLETE AND
SIGN THIS FORM.

PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION IF BIDDER/ RESPONDENT IS SUBMITTING AS PART OF A
JOINT VENTURE. Joint Venture means a collaboration of for-profit business entities, in response to a
solicitation, which is manifested by a written agreement, between two or more independently owned and
controlled business firms to form a third business entity solely for purposes of undertaking distinct roles and
responsibilities in the completion of a given contract. Under this business arrangement, each joint venture
partner shares in the management of the joint venture and also shares in the profits or losses of the joint venture
enterprise commensurately with its contribution to the venture.

STATE BIDDER'S / RESPONDENT’S PERCENTAGE OF OWNERSHIP IN THE JOINT VENTURE: %

SUBMIT A COPY OF THE JOINT VENTURE AGREEMENT. SUBMIT ANY OTHER DOCUMENTATION
REQUESTED BY CITY TO SUBSTANTIATE THE EXISTANCE OF AND/OR PARTICIPATION IN THE JOINT
VENTURE. NO PREFERENCE POINTS WILL BE ALLOCATED TO A JOINT VENTURE THAT FAILS TO
SUBMIT REQUIRED DOCUMENTATION.

SOLICITATION NAME/NUMBER: 6100008495

PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION REGARDING BIDDER'S / RESPONDENT'S
HEADQUARTERS:

Name of Business: Rush Truck Center
Physical Address: 8922 |.H. 10 East
City, State, Zip Code:

Converse, TX 78109
Phone Number: 210-380-6772

Email Address: leclairep@rushenterprises.com

Provide the total number of f'u,ll-time, part-time, and contract personnel employed by
Bidder / Respondent: 2

Is Business headquartered within the incorporated San Yes 0
Antonio city limits? (circle one)

Has the business been headquartered in the incorporated Yes — x o
San Antonio city limits for one year or more? (circle one)

If the answers to the questions above are “Yes”, stop here. If the answer to either of
the above questions is “No”, provide responses to the following questions:

Local Preference Program Identification Form 11/21/14
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City of San Antonio
Finance Department - Purchasing Division
Local Preference Program Identification Form

PROVIDE THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION REGARDING BIDDER'S / RESPONDENT'S LOCAL OFFICE
(IF APPLICABLE):

Name of Business: Rush Truck Center

Physical Address: 8922 |.H. 10 East

City, State, Zip Code: Converse, TX 78109

Phone Number: 210-380-6772

Email Address: leclairep@rushenterprises.com

Provide the total number of full-time, part-ti&\g_and contract personnel employed by
Bidder / Respondent in the local office:

~——

Is the business located in the incorporated San Antonio city Tes No
limits? (circle one)

Has the business been located in the incorporated San
Antonio city limits for one year or more? (circle one)

Are at least 100 full-time, part-time or contract employees

regularly based in the San Antonio office? (circle one)

Are at least 20% of the business’ total full-time, part-time or
contract employees regularly based in the San Antonio
office? (circle one)

Do the employees in the San Antonio office perform a
substantial role in the business' performance of a
commercially useful function or are a substantial part of the
business’ operations conducted in the San Antonio office?
circle one)

No

No

No

No

OIIRES.

Local Preference Program Identification Form 11/21/14
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City of San Antonio
Finance Department - Purchasing Division
Local Preference Program Identification Form

ACKNOWIL EDGEMENT
THE STATE OF TEXAS

| certify that my responses and the information provided on this Local Preference Program Identification Form
are true and correct to the best of my personal knowledge and belief and that | have made no willful
misrepresentations on this form, nor have | withheld any relevant information in my statements and answers to
questions. | am aware that any information given by me on this Local Preference Program Identification Form
may be investigated and | hereby give my full permission for any such investigation, including the inspection of
business records and site visits by City or its authorized representative. | fully acknowledge that any
misrepresentations or omissions in my responses and information may cause my offer to be rejected or contract
to be terminated. | further acknowledge that providing false information is grounds for debarment.

BIDDER'’S / RESPONDENT'S FULL NAME:

PatrickleClaire

(Prinylme) Zthor’;d 27

(Signature) Authorized Representative of Bidder / Respondent

resentative of Bidder / Respondent

Sales

Title

3-27-2017

Date

This Local Preference Identification Form must be submitted with the bidder’s /
respondent’s bid/proposal response.

Local Preference Program Identification Form 1172114
Page 4 of 4



009 - ATTACHMENTS
Attachment A
PRICE SCHEDULE
Local Preference Program (LPP) Ordinance

The 82nd Texas Legislature adopted a revision to the law that allowed the City of San Antonio (City) to adopt a policy that
would grant contracting preferences to local businesses for certain types of contracts. The City adopted such a policy,
known as the Local Preference Program, described in the San Antonio City Code Chapter 2, Article Xli, effective for
solicitations issued after May 1, 2013,

This solicitation is subject to the Local Preference Program. For more information on the program, refer to the Local
Preference Program ldentification Form attached to this solicitation.

In order to receive consideration the Local Bidder must complete and return the attached Local Preference Identification
Form.

ITEM PRICING
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION
1 3 1 Ton Four Full Door Cab Long Bed 4x2 Pickup Truck
PRICE EACH: $ No Bid
TOTAL: $

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
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PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

2 1 1 Ton Four Full Door Long Bed 4x2 Pickup Truck w/ Toolbox
PRICE EACH: $ No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)
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ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

3 1 1 Ton Four Full Door Long Bed 4x4 Pickup Truck With Toolbox
PRICE EACH: $ No Bid
TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID I[TEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

4 1 1 Ton Regular Cab 60” Cab to Axle DRW 4x2 9ft Flat Bed
With Non-removable Sides- NO LIFT GATE

PRICE EACH: $ No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF FLATBED OFFERED:

FLATBED WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

5 1 1 Ton 60" Cab to Axle, DRW 4x4 Flat Bed Body With Non-Removable Sides
with Pipe Rack & Lift Gate Truck

PRICE EACH: § No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF FLATBED & LIFT GATE OFFERED:

FLATBED & LIFT GATE WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

6 1 1 Ton Regular Cab DRW Hi Sides Dump Body w/ Lift Gate
PRICE EACH: § No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF FLATBED & LIFT GATE OFFERED:

FLATBED & LIFT GATE WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

7 2 1 Ton Regular Cab 84" CA DRW 4x2 w/Stake Bed and Lift Gate
PRICE EACH: $ No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF STAKE BED & LIFT GATE OFFERED:

STAKE BED & LIFT GATE WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

8 1 1 Ton Regular Cab 60” CA DRW with Stake Bed Body & Pintle Hitch- NO
LIFT GATE

PRICE EACH: § No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF STAKEBED OFFERED:

STAKE BED WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: -

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

9 3 1 Ton Cab & Chassis 84" Cab to Axle DRW Pickup Truck with Traffic
Utility Body

PRICE EACH: § No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF UTILITY BODY OFFERED:

UTILITY BODY WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: .

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

10 2 16,001-19,500 GVW Cab & Chassis Regular Cab 84" CA, 4x2 DRW Diesel
Service Body with 4,000 Ibs. Crane & Lift Gate

PRICE EACH: § No Bid

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF SERVICE BODY, CRANE & LIFTGATE OFFERED:

SERVICE BODY, CRANE & LIFTGATE WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YESINO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

11 1 16,001-19,500 GVW Cab & Chassis Regular Cab 84” CA, 4x2 DRW Diesel
Service Body with 5,000 Ibs. Crane & Lift Gate

PRICE EACH: $ No Bid

TOTAL: §
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YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF SERVICE BODY, CRANE & LIFTGATE OFFERED:

SERVICE BODY, CRANE & LIFTGATE WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)
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ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

12 1 19,501-26,000 GVW Chipper Truck
PRICE EACH: § No Bid
TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF CHIPPER CATCH BODY OFFERED:

CHIPPER CATCH BODY WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)
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ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

13 1 35K GVW 7 Cubic Yard Dump Truck — No Pintle Hitch
PRICE EACH: § 82,354.33
TOTAL: § 82,354.33

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Hino 338

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
Hino JO8E 260 hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

5 year

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 1.H. 10 East

Converse, TX 78109

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF DUMP BODY OFFERED:
Herrera 7 yard Dump Body

DUMP BODY WARRANTY:

1 Year

DUMP BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

Herrera Fabrication Inc.

DUMP BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
7118 John Ralston
Houston, TX 77044

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN __150 CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
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PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE

BID YITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)
es .

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

14 1 35K GVW 7 Cubic Yard Dump Truck —~ With Pintle Hitch
PRICE EACH: $ 85,961.56

TOTAL: § 85,961.56

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Hino 338

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
Hino JOBE 260 hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:
5 Year

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 I.H. 10 East
Converse, TX 78109

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF DUMP BODY OFFERED:
Herrera 7 yard Dump Body

DUMP BODY WARRANTY:

1 Year

DUMP BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

Herrera Fabrication Inc.
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DUMP BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
7118 John Ralston

Houston, TX 77044

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN __ 150 CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A .

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

Yes

ITEM QUNATITY DESCRIPTION
15 13 52K GVW 12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck
PRICE EACH: § 115,431.15
4
TOTAL: § 1,600,604.95

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Peterbilt 567

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
ISX 12350V 350 hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

1 year

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 |.H. 10 East
Converse, TX 78109

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF DUMP BODY OFFERED:
Herrera 12 Yard
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DUMP BODY WARRANTY:

1 year

DUMP BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

Herrera Fabrication Inc.

DUMP BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
7118 John Ralston

Houston, TX 77044

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN __ 150 CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A .

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE

BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)
Yes .

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

16 1 1 Ton Regular Cab DRW 4x4 Welder & Compressor Truck
ID

PRICE EACH: $ NOB

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:;
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WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF WELDER & COMPRESSOR OFFERED: -

WELDER & COMPRESSOR WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

17 6 52K GVW Conventional Tractor Truck
PRICE EACH: § 110,056.00

TOTAL: $ 660,336.00

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:
2018 Peterbilt 567

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
Paccar MX-13 485 hp

WARRANTY:

1 year

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
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8922 I.H. 10 East

Converse, TX 78109

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN ___ 150 CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: __ NA

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

Yes

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

18 1 60K GVWR 5th Wheel Tractor Truck
PRICE EACH: § NO BID

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:
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BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

19 13 35K GVW Brush Truck w/ Grappler
PRICE EACH: $ 170,198.40

TOTAL: $ 2,212,579.20

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Peterbilt 348

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
Paccar PX-9 330hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

1 year

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 |.H. 10 East

Converse, TX 78109

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF GRAPPLER BODY OFFERED:
BUILTRITE Model: Talon 88

GRAPPLER BODY WARRANTY:

1 Year

GRAPPLER BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Fox Truck World

GRAPPLER BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
965 FM 1516 S
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San Antonio, 78263

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN 150 CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

Yes

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

20 2 40K GVWR Brush Tractor Truck
PRICE EACH: $ NO BID

TOTAL: $

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
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BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

21 1 66,000 GVWR Catch Basin Cleaner Truck
PRICE EACH: $ NO BID

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF VACUUM & HIGH VELOCITY HYDRAULIC SEWER & CATCH BASIN CLEANER BODY
OFFERED:

VACUUM & HIGH VELOCITY HYDRAULIC SEWER & CATCH BASIN CLEANER BODY WARRANTY:

VACUUM & HIGH VELOCITY HYDRAULIC SEWER & CATCH BASIN CLEANER BODY WARRANTY SERVICE
PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

VACUUM & HIGH VELOCITY HYDRAULIC SEWER & CATCH BASIN CLEANER BODY WARRANTY SERVICE
PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
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DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

22 4 35 GVW Tanker Truck
PRICE EACH: $§ 110,780.11

TOTAL: § 443,120.44

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Hino 338

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
Hino JOBE 260 hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:
5 Year

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 |.H. 10 East

Converse, TX 78109

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF TANKER/SPRINKLER OFFERED:;
Etnyer 1900 Gal. with 8' spray bar

TANKER/SPRINKLER WARRANTY:

1 Year
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TANKER/SPRINKLER WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Cooper Equipment Co.

TANKER/SPRINKLER WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
17474 Judson Road
San Antonio, TX 78247

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN 150 _ CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A .

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

Yes

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

23 1 35K GVWR Turntable Winch Auger Truck
PRICE EACH: $ 199,771.00

TOTAL: $ 199,771.00

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Peterbilt 337

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
Paccar PX-9 330hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

1 year

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 |.H. 10 East
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Converse, TX 78109

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF TURNTABLE WINCH AUGER BODY OFFERED:
Altec Model DC45

TURNTABLE WINCH AUGER BODY WARRANTY:

1 year

TURNTABLE WINCH AUGER BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

Altec Industries

TURNTABLE WINCH AUGER BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
Gembler Road

San Antonio, TX 78260

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN __ 150 CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A .

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TQ THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

Yes

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION
24 1 Animal Care Unit
PRICE EACH: § NO BID

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:
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CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ANIMAL CONTROL BODY OFFERED:

ANIMAL CONTROL BODY WARRANTY:

ANIMAL CONTROL BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

ANIMAL CONTROL BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: .

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION
25 1 Half Round End Dump Trailer
PRICE EACH: § NO BID

TOTAL: $
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YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

26 1 28 Cubic Yard Live Bottom Trailer with Tarp Cover
PRICE EACH: § NO BID

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
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DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

27 3 Flat Bed Pintle Hitch Dovetail Trailer Minimum 40,000 GVWR
PRICE EACH: $ NO BID

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OFFERED:

WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)
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ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

28 1 14,001-16,000 GVW Utility Bed 41’ Working
Height Aerial Truck

PRICE EACH: § NO BID

TOTAL: §

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF AERIAL & SERVICE BODY OFFERED:

AERIAL & SERVICE BODY WARRANTY:

AERIAL & SERVICE BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:;

AERIAL & SERVICE BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
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PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

29 1 52K GVW 2,000 Gallon Fuel & Lube Truck
PRICE EACH: % 229,628.14

TOTAL: $ 229,628.14

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Peterbilt 567

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
1SX12 385V 385hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

1 year

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Tuck Center

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 |.H. 10 East
Converse, TX 78109

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF FUEL & LUBE BODY OFFERED:
Niece FL2000

FUEL & LUBE BODY WARRANTY:

1 year

FUEL & LUBE BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

Niece Equipment
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FUEL & LUBE BODY WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
17401 1-35
Buda, TX 78610

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN __ 150 CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

Yes

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

30 2 19,501- 26,000 Four Full Door GVW Flat/Stake Bed Truck w/ Lift Gate and
Tow Package

PRICE EACH: $ NO BID

TOTAL: $

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF FLAT/STAKE BED & LIFT GATE OFFERED:

FLAT/STAKE BED & LIFT GATE WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE:;

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

31 2 14,001-16,000 GVW Cabover 14’ Box Truck with Lift Gate
PRICE EACH: $§ 50,313.54

TOTAL: § 100,627.08

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED:
2018 Hino 155

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP):
Hino JOSE-TP 210 hp

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY:
5 Year

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME:
Rush Truck Center

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
8922 |.H. 10 East

Converse, TX 78109
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF BOX & LIFT GATE OFFERED:
Morgan 14' Dry Van Body & Maxon TE-20 72"x 32" + 4" 2000lb cap. liftgate

BOX & LIFT GATE WARRANTY:

1 Year

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN 150  CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE: N/A

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: N/A

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT
THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE? (YES/NO)

Yes

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION

32 1 16,001 -~ 19,500 Ib. GVW 60” Cab to Axle, DRW, 4x4 Flat Bed Body wi/Lift
Gate

PRICE EACH: § NO BID

TOTAL: $

YEAR, MAKE & MODEL OF CAB & CHASSIS OFFERED

SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF ENGINE OFFERED (INCLUDE SAE NET HP).

CAB & CHASSIS WARRANTY

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY NAME

WARRANTY SERVICE PROVIDER FACILITY ADDRESS:
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SPECIFIC MAKE & MODEL OF BOX & LIFT GATE OFFERED:

BOX & LIFT GATE WARRANTY:

DELIVERY WILL BE MADE WITHIN CALENDER DAYS AFTER ISSUANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER.
PRODUCTION CUT-OFF DATE:

INDICATE THE LAST DAY THAT THE CITY CAN PLACE ORDERS UNDER THIS CONTRACT WITHOUT MISSING
THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE: i

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FOR ALL ORDERS PLACED PRIOR TO THIS CUT OFF DATE. IN THE EVENT

THAT CITY DOES NOT AWARD A CONTRACT PRIOR TO PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE, CAN BIDDER PROVIDE
BID ITEMS, AT THE BID PRICE SUBMITTED, AFTER THE PRODUCTION CUT OFF DATE?" (YES/NO)

Prompt Payment Discount: % days. (If no discount is offered, Net 30 will apply.)
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