Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
_	5 . W.F. III . F		Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Vermeer Equipment of Texas	H & E Equipment Services	Centerline Supply	Anderson Machinery Company	RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Cooper Equipment Co.	Nueces Power Equipment	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
1	Minimum 74 HP Grounds Wood Chipper: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	\$37,500.00 \$37,500.00 2017 Vermeer BC1000XL Deutz TD2.9L Tier 4 Final 74 HP 1 year/1,000 hour on drum) Vermeer Equipment of Texas 16593 IH 35 N, Selma, TX 78154 45 Days N/A		No Bio	s No Bid	No Bio	3 No Bio	No Bid	No Bid	l No Bio	l No Bid
2	Non Self Propelled Trailer Mounted Air Compressor: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:	1	No Bid	\$41,935.00 \$41,935.00 2017 Sullair 375DPQ- CAT iT4 Caterpillar C4.4, 115 hp 1 Year on machine, 2 years on air end H & E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX		d No Bid	No Bid	NAS \$41,876.00 \$41,876.00 \$41,876.00 2017 Chicago Pneumatic CPS 400 John Deere, 4045 HFC92 (115 Net HP) 24 month, unlimited hours engine, 24 months unlimited hours compressol element Associated Supply Co. Inc., ASCC 4146 IH 10 East, San Antonio, Texas		No Bid	I No Bio	i No Bid
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			78220 30 Days 12-1-2017 12-1-2017 No				78219 60 Days 11-1-17 9-1-17 No				

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Local Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Vermeer Equipment of Texas	H & E Equipment Services	Centerline Supply	Anderson Machinery Company	RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Cooper Equipment Co.	Nueces Power Equipment	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
4	26' Scissor Lift: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Non Self Propelled Skid Mounted Welder/Generator: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):	1		\$14,325.00 \$14,325.00 \$14,325.00 2017 Skyjack Slyjack Slyjack 29 year full machine, 5 years structural components H & E Equipment Services 5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220 30 Days 12-1-2017 Yes	210-224-4600 No Bio		830-632-3100 No Bio	210-333-8000 \$16,650.00 \$16,650.00 2017 JLG 2632 ES 12 months Associated Supply Co Inc., ASCC 4146 IH 10 East, San Antonio, Texas 78219 30 Days 11-1-17 9-1-17 No	210-657-5151 No Bid	361-548-7463 No Bid	210-648-4444 No Bid	210-213-3143 No Bid
	Warranty:			3 years								
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			H & E Equipment Services								
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220								
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:			30 Days 12-1-2017 12-1-2017	•							
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			Yes								

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Local Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Vermeer Equipment of Texas	H & E Equipment Services	Centerline Supply	Anderson Machinery Company	RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Cooper Equipment Co.	Nueces Power Equipment	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
5	DELETED:											
6	Walk Behind Extrusion Thermoplastic Applicator: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Warranty:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$22,495.00 \$22,495.00 2017, CH265/360M w/ full set of set dies / Trantex Mfg, Manufacturers	No Bid	No Bio	t No Bio	t No Bid	No Bio	l No Bio	l No Bid
	wanany.				Warranty							
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:				Centerline Supply, San Antonio							
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				1731 S. San Marcos #932, San Antonio, TX 78207							
	Delivery:				30 Days	:						
	Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				May 22, 2017 May 22, 2017 No							
7	Walk Behind Scrubber/Asphalt Scarifier:	2			1							
	Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:		No Bid	\$5,894.00 \$11,788.00 2017 Ecko CPM-10- 13H W/A208 Drum Assembly	\$16,850.00 2017 Graco 390FF	No Bid	No Bio	d No Bio	d No Bid	No Bio	l No Bio	l No Bid
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):			Honda GX 390, 13HP								
	Warranty:			1 year machine (90 day drum	,							
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			assembly) H & E Equipment Services	Centerline,							
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX 78220	1731 S. San Marcos #932, San Antonio, TX 78207							
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off			30 Days 12-1-2017 12-1-2017 Yes	May 22, 2017 May 22, 2017							
	date:			Yes	, No							

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Bid 1 Vermeer Equipment	Non-Local H & E Equipment	Non-Local Centerline Supply	Local Anderson Machinery	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co.	Non-Local Associated Supply	Local Cooper Equipment	Bid 1 Nueces Power	Local Waukesha-Pearce	Local Holt Cat
			of Texas	Services		Company		Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Co.	Equipment	Industries, Inc.	
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
8	Tracked Milling Machine: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	\$444,912.00 \$444,912.00 2017 Bomag BM1300/35	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS \$438,744.00 \$438,744.00 2017 Wirtgen 120CFI Milling Machine		d No Bid
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):					MTU (Mercedes) Series 1000 6R 350HP				Cummins QSL9 C- 300 333hp		
	Warranty:					12 consecutive months of 1,000 hours whichever				12 months or 1000 Hours whichever Occurs First		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:					comes first Anderson Machinery				Nueces Power		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:					Company 9415 N. E. Loop 410				Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North, Converse, TX 78109		
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:					90-150 9-30-17 9-30-17 No				30-150 Days 12/31/2017 10/31/2017 No		
9	DELETED:											
10	Trailer Attenuator :	1				1						
	Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:		No Bid	No Bid	\$30,750.00 \$30,750.00 2017, Scorpion, TL-3 12 Volt w/ Wanco IS Light Arrow Board		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	d No Bid
	Warranty:				Mfg. Warranty	•						
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:				Centerline Supply San Antonio							
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				1731 S. San Marcos #932, San Antonio, TX 78207							
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:				30 Days May 22, 2017 May 22, 2017							
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				No	1						

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
			Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment				Centerline Supply		RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply		Nueces Power	Waukesha-Pearce	Holt Cat
			of Texas	Services		Company		Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Co.	Equipment	Industries, Inc.	
								ASCO Equipment Co.				
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY			San Antonio,	San Antonio,	New Braunfels,	San Antonio,	San Antonio,	Converse,		San Antonio,
			TX 78154		TX 78207	TX 78219	TX 78132	TX 78219	TX 78247			TX 78222
			210-337-7700	210-655-0048	210-224-4600	210-661-2366	830-632-3100	210-333-8000	210-657-5151	361-548-7463	210-648-4444	210-213-3143
11	Enclosed Tracked Skid Loader:	1						1				
''	Enclosed Tracked Skid Loader.	'		NAS				NAS				
	Price Each:		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$59,376.81	\$51,300.00	No Bid	No bid	No Bid	\$71,872.00
	Total:			\$54,715.00			\$59,376.81	\$51,300.00				\$71,872.00
	Percentage between lowest responsive											21.04%
	bid and local bid:											
	Price Differential:											\$12,495.19
	Year, Make & Model Offered:			2017 Gehl RT250			2017 John Deere	2017 Case TV380				2017 Caterpillar
							331G					299D2
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered			Deutz TD 3.6 Tier IV,			Yanmar 4TNV94FHT	FPT F513 FL413 E*				Cat C3.8 DIT Tier 4f
	(Include SAE net HP):			74.3 HP			91.2 HP					95 HP
	ľ.											
	Warranty:			1 years			1 year full machine					12 months/unlimited
							unlimited hours / 2nd					hours, total machine
							year PT&H up to					
							2000 hrs.	•				
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			H & E Equipment			RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Co				Holt Cat
	Training Corrido Frontaci Facility Hame.			Services			TO Equipmont out	Inc., ASCO				Tion out
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			5327 Tex-Con Rd.,			19275 N. IH 35, New	4146 IH 10 East,				5665 S.E. Loop 410,
				San Antonio, TX			Braunfels, TX 78132					San Antonio, TX
				78220				78219				78222
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:			30 Days			60-90 Days					130 Days
	Production Cut-off Date:			12-1-2017			12-31-17	12-30-17				Unknown
	Last day order can be placed without			12-1-2017			12-31-17	8-20-17				Unknown
1	missing cut-off date:			.2 . 2017			.20117	5 20 17				S.II.IOWII
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off			No			No	No.				No
1	date:							1				
10	DELETED:											
12	DELETED.											
			1	1	I	1	1	ı	l	1	1	

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Bid 1 Vermeer Equipment	Non-Local H & E Equipment	Non-Local Centerline Supply	Local Anderson Machinery	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co.	Non-Local Associated Supply	Local Cooper Equipment	Bid 1 Nueces Power	Local Waukesha-Pearce	Local Holt Cat
	,		of Texas	Services		Company		Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.		Equipment	Industries, Inc.	
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132	San Antonio, TX 78219	TX 78247	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222
			210-337-7700	210-655-0048	210-224-4600	210-001-2300	830-632-3100	210-333-8000	210-657-5151	361-548-7463	210-648-4444	210-213-3143
13	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader w/ Multiple Attachments:	1		NAS				1				
	Price Each:		No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$51,715.50	\$53,325.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total:			\$50,487.00			\$51,715.50	\$53,325.00				
	Year, Make & Model Offered:			2017 Gehl V330			2017 John Deere 330G	2017 Case SV340				
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):			Yanmar 4TNV98CT- NMS, Tier IV, 70.7HP			Yanmar 4TNV94FHT 91.2 HP	FPT F513FL413E' B002				
	Warranty:			1 Year			1 year full machine unlimited hours / 2nd year PT&H up to 2000 hrs.					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			H & E Equipment Services				Associated Supply Co				
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			5327 Tex-Con Rd.,			19275 N. IH 35, New					
				San Antonio, TX 78220			Braunfels, TX 78132	San Antonio, Texas 78219				
	Delivery:			60 Days			60-90 Days	100 Days				
	Production Cut-off Date:			12-1-2017			12-31-17	12-30-17				
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:			12-1-2017			12-31-17	9-20-17				
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			No			No	No				
14	Motor Grader, Diesel 4 Ton Combo Drum &	5										
	Pneumatic Tired Roller		N- Did	N- Did	N- Di-	↑ ↑ ↑ ↑ ↑ ↑ ↑ ↑ ↑ ↑	N- Di-	NAS	\$50.505.00	\$55.540.00	N- Did	NAS
	Price Each: Total:		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$54,586.00 \$272,930.00	No Bid	\$48,483.00 \$242,415.00	\$52,595.00 \$262,975.00	\$55,549.60 \$277,748.00	No Bid	\$52,295.00 \$261,475.00
	Year, Make & Model Offered:					2017, Bomag BW138AC-5		2017 Case DV45CC	2017 Dynapac CC1300C	2017 Hamm HD 13 VT Combo Roller		2017 Caterpillar CC34B with ballast
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered					Tier 4 Kubota V2403		Yanmar 4TNV88,	2017 Kubota	Kubota V2403-CR		option Cat C2.2Tier 4f
	(Include SAE net HP):					45.1 HP		40 Net Hp	V2203-M 49 H.P.	49.3HP		48.8 hp
	Warranty:					12 consecutive months of 1,000 hours whichever		12 Month unlimited Hours	1 year/1,500 hrs.	12 months or 1000 hours whichever comes first		12 months/unlimited hours, total machine
						comes first						
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:					Anderson Machinery Company		Associated Supply Co Inc., ASCO	Cooper Equipment Co.	Nueces Power Equipment		Holt Cat
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:					9415 N. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX		4146 IH 10 East, San Antonio, Texas	17474 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX	4697 FM 1516 North, Converse, TX 78109		5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX
						78219		78219	78247	Converse, 1A 78109		78222
	Delivery:					60-120		120 Days	75 Days			160 Days
	Production Cut-off Date:					9-30-17		12-30-17	Oct 1, 2017	12/31/2017		Unknown
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:					9-30-17		9-1-17	Oct 1, 2017	10/31/2017		Unknown
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:					Not Provided		No	Yes	No		No

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
1			Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment			H & E Equipment	Centerline Supply		RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply	Cooper Equipment	Nueces Power	Waukesha-Pearce	Holt Cat
			of Texas	Services		Company		Company, Inc. dba,	Co.	Equipment	Industries, Inc.	
								ASCO Equipment Co.				
0400000400			40500 111 05 11 11	5007 T O D I	1701 0 0 11	044511 5 1 440	40075 1111.05	4440 111 40 5	47474	4007 FM 4540 M	0740 0 5 1 440	5005.0.5.1440
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma,	San Antonio,	#932 San Antonio,	San Antonio,	New Braunfels.	San Antonio,	San Antonio,	Converse,	San Antonio.	San Antonio.
item	Description	QII		TX 78220	TX 78207			TX 78219			TX 78222	TX 78222
				210-655-0048	210-224-4600	210-661-2366	830-632-3100	210-333-8000			210-648-4444	210-213-3143
			210-331-1100	210-003-0040	210-224-4000	210-001-2300	030-032-3100	210-333-0000	210-037-3131	301-340-7403	210-040-4444	210-213-3143
15	DELETED:											
16	3 Cubic Yard Articulated Wheeled Loader	1										
	w/ 72" Forks:											
	Price Each:		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$146,990.46		No Bid		\$168,974.00	
	Total:						\$146,990.46	\$137,250.00		\$121,857.91	\$168,974.00	
	Percentage between lowest responsive										23.11%	
	bid and local bid: Price Differential:										\$31,724.00	
	Year, Make & Model Offered:						2017 John Deere	2017 Case 621G		2017 Hyundai	\$31,724.00 2017 Komatsu	
	rear, make a model Offered.						544K II			HL940TM	2017 Komatsu WA270-8	
							344K II			TIL940TW	VVA210-6	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered						John Deere Power	FPT F4HFE 613W,		Cummins QSB6.7	Komatsu SAA6D107E	
	(Include SAE net HP):						Tech PVS6068	(151 Net HP)		156 HP	3 149 HP	
	·						163 HP					
	Warranty:							3 yr. / 3000 hr. factory		Standard Warranty 3	1 Year/Unlimited	
							unlimited hours			Years or 3000 Hours,	Hours	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:						PDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Co		Whichever Nueces Power	Waukesha-Pearce	
	warranty Service Flovider Facility Name.						KDO Equipment Co.	Inc., ASCO		Equipment	Industries, Inc.	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:						19275 N. IH 35, New			4697 FM 1516 North,	3740 SE Loop 410,	
	,						Braunfels, TX 78132			Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX	
							·	78219		·	78222	
	Delivery:						60-90 Days			30-150 Days	60-90 Days	
	Production Cut-off Date:						12-31-17	12-30-17		6/30/2017	8-1-2017	
	Last day arder can be placed without						12-31-17	9-20-17		6/30/2017	8-1-2017	
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:						12-31-17	9-20-17		6/30/2017	8-1-2017	
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off						No	No		No	No	
	date:						INO	INC		INO	INU	
	uale.		I	l	l	I		I	l			

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
			Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Vermeer Equipment of Texas	H & E Equipment Services	Centerline Supply	Anderson Machinery Company	RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Cooper Equipment Co.	Nueces Power Equipment	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
17	Tracked Excavator Minimum 10¹ Telescopic Boom: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Tracked Excavator w/ Telestick Attachment	1	No Bid	l No Bid	No Bio	d No Bid	l No Bio	d No Bio	No Bio	d No Bio	\$245,860.00 \$245,860.00 2017 Gradal X1.3200 V Volvo TAD571 VE 152 HF 1 Year/1,500 Hours Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc 3740 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 90-120 Days 9-30-2017 9-30-2017	
	And A8" Bucket: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No Bid	l No Bid	No Bio	d No Bid	d No Bid	d No Bio	No Bid	d No Bid	\$392,600.00 \$392,600.00 2017 Gradal XL5200 V Volvo TAD571 VE 153 HF 1 Year/1,500 Hours Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc 3740 SE Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 90-120 Days 9-30-2017 9-30-2017	

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
L'			Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Vermeer Equipment of Texas	H & E Equipment Services	Centerline Supply	Anderson Machinery Company	RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Cooper Equipment Co.	Nueces Power Equipment	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
19	Low Ground Pressure Dozer w/ High Sprockets: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bio	d No Bio	I No Bio	l No Bid	\$346,109.33 2017 John Deere 850k John Deere Power Tech PSS 6068 205 HF 1 year full machine unlimited hours	\$325,250.00 2017 Case 2050M FPT F4HFE613J, 214 Net HF 3 yr. / 3000 hr. factory Associated Supply Co Inc., ASCC / 4146 IH 10 East San Antonio, Texas 78218 150 Days / 7-31-17		No Bio	No Bid	\$314,295.00 \$314,295.00 2017 Caterpillar D6N LPG Cat C7.1 ACERT Tier 4f 182 hp 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine Holt Cat 5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 155 Days Unknown Unknown
20	Tracked Loader with 3.0 Cubic Yard Bucket with Teeth: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bio	3 No Bio	d No Bid	l No Bid	NAS \$255,989.86 \$255,989.86 \$255,989.86 2017 John Deere 755K John Deere Power Tech PVX6068 190 HF 1 year full machine unlimited hours RDO Equipment Co 19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132 60-90 Days 12-31-17 12-31-17		l No Bid	NAS \$266,312.00 \$266,312.00 \$266,312.00 2016 Liebherr LR636 Liebherr D934A7 181 HF One Year or 2000 Hours Whichever Comes Firs Nueces Power Equipmen 4697 FM 1516 North, Converse, TX 78109 30-150 Days 12/31/2017 9/30/2017		\$269,774.00 \$269,774.00 2017 Caterpillar 963K Cat C7.1 ACERT Tier 4f 193 hp 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine Holt Cat 5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222 145 Days Unknown Unknown

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local	Local Bid 1	Local	Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Vermeer Equipment of Texas	H & E Equipment Services	Centerline Supply		RDO Equipment Co.	Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Cooper Equipment Co.	Nueces Power Equipment	Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
21	DELETED:											
22	Asphalt Paver: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	l No Bio	No Bid	No Bio	l No Bid	\$171,168.00 \$171,168.00 2017 AP355F
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):											Cat C3.3B Tier 4f 74 hp
	Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:											12 months/unlimited hours, total machine Holt Cat
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:											5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:											78222 100 Days Unknown Unknown No
23	Enclosed Tracked Skid Steer with Asphalt Float and Planer Attachments: Base Unit Price Each: Base Unit Total: Option A, Asphalt Float - Price Each: Option Total:	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NAS \$63,185.03 \$252,740.12 \$13,480.47 \$53,921.88 Not Specified		No Bid	No Bio	l No Bid	\$88,241.00 \$352,964.00 \$13,091.00 \$52,364.00 Gecon ST200
	Option B, Planar Attachment - Price Each:	4					\$23,849.23	;				\$24,940.00
	Option B Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:						\$95,396.92 Not Specified 2017 John Deere 333G	ļ				\$99,760.00 Caterpillar PC412B 2017 Caterpillar 297D2 XHP
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:						Yanmar 4TNV94FHT 100 HP 1 year full machine unlimited hours / 2nd year PT&H up to) I				Cat C3.8 DIT Tier 4f 110 HP 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:						2000 hrs RDO Equipment Co.					Holt Cat
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:						19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132					5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:						60-90 Days 12-31-17					160 Days Unknown
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off						12-31-17 No					Unknown
	date:						140	1				NO

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment			Non-Local H & E Equipment Services	Non-Local Centerline Supply	Anderson Machinery Company	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co.	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Local Cooper Equipment Co.	Bid 1 Nueces Power Equipment	Local Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY		San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
24	Class 8 GVWR Mastic Surface Sealer Distributor Truck: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	No Bid	No Bio	d No Bio		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:											
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:											
25	Sweeper Scrubber, Riding (Broom Sweeper): Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	NAS \$49,918.00 \$49,918.00 2017 Laymor Sweepmaster 400		NAS \$50,109.00 \$50,109.00 2017 Laymor SM400	No Bic	NAS \$46,922.00 \$46,922.00 2017 Laymor SM400	\$54,146.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):			Kubota 3600 74HP		Kubota 3600 74HP		Kubota 3600 74 Net	2017 Cummins 74 H.P. Tier 4f			
	Warranty:			1 Year		12 consecutive months of 1,000 hours whichever		12 mos., 1000 hi	1 yr./1200 hrs. Body & Engine			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			H & E Equipment Services		comes first Anderson Machinery Company		Associated Supply Co	Cooper Equipment			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			5327 Tex-Con Rd., San Antonio, TX		9415 N. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX		4146 IH 10 East, San Antonio, Texas	17474 Judson Rd. San Antonio, TX			
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:			78220 90 Days 12-1-2017	;	78219 60-90 9-30-17		78219 90 Days 12-30-17	60 Days			
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:			12-1-2017		9-30-17		9-30-17	Dec 1, 2017			
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			No		Not Provided		No	Yes			

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Non-Local							Local		
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment			Non-Local H & E Equipment Services	Non-Local Centerline Supply	Anderson Machinery Company	Non-Local RDO Equipment Co.	Non-Local Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO Equipment Co.	Local Cooper Equipment Co.	Bid 1 Nueces Power Equipment	Local Waukesha-Pearce Industries, Inc.	Local Holt Cat
6100008462		LD	16593 IH 35 North	5327 Tex-Con Rd.	1731 S. San Marcos #932	9415 N. E. Loop 410	19275 N IH 35	4146 IH-10 East	17474 Judson Rd.	4697 FM 1516 N.	3740 S E Loop 410	5665 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Selma, TX 78154 210-337-7700	San Antonio, TX 78220 210-655-0048	San Antonio, TX 78207 210-224-4600	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-661-2366	New Braunfels, TX 78132 830-632-3100	San Antonio, TX 78219 210-333-8000	San Antonio, TX 78247 210-657-5151	Converse, TX 78109 361-548-7463	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-648-4444	San Antonio, TX 78222 210-213-3143
	2.3 Cubic Yard Articulated Wheeled Loader with 60" Fork Attachments: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:	3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$124,164.00 \$372,492.00 7.97%	\$128,269.73 \$384,809.19		No Bid	\$121,858.00 \$365,574.00 5.96%	\$418,845.00)
	Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered:					\$27,492.00 2017 Liugong 835H	2017 John Deere 444k	2017 Case 521G		\$20,574.00 2017 Hyunda HL940TM	i 2017 Komatsu	ı
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):					Perkins 1204F- E44TA, 125HP	John Deere Power Tech PSS 4045 124 HF	FPT F4HFE 413 NB	•	Cummins QSB6.7 156 HF	Komatsu SAA4D107E 2 126 Ne	6
	Warranty:					12 consecutive months	1 year full machine	3 yr. / 3000 hr. factory		Standard Warranty 3 Years or 3000 Hours Whichever		d
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:					Anderson Machinery Company 9415 N. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX	19275 N. IH 35, New	Associated Supply Co Inc., ASCC 4146 IH 10 East, San Antonio, Texas		Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North Converse, TX 78109	3740 SE Loop 410,	
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:					78219 150-180 9-30-17	60-90 Days 12-31-17	78219 90 Days 12-30-17		30-150 Days 6/30/2017	78222 45-60 Days 8-1-2017	3
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:					9-30-17 No	12-31-17 No	9-30-17 No	,	6/30/2017 No		
	Tracked Loader with 3.2 cubic yard Multi- Purpose Bucket3/14/2017 Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$268,125.96 2017 John Deere	No Bio	l No Bid	NAS \$278,095.00 \$278,095.00 Liebherr LR636)	\$285,492.00 \$285,492.00 2017 Caterpillar 963K
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:						755k John Deere Powel Tech PVX 6068 1 year full machine unlimited hours			Liebherr D934A7 181 HF One Year or 2000 Hours Whichevel Comes Firs		Cat C7.1 ACERT Tier 4f 193 hp 12 months/unlimited hours, total machine
ļ	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:						RDO Equipment Co.			Nueces Power Equipment	r	Holt Car
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:						19275 N. IH 35, New Braunfels, TX 78132			4697 FM 1516 North, Converse, TX 78109		5665 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:						60-90 Days 12-31-17 12-31-17			30-150 Days 12/31/2017 9/30/2017	,	145 Days Unknown Unknown
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:						No			No		No
28	DELETED:											
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
	Total: Total Award:		\$37,500.00 \$37,500.00	\$230,255.00 \$75,135.00	\$70,095.00 \$53,245.00	\$1,140,443.00 \$444,912.00		\$1,259,988.00 \$345,000.00		\$1,748,330.91 \$121,857.91		

Vermeer Equipment of Texas bid number 2, bid item number 9 which was deleted.

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373		San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
1	Minimum 74 HP Grounds Wood Chipper: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	No Bio	d No Bio	d No Bid
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:										
2	Non Self Propelled Trailer Mounted Air Compressor: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bic	No Bio	d No Bio	d No Bio
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:										
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date;										

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.		Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
3	26' Scissor Lift: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Non Self Propelled Skid Mounted Welder/Generator: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered	1	No Bid	\$19,108.00 2017 Genie GS2646 12 month entire unit, 36 month hydraulics, 60 month structural warranty	\$16,678.00 \$16,678.00 2017 Genie GS-2646, 26" Scissor Lift 1 year, 12 months unlimited hours B-C Equipment Sales, Inc. 5330 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78222 50 Days 90 Days From bid Date (06-08-17) No		No Bid		No Bio		
	(Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:										
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:										
1	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:										

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
5	DELETED:										
6	Walk Behind Extrusion Thermoplastic Applicator: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10,700.00* 2017 M-E Companies, Inc.	3	d No Bio
	Warranty:								Apollo I 6 Month Warranty		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:								M-B Companies, Inc		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:								79 Montgomery St. Montgomery, PA		
	Delivery:								From Stock or 21-28	5	
	Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:								12/31/17 12/1/17 Yes	,	
7	Walk Behind Scrubber/Asphalt Scarifier:	2									
	Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	No Bio	d No Bio
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):										
	Warranty:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:										
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:										

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
8	Tracked Milling Machine: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$469,847.00 2017 Wirtger W150CFI Milling	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:									Machine 6-Cylinder Diese Engine: Cummin QSL 9 C-380 AG4 12 Months or 1000 Hours whicheve	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:									comes firs Nueces Powe Equipmen 4697 FM 1516 North	t f
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:									Converse, TX 7810S 30-150 Days 12/31/2017 10/31/2017	
9	DELETED:										
10	Trailer Attenuator :	1									
	Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	l No Bid
	Warranty:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:										
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:										

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local			Local				Local	
			Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment				B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462	Ц	D 8	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description Q1	7		Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109		San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061		San Antonio, TX 78220
11	Enclosed Tracked Skid Loader: 1	1									
	Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive		No Bid	No Bid	\$83,649.00 \$83,649.00	No Bid	\$70,850.00 \$70,850.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	bid and local bid: Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered:				2017 ASV RT 120		2016/2017 Kubota SVL 95.2				
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):				Cummins QSF 3.8, 120 HP @ 2800RPM		Kubota V3800 Tier 4, net HP 87, Gross HP 96.4				
	Warranty:				12 months, 1 year, 1,000 hours		24 Mos or 2,000 Hours whichever occurs first, 12 mos., 1,000 hours on tracks				
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:				B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.		Ewald Kubota				
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				5330 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78222		1900 I-10 W., Seguin, TX 78155				
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:				50 Days or before 90 Days from bid date		10 Days Not known				
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				90 Days From bid Date (06-08-17) No		Not Provided Not Provided				
12	DELETED:										

Opened: For:	March 8, 2017 Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Local Bid 1 Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Non-Local American Material Handling	Non-Local B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Local Bid 2 Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Non-Local Ewald Kubota	Non-Local H & V Equipment	Non-Local M-B Companies, Inc.	Local Bid 2 Nueces Power Equipment	Non-Local ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
13	Enclosed Wheeled Skid Loader w/ Multiple Attachments: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$57,500.00 \$57,500.00 2017 ASV VS-75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	l No Bio	l No Bio
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:				Deutz TD2.9 L 4 Liquid Cooled Diesel, 74HP @ 2800 RPM 12 months, 1 year, 1,000 hours						
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				B-C Equipment Sales, Inc. 5330 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78222						
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off				On or before 35 Days 90 Days From bid Date 90 Days From bid Date (06-08-17) Not Provided						
14	date: Motor Grader, Diesel 4 Ton Combo Drum & Pneumatic Tired Roller Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	5	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,500.00 \$282,500.00 2017 Sakai TW504 - 4 Ton Combo Drum &	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	l No Bio	l No Bi
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):				Pneumatic Kubota, D1703-M-D1- EF03 (Tier 4) 24 @ 2200RPM						
	Warranty:				1 year, 12 months						
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:				B-C Equipment Sales, Inc. 5330 Tex-Con Rd.						
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:				San Antonio, TX 78222 30 Days 90 Days after bid date						
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				90 Days after bid date (06-08-17) No						

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local			Local				Local	
			Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC		B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373		San Antonio, TX 78220				New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
15	DELETED:										
16	3 Cubic Yard Articulated Wheeled Loader w/ 72" Forks: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$156,155.00 \$156,155.00		No Bid	\$139,010.70 \$139,010.70		No Bid	\$131,029.00 \$131,029.00
	Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered:				2017 Kawasaki 7027 Wheel Loader, 3.4 Cu Yd.			2017 Doosan DL220-5			2017 Volvo D60H Wheel Loader
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):				Cummins QSB 6.7 Tier 4I, 168 HP @ 2200			Doosan DL06 (119.0 Hp. Net)			Volvo D6J Diesel Tier 4 Final, 165 Net SAE HP
	Warranty:				2 years, 2,000 hours			One Year			12 Months/2,500 Hrs. Full Machine
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:				B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.			H & V Equipment, Inc.			ROMCO Equipment Company
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				5330 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78222			3307 S. E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78222			1042 S.E. Loop 410, San Antonio, TX 78220
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:				37 Days 90 Days From bid Date			45-60 Days None			150 Days 3/06/2017
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:				90 Days From bid Date (06-08-17)			N/A			3/06/2017
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				No			N/A			Yes until 6/1/17

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.		Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
17	Tracked Excavator Minimum 10' Telescopic Boom: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	No Bid
18	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Tracked Excavator w/ Telestick Attachment and 48" Bucket: Price Each: Total:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	No Bid
	Total: Specific Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date:										

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC		B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
19	Low Ground Pressure Dozer w/ High Sprockets: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	d No Bio	d No Bid
20	Tracked Loader with 3.0 Cubic Yard Bucket with Teeth: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	d No Bio	d No Bid

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
21	DELETED:										
22	Asphalt Paver: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bio	d No Bio	NAS \$151,946.00 \$151,946.00 2016 LeeBoy 8510 Track Asphalt pave
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):										Kubota water coole turbocharged, 74 Hi Tier 4 Fina
	Warranty:										12 Months/1,000 Hrs Full Machin
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:										ROMCO Equipmer Compar 1042 S.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, T.
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:										7822 10 Day 6/01/201 6/01/201
23	Enclosed Tracked Skid Steer with Asphalt Float and Planer Attachments: Base Unit Price Each: Base Unit Total: Option A, Asphalt Float - Price Each: Option Total:	4	No Bid	No Bid	NAS \$83,649.00 \$334,596.00 \$43,000.00 \$172,000.00 Simex PL-C1000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bic	d No Bio	I No B
	Option B, Planar Attachment - Price Each:	4			Planer \$16,000.00	•					
	Option B Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:				\$64,000.00 Simex ST 200 Float 2017 ASV, RT -120 Compact Track						
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:				Loader Cummins QSF 3.8L, 120HP @ 2800 12 months, 1 year, 1,000 hours						
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:				B-C Equipment Sales,						
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				Inc. 5330 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX						
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:				78222 Up to 60 Days 90 Days From bid						
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				Date 90 Days From bid Date (06-08-17) No						

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
24	Class 8 GVWR Mastic Surface Sealer Distributor Truck: Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Sweeper Scrubber, Riding (Broom Sweeper): Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:	1	\$283,972.00 \$283,972.00 \$283,972.00 \$2018 Freightliner 114SD with BlackRoads Inc. Crown FD3000 Mastic Surface Seal Applicator Detroit DD13, 410HP / 1550 Ft. Lbs. of Torque Chassis, Body and Hydraulics = 1 year / 100K Miles - Engine = 2 years / 250K Miles - Transmission = 2 years / Unlimited Doggett Freightliner of South Texas. LLC 8700 IH 10 East, Converse, TX 78109 180-240 Days 9/30/2017 7/30/2107 Yes		NAS \$50,806.00 \$50,806.00 \$50,806.00 2017 Superior DT80K Riding Broom Sweeper Kubota Diesel, 84.5HP @ 2500 RPM Model: V3600T 1 year, 1,000 hours	\$353,107.00 \$353,107.00 2018 Freightliner 114SD with Bergkamp MAXX MA30 Mastic Applicator Detroit DD13, 410HP /1550 Ft. Lbs. of Torque Chassis, Body and Hydraulics = 1 year / 100K Miles - 1 year / 100K Miles - 1 year / 100K Miles - 1 Transmission = 2 years / 250K Miles - Transmission = 2 years / Unlimited Miles Doggett Freightliner of South Texas. LLC 8700 IH 10 East, Converse, TX 78109 180-240 Days 9/30/2017 7/30/2107 Yes					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				5330 Tex-Con Rd. San Antonio, TX 78222 37 Days 90 Days From bid Date 90 Days From bid Date (06-08-17) Not Provided						

Opened:	March 8, 2017		Local Bid 1	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local	Non-Local	Non-Local	Local Bid 2	Non-Local
For:	Purchase of Medium and Heavy Equipment		Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	American Material Handling	B-C Equipment Sales, Inc.	Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC	Ewald Kubota	H & V Equipment	M-B Companies, Inc.	Nueces Power Equipment	ROMCO Equipment Co.
6100008462		LD	8700 IH 10 East	3651 Mars Hill Road	5330 Tex-Con Road	8700 IH 10 East	1900 I-10 West	3307 S.E. Loop 410	1615 Wisconsin Ave., PO Box 200	4697 FM1516 North	1042 S.E. Loop 410
Item	Description	QTY	Converse, TX 78109 210-277-4373	Watkinsville, GA 30677	San Antonio, TX 78220	Converse, TX 78109	Seguin, TX 78155	San Antonio TX 78222	New Holstein, WI 53061	Converse, TX 78109	San Antonio, TX 78220
26	2.3 Cubic Yard Articulated Wheeled Loader with 60" Fork Attachments: Price Each: Total: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:	3	No Bid	No Bid	\$122,800.00 \$368,400.00		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$142,805.00 \$428,415.00 24.18%	
	Price Differential: Year, Make & Model Offered:				2017 Kawasaki 6227. 25 Cu Yd. Wheel Loader					\$83,415.00 2017 Liebherr L526	2017 Volvo L50H Wheel Loader
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP):				Isuzu 4HK1, Tier 4I, 152 HP @ 2200					4045HFL07 140 HP	Volvo D4J Diesel, Tier 4 Final 114 Net SAE HP
	Warranty:				2 years, 2,000 hours					One Year or 2000 Hours Whichever Comes First	12 Months/2,500 Hrs. Full Machine
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:				B-C Equipment Sales, Inc. 5330 Tex-Con Rd.					Nueces Power Equipment 4697 FM 1516 North,	ROMCO Equipment
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date:				San Antonio, TX 78222 37 Days 90 Days From bid					Converse, TX 78109 30-150 Days 12/31/2017	San Antonio, TX 78220 150 Days 3/06/2017
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:				Date 90 Days From bid Date (06-08-17) No					9/30/2017 No	3/06/2017 Yes until 6/1/17
27	Tracked Loader with 3.2 cubic yard Multi- Purpose Bucket3/14/2017 Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model Offered:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE net HP): Warranty:										
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:										
	Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date: Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:										
28	DELETED:										
	Payment Terms		Net 30				Net 30		Net 30	Net 30	
	Total: Total Award:		\$283,972.00 \$283,972.00	,	\$1,586,284.00	\$353,107.00	\$70,850.00	\$139,010.70	\$10,700.00*	\$898,262.00	\$621,903.00

Vermeer Equipment of Texas bid number 2, bid item number 9 which