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ANORDINANCE 2017 -06-0g - 411

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM SILSBEE FORD AND ANCIRA MOTOR
COMPANY TO PROVIDE THE SAN ANTONIO POLICE DEPARTMENT
WITH FOUR REPLACEMENT LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS FOR A TOTAL
COST OF $165,926.30, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL
AND REPLACEMENT FUND.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light duty trucks for
use by the San Antonio Police Department for a variety of tasks including traffic fatality
investigations, vehicle crime prevention, K9 transport and additional project support throughout
the City; and

WHEREAS, Silsbee Ford submitted the lowest bid for items 1 and 3 for a total cost of
$121,258.30; and

WHEREAS, the lowest bid was submitted by Ancira Motor Company for item 2 for a total cost
of $44,668.00; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Silsbee Ford (Items 1 and 3) and by Ancira Motor
Company (Item 2) to provide the City with light duty trucks for a total cost of $165,926.30 is
hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance
deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. Attached hereto and incorporated herein for all
purposes as Exhibit I is the bid tabulation sheet. Copies of the bids are available for inspection
in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funding in the amount of $165,926.30 for this ordinance is available in Fund
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5501055 as part of the Fiscal Year 2017
Budget.

SECTION 3. Payment not to exceed $121,258.30 is authorized to Silsbee Ford and should be
encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed $44,668.00 is authorized to Ancira Motor Company and
should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.
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SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.
PASSED and APPROVED this 8" day of June, 2017.

2. fn
M A O R

Ivy R. Taylor

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

L icia M Vac C1ty Cletk Jev  Andrew Segovia, City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 6 (in consent vote: 4,5,6,7,8,9,11, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18A, 18B, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23,24 )

Date: 06/08/2017

Time: 09:24:45 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Silsbee Ford and Ancira Motor Company to provide the San

Antonio Police Department with four replacement light duty trucks for a total cost of $165,926.30,
funded from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer;
Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Result: Passed
Voter Group P ok Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ivy R. Taylor Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Alan Warrick District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldana District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Ray Lopez District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Ron Nirenberg District 8 X
Joe Krier District 9 X
Michael Gallagher District 10 X

http://cosaweb/voteinterface/Default.aspx 6/9/2017



City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: April 26, 2017
For: Purchase of Public Safety Light Duty Trucks Non-Local - Bid 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local - Bid 2
Silsbee Ford Ancira Motor Company  [Caldwell Country Caldwell Country Ford  [Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Silsbee Ford
Chevrolet
6100008712 IM {1211 US Hwy 96 N 10807 IH-10 West PO Box 27 800 Hwy 21E. 4562 IH 10 East 16550 IH35 N 1211 US Hwy 96 N
SHsbes, San Antanio, Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, Selma, Silsbee,
TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 77656
Item Description Qty [409-880-9191 210-558-2612
1 % Ton Full Four Door 4x4 Pickup Truck BOMB SQUAD K-9 1 -
Price Each $50,648.70 $54,445.00 $51,227.00
Price Total $50,648.70 $54,445.00 $51,227.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $50,648.70 $54,445.00 $51,227.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2017 Ford F-250 Crew No Bid| 2018 Chevrolet 2500HD| 2017 Ford F-250 Crew No Bid No Bid| No Bid
Cab Crew Cab 4X4 SWB Cab 4X4]
CK25743
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford 6.7L V8 Diesel GM Duramax Diesel| 6.7L Powerstroke Diesel
6.6L @445hp @ 2000 440HP
RPM, 910 torque @)
1600 RPM
Warranty 36 mo/36,000 Bumper tof 3yr/36,000 miles bumper| 3yr/36,000 Mile Bumper|
Bumper to bumper to Bumper,
5 yr/100,000 Powertrain| 5 yr/100,000 miles 5 yr/100,000 Mile
powertrain @ n/c Powertrain on Diesel
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Ford| Freedom Chevrolet| Your Local Ford Dealer|
Warranty Facility Address 8333 1-10 Frontage Rd| 13483 110 San Antonio,| Your Local Ford Dealer|
San Antonio, Tx] Tx 78249
Production Cut-Off Date 5-30-17| tbd (appx 12/17) TBD|
Last Day to Place Order 5-30-17 1213117 TBD
Firm Pricing Date No| 12/3117| No
Delivery Days 120-160 150 180
£2) 1/2 Ton Four Full Door 4x2 Pickup Truck SAPD 2
Price Each $24,974.64 $22,334.00 $24,717.00 $28,645.13 $26,742.00
Price Total $49,949.28] $44,668.00 $49,434.00 $57,290.26 $53,484.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%)| 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 2.00%!| 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $49,949.28] $44,668.00 $49,434.00 $56,144.45 $53,484.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 25.69%| 19.74%)|
Price Differential
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford F-150 Crew CabjfMopar Pentastar 3.6L V6 2018 Chevrolet 1500 No Bid Ford 3.5L V6 GTDI 2018 Chevrolet Crew| No Bid
305 HP | Silverado 4x2 Crew Cab 282 H.P. Cab Short Box|
2017 1500 Tradesman| SWB CC15543

Engine Offered

Warranty

Warranty Service Provide Name

Warranty Facility Address
Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Pricing Date

Delivery Days

3.5L Ve

36 mo/36,000 Bumper tof
Bumper
5 yr/60,000 Powertrain|

Red McCombs Ford|

8333 I-10 Frontage Rd|
San Antoniof

5-5-17

5-5-17

No

90 da

Crew Cab 4x2 DS1L98]

3.6L V6 24V VVT Engine}

3 yr/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper 5 yr/100,000)
powertrain|

Ancira Chrysler, Jeep)
Dodge]

10807 IH-10 West, San|
Antonio Tx 78230
5/25/17]

5/20/17]

Yes|

120-150

GM 4.3L-V6 @ 285 hp|
@ 5300 RPM|
4.3L V6 (GM) Ecotec3

3yr/36,000 miles bumper
to bumper

5 yr/100,000 miles,
powertrain @ n/c|
Freedom Chevrolet

13483 110, San Antonio,
Tx 78249

tod (appx 12/17)
12/31/17|

12/31117

120

Ford Gas 3.5L

Base 36 months or|
36,000 miles

Grande Truck Center|

4562 |H-10 East San
Antonio. Tx 78219
5/2/2017|

5/2/12017|

Yes

75-90]

LV3, Gas/Ethenol V6
4.3L/285 HP|

LV3, Gas/Ethenol V6|
4.3L/285 HP)

3 yr or 36,000k Bunmper|
to Bumper + 5 year
100,000k Powertrain

Gunn Chevrolet|

16550 IH35N, Selma,|
Texas 78154

2017 4/27117

2018 5/18

5/18 Start of Production|
on 2018 is 7/10/17|
90-110 from start of|
production




City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 26, 2017
For: Purchase of Public Safety Light Duty Trucks Non-Local - Bid 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local - Bid 2
Silsbee Ford Ancira Motor Company |Caldwell Country Caldwell Country Ford  |Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet LTD. Silsbee Ford
Chevrolet
6100008712 IM_[1211 US Hwy 96 N 10807 IH-10 West PO Box 27 800 Hwy 21E. 4562 IH 10 East 16550 IH 35N 1211 US Hwy 96 N
Siisbee, San Antono, Caldwell, Caldwell, San Antonio, Selma, Silsbee,
TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 77836 TX 77836 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 77656
Item Description Qty |409-880-9191 210-5568-2612
3 1 Ton Four Full Door 4x4 Long Bed Truck w/KUV Body 1
Price Each $70,609.60] $73,110.00 $77,376.00 $80,878.61 $76,036.60
Price Total $70,609.60 $73,110.00 $77,376.00) $80,878.61 $76,036.60
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00%! 0.00%)| 2.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $70,609.60) $73,110.00 $77,376.00] $79,261.04 $76,036.60
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 12.25%!
Price Differential
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford F-350 Crew Cabj No Bid| 2018 Chevrolet 3500HD| 2017 Ford F-450 Crew| Ford 6.7L Diesel V8 No Bid| Ford F-450 Crew Cab
Crew Cab 4X4 Cab 4X4 60"CA 330 HP
CK36043,[Knapheide (See marked|
KC108L2089J body] GM specifications forl
Duramax Diesel @ 445 exceptions)
hp
Engine Offered 6.7L V8 Diesel GM Duramax Diesel /| 6.7L Powerstroke Diesel| Ford 6.7L Diesel Ford 6.7L V8 Diesel
6.6L @ 445 hp @ 2800 330 HP
RPM, 910 torque @
1600 RPM|
Warranty 36 mo/36,000 Bumper tof 3yr/36,000 miles bumper| 3 yr/36,000 Mile Bumper| Base Warranty 36 36 mo/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper to bumper] to Bumper| months or 36,000 miles Bumper
5 yr/100,000 Power Train| 5 yr/ 100,000 mile| 5 yr/100,000 Mile| See Attached Powertrain’ 5 yr/100,000 Power Train
powertrain @ n/c| Powertrain in specifications|
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Ford| Freedom Chevrolet| Your Local Ford Dealerl Grande Truck Center| Red McCombs Ford
Warranty Facility Address 8333 I-10 Frontage Rd.| 13483 110,| Your Local Ford Dealer 4562 IH-10 East] 8333 I-10 Frontage Rd.
San Antonio, Tx 78230 San Antonio, Tx 78249 San Antonio, Tx 78219 San Antonio, Tx 78230
Production Cut-Off Date 5-30-17| tbd (appx 12/2017) TBD 7/28/2017| 5-30-17
Last Day to Place Order 5-30-17| 123117 TBD| 7/28/2017 5-30-17
Firm Pricing Date Nol 12/31/2017] No| Noj No!
Delivery Days | 120-160) 150 220 150-180 120-160!
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2% 10 days Net 30 Net 30
Total $171,207.58 $44,668.00 $176.989.00 $128.,603.00 $135,405.49; $53.484.00 $76.,036.60
Total Award $121,258.30 $44,668.00




