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08/31117 
Item No.8 

ANORDINANCE 20·17- 0 8-31 -0 6 Q 1 
AUTHORIZING CONTRACTS WITH THE AKANA GROUP INC., C&M 
GOLF & GROUNDS EQUIPMENT, HOLT TEXAS, LTD., SAGELINE 
INC., AND TUTTLE MOTOR COMPANY TO PROVIDE CITY 
DEPARTMENTS WITH TRACTORS AND LANDSCAPING EQUIPMENT 
FOR AN ESTIMATED TOTAL COST OF $1,594,054.18 OVER A TWO 
YEAR PERIOD, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND 
REPLACEMENT FUND AND STORM WATER FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide various departments of the City of San Antonio 
with tractors and landscaping equipment for a various mowing, vegetation projects, and park 
maintenance projects throughout the City; and 

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Holt Texas, LTD. (Items 1, 5, and 6), H&V Equipment (Item 
1), The Akana Group Inc. (Item 4), Ag-Pro Texas (Items 5 and 6), and Ewald Kubota (Item 6), 
failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements; and 

WHEREAS, the lowest responsive bids were submitted by Tuttle Motor Company for items 1 
and 5, Holt Texas, LTD. for item 2, C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment for items 4 and 10, The 
Akana Group Inc. for item 6, and Sageline Inc. for items 7-9; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bids from Tuttle Motor Company (Items 1 and 5), Holt 
Texas, LTD. (Item 2), C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment (Items 4 and 10), The Akana Group 
Inc. (Item 6), and Sageline Inc. (Items 7-9) to provide the City of San Antonio with tractors and 
landscaping equipment for an estimated total cost of $1 ,594,054.18 over a two year period are 
hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance 
deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto 
and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for 
inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids from Holt Texas, LTD. (Items 1, 5, 
and 6), H&V Equipment (Item 1), The Akana Group Inc. (Item 4), Ag-Pro Texas (Items 5 and 
6), and Ewald Kubota (Item 6) failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $397,778.02 is available as part of 
the Fiscal Year 2017 budget per the table below: 
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Total 

Amount 
$309,843.86 
$87,934.16 

$397,778.02 

General Ledger Cost Center Fund 
5501055 3503200001 72001000 
5501000 2304020007 29070000 

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amount is authorized to The Akana Group, 
Inc., C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment, Holt Texas, LTD, Sageline, Inc., and Tuttle Motor 
Company and should be encumbered with a purchase order. 

SECTION 5. Additional funding for this ordinance in an amount up to $1,196,276.16 will be 
encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is authorized to the vendors 
identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the Fiscal Year 2018 budget and 
such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through their terms as evidenced by 
subsequent ordinances. 

SECTION 6. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP 
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 7. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 31st day of August, 2017. 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

£z~ 

2 
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Agenda Item: 8 ( in consent vote: 7, 8, 10, II, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28A, 288) 

Date: 08/31/2017 

Time: 09:24:59AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: An Ordinance authorizing contracts with The Akana Group, Inc., C&M Golf & Grounds Equipment, 
Holt Texas, LTD, Sageline, Inc., and Tuttle Motor Company to provide City departments with tractors 
and landscaping equipment for an estimated total cost of $1,594,054.18 over a two year period, funded 
by the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund and the Storm Water Fund. [Ben Gorzell, Chief 
Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 

Present 

Ron Nirenberg Mayor X 

Roberto C. Trevino District I X X 

William Cruz Shaw District 2 X 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 X 

Rey Saldana District 4 X 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 X 

Greg Brockhouse District 6 X 

Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X 

Manny Pelaez District 8 X 

John Courage District 9 X X 

Clayton H. Perry District 10 X 

http:/ /cosaweb/voteinterface/Default.aspx 8/3112017 
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CMy of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June14, 2017 NorH..ocal Local Local Local 
Non-Local Local NorH..ocal Non-Local Bid 1 Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3 

For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Molor Compeny Hok Texas, LTD. C&M Golf & Grounds The Akana Group Inc. Sogeline Inc. Ag-Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc. DeWinnie Equipment DeWinnie Equipment DeWinnie Equipment 
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment Company Company Company 

6100008940 LD 508Ave H. 5665 S.E. Loop 410 13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 W NW Highway, 1300 W. University 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut Street 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 
ste. 100 Ave. 

ftom Description Esllmllod Poteet, San Antonio, San Antonia, Grapevine, Georgetown. Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, S8nAntonkJ, 
QuaniHy TX 78065 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250 

830-742-3515 210-648-1111 21G-657-3511 571-229-6843 512-930-4054 830-37&-54n 

1 4x4 UIIIHy Tractor: 14 NAS 
Price Each: $62,480.01 $58,500.00 No Bid $64,236.35 No Bid $63,250.0! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Tolal: $674,720.0! $791 ,000.00 $699,308.90 $685.500.00 
Make & M-1 Offered: Case Fannall1101 Massey Ferguson John Deere 511 SM John Deere 51 15M 

5711 Utility TraciOi 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered case IHFPT Tie Agco Power 4 Cyl John Deere John Deere Powe 
(Include SAE net HP): 48/Final11 0 Eng in Max Engine HP 11.Cl PowerTech Diesel Tech PWL 115 HF 

HP90PTOHF Engine 
Warranty: 2 Yr ..12000 Hrs 24 Monlh/2000 Hou 2 Years/2000 Hours 2 Years or 2000 Hours 

Whichever come Factory Warrant~ Factory Warrant) 
Firs 

Warranty SeMce Provider FadiH:y Name; Tuttle Motor Compan HoftCal Not Provided Ag-Pro 

Warranty Service Provkter Facility Address: 509 Ave H. Poteet. TI 5665 S.E. Loop 410, Not Provided 3030 N. Austin , 
7806 San Antonio, TX Seguin, TX 78155 

Delivery: GOD~ 120 Days 45 Days 180Days 

2 Compact Tractor with 5 foot Shredder: 4 
Noek Price Each: $15,250.01 No Bid $27,272.70 No Bid $22,875.0C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Total: $61,000.0! $109.090.80 $91 ,500.00 
Make & Model Offered: Massey Fergusor John Deere 3033R John Deere 3033RJ 

1726E and wooce Compact UUIIt John Deere MX5 
RC5Shr.- Tractor (24PTO HP) 

Speclflc Make & MOOel of Engine Offered 24.0 Rated HF Vanmar Dtesel Engine Vanmar- 3TNV88C -
(Include SAE net HP) : Shtbaura 3 CyHnde 32.2 HP MJT33 HP 

Liquid Cooled Diese 
Warranty: MF1728E-2 2 Years/2000 Hours 3033R - 2 yrs. or 2000 

Monlh/2000Hou Factory Warranty Hrs.I MX5-1 Year-
Factory Warranty Gearbox 5 Years 

Woods RC5 - 1 Yea 
factory Warranty or 

Cutter/3 Veal"! 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warrantv oo ~oft~a 
Nol Provided Ag-Pro 

Warranty Service Provider FacMity Address: 5665 S.E. Loop 410 Nol Provided 3030 N. Austin, 
san Antonio, u Seguin, TX 78155 

7822l 
Delivery: 1""na~ 45 Days 180Dar-

3 Deleted: 

~ 
:J: -m 
=i -

Prepared by Putchasilg 7124f2017 1 Olf 10 



Cly ol San Antonio Bid lobulation 

Opened: June 14,2017 Non-Local Locll Local Local 
Non-Loc:ll Locll Non.Local Non-Local Bid 1 Non-local Non-Loc:ll Bld1 Bid 2 Bid 3 

For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company Hob Texas, LID. C&M Golf & Grounds The Akana Group Inc. S8gdne Inc. Ag.Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc. DeWinnie Equipment DeWinnie Equipment DeWinnie Equipment 
Tractor and Landscaping Equlpmenl Equipment Company Company Company 

6100008940 LD 509 Ave H. 5665 S.E. Loop 410 13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 WNW Highway, 1300 W. University 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut Street 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 
Ste. 100 Ave. 

nem Description Estimated Poteet, San Antonio, San Antonio, Grapevine, Georgetown. Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, 
Quontfty TJ( 78065 TJ( 78222 TJ( 78233 TJ( 78051 TJ( 711628 TJ( 78155 TJ( 78155 TJ( 78250 TJ( 78250 TJ( 78250 

830-742-3515 210-648-1111 2111-1157-3511 571-229-6843 512-930-4054 830-37D-54n 

4 Sklgle Operator Grounds Sprayer. , 
NAS 

Price Each: No Bid NoBk $26,721.114 $9,026.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $26,721.114 $9,026.04 
Make & Model Offered: Smllhco Spray sta Frontier LSI 125 3-pl 

175< Mounted Liquid 
Sprayer- AHachment 

On~ 
Speciftc Make & Model of Engine Offered Smlhco 1754, 31 Hf NA 
(Include SAE net HP) : 

Warranty: 2Yr 2 Years/2000 Hours 
Factory Warran~ 

Warranty Service Provider FaciiHy Name: C&M Golf & Ground Not Provided 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 13250 Lookout Rd. Not Provided 
San Antonio, TI 

7823 
Delivery: 30Do 45 days 

5 15' Ft Batwing Mower Deck: 20 

NAS NAS 
Price Each: $15,495.00 $12,500.00 No Bid $19,1165.89 No Bid $11,750.00 $18,004.0< No 1!10 No Bid No Bid 
Total: $31M1,900.00 $250,000.00 $397,317.80 $235,000.00 $360,080.00 
Make & Model Offered: Rhlno415! Woods BWI BOXHD John Deere CX15 Fie John Deere MX15 Alamo Industrial-

wing Rotary Cutler- Eagle 1 5" Flex Wing 
540 RPM - Stump RotaryMowe 
JumpeiS - Single 

Suction Blades 

Warranty: 1 yr. machine, 2 yrs 1 YearF~Of) 2 Years/2000 Hours 1 Year I 5 Years Mower warranty- 1 
Ltd OriveNne. 6 yrs Warranty on Machine Factory Warrant Gearbo> Year Limlled and 

gearbox, 2 yrs. s~~~ 8 Yelr on Ge1rbo Gearbox wammty-
Warrant SYearUmtted 

Warranty Service Provider FacHity Name: Tuttle Motor Compan Holt Cat Not Provided Ag-Pro H & V Equipment 
Services Inc. 

Warranty Service Provider Factilty Address: 509 Ave H. Poteet, 1) 5665 S.E. Loop 410, Not Provided 3030 N. AustJn • 3307 s Elst loop 410, 
7806! San Antonio, TX Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 

7822l 1ti222 
Delivery: 45Dar. 60 Days 45 days 180 Days 120 Days 

Prepilted by Purchasilg 712412017 2oJ 10 



CMy of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June14, 2017 Non-Local Local Local Local 
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Bid 1 Non~ocal Non-Local Bld1 Bid 2 Bid 3 

For. Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company Hok Texas, LTD. C&M Golf & Grounds The Akana Group Inc. 5ageline Inc. Ag-Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc. DeWinnle Equipment DeWinnie Equipment DeWinnie Equipment 
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment Company Company Company 

6100008940 LD SOU Ave H, 5665 S.E. Loop 410 13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 WNW Highway, 1300 W. University 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut street 11002 Bendera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 
ste. 100 Ave. 

Mom Description Estimated Poteet, San Antonio. &an Antonio, Grapevine, Georgetown, Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, SanAntonkJ, San AntonkJ. 
Quantity TX 78065 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78828 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 76250 TX 78250 

830-742-3515 210-&48-1111 21o-&57-3511 571-229-6843 512-930-4054 830-379-54n 

6 94• inch Mower Deck: 2 

NAS NAS 
Prk:e Each: No Bid $5.700.00 NoBk $9,959.1! No Bid $7,150.0< No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBk:l 
Total: $11 ,400.00 $19.918.3 $14,300.00 
Make & Model Offered: Woods BB8400X 2017 Bush Hog 32 Brown684 

Warranty: 1 YearFa~Of') 2 Years/2000 Hour. 1 Year /90 Days on 
Warranty on Mach~ Factory Warrant) Gearbox 

6 Year on Gearbo> 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 
Warra~ll 
Hoi! Cat Not Provide< Ag-Pro 

Warranty Service Provider FaciMty Address: 5665 S.E. Loop 410, Not Provide< 3030 N. Austin, 
San Antonto. TX Seguin, TX 78155 

7822< 
DeUvery: 60 Days 45 dar. 180 Days 

7 52• Zero Tum Mowers- GASOUNE 3 
Engines: 
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,909.3e $6,459.0! No Bid No Bid $6,974.13 $6,623.48 $8,395.27 
Total: $23,728.08 $19,3n.O< $26,922.39 $25,670.36 $26,185.61 
Prompt Payment Discount: 1% 1% 1% 
Total Cost,.;lh Prompt Payment $26,653.17 $25,611.88 $27,903.95 
Discount 
Percentage between lowest responsive 38% 24% 44% 
bid and local bid: 
Price Differential: $7.276.17 $6,234.88 $6,526.95 

Make & Model Offered: John Deere Z9~ 5E Bad Boy OuUaw 54 Exmark, Gravely, Pro·Tum 252 Gravely, Pro·Tum 452 
Commercial ZTra B8054ZT74 LZS740AKC524~ 992268 992273 

SpecifiC Make & Model of Engine Offered Not Provide< 747ccKohle Kohler Command Kawasaki FX850V, Kawasaki FXIJSOV 
(Include SAE net HP): Confidant 25HF ECV 740 EFI, 25HP 27HP 27HP 

Warranty: 2 Years/2000 Hour. Defects In material 01 5 Year or 1250 Hours, 2 Years 3Years 
Factory Warrant workmanship 2 year. First 2 years no hou 

limNed 

Warranty Service Provider Facilrty Name: Not Provide< Texas Trador Count~ DeWinnMt Equipment OeWinnie Equlpmen I OeWinnie Equipment 
Com pan Com pan Com pan) 

Warranty Service Provkler Facility Address; Not Providec 1175 FM 308, Nev 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd., 
Braunfels, TX 7813( San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX 

7825( 7825( 78250 
DeNverv: 45dall! 30Da., 45Days 45 Days 45 Days 

Prep.~red by Pun:hamg 712.4fl017 3 ol'10 



CKy of San Antonio Bid Tobulolion 

Opened: June 1.t, 2017 Non-Local Local Local Local 
Non-Local Local Non-Local Non-Local Bid I Non..L.ocal Non..Loeal Bld1 Bkl2 Bkl3 

For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company Haft Texas, L TO. C&M Golf & Grounds The Akana Group Inc. Sagellnelnc. Ago-Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc. OeWinnie Equipment OeWinnle Equipment OeWinnie Equipment 
Tractor and Landsceptng Equipment Equipment Company Company Company 

6100008940 LD 509Ave H, 5665 S.E. Loop 410 13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 WNW Highway. 1300 W. UnlversHy 3030 N. Austin 1502 E Walnut street 11002 Bandara Rd. 11002 Bandara Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 
Sle. 100 Ave. 

Hem Description Estimated Poteet, San Antonio, San Antonio. Grapevine, Georgetown, Seguin, Saguln. San Antonio. San Antonio, San Antonio, 
QuontKy TX 76065 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250 

830-742-3515 210-6411-1111 210-657-3511 571-229-61143 512-930-4054 830-3711-5477 

8 so· Zero Tum Mowers (Diesel): 12 
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $19,5002! $11,899.04 No Bid No Bid $12.992.93 $12,992.93 $12.992.93 
Total: $234.003.0! $142,786.04 $155.915.16 $155,915.11 $155,915.16 
Prompt Payment Discount: 1% 1% 1% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $154,356.01 $154,356.01 $154,356.01 
Discount 
Percentage between lo\NBst responsive 8% 8% 8% 
bid and local bid: 
Price Differential: $11,568.01 $11,568.01 $11,568.01 

Make &. Model Offered: John Deere Z907F Bad Boy61" Compac Exmark, Exmark. E>cmark. 
Diesel W 80 in. ~ Diesel BBD61247CI LZS902DKU605A 1 LZS902DKU605A 1 LZS902DKU605A 1 

gauge Side Olscharg1 
Decl 

1100ccCal Dieso Specifoc Make & Model of Engine OHered Not Provide< Kubota Diesel, 0902 Kubota Diesel. 0902 Kubota Diesel, 0902 
(Include SAE net HP): 24.9Hf 25HF 25HF 25HP 

Warranty: 2 Yearsl2000 Hou" Defects in maten~ o 2 Years 2 Years 2Years 
Factory Warren~ workmanship 2 year. 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Not Provldecl Texas Tractor Countr, DeWinnle Equipment DeWinnle Equipment DeWklnle Equipment 
Com pan Com pan Company 

Warranty Service Provider FacMity Address~ Not Provldecl 1175 FM 306, N .. 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandara Rd •• 
Braunfels. TX 78131 San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX San Antonto. TX 

78250 457~~~ 78250 Delivery: 45 daY! 30Der. 45 Days 45 Days 

9 eo· Zero Tum Mowers (Gasoline): 4 
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid SB.132.6o $8,559.0! No Bid No Bid $9,796.83 $8,604.97 $10,094.45 
Total: $32.530.5 $26,236.0! $39,187.32 $35,219.68 $40,377.80 
Prompt Payment Discount 1% 1% 1% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment $36,795.45 $34,867.68 $39,974.02 
Discount 
Percentage between lowest responsive 48% 33% 52% 
bid and local bid: 
Price Differential: $12,559.45 $8,631.66 $13,738.02 

Make & Model Offered: John Deere Z9151 Bad BoyOuUaw61 Exmerk , Gravely, Pro-Tum 260 Gravely Pro-Tum 460 
Commercial ZTar1 B6061ZT74 LZS749AKC604A1 992269 992274 

Specific Make & Model of Engine OHered Not ProvkHH 747ccKollle Kohler Command Kawasaki FX850V, Kawasaki FX921V, 
(Include SAE nel HP): Confidant 25 HF ECV 749 EFt. 26.5HF 27HP 31 HP 

Warranty: 2 Years/2000 Hour. Defects In matertal o 5 Year or 1250 Hours, 2 Years 3 Years 
Factory Warrant workmanship 2 year. First 2 years no hou 

limNed 

Warranty Service Provider Fadlily Name: No! Provide; Texas Tractor Countr OeWinnte Equipment OeWinnie Equipment DeWinnle Equlpmen 
Compan Companl Companl 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address; Not Provide; 1175 FM 306, Nev 11002 Bandera Rd. , 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd., 
Braunfels. TX 78134 San Antonio. TX San Antonio. TX San Antonto, 1X 

7825! 78250 78250 
Delivery: 45da 300M. 45Dar. 45DaY! 450~ 

Prepared by Pun:hasilg 712412017 4 of 10 



Clty of 5an Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 14,2017 Non-Local Local Local Local 
Non-Local Loclll Non-Local Non-Local Bk11 Non-Local Non-Loc .. Bld1 Bkl2 Bk13 

For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of Tuttle Motor Company Holt Texas, LTD. C&M Golf & Grounds The Aklnl Group Inc. Sage+ine Inc. Ag-Pro Texas Alamo Group (TX) Inc. OeWinnie Equtpment OeWinnle Equipment OeWkmie Equipment 
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Equipment Company Company Company I 

61 000011940 LO sog Ave H. 5665 S.E. Loop 410 13250 Lookout Rd. 1701 W NW Highway, 1300 W. Untverstty 3030 N. Auslln 1502 E Walnut Street 11002 Bandera Rd. 11002 Bendera Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd. 
Sta. 100 Ave. 

Mem Oeocrtpllon Estimated Poteet, San Antonio. San Antonio, Grapevine, Georgetown, Seguin, Seguin, San Antonio, San Anlonlo, san Antonio. 
Quantity TX 78065 TX 78222 TX 78233 TX 78051 TX 78628 TX 78155 TX 78155 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78250 

830-742-3515 210-648-1111 2111-857-3511 571-229-6843 512-i30-4054 &30-37&-54n 

10 3 Wheeled Infield Tractor w/ Attachments: 3 

Price Each: No Bid NoBk $17,422.3! No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Tolal: $52,266.9! 

Malle & Model Offered: Smilhco Sand Star 1 
I'Njl45-001 

SpeciriC Make & Model of Engine Offered Vanguard 1 
(Include SAE net HP): HP112kWOH\ 

Gasollm 

Warranty: 2Yeao 

Warranty Service Provider Facillly Name: C&M Got! & Gr0<100. 

Warranty Service Provider FacWity Address; 13250 Lookout Rd. 
San Antonio, nc 

78233 

Delivery: 30 Day:~ 

Payment Terms: Net30 Net3C Net30 ~30 Net 3D Net 30 Net30 1%-10 Day:~ 1%-10 Oeys 1%-10 Days 
- --- --- - -- --

Mem 3 was deleted and wll be rebkt at a later date. 

Prep~~red by Pwchllsrtg 712412017 Sof10 



CMy of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 14,2017 Locol Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local 
Bid4 Non-Local Bid1 Bid 2 Bid 3 Non-Local Non-Local AK1 Bid 2 

For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnle Equipment Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment H & V Equipment H & V Equipment Moridge Professional Turf Professional Turf SageHne Inc. 
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Company Manufacturing, Inc. Pnxlucts Products 

61000081140 LD 11002 Bandera Rd. 1900WIH10 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 105 SOld Hwy 81 11468 Selme Parkway 9468 Selma Parkway 1300 W. UniversMy 
Ave. 

Kem Description Estimoted San Antonto , Seguin. San Antonio san Antonio San Antonio Mollll<lrk!ve. Selma, Selma, Georgetown. 
Quantity 1X 78250 1X 78155 1X 78222 1X 78222 1X 78222 KS67107 1X 78154 1X 78154 1X 78628 

1 4x4 Utilhy Trador. 14 NAS 
Price Each: No Bid $66.537.00 No Bid No Bid $60.764.71 NoBkj No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $931.518.00 $850.705.114 
Make & Model Offered: Kubote M6-111SHC KloU PX1153 PCE 

Speclrtc Make & Model of Engine Offered Kubota \13800 Tier 4 Dae®ng DL03-LEA07 
(Include SAE net HP): DEV 108.8 Net HP 110HP 

Warranty: 24 Mos/2000 Hours One Year 2000 Hrs. to 
VVhk:hever Occurs Include al required 

First, Powertrain 38 Under4.2.3 
Mos/3000 WOF 

Warranty Service Provider Faclfity Name: Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment 
Services 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1900WIH10. 3307 S. E. Loop 410. 
Seguin. lX 7815! San Antonio, TX 

OeNvery: 60 Days 45 Days 

2 Compad Tractor with 5 foot Shredder: 4 
Price Each: No Bid $22.1148.0! $17.483.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $91 .796.00 $89.934.12 
Make & Model Offered: Kubota L2501 KloU CK 2610 HST 

ROPS 

Speciflc Make & Model of Engine Offered Kubola 01703 23.9 Dae®ng 3A165LWM-
(Include SAE net HP) : HP V24.5 HP 

Warranty: 24 Mos/1500 Hours 1 Year 2000 Hours to 
VVhk:hever Occurs Include all required 

Fk'sl, PT 36 Mos/2000 Under4.2.3 
WOF 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment 
Services 

Warranty Service Provider Faciltly Address: 1900WIH10, 3307 S. E. Loop 410. 
Seguln. lX 78155 Sen Antonio. 1X 

78222 
Delivery; 60 Days 45 Days 

3 Deleted: 

Prepared by Pwchasing 712412017 aot to 



CRy of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 14, 2017 Local Non-Loci I Non-Loc11 Non-Loc•l Non-Local Non-Loci I 
Bld4 Non-Local Bid I Bid 2 Bid 3 Non-Local Non-Loc•l All Bid 2 

For. Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnM! Equipment Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment H & V Equipment H & V Equipment Morldge Professional Turf Professional Turf SageNne Inc. 
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Company Manufaduring,lnc. Products Products 

810000111140 LD 11002 Bandera Rd. 1900WtH10 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 105 SOld Hwy 81 9488 Selma Parkway 11488 Selme Parkway 1300 W. University 
Ave. 

Rem Description Estimated San Antonio, Beguin, Sen Antonio San Antonto San Antonio Moundridge, Selma, Selma, Georgetown, 
Quantity TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS67107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78628 

4 Single Operator Grounds Sprayer: 1 
Plice Each: NoBk No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid :~~ :::::: No Bid No Bid 
Total: 
Make & Model Offered: Toro MP 1750 (Toro 

41188) 

Speciftc Make & Model of Engine Offered Kohler. 27 HP 
(Include SAE net HP): 

Warranly: 2 years or 1500 hours 
whichever occurs first 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Professional Tun 
Products 

Warranty Service Provider FacWity Address: 9468 Selma Parkway, 
Selma, TX 78154 

OeNvery: 15-30 Days 

5 15' Ft Batwing Mower Deck: 20 

Price Each: No Bid $18,299.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bod No Bid 
Tolat: $325,980,00 
Make & Model Offered: Rhlno4150 

Warranty: 1 Yr. 

Warranty Servk:e Provider Facility Name; Ewald Kubota 

Warranty SeMce Provider Fadity Address; 1900WtH10, 
Beguln, TX 7815! 

Delivery: 45Dayo 
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CMy of Son Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 14, 2017 Local Non-Local Non-LoCI I Non--Local Non-Local Non-loCI I 
Bld4 NotH.ocol Bid I Bid 2 Bid 3 Non-Local Non-Local All Bid 2 

For: Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnie Equipment Ewald Kubota H & V Equlpmenl H & V Equlpmenl H & V Equlpmenl Morldge Professional Turf Professional Turf 5ageNne Inc. 
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Company Manufacturing, Inc. Products Products 

6100008940 LD 11002 Bandera Rd. 1900WIH10 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 105 SOld Hwy 81 9488 Selma Parkway 9468 Sekna Parkway 1300 W. University 
Ave. 

Mom Description Estimoled san Antonto. Seguin. San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio Moundridge. Selma, Selma. Georgetown, 
QuontMy TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS67107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78628 

6 84. inch Mower Deck: 2 
NAS 

Price Each: No Bid $9.300.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Tolal: $18.1100.00 
Make & Model Offered: Rhino 484 

Warranty: 1Yr. 

Warranty Service Provider FaciHty Name; Ewald Kubota 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address~ 1900WIH10. 
Seguin. TX 78155 

Delivery: 45 Days 

7 52· Zero Tum Mowers. GASOUNE 3 
Engines: I 

Price Each: $7.564.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SS.487.00 SS.246.23 $7.244.16 $6.999.00 
Total: $22.692.00 $25.461.00 $24.736.69 $21.732.48 $20.997.00 
Prompt Payment Discount: 1% ! 
Tolal Cost v.ith Prompt Payment $22.465.08 

! 
Discount 
Percentage between lowest responsive 18% 

' bid and local bid: I 

Pries Differential: $3.088.08 

Make & Model Offered: Cub Pro Z 554l Grasshopper 225152 Toro 749DE Toro 74955 Bed Boy Oulla~ 
~~~::J 

Specific Make & Model of Engkle Offered Kohler Command Kohler Command Pro Kohler25 HP 25 HP Kohle 852cc Kawasaki FX 
(Include SAE nel HP): ECV 749 EFI. 26.5HP Model CH742. 747cc. Command Pro W/S'Z' 27HP 

Horizontal Crankshaft, Turbo Force Deck 
25HF 

Warranty; 3 Years 5 Years or 1 ,25C Engkle 3 years, Not Provided Defects in material o I 
hours, first 3 years no Product 5 years 01 workmanship 2 years -··-·--·- j occurs first 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: DeWinnie Equipment DeWinnte Equipment Professtonll Turl Professional Turl Texas Tractor Count 
Com pan) Products Products 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11002 Bandera Rd., 11002 Bandera Rd., 9468 Sekna Parkway, 9468 Selma Parkway, 1175 FM 306, New 
San AntonkJ, TX San Anlonlo. TX Selma. TX 78154 Selma. TX 78154 Braunlels. TX 7813 

DeNverv: 
782511 1e251 

45Davs 30 DaY! 15-30 Days Nol Provided 30 Davs 

Prepared by Purcha"'sJ 7/2412017 lot 10 



CMy of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 14. 2017 Local Non-Local Non--Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-LoCI I 
Bld4 Non-Local Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3 Non-local Non-Local AK1 Bid 2 

For. Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnte Equipment Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment H & V Equipment H & V Equipment Morldge Professional Turf Professional Turf Sageline Inc. 
Tractor and landscaping Equipment Company Manufactul1ng, Inc. Products Products 

8100008D40 LD 11002 Bandera Rd. 1VOOWtH10 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 105 SOld Hwy 81 9488 Sekna Parkway 9-468 Sekna Parkway 1300 W. University 
Ave. 

Kern Description Estimated San Antonto, Seguin. San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio Moundridge, Sekna, Selma, Georgetown. 
Quantity TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS87107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78828 

8 60. Zero Tum Mowers (DM!sel): 12 
Price Each: $12,992.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11 .997.00 $12,314.36 No Bid $13,100.0< 
Total: $155,915.18 $143 .984.0< $147,772.32 $157,200.0< 
Prompt Payment Discount: 1% 
Total Cost v.ffi1 Prompt Payment $154,356.01 
Discount 
Percentage between lowest responsive 8% 

bid and local bid: 
Price Differential: $11,568.01 

Make & Model Offered: Exmar1<. Grasshopper 3250/61 Toro 74267 Bad Boy Oiesel81 
l2S902DKU605A 1 B8A6135PK 

Speciftc Make & Model of Engine Offered Kubota Diesel, 0902 Kubota D902. 898cc, Kubota 25 HP 1500cc Perkins LC 
(Include SAE net HP): 25HF Cast-Iron Block. 3- Dlesel35 HP 

Cylinder, Horizontal 

Warranty: 2Yean c~·~=~·!f ~~: Engine 2 Years Defects In material o 
hours. ftrst 3 years no Product 4 Yrs. 0< workmanship 2 years 

hour limitation 1,200 Hours 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: DeWinnle Equipment DeWinnie Equipment wh~"rovr:=~~ Texas Tractor Count!) 
Com pan Products 

Warranty Service Provider FaciNty Address: 11002 Bandera Rd .. 11002 Bandera Rd .. 9468 Sekna Parkway. 1175 FM 308, Ne~ 
San Antonk), TX San Anlonio , TX Selma, TX 78154 Braunfels, TX 7813C 

7825( 78250 
DeN very: 45 Days 30 Days 15-30 Days 30 Days 

9 so• Zero Tum Mowers (Gasoline): 4 
Price Each: $8.244.0< No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,897.00 $8,482.78 $7,646.1! $7,299.0< 
Total: $32,978.0< $34,768.011 $33,931 .12 $31 ,364.64 $29,198.0< 
Prompt Payment Discount: 1% 
Total Cost wlh Prompt Payment $32,646.24 

Discount 
Percentage between lo'Nest responsive 24% 
bid and local bid: 
Price Differential: $8,410.24 

Make & Model Offered: Cub Pro Z 560L Grasshopper 329B/81 Toro 74915 Toro 74958 Bad Boy Outlaw 
Extreme 81• 

B8081FX85! 
Speclftc Make & Model of Engk1e Offered Kawasaki FXBSOV, Vanguard Big Block Kohler25 HP 25 HP Kohle 852cc Kawasaki FX 
(Include SAE net HP): 27HF Model5424, 895tt, Command Pro EFI W 27 HF 

Aluminum Block, V- 80' Turbo Force Deck 
Twk1. Horizontal 

Warranty: 3 Years c~~==~·:r ~~ Engine 3 yr.;., rest 5 Not Provided Defects In material Di 
hours, first 3 years no yrs. or 1500 hours workmanship 2 years 

hour limltaUon whichever occurs first 

Warranty Service Provider Factlity Name: DeWinnie Equipmen DeWinnie Equipment Professional Tur Professional Tur Texas Tractor Count11 
Com pan Products Products 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11002 Bandera Rd .. 11002 Bandera Rd. . 9468 Sekna Parkway , 9468 Selma Parkway, 1175 FM 308, New 
San AntonkJ. TX San AntonkJ, TX Selma, TX 78154 Selma. TX 78154 Braunfels, TX 78131 

1e251 7825( 
Delivery: 45DaV! 30Davs 15-30 DaY! Not Provided 30Da)'! 
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City of Son Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: June 14, 2017 Loco! Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local NorH.ocal NorH..ocal 
Bld4 Non-Loco! Bid I Bid 2 Bid 3 Non-Local Non.t.ocol Alt1 Bid 2 

For. Annual Contract For The Purchase of DeWinnJe Equipment Ewald Kubota H & V Equipment H & V Equipment H & V Equipment Moridge Profes$10nal Turf Professional Turf S8geHne Inc. 
Tractor and Landscaping Equipment Company Manufacturing. Inc. Produc:1S Products 

61000011~0 LD 11002 Bondonl Rd. UOO W IH10 l307 S.E. Loop 410 ll07 S.E. Loop 410 ll07 S.E. Loop 410 105 SOld Hwy 81 9408 s.ma Parkway 9488 Selma Parkway 1300 W. university 
Ave. 

Mom Doscrtplion Estimated Son Antonio , S8guk1. Son Antonio San Anton&o San Antonio Moundridge, Selma. Selma. Georgetown, 
Quantity TX 78250 TX 78155 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78222 KS67107 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 78628 

10 3 Wheeled Infield Tractor w/ Anachments: l 

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,928.58 No Bid No Bid 

Total: $68.785.74 
Make & Model Offered: Toru S.nd Pro 304 

(08703) 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 16HP 
(Include SAE nel HP): 

Warranty: 2 years or 1500 hours 
wh~ever occurs first 

Warranty Servlc:e Pruvidef Facility Name: Prufess~= 

Warranty Servtce Provkter FaciiHy Address: 9488 Selma Parkway, 
Satma. TX 78154 

Delivery: tS.lO Days 

Payment Tenns: 1%-10 Days Noll Net 30 NailO Net 30 Net l~ NellO Nai30 Nail 

hem 3 was deleted and wll be rebid at a later date. 
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