
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 11, 2017 Local Local
For: Purchase of Service and Utility Trailers San Antonio 

Southwest Trailers
Smart Control 
Systems LLC, dba 
Hotsy Equipment 
Company

6100009200 LD 10302 IH 35 North 3005 Interstate Dr.

Item Description Quantity
San Antonio,             
TX 78233                  
210-657-5828

San Antonio,             
TX 78219                  
210-224-4906

1 Single Axle Utility Trailer- Wood Floor: 2
Price Each: $2,195.00 No Bid
Total: $4,390.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $4,346.10
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017, SW 

Gooseneck, 
B3588TTRG-12

 

Warranty: 1 Year Trailer, 2 
Years Axle

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Wheel
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road, 

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery: 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/08/2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes

2 Single Axle Utility Trailer- Steel Floor: 2
Price Each: $2,925.00 No Bid
Total: $5,850.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $5,791.50
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017, Southwest 

Gooseneck, 
B3583TTRG-12

 

Warranty: 1 Year Trailer, 2 
Years Axle

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Wheel
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road, 

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery: 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/08/2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 11, 2017 Local Local
For: Purchase of Service and Utility Trailers San Antonio 

Southwest Trailers
Smart Control 
Systems LLC, dba 
Hotsy Equipment 
Company

6100009200 LD 10302 IH 35 North 3005 Interstate Dr.

Item Description Quantity
San Antonio,             
TX 78233                  
210-657-5828

San Antonio,             
TX 78219                  
210-224-4906

3 Single Axle Utility Landscape Trailer with 
Storage Box:

2

Price Each: $3,565.00 No Bid
Total: $7,130.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $7,058.70
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017, Southwest 

Gooseneck, 
BB3560LSRG-12 

 

Warranty: 1 Year Trailer, 2 
Years Axle

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Wheel
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road, 

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery: 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/08/2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes

4 Heavy Duty Tandem Axle Trailer:
1

Price Each: $4,550.00 No Bid
Total: $4,550.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $4,504.50
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017, Southwest 

Gooseneck, 
B1283LB5U-14

 

Warranty: 1 Year Trailer, 2 
Years Axle

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Wheel
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road, 

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery: 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/08/2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 11, 2017 Local Local
For: Purchase of Service and Utility Trailers San Antonio 

Southwest Trailers
Smart Control 
Systems LLC, dba 
Hotsy Equipment 
Company

6100009200 LD 10302 IH 35 North 3005 Interstate Dr.

Item Description Quantity
San Antonio,             
TX 78233                  
210-657-5828

San Antonio,             
TX 78219                  
210-224-4906

5 Tandem Axle Low Boy Trailer w/ Edger 
Racks:

3

Price Each: $5,350.00 No Bid
Total: $16,050.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $15,889.50
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017, Southwest 

Gooseneck, 
B7083TTSU-18

 

Warranty: 1 Year Trailer, 2 
Years Axle

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Wheel
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road, 

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery: 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/08/2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes

6 Tandem Axle Utility Trailer with Blower 
storage and Side Racks:

2

Price Each: $6,950.00 No Bid
Total: $13,900.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $13,761.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017, Southwest 

Gooseneck, 
B7083TTSU-18 

Warranty: 1 Year Trailer, 2 
Years Axle

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Wheel
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road, 

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery: 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/08/2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 11, 2017 Local Local
For: Purchase of Service and Utility Trailers San Antonio 

Southwest Trailers
Smart Control 
Systems LLC, dba 
Hotsy Equipment 
Company

6100009200 LD 10302 IH 35 North 3005 Interstate Dr.

Item Description Quantity
San Antonio,             
TX 78233                  
210-657-5828

San Antonio,             
TX 78219                  
210-224-4906

7 Tandem Axle Utility Vehicle Transport 
Trailer with Storage Box:

2

Price Each: $4,319.00 No Bid
Total: $8,638.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $8,551.62
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017, Southwest 

Gooseneck, 
B4583LSRG-12

Warranty: 3 Yr. -100K
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: 1 Year Trailer, 2 

Years Axle
 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Southwest Wheel

Delivery: 343 Gembler Road, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219

 

Production Cut-off Date: 75 Days
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

10/08/2017

 Yes
 
8 Tandem Axle Enclosed Cargo Box Utility 

Trailer:
1

Price Each: $13,325.00 No Bid
Total: $13,325.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $13,191.75
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018, Cargo Mate 

CM716TA4
Warranty: 3 Years
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Wheel
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road, 

San Antonio, TX 
78219

Delivery: 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/08/2017
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

10/08/2017  

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 11, 2017 Local Local
For: Purchase of Service and Utility Trailers San Antonio 

Southwest Trailers
Smart Control 
Systems LLC, dba 
Hotsy Equipment 
Company

6100009200 LD 10302 IH 35 North 3005 Interstate Dr.

Item Description Quantity
San Antonio,             
TX 78233                  
210-657-5828

San Antonio,             
TX 78219                  
210-224-4906

9 Single Axle Trailer Mounted 200 Gallon 
Pressure Washer

1

Price Each: $13,825.00 $11,040.00
Total: $13,825.00 $11,040.00
Prompt Payment Discount: 1%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $13,686.75
Year, Make & Model of Trailer Offered: 2017, SW 

Gooseneck/Hotsy, 
SWGBS266GNNR-

11/1270SS

2017 Diamondback 
Model 5' X 10'

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year Trailer, 2 
Years Axle

30 Day Limited 
Warranty Against 

Manufacturers 
Defects

Trailer Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Name:

Southwest Wheel Diamondback 
Trailers

Trailer Warranty Service Provider Facility 
Address:

343 Gembler Road, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219

2425 W. FM2369, 
Uvalde, TX 78801

Year, Make & Model of Pressure Washer 
Offered:

2017, Hotsy, 
1270SS

2017 - Hotsy Model 
1290SS - Special

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 
(Include SAE Net HP):

Honda GX630, 
24HP

Honda - GX660 - 
24HP

Pressure Washer Warranty: 7 Years 7 Years on pump / 5 
Years Coil / Honda 

Standard 1 Year 
against manufacture 

defects

Pressure Washer Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Name:

Southwest Wheel Hotsy Equipment 
Company

Pressure Washer Warranty Service 
Provider Facility Address:

343 Gembler Road, 
San Antonio, TX 

78219

3005 Interstate Dr., 
San Antonio, TX 

78219 
Delivery: 75 Days 15 Days
Production Cut-off Date: N/A N/A
Last day order can be placed without 
missing cut-off date:

N/A N/A

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 
date:

Yes Yes

Payment Terms: 1%, 10 Days Net 30

Total: $87,658.00 $11,040.00
Total Award: $73,833.00 $11,040.00
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