City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
| AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES
Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered: AC Delco - Johnson East Penn JCl/Interstate East Penn East Penn
Controls
Brand Name of Batteries Offered: AC Delco NAPA Interstate Duracell Ultra NAPA
1 Group: Ul-L 40 8223
Quoted Reserve Capacity 27 25 30 25 25
Supplier Code # Ul 230 8223 SP-30 SLIUIA UIL
Unit Price $42.55 $30.18 $26.95 $29.68 $33.69
Total Price $1,702.00 $1,207.20 $1,078.00 $1,187.20 $1,347.60
Core Charge Price $11.00 $9.00 $5.00 $6.00 $9.00
Total Core Charge Price $440.00 $360.00 $200.00 $240.00 $360.00
Total $2,142.00 $1,567.20 $1,278.00 $1,427.20 $1,707.60
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total Price with Prompt Payment $1,702.00 $1,183.06 $1,078.00 $1,187.20 $1,347.60
Discount
2 Group: U1-R 10 8229R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 27 25 30 25 25
Supplier Code # U1R230 8229R SP-30R SLIU1RA UIR
Unit Price $41.65 $36.42 $26.95 $29.50 $43.44
Total Price $416.50 $364.20 $269.50 $295.00 $434.40
Core Charge Price $11.00 $9.00 $5.00 $6.00 $9.00
Total Core Charge Price $110.00 $90.00 $50.00 $60.00 $90.00
Total $526.50 $454.20 $319.50 $355.00 $524.40
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $416.50 $356.92 $269.50 $295.00 $434.40
3 Group: 4D 15 NAS 7266
Quoted Reserve Capacity 335 320 295 290 320
Supplier Code # 4DA 7266 4D-XHD SLI4DA 4D
Unit Price $110.40 $134.04 $100.95 $122.76 $149.51
Total Price $1,656.00 $2,010.60 $1,514.25 $1,841.40 $2,242.65
Core Charge Price $31.00 $54.00 $60.00 $36.00 $54.00
Total Core Charge Price $465.00 $810.00 $900.00 $540.00 $810.00
Total $2,121.00 $2,820.60 $2,414.25 $2,381.40 $3,052.65
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Battery cost with Prompt Payment $1,656.00 $1,970.39 $1,514.25 $1,841.40 $2,242.65

Discount




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
4 Group: 4DLT 20 -850 -7251
Quoted Reserve Capacity 250 250 250 240 250
Supplier Code # 759 7251 4D-DLT SLI4DLT 4DLT
Unit Price $118.48 $113.79 $84.95 $115.50 $129.39
Total Price $2,369.60 $2,275.80 $1,699.00 $2,310.00 $2,587.80
Core Charge Price $31.00 $36.00 $60.00 $48.00 $36.00
Total Core Charge Price $620.00 $720.00 $1,200.00 $960.00 $720.00
Total $2,989.60 $2,995.80 $2,899.00 $3,270.00 $3,307.80
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $2,369.60 $2,230.28 $1,699.00 $2,310.00 $2,587.80
Discount
5 Group: 8D 40 -1400 7269
Quoted Reserve Capacity 450 435 450 430 435
Supplier Code # 8D1400 7269 8D-MHD SLISDA 8D
Unit Price $145.08 $150.20 $124.95 $146.00 $169.73
Total Price $5,803.20 $6,008.00 $4,998.00 $5,840.00 $6,789.20
Core Charge Price $31.00 $72.00 $60.00 $48.00 $72.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,240.00 $2,880.00 $2,400.00 $1,920.00 $2,880.00
Total $7,043.20 $8,888.00 $7,398.00 $7,760.00 $9,669.20
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $5,803.20 $5,887.84 $4,998.00 $5,840.00 $6,789.20
Discount
6 Group: 24 50 650 7524
Quoted Reserve Capacity 113 115 95 115 115
Supplier Code # 24A 7524 PF-24-5 SLI24A 24
Unit Price $50.71 $72.27 $39.95 $55.50 $82.15
Total Price $2,535.50 $3,613.50 $1,997.50 $2,775.00 $4,107.50
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $550.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $600.00 $900.00
Total $3,085.50 $4,513.50 $2,997.50 $3,375.00 $5,007.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $2,535.50 $3,541.23 $1,997.50 $2,775.00 $4,107.50




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
7 Group: 24 Deep Cycle 5 8240
Quoted Reserve Capacity 140 120 140 130 120
Supplier Code # M24MF 8240 SRM-24 SLI24MDC 24DCM
Unit Price $64.35 $66.68 $58.95 $80.01 $79.85
Total Price $321.75 $333.40 $294.75 $400.05 $399.25
Core Charge Price $14.50 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $72.50 $90.00 $100.00 $60.00 $90.00
Total $394.25 $423.40 $394.75 $460.05 $489.25
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $321.75 $326.73 $294.75 $400.05 $399.25
Discount
8 Group: 24F 5 7524F
Quoted Reserve Capacity 113 115 95 115 115
Supplier Code # 24FA 7524F PF-24F-5 SLI24FA 24F
Unit Price $50.71 $74.14 $39.95 $55.50 $88.25
Total Price $253.55 $370.70 $199.75 $277.50 $441.25
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $55.00 $90.00 $100.00 $60.00 $90.00
Total $308.55 $460.70 $299.75 $337.50 $531.25
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $253.55 $363.29 $199.75 $277.50 $441.25
Discount
9 Group: 26 20 7526
Quoted Reserve Capacity 85 80 58 80 80
Supplier Code # 26A 7526 MT-26 SLI26 26
Unit Price $47.16 $78.55 $48.95 $64.72 $90.18
Total Price $943.20 $1,571.00 $979.00 $1,294.40 $1,803.60
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $220.00 $360.00 $400.00 $240.00 $360.00
Total $1,163.20 $1,931.00 $1,379.00 $1,534.40 $2,163.60
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $943.20 $1,539.58 $979.00 $1,294.40 $1,803.60




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
10 Group: 26R 15 7526R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 85 80 81 80 80
Supplier Code # 26RA 7526R MT-26R SLI26R 26R
Unit Price $47.16 $74.17 $48.95 $64.72 $86.28
Total Price $707.40 $1,112.55 $734.25 $970.80 $1,294.20
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $165.00 $270.00 $300.00 $180.00 $270.00
Total $872.40 $1,382.55 $1,034.25 $1,150.80 $1,564.20
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $707.40 $1,090.30 $734.25 $970.80 $1,294.20
11 Group: 27 50 7527 7527
Quoted Reserve Capacity 130 120 160 120 120
Supplier Code # 27A 7527 MT-27 SLI27 27
Unit Price $65.90 $76.15 $59.95 $61.50 $86.53
Total Price $3,295.00 $3,807.50 $2,997.50 $3,075.00 $4,326.50
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $550.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $0.00 $900.00
Total $3,845.00 $4,707.50 $3,997.50 $3,075.00 $5,226.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $3,295.00 $3,731.35 $2,997.50 $3,075.00 $4,326.50
Discount
12 Group: 27 Deep Cycle 30 8270
Quoted Reserve Capacity 160 160 160 175 160
Supplier Code # M27MF 8270 SRM-27 SLI27MDC 27DCM
Unit Price $70.92 $71.24 $64.95 $74.50 $82.45
Total Price $2,127.60 $2,137.20 $1,948.50 $2,235.00 $2,473.50
Core Charge Price $14.50 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $435.00 $540.00 $600.00 $360.00 $540.00
Total $2,562.60 $2,677.20 $2,548.50 $2,595.00 $3,013.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $2,127.60 $2,094.46 $1,948.50 $2,235.00 $2,473.50




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
13 Group: 31S 30 7238
Quoted Reserve Capacity 180 180 185 1.95 180
Supplier Code # ACD31TS 7238 PF-31S-7 SLI31DP 31S
Unit Price $77.57 $82.52 $59.95 $99.90 $92.51
Total Price $2,327.10 $2,475.60 $1,798.50 $2,997.00 $2,775.30
Core Charge Price $18.50 $27.00 $20.00 $18.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $555.00 $810.00 $600.00 $540.00 $810.00
Total $2,882.10 $3,285.60 $2,398.50 $3,537.00 $3,585.30
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $2,327.10 $2,426.09 $1,798.50 $2,997.00 $2,775.30
Discount
14 Group: 34 20 -690 7534
Quoted Reserve Capacity 115 115 120 110 115
Supplier Code # 34PS 7534 PF-34-6 SLI34 34
Unit Price $69.57 $75.53 $49.95 $72.50 $87.82
Total Price $1,391.40 $1,510.60 $999.00 $1,450.00 $1,756.40
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $220.00 $360.00 $400.00 $240.00 $360.00
Total $1,611.40 $1,870.60 $1,399.00 $1,690.00 $2,116.40
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $1,391.40 $1,480.39 $999.00 $1,450.00 $1,756.40
15 Group: 36R 30 7536R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 130 130 130 120 130
Supplier Code # 36RPS 7536R MT-36R SLI36R 36R
Unit Price $76.45 $75.44 $63.95 $87.68 $87.52
Total Price $2,293.50 $2,263.20 $1,918.50 $2,630.40 $2,625.60
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $330.00 $540.00 $600.00 $360.00 $540.00
Total $2,623.50 $2,803.20 $2,518.50 $2,990.40 $3,165.60
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $2,293.50 $2,217.94 $1,918.50 $2,630.40 $2,625.60

Discount




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
16 Group: 40R 30 7540R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 105 105 105 105 105
Supplier Code # 40RA 7540R MT-40R SLI40RT6M 40R
Unit Price $65.78 $74.72 $63.95 $83.02 $86.91
Total Price $1,973.40 $2,241.60 $1,918.50 $2,490.60 $2,607.30
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $330.00 $540.00 $600.00 $360.00 $540.00
Total $2,303.40 $2,781.60 $2,518.50 $2,850.60 $3,147.30
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $1,973.40 $2,196.77 $1,918.50 $2,490.60 $2,607.30
Discount
17 Group: 48 70 -730 7548
Quoted Reserve Capacity 140 135 115 120 135
Supplier Code # 48A 7548 MTP-48/H6 SLI48H6M 48
Unit Price $80.00 $84.51 $81.95 $90.90 $99.45
Total Price $5,600.00 $5,915.70 $5,736.50 $6,363.00 $6,961.50
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $770.00 $1,260.00 $1,400.00 $840.00 $1,260.00
Total $6,370.00 $7,175.70 $7,136.50 $7,203.00 $8,221.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $5,600.00 $5,797.39 $5,736.50 $6,363.00 $6,961.50
18 Group: 49 70 7549
Quoted Reserve Capacity 150 185 175 185 185
Supplier Code # 49PS 7549 MTP-49/H8 SLI49H8M 49
Unit Price $99.39 $94.29 $98.95 $104.70 $108.05
Total Price $6,957.30 $6,600.30 $6,926.50 $7,329.00 $7,563.50
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $770.00 $1,260.00 $1,400.00 $840.00 $1,260.00
Total $7,727.30 $7,860.30 $8,326.50 $8,169.00 $8,823.50
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $6,957.30 $6,468.29 $6,926.50 $7,329.00 $7,563.50




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
19 Group: 51R 20 -450 7551R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 75 75 75 70 75
Supplier Code # 51RA 7551R PF-51R-6 SLI51R 51R
Unit Price $48.71 $78.62 $44.95 $68.09 $89.27
Total Price $974.20 $1,572.40 $899.00 $1,361.80 $1,785.40
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $220.00 $360.00 $400.00 $240.00 $360.00
Total $1,194.20 $1,932.40 $1,299.00 $1,601.80 $2,145.40
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $974.20 $1,540.95 $899.00 $1,361.80 $1,785.40
20 Group: 58 100 -580 7558
Quoted Reserve Capacity 80 85 80 85 85
Supplier Code # 58A 7558 MT-58 SLI58 58
Unit Price $50.87 $78.62 $49.95 $61.68 $89.27
Total Price $5,087.00 $7,862.00 $4,995.00 $6,168.00 $8,927.00
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,100.00 $1,800.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,800.00
Total $6,187.00 $9,662.00 $6,995.00 $7,368.00 $10,727.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $5,087.00 $7,704.76 $4,995.00 $6,168.00 $8,927.00
Discount
21 Group: 58R 60 -580 7558R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 80 85 100 85 85
Supplier Code # 58RA 7558R MT-58R SLI58R 58R
Unit Price $50.87 $78.62 $55.95 $61.68 $89.27
Total Price $3,052.20 $4,717.20 $3,357.00 $3,700.80 $5,356.20
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $660.00 $1,080.00 $1,200.00 $720.00 $1,080.00
Total $3,712.20 $5,797.20 $4,557.00 $4,420.80 $6,436.20
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $3,052.20 $4,622.86 $3,357.00 $3,700.80 $5,356.20




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
22 Group: 65 1100 -850 7565
Quoted Reserve Capacity 160 150 150 150 150
Supplier Code # 65PGHR 7565 V65-6 SLI65M 65
Unit Price $83.90 $80.57 $65.95 $65.50 $99.38
Total Price $92,290.00 $88,627.00 $72,545.00 $72,050.00 $109,318.00
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $12,100.00 $19,800.00 $22,000.00 $13,200.00 $19,800.00
Total $104,390.00 $108,427.00 $94,545.00 $85,250.00 $129,118.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $92,290.00 $86,854.46 $72,545.00 $72,050.00 $109,318.00
23 Group: 75 200 NAS -650 7575
Quoted Reserve Capacity 90 90 80 90 90
Supplier Code # 75A 7575 PF-75-5 SLI75 75
Unit Price $57.77 $72.27 $49.95 $63.24 $83.25
Total Price $11,554.00 $14,454.00 $9,990.00 $12,648.00 $16,650.00
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $2,200.00 $3,600.00 $4,000.00 $2,400.00 $3,600.00
Total $13,754.00 $18,054.00 $13,990.00 $15,048.00 $20,250.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $11,554.00 $14,164.92 $9,990.00 $12,648.00 $16,650.00
24 Group: 78 100 -690 7578
Quoted Reserve Capacity 110 110 120 110 110
Supplier Code # 78A 7578 PF-78-6 SLI78 78
Unit Price $58.15 $77.05 $52.95 $66.66 $89.29
Total Price $5,815.00 $7,705.00 $5,295.00 $6,666.00 $8,929.00
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,100.00 $1,800.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,800.00
Total $6,915.00 $9,505.00 $7,295.00 $7,866.00 $10,729.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $5,815.00 $7,550.90 $5,295.00 $6,666.00 $8,929.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
NAS NAS
25 Group: 78 Dual Terminal 100 -800 8434/78
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 120 115 115 120
Supplier Code # 843478 V34787 SLI34DTM 34/78
Unit Price $87.51 $59.95 $76.76 $99.49
Total Price $8,751.00 $5,995.00 $7,676.00 $9,949.00
Core Charge Price $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,800.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,800.00
Total $10,551.00 $7,995.00 $8,876.00 $11,749.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $8,575.98 $5,995.00 $7,676.00 $9,949.00
26 Group: 90 100 7590
Quoted Reserve Capacity 100 100 100 90 100
Supplier Code # 90A 7590 MTP-90/T5 SLI90T5 90
Unit Price $66.41 $82.11 $61.95 $77.77 $93.68
Total Price $6,641.00 $8,211.00 $6,195.00 $7,777.00 $9,368.00
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,100.00 $1,800.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,800.00
Total $7,741.00 $10,011.00 $8,195.00 $8,977.00 $11,168.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $6,641.00 $8,046.78 $6,195.00 $7,777.00 $9,368.00
27 Group: 94R 60 -790 7594R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 145 135 130 140 135
Supplier Code # 94RA 7594R MTP-94R/H7 SLI94R47M 94R
Unit Price $94.51 $111.35 $95.95 $117.00 $126.95
Total Price $5,670.60 $6,681.00 $5,757.00 $7,020.00 $7,617.00
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $660.00 $1,080.00 $1,200.00 $720.00 $1,080.00
Total $6,330.60 $7,761.00 $6,957.00 $7,740.00 $8,697.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $5,670.60 $6,547.38 $5,757.00 $7,020.00 $7,617.00

Discount




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
28 Group: 96R 30 -600 8496R
Quoted Reserve Capacity 95 90 95 90 90
Supplier Code # 96RPS 8496R MTP-96R SLI96R 96R
Unit Price $85.05 $80.88 $61.95 $78.78 $92.12
Total Price $2,551.50 $2,426.40 $1,858.50 $2,363.40 $2,763.60
Core Charge Price $11.00 $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $330.00 $540.00 $600.00 $360.00 $540.00
Total $2,881.50 $2,966.40 $2,458.50 $2,723.40 $3,303.60
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $2,551.50 $2,377.87 $1,858.50 $2,363.40 $2,763.60
29 Group: 534B20R 100 9851P
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 60 No Bid No Bid 60
Supplier Code # 9851P Thru Toyota only! 51P
Unit Price $127.92 $143.91
Total Price $12,792.00 $14,391.00
Core Charge Price $18.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,800.00 $1,800.00
Total $14,592.00 $16,191.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $12,536.16 $14,391.00
30 Group: 546B24R 100 9851P
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 60 No Bid No Bid 60
Supplier Code # 9851P Thru Toyota only! 51P
Unit Price $127.92 $143.91
Total Price $12,792.00 $14,391.00
Core Charge Price $18.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,800.00 $1,800.00
Total $14,592.00 $16,191.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $12,536.16 $14,391.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
31 Group: XHD31C 12 -1000 7236
Quoted Reserve Capacity 195 190 185 185 190
Supplier Code # 31-901CT 7236 PF-31S-7 SLI31PHP 31S
Unit Price $97.75 $85.99 $59.95 $104.50 $103.86
Total Price $1,173.00 $1,031.88 $719.40 $1,254.00 $1,246.32
Core Charge Price $18.50 $27.00 $30.00 $18.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $222.00 $324.00 $360.00 $216.00 $324.00
Total $1,395.00 $1,355.88 $1,079.40 $1,470.00 $1,570.32
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $1,173.00 $1,011.24 $719.40 $1,254.00 $1,246.32
32 Group: 25 4 -550 7525
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 95 100 90 95
Supplier Code # 7525 MT-25 SLI25 25
Unit Price $74.55 $49.95 $70.76 $85.73
Total Price $298.20 $199.80 $283.04 $342.92
Core Charge Price $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $72.00 $80.00 $48.00 $72.00
Total $370.20 $279.80 $331.04 $414.92
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $292.24 $199.80 $283.04 $342.92
33 Group: 67R 2 7567R
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 65 65 65 65
Supplier Code # 7567R MTP-67R SLI67R 67R
Unit Price $118.32 $62.95 $104.50 $135.40
Total Price $236.64 $125.90 $209.00 $270.80
Core Charge Price $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $36.00 $40.00 $24.00 $36.00
Total $272.64 $165.90 $233.00 $306.80
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $231.91 $125.90 $209.00 $270.80
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
34 Group: 86 3 7586
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 85 90 85 85
Supplier Code # 7586 PF-86-6 SLI86 86
Unit Price $81.78 $49.95 $64.50 $93.26
Total Price $245.34 $149.85 $193.50 $279.78
Core Charge Price $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $54.00 $60.00 $36.00 $54.00
Total $299.34 $209.85 $229.50 $333.78
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $240.43 $149.85 $193.50 $279.78
35 Group: 151R 5 65151R
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 55 57 55 55
Supplier Code # 151R MT-151 SLI151R 151R
Unit Price $63.74 $75.95 $63.50 $73.87
Total Price $318.70 $379.75 $317.50 $369.35
Core Charge Price $18.00 $20.00 $12.00 $18.00
Total Core Charge Price $90.00 $100.00 $60.00 $90.00
Total $408.70 $479.75 $377.50 $459.35
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $312.33 $379.75 $317.50 $369.35
Il FIRE DEPARTMENT TRUCK
BATTERIES
Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered: Johnson Industries East Penn JCl/Interstate EAST PENN East Penn
Brand Name of Batteries Offered: AC Delco NAPA| Interstate/PowerFast. DURACELL ULTRA NAPA
1 Group: 31P 100 7237 NAS NAS
Quoted Reserve Capacity 195 190 185 175 190
Supplier Code # 31-900CT 31P PF-31P-7 SLI 31 XPA 7237
Unit Price $97.75 $85.99 $59.95 $75.68 $103.86
Total Price $9,775.00 $8,599.00 $5,995.00 $7,568.00 $10,386.00
Core Charge Price $18.50 $27.00 $30.00 $18.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,850.00 $2,700.00 $3,000.00 $1,800.00 $2,700.00
Total $11,625.00 $11,299.00 $8,995.00 $9,368.00 $13,086.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $9,775.00 $8,427.02 $5,995.00 $7,568.00 $10,386.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
2 Group: 31S 1500 7236 NAS NAS
Quoted Reserve Capacity 195 190 185 175 190
Supplier Code # 31-901CT 31S PF-31S-7 SLI31SA 7236
Unit Price $97.75 $85.99 $59.95 $75.68 $103.86
Total Price $146,625.00 $128,985.00 $89,925.00 $113,520.00 $155,790.00
Core Charge Price $18.50 $27.00 $30.00 $18.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $27,750.00 $40,500.00 $45,000.00 $27,000.00 $40,500.00
Total $174,375.00 $169,485.00 $134,925.00 $140,520.00 $196,290.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $146,625.00 $126,405.30 $89,925.00 $113,520.00 $155,790.00
Discount
1] UTILITY BATTERIES
Manufacturer Name of Batteries Offered: No Bid Est Penn JCI/Trojan| EAST PENN / ASCENT East Penn
Brand Name of Batteries Offered: No Bid NAPA Trojan, DURACELL ULTRA/ NAPA
Interstate/PowerFast DURACELL ULTRA
1 Group: T105 150
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 447 448 447
Supplier Code # 8144 PF-GC2 SLIGC115 8144
Unit Price $90.63 $68.95 $89.68 $103.70
Total Price $13,594.50 $10,342.50 $13,452.00 $15,555.00
Core Charge Price $27.00 $30.00 $18.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $4,050.00 $4,500.00 $2,700.00 $4,050.00
Total $17,644.50 $14,842.50 $16,152.00 $19,605.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $13,322.61 $10,342.50 $13,452.00 $15,555.00
2 Group: T125 30 8146
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 530 20 Hrs @ 225 amps 488 530
Supplier Code # 8146 GC2-ECL-UTL SLI GC 125 8146
Unit Price $90.63 $87.95 $106.68 $103.70
Total Price $2,718.90 $2,638.50 $3,200.40 $3,111.00
Core Charge Price $27.00 $30.00 $18.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $810.00 $900.00 $540.00 $810.00
Total $3,528.90 $3,538.50 $3,740.40 $3,921.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $2,664.52 $2,638.50 $3,200.40 $3,111.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
3 Group: T145 60 8146
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 530 20 Hrs @ 225 amps No Bid 530
Supplier Code # 8146 GC2-ECL-UTL 8146
Unit Price $90.63 $87.95 $103.70
Total Price $5,437.80 $5,277.00 $6,222.00
Core Charge Price $27.00 $30.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $1,620.00 $1,800.00 $1,620.00
Total $7,057.80 $7,077.00 $7,842.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $5,329.04 $5,277.00 $6,222.00
4 Group: T875 20 8148
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 290 295 318 290
Supplier Code # 8148 PF-GC8 SLI GC 8V 8148
Unit Price $94.21 $98.95 $110.00 $105.35
Total Price $1,884.20 $1,979.00 $2,200.00 $2,107.00
Core Charge Price $27.00 $30.00 $18.00 $27.00
Total Core Charge Price $540.00 $600.00 $360.00 $540.00
Total $2,424.20 $2,579.00 $2,560.00 $2,647.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $1,846.52 $1,979.00 $2,200.00 $2,107.00
5 Group: UB12120 20 ES1212
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 0, 12 Amps/HR 12 Amps - 0, 12 amps/HR
Supplier Code # ES1212 SLA1105 SLA12-12F2 ES1212
Unit Price $33.66 $30.00 $27.88 $37.90
Total Price $673.20 $600.00 $557.60 $758.00
Core Charge Price $0.00 $2.50 $0.00 $0.00
Total Core Charge Price $0.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $673.20 $650.00 $557.60 $758.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $659.74 $600.00 $557.60 $758.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM 14737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
6 Group: UB12180 20 18 amps per hr
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 0, 12 amps/HR 18 Amps - 0, 12 amps/hr
Supplier Code # ES1712 SLA1116 SLAA12-18NB ES1712
Unit Price $49.96 $33.00 $44.45 $43.95
Total Price $999.20 $660.00 $889.00 $879.00
Core Charge Price $0.00 $2.50 No Charge $0.00
Total Core Charge Price $0.00 $50.00 No Charge $0.00
Total $999.20 $710.00 $889.00 $879.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $979.22 $660.00 $889.00 $879.00
7 DELETED
8 Group: UB12550 12
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 0, 55 amps/HR 55 AHS 0, 55 amp/hr
Supplier Code # 8222NF SLA1165 DURDC12-55P 8222 NF
Unit Price $76.76 $136.95 $122.05 $89.86
Total Price $921.12 $1,643.40 $1,464.60 $1,078.32
Core Charge Price $9.00 $30.00 $12.00 $9.00
Total Core Charge Price $108.00 $360.00 $144.00 $108.00
Total $1,029.12 $2,003.40 $1,608.60 $1,186.32
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $902.70 $1,643.40 $1,464.60 $1,078.32
9 Group: UB12350 22
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 0, 35 amps/HR 35 Amps 0, 35 amp/hr
Supplier Code # ESUI-35 SLA1156 DURDC12-35J ESUI-35
Unit Price $66.42 $69.95 $62.44 $76.89
Total Price $1,461.24 $1,538.90 $1,373.68 $1,691.58
Core Charge Price $9.00 $20.00 $6.00 $9.00
Total Core Charge Price $198.00 $440.00 $132.00 $198.00
Total $1,659.24 $1,978.90 $1,505.68 $1,889.58
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $1,432.02 $1,538.90 $1,373.68 $1,691.58
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local

For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company

Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
10 Group: UB1250 8
Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 0, 5 amps/HR 5 Amps 0, 5 amp/hr
Supplier Code # ES5-12 SLA1055 DURA12-5F ES5-12
Unit Price $21.16 $15.00 $17.45 $24.97
Total Price $169.28 $120.00 $139.60 $199.76
Core Charge Price $0.00 $2.50 $0.00 $0.00
Total Core Charge Price $0.00 $20.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total $169.28 $140.00 $139.60 $199.76
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $165.89 $120.00 $139.60 $199.76
Discount
11 Group: UB1220T 8

Quoted Reserve Capacity No Bid 0, 2 amp/HR 2 Amps No Bid 0, 2 amps/hr
Supplier Code # UBI220T SLA1020 UB1220T
Unit Price $45.37 $26.95 $47.37
Total Price $362.96 $215.60 $378.96
Core Charge Price $0.00 $2.50 $0.00
Total Core Charge Price $0.00 $20.00 $0.00
Total $362.96 $235.60 $378.96
Prompt Payment Discount 2.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total cost with Prompt Payment $355.70 $215.60 $378.96
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local

For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company

Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. [210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
12 Group: ES17-12 8

Nominal Voltage No Bid No Bid

Nominal Capacity

30 hour rate (0.9A to 10.50V) 18Ah
10 hour rate (1.71A to 10.50V) 17.1 Ah
5 Hour rate (3.06 to 10.20V) 15.3 Ah
1C (18A to 9.60V) 9.6 Ah

3C (54A to 9.60V) 6.3 Ah

Internal Resistance (at 1KHz) Approx:
12Q

Maximum Discharge Current for 5
seconds: 270A

Charge retention (shelf life) at 20°C
(68°F)

1 month — 92%

3 months - 90%

6 months - 80%

Estimated Annual Usage: 8

Terminal: F3

Supplier Code
Unit Price:
Total Price

#:

Core Charge Price:
Total Core Charge Price

Total

Prompt Payment Discount

Total cost with
Discount

Prompt Payment

ES17-12
$49.96
$399.68
$0.00
$0.00
$399.68
2.00%
$391.69

ES17-12
$35.00
$280.00
$5.00
$40.00
$320.00
0.00%
$280.00

ES 17-12
$43.95
$351.60
$0.00
$0.00
$351.60
0.00%
$351.60
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2017 Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Automotive, Industrial, and |Full Service Auto Parts |Genuine Parts IBS of Paseo Del Rio  [River Birch Way LLC South Texas Auto
Utility Batteries Company dba Batteries Plus Parts Company
Bulbs
6100008491 IM (4737 Broom Street 6374 Rittiman Road 902 Chulie Drive 6891 Bandera Rd. 20475 Hwy 46 W,
Ste. 340
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Spring Branch,
Est. [TX 78217 TX 78218 TX 78216 TX 78238 TX 78070
Item Description Qty. |210-590-6793 210-661-7700 210-666-4588 210-647-0103
v DELIVERY & DISPOSAL SERVICE
A. Business hours from and to: 7:30AM - 6:00PM 7:30AM - 7:00PM 7:30 AM - 5:30 PM 8:00 AM - 8:00 PM| 7:30 AM - 8:00 PM
8-7 SAT, 11-6 SUN
Days per week: 5 5 5| 5 days per week, M-F 5
Disposal Fee Per Battery $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 ENV FEE $3.00 per $3.00
12V Battery (St. of
Texas)
ENV FEE $2.00 PER
6V Battery (St of Texas)
Prompt payment discount: Net 30 2% 10 Days Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Subtotal $29,183.40 $181,643.32 $62,088.05 $73,981.28 $0.00
Total of Core Charge $5,140.00 $50,598.00 $23,720.00 $13,332.00 $0.00
Total of Core Credit -$5,140.00 -$50,598.00 -$23,720.00 -$13,332.00
Total of Charge for Disposal of Junk $1,320.00 $6,021.00 $3,045.00 $3,426.00 $0.00
Batteries
Estimated Annual Award $30,503.40 $187,664.32 $65,133.05 $77,407.28 $0.00

* For evaluation purposes, core charge fee and disposal of junk batteries not considered.
** Jtems identified NAS in the bid tabulation did not meet minimum reserve capacity identified in bid specifications.
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