City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 18, 2017
Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Associated Supply ROMCO Equipment  [Holt Texas, LTD Anderson Machinery |Bobcat of San Antonio |Briggs Equipment Closner Equipment
Company, Inc. dba, Co. Company Co. Inc.
ASCO Equipment
6100009231 LD |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |1042 S.E. Loop 410  [5665 Southeast Loop | 9415 N. E. Loop 410 |11146 IH 35 North 711 N.W.W. White Rd. (21910 FM 2252
410
Item Description QTY |Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Schertz,
TX 79404-6800 TX 78220 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78233 TX 78219 TX 78154
806-745-2000 210-648-4600 210-648-1111
1 Off Road Construction Material Handling 1
Forklift: NAS
Price Each: $76,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70,972.00 No Bid
Total: $76,000.00 $70,972.00
Percentage between lowest responsive
bid and local bid:
Price Differential:
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017 Case 586H 2017 Sellick
S60J4e-4
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered FPT F5HFL463D, Ecomax T4, 74 hp
(Include SAE net HP): 74 Gross, 68 Net|
Warranty: 12 months/unlimited 12 month or 2000 hrs
hour, engine 24
months/2000 hr., 24
months/2000 hr.
transmission
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Associated Supply Co Briggs Equipment
Inc.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, 711 N.W.W. White
San Antonio, Texas| Rd., San Antonio,
78219 TX 78219
Delivery: 150 Days| 75 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 9-30-17| 11/30/2017
Last day order can be placed without 9-30-17| 11/30/2017
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Noj Until the year 2018
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 18, 2017
Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Associated Supply ROMCO Equipment  [Holt Texas, LTD Anderson Machinery |Bobcat of San Antonio |Briggs Equipment Closner Equipment
Company, Inc. dba, Co. Company Co. Inc.
ASCO Equipment
6100009231 LD |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |1042 S.E. Loop 410  [5665 Southeast Loop | 9415 N. E. Loop 410 |11146 IH 35 North 711 N.W.W. White Rd. (21910 FM 2252
410
Item Description QTY |Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Schertz,
TX 79404-6800 TX 78220 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78233 TX 78219 TX 78154
806-745-2000 210-648-4600 210-648-1111
2 Enclosed Tracked Skid Loader with 1
Grappler:
Price Each: $36,600.00 $33,673.00 $37,200.00 $36,029.00 $35,108.90 No Bid No Bid
Total: $36,600.00 $33,673.00 $37,200.00 $36,029.00 $35,108.90
Percentage between lowest responsive 10.47% 7.00%
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $3,527.00 $2,356.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017 Case SR130 2017 Volvo MC70C|| 2017 Caterpillar 226D 2017 GEHL Skid 2017 Bobcat S550
Loader R165
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered ISM N844L-F, 42.8|| Kohler KDI1903TCR,|| Cat C2.2 CRDI Tier 4f Yanmar 4TNV98C- Bobcat 2.4L, 61 HP
(Include SAE net HP): Gross,45.8 Net 55.1 net hp NMS?2 Tier 4, 68.4 HP
Warranty: 12 months/unlimited 1yr. or 1500 hours| 12 months/unlimited One (1) Year One Year Full
hours - 24 hours, total machine
months/2000 hr. full
factor
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Associated Supply Co[|[Romco Equipment Co. Holt Cat| Anderson Machinery| Bobcat of San Antonio
Inc. Company
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East,|| 1042 S.E. Loop 410,|| 5665 S.E. Loop 410,| 9415 N. E. Loop 410 11146 IH 35 N., San
San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, T. San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX
78219 78220 78222 78219
Delivery: 150 Days 60-120 days| 90-120 Days 60-120 60 days
Production Cut-off Date: 9-30-17| 9-29-20[ Unknown at this time 10-31-17 Dec 31, 2017
Last day order can be placed without 9-30-17 9-29-20[ Unknown at this time 10-31-17 Dec 31, 2017
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No| No| No No No
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 18, 2017
Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Associated Supply ROMCO Equipment  [Holt Texas, LTD Anderson Machinery |Bobcat of San Antonio |Briggs Equipment Closner Equipment
Company, Inc. dba, Co. Company Co. Inc.
ASCO Equipment
6100009231 LD |2102 E. Slayton Rd. |1042 S.E. Loop 410  [5665 Southeast Loop | 9415 N. E. Loop 410 |11146 IH 35 North 711 N.W.W. White Rd. (21910 FM 2252
410
Item Description QTY |Lubbock, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Schertz,
TX 79404-6800 TX 78220 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78233 TX 78219 TX 78154
806-745-2000 210-648-4600 210-648-1111
3 7 Ton Double Drum Vibratory Roller: 2 NAS
Price Each: $112,578.00 No Bid $106,704.00 $113,123.00 No Bid No Bid $96,468.40
Total: $225,156.00 $213,408.00 $226,246.00 $192,936.80
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017 Case DV209D 2017 Caterpillar CB7 2017 Bomag 2018 Dynapac
BW141AD-5 CC2200
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Deutz TCD 3.6 L 4, Cat C3.4B Tier 4iff Kubota V3307 CRT-T, Current engine is
(Include SAE net HP): 100HP Tier 4 Final 74.2 HP Deutz TCD 100 hp -
Tier 4F engine will be
Available by deliver
date and will meet all
cnPArs
Warranty: 12 mo./unlimited hr. - 12 months/unlimited|| One (1) Year or 1,000 1 year factory warranty
24 months/2000 Hr. hours, total machine| hours, whichever
Enaine comes first
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Associated Supply Co Holt Cat| Anderson Machinery Closner Equipment
Inc. Company Co. Inc.
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 4146 IH 10 East, 5665 S.E. Loop 410,] 9415 N. E. Loop 410 21910 FM 2252,
San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, TX Schertz, TX 78154
78219 78222 78219
Delivery: 150 Days 90-120 Days 90-150 180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 9-30-17 Unknown at this time 10-31-17 08/14/2018
Last day order can be placed without 9-30-17 Unknown at this time 10-31-17 08/14/2018
missina cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No Yes
date:
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $337,756.00 $33,673.00 $250,608.00 $262,275.00 $35,108.90 $70,972.00 $192,936.80
Total Award: $76,000.00 $33,673.00 $213,408.00
Prepared by Purchasing 8/31/2017 3of 6



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 18, 2017 Local
Local Non-Local Local Alt Bid 1 Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Cooper Equipment Equipment Depot H & V Equipment H & V Equipment Nueces Farm Center |RDO Equipment Co.
Co. dba Nueces Power
Equipment
6100009231 LD |17474 Judson Rd. 5250 N. Loop 1604 E. 3307 S.E. Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410  |4697 FM 1516 N 19275 N IH 35
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio Converse, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78109 TX 78132
1 Off Road Construction Material Handling 1
Forklift: NAS NAS
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $77,485.47 $70,985.47 No Bid No Bid
Total: $77,485.47 $70,985.47
Percentage between lowest responsive 1.95%
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $1,485.47

Year, Make & Model Offered:
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

2017 Load Lifter
Model 2422-6D
Enclosed Cab

Perkins model 1104D-
44T-Tier Il

1 yr./21000 hours full
machine &
11yr/3000hours
engine only

H & V Equipment

3307 S.E. Loop 410,
San Antonio TX 78222

112 days
None
None

Yes

2017 Load Lifter
Model 2422-6D w/
FOPS-ROPS

Perkins model 1104D-
44T-Tier 11

1 yr./1000 hours full
machine &
11yr/3000hours
engine only|

H & V Equipment

3307 S.E. Loop 410,
San Antonio TX 78222

112 days
None
None

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 18, 2017 Local
Local Non-Local Local Alt Bid 1 Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Cooper Equipment Equipment Depot H & V Equipment H & V Equipment Nueces Farm Center |RDO Equipment Co.
Co. dba Nueces Power
Equipment
6100009231 LD |17474 Judson Rd. 5250 N. Loop 1604 E. (3307 S.E. Loop 410 |3307 S.E. Loop 410 |4697 FM 1516 N 19275 N IH 35
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio Converse, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78109 TX 78132
2 Enclosed Tracked Skid Loader with 1
Grappler:
Price Each: No Bid $37,664.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37,078.08
Total: $37,664.40 $37,078.08

Percentage between lowest responsive
bid and local bid:

Price Differential:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:

Last day order can be placed without
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off
date:

2017 New Holland
L218

ISM 844LT,
Net HP -57

2 year full machine

Equipment Depot

5250 N. Loop 1604 E.
San Antonio, TX|
78247

45 Days
N/A
N/A

N/A

2017 John Deere
316GR

Yanmar 4TNV86CHT
(61 HP)

1 yr. full machine
warranty and 2nd year
PT&H up to 2000 hrs.

RDO Equipment Co.

19275 N. IH 35, New
Braunfels, TX 78132

60-90 Days
Unknown at this time

Unknown

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 18, 2017 Local
Local Non-Local Local Alt Bid 1 Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Heavy Equipment Cooper Equipment Equipment Depot H & V Equipment H & V Equipment Nueces Farm Center |RDO Equipment Co.
Co. dba Nueces Power
Equipment
6100009231 LD |17474 Judson Rd. 5250 N. Loop 1604 E. (3307 S.E. Loop 410 |3307 S.E. Loop 410 |4697 FM 1516 N 19275 N IH 35
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio San Antonio Converse, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78247 TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78109 TX 78132
3 7 Ton Double Drum Vibratory Roller: 2 NAS
Price Each: $99,867.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $117,998.00 No Bid
Total: $199,734.00 $235,996.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2017 Dynapac 2017 Hamm HD70 VV
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered CC200 Comf Cab Deutz TCD 2.9 L4,
(Include SAE net HP): T4F SAE HP 74.2
Warranty: 1 year or 1,200 hrs. 1 year/1000 hours
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cooper Equipment Nueces Power
Co. Equipment
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 17474 Judson Rd. 4697 FM 1516 North,
San Antonio, TX Converse, TX 78109
78247
Delivery: 140 Days 120 Days
Production Cut-off Date: December 2107 20-Dec-17
Last day order can be placed without December 15, 2107 12/20/2017
missina cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes Yes
date:
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $199,734.00 $37,664.40 $77,485.47 $70,985.47 $235,996.00 $37,078.08
Total Award:
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