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ANORDINANCE 2017 -10-19-0800

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM MISSION GOLF CARS, DEWINNE
EQUIPMENT COMPANY, PROFESSIONAL TURF PRODUCTS AND
EWALD KUBOTA TRACTOR TO PROVIDE 34 LIGHT UTILITY
VEHICLES FOR A TOTAL COST OF $417,356.72, FUNDED FROM THE
EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND AND THE
GENERAL FUND.

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light utility vehicles,
such as electric and gasoline powered golf carts and off-road utility vehicles, for use by various
City departments for yard, warehouse, and field work projects throughout the City; and

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Mission Golf Cars (Items 5, 8-9, 11 and 13-14), DeWinne
Equipment Company (Items 7, 11 and 16), Golf Cars Etc. (Items 7-9, 11, 13-14 and 16) and
Professional Turf Products (Item 14 - Alternate) failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or
requirements; and

WHEREAS, the lowest bids were submitted by Mission Golf Cars (Items 1 and 2) for a total
cost of $17,970.00; and

WHEREAS, DeWinne Equipment Company submitted the lowest, responsive bids (Items 3, 5,
7-8, 11, 13 and 16) for a total cost of $344,251.24; and

WHEREAS, the lowest, responsive bid was submitted by Professional Turf Products (Item 14)
for a cost of $38,598.48; and

WHEREAS, Ewald Kubota Tractor submitted the lowest, responsive bid (Item 9) for a cost of
$16,537.00; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bids from Mission Golf Cars (Items 1 and 2), DeWinne
Equipment Company (Items 3, 5, 7-8, 11, 13 and 16), Professional Turf Products (Item 14) and
Ewald Kubota Tractor (Item 9) to provide the City of San Antonio with light utility vehicles for a
total cost of $417,356.72 is hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all
required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid
tabulation sheet is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies
of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance
Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted by Mission Golf Cars
(Items 5, 8-9, 11 and 13-14), DeWinne Equipment Company (Items 7, 11 and 16), Golf Cars Etc.
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(Items 7-9, 11, 13-14 and 16) and Professional Turf Products (Item 14 - Alternate) failed to meet
the City’s specifications and/or requirements.

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $417,356.72 is available as part as
the Fiscal Year 2018 Budget. See the table below:

Amount General Ledger Cost Center Fund
$ 352,214.63 5501055 3503200001 72001000
$ 56,562.09 5501050 2615040001 11001000
$ 8,580.00 5501055 2015040002 11001000
Total Amt. $417,356.72

SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the budgeted amounts are authorized as follows:
$17,970.00 to Mission Golf Cars, $344,251.24 to DeWinne Equipment Company, $38,598.48 to
Professional Turf Products, and $16,537.00 to Ewald Kubota Tractor and should be encumbered
with purchase orders.

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 19" day of October, 2017.

Ron Nirenberg
ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:
f\{\ - //é Z 7 4
1a M. Vagek, City Cletk “ Andrew Segovia, City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 7 (in consent vote: 5,6,7,9, 11A, 11B, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 19, 20, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26,27 )
Date: 10/19/2017
Time: 09:51:43 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Mission Golf Cars, DeWinne Equipment Company, Professional
Turf Products and Ewald Kubota Tractor to provide 34 light utility vehicles for a total cost of
$417,356.72, funded from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund and the General Fund. [Ben
Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]
Result: Passed
Voter Group P Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X X
William Cruz Shaw District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 %
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 5
John Courage District 9 X X
Clayton H. Perry District 10 X

http://cosaweb/voteinterface/Default.aspx 10/19/2017
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Exhibit 1



City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 16, 2017
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Local Alt 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Alt 1 Non-Local
Mission Golf Cars DeWi Equip DeWi Equij P i Turf Ewald Kubota Tractor Golf Cars Etc. Professional Turf
Company Company Products Products
6100009216 M 18865 Redland Road 11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 1900W IH 10 5560 N. Loop 1604 East |9468 Selma Parkway
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Sequin, San Antonio, Selma,
78259 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78154 TX 78155 TX 78247 TX 78154
Item Description Qty |210-545-7868 979-567-6116 979-567-6116 210-666-7112
1 Heavy Duty Cargo Transport Vehicle- 2 seater 1
Price Each 59.39000' $17,030.85
Price Total $9,390.00 $17,030.85
P ge b lowest resp bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Titan HD 48V| No bid No Bid! 2017 Toro Workman| No Bid No Bid No Bid|
HDT Auto
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Cushman 48 Volt DC Toro 07390 Workman 28
HP
Warranty 2 Year| 2 yrs or 1500 hours - see
attached *****(illegible),
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and| Professional Turf|
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Products 9468 Selma|
Redland Road, San| Parkway, Selma Tx|
Antonio, Texas 78259 78154
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th November 1, 2017
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1stf November 1, 2017,
Firm Pricing Date Yes| No
Delivery Days 60 15-30
2 Electric Golf Cart- 4 Seater 1
Price Each $8,580.00 $8,781.80)
Price Total $8.580.00) $8,781.80
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman Shuttle No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid|2018 Club Car Villager 4 -| No Bid
2+2] Electric 4-Passengerf
pecific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Cushman Shuttle 2+2| 48 Volt Excel Electric -|
48V DC| SAE H/P Rating=Peak 13
H.P.
Warranty 2 Yeal 4 year limited battery, 3|
1 year power-train/frame, 2
year limited remaining
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and| Golf Cars, Etc. -|
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Authorized Club Carf|
Redland Road, San| Dealer|
Antonio, Texas 78259
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 06/01/2018
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st| 03/01/2018,
Firm Pricing Date Yes| NO|
Delivery Days 60’ 30 to 45|
16

I LIgIHX3



City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 16, 2017
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Local Alt 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Alt 1 Non-Local
Mission Golf Cars DeWinne DeWi i P i Turf Ewald Kubota Tractor Golf Cars Etc. Professional Turf
Company Company Products Products
6100009216 M 18865 Redland Road | [11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 1900W IH 10 5560 N. Loop 1604 East |9468 Selma Parkway
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Sequin, San Antonio, Selma,
78259 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78154 TX 78155 TX 78247 TX 78154
Item D ipti Qty [210-545-7868 979-567-6116 979-567-6116 210-666-7112
3 Turf & Ground Utility Vehicle with Power Dump Bed 5
Price Each $13,380.00) 59,759.00| $12,503.00 $11,172.65
Price Total $66,900.00 $48,795.00] $62,515.00 $55,863.25
F ge b lowest bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman Hauler] 2017 Volunteer 4x4 2017 Gravely 996200 No Bid No Bid| 2018 Club Car Carryall No Bid
4x4 JSV 3000 1500 2-wheel drive - Gas
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) 2018 Cushman Hauler 28| Kohler 31 hp, 747cc| Polaris gas EFI 570cc| Kawasaki SH680 4-cycle
HP Subarul kohler aegis v-twin| 40hp peak| SAE H.P. Rating 20.1
Warranty 2 Year| 1-year 1-year] 2 years / 2000 hourl|
engine/drive-train and 1
year remaining vehicle
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and| DeWinne E: DeWinne E Golf Cars, Etc. -
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Company| Company| Authorized Club Carl|
Redland Road, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, Sanf 11002 Bandera Rd, San Dealer
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017| 10/01/2017 06/01/2018
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st 10/01/2017 10/01/2017 03/01/2018
Firm Pricing Date Yes| yes| yes NO|
Delivery Days 60| 30 30| 30to 45
4 DELETED
5 4 Wheeled 4x2 Open Cab Light Utility Vehicle GASOLINE 2 NAS
Price Each $8,320.00 38‘500.00| $12,503.00 $10,286.85
Price Total $16,640.00 $17,000.00] $25,006.00 $20,573.70
P ge b lowest resp bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman 1200 2017 Volunteer 4x4| 2017 Gravely 996200 No Bid No Bid| 2018 Club Car Carryall No Bid
JSV 3000 1500 2-wheel drive - Gas
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) 2018 Cushman 12 HP| Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler] Polaris gas EFI 570cc| Kawasaki SH680 SAE
Kawasakil aegis v-twin| 40hp peak| Rating - 20.1
Warranty 2 Year| 1 Year| 1-year| 2 years / 2000 hour
limited
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and| DeWinne Equipment| DeWinne Equipment Golf Cars, Etc. -
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Company| Company| Authorized Club Carl
Redland Road, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San Dealer|
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250 Antonio, Tx 78250
Pr ion Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017| 10/01/2017 06/01/2018
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st| 10/01/2017] 10/01/2017| 03/01/2018
Firm Pricing Date Yes| yes| yes NO|
Delivery Days 60) 30] 30| 30to 45
[} DELETED

26




City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation
Opened: August 16, 2017
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Local Alt 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Alt 1 Non-Local
Mission Golf Cars DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment Professional Turf Ewald Kubota Tractor Golf Cars Etc. Professional Turf
Company Company Products Products
6100009216 M 18865 Redland Road 11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 1900W IH 10 5560 N. Loop 1604 East (9468 Selma Parkway
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Sequin, San Antonio, Selma,
78259 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78154 TX 78155 TX 78247 TX 78154
tem D ip Q! 210-545-7868 979-567-6116 979-567-6116 210-666-7112
T 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with Cargo Bed 6 NAS NAS
Price Each $13,380.00 $9,954.00) $13,202.91 $11,771.00
Price Total $80,280.00 $59,724.00) $79.217.46| $70,626.00
P lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman Hauler 2017 Volunteer 4x4] 2017 Gravely 996200 No Bid No Bid| 2018 Club Car Carryall No Bid
4x4 JSV 3000 1500 4x4 - Gas
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Subaru 28 HP| Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler Polaris gas EFI 570cc] Kawasaki SH680 SAE
aegis v-twin| 40hp peak| Rating - 20.1 H.P.
Warranty 2 Year 1 Year| 1-year| 2 years / 2000 hours
limited warranty|
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment| Golf Cars, Etc. -
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Company| Company| Authorized Club Car
Redland Road, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San Dealer|
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017| 10/01/2017 06/01/2018
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st 10/01/2017] 10/01/2017| 03/01/2018
Firm Pricing Date Yes| yes| yes| NO|
Delivery Days 60 30| 30) 3010 45
8 Off Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 w/ Power Tilt Large Cargo Bed & Hitch- 8 NAS NAS
2 Seater
Price Each $11,539.00 $14,453,06I $14,672.00 $13,459.05
Price Total $92,312.01 $115,624.48] $117.376.00 $107,672.40
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered Cushman Hauler 4x4 No Bid| 2017 Gravely 996202 No Bid 2017 RTV 900 W| 2018 Club Car Carryall No Bid

ific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty

Warranty Service Provide Name & Address

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Pricing Date
Delivery Days

Kubota Diesel 22 HP

2 Year|

Mission Golf Cars and
Industrial Vehicles 18865
Redland Road, San
Antonio, Texas 78259

Dec 15th - Jan 8th
Nov 1st]

Yes|

60

JSV-3000 Diesel
Kohler Diesel 1003,
24HP|

1-year|

DeWinne Equipment]
Companyj

11002 Bandera Rd, San|
Antonio, Tx 78250

10/01/2017|
10/01/2017|

yes
BOH

Kubota D902 21.6 HP

12 Mos

Ewald Kubota 1900 IH 10
W Sequin Tex 78155

12-31-17
12-31-17
Yes

30

1500 4x4 - Diesel|
Kubota D-722 3-cylinder|
Diesel - SAE Rating -|
200 H.P.

2 years /2000 hours
engine/drive-train and 1
year bumper to bumper|
warranty|

Golf Cars, Etc. -
Authorized Club Car|
Dealer|

06/01/2018
03/01/2018
NO|

30 to 45
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 16, 2017
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Local Alt 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Alt 1 Non-Local
Mission Golf Cars DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment Professional Turf Ewald Kubota Tractor Golf Cars Etc. Professional Turf
Company Company Products Products
6100009216 M 18865 Redland Road 11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 1900W IH 10 5560 N. Loop 1604 East (9468 Selma Parkway
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Sequin, San Antonio, Selma,
78259 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78154 TX 78155 TX 78247 TX 78154
Item Description Qty [210-545-7868 979-567-6116 979-567-6116 210-666-7112
9 Off Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 w/ Cargo Bed-4 Seater 1 NAS NAS
Price Each $13,548.00 $17,505.01 316.537A00‘ $16,695.65
Price Total $13,548.00 $17,505.01 $16,537.00] $16,695.65
P by lowest bid and local bid 5.85%
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman Hauler| No Bid 2017 Gravely 996203 2017 RTVX 1140f 2018 Club Car Carryall
Crew| JSV-3000 Diesel| 1500SE 4x4 4-pass -
Diesel
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Kubota Diesel 22 HP Kohler Diesel 1003, No Bid| Kubota D1105 24.8 HP| Kubota D-722 3-cylinder| No Bid
24HP diesel - SAE Rating -|
20.0H.P.
Warranty 2 Year 1-year| 12 Mos| 2 years / 2000 hours
limited warranty/|
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and DeWinne Equipment| lEwald Kubota 1900 IH 10| Golf Cars, Etc. -
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Company| W Sequin Tex 78155 Authorized Club Carl|
Redland Road, San 11002 Bandera Rd, San Dealer
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017 12-31-17 06/01/2018
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st 10/01/2017 12-31-17 03/01/2018
Firm Pricing Date Yes, yes Yes| NO
Delivery Days 60 30! 30| 30 to 45|
Last Day to Place Order
10 DELETED
13 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with Cargo Bed and Removable Soft Cab 3 NAS NAS NAS
Enclosure
Price Each $9,979.00 $10,260.000  $14,.232.86| $12,448.25
Price Total $29,937.00 $30,807.00| $42,698.58) $37,344.75
P [s] lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman Hauler| 2017 Volunteer 4x4| 2017 Gravely 996200 No Bid No Bid| 2018 Club Car Carryall No Bid
4x4 JSV-3000 1500 4x4 - Gas
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Subaru 28 HP| Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler] Polaris gas EFI 570cc| Kawasaki SH660 - SAE
aegis v-twin 40hp peak| Rating - 20.1 H.P.
Warranty 2 Year| 1 Year] 1-year| 2 years /2000 hours
limited warranty|
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and DeWinne DeWi Equij it Golf Cars, Etc. -|
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Companyj Company| Authorized Club Carl
Redland Road, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| Dealer
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017| 10/01/2017] 06/01/2018
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st| 10/01/2017| 10/01/2017| 03/01/2018
Firm Pricing Date Yes yes yes| NO
Delivery Days 60 30| 30) 30to 45
12 DELETED
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 16, 2017
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Local Alt 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Alt 1 Non-Local
Mission Golf Cars DeWinne i DeWi Equip P i Turf Ewald Kubota Tractor Golf Cars Etc. Professional Turf
Company Company Products Products
6100009216 M 18865 Redland Road | [11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 1900W IH 10 5560 N. Loop 1604 East (9468 Selma Parkway
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Sequin, San Antonio, Selma,
78259 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78154 [TX 78155 TX 78247 TX 78154
ftem Description 210-545-7868 979-567-6116 979-567-6116 210-666-7112
13 Off Road Light Utility Vehicle 4x4 w/ NO POWER TILT Large Cargo Bed 1 NAS NAS
& Hitch- 2 Seater
Price Each $9,338.00 512.400.00' $11,355.30
Price Total $9,338.00 $12,400.00] $11,355.30
P ge b lowest resp bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman 4x4 No Bid| 2017 Gravely 996200 No Bid No Bid| 2018 Club Car Carryall No Bid|
JSV-3000) 1500 4x4 - Gas
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Subaru 28 HP Polaris gas EF1 570cc] Kawasaki SH660 - SAE
40hp peak| Rating - 20.1 H.P.
Warranty 2 Year| 1-year| 2 years / 2000 hours|
limited warranty|
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and DeWinne Equipment Golf Cars, Etc, -
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Company| Authorized Club Car|
Redland Road, San 11002 Bandera Rd, San| Dealer
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017| 06/01/2018
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st| 10/01/2017| 03/01/2018
Firm Pricing Date Yes yes| NO
Delivery Days 60 30) 30 to 45,
14 Cart w/ Power Dump Bed 2 Seater- GASOLINE 4 NAS NAS NAS
Price Each $8,320.00 $10,269.00 $13,162.96| $9,649.62) $10,231.00 $9,422.20 $7,940.47
Price Total $33,280.00 $41,076.00 $52,651.84 $38,598.48 $40,924.00 $37,688.80 $31,761.88|
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 6.42% 36.41%)
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman Hauler]| 2017 Volunteer 4x4 2017 Gravely 996200| 2017 Toro Max| 2017 RTV 400| 2018 Club Car Carryallj 2017 Toro GTX|
4x4 JSV-3000] 500G 4x2 - EFI GAS
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Subaru 28 HP| Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler| Polaris gas EF1 570cc| 480cc Toro Max 07235 Subaru 16 HP Subaru EX-40 E.F.I.-| 429CC Toro GTX 07042
aegis v-twin 40hp peak| SAE Rating - 14.0 H.P.
Warranty 2 Year| 1 Year| 1-year| 2 yror 1500 hours - see| 12 Mos 3 years / 3000 hour| 2 yror 1500 hours - see
attached| limited engine/drive-train attached
and 2 year limited
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and DeWinne Equipment| DeWinne Equipment] 9468 Selma Parkway,|Ewald Kubota 1900 IH 10 Golf Cars, Etc. -| 9468 Selma Parkway,
Industrial Vehicles 18865 Company]| Company| Selma Tx 78154 Wi Authorized Club Carl Selma Tx 78154
Redland Road, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| Dealer|
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017 10/01/2017] November 1, 2017} 12-31-17 06/01/2018 November 1, 2017
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st 10/01/2017 10/01/2017| November 1, 2017 12-31-17 03/01/2018 November 1, 2017
Firm Pricing Date Yes| yes yes| Noj Yes NO No
Delivery Days 60! 30| 30| 15—30’ 30! 30to 45 15-30)
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 16, 2017
For: Purchase of Light Utility Vehicles Local Local Alt 1 Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Alt 1 Non-Local
Mission Golf Cars DeWinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment Professional Turf [Ewald Kubota Tractor Golf Cars Etc. Professional Turf
Company Company Products Products
6100009216 M 18865 Redland Road 11002 Bandera Rd 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 1900W IH 10 5560 N. Loop 1604 East [9468 Selma Parkway
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Sequin, San Antonio, Selma,
78259 TX 78250 TX 78250 TX 78154 TX 78155 TX 78247 TX 78154
Item Description Qty |210-545-7868 979-567-6116 979-567-6116 210-666-7112
15 DELETED
16 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with Cargo Bed & Winch 2 NAS NAS
Price Each $15,180.00 $10,174.00) $14,257.86) $12,864.80
Price Total $30,360.00 $20,348.00 $28,515.72] $25,729.60
P g lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Cushman Hauler] 2017 Volunteer 4x4] 2017 Gravely 996200 No Bid No Bid| 2018 Club Car Carryall| No Bid!
4x4 JSV-3000) 1500 4x4 - Gas|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Subaru 28 HP| Kohler 31hp, 747 kohler] Polaris gas EF1 570cc] Kawasaki SH680 - SAE
aegis v-twin 40hp peak| Rating - 20.1 H.P.
Warranty 2 Year| 1 Year 1-year 2 Years / 2000 hour|
limited warranty|
Warranty Service Provide Name & Address Mission Golf Cars and| D quip DeWil Golf Cars, Etc. -
Industrial Vehicles 18865, Companyj Companyj Authorized Club Carf
Redland Road, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| 11002 Bandera Rd, San| Dealer
Antonio, Texas 78259 Antonio, Tx 78250 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date Dec 15th - Jan 8th 10/01/2017 10/01/2017| 06/01/2018,
Last Day to Place Order Nov 1st| 10/01/2017| 10/01/2017| 03/01/2018,
Firm Pricing Date Yes, yes| yes| NO|
Delivery Days 60 30| 30| 30 to 45
17 DELETED
18 DELETED
Prompt Payment Discount Net 30| Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
|
$17,970.00 $65,795.00 $278,456.24 $38,598.48 | $16,537.00 $0.00 $0.00
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