L.C
10/19/17
Item No. 8

aNorpINANCE 2017-10-19-0801

ACCEPTING THE BIDS FROM CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL
PRODUCTS, INC. AND TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS TO
PROVIDE PESTICIDE PRODUCTS FOR THE SAN ANTONIO
METROPOLITAN HEALTH DISTRICT FOR AN ESTIMATED TOTAL
COST OF $80,000.00.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with pesticide products for
use by licensed personnel of the San Antonio Metropolitan Health District to control various
mosquito borne diseases; and

WHEREAS, Target Specialty Products (Items 1, 3-7 and 9) and Clarke Mosquito Control
Products, Inc. (Item 10) submitted the lowest bids for an estimated total cost of $16,000.00
annually; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low bids from Target Specialty Products (Items 1, 3-7 and 9) and Clarke
Mosquito Control Products, Inc. (Item 10) to provide pesticide products for the San Antonio
Metropolitan Health District for an estimated total cost of $16,000.00 annually is hereby
accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits,
insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation is attached hereto and incorporated
herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices
of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders and payment is
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the
Fiscal Year 2018 budget and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through
their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances.

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 19" day of October, 2017.

ATT )" @< APPROVED AS TO FORM:
[y i ——

tﬁsla M. Vacek Clty Clerk \_/ /‘/\(Kndrew Segovia, City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 8
Date: 10/19/2017
Time: 09:59:58 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: An Ordinance accepting the bids from Clarke Mosquito Control Products and Target Specialty Products
to provide pesticide products for the San Antonio Metropolitan Health District for an estimated total
cost of $80,000.00. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer,
Finance]
Result: Passed
Voter Group P i Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X
William Cruz Shaw District 2 X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 %
Clayton H. Perry District 10 X
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 15, 2017 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
For: Annual Contract Pesticide Products ADAPCO, LLC Clorke Mongit:Control Carke: Mosalilta. Control Target ialty P Target ialty Products SiteOne Landscape Supply |Winfield
Products, Inc. Products, Inc.
550 Aero Ln. 675 Sidwell Ct 675 Sidwell Ct 1225 N. Post Oak Rd. 1225 N. Post Oak Rd. 1385 East 36th Street 6085 Corridor Pkwy #150
6100008372 ES Sanford, St. Charles, St. Charles, Houston, Houston, Cleveland, Schertz,
Estimated (FL 32771 IL 60174 IL 60174 TX 77055 TX 77055 OH 441144 TX 78154
Annual |407-328-6519 800-323-5727 800-901-9746 210-590-1012
Item Description Quantity
Aqualuer 20-20 (2.5 Gallon Jug) -
1 AllPro # 198401
Unit Cost 12 $487.50| $587.50 No Bid $300.00) $230.00] No Bid No Bid
Total Cost $5,850.00| $7,050.00 $3,600.00) $2,760.00]
Manufacturer Name: Bayer Environmental Clarke Aqua Duet Aqualer 20-20f Envion 30-30]
Product No.: AQR-2x2.5 11746 198401 2239002
[Packaged: 2x2.5 gls per case 2x2.5 gallon jugs 2.5 gallon jugs| 2.5 gallons jugs|
an Alternate Bid
2 Deleted on Item #2 Only
BVA 2 Larvicide Oil (5 Gallon Pails) -
3 BVA Oils #1 487005
Unit Cost 120 $42.35 $75.00| No Bid] $41.50| $41.50| No Bid $52.75
Total Cost $5,082.00 $9,000.00 $4,980.00| $1,757.53 $6.330.00
Manufacturer Name: Sunspray MLO Clarke CocoBear BVA 2 Larvicide Oill BVA 2 Larvicide Oil| BVA Oils|
Product No.: MLO-5 11575-2x2.5 1487005 1487005 1487005/
Packaged: 5 gallon pail 2x2.5 gal jugs| 5 gallon pails| 5 gallon pails|
Permethrin 10% (1 Gallon) -
4 Control Solutions # 159010
Unit Cost 20 $50.61 $125.00 No Bid| $41.50] $41.50) $67.45] $44.43
Total Cost $1,012.20 $2,500.00 $830.00 $2,100.32] $1,349.00| $888.60
Manufacturer Name: csl| Clarke Flit 10EC Permethrin 10%) Permethrin 10%) $67.45 Control Solution
Product No. PER 10-4. 1 gallory 159010 159010 82004506 159010
Packaged: 4x1 gl case 4x1 gal| 1 gallon jus 1 gallon jugs| 1.25/0z.cont. 1gm
\Wasp Freeze Il (17.50z Can) -
5 BASF Corporation # 197601
Unit Cost 72 No Bid No Bid No Bid| $8.27] $8.27) $9.17 $7.45
Total Cost $595.44) $595.44 $660.24 $536.40
Manufacturer Name: Wasp Freeze || Wasp Freeze || BASF
Product No. 197601 197601 ZCW WaspFreeze 157601
Packaged / Cost Per Oz 17.5 oz can / $0.47] 17.5 oz can / $0.47| 17.50z can / $0.52 12.50z / $0.60
PT 565 Plus XLO Formula 2 (20 oz Can) -
6 BASF # 197552
Unit Cost 96 No Bid No Bid No Bidj $16.77| $16.77| $19.56| $16.95|
Total Cost $1,609.92] $1,609.92 $1,877.76] $1,627.20
Manufacturer Name: PT 565 Plus XLO Formula 2f| PT 565 Plus XLO Formula 2 Whitmike Micro-Gen BASF
Product No. 197552 197552 2263 147552
P: 20 oz can| 20 o0z can| 200z 20 oz can
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 15, 2017 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
ALTERNATE ALTERNATE
. - Clarke Mosquito Control Clarke Mosquito Control i & 2 .
For: Annual Contract Pesticide Products [ADAPCO, LLC Prodkicts, Inc. Broducts, inc. Target Target SiteOne Landscape Supply |Winfield
550 Aero Ln. 675 Sidwell Ct 675 Sidwell Ct 1225 N. Post Oak Rd. 1225 N. Post Oak Rd. 1385 East 36th Street 6085 Corridor Pkwy #150
6100008372 ES Sanford, St. Charles, St. Charles, Houston, Houston, Cleveland, Schertz,
Estimated |FL 32771 IL 60174 IL 60174 TX 77055 TX 77055 OH 441144 TX 78154
Annual  [407-328-6519 800-323-5727 800-901-9746 210-590-1012
Item Description Quantity
Drione Insecticide Dust (7 Ib Pail) -
7 Bayer # 129220
Unit Cost 16 $229.25 No Bid No Bid $172.55 $172.55 $222.39 $182.34
Total Cost $3,668.00, $2,760.80] $2,760.80 $3,558.24 $2.917.44
Manufacturer Name: Bayer Drione Insecticide Dust] Drione Insecticide Dust Bayer| Bayer,
Product No.: Drione-28 129220 129220 4191233 129220
Packaged: 4x7 Ib case| 71b pﬂ 7 Ib pail 7Ib pail 7lb|
8 Deleted
Maxforce FC Ant Bait Station (24 per bag) -
9 Bayer # 100511
Unit Cost 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid] $20.65] $20.65| $22.86| $21.19
Total Cost $165.20) $0.00 $182.88 $169.52
Manufacturer Maxforce FC Ant Stations] Maxforce FC Ant Stations Maxforce Bayer
Product No. 100511 100511 80194501 100511
Packaged: baa of 24 slalions bag of 24 stations 1x24 Trays| 24/bag|
Summit BT Briquets (5x20pk (100) per case) -}
10 AMVAC # 182460 27 $84.48| $67.50| No Bid $69.50| $69.50, $71.25 $81.65
Unit Cost $2,280.96| $1,822.50| $1,876.50| $1,876.50 $1,923.75 $2.204.55
Total Cost AMVAC] Summit BT| Summit Bit Briquets Summit Bit briquets| Summit AMVAC
Manufacturer Name: BAC-1 11036 182460 182460 111-5 182460
Product No. 5x20pk (100) per case| 100 per caself case of 100 (5 x 20) case of 100 (5x20) 5x20pk| 5x20 (100)
Packaged:
1" Deleted
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30| Net 30 Net 30
|E: Annual Award $1,822.50 $10,941.36 $2,760.00




