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ORDINANCE 2018-02-15-0093

AUTHORIZING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING
UNIT PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED
ANNUAL COST OF $1,183,400.04: (A) KINLOCH EQUIPMENT &
SUPPLY, INC. FOR ELGIN SWEEPER PARTS; (B) GREEN OASIS,
LLC DBA GREEN OASIS PLANTSCAPES FOR THE LEASE AND
MAINTENANCE OF INTERIOR PLANTS FOR THE SAN ANTONIO
INTERNATIONAL AIRPORT; (C) HIGH SIERRA ELECTRONICS,
INC. FOR AUTOMATED FLOOD WARNING SYSTEM PARTS; AND
(D) CAMPBELL SCIENTIFIC, INC. AND KELLER AMERICA, INC.
FOR AUTOMATED FLOOD WARNING SYSTEM PARTS
DISTRIBUTORS.

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with commodities and
services on an annual basis for the terms of the contracts; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves the following contracts: (A) Kinloch Equipment & Supply,
Inc. for Elgin sweeper parts; (B) Green Oasis, LLC DBA Green Oasis Plantscapes for the lease
and maintenance of interior plants for the San Antonio International Airport; (C) High Sierra
Electronics, Inc. for automated flood warning system parts; and (D) Campbell Scientific, Inc.
and Keller America, Inc. for automated flood warning system parts distributors; and

WHEREAS, Texas Local Government Code section 252.022(a)(2) provides that competitive
bidding is not required for a procurement of items necessary to preserve or protect the public
health or safety of the municipality’s residents; and

WHEREAS, according to section 252.022(a)(7) of the Texas Local Government Code
competitive bidding is not required for a procurement of items that are available from only one
source; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves two low bid contracts, one contract procured on the basis
of sole source and two contracts procured on the basis of the public health or safety exemption;
and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and
endorsements: (A) Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc. for Elgin sweeper parts; (B) Green Oasis,
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LLC DBA Green Oasis Plantscapes for the lease and maintenance of interior plants for the San
Antonio International Airport; (C) High Sierra Electronics, Inc. for automated flood warning
system parts; and (D) Campbell Scientific, Inc. and Keller America, Inc. for automated flood
warning system parts distributors. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated
herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices
of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance is available as part of the Fiscal Year 2018 Budget in
the following amounts: (A) $96,000.00 in Fund 77003000, Cost Center 5557010001, General
Ledger 5301020; (B) $53,400.04 in Fund 51001000, Cost Center 3305030007, General Ledger
5202025; (C) $516,000.00 in Fund 11001000, Cost Center 2312020001, General Ledger
5301030; and (D) $518,000.00 in Fund 11001000, Cost Center 2312020001, General Ledger
5301030.

SECTION 3. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders and payment is
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the
Fiscal Year 2018 budget and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through
their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 15" day of February, 2018.

Ron Nirenberg

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

ticia M. Vﬁ, City Clerk e Andrew Segovia, City Attorney
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Voting Results Interface Page 6 of 85
Agenda Item: 8 (in consent vote: 5,6,7,8,9, 10, 11, 12A, 12B, 12C, 12D, 12E, 13A, 13B, 13C, 13D, 14, 15, 16,
17, 19, 21B, 22A, 22B, 22C, 23A, 23B, 23C, 23D, 23E, 23F, 23G, 23H)
Date: 02/15/2018
Time: 09:16:43 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: Ordinance authorizing the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an

estimated annual cost of $1.183,400.04: (A) Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc. for Elgin sweeper
parts; (B) Green Oasis, LLC DBA Green Oasis Plantscapes for the lease and maintenance of interior
plants for the San Antonio International Airport; (C) High Sierra Electronics, Inc. for automated flood
warning system parts; and (D) Campbell Scientific, Inc. and Keller America, Inc. for automated flood
warning system parts distributors, [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief
Financial Officer, Finance]

Result: Passed
Voter Group Prl:::n ¢ Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Treviiio District 1 X
William Cruz Shaw District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldana District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X X
Clayton H. Perry District 10 X

https://cosaweb1/voteinterface/default.aspx 2/16/2018
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Exhibit 1



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: December 11, 2017
For: Annual Contract for Elgin Sweeper Parts Local
Kinloch Equipment & Supply, Inc.
6100009572 DG 12100 Crown Point, Ste. 120
Estimated |San Antonio,
Item Description Annual |[TX 78233
Usage [210-881-9344
1(A): Elgin Sweeper Parts:
a Percent of discount offered 4%)
b Products Identification (Manufacturer): Elgin
c Type of Price Schedule (dealer, jobber, efc.): Dealer|
d Price Schedule Number: N/A
e Date of Price Schedule: 12/6/2017
f Price Schedule Column on Which Discount is Based: (i.e. MSRP
distributor, net, wholesale):
g Warranty (minimum 90 days): 90 Days||
1(B): Specified Items for evaluation purposes only
Payment Terms Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $96,000.00
Estimated Annual Award SBB.UOU.DOI

Prepared by Purchasing 1/5/2018

Page 1



City of San Antonlo Bid Tabulation

For,

16100009642

Opened:

November 17, 2017

AIC for Lease&Maintenance of Interior Plants for San Antonio
intemational Alrport

Dascription

M8
Estimated
Annual
Quantity

LOCAL LOCAL

NON-LOCAL

reen Oasis, LLC TPiant interscapes, inc

165 Remount 6436 Babeock Rd

San Antonic San Antonio
TX 78218 ITX 78249
210-653-8900

“[Rentokil North America Inc,
DBA Ambius

12100 Crown Point Dr Ste 115

San Antonio

TX 78233

1B

1E

1

1K

1N

B

One tme indial lease feo to provide, delver and mstall plants|
and planter materials.

Level Zero-Tunnel Entrance coming in from the parking garage.
Next to Elevator

Price For Location A (Including 1 plant &1 planter)

Level Zero~Tunnel Entrance coming in from the parking garage.

Price For Location B (Including 42 plants & 7 planters - 6 plants
per planter)

Skybridge-Bridge connecting Terminal B to the ConRac Rental
Car Center

Price For Location C (Including 12 plants &12 planters)
(Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby along the large front)
windows

IWFD(LMD, g 7 plants &7

Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the frosted glass]
|wall just outside of the TSA checkpoint near chair grouping

Price For Location E g 2 plants & 2 pl )

Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the seating
|grouping at the first door (East most TB door)
Price For Location F (Including 2 plants & 2 planters)

Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the seating
grouping and elevator landing near tha airport chapel
Price For Location G (Including 2 plants & 2 planters)

Terminal A Daparture level ticke! lobby seating area just behind
the Ambassadar booth
Price For Location H (Including 6 plants 8 6 p

Terminal B Arivals level in Baggage claim area tail trees along)
windows
Price For Location | (inchuding 2 plants & 2 pl )

Terminal B Amivals level in Baggage claim area, plants inside|
the baggage camousal loop
Price For Location J (i ding 3 plants & 3 pl ]

Terminal B Amivals level In Baggage claim area near the
‘ambassador booth and far East end of TB near elevator
Price For Location K (Including 2 plants & 2 p )

Terminal A Amrivals lovel in Baggage claim area, plants inside

the baggage camousel loop
Price For Location L (| g 6 plants & 6 pl 3

Inside the ConRac rental car customer servica lobby on 4th floor
Price For Location M (| g 6 plants 86

Inside the ConRac rental car customer servica lobby on 4th floor

Price For Location N (including 36 plants & 6 planters - § plants
per planters)

‘Weekly Maintenance Fea to provide weekly maintenance and

service of all plants and planters at each Location.
Level Zero~Tunnel Entrance coming in from the parking garage

Total Cost For Location A

Level Zero=Tunnel Entrance coming In from the parking garage.

Unit Price For Location B
Total Cost For Location 8

Skybridge-Bridge connecting Terminal B to the ConRac Rental
Car Center

Unit Price For Location C
Total Cost For Location C

Terminal B Departure Lavel Ticket Lobby slong the large front
windows

(Unit Price For Location D
Total Cost For Location D

NiA

MNiA

NiA

NiA

MIA

NIA

NIA

MiA

NIA

NI

NIA

Weoks

Weaks

Weaks

$615.00]

$4.585.004

$4.878.004

$748.004
S748.004
$748.00}
51,980.00{
si.maT
s613.00f
$748.00f
$1,605.00}

$4,944 00}

$4.438

533.691

$4.51
$2381

$54.73
§2,845.964

2o

$76.
$3.997.7

$60.45

$429.57

$118.44

$325.88)

$75.53|
§75.53
§76.83
$136.78

$114.9

§75.53]
$67.25
$282 43
$380.41

s226272|

4
$244.92

$128.38
$6.675.76

$36 68|
$1.907 36|

$76.76]
$3.9681.52

$99.12

$1.006.77

$6309.92

$1.957.:

$297 16|

$297.16)

$297.16

$1,208 54

$559.

$297.16)

$319.96|

$1.678.20

5863

$9.6081.52

$24.78
$1,288.56

$251.69
§13,067.88

$159.98
$8,318.96

$480.47
$25,452 44




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened Novembaer 17, 2017
For. Inievior Plant " L LOCAL NON-LOCAL
mml'"; ’m“.l\ foiminanos of for S Arkcia [Green Dasis, LLC [Plant Interscapes. inc TRentokil North America Inc.
DBA Ambius
155 Remount 6436 Babcock Rd 12100 Crown Point Dr Ste 115
[6100009642 MB
Esti y San Antonio San Antonio San Antonio
TX 78218 TX 78249 TX 78233
Itom Description Annual |6 ces 000
Quantity
- Torminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the frosted glass =] )
wall just outside of the TSA checkpoint near chair grouping
Unit Price For Location E (Including 2 plants & 2 planters) Waeeks $7.54 $3.38 §74.29
Total Cost For Location E H $392 01 $175.76 $3,863.08
o5 Torminel B Departure Level Tickel Lobby near the seating 52
grouping al the first door (East most T8 door)
Unit Price For Location F Weeks §7.54] $3.38] §74.29
Total Cost For Location F $392 08f $175.75) $3.863.08
26 Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the seafing 52
Unit Price For Location G ‘Waoks 7. $3.38] §74.29|
Total Cost For Location G 539208 $175.76, $3,863.08
M Terminal A Departure level ticket jobby seating area just behind 52
ok Pric Por Locstan 3
Unit Price For Location H Weaks $24 54 $18.34 $302.1
Total Cost For Location H $1.276.084 $953.68| $15.710.76|
2 Terminal B Amivals level in Baggage claim area tall trees along| 52
Unit Price For Location | Weeks $7 3'21.901 $139.85
Total Cost For Location | $307. $1.140.36 $7272.20
2 Torminal B Asmivals level in Baggage claim area, plants inside 52
the baggage camousel loop
Unit Price For Location J Weeks $7 54 $9.17 $39.99
Total Cost For Location J $302 08} $476 84 $2,079.48
2K Torminel B Amivals lovel in Baggage claim area near the 52
ambassador booth and far East end of TB near elevator
Unit Price For Location K Weeks §7.54) $3.38 §74.29
Total Cost For Location K $302 08} $175.76 $3,863.08
2 Terminal A Amivals level in Baggage claim area, plants inside 52
the carmousel lkop
Unit Price For Location L Weeks 82848' $18.34 $79.99
Total Cost For Location L §1,375.92 $953.68) $4,159.48
M Inside tha ConRac rental car customer service lobby on 4th floor 52
Unit Price For Location M Weeks sss.aﬂ $65.79 $419.55|
Total Cost For Location M §34257 $3.421.08 $21.816.60|
N Inside the ConRlac rental car customer service lobby on 4th floor 52
Unit Price For Location N Weeks 532 81 $110.04 $215.77|
Total Cost For Location N $1.706.12) $5.722.08 $11,220.04
Paymaent Tarm Net 30 Nat 30|
Total One time initial nase fee $2.26272 $9.681.52
Total Annual Maintenance $26,190.32 $125,858.72
I&b Total 1* vear without Promot Pavment Discount $28,453.04 $135540.24
Sub Total 1" year with Prompt Payment Discount 528.453.04 $1355402¢
Total E: d full term juded 2 years option without
Prompt Payment Discount $133.214 32| $638,975.12
Total E 4 full term ! 2 years opton with|
£ 51 4.32/ $638.97512
T




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 5, 2017
For: Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
? Parts Sole Source
High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
6100009334 AJ 155 Spring Hill Dr, Suite 106
Grass Valley,
CA 95945
item Description Quantity [530-273-2080
3316-00 Alert Data Transmitter Weatherproof
1 Fiberglass Enclosure 2
Net Unit Price $2,650.0
Extended Price $5,300.0
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, In
Product No 3316-0
Warranty (# of years) 3
7000-14 10' Standpipe Assembly W/Key Lock
2 Door 4
Net Unit Price $1,554.5
Extended Price $6,218.2
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, In
|Product No 7000-1
Warranty (# of years) 3
3 5302-00 20 Watt Solar Panel 3
Net Unit Price $404.30
Extended Price $1,212.90
Manufacturer Name Sunwize
Product No 5302-00
Warranty (# of years) 1y
3580-37 Master Controller Electronic L-Panel,
4 PT, 2 Floats 4
Net Unit Price $3,490.
Extended Price $13,960.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc|
Product No 3580-37]
Warranty (# of years) 3y
3580-34 Remote Controller Electronic L-Panel,
5 BGO Control and Monitoring 10
Net Unit Price $3,436.45
Extended Price $34,364.5
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, In
Product No 3580-
Warranty (# of years) 3
6 7110-00 Omni Directional Antenna 25
Net Unit Price $118.7
Extended Price $2,967.5
Manufacturer Name D. Johnson
Product No 7110-0
Warranty (# of years) 3
3580-30 Controller Electronic L-Panel Remote
7 Assembly 10
Net Unit Price $3,436.
Extended Price $34,364.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, |
Product No 3580-
Warranty (# of years) 3




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 5, 2017
For: Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
: Parts Sole Source
High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
6100009334 AJ 155 Spring Hill Dr, Suite 106
Grass Valley,
CA 95945
Item Description Quantity |530-273-2080
8 3345-04 Alert Controller/Transceiver/Decoder 5
Net Unit Price $3,794.
Extended Price $18,972.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, In
Product No 334
Warranty (# of years)
9 5316-00 MPPT New 30
Net Unit Price $272.2
Extended Price $8,167.5
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, In
Product No 531
Warranty (# of years)
9080-00 Barrier Gate Operator with 25’ Wood
10 Wishbone Arm 10
Net Unit Price $10,797
Extended Price $107,975.0
Manufacturer Name Linear/O
Product No 9080-01
Warranty (# of years) 1y
11 9080-01 Barrier Gate Operator Interface Unit 6
Net Unit Price $2.556.f3>g|
Extended Price $15,339.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 9080-01
Warranty (# of years) 3yr
5310-00 Protech Solar Panel Volt Regulator
12 Module 15
Net Unit Price $60.15
Extended Price $902.25)
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 5310-00f
Warranty (# of years) 3y
13 5315-01 Solar Charger & Load Control 30
Net Unit Price $235.
Extended Price $7.065.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 5315-01
Warranty (# of years) 3y
14 3701-00 VHF Telemetry Transceiver 50
Net Unit Price $540.0
Extended Price $27,000.0
Manufacturer Name Maxo
Product No 3701-0
Warranty (# of years) 1
3801-01 25 Watt VHF Power Amplifier (148-
15 174 MHz) 1
Net Unit Price No Bidl
*Temporarily Unavailable from
Extended Price Supplier]
Manufacturer Name
Product No
Warranty (# of years)




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 5, 2017
For- Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
: Parts Sole Source
High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
6100009334 AJ 155 Spring Hill Dr, Suite 106
Grass Valley,
CA 95945
Item Description Quantity |530-273-2080
16 7000-13 10ft. Standpipe Section 2
Net Unit Price $1,554.5
Extended Price $3,109.1
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 7000-1
Warranty (# of years) 3 yri
17 7000-01 Standpipe Door with Key Lock 8
Net Unit Price $312.7
Extended Price $2,502.0
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 7000-01
Warranty (# of years) 3y
18 5304-01 40 Watt Solar Panel 5
Net Unit Price $562.
Extended Price $2,814.
Manufacturer Name Sunwi
Product No 5304-01
Warranty (# of years) 1 yri
19 5306-01 Watt Solar Panel 15
Net Unit Price $727.80
Extended Price $10,917.
Manufacturer Name Sunwi
Product No 5306-01
Warranty (# of years) 11
20 6600-10 15 PSI| Pressure Transducer 15
Net Unit Price $2,118.45
Extended Price $31,776.75|
Manufacturer Name Drucl
Product No 6600—1ﬂ
Warranty (# of years) 1
6640-00 15 PSI Pressure Transducer; 0-5
21 vDC 8
Net Unit Price $1,237.50
Extended Price $9,900.00}
Manufacturer Name Keller America
Product No 664
Warranty (# of years) 2y
22 10-13374-01 Cable Battery Cable Assembly 50
Net Unit Price $62.25]
Extended Price $3,112.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 10-13374-01
Warranty (# of years) 3
23 7105-04 High Gain Directional Antenna 10
Net Unit Price $384.35
Extended Price $3,843.50)
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 7105-04|
Warranty (# of years) 3yr




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 5, 2017
For- Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
) Parts Sole Source
High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
6100009334 AJ 155 Spring Hill Dr, Suite 106
Grass Valley,
CA 95945
Item Description Quantity |530-273-2080
24 7110-10 Omni Directional Antenna 40
Net Unit Price $118.7
Extended Price $4,748.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 7110-0
Warranty (# of years) 3
25 7150-12 Antenna Cable Set 35
Net Unit Price $227.2
Extended Price $7,953.7
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 7150-12]
Warranty (# of years) 3yr
26 3351-01 Receives & Decodes ALERT 10
Net Unit Price 51,080,23
Extended Price $10,802.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 3351-01
Warranty (# of years) 3yr
4005-01 Output Converter for Low Level
27 Pressure 10
Net Unit Price $282.75)
Extended Price $2,827.50
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 4005-01
Warranty (# of years) 3y
6640-12 Ouput Converter for Low level
28 Pressure Board Keller 10
Net Unit Price $68.55
Extended Price $685.50
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
|Product No ol
Warranty (# of years) 3 yri
29 3512-00 Controller 15
Net Unit Price $1,7871
|Extended Price $26,807.2
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 3512
Warranty (# of years) 3yr
30 3580-37 Dual Control Local and Master 2
Net Unit Price $3,490.
Extended Price $6,980.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 3580-37|
Warranty (# of years) 3 yr




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 5, 2017
For: Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
) Parts Sole Source
High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
6100009334 AJ 1565 Spring Hill Dr, Suite 106
Grass Valley,
CA 95945
Item Description Quantity [530-273-2080
9080-02 BGO Interface Cable Extended by
31 12FT 8
Net Unit Price $8,939.
Extended Price $71,512.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
|Product No 9080-0
Warranty (# of years) 3
32 3306-00 Transmitter 3
Net Unit Price $2,650.
Extended Price $7.950.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, inc.
Product No 33086-0
Warranty (# of years) 3
33 5529-00 Pressure Calibrator 1
Net Unit Price $3,111.80
Extended Price $3,111.80
Manufacturer Name Keller America
Product No 5529-0
Warranty (# of years) 2 yr
34 10-13371-01 Interface Board 16
Net Unit Price $1,275.
Extended Price $20,400.
Manufacturer Name High Sierra Electronics, Inc.
Product No 10-13371-01
Warranty (# of years) 3 yri
Payment Terms Net 3
Delivery 60 da
Estimated Annual Total $515,562.80
|Estimated Annual Award $515,562.80




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

For:

|8100009333

December 11, 2017
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
Parts

Non-Local

MNon-Local

|815W. 1800 N

om

Description

n,
UT 84321
435-227-9532

Campbell Scientific inc. |

Keller America Inc.
351 Bell King Road
Newport News,

VA 23606
757-596-6680

{9080-18 18' WOOD ARM ASSEMBLY- Brand:
Linear/Osco

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

hQOBO-Zﬁ REPLACEMENT 25 ft WOOD
WISHBONE ARM ASSEMBLY- Brand:
Linear/Osco

MNet Unit Price

|Exﬁanded Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

|5830-03 GATE ARM LED BEACON- Brand:
Chapel Hill Manufacturing

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

16951-01 2" DIAMETER GALVANIZED FLOAT
TUBE~- Brand: Omega

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

{6600-01 ADDITIONAL SUBMERSIBLE CABLE
- Brand: Druck, Inc.

Met Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

6640-01 ADDITIONAL SUBMERSIBLE CABLE
I~ Brand: Keller America

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

{Warranty (# of years)

5512-00 WATTMETER; 20-1000 MHz, 50
Ohm - Brand: Telwave

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

‘Warranty (# of years)

15

16

15

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBid1

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid|

No Bid|

No Bid

No Bid|

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

For:

6100009333

December 11, 2017
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
Parts

AJ

Non-Local

Non-Local

Campbell Scientific Inc.
B15W. 1800 N

Item

Description

Quantity

Logan,
UT 84321
435-227-9532

Keller America Inc.
351 Bell King Road
Newport News,

VA 23606
757-596-6680

10

5512-01 CARRYING CASE FOR
WATTMETER — Brand: Telwave
Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

5515-00 VHF ANTENNA ANALYZER -
Brand: MFJ Enterprises

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

6640-15 PRESSURE TRANSDUCER
INTERFACE — Brand: Keller America
Met Unit Price

Extended Price

{Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

31330 Surge Protection Kit, Type N to BNC,
100-512MHz, 18 inches — Brand: Campbell
Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

MHBDCS800/ SPECIAL-MISC VHF Omni
Antenna Includes MBC mounting hardware —
Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

MYA1503KN/ SPECIAL-MISC VHF
Directional Antenna Includes mounting
hardware — Brand: Campbell Scientific
Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

14221 900MHz 3dBd Omni Antenna w/Type

N Female & Mounting Hardware — Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Warranty (# of years)

25

25

10

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NoBidL

$612.

$3,062.

Keller America |

0507.33507.081308.
2

$80.73
$2,018.2

PCTEL

MHBDC8500

$108.86{
$1,088.60}

MYA1503KN|l

$144.1

$1.441,
Campbell Sc
14221

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid|

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

16100009333

December 11, 2017
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
Parts

Non-Local

Non-Local

Campbell Scientific Inc.
{815W, 1800 N

Item

Description

Quantity

21

14201 900MHz 9dBd Yagi Antenna wiType N
Female & Mounting Hardware — Brand:
Campbell

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

31314 Surge Protection Kit, Type N to
RPSMA, 700-2700MHz, 18 inches — Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

|Extended Price

[Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

31182 27dBi GPS Antenna 3V Magnetic

|Warranty (# of years)

CM235/17959 Magnetic Mounting Stand —
Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

32262 4G/3G Omni 2dBd Antenna wiType N
Female & CSI Mounting Hardware — Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

31317 Surge Protection Kit, Type N to SMA,
700-2700MHz, 18 inches — Brand: Campbell
Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

SPECIAL-MISC 12'LMR195 N to N — Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

10

15

10

10

Logan,
UT 84321
435-227-9532

|Newport News,

Keller America Inc.
351 Bell King Road

VA 23606
757-596-6680

$213.90
$2,139.00)

No Bid

Campbell

Sci
14201
1

$199.9
$2,999.2

Campbell
nn

$22

$223.
Campbell Sc

mn

1

$44.64
$446.
Campbell Sci
1795
1y

$83.70|
$837.
Campbell Sci
3226
1

$199.95
$1,999.50)

Campbell
3131
1

$42.00
$420.00

No Bid

Mo Bid|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
Opened: December 11, 2017
s Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
- Parts Non-Local Non-Local
Campbell Scientific Inc. |Keller America Inc.
16100009333 AJ B15W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road
Logan, Newport News,
UT 84321 VA 23606
Item Description Quantity |435-227-9532 757-596-6680
SPECIAL-MISC 20'LMR195 N to N RFACE -
22 Brand: Campbell Scientific 25
Net Unit Price $53.50} No Bid
Extended Price $3,837.50)
Manufacturer Name
Product No
Warranty (# of years)
CCFC-R2/32494-1 CSC Outdoor
Observation & Surveillance Field Camera (-40
to +60C) -R2 w/RS-232 Comms - Brand:
23 Campbell Scientific 20
Net Unit Price $2,464.50 No Bid|
Extended Price $49,290.00)
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No 32494-1
Warranty (# of years) 2 yrl
18549 CC Camera or PWD22 Mounting Kit -
24 Brand: Campbell Scientific 20
Net Unit Price $42. No Bid
Extended Price $855.
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 1854
Warranty (# of years) 1
CCFCCBL1-L12-PT/ 32495-20 CCFC Power
& /O Cable 12ft per cable -PT wiTinned Wires
25 |- Brand: Campbell Scientific 20
Net Unit Price $164.40) No Bid
Extended Price $3,288.00
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 3249533
Warranty (# of years) 1
CCFCCBL2-L12/ 32496-14 CCFC RJ45
Environmental Ethernet Cable 12ft per cable =
26 Brand: Campbell Scientific 2
Net Unit Price $266.5: Mo Bid
Extended Price $533.
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sc
Product No 32496-1
Warranty (# of years)
28033 Ethemet ESP-100-POE In-line Surge
27 Protection — Brand: Campbell Scientific 2
Net Unit Price $33. No Bid
Extended Price $66.
Manufacturer Name Campbeil
Product No 280
Warranty (# of years)
CRE-NA-ST-SW/ 28385-5 Measurement &
Control Datalogger -NA No Additional Coms -
ST -40 to +70C
|-SW Standard 3yr Warmanty — Brand: Campbell
Scientific
28 15
Net Unit Price $1,813.50 No Bid
Extended Price $27,202.50)
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sc
Product No 23%i
Warranty (# of years) 3




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017
For: Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
; Parts Non-Local Non-Local
Campbell Scientific Inc.  |Keller America Inc.
6100009333 AJ 815W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road
Logan, Newport News,
UT 84321 VA 23606
Item Description Quantity |435-227-9532 757-596-6680
CR6-RF407-ST-SW/ 28385-14
Measurement & Control Datalogger -RF407
w/900MHz Radio -ST -40 to +70C; -SW
Standard 3yr Warranty — Brand: Campbell
29 Scientific 20
Net Unit Price $2,087.85 No Bid
Extended Price $41,757.004
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sc
Product No 28385-14)f
Warranty (# of years) 3y
CR310-NA/ 31968-1 Datalogger (-40 to
+70C) -NA No Additional Coms — Brand:
30 Campbell Scientific 6
Net Unit Price $875. No Bid|
Extended Price $5,250.
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 31968-1
Warranty (# of years) 3
CR310-RF407/ 31968-2 Datalogger (-40 to
+70C) -RF407 w/800MHz Radio —~ Brand:
31 Campbell Scientific 10
Net Unit Price $1,004.40f No Bid
Extended Price $10,044.00}
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 31968-
Warranty (# of years) 3y}
18823 Universal Backplate for ENC14/16; 1
inch-on- center hole grid — Brand: Campbell
32 Scientific 20
Net Unit Price $30.1 No Bid
Extended Price $602.
Manufacturer Name Campbell S
Product No 1882
Warranty (# of years)
21106-20/ RF500M-AL  Radio Modem -ST -
25 to +50C -SW Standard 1yr Warranty -AL
ALERT Dual Mode OS -J1 Jumper for
33 RF31x/32x - Brand: Campbell Scientific 20
Net Unit Price $409.20 No Bid
Extended Price $8,184.00
Manufacturer Name 21106-20
Product No 21106-20
Warranty (# of years) 1y
14291 Field Power Cable 12Vdc Plug to
34 Pigtail, 2ft = Brand: Campbell Scientific 5
Net Unit Price $16.00 No Bid
Extended Price $80.004
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No 14291
Warranty (# of years) 1 yrI
AL200/28817 ALERTZ Encoder, Modulator &
|Sensor Interface (<40 to +60C) — Brand:
as Campbell Scientific 10
Net Unit Price $553. No Bid
Extended Price $5,533.
|Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 2881
Warranty (# of years) 1




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017
For: Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
’ Parts Non-Local Non-Local
Campbell Scientific Inc. [Keller America Inc.
|6100009333 Al |815W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road
Logan, Newport News,
UT 84321 VA 23606
Item Description Quantity |435-227-9532 757-596-6680
SC12/16675 Rabust CS /O Cable, 2ft -
36 Brand: Campbell Scientific 10
Net Unit Price $14, No Bid|
Extended Price $148.
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 1667
Warranty (# of years) 1
18663 Null Modem Cable 9-Pin Male to Male,
v 1ft = Brand: Campbell Scientific 10
Net Unit Price $14.88) No Bid
Extended Price $148.80)
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No 18663
‘Warranty (# of years) 1y
RV50-NA/31886-1 RV50 Sierra Wireless
Airlink 4G Industrial LTE Cellular Gateway —
38 Brand: Campbell Scientific 10
Net Unit Price $571.9 No Bid
Extended Price $5,719.
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 31886-1
'Warranty (# of years) 3y
32252 RV50 Mounting Kit— Brand: Campbell
39 Scientific 10
Net Unit Price $23. No Bid
Extended Price $232.
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 3225
Warranty (# of years) 11
SPECIAL-COM  ALERT2 Repeater with RS-
232 output Dual radios Custom enclosure —
40 Brand: Campbell Scientific 2
Net Unit Price $8,131.4, No Bid
|Extended Price $16,262.
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No
Warranty (# of years)
SPECIAL-COM  ALERT2 Field Decoder —
4 Brand: Campbell Scientific 2
Net Unit Price $2,850.00/ ‘No Bid
Extended Price $5,700.00)
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sciff
Product No
Warranty (# of years)
SP20-PT-SM/ 10893-1 20W Solar Panel, 15ft
Cable -PT w/Tinned Wires -SM Std Mounting
42 Kit = Brand: Campbell Scientific 15
Net Unit Price $278.07] No Bid|
Extended Price $4.171.
Manufacturer Name Campbell q
Product No 10893-1
Warranty (# of years) 1y
SP50-L15-PT/31276-39 50W Solar Panel
15ft cable per SP50 -PT wiTinned Wires —
43 Brand: Campbell Scientific 20
Net Unit Price $598. No Bid
Extended Price $11,973.
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sc
Product No 31276-3
Warranty (# of years) 1




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

16100009333

December 11, 2017
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
Parts

Non-Local Non-Local

Item

Desc!

Quantity

Keller America Inc.
351 Bell King Road
Newport News,

VA 23606
757-596-6680

Campbell Scientific Inc.
B15W. 1800 N

Logan,

UT 84321
435-227-9532

45

a7

49

20796-US/ 20796-1 Power Supply 24Vdc
1.67A Output, 100-240Vac 1A Input. 5ft Cable -
US US & Canada Plug — Brand: Campbeil
Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

LSPECIAL-POWER Crydom DRATMPDC3B
NC SPST SSR - Brand: Campbell Scientific
Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

|Product No

Warranty (# of years)

28870 Ritron DTX-145 VHF Radio
Programmed for 77?.777?MHz (136-174MHz)-
Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

SPECIAL-COM Ritron DTX-145 data cable
for use with HSE controller RFACE ~ Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No
Warranty (# of years)

29291 RF320-Series Ritron Radio to AL200
Cable, 12 inches — Brand; Campbell Scientific
Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

28823 Ritron mounting bracket ~ Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

32043 Maxon SD-125EL V2 VHF Radio
(148-174MHz) Programmed for 222.227MHx -
Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

10

40

40

15

$30.001
$150.00)
Campbell Sci
29796-1

$69.94

DRATMPDC3

$366.50
$14,220.00

Campbell Sci
2878
1

$22.29
$891.60|
Campbell St:ll
28823

$232.50
$3,487.50
Campbell
3204

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid|

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

For:

|6100009333

December 11, 2017
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
Parts

Non-Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

Campbell Scientific Inc.
815W. 1800 N

Logan,

UT 84321
435-227-9532

Keller America Inc.
351 Bell King Road
MNewport News,

VA 23606
757-596-6680

51

52

53

31924 SUB MAXON SD-125E V2 RADIO
DATA CABLE. 15 INCHES — Brand: Campbell
Scientific

MNet Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

21104 FAB MAXON RADIO MOUNTING
BRACKET FOR 1 INCH GRID MOUNTING -
Brand: Campbell Scientific

MNet Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

|SPECIAL-COM Maxon SD-125EL V2 data
cable for use with HSE controller — Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No
Warranty (# of years)

CS451-33-SA-14-SN/28790-1107 Pressure
Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel, -
33 wi33ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1% Accuracy; -
14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN w/Standard Nose
Cone — Brand: Campbell Scientific

MNet Unit Price

Extended Price

|Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

CS5451-75-SA-14-SN/28790-663 Pressure
Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel; -
75 wiT5ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1% Accuracy; -
14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN w/Standard Nose
Cone — Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

CS451-100-SA-14-SN/28790-670  Pressure
Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel; -
100 w/100ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1%
Accuracy; -14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN
wi/Standard Nose Cone — Brand: Campbell
Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

15

15

15

$59.85
$897.
Campbell Sci
3192
1

$24.91
$373.
Campbell
1
1

$488.25
Campbell Scl
Special-COM Maxon 1o
HSE

1

$32.55

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Mo Bid|

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100009333

December 11, 2017
Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
Parts

Non-Local

Non-Local

Description

Logan,
UT 84321

Campbell Scientific Inc.
815W. 1800 N

435-227-9532

Keller America Inc.

351 Bell King Road
Newport News,

VA 23606
757-596-6680

57

59

60

61

CS451-200-SA-14-SN/28790-881 Pressure
Transducer SDI-12 /RS-232, Stainless Steel; -
200 w/200ft per Probe; -SA Std 0.1%
Accuracy; -14 0-14.5psig (100kPa); -SN
wi/Standard Nose Cone — Brand: Campbell
rScianﬁﬁc

Net Unit Price
Extended Price
Manufacturer Name
Product No
Warranty (# of years)

CS475A-L100-PT/32873-3 Radar Water
Level Sensor, 114.8ft Max Distance (-40 to
+80C) 100ft cable per sensor; -PT wiTinned
Wires — Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

CS475A-L200-PT/32873-18 Radar Water
Level Sensor, 114.8ft Max Distance (-40 to
+80C) 200ft cable per sensor; -PT w/Tinned
Wires — Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

TES525WS-L20-PT/10868-86 Texas
Electronics Rain Gage 0.01 inch (0.254mm)
Tip wi8 inch Orifice 20ft cable per sensor; -PT
wi/Tinned Wires — Brand: Campbell Scientific
Net Unit Price

Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

‘Warranty (# of years)

CM270/20621 TES25, TES25MM, or
TE525WS Rain Gage Mounting Kit - Brand:
Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price

|Extended Price

Manufacturer Name

Product No

Warranty (# of years)

SPECIAL-SENSOR EML SBS500; P-780-
404; 0.01 inch resolution; 10 inch orifice; 20ft
cable per sensor

Tinned wires — Brand: Campbell Scientific

Net Unit Price
Extended Price
Manufacturer Name
Product No
Warranty (# of years)

$1,010.00]
$1,010.00]
Campbell Scll
28790-881
v

$2,366.

$2,366.
Campbell
328

$2,437.00|
$2,437.00|

Campbell
328731
v

$404.60)
$1,213.80)

Campbell Sc
10508—Bﬂ
3

$110.00]
$440.00)
Campbell Sci
20621

1

$900.00
$4.500.00
EMY]
SBSS00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017
Eor: Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
g Parts Non-Local Non-Local
Campbell Scientific Inc.  |Keller America Inc.
6100009333 AJ 815 W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road
Logan, Newport News,
UT 84321 VA 23606
Item Description Quantity |435-227-9532 757-596-6680
SPECIAL-SENSOR  Levelling base for EML
SBSS500 tipping bucket rain gauge — Brand:
63 Campbell Scientific 6
Net Unit Price $145. No Bid
|Extended Price $870.
Manufacturer Name EM
Product No SBS500 Ba
Warranty (# of years)
30408  Datalogger recalibration with
64 documentation — Brand: Campbell Scientific 1
Net Unit Price $270.00] No Bid
Extended Price $270.00
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No 304084
Warranty (# of years)
31971 CR300 Recalibration with
65 documentation — Brand: Campbell Scientific 1
Net Unit Price $210.00) No Bid
Extended Price $210.00]
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 3197
Warranty (# of years)
25425 (CS451 Recalibration with
66 documentation — Brand: Campbell Scientific 1
Net Unit Price $100.00) No Bid
Extended Price $100.00
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 2542
Warranty (# of years)
27442 (CS451 Recabling service — Brand:
67 Campbell Scientific 1
Net Unit Price $87. No Bid|
Extended Price $87.
Manufacturer Name Campbell S
Product No 2744
Warranty (# of years)
LOGGERNETADM-D/31048-1  Admin
Datalogger Support Software (Server and
Clients); -D Download Only — Brand: Campbell
68 Scientific 1
Net Unit Price $1,175. No Bid
Extended Price $1,175.
Manufacturer Name Campbell
Product No 31048-1
Warranty (# of years)
SPECIAL-SYS  Flasher Master; 2-Way
ALERT2 communications — Brand: Campbei|
69 Scientific 5
Net Unit Price $13,710.00} No Bid
Extended Price $68,550.00]
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sc
Product No Special-SYS FLSH MST
Warranty (# of years)
SPECIAL-SYS  Flasher Remote; 2-Way
ALERTZ2 communications — Brand: Campbell
70 Scientific 5
Net Unit Price $11,500.00) No Bid|
Extended Price $57,500.00]
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No Special-SYS FLSH RE
Warranty (# of years) k1




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017
For: Annual Contract for Automated Flood System
' Parts Non-Local Non-Local
Campbell Scientific Inc. |Keller America Inc.
6100009333 AJ 815 W. 1800 N 351 Bell King Road
Logan, Newport News,
UT 84321 VA 23606
Item Description Quantity |435-227-9532 757-596-6680
SPECIAL-SYS  Flasher Master; 1-way
ALERT2 communications; 2-way 900 MHz
ral communications — Brand: Campbell Scientific 15
Net Unit Price $4,511.97| No Bid
Extended Price $67,679.55|
Manufacturer Name Campbell Scij
Product No
Warranty (# of years)
SPECIAL-SYS  Flasher Remote; 2-way 900
MHz communications — Brand: Campbell
72 Scientific 15
Net Unit Price $2,092.50| No Bid
Extended Price $31,387.50|
Manufacturer Name Campbell Scil
Product No
Warranty (# of years)
31206/Special-Sensor  Al200 alert2 ,
Encoder , modulator — Brand: Campbell
73 Scientific 5
Met Unit Price $2,525.00] No Bid
Extended Price $12,625.00)
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No 3120ﬂ
Warranty (# of years) 1
SPECIAL-SENSOR  Key Board / Display for
74 Cr1000, with CR6— Brand: Campbell Scientific B
Net Unit Price $290.00) No Bid
Extended Price $1,450.00}
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No
Warranty (# of years)
13822-41 HS Rain Gage — Brand: Campbell
75 Scientific 2
Net Unit Price $1,353.00} No Bid
Extended Price $2,706.00f
Manufacturer Name Campbell Sci
Product No 13822-41)
‘Warranty (# of years) 1y
CM240/20620 Leveling base and mount -
76 Brand: Campbell Scientific 2
Net Unit Price $128.00| No Bid
|Extended Price $256.00|
Manufacturer Name Campbell Scil|
Product No 20620
Warranty (# of years) 11
CS700-L10-PW/8811-60 Rain Gage —
7 Brand: Campbell Scientific 3
Net Unit Price $1,908.80) No Bid
Extended Price $5,726.40|
Manufacturer Name Campbell Scij
Product No 8811-60)
Warranty (# of years) 1yr
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Delivery 60 da 60 days
Estimated Annual Total $514.301.14| $3,062.50
Estimated Annual Award $514,301.14] $3,062.50




