
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017
Local Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local

For: LED Lighting Fixtures For Convention Center Alderom, LLC Advenso LLC. Alderom, LLC (Alternative Bid) Facility Solutions Group, Inc. General Supply and Service BDA 

GEXPRO 

HD Supply Facilites Maintenance, 

Ltd.

6100009451 JG 4630 N Loop West, Ste.-305 203 SW Loop 410 4630 N Loop West, Ste.-305 3003 NE Loop 410 #130 6110 Trade center Drive Ste. 101B 101 Riverview Parkway 

Item Description  Quantity

San Antonio, 

TX 78249

(210) 667-6111

San Antonio, 

TX 782245

San Antonio, 

TX 78249

San Antonio, 

TX 78218

Austin, 

TX 78244

Santee, 

CA 92071

1 Indoor LED Lighting 312 NAS

 Unit Price $398.98 No Bid $387.84 $439.17 $464.98 $768.22

Total Price $124,481.76 No Bid $121,006.08 $137,021.04 $145,072.99 $239,684.64

Manufacturer Cooper Lighting Eaton INDY Eaton Eaton Eaton/Cooper

Model/Product Number LSR8AS40D010TEMB ER8AS40830 

8LN0H P836MB

LC8P 40LM 30K 120 B G3 B0CRI 

FD/L8 P CSS/ PSTEM 36N BLPEN

LSR8AS40D010TEMB/ER8AS40830/

8LN0H/P836MB

LSR8AS40D010TEMB/ER8AS40930/8L

NOH/P836MB

LSR8AS40D010TEMBER8AS40830 

8LN0H P836M

Payment Terms Net 30 No Bid Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2% 10

Prompt payment discount $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4,793.69

124,481.76 No Bid $121,006.08 137,021.04 $145,072.99 234,890.95

Total $124,481.76 No Bid $121,006.08 $137,021.04 $145,072.99 $234,890.95

Total Award $124,481.76
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: December 11, 2017

For: LED Lighting Fixtures For Convention Center

6100009451 JG

Item Description  Quantity

1 Indoor LED Lighting 312

 Unit Price

Total Price

Manufacturer

Model/Product Number

Payment Terms

Prompt payment discount

Total 

Total Award

Local Local Local Non-Local Local Local

HJD Capital Electric, Inc. HSC ELECTRIC Company Inc. HSC ELECTRIC Company Inc. 

(Alternative Bid)

Lowe's Home Centers, LLC. Trident Building Services And Tech, 

LLC.

Yanez Enterprises And Services, 

LP

5424 Hwy 90 W 4131 Mount Laurel Dr. 4131 Mount Laurel Dr. 1000 Lowes Blvd. 9506 Maytum Circle 15823 Blue Creek St.

San Antonio, 

TX 78227 

San Antonio, 

TX 78240

San Antonio, 

TX 78240

Mooresville, 

NC 28117

Helotes, 

TX 78023

San Antonio, 

TX 78232

NAS

$432.95 $549.92 $367.25 $421.88 $522.47 $546.60

$135,080.40 $171,575.04 $114,582.00 $131,626.56 $163,010.64 $170,539.20

Eaton Portfolio Lighting Lithonia Lighting Eaton Eaton Cooper Lighting

Portfolio-

LSR8AS40D010TEMB/ER8AS40

830/8LNOH/P836MB

LSR8AS40D010TEMBER8AS4083

0 8LNOH P836MB

LC85 40LM 30K MVOH B G4 

80CRI E210

LSR8AS40D010TEMB/ER8AS4093

0/8LNOH/P836MB

Portfolio 

LSR8AS40D010TEMB/ER8AS4083

0/8LNOH/P836MB

LSR8AS40D010TEMB/ER8AS4083

0/8LNOH/836MB

Net 30 2% 30 2% 30 Net 30 2% 10 Net 30

$0.00 $3,431.50 $2,291.64 $0.00 $3,260.21 $0.00

135,080.40 168,143.54 112,290.36 131,626.56 159,750.43 170,539.20

$135,080.40 $168,143.54 $112,290.36 $131,626.56 $159,750.43 $170,539.20
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