City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 24, 2018
For: Light Utility ATVs & Carts Local Local Local Non-Local Local
Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Redland Rd.
6100009802 IM San Antonio, Tx. San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx.
78247 78233 78250 78154 78259
Iltem Description Quantity |1210-451-0352 830-265-2156 210-684-5296
1 Cart w/ Power Dump Bed 4 Seater- 1
ELECTRIC
Price Each $9,999.40 No bid No bid No bid No bid
Total Price $9,999.40
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 500E with
Electric dump, all-aluminum cargo
bed with tailgate
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 500 Amp Curtis Solid State
Controller - 48 Volt 1.Q. Plus
Electric, 20.0 Peak H.P.
Warranty 2 Year limited vehicle/electronics|
warranty -
4 Year limited battery warranty
Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars, Etc.
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San
Antonio - Texas 78247,
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st, 2018
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 2018
Firm Price Yes
Days for Delivery 30-45
2 Electric Golf Cart - 4 Seater with Rear 2
Luggage Storage NAS
Price Each $11,583.00 No bid No bid No bid $10,978.00
Total Price $23,166.00 $21,956.00

Year, Make & Model Offered

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Name
Warranty Facility Address

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Price

Days for Delivery

2018 Club Car Transporter with
removable rear stake-bed kit
500 Amp Curtis Solid State|
Controller / 48 Volt 1.Q. Plus
Electric, 20.0 Peak H.P.

2 Year limited vehicle/electronics
warranty -

4 Year limited battery warranty
Golf Cars, Etc.

5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San
Antonio - Texas 78247

August 1st, 2018

July 1st, 2018,

Yes
30-45

2018 Cushman Shuttle 4 48V.

48

2 Year
Mission Golf Cars

18865 Redland Road
March 1st 2018

Feb 19th 2018

No

90




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:  January 24, 2018
For: Light Utility ATVs & Carts Local Local Local Non-Local Local
Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Redland Rd.
6100009802 IM San Antonio, Tx. San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx.
78247 78233 78250 78154 78259
Iltem Description Quantity |210-451-0352 830-265-2156 210-684-5296
3 DELETED
4 4 Wheeled 4x2 Open Cab Light Utility 4 NAS
Vehicle ELECTRIC NAS
Price Each $9,135.80 $10,129.94 No bid No bid $9,869.00
Total Price $36,543.20 $40,519.76 $39,476.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 550E with
manual dump all-aluminum cargo
bed with tailgate 2018 John Deere TE 2018 Cushman Hauler ProX
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 500 Amp Curtis Solid State
Controller / 48 Volt .Q. Plus Wound direct drive, 48vdc
Electric, 20.0 Peak H.P. separately excited, 400 AMP 72 Volt AC
Warranty 2 Year limited vehicle/electronics
warranty -
4 Year limited battery warranty| 1 Year| 2 Year
Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment Mission Golf Cars
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San 16331 Pleasantville Rd., San
Antonio - Texas 78247 Antonio, Tx 78233 18865 Redland Road
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st, 2018, 5-31-18 March 1st 2018
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 2018, 5-1-18 Feb 19th 2018
Firm Price Yes no No
Days for Delivery 30-45 45 90
5 DELETED
6 6x4 Open Cab Light Utility Vehicle 1
Price Each No bid $8,900.14 No bid No bid No bid
Total Price $8,900.14
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 John Deere TH6x4
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki
Warranty 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Name
Warranty Facility Address

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Price

Days for Delivery

Mustang Equipment

16331 Pleasantville Rd., San
Antonio, Tx 78233

5-31-18

5-1-18

No

40




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 24, 2018
For: Light Utility ATVs & Carts Local Local Local Non-Local Local
Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Redland Rd.
6100009802 IM San Antonio, Tx. San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx.
78247 78233 78250 78154 78259
Iltem Description Quantity |210-451-0352 830-265-2156 210-684-5296
7 Ground & Turf Utility Vehicle with Power 1 NAS
Dump Bed
Price Each $10,650.55 No bid $12,669.88 $22,710.00 No bid
Total Price $10,650.55 $12,669.88 $22,710.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 2- 2018 Gravely JSV-3000 996200 2018 Toro HXD (07384)
wheel drive with electric dump, all
aluminum cargo bed
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki FH680D - 20.1 H.P. @ Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak|| Kubota 32.5 HP liquid cooled Gas
3400 RPM Per SAE - J1349
Warranty 2 Year / 2000 hour limited engine- 1Year| 2 yearsor 1500 hours which ever
drivetrain warranty comes first
1 Year limited bumper to bumper
Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars, Etc. DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio, 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, Tx
Antonio - Texas 78247 TX 78250 78154
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st, 2018 10/31/2018 October 1, 2019
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 2018 10/31/2018 July 1, 2018
Firm Price Yes no not specified
Days for Delivery 30-45 45 15-30
8 4x4 Utility Vehicle- 2 seat w/Dump Bed- 1 NAS
Gasoline
Price Each $11,853.00 $13,032.00 $13,658.56 No bid No bid
Total Price $11,853.00 $13,032.00 $13,658.56
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 4X4 2018 Gravely JSV-3000 996200
Gas| 2018 John Deere 825E
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki FH680D - 20.1 HP. @ Polaris aires gas efi 570cc 40hp
3400 RPM Per SAE - J1349 chery peak
Warranty 2 Year / 2000 hour limited engine- 1 Year
drivetrain warranty|
1 Year limited bumper to bumper| 1 year,

Warranty Service Provider Name
Warranty Facility Address

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Price

Days for Delivery

Golf Cars, Etc.

5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San
Antonio - Texas 78247
August 1st, 2018

July 1st, 2018,

Yes

30-45

Mustang Equipment

16331 Pleasantville Rd., San
Antonio, Tx 78233

5-31-18

5-1-18

No

35

DeWinne Equipment Company
11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio,
TX 78250

10/31/2018

10/31/2018

no

45




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 24, 2018
For: Light Utility ATVs & Carts Local Local Local Non-Local Local
Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Redland Rd.
6100009802 IM San Antonio, Tx. San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx.
78247 78233 78250 78154 78259
Iltem Description Quantity |210-451-0352 830-265-2156 210-684-5296
9 4x4 Off Road Utility Vehicle- Diesel 1
Price Each No bid No bid $15,518.56 No bid No bid
Total Price $15,518.56
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Gravely JSV-3000 996200
Color is Red
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Polaris aires gas efi 570cc 40hp
peak
Warranty 1 Year
Warranty Service Provider Name Dewinne Equipment Company
Warranty Facility Address 11002 Bandera Rd, San Antonio,
TX 78250
Production Cut-Off Date 10/31/2018
Last Day to Place Order 10/31/2018,
Firm Price no
Days for Delivery 45
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total Estimated Award $33,165.40 $62,451.90 $28,188.44
Total Award 11 $33,165.40 $62,451.90 $28,188.44 $0.00 $0.00

Item #3 has been deleted and will be re-bid at a later date.
Golf Cars, Etc. bid 3 items that were not as specified:
Item#4 did not meet cargo bed dimensions.

Item #5 has been deleted and may be re-bid at a later date.
Item#7 & Item #8 did not meet engine requirements.
Mission Golf Carts did not sign a paper bid or submit a certified electronic bid, therefore was disqualified from

evaluation.




	Final

