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ORDINANCE 20 1 8 - Q 4 - Q 5 - Q 2 1 1 
APPROVING THE PURCHASE OF 11 LIGHT UTILITY ATVS AND 
CARTS FROM GOLF CARS, ETC., MUSTANG EQUIPMENT, AND 
DEWINNE EQUIPMENT COMPANY FOR A TOTAL COST OF 
$123,805.74, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL & 
REPLACEMENT FUND, THE AIRPORT OPERA TING & 
MAINTENANCE FUND, AND THE GENERAL FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light utility all-terrain 
vehicles (ATVs) and carts for use by various City departments; and 

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Mission Golf Carts (Items 2 and 4) and Golf Cars, Etc. 
(Items 4, 7, and 8) failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements for light _utility 
A TVs and carts; and 

WHEREAS, the lowest responsive bids were submitted by Golf Cars, Etc. (Items 1 and 2) for a 
total cost of $33,165.40, Mustang Equipment (Items 4, 6, and 8) for a total cost of $62,451.90, 
and DeWinne Equipment Company (Items 7 and 9) for a total cost of $28,188.44; NOW 
THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Golf Cars, Etc. (Items 1 and 2), Mustang Equipment (Items 
4, 6, and 8), and DeWinne Equipment Company (Items 7 and 9) for a total cost of $123 ,805.74 
to provide the City with eleven light utility ATVs and carts is hereby accepted, subject to and 
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates 
and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all 
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the 
Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted by Mission Golf Carts 
(Items 2 and 4) and Golf Cars, Etc. (Items 4, 7, and 8) for light utility A TVs and carts failed to 
meet the City' s specifications and/or requirements. 

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $123 ,805.74 is available as part of 
the Fiscal Year 2018 Budget. See the table below: 

Amount General Ledger Cost Center Fund 
$72,089.18 5701080 3503200001 72001000 
$28,550.56 5701080 2615020001 11001000 
$23,166.00 5701080 3305040006 51001000 

Total amt. $123,805 .74 
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SECTION 4. Payment not to exceed the amount of $33 ,165.40 is authorized to Golf Cars, Etc. , 
$62,451.90 is authorized Mustang Equipment, and $28,188.44 is authorized to DeWinne 
Equipment Company and should be encumbered with purchase orders. 

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP 
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 5th day of April, 2018. 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

~ torney 

2 
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Agenda Item: 5 ( in consent vote: 5, 6, 7, 8, 9A, 98, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16A, 168, 16C, 16D, 16E) 

Date: 04/05/2018 

Time: 10:04:36 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: Ordinance approving the purchase of 11 light utility ATVs and carts from Golf Cars, Etc. , Mustang 
Equipment, and De Winne Equipment Company for a total cost of $123,805.74, funded from the 
Equipment Renewal & Replacement Fund, the Airport Operating & Maintenance Fund, and the 
General Fund. [Ben Gorzell , Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, 
Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not 

Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ron Nirenberg Mayor X 

Roberto C. Trevino District I X X 

William Cruz Shaw District 2 X X 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 X 

Rey Saldana District 4 X 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 X 

Greg Brockhouse District 6 X 

Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X 

Manny Pelaez District 8 X 

John Courage District 9 X 

Clayton H. Perry District 10 X 

https://cosaweb I /voteinterface/default.aspx 4/6/2018 
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Exhibit I 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened: January 24, 2018 

For: Light Utility ATVs & Carts Local Local Local Non-Local Local 
Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts 
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Redland Rd . 

6100009802 IM San Antonio , Tx. San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx. 
78247 78233 78250 78154 78259 

Item Descriotion Quantity 210-451-0352 830-265-2156 210-684-5296 

1 Cart w/ Power Dump Bed 4 Seater- 1 
ELECTRIC 

Price Each $9,999.40 No bid No bid No bid No bid 
Total Price $9,999.40 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 500E with 

Electric dump, all-aluminum cargo 
bed with tailgate 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 500 Amp Curtis Solid State 
Controller - 48 Volt I.Q. Plus 

Electric, 20.0 Peak H.P. 
Warranty 2 Year limited vehicle/electronics 

warranty-
4 Year limited battery warranty 

Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars, Etc. 
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San 

Antonio - Texas 78247 
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st, 2018 
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 2018 
Firm Price Yes 
Days for Delivery 30-45 

2 Electric Golf Cart - 4 Seater with Rear 2 
Luggage Storage NAS 

Price Each $11,583.00 No bid No bid No bid $10,978.00 
Total Price $23,166.00 $21 ,956.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Transporter with 

removable rear stake-bed ki 2018 Cushman Shuttle 4 48V. 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 500 Amp Curtis Solid State 

Controller/ 48 Volt I.Q. Plus 
Electric, 20.0 Peak H.P. 48 

Warranty 2 Year limited vehicle/electronics 
warranty-

4 Year limited battery warranty 2 Year 
Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars , Etc. Mission Golf Cars 
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San 

Antonio - Texas 78247 18865 Redland Road 
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st, 2018 March 1st 2018 
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 2018 Feb 19th 2018 
Firm Price Yes No 
Days for Delivery 30-45 90 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: January 24, 2018 

For: Light Utility ATVs & Carts Local Local Local Non-Local Local 
Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts 
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Redland Rd. 

6100009802 IM San Antonio , Tx. San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx. 
78247 78233 78250 78154 78259 

Item Descriotion Quantity 210-451-0352 830-265-2156 210-684-5296 

3 DELETED 

4 4 Wheeled 4x2 Open Cab Light Utility 4 NAS 
NAS Vehicle ELECTRIC 

Price Each $9,135.8( $10,129.94 No bid No bid $9,869.00 
Total Price $36,543.2( $40,519.76 $39,476.00 
Year. Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 550E with 

manual dump all-aluminum cargo 
bed with tailgate 2018 John Deere TE 2018 Cushman Hauler ProX 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offeroad 500 Amp Curtis Solid State 
Controller/ 48 Volt I.Q. Plus Wound direct drive, 48vdc 

Electric, 20.0 Peak H.P. separately excited , 400 AMP 72 Volt AC 
Warranty 2 Year limited vehicle/electronics 

warranty 
4 Year limited battery warrant} 1 Year 2 Year 

Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipmen Mission Golf Cars 
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San 16331 Pleasantville Rd. , San 

Antonio - Texas 78247 Antonio, Tx 78233 18865 Redland Road 
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st, 201E 5-31-18 March 1st 2018 
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 201€ 5-1-18 Feb 19th 2018 
Firm Price Yes no No 
Days for Delivery 30-45 45 90 

5 DELETED 

6 6x4 Open Cab Light Utility Vehicle 1 
Price Each No bid $8,900.14 No bid No bid No bid 
Total Price $8,900.14 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 John Deere TH6x4 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki 
Warranty 1 Year 
Warranty Service Provider Name Mustang Equipmen 
Warranty Facility Address 16331 Pleasantville Rd. , San 

Antonio, Tx 78233 
Production Cut-Off Date 5-31-18 
Last Day to Place Order 5-1-1€ 
Firm Price Ne 
Days for Delivery 4C 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: January 24, 2018 

For: Light Utility A TVs & Carts Local Local Local Non-Local Local 
Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts 
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Redland Rd. 

6100009802 IM San Antonio, Tx. San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx. 
78247 78233 78250 78154 78259 

Item Descriotion Quantitv 210-451-0352 830-265-2156 210-684-5296 

7 Ground & Turf Utility Vehicle with Power 1 NAS 
Dump Bed 

Price Each $10,650.55 No bid $12,669.88 $22.710.00 No bid 
Total Price $10.650.55 $12,669.88 $22,710.00 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 2- 2018 Gravely JSV-3000 996200 2018 Toro HXD (07384) 

wheel drive with electric dump, all 
aluminum cargo bed 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki FH680D - 20.1 H.P. @ Polaris gas EFI 570cc 40hp peak Kubota 32.5 HP liquid cooled Gas 
3400 RPM Per SAE - J1 349 

Warranty 2 Year / 2000 hour limited engine- 1 Year 2 years or 1500 hours which ever 
drivetrain warranty comes first 

1 Year limited bumper to bumper 
Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars , Etc. Dewinne Equipment Compan~ Professional Turf Products 
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San 11002 Bandera Rd , San Antonio, 9468 Selma Parkway, Selma, Tx 

Antonio - Texas 78247 TX 7825C 78154 
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st, 2018 10/31 /2018 October 1, 2019 
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 2018 10/31 /2018 July 1, 201 8 
Firm Price Yes nc not specified 
Days for Delivery 30-45 45 15-30 

8 4x4 Utility Vehicle- 2 seat w/Dump Bed- 1 NAS 
Gasoline 

Price Each $11 ,853.00 $13,032.U\. $13 ,658.56 No bid No bid 
Total Price $11 .853.00 $13.032.0C $13,658.56 
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Club Car Carryall 1500 4X4 2018 Gravely JSV-3000 996200 

Gas 2018 John Deere 825E 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki FH680D - 20.1 H.P. @ Polaris aires gas efi 570cc 40hp 

3400 RPM Per SAE - J1349 chel) peak 
Warranty 2 Year / 2000 hour limited engine- 1 Year 

drivetrain warranty 
1 Year limited bumper to bumper 1 yea, 

Warranty Service Provider Name Golf Cars, Etc. Mustang Equipmen DeWinne Equipment Company 
Warranty Facility Address 5560 N. Loop 1604 East, San 16331 Pleasantville Rd .. San 11002 Bandera Rd , San Antonio, 

Antonio- Texas 78247 Antonio, Tx 78233 TX 78250 
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st. 2018 5-31-18 10/31 /2018 
Last Day to Place Order July 1st, 2018 5-1-11 10/31 /2018 
Firm Price Yes Ne no 
Days for Delivery 30-45 31 45 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: January 24, 2018 

For: Light Utility ATVs & Carts 

6100009802 

Item Description 

9 4x4 Off Road Utility Vehicle- Diesel 

Price Each 
Total Price 
Year, Make & Model Offered 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

Warranty 
Warranty Service Provider Name 

Warranty Facility Address 

Production Cut-Off Date 
Last Day to Place Order 
Firm Price 
Days for Delivery 
Payment Terms 

Total Estimated Award 
Total Award 

Item #3 has been deleted and will be re-bid at a later date. 

Golf Cars, Etc. bid 3 items that were not as specified: 
ltem#4 did not meet cargo bed dimensions. 

Item #5 has been deleted and may be re•bid at a later date. 
ltem#7 & Item #8 did not meet engine requirements. 

Local 
Golf Cars, Etc. 
5560 N. Loop 1604 East 

IM San Antonio , Tx. 
78247 

Quantity 21~51-0352 

1 
No bid 

Net 30 

$33,165.40 
11 $33 165.40 

Mission Golf Carts did not sign a paper bid or submit a certified electronic bid, therefore was disqualified from 

evaluation. 

Local Local 
Mustang Equipment DeWinne Equipment Company 
16331 Pleasantville Rd. 11002 Bandera Rd 
San Antonio Tx. San Antonio, Tx. 
78233 78250 
830-265-2156 210-684-5296 

No bid $15,518.56 
$15,518.56 

2018 Gravely JSV-3000 996200 
Color is Red 

Polaris aires gas efi 570cc 40hp 
peak 

1 Year 
Dewinne Equipment Company 

11002 Bandera Rd , San Antonio, 
TX 78250 

10/31/2018 
10/31/2018 

nc 
45 

Net 3C Net 3C 

$62,451.90 $28,188.44 
$62 451.90 $28,188.44 

Non-Local Local 
Professional Turf Products Mission Golf Carts 
9468 Selma Parkway 18865 Red land Rd. 
Selma, Tx San Antonio, Tx. 
781 54 78259 

No bid No bid 

Net 30 Net30 

$0.00 $0.00 


