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04/19/18
Item No. 6

ORDINANCE 2018-04-19-0281

APPROVING THE PURCHASE OF A TOTAL OF 24 SUVS AND VANS
FROM SILSBEE TOYOTA, SILSBEE FORD, ANCIRA MOTOR
COMPANY AND GUNN CHEVROLET, LTD FOR A TOTAL COST OF
$638,063.18, FUNDED FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL &
REPLACEMENT FUND AND THE AIRPORT OPERATING &
MAINTENANCE FUND.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide various departments of the City of San Antonio
with sport utility vehicles (SUVs) and vans that will support airfield tarmac operations, arson
investigations, code enforcement activities, community center program participant and volunteer
transportation, and transportation of custodial maintenance materials and crews; and

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Gunn Chevrolet LTD. (Item 7), a City Business as defined by
the City’s Local Preference Program, is within 3 percent of the lowest bid, which was from
Silsbee Ford, a bidder which is not a City Business; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves three low bid contracts, and one contract awarded to a
bidder other than the lowest bidder due to the application of a local preference, as permitted by
Texas Local Government Code §271.905; and

WHEREAS, the low responsive bids were submitted by Silsbee Toyota (Item 1) for a total cost
of $343,187.00, Silsbee Ford (Items 2, 3, 8 and 9) for a total cost of $142,423.18, Ancira Motor
Company (Items 4 and 5) for a total cost of $61,798.00 and Gunn Chevrolet LTD. (Items 6 and
7) for a total cost of $90,655.00; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bids from Silsbee Toyota (Item 1), Silsbee Ford (Items 2, 3, 8
and 9), Ancira Motor Company (Items 4 and 5) and Gunn Chevrolet LTD. (Items 6 and 7) to
provide the City of San Antonio with SUVs and vans for a total cost of $638,063.18 are hereby
accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits,
insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and
incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection
in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that, pursuant to the City’s Local Preference
Program, passed by ordinance number 2013-03-21-0167 and as amended by ordinance number
2014-11-13-0923, Gunn Chevrolet LTD. (Item 7), a City Business, is entitled to award.

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $638,063.18 is available as part of
the FY 2018 Budget, as follows:
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Amount General Ledger | Cost Center Fund
$ 542,604.18 5501055 3503200001 72001000
$ 95,459.00 5701085 3305040007 51001000
3305040009

Total amt. $638,063.18

SECTION 4. Payment in the amount up to $343,187.00 is authorized to Silsbee Toyota,
$142,423.18 to Silsbee Ford, $61,798.00 to Ancira Motor Company, and $90,655.00 is
authorized to Gunn Chevrolet LTD. and will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders.

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL

Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 19™ day of April, 2018.

ATTEST:

(aw (o

Ma ek, City c#k

Ron Nirenberg

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

WL danten

Kndrevs/gegowa City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 6 (in consentvote: 4,5,6,7,8,9, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25A, 25B, 26, Z-

1,27)
Date: 04/19/2018
Time: 10:05:39 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: Ordinance approving the purchase a total of 24 SUVs and vans from Silsbee Toyota, Silsbee Ford,

Ancira Motor Company and Gunn Chevrolet, LTD for a total cost of $638,063.18, funded from the
Equipment Renewal & Replacement Fund and the Airport Operating & Maintenance Fund. [Ben
Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Result: Passed
Voter Group P Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Treviio District 1 X X
William Cruz Shaw District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X
X

Clayton H. Perry District 10

https://cosaweb1/voteinterface/default.aspx 4/19/2018
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Exhibit I

Opened: February 23, 2018
For: Purchase of SUVs and Vans Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local - Alt Bid Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Ford Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Four Stars Ford Grapevine DCJ, LLC  |Jim Bass Ford, Inc
6100009915 IM 1211 US Hwy 96 N 1211 US Hwy 96 N 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35N 16550 IH 35N 205 W. Belknap St.  [2601 William Tate 4032 W. Houston Harte
resswa
Silsbee, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, Selma, Jacksboro, Grapevine, ?;f, Angelg,
TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 76458 TX 76051 TX 76901
Item Description Qty [409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-558-1500 210-599-5000 210-599-5000
1 Compact SUV-Hybrid 13
Price Each $26,399.00
Price Total $343,187.00|
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%|
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $343,187.00|
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 Toyota Rav-4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) 2.5L 4 cyl.
Warranty 36m/36,000 miles
Bumper to Bumper]
Warranty Service Provide Facility Name Red McCombs Toyotal
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 13526 West 110
Frontage, S/a TX
Production Cut-Off Date 5-30-1
Last Day to Place Order 5-30-1
Firm Pricing Date n
Delivery Days 12
2 Medium SUV 4x2 3
Price Each $19,153.26 $20,043.00 $21,418.00| $28,228.08 $23,791.00 $27,201.00
Price Total $57,459.78 $60,129.00| $64,254.00 $84,684.24 $71,373.00 $81,603.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.50%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $57,459.78 $60,129.00| $64,254.00| $84,684.24 $69,588.68 $81,603.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 4.65%| 11.82%
Price Differential $2,669.22 $6,794.22
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bid| 2018 Escape S| 2018 Dodge Journey 2018 Chevrolet No Bid 2018 Ford Explorer| 2019 Jeep Cherokee| 2018 Ford Explorer!|
Equinox FWD LS| FWD Latitude,
1XP26
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford 2.5L 14 cylfl Dodge 2,4L 16 Valve 4| GM, Turbocharge Gas| Ford 3.5 Liter V6-290 Jeep 2.4L 180 hp| Ford 3.5L V6 290 HP
Cylinder 173 HP 14, 1.5L 170 HP horsepower|
Warranty 36 mo/36,000 Bumpery 3 Year / 36000 Mile; 3yr/36,000k BTB 3 yr/36,000 mile 3 yr/ 36,000 miles| 3 yrs or 36000 miles,
To Bumper| Bumper to Bumper and Syr or 100,000k bumper to bumper, 5 yr/100,000 miles! bumper to bumper.
5 yr/60,000 powertrain| 5 Year/ 100000 mile PowerTrain 5 year/60,000 mile| limited powertain| 5 yrs or 60,000
Powertrain| powertrain powertrain
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Ford| Ancira Dodge| Gunn Chevrolet LTD| Red McCombs-Ford Any Jeep Dealer Any Ford dealer|
nationwide
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 8333 W I-10 San 10807 IH-10 West, 16550 IH35N, 8333 Interstate 10 San above Nearest Ford dealer
Antonio, Tx.| San Antonio, Tx 78230 Selma Texas 78154 Antonio, Tx 78230
Production Cut-Off Date 5/4/2018| 10/11/2018; 3/22/2018 6-1-2018| June 2019 6/1/2018
Last Day to Place Order 5/4/201 10/5/2018 3/22/2018 6-1-2018| Est April 2019, 5/31/2018
Firm Pricing Date N No No| Yes No| yes|
Delivery Days 12 90-120 120 100! 75-110 75-85)
*Note:

Dark cloth not available;
for this trim level.
Medium light stone is
only color available for|
this trim level.
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Opened:

February 23, 2018

For: Purchase of SUVs and Vans Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local - Alt Bid Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Ford Ancira Motor Company (Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Four Stars Ford Grapevine DCJ, LLC  |Jim Bass Ford, Inc
6100009915 IM  [1211 US Hwy 96 N 1211 US Hwy 96 N 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35N 16550 IH 35N 205 W. Belknap St.  [2601 William Tate 4032 W. Houston Harte
resswa
Silsbee, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, Selma, Jacksboro, Grapevine, g:f, Angelg,
TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 76458 TX 76051 TX 76901
Item Description Qty [409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-558-1500 210-599-5000 210-599-5000
3 Medium, SUV 4x4 1
Price Each $21,851.08] $24,259.00 $22,923.00 $30,138.08 $29,275.00 $29,131.00
Price Total $21,851.08 $24,259.00 $22,923.00 $30,138.08 $29,275.00 $29,131.00
Prompt Payment Discount 2.50%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $21,851.08 $24,259.00 $22,923.00 $30,138.08 $28,543.13 $29,131.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 11.02% 4.91%
Price Differential $2,407.92 $1,071.92
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bid| 2018 Fordj 2018 Dodge Journey 2018 Chevrolet No Bid| 2018 Ford Explorer 4x4| 2019 Jeep Cherokee 2018 Ford Explorer|
AWD| Equinox IXX26 AWD Latitude Plus
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Escape S 4X4 4 cyll Dodge Pentastar 3.6L| GM, Turbocharge Gas Ford 3.5 Liter V6-290|  Jeep 3.2L V6 271hp| Ford 3.5L V6 290 HP
V6 283 HP 14, 1.5L 170 HP| horsepower|
Warranty 36 m/36,000 Bumpeﬁ 3 Year / 36000 Mile| 3 yr or 36,000k BTB 3 yr/36,000 mile 3 yr / 36,000 miles 3 yr or 36000 miles
To Bumper]j| Bumper to Bumper and| 5 yr or 100,000k bumper to bumper, 5 yr/100,000 miles; bumper to bumper.
5 yr/60,000 powertrain 5 Year/ 100000 mile; PowerTrain 5 year/60,000 mile limited powertain| 5 yr or 60,000
Powertrain powertrain powertrain
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Ford| Ancira Dodge| Gunn Chevrolet LTD Red McCombs-Ford Any Jeep Dealer Any Ford dealer
78230 nationwide
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 8333 W I-10 San 10807 IH-10 West, 16550 IH35N, 8333 Interstate 10 San above Nearest Ford dealer|
Antonio, Tx.| San Antonio, Tx 78230 Selma Texas 78154 Antonio, Tx 78230
Production Cut-Off Date 5/4/2018 10/11/2018 3/22/2018 6-1-2018 June 2019 6/1/2018
Last Day to Place Order 5/4/2018 10/5/2018 3/22/2018 6-1-2018 Est April 2019 5/31/2018
Firm Pricing Date No No No Yes No yes
Delivery Days 121 90-120 120 100 75-110 75-85
*Note:
Dark cloth not available!
for this trim level.
Medium light stone is:
only color available for|
" this trim level
4 Full Size Utility Vehicle 4x2 Special Service Package 1
Price Each $34,710.16) $29,216.00) $36,675.16 $35,611.00
Price Total $34,710.16) $29,216.00) $36,675.16 $35,611.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%j 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $34,710.16 $29,216.00] $36,675.16 $35,611.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bid| 2018 Ford Expedition| 2018 Dodge Durangoj No Bid No Bid| 2018 Ford Expedition No bid| 2018 Ford Expedition
SSV|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford 3.5L Eco Boostl Dodge 5.7L Hemi V8 3.5 Liter V6 Ecoboost - Ford 3.5L V6 Ecoboost
360 HP} 365 HP 375 HP|
Warranty 36 m/36,000 Bumper| 3 Year / 36000 Mile| 3 yr/36,000 mile 3 yr or 36000 miles
To Bumper| Bumper to Bumper and bumper to bumper, bumper to bumper.
5 yr/60,000 powertrain| 5 Year/ 100000 mile} 5 year/60,000 mile 5 yr or 60,000 miles
Powertrain| powertrain nowertrain
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Ford| Ancira Dodge| Red McCombs-Ford Any Ford dealer|
78230 nationwide
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 8333 W I-10 San| 10807 IH-10 West, 8333 Interstate 10 San Nearest Ford dealer
Antonio, Tx.| San Antonio, Tx 78230 Antonio, Tx 78230
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st 5/17/2018 8-3-2018 8/3/2018|
Last Day to Place Order August 1st 5/10/2018 8-3-2018 8/2/2018
Firm Pricing Date Nol Noj Yes! yes|
Delivery Days 120 120-150] 100 140-155
*Note:

Largest fuel tank for
standard length is 23

gallons.
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Opened:

February 23, 2018

For: Purchase of SUVs and Vans Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local - Alt Bid Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Ford Ancira Motor Company [Gunn Chevrolet LTD. [Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Four Stars Ford Grapevine DCJ, LLC  |Jim Bass Ford, Inc
6100009915 IM 1211 US Hwy 96 N 1211 US Hwy 96 N 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35N 16550 IH 35N 205 W. Belknap St. 2601 William Tate 4032 W. Houston Harte
resswa
Silsbee, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, Selma, Jacksboro, Grapevine, S:?, Ange.:
TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 76458 TX 76051 TX 76901
Item Description Qty |409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-558-1500 210-599-5000 210-599-5000
5 Full Size Utility Vehicle 4x4 Special Service Package 1
Price Each $37,368.16 $32,582.00 $39,408.16 $38,279.00
Price Total $37,368.16) $32,582.00 $39,408.16 $38,279.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00%| 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $37,368.16 $32,582.00 $39,408.16 $38,279.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered No bid| 2018 Ford Expedition|| 2018 Dodge Durango No Bid No Bid| 2018 Ford Expedition No bid| 2018 Ford Expedition
SSV 4X4| AWD]
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford 3.5L Eco Boost| Dodge 5.7L Hemi V8| 3.5 Liter V6 Ecoboost - Ford 3.5L V6 Ecoboost
360 HP| 365 HP 375 HP|
Warranty 36 m/36,000 Bumper| 3 Year / 36000 mile 3 year/36,000 mile 3 yrs or 36000 miles
To Bumper| Bumper to Bumper and| bumper to bumper, bumper to bumper.
5 yr/60,000 powertrain| 5 Year/ 100000 5 year/60,000 mile 5 yrs or 60,000 miles|
Powertrain| powertrain powertrain|
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Ford| Ancira Dodge Red McCombs Ford Any Ford dealer]|
nationwide
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 8333 W I-10 San 10807 IH-10 West, 8333 Interstate 10, San Nearest Ford dealer
Antonio, Tx.[| San Antonio, Tx 78230 Antonio, Tx 78230
Production Cut-Off Date August 1st] 5/17/2018 8-3-2018 8/3/2018
Last Day to Place Order August 1st] 5/10/2018 8-3-2018 8/2/2018
Firm Pricing Date No N Yes| yes
Delivery Days 120 120-150] 100! 140-155
*Note:
Largest fuel tank for
standard length is 23
gallons.
6 Large SUV with Extra Cargo Space 1
Price Each $33,980.16 $36,021.00 $33,661.00) $38,113.16 $37,049.00|
Price Total $33,980.16 $36,021.00 $33,661.00] $38,113.16 $37,049.00,
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%| 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $33,980.16 $36,021.00 $33,661.00 $38,113.16 $37,049.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bid| 2018 Expedition SSV/| No Bid| 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe| 2018 Chevrolet Tahoe]| 2018 Ford Expedition No bid| 2018 Ford Expedition

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty

Warranty Service Provide Name
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Pricing Date
Delivery Days

Ford 3.5L V6 Eco
Boost|

36 m/36,000 Bumper!
To Bumper

5 yr/60,000 powertrain

Red McCombs

8333 W I-10 San
Antonio, Tx. 78230
August 1st

August 1st

No|

120]

GM, L83 Gas/Ethanol|
V8 5.3L 355 HP|

SSV 5W4 CK15706)

4X4
GM, L83 Gas/Ethanol
V8 5.3L 355 HP|

3 yr or 36,000k BTB} 3 yr or 36,000k BTB|
5 yr or 100,000k| 5 yr or 100,000k
PowerTrain| PowerTrain|
Gunn Chevrolet LTD|  Gunn Chevrolet LTD|
16550 IH35N,| 16550 IH35N,
Selma Texas 78154 Selma Texas 78154
4/26/201 8I 4/12/201
4/26/2018 4/12/201
No| Noj
120 120
*GM does not make| *Tahoe Speciall
2WD Special Service| Services 4X4|

3.5 Liter V6 Ecoboost -
365 HP

3 year/36,000 mile
bumper to bumper,

5 year/60,000 mile
powertrain

Red McCombs|

8333 Interstate 10, San
Antonio, Tx 78230
8-3-2018|

8-3-2018

Yes

100

3.5L V6 Ecoboost
375 HP|

3 yrs or 36000 miles|
bumper to bumper.

5 yrs or 60,000 miles!
powertrain,

Any Ford dealer
nationwide:

Nearest Ford dealer

8/3/2018
8/2/2018
yes|
140-155
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Opened:

February 23, 2018

For: Purchase of SUVs and Vans Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local - Ait Bid Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Ford Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Four Stars Ford Grapevine DCJ, LLC  |Jim Bass Ford, Inc
6100009915 IM |1211 US Hwy 96 N 1211 US Hwy 96 N 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35N 16550 IH 35N 205 W. Belknap St. 2601 William Tate 2232 W. Houston Harte
resswa
Silsbee, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, Selma, Jacksboro, Grapevine, Sa’:\ Ange;oy,
TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 76458 TX 76051 TX 76901
Item Description Qty |409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-558-1500 210-599-5000 210-599-5000
7 12-Passenger Van-Low Roof 2
Price Each $28,257.16 $28,497.00] $30,855.16 $29,032.00
Price Total $56,514.32 $56,994.00] $61,710.32 $58,064.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00%) 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $56,514.32 $56,994.00 $61,710.32 $58,064.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 0.85%)
Price Differential $479.68||
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bid| 2018 Transit 350 LR No Bid| 2018 Chevrolet| No Bid 2018 Ford Transit| No Bid 2018 Ford Transit,
CG33706 Ext 12 Pass|
Van|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford 3.7L V6 GM, LVI Gas/Ethanol 3.7 Liter V6 - 275 HP Ford 3.7L V& 275 HP|
V6 4.3L 276 HP|
Warranty 36 mo/36,000 Bumper 3 yr or 36,000k| 3 year/36,000 mile 3 yrs or 36000 months
To Bumper bumper to bumper, bumper to bumper.
5 yr/60,000 powertrain 5 year/60,000 mile 5 yrs or 60,000 miles|
powertrain powertrain
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Gunn Chevrolet LTD| Red McCombs! Any Ford dealer|
nationwide
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 8333 W I-10 San 16550 IH35N, 8333 Interstate 10 San Nearest Ford dealer
Antonio, Tx. 78230 Selma Texas 78154 Antonio, Tx 78230
Production Cut-Off Date June 1st 5/31/2018 (?) 5-4-2018 5/4/12018
Last Day to Place Order June 1st 5/31/2018| 5-4-2018] 5/3/2018
Firm Pricing Date No| Yes Yes yes|
*Date has not been set|
Delivery Days 120 150] 100 115-125
*Note:
Longest wheelbase|
available for Transit is
148",
Fuel tank is 25 gallons
8 12-Passenger Van- Medium Roof w/Tow Package 1
Price Each $31,861 A16' $34,459.16 $32,636.00
Price Total $31,861.16 $34,459.16 $32,636.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%] 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $31,861.16 $34,459.16 $32,636.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bidjf 2018 Transit 350 Med. No Bid No bid No Bid 2018 Ford Transit No bid| 2018 Ford Transit

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)

Warranty

Warranty Service Provide Name
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Pricing Date
Delivery Days

Roof]
Ford 3.7L V6|

36 mo/36,000 Bumper|
To Bumper
5 yr/60,000 powertrain|

Red McCombs Ford

8333 W I-10 San|
Antonio, Tx. 78230
June 1st]

June 1st}

Noj

120)

3.7 Liter V6 - 275 HP

3 year/36,000 mile
bumper to bumper,
5 year/60,000 mile
powertrain

Red McCombs Ford

8333 Interstate 10 San
Antonio, Tx 78230
5-4-2018

5-4-2018

Yes

100

Ford 3.7L V6 275 HP

3 yrs or 36000 miles
bumper to bumper.

5 yrs or 60,000 miles
Powertrain

Any Ford dealer,
nationwide

Nearest Ford dealer|

5/4/2018
5/3/2018

yes

115-125

*Note:

Largest fuel tank|

available is 25 gallons!
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Opened:

February 23, 2018

For: Purchase of SUVs and Vans Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local - Alt Bid Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Ford Ancira Motor Company |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. |Gunn Chevrolet LTD. [Four Stars Ford Grapevine DCJ, LLC  [Jim Bass Ford, Inc
6100009915 IM 1211 US Hwy 96 N 1211 US Hwy 96 N 10807 IH-10 West 16550 IH 35N 16550 IH 35N 205 W. Belknap St. 2601 William Tate 4032 W. Houston Harte
Expresswa
Silsbee, Silsbee, San Antonio, Selma, Selma, Jacksboro, Grapevine, S:’r: Angelg.
TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 78230 TX 78154 TX 78154 TX 76458 TX 76051 TX 76901
Item Description Qty |409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-558-1500 210-599-5000 210-599-5000
9 12-Passenger Van- Medium Roof 1
Price Each $31,251 .15' $33,759.16 $31,749.00
Price Total $31,251.16 $33,759.16 $31,749.00,
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00%if 0.00%: 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $31,251.16 $33,759.16 $31,749.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price Differential
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bid| 2018 Transi No Bid No bid No Bid 2018 Ford Transit No bid 2018 Ford Transit|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Ford 3.7L V6 3.7 Liter V6 - 275 HP Ford 3.7L V6 275 HP
Warranty 36 m/36,000 Bumper| 3 year/36,000 mile 3 yrs or 36000 miles
To Bumper] bumper to bumper, bumper to bumper.
5 yr/60,000 powertrain 5 year/60,000 mile 5 yrs or 60,000 miles|
powertrain Powertrain
Warranty Service Provide Name Red McCombs Ford Red McCombs Any Ford dealer|
nationwide!
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 8333 W 1-10 San)| 8333 Interstate 10 San Nearest Ford dealer
Antonio, Tx. 78230 Antonio, Tx 78230
Production Cut-Off Date June 1st| 5-4-2018 5/4/2018,
Last Day to Place Order June 1st] 5-4-2018 5/3/2018
Firm Pricing Date No Yes yes|
Delivery Days 120) 100 115-125|
*Note:
Largest fuel tank
available is 25 gallons!
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2.5% 10 Days Net 30
Total Award $343,187.00 $142,423.18 $61,798.00 $56,994.00 $33,661.00
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