
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

1 ¾ Ton 56” CA Utility Body Truck with Pipe 

Rack:

1

Price Each: $34,291.00 $35,120.00 No Bid $35,128.00 No Bid No Bid

Total: $34,291.00 $35,120.00  $35,128.00

Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $34,249.80

Percentage between lowest responsive bid 

and local bid:

0.1% 2.5%

Price Differential: $41.20 $870.20

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 Ram 2500 Reg. 

Cab

2018 or 2019 Ford 

F250 R/C 4X2 w/ Pipe 

Rack

 2018 Ram 2500

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Dodge Hemi 5.7L V8, 

383HP

6.2L, V8 Ford 385 

H.P.

 Ram 6.4L Hemi V8, 

410 HP (Reg-ired For 

Heaviest Suspension)

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto. 

66RFE

Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic

 Dodge 66RFE Auto

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 

Year/100,000 

Powertrain

36 Months or 36,000 

Miles Base Warranty

 3/36,000, 5/100,000 

Limited Powertrain

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center  Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

10807 IH-10 West, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

 Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Year, Make & Model of Utility Body and 

Pipe Rack Offered:

2018 Stahl 205393 

CST98VVS and Axton 

Pipe Rack

2018 Stahl 

CST98VVS w/ ATE 

Custom Pipe Rack

 2018 Stahl 

CST98VV6

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty: Service Body 5 Years, 

Pipe           Rack 1 Yr.

12 Months  5 Yr. Limited

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Name:

Axton Truck 

Equipment

Axton Truck 

Equipment

 Axton Truck 

Equipment

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Address:

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

 4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days  135-160 Days

Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018  12/22/18

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

10/1/2018 June 30, 2018  10/10/18

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No No  No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

2 1 Ton Extended Cab Utility Truck with 

Herbicide Tank:

1

Price Each: $52,352.00 $51,721.00 No Bid $53,472.00 No Bid No Bid

Total: $52,352.00 $51,721.00 $53,472.00

Prompt Payment Discount: 2.5%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $52,135.20

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 Ram 3500 Crew 

Cab 4X4

2018 or 2019 Ford 

F350 Super Cab 4X4

 2018 Ram 3500 Crew 

Cab (Full 4 Dr.)

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins Diesel 6.7L 

I-6, 385 HP

6.7L, V8 Ford Diesel 

450 H.P.

 Cummins  I-6 Turbo 

Diesel 385 hp

Transmission Offered: 6-SPD Auto Aisin 

AS69RC HD

6 Speed Ford 

Automatic 

Transmission

 Aisen AS69 RC Auto

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 

Year/100,000 

Powertrain

36 Months or 36,000 

Miles Base Warranty

 3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Yr./100,000 mile 

motor limited 

powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center  Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

10807 IH-10 West, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

 Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Year, Make & Model of Herbicide Tank 

offered:

2018 Northstar Model 

#268170 

Northstar Skid 

Sprayer Model 

#268170 

 2018 Stahl 

CST98VVS Body, 

Northstar Skid 

Sprayer #268170, 200 

gal
Herbicide Tank Warranty: 2 Yr. 12 Months  2 Yr. Commercial 

Limited

Herbicide Tank Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Northern Tool and 

Equipment

Axton Truck 

Equipment

 Axton Truck 

Equipment

Herbicide Tank Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

2505 NW Loop 410, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

 4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days  135-160 Days

Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018  12/22/18

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

10/1/2018 June 30, 2018  10/10/18

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No No  No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

3 1 Ton Regular Cab 4x4 Long bed with 

Toolbox:

1

Price Each: $37,241.00 $39,414.00 No Bid $37,711.00 No Bid $44,387.00
Total: $37,241.00 $39,414.00 $37,711.00 $44,387.00

Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $36,768.23

Percentage between lowest responsive bid 

and local bid:

1.3% 7.2%

Price Differential $472.77 $2,645.78

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

Ram 3500 Reg. Cab 

4X4

2018 or 2019 Ford 

F350 R/C 4X4

2018 Ram 3500 2018 F-350

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins Diesel 6.7L     

I-6, 350 HP

 Ford 6.7L, V8 Diesel 

450 H.P.

Cummins I-6 Turbo 

Diesel,. 370 hp

6.2L Gasoline

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto 

68RFE Trans.

Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic 

Transmission

Ram 68RFE Auto 6 Speed Automatic

Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 

Year/100,000 

Powertrain

36 Months or 36,000 

Miles

3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Yr./100,000 mile 

motor + limited 

powertrain 

3 Year , 36,000 Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Red McCombs

Warranty Service Facility Address: 10807 IH-10 West, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

8333 W. IH-10, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

Make & Model Toolbox Offered: Weatherguard 127-5-

02

WEG-127-5-02 

Weather Guard Cross 

Bed Toolbox - Black 

Aluminum Tread Plate

Weather Guard Weg 

127-5-02

2018 American 

(Aluminum)

Delivery: 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 100 Days

Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 12/22/18 Oct. 31, 2018

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 10/10/18 "July 23, 2018

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No No No No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

4 1 Ton Four Full Door 4x4 Pickup Truck w 

Toolbox:

3

NAS

Price Each: $38,593.00 $43,112.00 $42,275.00 $40,214.00 No Bid $37,839.68

Total: $115,779.00 $129,336.00 $126,825.00 $120,642.00  $113,519.04

2.50%

$117,625.95

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 Ram Crew Cab 

4X4

2018 or 2019 Ford 

F350 Crew Cab 4X4

2018 Chevrolet 1 Ton 

SRW Crew Cab 

CK3543

2018 Ram 3500  2018 F-250

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins Diesel 6.7L 

I-6, 385 HP

6.7L, V8 Ford Diesel 

450 H.P.

GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP 

Turbo-Diesel

Cummins I-6 Turbo 

Diesel,. 370 hp

 6.2L

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto 

68RFE Trans.

6 Speed Ford 

Automatic 

Transmission

Allison 1000, 6 SPD 

Automatic 

Transmission

Ram 68RFE Auto  6 Speed Automatic

Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 

Year/100,000 

Powertrain

36 Months or 36,000 

Miles

3 yr. or 36,000K BTB, 

5 Yr. or 100,000K 

powertrain

3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Yr./100,000 mile 

motor + limited 

powertrain 

 3 Year , 36,000 Miles

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Chevrolet, Gunn LTD Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

 Red McCombs

Warranty Service Facility Address: 10807 IH-10 West, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

16550 IH 35 N., 

Selma, TX 78154

Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

 8333 W. IH-10, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

Make & Model Toolbox Offered: Weatherguard 127-5-

02

WEG-127-5-02 

Weather Black 

Aluminum Tread Plate

RS-C63WAB Single 

BLK Tread Wide FS 

(See attached Quote) 

35943

Weather Guard Weg 

127-5-02

 2018 American

Delivery: 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 100 Days 120-150 Days  100 Days

Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 2018 Model 12/22/18  Oct. 31, 2018

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 10/10/18  July 23, 2018

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No No No, Add 2% $993.00 

2019 start up 3/29/18, 

production starts 

6/19/18

No  No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

5 1 Ton Four Full Door 4x2 Propane Fueled 

Pickup Truck:

1

NAS

Price Each: No Bid $40,870.00 $49,148.00 No Bid No Bid $31,366.00

Total:  $40,870.00 $49,148.00 $31,366.00

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

 2018 or 2019 Ford 

F350 Crew Cab 4X2

2018 Chevrolet 

CK35943 4X4 Crew 

Cab

2018 LK/B 6.2L 

(C.N.G.) F350

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

 Ford 6.2L Gas, V8 

Engine, 385 H.P.

GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP 

Turbo-Diesel V8

6.2L (Compressed 

Natural Gas)

Transmission Offered:  Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic 

Transmission

Allison 1000, 6 SPD 

Automatic 

Transmission

6 Speed Automatic

Cab & Chassis Warranty:  36 Months or 36,000 

Miles

3 yr. or 36,000K BTB, 

5 Yr. or 100,000K 

powertrain

3 Year , 36,000 Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

 Grande Truck Center Chevrolet, Gunn LTD Red McCombs Ford

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 

Address:

 4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

16550 IH 35 N., 

Selma, TX 78154

8333 W. IH-10, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

Year, Make & Model Propane System 

Offered:

 2018 Nat G LAEH-00-

0-00.0-A1A1-0-0-400-

3.51

2018 LPG ICOM 

System 57 Gallons

2018 GNG Prep-Kit 

(Ford)

Propane System Warranty:  12 Months 2 Year Warranty 3 Year , 36,000 Miles

Propane System Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

 Nat G Nat G Red McCombs Ford

Propane System Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

 4562 I 10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

16504 Aldine 

Westfield, Houston, 

TX 77032

8333 W. IH-10, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

Delivery:  120-150 Days 120-130 Days 100 Days

Production Cut-off Date:  June 30, 2018 3/22/18 2018 Model October 31, 2018

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 July 23, 2018

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

 No No, Add 2% $993.00 

2019 start up 3/29/18, 

production starts 

6/19/18

No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

6 1 Ton Four Full Door Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck 

w/ Toolbox and Lift Gate:
1

Price Each: $41,762.00 $45,436.00 $45,434.00 $42,849.00 No bid $48,813.24
Total: $41,762.00 $45,436.00 $45,434.00 $42,849.00 $48,813.24
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $41,777.78

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 Ram 3500 Crew 

Cab 4X4

2018 or 2019 Ford 

F350 Crew Cab 4X4

2018 Chevrolet 

CK35943 4X4 Crew 

Cab 

2018 Ram 3500 F-350

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins Diesel 6.7L 

I-6, 350

Ford 6.7L, V8 Diesel 

450 H.P.

GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP 

Turbo-Diesel V8

Cummins I-6 Turbo 

Diesel,. 370 hp

2018 6.0L, V8           

(385 H.P.)

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto 

68RFE Trans.

Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic 

Transmission

Allison 1000, 6 SPD 

Automatic 

Transmission

Ram 68RFE Auto 6 Speed Automatic

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 

Year/100,000 

Powertrain

36 Month or 36,000 

Miles

3 yr. or 36,000K BTB, 

5 Yr. or 100,000K 

powertrain

3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Yr./100,000 mile 

motor + limited 

powertrain 

3 Year, 36,000 Mi.

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Chevrolet, Gunn LTD Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

3 Year, 36,000 Mi.

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

10807 IH-10 West, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

16550 IH 35 N., 

Selma, TX 78154

Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Red McCombs Ford

Make & Model of Toolbox offered Weatherguard 127-5-

02

WEG-127-5-02 

Weather Black 

Aluminum Tread Plate

RS-C63AW Single Lid 

Full Size White

Weather Guard Weg 

127-5-02

American

Year, Make & Model of Lift Gate Offered: 2018 Maxon C2-60-

1542TP38

Max-C2-60-1542 

TP38 Maxon 1500 

lbs. Steel

 Tommy Gate TG-

G2601542 TP38

2018 Maxon Max-c2-

60-1542 TP38

2018 Waltco

Lift Gate Warranty: 2 Yr. 12 Months 2 Years 2 years or 6,000 

Cycles

2 Year - Unlimited 

Lift Gate Warranty Service Provider Facility 

Name:

Axton Truck 

Equipment

Axton Truck 

Equipment

Truck Fitters Axton Truck 

Equipment

Waltco

Lift Gate Warranty Service Provider Facility 

Address:

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

2625 Broadway St., 

San Antonio, TX 

78215

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

285 Northeast Ave., 

Tallmadge, Ohio 

44278

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days 120-130 Days 125-150 Days 100 Days

Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 2018 Model 12/22/18 October 31, 2018

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 10/10/18 July 23, 2018

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No No No, Add 2% $993.00 

2019 start up 3/29/18, 

production starts 

6/19/18

Not Provided No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

7 1 Ton 56” CA Utility Body Truck with 

Ladder Rack: 1

Price Each: $42,736.00 $43,925.00 No Bid $43,995.00 No Bid No Bid

Total: $42,736.00 $43,925.00 $43,995.00

Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50%

Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $42,895.13

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

Ram 3500 Reg. Cab 

4X2

2018 or 2019  2018 Ram 3500

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins Diesel 6.7L 

I-6, 350

Ford 6.7L, V8 Diesel 

Engine, 450 H.P.

 Cummins I-6 Turbo 

Diesel,. 370 hp

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto 

68RFE Trans.

Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic 

Transmission

 Ram 68RFE Auto

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 

Year/100,000 

Powertrain

36 Month or 36,000  3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Yr./100,000 mile 

motor + limited 

powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center  Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

10807 IH-10 West, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

 Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Year, Make & Model of Ladder Body and 

Pipe Rack Offered:

Stahl 2055393 

CST98VVS

2018 Stahl 

CST98VVS Service 

Body ATE-Custom 

Ladder Rack

 2018 Stahl 

CST98VVS

Utility Body & Ladder Rack Warranty: Service Body 5 Yrs., 

Axton Rack 1 Yr. 

12 Months  5 Years Limited

Utility Body & Ladder Rack Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Name:

Axton Truck 

Equipment

Axton Truck 

Equipment

 Axton Truck 

Equipment

Utility Body and Ladder Rack Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Address:

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

 4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days  140-160 Days

Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018   12/22/18

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

10/1/2018 June 30, 2018  10/10/18

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No No  No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

8 1 Ton 84” Cab to Axle DRW 4x2 with 

Traffic Utility Body:
2

Price Each: No Bid $60,473.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $120,946.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 or 2019 Ford 

F350 R/C 4X2 Cab 

Chassis

  

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Ford 6.7L, V8 Diesel 

330 H.P.

  

Transmission Offered: Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic 

Transmission

  

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 Months or 36,000 

Miles

  

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Grande Truck Center   

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

  

Year, Make & Model of Utility Body Offered: UTEC model UT11-

576 TP

  

Utility Body Warranty: 12 Months   

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

UTEC   

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

5860 Pfieil Road, 

Schertz, TX 78154 

  

Delivery: 120-150 Days   

Production Cut-off Date: June 30, 2018   

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

June 30, 2018   

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No   
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

9 1 Ton 84” CA High Side Body Truck with 

Lift Gate:
1

NAS

Price Each: No Bid $46,138.00 $45,709.00 No Bid No Bid $43,353.00
Total: $46,138.00 $45,709.00 $43,353.00
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 or 2019 Ford 

f350 Cab Chassis 

Reg. Cab 4X2

Chevrolet CC36403 

2WD, 84 CA 2WD 

Diesel  

 2018 F350

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Ford 6.7L, V8 Diesel 

330 H.P.

GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP 

Turbo-Diesel V8

 Ford 8 Cylinder        

(385 HP) Diesel 

Transmission Offered: Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic 

Transmission

Allison 1000, 6 SPD 

Automatic Trans

 6 Speed Automatic

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 Month or 36,000 

Miles

3 yr. or 36,000K BTB, 

5 Yr. or 100,000K 

powertrain

 3 Year , 36,000 Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Grande Truck Center Chevrolet, Gunn LTD  Red McCombs

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

16550 IH 35 N., 

Selma, TX 78154

 8333 W. IH-10, San 

Antonio, TX 78230

Year, Make & Model of High Side Body & 

Lift Gate offered:

2018 Reading H-12-D 

HD Platform, G2 92-

1650 TP41 Tommy 

Gate

2018 TN-1689 7843L  2018 Waltco

High Side Body & Lift Gate Warranty: 12 Months Limestone Non-

Skirted 14x97 84 CA, 

tommy gate - 

G2921650 TP41 

 2 Years

High Side Body & Lift Gate Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Name:

Cobalt Truck 

Equipment

Truck Fitters  Waltco

High Side Body & Lift Gate Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Address:

11218 IH-10 East, 

Converse, TX 78109

2625 Broadway St., 

San Antonio, TX 

78215

 285 Northeast Ave., 

Tallmadge, Ohio 

44278

Delivery: 120-150 Days 120 Days  100 Days

Production Cut-off Date: June 30, 2018 Done 2018 

(2/22/2018)

 October 31, 2018

Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

June 30, 2018 2/22/2018 Done  July 23, 2018

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No 2019 Orders start up 

is 3/29/18, production 

starts 6/9/2018

 No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

10 1 Ton Full Four Door 60” CA DRW 4x2 9ft 

Flatbed Truck with hinged drop down sides 

and Lift Gate:

1

Price Each: $44,953.00 $50,484.00 No bid $44,124.00 No Bid $46,396.56
Total: $44,953.00 $50,484.00 $44,124.00 $46,396.56
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $43,020.90
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 

and local bid:

4.5% 17.3%

Price Differential: $1,932.10 $7,463.10
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 Ram  350 Crew 

Cab Chassis 60 CA 

4X2

2018 or 2019 Ford 

F350 Crew Cab, Cab 

Chassis 4X2

2018 Ram 3500 

Chassis

Ford F-350

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

Cummins Diesel 6.7L 

I-6, 325

Ford 6.7L, V8 Diesel 

330 H.P.

Cummins I-6 Turbo 

Diesel 325 hp

6.0L V8 (385 H.P.)

Transmission Offered: 6-SPD Auto Aisin Ford 6 Speed 

Automatic 

Transmission

Aisen AS69 RC Auto 6 Speed Automatic

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 

Year/100,000 

Powertrain

36 Month or 36,000 

Miles

3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Yr./100,000 mile 

motor + limited 

powertrain 

3 Year , 36,000 Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

3 Year , 36,000 Miles

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

10807 IH-10 West, 

San Antonio, TX 

78230

4562 IH-10 East, San 

Antonio, TX 78219

Any Ram Truck 

Dealer

Red McCombs Ford, 

8333 W. IH-10, San 

Antonio, TX 78230
Year, Make & Model of Flatbed w/ Drop 

Sides & Lift Gate offered:

2018 Flatbed, Tommy 

Gate Model # G2-92-

1650TP41

2018 Reading Model 

H-9-d HD Platform, 

Tommy Gate G2 92-

1650 TP41

2018 Axton Custom, 

Maxa G2-92-1650 

TP41

2018 Enoven

Flatbed w/ Drop Sides & Lift Gate 

Warranty:

Axton Bed 1 Yr., 

Tommy gate 2 Yrs.

12 Months 2 Yr. Palfinger

Flatbed w/ Drop Sides & Lift Gate Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Name:

Axton Truck 

Equipment

Cobalt Truck 

Equipment

Axton Truck 

Equipment

Lifetime (Limited)

Flatbed w/ Drop Sides & Lift Gate Warranty 

Service Provider Facility Address:

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

11218 IH-10 East, 

Converse, TX 78109

4844 Whirlwind, San 

Antonio, TX 78217

15939 Piuma Ave., 

Cerritos, CA

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days 125-150 Days 100 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 12/22/18 October 31, 2018
Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 10/10/18 July 23, 2018

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

No No No No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 28, 2018
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor 

Company

Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 

Vehicles, LLC.

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009

Item Description QTY San Antonio,               

TX 78230                     

210-558-1500

San Antonio,                

TX 78219                    

210-666-7112

Selma,                                

TX 78154                    

210-599-5000

Grapevine,                       

TX 76051                    

817-410-7541

Converse,                        

TX 78109                   

210-380-6772

Schertz,                      

TX 78154

11 Class 5 14,001-16,000 GVW Cabover 14’ 

Box Truck with Lift Gate:

2

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54,481.43 No Bid
Total: $108,962.86
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 

Offered:

2018 Hino

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 

(Include SAE net HP): 

JO5E-TP, 210 HP

Transmission Offered: Aisin A465, 6 Speed 

Auto
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 5 Year/200,000 Miles
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Name:

Rush Truck Center

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 

Facility Address:

8922 I.H. 10 East, 

Converse, TX 78109
Year, Make & Model of 14 Ft. Box & Lift 

Gate offered:

2018 Morgan Dry Van

14 Ft. Box & Lift Gate Warranty: 1 Year
14 Ft. Box & Lift Gate Warranty Service 

Provider Facility Name:

W&B Service

14 Ft. Box & Lift Gate Warranty Service 

Provider Facility Address:

8803 IH 10 East, 

Converse, TX 78109 
Delivery: 120 Days
Production Cut-off Date: N/A
Last day order can be placed without 

missing cut-off date:

N/A

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off 

date:

Yes

12 Deleted:   

Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 2-1/2% Net 10 Days Net 30 Net 30

Total: $369,114.00 $603,390.00 $267,116.00 $377,921.00 $108,962.86 $281,438.28
Total Award: $271,809.00 $213,537.00 $45,709.00 $44,124.00 $108,962.86

Item: 12 was deleted and will be rebid at a later date.
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