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ORDINANCE 2 Q 1 8 - Q ? - 1 Q - Q ) 2 6 
APPROVING THE PURCHASE OF 15 MEDIUM DUTY TRUCKS FROM 
ANCIRA MOTOR COMPANY, GRANDE TRUCK CENTER, 
GRAPEVINE DCJ LLC, GUNN CHEVROLET, LTD. AND RUSH TRUCK 
CENTER FOR A TOTAL COST OF $684,141.86, FUNDED FROM THE 
EQUIPMENT RENEW AL & REPLACEMENT FUND, AIRPORT 
OPERATING & MAINTENANCE FUND, SOLID WASTE OPERATING & 
MAINTENANCE FUND, AND STORMWATER OPERATING FUND. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide various departments of the City of San Antonio 
with medium duty pickup trucks with various bodies, tool boxes, racks and/or lift gates; and 

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Ancira Motor Company (Items 1 and 3), a City Business as 
defined by the City's Local Preference Program, are within 3 percent of the lowest bids, which 
were from Grapevine DCJ LLC, a bidder which is not a City Business; and 

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Rolltechs Specialty Vehicles, LLC (Items 4, 5, and 9) failed 
to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements; and 

WHEREAS, the low responsive bids were submitted by Ancira Motor Company (Items 1, 3, 4, 
6, and 7) for a total cost of $271,809.00, Grande Truck Center (Items 2, 5, and 8) for a total cost 
of $213,537.00, Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. (Item 9) for a cost of $45,709.00, Grapevine DCJ LLC 
(Item 10) for a cost of $44,124.00, and Rush Truck Center (Item 11) for a total cost of 
$108,962.86; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The low, responsive bids from Ancira Motor Company (Items 1, 3, 4, 6, and 7), 
Grande Truck Center (Items 2, 5, and 8), Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. (Item 9), Grapevine DCJ LLC 
(Item 10), and Rush Truck Center (Item 11) for a total cost of $684,141.86 to provide the City of 
San Antonio with medium duty pickup trucks are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent 
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and 
endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all 
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the 
Purchasing Division of the Finance Department. 

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that, pursuant to the City's Local Preference 
Program, passed by ordinance number 2013-03-21-0167 and as amended by ordinance number 
2014-11-13-0923, Ancira Motor Company, a City Business, is entitled to award for items 1 and 
3. 

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $684,141.86 is available as part of 
the FY 2018 Budget, as follows: 
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Amount 

$ 479,334.00 
$ 108,962.86 
$44,124.00 
$51 ,721.00 

Total amt. $684,141.86 

General 
Ledger 

5701080 
5701080 
5701080 
5701080 

Cost Center Fund 

3503200001 72001000 
5555050004 55001000 
3305030006 51001000 
2304020002 29070000 

SECTION 4. Payments in amounts not to exceed the budgeted amounts are authorized as 
follows: $271 ,809.00 to Ancira Motor Company, $213,537.00 to Grande Truck Center, 
$45,709.00 to Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd., $44,124.00 to Grapevine DCJ LLC, and $108,962.86 to 
Rush Truck Center, and will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders. 

SECTION 5. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director 
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the 
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, 
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP 
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL 
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance. 

SECTION 6. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 10th day of May, 2018. 

Ron Nirenberg 

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

2 
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Agenda Item: 6 ( in consent vote: 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23) 

Date: 05/ 10/2018 

Time: 09:18:57 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: Ordinance approving the purchase of 15 medium duty trucks from Ancira Motor Company, Grande 
Truck Center, Grapevine DCJ LLC, Gunn Chevrolet, Ltd. and Rush Truck Center for a total cost of 
$684,141.86, funded from the Equipment Renewal & Replacement Fund, Airport Operating & 
Maintenance Fund, Solid Waste Operating & Maintenance Fund, and Stormwater Operating Fund. 
[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group 
Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 

Present 

Ron Nirenberg Mayor X 

Roberto C. Trevino District I X X 

William Cruz Shaw District 2 X X 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 X 

Rey Saldana District 4 X 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 X 

Greg Brockhouse District 6 X 

Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X 

Manny Pelaez District 8 X 

John Courage District 9 X 

Clayton H. Perry District I 0 X 

https://cosaweb 1 /voteinterface/default.aspx 5/10/2018 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LO 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

1 ¾ Ton 56" CA Utility Body Truck with Pipe 1 
Rack: 
Price Each: $34,291 .00 $35,120.00 No Bid $35,128.00 No Bid No Bid 
Total: $34,291 .00 $35,120.00 $35,128.00 
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $34,249.80 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid 0.1% 2.5% 
and local bid: 
Price Differential: $41 .20 $870.20 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 Ram 2500 Reg. 2018 or 2019 Ford 2018 Ram 2500 
Offered: Cab F250 RIC 4X2 w/ Pipe 

Rack 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Dodge Herni 5. 7L V8, 6.2L, V8 Ford 385 Ram 6.4L Hemi V8, 
(Include SAE net HP): 383HP H.P. 410 HP (Reg-ired For 

Heaviest Suspension) 
Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto. Ford 6 Speed Dodge 66RFE Auto 

66RFE Automatic 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 36 Months or 36,000 3/36,000. 5/100,000 
Bumper to Bumper 5 Miles Base Warranty Limited Powertrain 

Year/100,000 
Powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Any Ram Truck 
Facility Name: Dealer 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 10807 IH-1 0 West, 4562 IH-10 East, San Any Ram Truck 
Facility Address: San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78219 Dealer 

78230 
Year, Make & Model of Utility Body and 2018 Stahl 205393 2018 Stahl 2018 Stahl 
Pipe Rack Offered: CST98WS and Axton CST98WS w/ ATE CST98W6 

Pipe Rae• Custom Pipe Rack 
Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty: Service Body 5 Years , 12 Months 5 Yr. Limited 

Pipe Rack 1 Yr. 

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty Axton True• Axton Truck Axton Truck 
Service Provider Facility Name: Equipment Equipment Equipment 

Utility Body and Pipe Rack Warranty 4844 Whirlwind, San 4844 Whirlwind, San 4844 Whirlwind, San 
Service Provider Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78217 Antonio, TX 78217 Antonio, TX 78217 

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days 135-160 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 12/22/18 
Last day order can be placed without 10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 10/10/18 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No 
date: 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/13/2018 1 of 11 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ , LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LO 10807 IH-1 0 West 4562 I H-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

2 1 Ton Extended Cab Utility Truck with 1 
Herbicide Tank: 
Price Each: $52,352.00 $51 ,721 .0C No Bid $53,472.00 No Bid No Bid 
Total: $52,352.00 $51,721 .0C $53,472.00 
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.5% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $52,135.20 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 Ram 3500 Crew 2018 or 2019 Ford 2018 Ram 3500 Crew 
Offered: Cab 4X4 F350 Super Cab 4X4 Cab (Full 4 Dr.) 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins Diesel 6. 7L 6. 7L, VS Ford Diesel Cummins 1-6 Turbo 
(Include SAE net HP): 1-6, 385 HP 450 H.P. Diesel 385 hp 

' Transmission Offered: 6-SPD Auto Aisin 6 Speed Fore Aisen AS69 RC Auto 
AS69RC HD Automatic 

Transmission 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 36 Months or 36,00C 3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Bumper to Bumper 5 Miles Base Warranty Yr./100,000 mile 
Year/100,000 motor limited 

Powertrain powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Cente, Any Ram Truck 
Facility Name: Dealer 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 10807 IH-10 West, 4562 IH-10 East, San Any Ram Truck 
Facility Address: San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78219 Dealer 

78230 
Year, Make & Model of Herbicide Tank 2018 Northstar Model Northstar Skid 2018 Stahl 
offered: #268170 Sprayer Model CST98WS Body, 

#26817( Northstar Skid 
Sprayer#268170, 200 

cal 
Herbicide Tank Warranty: 2Yr. 12 Months 2 Yr. Commercial 

Limited 

Herbicide Tank Warranty Service Provider Northern Tool and Axton Trucl Axton Truck 
Facility Name: Equipment Equipmen Equipment 

Herbicide Tank Warranty Service Provider 2505 NW Loop 410, 4844 Whirlwind, San 4844 Whirlwind, San 
Facility Address: San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78217 Antonio, TX 78217 

78230 
Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Day, 135-160 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2011 12/22/18 

Last day order can be placed without 10/1/2018 June 30, 2011 10/10/18 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No N< No 
date: 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/13/2018 2 of 11 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 I H-1 O East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 1 O East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

3 1 Ton Regular Cab 4x4 Long bed with 1 
Toolbox: 
Price Each: $37,241.00 $39,414.00 No Bid $37,711.00 No Bid $44,387.00 
Total : $37,241.00 $39,414.00 $37,711.00 $44,387.00 
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $36,768.23 I 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid 1.3% 7.2% 
and local bid: 
Price Differential $472.77 $2,645.78 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Ram 3500 Reg. Cab 2018 or 2019 Ford 2018 Ram 3500 2018 F-350 
Offered: 4X4 F350 R/C 4X4 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins Diesel 6.7L Ford 6.7L, VS Diesel Cummins 1-6 Turbo 6.2L Gasoline 
(Include SAE net HP): 1-6, 350 HP 450 H.P. Diesel ,. 370 hp 

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto Ford 6 Speed Ram 68RFE Auto 6 Speed Automatic 
68RFE Trans. Automatic 

Transmission 
Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 36 Months or 36,000 3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 3 Year , 36,000 Miles 

Bumper to Bumper 5 Miles Yr./100,000 mile 
Year/100,000 motor+ limited 

Powertrain powertrain 

Warranty Service Provider Faci lity Name: Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Any Ram Truck Red Mccombs 
Dealer 

Warranty Service Facility Address: 10807 I H-10 West, 4562 IH-10 East, San Any Ram Truck 8333 W. IH-10, San 
San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78219 Dealer Antonio, TX 78230 

78230 
Make & Model Toolbox Offered: Weatherguard 127-5- WEG-127-5-02 Weather Guard Weg 2018 American 

02 Weather Guard Cross 127-5-02 (Aluminum) 
Bed Toolbox - Black 

Aluminum Tread Plate 

Delivery: 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 100 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 12/22/18 Oct. 31 , 2018 
Last day order can be placed without 10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 10/10/18 "July 23, 2018 
missing cut-off date: 

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No No 
date: 

Prepared by Purchasing 4/13/2018 3 of 11 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ , LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LO 10807 IH-10 West 4562 I H-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 Wi lliam Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

4 1 Ton Four Full Door 4x4 Pickup Truck w 3 
Toolbox: NAS 
Price Each: $38,593.00 $43,112.00 $42,275.00 $40,214.00 No Bid $37,839.68 
Total : $115,779.00 $129,336.00 $126,825.00 $120,642.00 $113,519.04 

2.50% 
$117,625.95 

Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 Ram Crew Cab 2018 or 2019 Ford 2018 Chevrolet 1 Ton 2018 Ram 3500 2018 F-250 
Offered: 4X4 F350 Crew Cab 4X4 SRWCrewCab 

CK3543 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cumrnns Diesel 6. 7L 6. 7L, VS Ford Diesel GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP Currvnins 1-6 Turbo 6.2L 
(Include SAE net HP): 1-6, 385 HP 450 H.P. Turbo-Diesel Diesel ,. 370 hp 

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto 6 Speed Ford All ison 1000, 6 SPD Ram 68RFE Auto 6 Speed Automatic 
68RFE Trans. Automatic Automatic 

Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 36 Months or 36,000 3 yr. or 36,000K BTB, 3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 3 Year , 36,000 Miles 
Bumper to Bumper 5 Miles 5 Yr. or 100,000K Yr./100,000 mile 

Year/100,000 powertrain motor + limited 
PowP.rtrnin nowArtrain 

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Chevrolet, Gunn LTD Any Ram Truck Red McCombs 
Dealer 

Warranty Service Facility Address: 10807 IH-10 West, 4562 IH-10 East, San 16550 IH 35 N., Any Ram Truck 8333 W. IH-10, San 
San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78219 Selma, TX 78154 Dealer Antonio, TX 78230 

Make & Model Toolbox Offered: Weatherguard 127-5 WEG-127-5-02 RS-C63WAB Single Weather Guard Weg 2018 American 
02 Weather Black BLK Tread Wide FS 127-5-02 

Aluminum Tread Plate (See attached Quote) 
35943 

Delivery: 120-150 Days 120-150 Days 100 Days 120-150 Days 100 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 2018 Model 12/22/18 Oct. 31, 2018 

Last day order can be placed without 10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 10/10/18 July 23, 2018 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No, Add 2% $993.00 No No 
date: 2019 start up 3/29/1 8, 

production starts ... , o 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ. LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles. LLC. 

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 I H-1 0 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine. Converse, Schertz. 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

5 1 Ton Four Full Door 4x2 Propane Fueled 1 
Pickup Truck: NAS 
Price Each: No Bid $40,870.0C $49,148.00 No Bid No Bid $31 ,366.00 
Total: $40,870.0C $49,148.00 $31 ,366.00 
Year. Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 or 2019 Ford 2018 Chevrolet 2018 LK/B 6.2L 
Offered: F350 Crew Cab 4X2 CK35943 4X4 Crew (C.N.G.) F350 

Cab 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.2L Gas. VE GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP 6.2L (Compressed 
(Include SAE net HP): Engine. 385 H.P. T urb0-Diesel VB Natural Gas} 

Transmission Offered: Ford 6 Speed Allison 1000, 6 SPD 6 Speed Automatic 
Automatic Automatic 

Transmission Transmission 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 Months or 36,00C 3 yr. or 36,000K BTB. 3 Year . 36,000 Miles 

Mile! 5 Yr. or 100,000K 
powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Cente1 Chevrolet, Gunn LTD Red Mccombs Ford 
Facility Name: 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Provider Facility 4562 IH-10 East. San 16550 IH 35 N., 8333 W. IH-10, San 
Address: Antonio, TX 78219 Selma, TX 78154 Antonio. TX 78230 

Year, Make & Model Propane System 2018 Nat G LAEH-<l0 2018 LPG ICOM 2018 GNG Prep-Kit 
Offered: 0-<l0. 0-A 1 A 1-0-<l-40O System 57 Gallons (Ford) 

3.51 
Propane System Warranty: 12 Month, 2 Year Warranty 3 Year . 36,000 Miles 

Propane System Warranty Service Provider NatG NatG Red Mccombs Ford 
Facility Name: 

Propane System Warranty Service Provider 4562 I 10 East, San 16504 Aldine 8333 W . IH-10, San 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 782H Westfield, Houston, Antonio, TX 78230 

TX 77032 
Delivery: 120-150 Day, 120-130 Days 100 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: June 30, 20H 3/22/18 2018 Model October 31 , 2018 
Last day order can be placed without June 30, 20H 3/22/18 July 23, 2018 
missing cut~ff date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Ne No, Add 2% $993.00 No 
date: 2019 start up 3/29/18, 

production starts ~,,-... 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ , LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LO 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 Wi lliam Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-71 12 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

6 1 Ton Four Full Door Cab 4x4 Pickup Truck 1 
w/ Toolbox and Lift Gate: 
Price Each: $41 ,762.00 $45,436.00 $45,434.00 $42,849.00 No bid $48,813.24 
Total: $41 ,762.00 $45,436.00 $45,434.00 $42,849.00 $48,813.24 
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $41 ,777.78 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 Ram 3500 Cre'h 2018 or 2019 Ford 2018 Chevrolet 2018 Ram 3500 F-350 
Offered: Cab 4X4 F350 Crew Cab 4X4 CK35943 4X4 Crew 

Cab 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummns Diesel 6.7L Ford 6. 7L, VS Diesel GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP Cummins 1-6 Turbo 2018 6.0L, VS 
(Include SAE net HP): 1-6, 350 450 H.P. Turbo-Diesel VS Diesel,. 370 hp (385 H.P.) 

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto Ford 6 Speed Allison 1000, 6 SPD Ram 68RFE Auto 6 Speed Automatic 
68RFE Trans. Automatic Automatic 

Transmission Transmission 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 36 Month or 36,000 3 yr. or 36,000K BTB, 3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 3 Year, 36,000 Mi. 

Bumper to Bumper 5 Miles 5 Yr. or 100,000K Yr./100,000 mile 
Year/100,000 powertrain motor+ limited 

Powertrain powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Chevrolet, Gunn LTD Any Ram Truck 3 Year, 36,000 Mi. 
Facility Name: Dealer 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 10807 I H-10 West, 4562 I H-10 East, San 16550 IH 35 N., Any Ram Truck Red McCombs Ford 
Facility Address: San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78219 Selma, TX 78154 Dealer 

78230 
Make & Model of Toolbox offered Weatherguard 127-5 WEG-127-5-02 RS-C63AW Single Lid Weather Guard Weg American 

02 Weather Black Full Size White 127-5-02 
Aluminum Tread Plate 

Year, Make & Model of Lift Gate Offered: 2018 Maxon C2-60- Max-C2-60-1542 Tommy Gate TG- 2018 Maxon Max-c2- 2018 Waltco 
1542TP38 TP38 Maxon 1500 G2601542 TP38 60-1542 TP38 

lbs. Steel 

Lift Gate Warranty: 2 Yr. 12 Months 2 Years 2 years or 6,000 2 Year - Unlimited 
Cycles 

Lift Gate Warranty Service Provider Facility Axton True! Axton Truck Truck Fitters Axton Truck Waltco 
Name: Equipmen Equipment Equipment 

Lift Gate Warranty Service Provider Facility 4844 Whirtwind, San 4844 Whirtwind, San 2625 Broadway St. , 4844 Whirtwind, San 285 Northeast Ave., 
Address: Antonio, TX 78217 Antonio, TX 78217 San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78217 Tallmadge, Ohio 

78215 44278 
Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days 120-130 Days 125-150 Days 100 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 2018 Model 12/22/18 October 31 , 2018 

Last day order can be placed without 10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 3/22/18 10/10/18 July 23, 2018 
missing cut~ff date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No, Add 2% $993.00 Not Provided No 
date: 2019 start up 3/29/18, 

production starts 
6/19/18 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duly Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specially 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 I H-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

7 1 Ton 56" CA Utility Body Truck with 
Ladder Rack: 1 
Price Each: $42,736.00 $43,925.00 No Bid $43,995.00 No Bid No Bid 
Total: $42,736.00 $43,925.00 $43,995.00 
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50% 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $42,895.13 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis Ram 3500 Reg. Cab 2018 or 2019 2018 Ram 3500 
Offered: 4X2 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummns Diesel 6. 7L Ford 6.7L, VS Diesel Cummins 1-6 Turbo 
(Include SAE net HP): l-6, 350 Engine, 450 H.P. Diesel .. 370 hp 

Transmission Offered: Dodge 6-SPD Auto Ford 6 Speed Ram 68Rf'E Auto 
68RFE Trans. Automatic 

Transmission 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 36 Month or 36,000 3 Yr./36,000 Miles, 5 

Bumper to Bumper 5 Yr./100,000 mile 
Year/100,000 motor+ limited 

Powertrain powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranly Service Provider Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Any Ram Truck 
Facility Name: Dealer 

Cab & Chassis Warranly Service Provider 10807 I H-10 West, 4562 IH-10 East, San Any Ram Truck 
Facility Address: San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78219 Dealer 

78230 
Year, Make & Model of Ladder Body and Stahl 2055393 2018 Stahl 2018 Stahl 
Pipe Rael< Offered: CST98WS CST98WS Service CST98WS 

Body ATE-Custom 
Ladder Rack 

Utility Body & Ladder Rack Warranty: Service Body 5 Yrs .. 12 Months 5 Years Limited 
Axton Rack 1 Yr. 

Utilily Body & Ladder Rack Warranly Axton Trucj Axton Truck Axton Truck 
Service Provider Facilily Name: Equipment Equipment Equipment 

Utilily Body and Ladder Rack Warranty 4844 Whirlwind, San 4844 Whirlwind, San 4844 Whirlwind, San 
Service Provider Facilily Address: Antonio, TX 78217 Antonio, TX 78217 Antonio, TX 78217 

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days 140-160 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 10/11/2018 June 30, 2018 12/22/18 

Last day order can be placed without 10/1/2018 June 30, 2018 10/10/18 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No No 
date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine OCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehictes, LLC. 

6100009903 LO 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

8 1 Ton 84" Cab to Axle ORW 4x2 With 2 
Traffic Utility Body: 

Price Each: No Bid $60,473.0C No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Total: $120,946.0C 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 or 2019 Ford 
Offered: F350 RIC 4X2 Cat 

Chassi, 

Specific Make & MQdel of Engine Offered Ford 6.7L, VS Diesel 
(lnctude SAE net HP): 330 H.P. 

Transmission Offered: Ford 6 Speec 
Automatic 

Transmission 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 Months or 36,00C 

Mile, 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Cante, 
Facility Name: 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH-10 East, San 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78219 

Year, Make & Model of Utility Body Offered: UTEC model UT11 
576 TF 

Utility Body Warranty: 12 Months 

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider UTEC 
Facility Name: 

Utility Body Warranty Service Provider 5860 Pfiei l Road, 
Faci lity Address: Schertz, TX 78154 

Delivery: 120-150 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: June 30, 2018 

Last day order can be placed without June 30, 2018 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No 
date: 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet. LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 I H-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1 500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-41 0-7541 210-380-6772 

9 1 Ton 84" CA High Side Body Truck with 1 
Lift Gate: NAS 
Price Each: No Bid $46, 138.0C $45,709.00 No Bid No Bid $43,353.00 
Total: $46,138.0C $45,709.00 $43,353.00 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 or 2019 Ford Chevrolet CC36403 2018 F350 
Offered: 1350 Cab Chassi, 2WD, 84 CA 2WD 

Reg. Cab 4X2 Diesel 

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Ford 6.7L, V8 Diesel GM L5P 6.6L, 445 HP Ford 8 Cylinder 
(Include SAE net HP): 330 H.P. Turbo-Diesel VS (385 HP) Diesel 

Transmission Offered: Ford 6 Speed All ison 1000, 6 SPD 6 Speed Automatic 
Automatic Automatic Trans 

Transmission 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 36 Month or 36,000 3 yr. or 36,000K BTB, 3 Year , 36,000 Miles 

Mile, 5 Yr. or 100,000K 
powertrain 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center Chevrolet, Gunn LTD Red Mccombs 
Facility Name: 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 IH-10 East, San 16550 IH 35 N., 8333 W. IH-10, San 
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78219 Selma, TX 78154 Antonio, TX 78230 

Year, Make & Model of High Side Body & 2018 Reading H-12-D 2018 TN-1689 7843L 2018 Waltco 
Lift Gate offered: HD Platform, G2 92 

1650 TP41 Tommy 
Gate 

High Side Body & Lift Gate Warranty: 12 Months Limestone Non 2 Years 
Skirted 14x97 84 CA, 

tommy gate 
G2921650 TP41 

High Side Body & Lift Gate Warranty Cobalt Truck Truck Fitters Waltco 
Service Provider Facility Name: Equipment 

High Side Body & Lift Gate Warranty 11218 IH-10 East. 2625 Broadway St. , 285 Northeast Ave .. 
Service Provider Facility Address: Converse, TX 78109 San Antonio, TX Tallmadge, Ohio 

78215 44278 
Delivery: 120-150 Days 120 Days 100 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: June 30, 2018 Done 2018 October 31 , 2018 

(2/22/2018) 
Last day order can be placed without June 30, 2018 2/22/2018 Done July 23, 2018 
missing cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No 2019 Orders start up No 
date: is 3/29118, production 

starts 619/2018 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolet, LTD Grapevine OCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 I H-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

10 1 Ton Full Four Door 60" CA ORW 4x2 9ft 1 
Flatbed Truck with hinged drop down sides 
and Lift Gate: 
Price Each: $44,953.00 $50,484.00 No bid $44,124.0C No Bid $46,396.56 
Total : $44,953.00 $50,484.00 $44,124.00 $46,396.56 
Prompt Payment Discount: 2.50¾ 
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: $43,020.9C 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid 4.5% 17.3% 
and local bid: 
Price Differential: $1 ,932.10 $7,463.10 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 Ram 350 Crew 2018 or 2019 Ford 2018 Ram 3500 Ford F-350 
Offered: Cab Chassis 60 CA F350 Crew Cab, Cab Chassis 

4X? r.h::1i:.~i~ 4X? 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins Diesel 6. 7L Ford 6. 7L, VS Diesel Cummins 1-6 Turbo 6.0L VS (385 H.P.) 
/Include SAE net HP\: 1-6. 325 330 H.P. Diesel 325 ho 
Transmission Offered: 6-SPD Auto Aisin Ford 6 Speed Aisen AS69 RC Auto 6 Speed Automatic 

Automatic 
Tr;.1n!=tmi""ion 

Cab & Chassis Warranty: 3 Years/36,000 Miles 36 Month or 36,000 3 Yr.136,000 Miles, 5 3 Year , 36,000 Miles 
Bumper to Bumper 5 Miles Yr.1100,000 mile 

Year/100,000 motor + limited 
Pn,,.,~rfr:::.in nnwortr-:::.in 

Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Ancira Dodge Grande Truck Center Any Ram Truck 3 Year , 36,000 Miles 
Facilitv Name: Deale, 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 10807 I H-10 West, 4562 IH-10 East, San Any Ram Truck Red Mccombs Ford, 
Facility Address: San Antonio, TX Antonio, TX 78219 Deale, 8333 W. IH-10, San 

7Rno Antonio TX 7R?30 
Year, Make & Model of Flatbed wl Drop 2018 Flatbed, Tommy 2018 Reading Model 2018 Axton Custom, 2018 Enoven 
Sides & Lift Gate offered: Gate Model # G2-92- H-9-d HD Platform, Maxa G2-92-1650 

1650TP41 Tommy Gate G2 92- TP41 
1Rc;n TP41 

Flatbed wl Drop Sides & Lift Gate Axton Bed 1 Yr., 12 Months 2 Yr. Palfinger 
Warrantv: Tommv aate 2 Yrs. 
Flatbed wl Drop Sides & Lift Gate Warranty Axton Truck Cobalt Truck Axton True! Lifetime (Limited) 
Service Provider Facilitv Name: Eauioment Eauioment Eauiomen 
Flatbed wl Drop Sides & Lift Gate Warranty 4844 Whirlwind, San 11218 IH-10 East, 4844 Whirlwind, San 15939 Piuma Ave., 
Service Provider Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78217 Converse, TX 78109 Antonio, TX 78217 Cerritos, CA 

Delivery: 120-150 days 120-150 Days 125-150 Days 100 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: 1011112018 June 30, 2018 12122118 October 31 , 2018 
Last day order can be placed without 101112018 June 30, 2018 10110118 July 23, 2018 
missina cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No Ne No ,~-·-· 
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: February 28, 2018 
Local Local Local Non-Local Local Non-Local 

For: Purchase of Medium Duty Trucks Ancira Motor Grande Truck Center Gunn Chevrolel, LTD Grapevine DCJ, LLC. Rush Truck Center Rolltechs Specialty 
Company Vehicles, LLC. 

6100009903 LD 10807 IH-10 West 4562 IH-10 East 16550 IH 35 N. 2601 William Tate 8922 IH 10 East 7451 FM 3009 

Item Description QTY San Antonio, San Antonio, Selma, Grapevine, Converse, Schertz, 
TX 78230 TX 78219 TX 78154 TX 76051 TX 78109 TX 78154 
210-558-1500 210-666-7112 210-599-5000 817-410-7541 210-380-6772 

11 Class 514,001-16,000 GVW Cabover 14' 2 
Box Truck with Utt Gate: 
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54,481.43 No Bid 
Total : $108,962.86 
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2018 Hino 
Offered: 
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered JO5E-TP, 210 HP 
/Include SAE net HP\: 
Transmission Offered: Aisin A465, 6 Speed 

Auto 
Cab & Chassis Warranty: 5 Yearl200,000 Miles 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Rush Truck Center 
Facilitv Name: 
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 8922 I.H. 10 East, 
Facilitv Address: Converse. TX 78109 
Year, Make & Model of 14 Ft. Box & Utt 2018 Morgan Dry Van 
Gate offered: 
14 Ft. Box & Lift Gate Warranty: 1 Year 
14 Ft. Box & Lift Gate Warranty Service W&B Service 
Provider Facilitv Name: 
14 Ft. Box & Utt Gate Warranty Service 8803 IH 10 East, 
Provider Facilitv Address: Converse. TX 78109 
Delivery: 120 Days 
Production Cut-off Date: NI~ 
Last day order can be placed without NI~ 
missina cut-off date: 
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes 
date: 

12 Deleted: 

Payment Terms: Net30 Net 30 Net 30 2-112% Net 10 Days Net30 Net 30 

Total : $369114.00 $603 390.00 $267 116.00 <377 921.00 •108 962.86 •281 438.28 
Tota• Award: •21180900 $213 537 00 $45 709 00 •44124 00 •108 962 86 

Item: 12 was deleted and will be rebid at a tater date. 

,, 
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