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ORDINANCE 20 18-05-31-0386

APPROVING THE PURCHASE OF FITNESS EQUIPMENT FOR
VARIOUS SAN ANTONIO FIRE DEPARTMENT FACILITIES FROM
WHEELS AND FITNESS IN MOTION OF SOUTH TEXAS, LLC DBA
FITNESS IN MOTION AND BSN SPORTS FOR A TOTAL COST OF
$167,028.71, FUNDED FROM THE GENERAL FUND.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with fitness equipment for
41 San Antonio Fire Department (SAFD) facilities; and

WHEREAS, the new equipment will replace outdated, damaged or broken equipment which
first responders use to better prepare for the daily physical demands of their job duties; and

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by BSN Sports (Items 4, 57 and 111) failed to meet the City’s
specifications and/or requirements; and

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Wheels and Fitness in Motion of South Texas, LLC DBA
Fitness in Motion (Item 95), a City Business as defined by the City’s Local Preference Program,
is within 3 percent of the lowest bid, which was from BSN Sports, a bidder which is not a City
Business; and

WHEREAS, the low responsive bids were submitted by Fitness in Motion (Items 1-15, 35-61,
and 64-112) for a total cost of $160,821.31 and BSN Sports (Items 16-34, 62 and 63) for a total
cost of $6,207.40; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low responsive bids from Fitness in Motion (Items 1-15, 35-61, and 64-112)
and BSN Sports (Items 16-34, 62 and 63) to provide the City of San Antonio with fitness
equipment for SAFD for a total cost of $167,028.71 are hereby accepted, subject to and
contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates
and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the
Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted by BSN Sports (Items 4, 57
and 111) for fitness equipment for SAFD failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or
requirements.

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that, pursuant to the City’s Local Preference
Program, passed by ordinance number 2013-03-21-0167 and as amended by ordinance number
2014-11-13-0923, Fitness in Motion, a City Business, is entitled to award of item 95.



T
05/31/18
Item No. 8

SECTION 4. Funding for this ordinance in the amount up to $167,028.71 is available in Fund
11001001, Cost Center 2015090001, and General Ledger 5501055, as part of the Fiscal Year
2018 Budget.

SECTION 5. Payments not to exceed the budgeted amounts are authorized to Fitness in Motion
and BSN Sports and should be encumbered with purchase orders.

SECTION 6. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 7. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 31* day of May, 2018.

M A Y O R
Ron Nirenberg

ATT T APPROVED AS TO FORM:

//@7//””—/

Vacek Clty Clerk/ Cindrew 'Segovia, City Attorney
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Agenda Item: 8 (in consent vote: 4,6,7,8,9, 10, 12, 13A, 13B, 14, 15, 16, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 27)
Date: 05/31/2018
Time: 09:52:18 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve
Description: Ordinance approving the purchase of fitness equipment for various San Antonio Fire Department
facilities from Wheels and Fitness in Motion of South Texas, LLC dba Fitness In Motion and BSN
Sports for a total cost of $167,028.71, funded from the FY 2018 General Fund Budget. [Ben Gorzell,
Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]
Result: Passed
Voter Group P s Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Treviiio District 1 X
William Cruz Shaw District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X X
Clayton H. Perry District 10 X

https://cosaweb1/voteinterface/default.aspx 5/31/2018
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Exhibit I



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: March 9, 2018
For: SAFD-PURCHASE OF FITNESS EQUIPMENT Local Non-Local
Fitness In Motion BSN Sports
6100009950 SC 8522 Broadway, Ste. 101 |PO Box 7726
San Antonio, TX Dallas, TX
o 78217 75209
Item Description Est. Qty [710-828-4542 800-527-7510
1 CSM 725 TUFF STUFF SMITH MACHINE WITH HI 4
LO WEIGHT STACKS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $4,382.61 No Bid
Total Price $17,530.44,
2 C3X MATRIX CLIMBMILL, OR APPROVED EQUAL 15
Unit Price $4,931.84 No Bid
Total Price $73,977.60
3 1.2 ROGUE SLED, OR APPROVED EQUAL 12
Unit Price $420.33 No Bid
Total Price $5,043.96
4 BSTBR1550 BODY SOLID BATTLE ROPE 50ft, OR 2 NAS
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $152.44 $79.98
Total Price $304.88 $159.96
5 RA0604 BLBR ROGUE BAR 2.0 BLACK SHAFT W 10
BRIGHT SLEEVES 48.53Ibs 28.5 mm, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $410.24 No Bid
Total Price $4,102.40
6 RA0584 BLBR ROGUE BELLA BAR 33 Ibs 25mm, 2
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price 346.35) No Bid
Total Price $692.70
7 RA1077 BEBR ROGUE CURL BAR BLACK WITH 1
ZINC SLEEVES, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $313.84 No Bid
Total Price $313.84
8 2.5LB ROGUE BLACK PLATES HG 2.0 PAIR , OR 1
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $10.09 No Bid
Total Price $10.09
9 5LB ROGUE BLACK PLATES HG 2.0 PAIR, OR 5
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $20.18, No Bid
Total Price $100.90
10 10LB ROGUE BUMPER PLATES HG 2.0 PAIR, OR 10
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $73.98 No Bid
Total Price $739.80
11 15LB ROGUE BUMPER PLATES HG 2.0 PAIR, OR 3

APPROVED EQUAL
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Unit Price $80.70 No Bid
Total Price $242.10
12 25LB ROGUE BUMPER PLATES HG 2.0 PAIR, OR 9
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $100.88 No Bid
Total Price $907.92
13 35LB ROGUE BUMPER PLATES HG 2.0 PAIR, OR 8
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $141.23 No Bid
Total Price $1,129.84
14 45L.B ROGUE BUMPER PLATES HG 2.0 PAIR, OR 15
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $181.58 No Bid
Total Price $2,723.70
15 OBO0O0O2 ROGUE BARBELL COLLAR PAIRS, OR 9
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $82.94 No Bid
Total Price $746.46
16 TSD 10LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS 1
10LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $43.04 $19.82
Total Price $43.04 $19.82
17 TSD 15LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS 1
15LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $64.56 $27.96
Total Price $64.56 $27.96|
18 TSD 20LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS 1
20LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $86.08 $37.96
Total Price $86.08 $37.96)
19 TSD 25LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS 1
25LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $107.60 $47.38
Total Price $107.6 $47.38]
20 TSD 30LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS 2
30LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $129.12 $55.96
Total Price $258.24 $111.92
21 TSD 35LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS 1
35LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $150.65 $65.96
Total Price $150.65 $65.96]
22 TSD 40LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS 1
40LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $172.17 $73.96
Total Price $172.17 $73.96]
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23

24

25

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

33

34

TSD 45LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
45LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 50LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
50LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 55LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
55LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 60LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
60LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 65LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS

65LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 70LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
70LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 75LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
75LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 80LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
80LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 85LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
85LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 90LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
90LBS. OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 95LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELLPAIRS
95LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 100LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
100LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

$193.69
$193.69

$215.21
$215.21

$236.73
$473.46

$258.25
$774.75

$279.77|
$559.54]

$301.29
$903.87

$322.81
$1,291.24

$344.33
$1,721.65

$365.85
$1,097.55

$387.37
$1,549.48

$408.89|
$1,226.67|

$430.42
$860.84

$83.96
$83.96)

$92.96
$92.96

$101.36
$202.72

$110.96
$332.8

$119.96
$239.92

$129.96
$389.88

$139.96
$559.84

$147.96
$739.80

$239.96
$719.88]

$257.96
$1,031.84

$273.96
$821.88

$285.96
$571.92
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35

36

37

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

TSD 105LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
105LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price
Total Price

TSD 110LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
110LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 115LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
115LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TSD 120LB TROY Rubber HEX DUMBELL PAIRS
120LBS, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

ASSAULT FITNESS AIR BIKES, OR APPROVED

EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

P4 RA0172 ROGUE PULL UP BARS, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RA0116 ROGUE MONSTER MATADOR DIP
ATTACHMENT, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RA6043 ROGUE 2.0 ADJUSTABLE BENCH, OR

APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

GSMB 015 TROY SLAM BALL 15lb, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

GSMB 020 TROY SLAM BALL 20lb, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

GSMB 025 TROY SLAM BALL 25lb, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

GSMB 030 TROY SLAM BALL 30LB, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

16

19

$451.94
$451.94

$473.46
$473.46

$494.98
$494.98

$516.50)
$516.50]

$1,007.78
$16,124.48

$225.30]
$225.30)

$223.61
$1,118.05

$836.45
$1,672.90

$40.35
$161.40

$47.53,
$47.53

$57.39P

$1,090.41

$63.67|

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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47

48

49

50

51

52

53

54

55

56

57

Total Price

GSMB 040 TROY SLAM BALL 40LB, OR

APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

GSMB 050 TROY SLAM BALL 50LB, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

ROGUE SLAM BALL 70LB, OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

AQOT56 TROY TRAP BAR, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price
Total Price

BSTDMB25 BODY SOLID MED BALL 25LBS, OR
APPROVED
Unit Price

Total Price

25-75lbs BRUTE FORCE ATHLETE SAND BAG
KIT, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

T PLYO FOAM PLYO BOX 3in 1, 16, 20, 24", OR
APPROVED
Unit Price

Total Price

RA0368 MEDIUM FILLER BAG (25"x6.5"), OR

APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RXD TOMAHAWK SANDBAG SHELL OUTER, OR
APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

IP0179-25-2 ROGUE 6-SHOOTER URETHANE
OLYMPIC GRIP PLATES - 45 Ib -PAIR, OR
APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

1P0179-45-2 ROGUE 6-SHOOTER URETHANE
OLYMPIC GRIP PLATES - 25 Ib -PAIR, OR
APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

10

$318.35

$79.81
$79.81

$107.6
$322.8

$300.95
$902.85

$206.24
$618.72

$22.42
$44.84

$218.57
$218.57

$1,067.07
$1,067.07|

$92.47
$924.70

$67.25
$336.25

$238.75
$238.75

$154.68
$154.68

NAS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$219.98
$659.94

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$239.96
$239.96

$133.96
$133.96
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58

59

60

61

62

63

64

65

66

67

68

AD0114 ROGUE HG COLLAR 2.0, OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RF0639-M ROGUE PB-2M PEG BOARD WITH
METAL NAME PLATE MAPLE, OR APPROVED
EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

RA0798 ROGUE SPARE PEG BOARD DOWELS,
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

FP0001-KIT ROGUE SLED HARNESS w/ 9" SLED
STRAP, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

RA0723 ROGUE WRIST ROLLER, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

PD0002 ROGUE 36" FOAM ROLLER, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

LXBBR ROGUE LACROSSE BALL, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TS00003 ROGUE ORIGINAL STICK, OR

APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

TS00007 ROGUE STANDARD STICK KIT, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

PR0003-3X8 ROGUE MADE IN THE USA BANNER
- 3X8', OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

MTT003 ROGUE MUTT BAR - 44LBS, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

10

$61.37] No Bid
$613.70]
$462.36] No Bid
$462.36
$14.29 No Bid
$14.29
$18.4 No Bid
$36.9
$110.8 $18.98
$110.88] $18.98
$33.63 $15.98,
$33.63 $15.98
$35.31 No Bid
$176.55]
$79.86 No Bid
$79.86
$147.96 No Bid
$147.96
$65.57 No Bid
$65.57
$179.06 No Bid

$179.06
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69 RF00640 ROGUE WORM, OR APPROVED EQUAL "
Unit Price $1,597.24] No Bid
Total Price $1,597.24

70 1.5 ROGUE 20' CLIMBING ROPE, OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Unit Price $179.06 No Bid
Total Price $179.06

71 RA0368 ROGUE FARMERS WALK HANDLES, OR
APPROVED
Unit Price $311.04 No Bid
Total Price $933.12

72 TOZ 47B TROY OLYMPIC STYLE FRENCH CURL
BAR (PREACHER BAR/EZ CURL BAR) , OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $116.57 No Bid
Total Price $116.57|

73 GOT 34 TROY OLYMPIC STYLE TRICEPS BAR,
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $75.32 No Bid
Total Price $150.64

74 TR1200 DT 3 LIFE SPAN WORKPLACE
TREADMILLS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $1,007.78 No Bid
Total Price $2,015.56

75 RA 1523 ROGUE DEADLIFT BAR JACK, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $277.42 No Bid
Total Price $277.42

76 RA 1363 ROGUE Vertical Bar Hanger TRIPLE
BAR, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $54.64 No Bid
Total Price $54.64

77 BSTWV40 BODY SOLID WEIGHTED VESTS, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $43.04 No Bid
Total Price $344.32

78 BSTBR1530 BODY SOLID BATTLE ROPE 30ft, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $88.55 No Bid
Total Price $177.10

79 GHD 2.0 ROGUE ABRAM GHD 2.0, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $1,088.37, No Bid
Total Price $5,441.85
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80

81

82

83

84

85

86

87

88

89

90

o1

T OPT TROY OLYMPIC PLATE TREES, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

AB10 ROGUE AB MATS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price
Total Price

TTVB S TROY V SHAPED TRICEP PRESS DOWN
BAR WITH SWIVEL, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

CHE 340 TUFF STUFF 45 DEGREE BACK
HYPEREXTENSION BENCH, OR APPROVED

EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RA0524 ROGUE 9 BAR HOLDER, OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

MODEL D CONCEPT 2 ROWER, OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RA0368 ROGUE PLYO BOX 3in 1, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

LXBBR10 ROGUE LACROSS BALLS 10 PACK,

OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

15 ROGUE RESISTANCE STRAPS - ORANGE,

OR
Unit Price

Total Price

30 ROGUE RESISTANCE STRAPS - RED, OR

APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

50 ROGUE RESISTANCE STRAPS - BLUE, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

65 ROGUE RESISTANCE STRAPS - GREEN, OR
APPROVED EQUAL

Unit Price

Total Price

$116.57
$582.85)

$55.39
$110.78

$39.45
$39.45

$570.52
$570.52

$208.48|
$625.44

$1,071.55
$4,286.20

$226.42
$452.84

$50.44
$50.44

$57.16
$57.16

$70.62
$70.62

$85.19
$85.19

$118.81
$118.81

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid|

No Bid
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92

93

94

95

96

97

98

99

100

101

102

100 ROGUE RESISTANCE STRAPS - BLACK, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

WALL TARGET ROGUE MONSTER BOLT
TOGETHER WALL TARGET, OR APPROVED

EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RF0712P ROGUE RIG MOUNT SPEED BAG, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

4241 EVERLAST STANDARD LEATHER SPEED
BAG, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and
local bid
Price Differential

ALDB TROY DIP BELT, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price
Total Price

JCUPS ROGUE PAIR MONSTER, OR APPROVED
EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RA0457 ROGUE MONSTER SINGLE BAR
HOLDERS, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

RA1455 ROGUE MONSTER MASS STORAGE
HANGERS SINGLE, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

HBOO17 ROGUE VOODOO FLOSS BANDS, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

PWB 14 TROY WALL BALLS 14LBS, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

PAD011 CRASH MAT RED 3 FOLD W LOGO, OR
APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price

Total Price

$165.89
$165.89

$134.50
$134.50

$443.87,
$443.87

$29.41
$29.41
1.48%

$0.43]

$49.32
$49.32

$147.96)
$295.92

$100.88
$201.76

$28.58,
$28.58

$40.35
$40.35

$94.15
$94.15

$415.84]
$415.84]

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$28.98
$28.98

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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103 RF0320 KB ROGUE STORAGE ADD ON 2 TIER - 1
TYPE 43, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $387.82 No Bid
Total Price $387.82
104 RA 0487 ROGUE FAT BOY SLED, OR APPROVED 5
EQUAL
Unit Price $192.51 No Bid
Total Price $962.55|
105 RF0366 ROGUE MULTI GRIP CROSSMEMBER, 1
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $221.93 No Bid
Total Price $221.93
106 BSTRT1 BODY SOLID RESISTANCE BANDS 2
VERY LIGHT, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $17.93 No Bid
Total Price $35.86/
107 BSTRT2 BODY SOLID RESISTANCE BANDS 2
GREEN LIGHT, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $21.52 No Bid
Total Price $43.04
108 BSTRT3 BODY SOLID RESISTANCE BANDS RED 2
MEDIUM, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $27.80 No Bid
Total Price $55.60
109 BSTRT4 BODY SOLID RESISTANCE BANDS 2
BLUE HEAVY, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $31.38 No Bid
Total Price $62.76
110 BSTRT5 PRISM RESISTANCE BANDS VERY 2 No Bid
HVY, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $35.87
Total Price $71.74
111 AD0061 ROGUE BEARING SPEED ROPE - SR1, 18 NAS
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $35.31 $5.98
Total Price $635.58 $107.64
112 RF0390 ROGUE PLATE STORAGE CHANNEL 2 1
PACK, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Unit Price $159.72 No Bid
Total Price $159.72
Delivery 30 Days
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Total Award $160,821.31| $6,207.40)




