Opened: May 30, 2018
For: Purchase of Landscaping Equipment Local - Alt Bid Local Local Non-Local Local
Holt Texas, LTD. Holt Texas, LTD. DeWinne Equipment Moridge Manufacturing, |H&V Equipment
Company Inc. Services
6100010242 IM  [5665 Southeast Loop |5665 Southeast Loop (11002 Bandera Rd. 107 S Old Hwy 81 3307 S.E. Loop 410
410 410
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Moundridge, San Antonio,
TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78250 KS 67107 TX 78222
Iltem Description Qty [210-648-1111 210-648-1111 210-684-5296
1A 4X4 Utility Tractor 1
Price Each $80,302.45 $88,138.93
Total Price $80,302.45 $88,138.93
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $80,302.45 $88,138.93
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 MASSEY 2018, Challenger No Bid No Bid No Bid
FERGUSON MT465E
MF5712SL
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) AGCO POWER 4 cyll AGCO POWER 4 cyl
4.4L (115HP) 4.9L (115 HP)
Warranty 24 MONTH/2000 24 MONTH/2000
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name HOLT CAT HOLT CAT
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 5665 SE LOOP 410, 5665 SE LOOP 410,
SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX
78222 78222
Production Cut-Off Date September 2018 September 2018
Last Day to Place Order September 30, 2018 September 30, 2018
Firm Pricing Date YES YES
Delivery Days 120 120
1B 20’ Ft Batwing Mower Deck 1 NAS
Price Each $22,750.00 $22,750.00 $19,902.00
Total Price $22,750.00 $22,750.00 $19,902.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 0.00% 0.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $22,750.00 $22,750.00 $19,902.00
Year, Make & Model Offered 2018 WOODS 2018 WOODS No Bid No Bid 2018 Modern 20
BW240XHD BW240XHD Predator
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Not specified Not specified N/A

Warranty

Warranty Service Provider Name
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address

Production Cut-Off Date
Last Day to Place Order
Firm Pricing Date
Delivery Days

6 year gearbox

HOLT CAT

5665 SE LOOP 410
SAN ANTONIO, TX
78222

September 2018
September 30, 2018
YES

120

6 year gearbox

HOLT CAT

5665 SE LOOP 410
SAN ANTONIO, TX
78222

September 2018
September 30, 2018
YES

120

5 year on gearbox, 10
year on deck Rust-thru
H&V Equipment

3307 S.E. Loop 410
San Antonio, Tx 78222

None
8/31/2018

yes thru 8/31/18
30

*see literature &
exceptions list




Opened:

May 30, 2018

For: Purchase of Landscaping Equipment Local - Alt Bid Local Local Non-Local Local
Holt Texas, LTD. Holt Texas, LTD. DeWinne Equipment Moridge Manufacturing, |H&V Equipment
Company Inc. Services
6100010242 IM  [5665 Southeast Loop |5665 Southeast Loop (11002 Bandera Rd. 107 S Old Hwy 81 3307 S.E. Loop 410
410 410
San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, Moundridge, San Antonio,
TX 78222 TX 78222 TX 78250 KS 67107 TX 78222
Iltem Description Qty [210-648-1111 210-648-1111 210-684-5296
2 72" Zero Turn Mowers 2 NAS
Price Each $22,950.00 $14,149.50
Total Price $45,900.00 $28,299.00
Prompt Payment Discount 0.00% 1.00%
Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount $45,900.00 $28,016.01
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Year, Make & Model Offered No Bid No Bid 2018 Exmark 2018 Grasshopper No Bid
LZS88CDYM724W0 400D/72
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) YANMAR 3TNV88C,[[Kubota 3-cylinder, liquid
37HP diesellfcooled diesel engine, 77
cu. in. (1261 cc), 25HP
Warranty 5 years or 2000 hours, 3-year limited
2 years no hour limit commercial warranty
with no hour limitation;
2 years parts & labor,
3rd year parts only
Warranty Service Provider Name Dewinne Equipment DeWinne Equipment
Company,
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address 11002 Bandera Rd.,||11002 Bandera Rd. San
San Antonio, TX 78250 Antonio, Tx 78250
Production Cut-Off Date 10/31/2018 Not applicable
Last Day to Place Order 10/31/2018 Not applicable
Firm Pricing Date No Not applicable
Delivery Days 45 30
3 DELETED 1
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 1.0% 10 days Net 30
Total Award $103,052.45 $45,900.00

NAS Item 1B (H&V Equipment Services, Inc.) required combined equipment
purchase. Only offered mower deck.

NAS Item 2 (Moridge Manufacturing, Inc.) Did not meet minimum requirements for

Horse power, ground speed, tire size.

Item 3 is deleted and will be re-bid at a later date.




	FINAL

