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ORDINANCE  2018-08-02-0541

APPROVING THE PURCHASE OF ASPHALT PAVING EQUIPMENT
AND ONE FLATBED TRUCK FOR THE TRANSPORTATION AND
CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS DEPARTMENT FROM ASSOCIATED
SUPPLY COMPANY, INC. DBA ASCO EQUIPMENT CO., COOPER
EQUIPMENT COMPANY, DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH
TEXAS, LLC, GRANDE TRUCK CENTER, HOLT TEXAS, LTD. AND
NUECES FARM CENTER, INC. DBA NUECES POWER EQUIPMENT
FOR A TOTAL COST OF $1,389,689.50, FUNDED FROM THE FY 2018
EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND.

& & & & &

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio, Transportation and
Capital Improvements Department (TCI) with asphalt paving equipment; and

WHEREAS, the equipment will be used by TCI for pavement operations, including paving and
resurfacing streets and rights of way, and transporting aggregates, paving materials and heavy
equipment for construction and repair projects throughout the City; and

WHEREAS, the low bids were‘ submitted by Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba‘ASCO
Equipment Co. (Item 3), Cooper Equipment Company (Items 1 and 6), Doggett Freightliner of
South Texas, LLC (Item 4), Grande Truck Center (Item 7), Holt Texas, LTD. (Item 5) and
Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment (Item 2) for a total cost of
$1,389,689.50; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The low bids from Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba ASCO Equipment Co.,
Cooper Equipment Company, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC, Grande Truck Center,
Holt Texas, LTD. and Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment to provide the
City of San Antonio with asphalt paving equipment and one flatbed truck for a total cost of
$1,389,689.50 are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required
bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. The bid tabulation sheet is
attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are
available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $1,389,689.50 is available in Fund
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5701080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2018
Budget.

SECTION 3. Payments, not to exceed the budgeted amounts, are authorized to Cooper
Equipment Company the amount of $182,321.50, Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power
Equipment in the amount of $32,500.00, Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba, ASCO
Equipment in the amount of $888,860.00, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC in the
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amount of $171,597.00, Holt Texas, LTD. in the amount of $62,862.00 and Grande Truck Center
in the amount of $51,549.00 and should be encumbered with purchase orders.

SECTION 4. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Director
of Finance, City of San Antonio. The Director of Finance may, subject to concurrence by the
City Manager or the City Manager's designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP
Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 5. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 2™ day of August, 2018.

|

ATTEST: [\ APPROVED AS TO FORM:
(Mv Y P
Waee City Cler M Cxndrew ,Ségovia, City Attorney




Voting Results Interface

Agenda Item:

7 (in consent vote: 7,8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23,24 )

Date: 08/02/2018
Time: 09:26:28 AM
Vote Type: Motion to Approve ,
Description: Ordinance approving the purchase of asphalt paving equipment and one flatbed truck for the
Transportation and Capital Improvements Department from Associated Supply Company, Inc. dba
ASCO Equipment Co., Cooper Equipment Company, Doggett Freightliner of South Texas, LLC,
Grande Truck Center, Holt Texas, LTD. and Nueces Farm Center, Inc. dba Nueces Power Equipment
for a total cost of $1,389,689.50, funded from FY 2018 Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund.
[Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]
Result: Passed
Not ; ;
Voter Group P Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 x X
William Cruz Shaw District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldaia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X
Clayton H. Perry District 10 X
https://cosawebl/voteinterface/default.aspx 8/3/2018
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Exhibit I



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: May 18, 2018
Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Cooper Equipment  [Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply Doggett Freightliner |Holt Texas, LTD Grande Truck Center [Anderson Machinery |H&V Equipment RDO Equipment Co.
Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment Company, Inc. Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, |of South Texas, LLC Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100010201 LD |17474 Judson Road |4697 FM 1516 N. 2102 E. Slayton Rd. |8700 IH 10 East 5665 Southeast Loop |4562 IH-10 East 9415 NE Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 [19275N. IH 35
410
Item Description QTY [San Antonio, Converse, Lubbock, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132
210-657-5151 210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-277-4373 210-648-1111 210-666-7112
1 2 Ton Tandem Smooth Drum Vibratory 1
Roller:
Price Each: $33,832.48 $39,473.00 $36,000.00| No Bid $42,470.00 No Bid $45,491.00, No Bid $44,452.25
Total: $33,832.48] $39,473.00 $36,000.00| $42,470.00 $45,491.00, $44,452.25
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018 Dynapad| 2018 Hamm HD12VV| 2018 Case DV26C| Caterpillar CB24B, 2018 Bomag| 2018 Sakai SW354
CC1200Vv1 2018 BW120AD-5 DPF

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Address:

Kubota D1703-D1
(T4F), 25 HP|

1 year/2000 hours|

Cooper Equipment
Company, Inc|

17474 Judson Road,
San Antonio, TX|

Kubota D1703 24.8|
hp

1 yr, 1000 hours

Nueces Power|
Equipment

4697 FM 1516 North,
Converse, TX 78109

Yanmar 3TNV88,
30.6 HP

12 Months/Unlimited|
Hours
Associated Supply Co

Inc.

4146 IH 10 East,
San Antonio, Texas|

Caterpillar C1.5, 36.2
hp T4f

12 months/unlimited|
hours, total machine

Holt Cat

5665 S. E. Loop 410,
San Antonio, Texas|

Kubota D1803

Twelve (12) Months|
or 1000 hrs.,
whichever comes first|

Anderson Machinery|
Company, San|
Antonio|

9415 NE Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX

Kubota D1703-M-DI-
EFO03, (25 hp)

1 year full machine,
then 2nd + 3rd year of]
powertrain up to 3000

hours.
RDO Equipment Co.

19275 N. IH 35, New
Braunfels, TX 78132

78247 78219 78222

Delivery: 45-90 Days| 30-120 Days| 180 Days 175 Days| 30-90 days; 30-90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: 'December 30, 2018| 8/31/18 7-15-18| Unknown at this time| 10-31-18| 8/30/2018
Last day order can be placed without 12/30/18 8/30/18 7-15-18 Unknown at this time 10-24-18| 8/15/2018
missing cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No No| No Unknown No No|
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 18, 2018
Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Cooper Equipment  [Nueces Farm Center, [Associated Supply Doggett Freightliner [Holt Texas, LTD Grande Truck Center [Anderson Machinery |H&V Equipment RDO Equipment Co.
Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment Company, Inc. Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, [of South Texas, LLC Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100010201 LD |17474 Judson Road |4697 FM 1516 N. 2102 E. Slayton Rd. |8700 IH 10 East 5665 Southeast Loop (4562 IH-10 East 9415 NE Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 |19275N. IH 35
410
Item Description QTY [San Antonio, Converse, Lubbock, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132
210-657-5151 210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-277-4373 210-648-1111 210-666-7112
2 Trailer Mounted Compressor: 1
Price Each: No Bid| $32,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $32,500.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018 Doosan P250)|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered John Deere 4050ST,
(Include SAE net HP): 74 HP)
Warranty: 1 yr /2000 Hours|
whichever occurs firs!
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Nueces Power]
Equipment]
Warranty Service Provider Facility 4697 FM 1516 North,
Address: Converse, TX 78109
Delivery: 30 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: 8/31/18
Last day order can be placed without 8/31/18
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No|
date:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/12/2018 20f7



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 18, 2018
Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Cooper Equipment  [Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply Doggett Freightliner |Holt Texas, LTD Grande Truck Center |[Anderson Machinery [H&V Equipment RDO Equipment Co.
Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment Company, Inc. Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, |of South Texas, LLC Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100010201 LD (17474 Judson Road |4697 FM 1516 N. 2102 E. Slayton Rd. |8700 IH 10 East 5665 Southeast Loop (4562 |H-10 East 9415 NE Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 |19275N.IH 35
410
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, Converse, Lubbock, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132
210-657-5151 210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-277-4373 210-648-1111 210-666-7112
3 4 Wheel Drive Articulated Wheeled 7
Loader: NAS
Price Each: No Bid $138,944.00) $126,980.00 No Bid $133,346.00 No Bid No Bid $128,777.00 $130,774.99
Total: $972,608.00| $888,860.00 $933,422.00 $901,439.00 $915,424.93|
Percentage between lowest responsive 5.01% 1.42%
bid and local bid:
Price Differential: $44,562.00 $12,579.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE net HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility
Address:

2018 Hyundai|
HL940TM or 2019
Hyundai, HL940TM|
Cummins QSB 6.7.
156 HP)|

3 yrs or 3,000 Hours|
whichever occurs first]

Nueces Powerl|
Equipment|

4697 FM 1516 North,
Converse, TX 78109

2018 Case 621G|

FPT F4HF2613W,

3yr/3,000 hr Factory|
Warranty|

Associated Supply Coj
Inc.

4146 IH 10 East,

San Antonio, Texas|

2018 Caterpillar 926M

Cat C7.1 ACERT T4f
SAE J1349 148 hp,
1ISO 14396, 153 hp!

The spec do not
require SAE hp.
12 months/unlimited
hours, total machine

Holt Cat

5665 S. E. Loop 410,
San Antonio, Texas|

2018 Doosan
DL220-5 Wheel
Loader|

Doosan DLO06,

6 Cylinder, 160 HP

12 mo / 1500 Hours
full machine, 36 mo /|
5000 PT+Hyd

H&V Equipment
Services, Inc.

3307 S.E. Loop 410,
San Antonio, TX|

2018 John Deere
544K I

John Deere Powerl

Tech PVS6068,
(163 HP)

1 year full machine
warranty|
RDO Equipment Co.

19275 N. IH 35, New
Braunfels, TX 78132

78219 78222 78222
Delivery: 60-150 Days| 180 Days| 175 Days| 90-130 Days (ARO)| 90-120 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 8/30/18] 7-15-18 Unknown at this time| None 6/30/2018,
Last day order can be placed without 8/30/18| 7-15-18 Unknown at this time 8/31/2018 6/15/2018
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Noj No| Unknown Yes - an additional 60 No;
date: days|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 18, 2018
Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Cooper Equipment  [Nueces Farm Center, [Associated Supply Doggett Freightliner |Holt Texas, LTD Grande Truck Center [Anderson Machinery [H&V Equipment RDO Equipment Co.
Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment Company, Inc. Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, [of South Texas, LLC Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Power Equipment IASCO Equipment
6100010201 LD |17474 Judson Road (4697 FM 1516 N. 2102 E. Slayton Rd. |8700 IH 10 East 5665 Southeast Loop (4562 IH-10 East 9415 NE Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 |19275N.IH 35
410
Item Description QTY ([San Antonio, Converse, Lubbock, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132
210-657-5151 210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-277-4373 210-648-1111 210-666-7112
4 Single Cab Asphalt Distributor: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid| $171,597.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $171,597.00)
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2020 Freightliner
M2-106]
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Cummins B6.7, 260
(Include SAE net HP): HP/660 Tq
Warranty: 2 Years - Unlimited
Miles|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Doggett Freightliner|
of South Texas, LLC|
Warranty Service Provider Facility 8700 IH 10 East,
Address: Converse, TX 78109
Year, Make & Model of Asphalt Distributor 2018 ED Etynyre|
Body Offered: Centennial Distributol
Asphalt Distributor Body Warranty: 1 Year
Asphalt Distributor Body Warranty Service Cooper Equipmen
Provider Facility Name: Company, Inc|
Asphalt Distributor Body Warranty Service 17474 Judson Road,
Provider Facility Address: San Antonio, TX|
78247
Delivery: 210-330 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 01/01/2019
Last day order can be placed without 09/31/2018
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Yes|
date:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/12/2018 40f7




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 18, 2018
Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Cooper Equipment  |[Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply Doggett Freightliner |Holt Texas, LTD Grande Truck Center [Anderson Machinery |H&V Equipment RDO Equipment Co.
Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment Company, Inc. Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, |of South Texas, LLC Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100010201 LD [17474 Judson Road [4697 FM 1516 N. 2102 E. Slayton Rd. |8700 IH 10 East 5665 Southeast Loop (4562 |H-10 East 9415 NE Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 |19275N. IH 35
410
Item Description QTY |[San Antonio, Converse, Lubbock, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78109 'TX 79404-6800 TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132
210-657-5151 210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-277-4373__ 210-648-1111 210-666-7112
5 35 Ton Paver Equipment Haul Trailer: 1
Price Each: $64,465.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid| $62,862.00)| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $64,465.22 $62,862.00)|
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018 Etnyre Paver 2019 XL 70 HDG
Special RTN35TD-PS Paver
Warranty: 1 Year| 12 months|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cooper Equipment| Holt Cat]
Company, Inc.
Warranty Service Provider Facility 17474 Judson Road, 5665 S. E. Loop 410,
Address: San Antonio, TX| San Antonio, Texas|
78247 78222
Delivery: 120-150 Days| 210 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: November 16, 2018 Unknown at this time
Last day order can be placed without 11/16/18 Unknown at this time|
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No Unknown|
date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 18, 2018
Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Cooper Equipment  |Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply Dogagett Freightliner |Holt Texas, LTD Grande Truck Center [Anderson Machinery |[H&V Equipment RDO Equipment Co.
Improvements (TCl) Pavement Equipment Company, Inc. Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, |of South Texas, LLC Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment
6100010201 LD [17474 Judson Road |4697 FM 1516 N. 2102 E. Slayton Rd. [8700 IH 10 East 5665 Southeast Loop (4562 IH-10 East 9415 NE Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 |19275N. IH 35
410
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, Converse, Lubbock, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132
210-657-5151 210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-277-4373 210-648-1111 210-666-7112
6 29 Cubic Yard Live Bottom Trailer with 2
Hydraulic or Electric Tarp Cover:
Price Each: $74,244.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $148,489.02)
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2018 Falcon Live|
Bottom LBW-237|
Warranty: 1 year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Cooper Equipment
Company, Inc.
Warranty Service Provider Facility 17474 Judson Road,
Address: San Antonio, T’
78247
Delivery: 120-150 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: November 16, 2018
Last day order can be placed without 11/16/18
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off Noj
date:
Prepared by Purchasing 7/12/2018 6of 7




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 18, 2018
Local Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Local Local Local Non-Local
For: Purchase of Transportation and Capital Cooper Equipment  |Nueces Farm Center, |Associated Supply Doggett Freightliner |Holt Texas, LTD Grande Truck Center |Anderson Machinery |H&V Equipment RDO Equipment Co.
Improvements (TCI) Pavement Equipment Company, Inc. Inc. dba Nueces Company, Inc. dba, |of South Texas, LLC Company, Inc. Services, Inc.
Power Equipment ASCO Equipment —
6100010201 LD |17474 Judson Road (4697 FM 1516 N. 2102 E. Slayton Rd. [8700 IH 10 East 5665 Southeast Loop [4562 |H-10 East 9415 NE Loop 410 3307 S.E. Loop 410 [19275N. IH 35
410
Item Description QTY |San Antonio, Converse, Lubbock, Converse, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, New Braunfels,
TX 78247 TX 78109 TX 79404-6800 TX 78109 TX 78222 TX 78219 TX 78219 TX 78222 TX 78132
210-657-5151 210-310-0066 806-745-2000 210-277-4373 210-648-1111 210-666-7112
7 One Ton Full Four Door 59" CA 4x4 9ft 1
Flatbed Truck with Sides and Lift Gate:
Price Each: No Bid| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid| $51,549.00| No Bid| No Bid No Bid
Total: $51,549.00)
Year, Make & Model Cab & Chassis 2019 Ford F350 Crew
Offered: Cab SRW,|
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered 6.7 L, V8 Diesel,
(Include SAE net HP): Ford, 330 H.P.
Transmission Offered: Ford 6 Speed|
Warranty: Base 36 Months or|
36,000 Miles|
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider Grande Truck Center|
Facility Name:
Cab & Chassis Warranty Service Provider 4562 |H-10 East, San
Facility Address: Antonio, TX 78219
Year, Make & Model of Flat Bed with Sides 2018 UT989TP|
Body and Lift Gate Offered: Platform |
2018 G2-87-1650)
Tommy Gatel
Flat Bed with Sides Body and Lift Gate 12 Months|
Warranty:
Flat Bed with Sides Body and Lift Gate UTEC]
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Flat Bed with Sides Body and Lift Gate 5860 Pfeil Road,
Warranty Provider Facility Address: Schertz, TX 78154
Delivery: 150-180 Days
Production Cut-off Date: 09/30/201
Last day order can be placed without 09/30/201
missing cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off No
date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30| Net 30 Net 30 Net 30|
Total: $246,786.72 $1,044,581.00) $924,860.00 $171,597.00 $1,038,754.00] $51,549.00 $45,491.00 $901,439.00 $959,877.18)
Total Award: $182,321.50 $32,500.00| $888,860.00 $171,597.00 $62,862.00 $51,549.00| J
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