
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 9, 2018

For: Annual Contract for Pet Supplies for Animal Care Services NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL

C-Specialties, Inc. MWI Animal Health B & R Estes Corp dba 

Locke Hill Feed, Pet & 

Lawn Supply

Legend + White Animal 

Health Corp.

6100010127 GDL

6245 Morenci Trail 3041 W. Pasadena 

Drive

4927 Golden Quail #105 105 Schelter Rd, Suite 

204

Item Description

Estimated 

Annual 

Quantities

Indianapolis, 

IN 46268

800-234-5330

Boise, 

ID 83705

208-955-9547

San Antonio, 

TX 78240

210-691-2351

Lincolnshire, 

IL 60069

1 Cardboard Animal Carriers - 17 1/2" Length x 12 1/4" Height 

x 8 1/2" Width 4,000

Manufacturer: C-Specialties VetOne I Love My Pet Carriers C-Specialties

Manufacturer Part #: 1002/N/K 610014 (Pack of 12) 21236104 Cardboard Carrier 50

Size: 17 1/2 L x 12 1/4 H x 8 

1/2" W

18 x 9 x 12 17 1/2" x 12 1/4" x 8 1/2" 17.5"L x 12.25"H x 

8.5"W Sold in Qty of 50 

per Case

Unit Price: $2.42 $2.95 $6.00 $3.19

Extended Price: $9,680.00 $11,800.00 $24,000.00 $12,760.00

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 147.93%

2 Deleted

3 Nurser Bottle - 2 Ounces - Clear Plastic with Rubber Nipples
500

Manufacturer: No Bid Pet Ag Pet Ag Pet Ag Nurser Bottle

Manufacturer Part #: 99801 202799980 PAG998801

Size:

2 oz
2 oz 2 oz - Sold in Qty of 12

Color: Clear Clear Clear

Unit Price: $0.69 $1.50 $2.24

Extended Price: $345.00 $750.00 $1,120.00

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 117.39%

4 Nurser Bottle - 4 Ounces - Clear Plastic with Rubber Nipples
200

Manufacturer: No Bid Pet Ag Pet Ag Pet Ag Nurser Bottle

Manufacturer Part #: 99804 2027999804 105.00235.4

Size: 4 oz 4 oz 4 oz - Sold in Qty of 6

Color: Clear Clear Clear

Unit Price: $1.31 $4.00 $3.62

Extended Price: $262.00 $800.00 $724.00

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 205.34%

5 Wire Folding Kennels - 22 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black
35

Manufacturer:
No Bid No Bid Midwest

Midwest Homes for 

Pets

Manufacturer Part #: MW02202 1518

Size: 22" 19"L x 13"W x 15"H

Color: Black Black

Unit Price: $27.00 $36.16

Extended Price: $945.00 $1,265.60

6 Wire Folding Kennels - 24 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black
85

Manufacturer:
No Bid No Bid Midwest

Midwest Homes for 

Pets

Manufacturer Part #: MW02197 824

Size: 24" 24"L x 18"W x 19"H

Color: Black Black

Unit Price: $29.00 $40.79

Extended Price: $2,465.00 $3,467.15

7 Wire Folding Kennels - 30 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black
35

Manufacturer:
No Bid No Bid Midwest

Midwest Homes for 

Pets

Manufacturer Part #: MW830 830

Size: 30" 30"L x 19"W x 21"H

Color: Black Black

Unit Price: $37.00 $52.13

Extended Price: $1,295.00 $1,824.55

8 Wire Folding Kennels - 36 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black
35

Manufacturer:
No Bid No Bid Midwest

Midwest Homes for 

Pets

Manufacturer Part #: MW836 836

Size: 36" 36"L x 23"W x 25"H

Color: Black Black

Unit Price: $49.00 $62.12

Extended Price: $1,715.00 $2,174.20
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Annual 
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Indianapolis, 

IN 46268

800-234-5330

Boise, 

ID 83705

208-955-9547

San Antonio, 

TX 78240

210-691-2351

Lincolnshire, 

IL 60069

9 Wire Folding Kennels - 42 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black
35

Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Midwest
Midwest Homes for 

Pets
Manufacturer Part #: MW02200 842

Size: 42" 42"L x 28"W x 30H

Color: Black Black

Unit Price: $75.00 $91.04

Extended Price: $2,625.00 $3,186.40

10 Wire Folding Kennels - 48 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black
35

Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Midwest
Midwest Homes for 

Pets
Manufacturer Part #: MW02201 848

Size: 48" 48"L x 30"W x 33"H

Color: Black Black

Unit Price: $86.00 $101.29

Extended Price: $3,010.00 $3,545.15

11 Deleted

12 Deleted

13 Dog Muzzles - Small - Nylon Fitted, Snap Buckles 3

Manufacturer: Four Flags VetOne Coastal Pet Coastal

Manufacturer Part #: MS VM-01 CO07599 01360 BLKSML

Size: 5 1/2" Small Small 1 (Small) Small 4.5-6"

Color: Blue Blue Black Black

Unit Price: $6.55 $3.01 $9.00 $9.99

Extended Price: $19.65 $9.03 $27.00 $29.97

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 199.00%

14 Dog Muzzles - Medium - Nylon Fitted, Snap Buckles 3

Manufacturer: Four Flags VetOne Coastal Pet Coastal

Manufacturer Part #: MM VM-02 CO07606 01360 BLKMED

Size: 6 1/2" Medium Medium 3 (Med) Medium 6.5-9"

Color: Blue Blue Black Black

Unit Price: $6.75 $3.13 $9.25 $10.40

Extended Price: $20.25 $9.39 $27.75 $31.20

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 195.53%

15 Dog Muzzles - Large - Nylon Fitted, Snap Buckles 3

Manufacturer: Four Flags VetOne Coastal Pet Coastal

Manufacturer Part #: ML VM-03 CO07612 01360 BLKLRG

Size: 7 1/2" Large Large 8 - Large Large 8.25-10.5

Color: Blue Blue Black Black

Unit Price: $6.99 $3.05 $9.50 $10.79

Extended Price: $20.97 $9.15 $28.50 $32.37

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 211.48%

16 Deleted

17 Deleted

18 Nylon Slip Leads with Metal Hoop - 1/2 Inch Wide by 4 Feet 

in Length - Assorted Color
36,000

Manufacturer: C Specialties No Bid Leather Bros KVP International

Manufacturer Part #: FL-Mix 5820 261.00900.2373

Size:
1/2 x 50" w Dring 4 Feet

1/2 inch wide by 4 feet 

in length

Color:
Assorted Assorted

Blue/White - Sold in 

Pack of 12

Unit Price: $0.60 $0.66 $1.29

Extended Price: $21,600.00 $23,760.00 $46,440.00

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 10.00%

19 Deleted

20 Deleted

21 Deleted

22 Deleted

23 Deleted

24 Deleted
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800-234-5330
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208-955-9547
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210-691-2351

Lincolnshire, 

IL 60069

25 Deleted

26 Deleted

27 Deleted

28 Nylon Slip Leads with Swivel Clip End - 4 to 5 Feet - 

Assorted Color
500

Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Coastal Pet Coastal

Manufacturer Part #: CO404 604

Size:
5/8 Wide x 4 Feet

3/4" x 4 Foot Nylon 

Lead

Color:
Assorted

Black, Red, Blue, Pink, 

Purple

$3.75 $6.90

Extended Price: $1,875.00 $3,450.00

29 Collars - Adjustable, Black Plastic Buckle with Steel Tag 

Ring - Large 1" - Assorted Color
20

Manufacturer: C-Specialties No Bid Coastal Pet Coastal

Manufacturer Part #: ACLG Mix 6601 06601

Size:

1 x 14-20" 1" x 14-20"

1" x 18-26 Adjustable 

Collar w buckle and 

ring

Color: Black, Red, Green, 

Purple, Hot Pink, Blue
Assorted Black, Pink, Red, Blue

Unit Price: $3.20 $4.25 $7.38

Extended Price: $64.00 $85.00 $147.60

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 32.81%

30 Collapsible Dog Bowls, Folding Nylon Type with Plastic 

Carabineer Clip - 5 Inches Wide - 8 ouce - Assorted Colors 500

Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Diamond Visions Dexas International

Manufacturer Part #: 11-2069 PW200432312

Size: 5" - 8 oz 8 Ounce

Color: Assorted Blue, Green, Pink

Unit Price: $3.50 $8.29

Extended Price: $1,750.00 $4,145.00

31 Deleted

Estimated Annual Total $31,404.87 $12,434.57 $65,158.25 $84,343.19

Estimated Annual Award $31,344.00 $634.57 $15,680.00


