CITY OF SAN ANTONIO
BID TABULATION

Opened:  July 20, 2018
NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For. Annual Contract for Veterinary Supplies Intervet Inc. dba Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. MWI Animal Health NAO Global Health LLC Patterson Vet Supply
2000 Galloping Hill Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini St., Ste 200 822 Tth Street, Ste 740
Kenilworth, Lakeville, Boise, Houston, Greeley,
NJ 07033 MN 55044 ID 83705 TX 77058 CO 80632-1240
6100010480 VF 512-507-8134 952-894-4350 208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703

A BOARDING & KENNEL - beds, collars, catchers, leads, harnesses, muzzles, nutrition, pet carriers, protective gloves, restraints

QUICK MUZZLE, X-SMALL

1 [5-10Ibs, Four Flags MD-00, each 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 355/ $ 3550 $ 3.85| $ 3850 $ 7.10[ $ 70.98| $ 364| $ 36.40
QUICK MUZZLE, SMALL

9 10-25 Ibs, Four Flags MD-01, each 1 each 10 NO BID NOBID| $ 3.66( $ 36.60 $ 395§ 3950 $ 6.89] $ 68.90( $ 374( $ 37.40
QUICK MUZZLE, MEDIUM

3 |25445Ibs, Four Flags MD-02, each 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 401 $ 4010 $ 410] $ 4100 $ 754 $ 75.40| $ 3.88| $ 38.80
QUICK MUZZLE, LARGE

4 4560 Ibs, Four Flags MD-03, each 1 each 10 NO BID NOBID| $ 401( $ 40.101( $ 433 $ 4330 $ 761 $ 76.05| $ 411 $ 4110
QUICK MUZZLE, X-LARGE

5 |60-80 Ibs, Four Flags MD-04, each 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 422 $ 422001 $ 453| $ 4530 $ 8.06| $ 80.60| $ 432| $ 43.20

B GROOMING SUPPLIES - brushes, clipper blade products, parts & accessories, combs, nail trimmers & files

A5 CLIPPER BLADES, CYROGEN-X

1 Size 40, Oster 078919-016-005, each 1 each 195 NO BID NOBID| $ 20.16(( $ 3,931.20( $ 20.29( § 3,956.55( $ 27.56| $ 5,374.20] $ 2064 $ 4,024.80
CLIPPER COOL 5-IN-1 COOLING SPRAY, Andis

2 12750, 13 oz aerosol can 1 each 30 NO BID NO BID| $ 6.87| $ 206.10][ $ 6.99] $ 209.70 | $ 9.67| $ 290.16( $ 7.04] $ 211.20
CLIPPER+BLADE OIL

3 |OSTER 076300-104-005, 4 oz bottle 1 cach 5 NO BID NO BID| $ 182 $ 9.10|$ 1.85] § 9.25| $ 2.41| $ 12.03| $ 1.33]| $ 6.65
OSTER BLADE WASH,

4 |OSTER 008272, 18 0z aerosol can 1 each 30 NO BID NO BID| $ 461('s 138.30/( $ 566 $ 169.80 | $ 6.50| $ 195.00| $ 472| § 141,60
OSTER POWER PRO ULTRA CLIPPER
REPLACEMENT BATTERY

5 Sunbeam Prdts 078400-101-000 1 each 10 NO BID NOBID| $ 4139] $ 413.90( $ 38.28] $ 38280 $ 49.79] § 497.90| $ 36.52| $ 365.20
CLIPPER

6  |Sunbeam Prdts 078400-030-000, Each 1 cach 7 NO BID NO BID| $ 184.86| $ 1,204.02| $ 146.33| § 1,024.31| § 251.63| $ 1,761.40| § 134.12| $ 938.84

ANDIS ULTRAEDGE AGC SUPER 2-SPEED
CLIPPER WITH DETACHABLE #10 BLADE,
7 |Andis 23275, Each 1 each 20 NO BID NO BID| $ 142.14| § 2,842.80| $ 12759 $ 2,551.80 || $ 175.50| $ 3,510.00| $ 128.02| §$ 2,560.40

c ANESTHESIA AND SUPPLIES - masks, injectables, bags, endotracheal tubes & accessories, respiratiors, vaporizers, ventilators

ANESTHESIA CIRCUIT UNIVERSAL F - 40"
1 |HOSE,NOBAG 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 18.39[ $ 183.90(| $ 19.21] $ 19210 $ 2090 $ 299.00( $ 18.82 § 188.20

ANESTHESIA CIRCUIT UNIVERSAL F - 60"
5 |HOSE, NOBAG 1 cach 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 18.39| $ 183.90( $ 16.82| $ 168.20 $ 26.26| $ 262.60( $ 18.82 § 188.20

ANESTHESIA UNIVERSAL F CIRCUIT

3 |PEDIATRIC - 40" HOSE, NO BAG 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 18.00] $ 180.00( $ 14.42| $ 14420 | $ 15.60| $ 156.00{ $ 14.12| $ 141.20
F/AIR CANISTER - ANESTHESIA GAS FILTER
4 |UNIT, Bickford 80120, 200 gms 1 each 520 NO BID NO BID| $ 4.20] $ 2,184.00|| $ 555| $ 2,886.00 | $ 8.78 $ 4,563.00| $ 429| $ 2,230.80

CANINE CLEAR PLASTIC ANESTHESIA

5  |MASKS, LARGE, Surgi-Vet 32393B1 1 each 5 NO BID NOBID| $ 25.00( $ 125.00( $ 2459 $ 122.95 NO BID NOBID| $ 24.92| $ 124.60
CANINE CLEAR PLATIC ANESTHESIA MASKS,
SMALL

6 |Surgi-Vet 32393B4 1 each 5 NO BID NOBID| $ 25.00( $ 125.00( $ 22.93['$ 114,65 $ 24.96| $ 124.80 $ 24.92| $ 124.60

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS,
7 0.5 liter, WestMed Inc 7-6205 1 each 30 NO BID NO BID| $ 6.00( $ 180.00| $ 481] § 14430 | § 11.70( $ 351.00] $ 2.51|[ § 75.30

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS
8 1 liter, WestMed Inc 7-6201 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 6.00( $ 60.00 | $ 481 % 4810 $ 20.02| $ 200.20| $ 2.51|[ $ 25.10

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS
9 2 liter, WestMed Inc 7-6202 1 each 15 NO BID NO BID| $ 6.00( $ 90.00( $ 481 % 7215 $ 20.02| $ 300.30( $ 251 $ 37.65

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS
10 |3 liter, WestMed Inc 7-6203 1 each 20 NO BID NOBID| $ 6.00] $ 120.00( $ 481| $ 96.20 | $ 2340| $ 468.00| $ 251 $ 50.20

PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES
11 WITH CUFF, 3.0 mm, VetOne 601029 1 each 13 NO BID NOBID| $ 1.24] $ 16.12)| $ 1.36( $ 1768 | $ 222| § 28.90| $ 282 $ 36.66

PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES
12 WITH CUFF, 3.5 mm, VetOne 602029 1 each 6 NO BID NO BID| $ 1.24] § 7441% 1.36( $ 8.16| $ 222| § 13.34( § 271 $ 16.26
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PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES
13 WITH CUFF, 4.0 mm, VetOne 603029 1 each 6 NO BID NO BID 1.24] $ 7.44 1.36( $ 8.16 2.22 13.34 294] § 17.64
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
14 WITH CUFF, 4.5 mm, VetOne 604029 1 each 5 NO BID NO BID 1.24( $ 6.20 1.36( $ 6.80 2.22 11.12 282| § 14.10
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
15 WITH CUFF, 5.0 mm, VetOne 605029 1 each 5 NO BID NO BID 1.24( $ 6.20 1.36( $ 6.80 2.22 11.12 200| $§ 10.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
16 WITH CUFF, 5.5 mm, VetOne 606029 1 each 5 NO BID NO BID 1.24( $ 6.20 136 $ 6.80 2.22 11.12 200| $§ 10.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
17 WITH CUFF, 6.0 mm, VetOne 607029 1 each 8 NO BID NO BID 1.24( $ 9.92 136 $ 10.88 2.22 17.78 200 $ 16.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
18 WITH CUFF, 6.5 mm, VetOne 608029 1 each 5 NO BID NO BID 1.24] $ 6.20 1.33] $§ 6.64 2.22 11.12 2.00( $ 10.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
19 WITH CUFF, 7.0 mm, VetOne 609029 1 each 18 NO BID NO BID 1.24] $ 22.32 1.36] $ 24.48 2.22 40.01 200] $§ 36.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
20 WITH CUFF, 7.5 mm, VetOne 610029 1 each 15 NO BID NO BID 1.24] $ 18.60 1.36] $ 20.40 2.22 33.35 2.00( $ 30.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
21 WITH CUFF, 8.0 mm, VetOne 611029 1 each 15 NO BID NO BID 1.24 $ 18.60 1.36 $ 20.40 2.22 33.35 200] $§ 30.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
22 WITH CUFF, 8.5 mm, VetOne 612029 1 each 8 NO BID NO BID 1.24 $ 9.92 1.36 $ 10.88 2.22 17.78 200] $ 16.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
23 WITH CUFF, 9.0 mm, VetOne 613029 1 each 8 NO BID NO BID 1.24 $ 9.92 1.36 $ 10.88 2.22 17.78 200] $§ 16.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
24 WITH CUFF, 9.5 mm, VetOne 614029 1 each 2 NO BID NO BID 1.24 $ 2.48 1.36 $ 2.72 3.90 7.80 2.00| $ 4.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
25 WITH CUFF, 10.0 mm, VetOne 615029 1 each 2 NO BID NO BID 1.24 $ 2.48 1.36 $ 2.72 2.22 4.45 2.00| $ 4.00
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
26 WITH CUFF, 10.5 mm 1 each 2 NO BID NO BID 777 $ 15.54 3.70| $ 7.41 4.03 8.06 795 § 15.90
PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES,
27 WITH CUFF, 11.0 mm 1 each 2 NO BID NO BID 777 $§ 15.54 371 $ 7.43 4.03 8.06 795 § 15.90
SODASORB CO2 ABSORBENT GRANUALES
FOR CANISTER REFILL
28  |Jorgensen J553, 3 Ib bag 1 each 520 NO BID NO BID 595§ 3,094.00 5.92|| $ 3,078.61 6.76 3,515.20 701 $ 3,645.20
D APPAREL AND GLOVES - aprons, eyewear, gloves, gowns, headwear, lab coats, masks, scrubs
DISPOSABLE SURGEON'S CAP
1 BOUFFANT 100 box 3 NO BID NO BID 7701 $ 23.10 360 $ 10.81 3.29 9.87 407( $ 12.21
TENDER TOUCH NITRILE EXAM GLOVES,
POWDER FREE, TEXTURED FINGER, LARGE
2 SemperMed TTNF204 200 box 250 NO BID NO BID 1041 $ 2,602.50 961| $ 2,401.55 10.88 2,720.25 379 $ 1,895.00
TENDER TOUCH NITRILE EXAM GLOVES,
POWDER FREE, TEXTURED FINGER, MEDIUM
3 SemperMed TTNF203 200 box 420 NO BID NO BID 1041 $ 4,372.20 961| $ 4,034.60 10.88 4,570.02 379 $ 3,183.60
POWDER FREE, TEXTURED FINGER, SMALL
4 SemperMed TTNF202.2 200 box 540 NO BID NO BID 1041 $ 5,621.40 961| $ 5,187.35 10.88 5,875.74 379 $ 4,093.20
STERILE SURGICAL GLOVES, POWDER-FREE
LATEX, SZ 6.5
5 DermAssist 133650 50 box 240 NO BID NO BID 19.06([ $ 4,574.40 3241 $ 7,778.78 26.34 6,321.12 11.68| $ 5,606.40
STERILE SURGICAL GLOVES,
POWDER-FREE LATEX, SZ 8.5
6 DermAssist 133850 50 box 110 NO BID NO BID 19.06([ $ 2,096.60 3241 $ 3,565.28 27.08 2,978.69 11.68| $ 2,569.60
7 SURGICAL MASKS, TIE ON 100 box 3 NO BID NO BID 420( $ 25.20 8.08| § 24.24 3.69 22.15 235 $§ 14.10
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E CANINE & FELINE BIOLOGICALS - antibodies, bordetella, distemper, influenza, lepto, lyme, parvo, rabies
1 DELETED
2 DELETED
3 DELETED
4 DELETED
5 DELETED
CLINICAL SUPPLIES - alcohol, cleaners, drains, feeding tubes, soap, needles, pharmacy containers, sharps collection, syringes & parts, tourniquets, urinary
F supplies
ACCEL CONCENTRATE
1 Ogena Solutions 62407, 1 gallon jug 1 jug 48 NO BID NO BID 35.60] $ 1,708.80 37471 $ 1,798.56 NO BID NO BID 35.14] $ 1,686.72
ALCOHOL, 70% ISOPROPYL
2 Vedco VIN-IPA7-16QT, 32 oz bottle 1 each 360 NO BID NO BID 298| $ 1,072.80 2.30]| $ 826.63 3.56| $ 1,282.32 2.52( § 907.20
COBALT PLASTIC PRESCRIPTION VIALS, 13
3 Dram, Patterson Private Label 07-857-8572 275 case 2 NO BID NO BID 43.55| $§ 87.10 43.88| $ 96.55 61.49] $ 122.98 32.18| $ 64.36
KENDALL SHARPS CHIMNEY-TOP
4 CONTAINER, Covidien 676236, 4 qt 1 container 6 NO BID NO BID 259 $§ 15.54 259 $ 15.54 319 § 19.11 2.09] $ 12.54
KENDALL SHARPS HINGED SEALING GASKET
5 LID CONTAINER, Covidien 8980, 8 gallon 1 each 156 NO BID NO BID 10.77] $ 1,680.12 15.25| $ 2,378.38 12701 $ 1,981.36 8.68] $ 1,354.08
6 NEEDLES, 18 G x 1" 100 box 480 NO BID NO BID 3.34( % 1,603.20 3.33]| § 1,600.70 16.38| $ 7,862.40 341§ 1,636.80
MONOJECT STERILE SYRINGE
7 LUER LOCK TIP, 12mL, Covidien 8381512878 80 box 100 NO BID NO BID 17.06] $ 1,706.00 17111 $ 1,711.08 NO BID NO BID 13.49] $ 1,349.00
MONOJECT STERILE SYRINGE
8 LUER LOCK, 60cc, Kendall Healthcare 560125 20 box 10 NO BID NO BID 18411 % 184.10 1847| $ 184.73 21771 $ 277.68 14.56] $ 145.60
9 SYRINGES 1cc, TB 25ga x 5/8" 100 box 1,100 NO BID NO BID 8.39| $§ 9,229.00 15.76| $ 17,338.09 8.16|[ $ 8,980.40 8.59| $ 9,449.00
SYRINGES 3cc LUER LOCK
10 Black Hub, 22g x 0.75" 100 box 1,100 NO BID NO BID 581| $§ 6,391.00 5.27|| $ 5,795.79 MA7( $ 12,283.70 529| § 5,819.00
SYRINGES 6cc, LUER LOCK
11 No Needle 50 box 500 NO BID NO BID 859] $ 4,295.00 861 $ 4,307.10 17.34] $ 4,335.50 6.79] $ 3,395.00
NON-STERILE SYRINGE CAPS,
POLYPROPLENE, CLEAR, Air-Tite Products
12 BUCC 1000 bag 12 NO BID NO BID 1724 $ 1,034.40 3541] § 424.91 32.50| $ 390.00 2235 $ 268.20
G VITAMINS, MINERALS & SUPPLEMENTS
PetAg NURSER BOTTLE, 2 OUNCE, Pet-Ag Inc
1 99801 12 bag 12 NO BID NO BID 8.28( $ 99.36 070 $ 100.11 1M1.71] $ 140.56 847( $ 101.64
2 DELETED
VITAMIN B-12
3 100ml, 5000mg/ml Vial 1 each 2 NO BID NO BID 1484 $ 29.68 13.30] $§ 26.60 NO BID NO BID 11.36( $ 22.72
VITAMIN K-1 INJECTABLE
4 K-1 Injectable, 100ml, 10mg/ml Vial 1 each 4 NO BID NO BID 872 $ 34.88 9.05| $ 36.22 NO BID NO BID 1274] $ 50.96
VITAMIN K1 - CHEWABLE TABLETS,
5 50 mg 50 bottle 6 NO BID NO BID 1756 $ 105.36 13.76( $ 82.56 2282 $ 136.89 14.46( § 86.76
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H IV PRODUCTS & FLUIDS - IV accessories, catheters, extension sets, pumps, sets,
CATHETER FEEDING URETHRAL
5Fr x 16" - Red Rubber
1 Covidien 8890700514 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID 0.92] $ 9.20 093] $ 9.27 139 § 13.91 0.74 7.40
8Fr x 22" - Red Rubber
2 Covidien 8890710810 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID 092] $ 9.20 093] $ 9.27 1.39] § 13.91 0.74 7.40
3 HYPERTONIC SALINE SOLUTION, 7.2%, 1 Liter 1 each 24 NO BID NO BID 468 $ 112.32 467| $ 112.04 6.47 $ 155.38 4.80 115.20
SURFLO IV CATHETER
4 14G x 2", Terumo 145102 50 box 1 NO BID NO BID 60.50 $ 60.50 1.19] $ 59.63 79.95| $ 79.95 1.24 62.00
SURFLO IV CATHETER
5 20G x 17, Terumo SROX2025V 50 box 24 NO BID NO BID 48.50| $ 1,164.00 1.01] $ 1,217.52 64.35| $ 1,544.40 0.99 1,188.00
SURFLO IV CATHETER
6 22G x 1", Terumo SROX2225V 50 box 30 NO BID NO BID 4850| $ 1,455.00 0.96) $ 1,441.80 64.35] $ 1,930.50 0.99 1,485.00
SURFLO IV CATHETER
7 24G x 3/4”, Terumo SROX2419V 50 box 24 NO BID NO BID 48.50| $ 1,164.00 1.01[ $§ 1,206.84 64.35] $ 1,544.40 0.99 1,188.00
IV EXTENSION SET, MALE AND FEMALE LUER
LOCK, 30"
8 Jorgensen J0467B 1 each 150 NO BID NO BID 0.99( $ 148.50 1.03] $ 154.44 112 $ 167.70 1.29 193.50
IV INTERMITTENT INJECTION CAP
9 LUER LOCK, 1” 25 box 40 NO BID NO BID 1.86| $ 1,860.00 0.48( $ 481.60 NO BID NO BID 1.18 1,180.00
IV MACRO DRIP SET, LUER LOCK
10 103", 15 drops/ml, 1 injection port 1 each 500 NO BID NO BID 2.73| $§ 1,365.00 1.28) $ 640.00 333 § 1,664.00 2.41 1,205.00
IV MICRO DRIP SET, LUER LOCK
1 70", 60 drops/ml, 1 Injection port 1 each 600 NO BID NO BID 2679 1,602.00 1.94] $ 1,164.72 325 § 1,950.00 1.96 1,176.00
LACTATED RINGERS Inj USP
12 LifeCare LRS, Plastic Bag, 12 x 1000mL per case 12 case 300 NO BID NO BID 582| $ 20,952.00 NO BID NO BID 78.16 $ 23,446.80 53.51 16,053.00
13 DELETED
SLIPPERY SAM, TOMKAT URETHRAL
CATHETER, PTFE, 3.5 frx 11cm (4")
14 Smiths Medical TTM35110E 1 each 5 NO BID NO BID 12.39([ $ 61.95 1257 § 62.84 18.68| $ 93.41 12.68 63.40
SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% Inj USP LifeCare,
15 Plastic Bag, 12 x 1000mL per case 12 case 300 NO BID NO BID 524 $ 18,864.00 NO BID NO BID 7597 $ 22,791.60 56.33 16,899.00
SURFLO WINGED INFUSION SET, 19GA x 3/4",
16 12" TUBING, Terumo SV19BLK box 50 box 2 NO BID NO BID 0.38] $ 38.00 0.38] $ 37.84 39.00| $ 78.00 0.39 39.00
SURFLO WINGED INFUSION SET, 23GA x 3/4",
17 12" TUBING, Terumo SV23BLK 50 box 2 NO BID NO BID 0.38] $ 38.00 0.38 $ 37.84 96.51| $ 193.01 0.39 39.00
SURFLO WINGED INFUSION SET, 25GA x 3/4",
18 12" TUBING, Terumo SV25BLK 50 box 2 NO BID NO BID 0.38] $ 38.00 0.38 $ 37.84 97.99] $ 195.98 0.39 39.00
| WOUND CARE & MANAGEMENT - Antiseptics, bandages, cotton rolls, sheets & wraps, gauze - all kinds, collars, tape, wound wash & cleaners, wraps
CURITY COTTON ROLL,
1 12-1/2" x 56", 1 Ib per roll, Covidien 2287 1 each 12 NO BID NO BID 365 % 43.80 365§ 43.75 551 $ 66.14 2.94 35.28
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
2 Size 7.5cm 1 each 200 NO BID NO BID 0.88( $ 176.00 2211 $ 442.50 NO BID NO BID 1.18 236.00
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
3 Size 10.0 cm 1 each 2100 NO BID NO BID 0.98( $ 2,058.00 230 $ 4,819.50 NO BID NO BID 1.75 3,675.00
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
4 Size 12.5cm 1 each 2400 NO BID NO BID 1.1 § 2,664.00 245| § 5,868.00 NO BID NO BID 2.22 5,328.00
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
5 Size 15.0 cm 1 each 2100 NO BID NO BID 1.33]| § 2,793.00 3.15| § 6,615.00 NO BID NO BID 2.39 5,019.00
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
6 Size 20.0 cm 1 each 2400 NO BID NO BID 207 $ 4,968.00 3.39| § 8,136.00 NO BID NO BID 3.00 7,200.00
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
7 Size 25.0 cm 1 each 3000 NO BID NO BID 262 $ 7,860.00 407] % 12,217.50 NO BID NO BID 3.59 10,770.00
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
8 Size 30.0 cm 1 each 1800 NO BID NO BID 331 § 5,958.00 455| $ 8,181.00 NO BID NO BID 4.46 8,028.00
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E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
9 Size 35.0 cm 1 each 200 NO BID NO BID 4.30| $ 860.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK
10 Size 40.0 cm 1 each 200 NO BID NO BID 4.78| $ 956.00 953 $ 1,906.50 NO BID NO BID 9.16 1,832.00
GAUZE SPONGE, NON-WOVEN/POLY
1 3"x 3", 4 Ply, Henry Schein Private Label 019924 | 200 pack 6 NO BID NO BID 287| $ 17.22 NO BID NO BID 1.34 8.03 1.94 11.64
STERILE, 2" x 75" UNSTRETCHED, 4.1 YARDS
12 STRETCHED, Henry Schein Private Label 12 bag 90 NOBID NO BID 483 $ 434.70 1.88] $ 169.29 1.74 156.78 0.83 74.70
NON-STERILE, 3" X 75" UNSTRETCHED, 4.1
13 YARDS STRETCHED, Henry Schein Private 12 bag 90 NO BID NO BID 7011 $ 630.90 279 $ 251.10 1.39 125.19 1.1 99.90
KENDALL CURITY STANDARD POROUS TAPE
14 1", Covidien 2531C 12 pack 12 NOBID NO BID 1176 $ 141.12 13.04] $ 156.49 14.26 17113 9.48 113.76
KENDALL SURGI-DRAPE
15 38.5" wide x 100 yards, Covidien 2345 1 each 52 NO BID NO BID 7445] $ 3,871.40 67.06| $ 3,487.10 112.74 5,862.27 59.11 3,073.72
NON-ADHERENT GAUZE PADS
16 Ix4 100 box 35 NO BID NO BID 16.52] $ 578.20 6.13] $ 214.61 8.01 280.28 0.98 17.15
ROLLED GAUZE, NON-STERILE, 2 PLY, NON-
17 WOVEN, 2" x 5 yards, Dukal Products 402 12 bag 300 NO BID NO BID 111 $ 333.00 5.14] $ 1,541.70 2.37 709.80 1.87 561.00
18 VET WRAP, 2" x 5 yards, assorted colors 24 case 4 NO BID NO BID 20.69| $ 110.35 14.99| $§ 59.95 32.20 85.87 22.02 58.72
WEBGLUE™ SURGICAL ADHESIVE
19 Henry Schein Private Label 031477, 2ml bottle 1 each 365 NO BID NO BID 1029 $ 3,755.85 11.70] $ 4,270.50 16.25 5,931.25 8.24 3,007.60
J SURGERY PRODUCTS & ACCESSORIES - adhesives, autoclave, clips, drapes, forceps, hooks, stapling, preps, sutures
AUTOCLAVE STEAM INDICATOR TAPE
3/4”, Henry Schein Private Label 037282, 3/4" x
1 60 yards 1 each 26 NO BID NO BID 322('$ 83.72 NO BID NO BID 151.39 140.57 3.29 85.54
SURGICAL BLADE (SCALPEL), STAINLESS
STEEL, STERILE, SIZE 10
2 Henry Schein Private Label 007319 100 box 145 NO BID NO BID 11.49( $ 1,666.05 10.00| $ 1,450.00 20.48 2,968.88 21.76 3,155.20
SURGICAL BLADE (SCALPEL), STAINLESS
STEEL, STERILE, SIZE 22, Henry Schein Private
3 Label 007325 100 box 100 NO BID NO BID 11.49([ $ 1,149.00 2240| $ 2,240.13 123.50 1,235.00 22.35 2,235.00
SKIN STAPLER, 35 REGULAR STAPLES
4 (5.4mm x 3.6mm after closure), VetOne 618029 1 each 50 NO BID NO BID 897§ 448.50 9.49| $§ 474.29 15.69 784.55 8.51 425.50
SELF-SEALING STERILIZATION POUCH, 5" x
5 10.5", Henry Schein Private Label 037275 200 box 16 NO BID NO BID 10.17] $ 162.72 997| $ 159.49 9.11 145.81 20.92 334.72
SUTURE #0 MAXON (C-9) - 1/2 Circle Rev Cut
37mm, 30" Green Polyglyconate
6 Medtronic VET-OTC-MW000824 36 box 75 NO BID NO BID 160.99| $ 12,074.25 162.16 | $ 12,509.44 242.78 18,208.13 125.42 9,406.50
SUTURE #2-0 MAXON (GS-11) - 1/2 Circle Rev
Cut 37mm, 30" Green Polyglyconate, Covidien
7 8886675561 36 box 185 NO BID NO BID 160.99| $ 29,783.15 162.15 $ 29,997.75 242.78 44,913.38 125.42 23,202.70
SUTURE #3-0 MAXON (C-14) - 3/8 Circle Rev
Cut 24mm / 30" Green Polyglyconate, Covidien
8 8886664141 36 box 90 NO BID NO BID 165.66| $ 14,909.40 166.87 | § 15,018.19 249.82 22,483.89 129.06 11,615.40
K CONTROLLED DRUGS
1 DELETED
BEUTHANASIA D - Special RX
2 100ml, C3N Bottle 1 each 5 $ 52.15 260.75 45.74| $ 228.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 52.15 260.75
BUTORPHANOL
3 Injectable, 10mg/ml 1 each 145 NO BID NO BID 151.12| $§ 21,912.40 58.42|f $ 8,470.58 NO BID NO BID 151.12 21,912.40
INJECTABLE (DEXDOMITOR®), 0.5mg/ml - 10
4 ml Vial, Zoetis 10002752 1 each 850 NO BID NO BID 124.97| $ 106,224.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 108.68 92,378.00
FATAL PLUS SOLUTION C-2N
5 250 mL 1 each 50 NO BID NO BID 82.00] § 4,100.00 67.78) $ 3,389.20 NO BID NO BID 81.00 4,050.00
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TRAMADOL HCL TABLETS C-IV
6 50mg, 500 per Bottle Amneal (Round) 500 bottle 200 NO BID NO BID| $ 1177 $ 2,354.00 17.56( $ 3,511.68 NO BID NO BID 1201 $ 2,402.00
ZETAMINE KETAMINE
7 100mg/ml, 10ml C3N Vial 1 each 1,575 NO BID NO BID| $ 6.15| $ 9,686.25 490 $ 7,712.78 NO BID NO BID 424) $ 6,678.00
PHARMACEUTICALS - analgesics, anesthetics, antibiotics, anti-fungal, anti-viral, decongestants, dermatologic, electrolyte, heartwork
L preventives/treatments,insecticides, nutritional, otic, vitamins
ACEPROMAZINE INJECTABLE
1 10mg/ml 50mL Vial, VetOne 501075 1 each 6 NO BID NOBID| $ 18.70( $ 112.20 16.73| $ 100.39 2449 § 146.92 18.11] § 108.66
ACEPROMAZINE TABLETS
2 25mg 100 bottle 3 NO BID NO BID| $ 4595| $ 137.85 42.36]| $ 127.09 61.96] $ 185.89 4582] $ 137.46
ACETYLCYSTEINE SOLUTION
3 USP 20%, 30mL 1 each 30 NO BID NO BID| $ 36.20( $ 362.00 11.26] $ 337.72 57.33] § 573.30 11441 § 343.20
ADAMS PLUS FLEA & TICK MIST WITH
4 PRECOR, 320z Bottle 1 each 4 NO BID NOBID| $ 11.29| $ 45.16 11.99( $ 47.95 18.69] $ 74.76 NO BID NO BID
AMINOPHYLLINE INJECTABLE
5 25mg / 10ml Vial 1 each 40 NO BID NO BID| $ 12.45) $ 498.00 NO BID NO BID 17.84] § 713.44 12741 $ 509.60
AMOXICILLIN ORAL, 250mg
6 100 mL per bottle 1 each 10 NO BID NOBID| $ 1.50(f $ 15.00 156] $ 15.57 NO BID NO BID 221 $ 22.10
200 mg / 28.5 mg per 5ml
7 100 mL per bottle 1 each 72 NO BID NO BID| $ 345] $ 248.40 297 $ 213.70 NO BID NO BID 4.06( $ 292.32
400 mg / 57 mg per 5ml
8 50 mL per bottle 1 each 72 NO BID NOBID| $ 333 $ 239.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.70( $ 266.40
AMOXI-CLAV TABLETS,
9 875mg/125mg 100 bottle 36 NO BID NOBID| $ 24491 $ 881.64 483 $ 869.76 NO BID NO BID 576 $ 1,036.80
ANIMAX OINTMENT
10 Dechra Vet Products, 15ml Tube 1 each 1 NO BID NOBID| $ 6.06| $ 66.66 574| $ 63.10 9.60 $ 105.64 5.65] $ 62.15
AZITHROMYCIN ORAL SUSPENSION
1 200mg/5ml, 30ml bottle 1 each 120 NO BID NOBID| $ 1245] % 1,494.00 11.21) $ 1,344.67 NO BID NO BID 1231 $ 1,477.20
12 DELETED
CARPROFEN (RIMADYL), 100mg
13 Zoetis 10000333 180 bottle 25 NO BID NO BID| $ 61.06 $ 1,526.50 67.84] $ 1,696.00 290.71| $ 7,267.75 55.48( $ 1,387.00
CARPROFEN (RIMADYL), 25mg
14 Zoetis 10000329 180 bottle 25 NO BID NO BID| $ 40.36| $ 1,009.00 44841 § 1,121.00 200.69| $ 5,017.25 36.71( $ 917.75
CARPROFEN (RIMADYL), 75mg
15 Zoetis 10000331 180 bottle 25 NO BID NO BID| $ 49.90( $ 1,247.50 5544 $§ 1,386.00 246.12 $ 6,153.00 4518 $ 1,129.50
CARPROFEN (RIMADYL) INJECTABLE
16 50 mg/ml - 20 ml vial, Zoetis 10000319 1 each 675 NO BID NOBID| $ 58.86| $ 39,730.50 NO BID NO BID 163.24] $ 110,187.00 51.75(f $ 34,931.25
CEFPODOXIME PROXETIL, 100mg
17 Putney Inc 26637033110 100 bottle 30 NO BID NO BID| $ 41.69| $ 1,250.70 58.50| $ 1,755.00 81.90( $ 2,457.00 52.65| $ 1,579.50
CEFPODOXIME PROXETIL, 200mg
18 Putney Inc 26637033210 100 bottle 30 NO BID NO BID| $ 83.12( $ 2,493.60 M1.75( $ 3,352.50 156.45( $ 3,911.25 100.58 | $ 3,017.40
CEPHALEXIN CAPSULES, 250mg
19 Midwest Vet Generics 191.32020.3 500 bottle 24 NO BID NO BID| $ 18.70([ $ 448.80 22.26| $ 534.24 36.12| $ 866.88 19.97( $ 479.28
CEPHALEXIN CAPSULES, 500mg
20 Midwest Vet Generics 191.32060.3 500 bottle 24 NO BID NOBID| $ 29.93( $ 718.32 32.36| § 776.64 50.26 $ 1,206.24 31.06| $ 745.44
21 DELETED
CHLORHEXIDINE SCRUB 4%,
22 Gallon, Clipper Distributing 1280012 1 1 gallon jug 75 NO BID NO BID| $ 17.53) $ 1,314.75 2519| $§ 1,888.99 2134 § 1,600.20 17.94] $ 1,345.50
CHLORHEXIDINE SOLUTION 4%
23 Gallon 1 1 gallon jug 120 NO BID NOBID| $ 6.09( $ 730.80 6.88] $ 825.56 NO BID NO BID 6.18( $ 741.60
24 DELETED
25 DELETED
CLAVAMOX TABLETS
26 125mg, Zoetis 10000483 210 bottle 12 NO BID NOBID| $ 116.06]| $ 1,392.72 NO BID NO BID 238.00( $ 2,856.00 170.00( $ 2,040.00
CLAVAMOX TABLETS
27 250mg, Zoetis 10000484 210 bottle 6 NO BID NOBID| $ 191.13] $ 1,146.78 NO BID NO BID 391.93 $ 2,351.58 279.95| §$ 1,679.70
CLAVAMOX TABLETS
28 375mg, Zoetis 10000486 210 bottle 6 NO BID NOBID| $ 27311 $ 1,638.66 NO BID NO BID 560.00( $ 3,360.00 400.00( $ 2,400.00
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25mg/ml , 20ml Bottle, Henry Schein Generic
29 014619 1 each 70 NO BID NO BID| $ 2.69( $ 188.30| $ 265 % 185.75| $ 10.57| $ 739.90| $ 265 $ 185.50
30 DELETED
DEXAMETHASONE INJECTABLE
31 2 mg/ml, 100ml Vial, VetOne 501012 1 each 8 NO BID NO BID| $ 391[ § 31281 % 374| $ 2995 $ 575 $ 46.03 $ 371 $ 29.68
DEXTROSE 50% SOLUTION
32 500ml Bottle, VetOne 501053 1 each 8 NO BID NO BID| $ 285 $ 2280 $ 269 $ 21.53] $ 435 $ 34.83( $ 3.00( $ 24.00
33 DOXYCYCLINE CAPSULES, 100mg 500 bottle 24 NO BID NO BID| $ 36.85( $ 884.40| $ 60.81| $ 1,459.39 [ $ 60.55 $ 1,453.20| $ 57.24| § 2,747.52
34 ENALAPRIL TABLETS, 20mg 100 bottle 5 NO BID NO BID| $ 8.54| $ 42701 $ 10.32] $ 51.61 NO BID NOBID| $ 11.00( $ 55.00
35 ENALAPRIL TABLETS, 5mg 100 bottle 5 NO BID NO BID| $ 7.58] § 3790 $ 7.88| $ 39421 $ 12.38 $ 61.88| $ 6.38] $ 31.90
EPI -TIC® ADVANCED EAR CLEANER,
36 Virbac 003108, 8 ounce bottle 1 each 15 NO BID NO BID| $ 8.96( $ 134.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID| § 8.60| $ 129.00
37 EPINEPHRINE INJECTION 1:1000, 50mL vial 1 each 6 NO BID NO BID| $ 13.32] § 79921 9% 1213 $ 7275 $ 18.37] $ 110.21| $ 1279 $ 76.74
FUROSEMIDE INJECTABLE, 50mg/mL, 100m|
38 vial, Vedco VEDC209 1 each 2 NO BID NO BID| $ 14411 § 28.821 % 18.39] $§ 36.77 NO BID NO BID| $ 14.00] $ 28.00
39 GABAPENTIN TABLETS, 300mg 500 bottle 12 NO BID NO BID| $ 17.14( $ 205.68( $ 33.04] $§ 396.45] $ 2799 § 1,679.16] $ 19.18] $ 230.16
40 GABAPENTIN TABLETS, 100mg 500 bottle 12 NO BID NO BID| $ 9.00( $ 108.00]| $ 18.33( $ 219.91 NO BID NO BID| $ 10.00] $ 120.00
41 DELETED
GENTMICIN SOLUTION, 100mg/ml vial, VetOne
42 510209 1 each 6 NO BID NO BID| $ 19.03([ $ 114.18( $ 19.23( $ 115.37 NO BID NOBID| $ 19.72( $ 118.32
43 HEPARIN INJECTABLE, 30ml vial 1 each 12 NO BID NO BID| $ 4.68| $ 56.16 || $ 765 § 91.74 NO BID NO BID| $§ 748] $ 89.76
44 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 3%, Gallon 1 1 gallon jug 22 NO BID NO BID| $ 464( % 102.08] $ 3.46| $ 76.03| $ 573 $ 125.97| $ 435] § 95.70
45 ISOFLOURANE, 250ml Bottle 1 each 300 NO BID NO BID| $ 21841 % 6,552.00 $ 21.72] $§ 6,517.44 1 § 29.89] $ 8,967.00| $ 21.35(( $ 6,405.00
IVERMECTIN 1%, 250ml Vial,
46 Norbrook 6460810670 1 each 12 NO BID NO BID| $ 32.13)| § 385.56 NO BID NOBID| $ 61.84] $ 742.06( $ 4436 $ 532.32
47 KETOCONAZOLE TABLETS, 200mg 100 100/bottle 12 NO BID NO BID| $ 51.71) § 620.52 NO BID NOBID| $ 7367 $ 884.02| $ 55.29( $ 663.48
KWIK STOP STYPTIC POWDER with
BENZOCAINE, 14 grams per jar,
48  |ARC Laboratories 1 each 12 NO BID NOBID| $ 4.02 $ 48.24 | $ 4.23( $ 50.70 NO BID NOBID| $ 4.16| $ 49.92
49 LevETIRAcetam, 250mg tablets 120 bottle 3 NO BID NOBID| $ 13541 $ 4062 $ 10.21] $ 30.62 NO BID NO BID| $ 7.74] $ 23.22
50 LevETIRAcetam, 500mg tablets 120 bottle 3 NO BID NO BID| $ 787 $ 2361 $ 11.95( $ 35841 § 2121 § 63.63| $ 12.57( § 37.71
LIQUI-TINIC™, 4x GALLON SUSPENSION, PRN
51 Pharmacal 30022022, 1 Gallon Jug 1 1 gallon jug 3 NO BID NO BID| $ 112.77|| $ 338.31]| $ 1M5.71( $ 347141 § 199.88| $ 599.63| $ 142.77] § 428.31
MANNITOL 25% INJECTABLE (OSMITROL),
52 12.5 g/50mL vial, Pfizer NDC 00409403101 1 each 12 NO BID NO BID| $ 746] $ 89.52| $ 241\ $ 28.90 NO BID NOBID| $ 3.05( $ 36.60
MARCAINE Multi-Dose Vial (MDV) 0.5%, 50ml
53 vial 1 each 20 NO BID NOBID| $ 2451 $ 49.00( $ 493( $ 98.56 NO BID NOBID| $ 5.36( $ 107.20
MELOXICAM (METACAM®) INJECTABLE
54 5 mg/ml 10ml, Boehringer 136327 1 each 100 NO BID NO BID| $ 63.45] § 6,345.00 NO BID NOBID| $§ 136.08| $ 13,608.00( $ 60.58(f $ 6,058.00
MELOXIDYL ORAL SUSPENSION, 1.5 mg/ml,
55 100ml bottle 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 44041 % 440401 $ 48.93| $ 489.30 | $ 81.89| $ 818.86| $ 43.16| $ 431.60
56 METRONIDAZOLE TABLETS, 250mg 250 bottle 16 NO BID NO BID| $ 15.23( $ 121.84] $ 14.98( $ 239.75 NO BID NO BID| $§ 14.99] § 239.84
57 METRONIDAZOLE TABLETS, 500mg 500 bottle 16 NO BID NO BID| $ 26.68( $ 426.88(( $ 46.12| $ 737.90| $ 66.85 $ 1,069.60| $ 40.73| $ 651.68
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NON-SPERMICIDAL, STERILE LUBRICATING
JELLY
58 5 ounce per tube, First Priority LU040 1 each 72 NO BID NO BID 142) $ 102.24 156] $ 112.13 329 $ 236.88 1.94] § 139.68
NEOMYCIN OPHTHALMIC OINTMENT,
59 3.5gm per tube 1 each 480 NO BID NO BID 424 $ 2,035.20 NO BID NO BID 839 $ 4,025.28 745| $ 3,576.00
NITROFURAZONE DRESSING, VEDCO VINV-
60 NITR-01LB, 1lb jar 1 each 12 NO BID NO BID 7211 $ 86.52 760 $ 91.26 NO BID NO BID 6.95[ $ 83.40
5mL DROPPER BOTTLE, Pacific Pharma NDC
61 60758-0188-05 1 each 100 89.90| $ 899.00 211 $ 211.00 281] $ 281.00 NO BID NO BID 347( $ 347.00
62 DELETED
PANACUR SUSPENSION (FENBENDAZOLE)
63 10%, gallon jug 1 1 gallon jug 16 NO BID NO BID 114.32| $ 1,829.12 NO BID NO BID 451.60| $ 7,225.57 32257 $ 5161.12
64 DELETED
65 PRAZOSIN HYDROCHLORIDE, 1mg 100 bottle 10 NO BID NO BID 37.871 $ 378.70 35.54( $ 355.44 NO BID NO BID 4465] $ 446.50
66 PREDNISONE, 20mg, Generic 100 bottle 5 NO BID NO BID 86.61) $ 43.31 10.39] $ 51.94 229.39( $ 114.70 18.71] § 93.55
67 PREDNISONE, 5mg, Generic 100 bottle 5 NO BID NO BID 50.83(f $ 25.42 8.38| $ 41.90 143.01] $§ 71.51 9.01( $ 45.05
PRAZIQUANTEL INJECTABLE
68 50 ml Vial, 56.8 mg/ml, Bimeda 1PRA004 1 each 6 NO BID NO BID 310.34] $ 1,862.04 396.97| $ 2,381.82 409.54| $ 2,457.25 301.48) $ 1,808.88
PENJECT (PENICILLIN G PROCAINE)
69 INJECTABLE, 250m! Vial 1 each 175 NO BID NO BID 7.64( $ 1,337.00 8.42| $§ 1,473.19 NO BID NO BID 9.80| $ 1,715.00
70 DELETED
71 DELETED
72 DELETED
73 DELETED
74 DELETED
SILVER SULFADIAZINE CREAM 1%, 400 GRAM
75 JAR, Ascend Laboratories NDC 67877-124-40 1 each 24 NO BID NO BID 28.82| $ 691.68 26.05(f $ 625.19 53.48| $ 1,283.52 33.31( § 799.44
AQUALITE SODIUM CHLORIDE FOR
76 IRRIGATION, 0.9%, 1000ml per bottle 1 each 20 NO BID NO BID 3.37|| $ 67.40 NO BID NO BID 823 $ 164.64 409] $ 81.80
PYRANTEL PAMOATE LIQUID, 50 MG/ML,
77 Columbia Labs 13824, 32 oz bottle 1 each 24 NO BID NO BID 2210 $ 530.40 21.21|f $ 508.98 35.60] $ 854.45 2262( $ 542.88
TUBE, not roll-on, 1 oz Tube, Jorgensen
78 J0276PGS 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID 1563 $ 156.30 599| $§ 59.90 7.00] $ 70.00 5.88( $ 58.80
TETANUS ANTITOXIN, 1500 Units (Purified), 1-
79 Dose / 2mL, Professional Biological 63611 1 each 20 NO BID NO BID 17.24(f $ 34.48 483 $ 96.63 NO BID NO BID 2176] $ 43.52
TOXIBAN® SUSPENSION - 10.4% ACTIVATED
CHARCOAL
80 Lloyd Inc of lowa 1151, 240ml per bottle 1 each 6 NO BID NO BID 1220 $ 73.20 1213 $ 72.77 16.67| $ 100.04 1248 § 74.88
81 DELETED
82 DELETED
M HOSPITAL AND LAB SUPPLIES
1 AlphaTRAK 2 TEST STRIPS, Zoetis 10014535 50 box 15 NO BID NO BID 51.60( $ 774.00 51.63( $ 774.52 76.76| $ 1,151.43 52.98( $§ 794.70
DUAL SCALE DIGITAL THERMOMETER, 10
2 second read, VetOne 601013 1 each 40 NO BID NO BID 479( $ 191.60 3.14] $ 125.56 NO BID NO BID 391 $ 156.40
FECAL LOOP, PUPPY & KITTEN, 1/4"W
3 Jorgensen J147P 1 each 25 NO BID NO BID 287 $ 71.75 298] $ 74.60 350 $ 87.50 294( § 73.50
FECAL LOOP, STANDARD, 3/8" W
4 Jorgensen J147 1 each 25 NO BID NO BID 287 $ 71.75 298| $ 74.60 3.50| $ 87.50 294( § 73.50
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FECA-MED PRE-MIXED SOLUTION
5 gallon, VetOne 601038 1 each 13 NOBID NO BID| $ 6.70| $ 87.10 6.24| $ 81.12 NO BID NO BID 6.36( $ 82.68
[-GLO FLUORESCEIN SODIUM OPHTHALMIC
STRIPS
6 Jorvet J1191 100 box 3 NO BID NO BID| $ 9.20(| $ 27.60 9.60| $ 28.81 11.20| $ 33.60 12.00( $ 36.00
MICROSCOPE COVER SLIPS, GLASS
7 22mm x 22mm 160 box 45 NO BID NO BID| $ 2071 $ 149.04 358] $ 257.59 252 $ 113.40 3.04( $ 218.88
MICROSCOPE SLIDES, 3" x 1", CLEAR,
8 Henry Schein Private Label 037993 72 box 62 NO BID NO BID| $ 228] % 141.36 219 $ 135.76 NO BID NO BID 2441 § 151.28
PET PILLERS, WHITE WITH BLUE TIPS
9 Jorgensen Labs J0384 12 pack 4 NO BID NO BID| $ 10.21) $ 40.84 NO BID NO BID 15.68| $ 62.72 1318 § 52.72
10 PILL ENVELOPE 1000 box 2 NO BID NO BID| $ 16.09|[ $ 32.18 17.40( $ 69.59 NO BID NO BID 16.47( $ 32.94
1 POVIDONE IODINE SOLUTION 7.5%, gallon jug 1 1 gallon jug 16 NO BID NOBID| $ 2057 $ 329.12 18.54| $ 296.67 26.50 $ 424.03 19.74] §$ 315.84
12 DIGITAL THERMOMETER PROBE COVERS 250 box 10 NO BID NO BID| $ 9.03 $ 90.30 568 $ 142.12 22.53] $ 112.63 9.25] § 92.50
TONGUE DEPRESSORS, 6" LENGTH, SMOOTH
13 EDGED, Patterson Private Label PV-3588 500 box 12 NO BID NOBID| $ 3901 $ 46.80 394§ 47.27 895 § 107.35 353 $ 42.36
WITNESS CANINE HEARTWORM PF ANTIGEN
14 TEST, Zoetis 3205 10 box 350 NO BID NO BID| $ 83.13] $ 11,638.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 252.00( $ 8,820.00
GROUP 2: CATALOG DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT IN GROUP 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TERMS NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30 NET 30
ESTIMATED ANNUAL AWARD $0.00 $ 70,884.76 $ 36,991.28 $ 9,257.51 $ 265,818.62

DELETED: ITEMS E1-E5, G2, G13, K1, L12, L24, L25, L30, L41, L62, L64, L70, L71, L72, L73,

L74, L81, L82 Tie Bids
DELETED: ITEM L21, Received No Bids

NAS: MILLER VET; DID NOT SIGN BID
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