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ORDINANCE '2 Q 1 9 - Q 1 - 1 Q - Q Q Q 5 
APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT 
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL 
COST OF $546,000.00, INCLUDED AND AVAILABLE IN THE ANIMAL 
CARE SERVICES DEPARTMENT'S FY 2019 ADOPTED GENERAL 
FUND BUDGET: (A) B&R ESTES CORP. DBA LOCKE HILL FEED, 
PET & LAWN SUPPLY, C-SPECIALTIES, INC., AND MWI ANIMAL 
HEALTH FOR PET SUPPLIES; (B) MIDWEST VETERINARY SUPPLY, 
INC., MWI ANIMAL HEALTH, NAO GLOBAL HEALTH LLC, AND 
PATTERSON VET SUPPLY FOR VETERINARY SUPPLIES; AND (C) 
INTERVET INC. DBA MERCK ANIMAL HEALTH FOR FELINE AND 
CANINE BIOLOGICALS. 

* * * * * 

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with commodities and 
services on an annual basis for the terms of the contracts; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves the following contracts: (A) B & R Estes Corp. dba Locke 
Hill Feed, Pet & Lawn Supply, C-Specialties, Inc., and MWI Animal Health for pet supplies; (B) 
Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc. , MWI Animal Health, NAO Global Health LLC, and Patterson 
Vet Supply for veterinary supplies; and (C) Intervet Inc. dba Merck Animal Health for feline and 
canine biologicals ; and 

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code section 252.022(a)(2) indicates that competitive 
bidding is not required for a procurement necessary to protect the public health or safety; and 

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves seven low bid contracts and one contract procured on the 
basis of the health or safety exemption; and 

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fi scal year's budget 
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE: 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO: 

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis 
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent 
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and 
endorsements: (A) B & R Estes Corp. dba Locke Hill Feed, Pet & Lawn Supply, C-Specialties, 
Inc. , and MWI Animal Health for pet supplies; (B) Midwest Veterinary Supply, Inc. , MWI 
Animal Health, NAO Global Health LLC, and Patterson Vet Supply for veterinary supplies; and 
(C) Intervet Inc. dba Merck Animal Health for feline and canine biologicals. The bid tabulation 
sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the 
bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the Finance 
Department. 
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SECTION 2. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders and payment is 
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the 
Fiscal Year 2019 budget and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through 
their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances. 

SECTION 3. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; 
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage. 

PASSED and APPROVED this 10th day of January, 2019. 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

2 
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Agenda Item: 9 ( in consent vote: 6, 7, 8, 9, IO, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23) 

Date: 01 / 10/2019 

Time: 09:38:33 AM 

Vote Type: Motion to Approve 

Description: Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an 
estimated annual cost of $546,000.00, included and available in the Animal Care Services Department's 
FY 2019 Adopted General Fund Budget: (A) 8 & R Estes Corp. dba Locke Hill Feed, Pet & Lawn 
Supply; C-Specialties, Inc.; and MW! Animal Health for pet supplies; (8) Midwest Veterinary Supply, 
Inc. ; MWI Animal Health; NAO Global Health LLC; and Patterson Vet Supply for veterinary supplies; 
and (C) Intervet Inc., dba Merck Animal Health for feline and canine biologicals. [Ben Gorzell, Chief 
Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance] 

Result: Passed 

Voter Group Not Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second 
Present 

Ron Nirenberg Mayor X 

Roberto C. Trevino District 1 X X 

District 2 X 

Rebecca Viagran District 3 X 

Rey Saldana District 4 X X 

Shirley Gonzales District 5 X 

Greg Brockhouse District 6 X 

Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X 

Manny Pelaez District 8 X 

John Courage District 9 X 

Clayton H. Perry District I 0 X 

https://cosaweb 1 /voteinterface/default.aspx 1/10/2019 
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Exhibit I 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation Exhibit I 
Opened: May 9, 2018 
For: Annual Contract for Pet Supplies for Animal Care Services NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

C-Specialties, Inc. MWI Animal Health B & R Estes Corp dba Legend + White Animal 
Locke Hill Feed, Pet & Health Corp . 

Lawn Supply 
6245 Morenci Trail 3041 w. Pasadena 4927 Golden Quail #105 105 Schelter Rd , Suite 

6100010127 GDL Drive 204 
Estimated Indianapolis , Boise, San Antonio, Lincolnshire, 

Annual IN 46268 ID 83705 TX 78240 IL 60069 

Item Description Quantities 800-234-5330 208-955-9547 210-691 -2351 

1 Cardboard Animal Carriers - 17 1/2" Length x 12 1/4" Height 
4,000 x 81/2" Width 

Manufacturer: C-Specialties VetOne I Love My Pet Carriers C-Specialties 

Manufacturer Part #: 1002/N/K 610014 (Pack of 12) 21236104 Cardboard Carrier 50 

Size: 171 /2 Lx121 /4Hx! 18 x9x12 17 1/2" X 121/4" X 81/2" 17 .5"L x 12.25"H X 

1/2" VI 8.5"W Sold in Qty of 50 
per Case 

Unit Price: $2 .42 $2.95 $6.00 $3.19 

Extended Price: $9,680.00 $11 ,800.00 $24,000.00 $12,760.00 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 147.93% 

2 Deleted 

3 Nurser Bottle - 2 Ounces - Clear Plastic with Rubber Nipples 
500 

Manufacturer: No Bid Pet Ag Pet Ag Pet Ag Nurser Bottle 

Manufacturer Part #: 99801 202799980 PAG998801 

Size: 2 oz 2 oz - Sold in Qty of 12 
2 oz 

Color: Clear Clear Clear 

Unit Price: $0.69 $1 .50 $2.24 

Extended Price: $345.0C $750.00 $1 ,120.00 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 117.39% 

4 Nurser Bottle - 4 Ounces - Clear Plastic with Rubber Nipples 
200 

Manufacturer: No Bid Pet Ag Pet Ag Pet Ag Nurser Bottle 
Manufacturer Part#: 99804 2027999804 105.00235.4 

Size : 4 02 4oz 4 oz - Sold in Qty of 6 

Color: Clear Clear Clear 

Unit Price: $1 .31 $4.00 $3.62 

Extended Price: $26? nr $800.00 $724.00 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 205.34% 

5 Wire Folding Kennels - 22 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 
35 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black 
Manufacturer: 

No Bid No Bid Midwest 
Midwest Homes for 

Pets 
Manufacturer Part#: MW02202 1518 
Size: 22" 19"L x 13"Wx 15"H 

Color: Black Black 
Unit Price: $27.00 $36.16 
Extended Price: $945.00 $1,265.60 

6 Wire Folding Kennels - 24 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible , 
85 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black 
Manufacturer: 

No Bid No Bid Midwest 
Midwest Homes for 

Pets 
Manufacturer Part#: MW02197 824 
Size: 24" 24"L x 18"W X 19"H 
Color: Black Black 
Unit Price: $29.00 $40.79 
Extended Price: $2.465.00 $3,467.15 

7 Wire Folding Kennels - 30 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 
35 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black 
Manufacturer: 

No Bid No Bid Midwest 
Midwest Homes for 

Pets 
Manufacturer Part#: MW830 830 
Size: 30" 30"L X 19'W X 21"H 
Color: Black Black 
Unit Price: $37.00 $52.13 
Extended Price: $1 ,295.00 $1,824.55 

8 Wire Folding Kennels - 36 Inches - Single Door. Collapsible. 
Plastic Liner. Plastic Coated Wire - Black 

35 

Manufacturer: Midwest Homes for 
No Bid No Bid Midwest 

Pets 
Manufacturer Part#: MW836 836 
Size: 36" 36"L x 23"W x 25"H 
Color: Black Black 
Unit Price: $49.00 $62.12 
Extended Price: $1 ,715.00 $2,174.20 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: May 9, 2018 
For: Annual Contract for Pet Supplies for Animal Care Services NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

C-Specialties, Inc. MWI Animal Health B & R Estes Corp dba Legend + White Animal 
Locke Hill Feed, Pet & Health Corp . 

Lawn Supply 
6245 Morenci Trail 3041 W. Pasadena 4927 Golden Quail #105 105 Scheller Rd , Suite 

6100010127 GDL Drive 204 
Estimated Indianapolis, Boise, San Antonio, Lincolnshire, 

Annual IN 46268 ID 83705 TX 78240 IL 60069 

Item Description Quantities 800-234-5330 208-955-954 7 210-691-2351 

9 Wire Folding Kennels - 42 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 
35 

Plastic Liner, Piastre Coated Wire - Black 
Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Midwest 

Midwest Homes for 
Pets 

Manufacturer Part#: MW02200 842 

Size: 42" 42"L X 28"W x 30H 

Color: Black Black 

Unit Price : $75.00 $91 .04 

Extended Price : $2 ,625.00 $3,186.40 

10 Wire Folding Kennels - 48 Inches - Single Door, Collapsible, 
35 

Plastic Liner, Plastic Coated Wire - Black 
Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Midwest 

Midwest Homes for 
Pets 

Manufacturer Part#: MW02201 848 

Size: 48" 48"L x 30'W x 33"H 

Color: Black Black 

Unit Price: $86.00 $101 .29 

Extended Price : $3,010.00 $3,545.15 

11 Deleted 
12 Deleted 

13 Dog Muzzles - Small - Nylon Fitted , Snap Buckles 3 
Manufacturer: Four Flags VetOne Coastal Pet Coastal 

Manufacturer Part#: MS VM-01 CO07599 01360 BLKSML 

Size: 51 /2" Small Small 1 (Small } Small 4.5-6" 

Color: Blue Blue Black Black 

Unit Price: $6 .55 $3.01 $9.00 $9.99 

Extended Price : $19.65 $9.03 $27.00 $29.97 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 199.00% 

14 Dog Muzzles - Medium - Nylon Fitted , Snap Buckles 3 
Manufacturer: Four Flags VetOne Coastal Pet Coastal 
Manufacturer Part#: MM VM-02 CO07606 01360 BLKMED 

Size: 6 1/2" Medium Medium 3 (Med} Medium 6.5-9" 

Color: Blue Blue Black Black 

Unit Price: $6.75 $3.13 $9.25 $10.40 

Extended Price: $20.25 $9.39 $27.75 $31 .20 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 195.53% 

15 Dog Muzzles - Large - Nylon Fitted , Snap Buckles 3 
Manufacturer: Four Flags VetOne Coastal Pet Coastal 
Manufacturer Part#: ML VM-03 CO07612 01360 BLKLRG 

Size: 7 1/2" Large Large 8 - Large Large 8.25-10.5 
Color: Blue Blue Black Black 
Unit Price: $6.99 $3.05 $9.50 $10.79 
Extended Price: $20.97 $9.15 $28.50 $32.37 

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 211 .48% 

16 Deleted 

17 Deleted 

18 Nylon Slip Leads with Metal Hoop - 1/2 Inch Wide by 4 Feet 
36,000 

in Length - Assorted Color 
Manufacturer: C Specialties No Bid Leather Bros KVP International 
Manufacturer Part#: FL-Mi> 5820 261 .00900.2373 
Size: 

1/2 x 50" w Dring 4 Feet 
1 /2 inch wide by 4 feet 

in length 
Color: 

Assorted Assorted 
Blue/White - Sold in 

Pack of 12 
Unit Price: $0.60 $0.66 $1 .29 
Extended Price: $21 ,600.00 $23,760.00 $46,440.00 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 10.00% 

19 Deleted 

20 Deleted 

21 Deleted 

22 Deleted 

23 Deleted 

24 Deleted 



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation 

Opened: May 9, 2018 
For: Annual Contract for Pet Supplies for Animal Care Services NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

C-Specialties, Inc. MWI Animal Health B & R Estes Corp dba Legend + White Animal 
Locke Hill Feed, Pet & Health Corp. 

Lawn Supply 
6245 Morenci Trail 3041 w. Pasadena 4927 Golden Quail #105 105 Scheller Rd , Suite 

6100010127 GDL Drive 204 
Estimated Indianapolis, Boise, San Antonio , Lincolnshire , 

Annual IN 46268 ID 83705 TX 78240 IL 60069 
Item Description Quantities 800-234-5330 208-955-954 7 210-691-2351 

25 Deleted 

26 Deleted 

27 Deleted 
, 

28 Nylon Slip Leads with Swivel Clip End - 4 to 5 Feet -
500 

Assorted Color 
Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Coastal Pet Coastal 
Manufacturer Part #: CO404 604 
Size: 

5/8 Wide x 4 Feet 
3/4" x 4 Foot Nylon 

Lead 
Color: 

Assorted 
Black, Red , Blue, Pink , 

Purp le 
$3.75 $6.90 

Extended Price: $1 ,875.00 $3,450.00 

29 Collars - Adjustable, Black Plastic Buckle with Steel Tag 
20 

Ring - Large 1" - Assorted Color 
Manufacturer: C-Specialties No Bid Coastal Pet Coastal 
Manufacturer Part#: ACLG Mi> 6601 06601 
Size: 1" x 18-26 Adjustable 

1 X 14-20" 1" X 14-20" Collar w buckle and 
ring 

Color: Black, Red , Green, 
Purple, Hot Pink, Blue 

Assorted Black, Pink, Red, Blue 

Unit Price: $3 .20 $4.25 $7 .38 
Extended Price: $64.00 $85.00 $1 47.60 
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 32.81% 

30 Collapsible Dog Bowls, Folding Nylon Type with Plastic 
Carabineer Cl ip - 5 Inches Wide - 8 ouce - Assorted Colors 500 

Manufacturer: No Bid No Bid Diamond Visions Dexas International 
Manufacturer Part#: 11-2069 PW200432312 
Size: 5" - 8 oz 8 Ounce 
Color: Assorted Blue, Green, Pink 
Unit Price: $3.50 $8.29 
Extended Price: $1,750.00 $4,145.00 

31 Deleted 

Estimated Annual Total $31,404.87 $12 434.57 $65 158.25 $84,343.19 

Estimated Annual Award $31 ,344.00 $634.57 $15,680.00 



Opened: July 20, 2018 

For: Amuat Conlract for Veterinary Sl4)plies 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON-lOCAL 

lntEMVet Inc. ctia Mefck Animal Heallh Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. 
2000 Gafloping Hil Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Keoilwof1h, Lakevifle, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

6100010480 VF 512-507-8134 952-894-4350 

A BOARDING & KENNEL • beds, collars, catchtn, leads, hamessn, muuWI, nutrition , pet carriers, protectiw glows, rHtraints 

QUICK MUZZLE, X-SMl\ll 
1 5-10 bs, Foor Flags MD-00, each 1 each 10 NO BID NOBID S 3.55 I 35.50 I 

QUICK MUZZLE, SMI\LL 

2 10-25 bs, Four Flags MD-01 , each 1 each 10 NO BIO NOBID I 3.66 S 36.60 S 
QUICK MUZZLE, MEDIUM 

3 25-45 bs, Four Flags MD-02, each 1 each 10 NO BID NOBIO I 4.01 $ 40.10 $ 

QUICK MUULE, LARGE 
4 45-60 bs, Four Flags MD-03, each 1 each 10 NO BIO NOBIO I 4.01 $ 40.10 I 

QUICK MUZZLE, X-LARGE 

5 60-80 lls, Four Flags MD-04, each 1 ead, 10 NO BIO NOBIO I 4.22 I 42.20 I 

B GROOMING SUPPLIES · brushes, clipper blade products, parts & 1cct1sorles, combs, nail trimmers & files 

AS CLIPPER BLADES, CYROGEN-X 
1 Sae 40, Oster 078919-016-005, each 1 each 195 NO BID NOBIO S 20.16 I 3,931.20 S 

CUPPERCOOL5-IN-1 COOLING SPRAY. Andis 

2 12750, 13 oz aerosol can 1 each 30 NO BIO NOBIO I 6.87 I 206.10 $ 

CLIPPER.SLADE OIL 

3 OSTER 076300-104-005, 4 oz bottle 1 each 5 NO BIO NOBIO I 1.82 I 9.10 $ 

OSTER BLADE WASH, 

4 OSTER 008272. 18 oz aerosol can 1 each 30 NO BID NO BIO I 4.61 $ 138.30 I 
;V~ICI"\ ..,,,._, "l"\VVLIN'\..,._,, ._,, 

REPLACEMENT BATTERY 
5 Sunbeam Ptdts 078400-101-000 1 each 10 NOBID NO BIO I 41 .39 $ 413.90 $ 

CLIPPER 

6 Swt>eam Pntts 078400-030--000, Each 1 each 7 NO BID NOBIO I 184.86 $ 1,294.02 $ 

ANDIS ULTRAEOGE AGC SUPER 2-SPEEO 
CLIPPER WITH DETACHABLE #10 BLADE, 

7 Andis 23275, Each 1 each 20 NOBIO NOBIO I 142.14 I 2,842 60 $ 

C ANESTHESIA AND SUPPLIES - masks, injectables, bags, endotracheal tubes & accessories, respiration, vaporizers, ventilators 

ANESTHESIA CIRCUIT UNIVERSAL F • 40' 
1 HOSE, NO BAG 1 each 10 NOBIO NOBIO I 18.39 S 18390 $ 

ANESTHESIA CIRCUIT UNIVERSAL F · 60' 

2 HOSE, NO BAG 1 each 10 NOBIO NOBIO I 18.39 $ 183.90 $ 

ANESTHESIA UNIVERSAL F CIRCUIT 

3 PEDIATRIC· 40' HOSE, NO BAG 1 each 10 NOBID NOBIO I 18.00 $ 160.00 I 
F/AIR CANISTER· ANESTHESIA GAS FILTER 

4 UNIT, Bickford 80120, 200 gms 1 each 520 NO BID NO BID I 4.20 $ 2,184.00 I 

CANINE CLEAR PLASTIC ANESTHESIA 
5 MASKS, LARGE, Sll'gi-Vat 3239381 1 each 5 NOBIO NOBIO I 2500 S 125 00 S 

CANINE CLEAR PLATIC ANESTHESIA MASKS, 
SMI\LL 

6 Surgi-Vet 3239384 1 each 5 NO BIO NO BID I 25.00 I 125.00 $ 

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS, 
7 0.5 filer , WestMed Inc 7-6205 1 each 30 NO BID NOBIO $ 6.00 I 180.00 $ 

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS 
8 1 liter, WestMed Inc 7-6201 1 each 10 NO BIO NO BID I 6.00 I 60.00 I 

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS 
9 2 liter, WestMed Inc 7-6202 1 each 15 NO BID NO BID I 6.00 I 90.00 I 

DISPOSABLE BREATHING BAGS 
10 3 liter, WestMed Inc 7-6203 1 each 20 NO BIO NO BIO I 6.00 I 120.00 I 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES 
11 WITH CUFF, 3.0 mm, Ve!One 601029 1 each 13 NO BIO NO BIO I 1.24 $ 16.12 $ 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES 

12 WITH CUFF, 3.5 mm, VetOne 602029 1 each 6 NO BIO NO BIO I 1.24 I 7.44 $ 

1 OF 9 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-lOCAL 

MWIAnimal Heallh NAO Global Health LLC Patterson Vet S1.41pty 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini St, Ste 200 822 7th Street, Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
ID83705 TX 77058 co 80632-1240 

208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703 

3.85 I 36.50 I 7.10 $ 70.98 $ 3.64 I 36.40 

3.95 S 39.50 S 6.89 S 68.90 S 3.74 S 37.40 

4.10 $ 41 .00 I 7.54 $ 75.40 $ 3.88 S 38.8( 

4.33 S 43.30 S 7.61 $ 76.05 S 4.11 $ 41.10 

4.53 I 45.30 I 8.06 I 80,60 $ 4.32 S 43.20 

20.29 S 3,956.55 s 27.56 S 5,374.20 I 2064 I 4,02460 

6.99 I 209.70 I 9.67 $ 290.16 $ 7.04 I 211 .20 

1.85 $ 9.25 I 2.41 $ 12.03 $ 1.33 $ 6.65 

5.66 I 169.80 $ 6.50 S 195.00 I 4.72 I 141.60 

36.28 I 382.80 $ 49.79 $ 497.90 $ 36.52 $ 365.20 

146.33 $ 1,024.31 s 251.63 $ 1,761.40 $ 134,12 $ 938.84 

127.59 $ 2,551 .60 s 175.50 $ 3,510.00 $ 12802 $ 2,560 40 

19.21 $ 192.10 $ 29.90 I 299.00 I 1882 S 188.20 

16.82 $ 168.20 $ 26.26 $ 262.60 $ 18.82 I 188.20 

14.42 I 144.20 I 15.60 S 156.00 I 14.12 $ 141 .2'l 

5.55 I 2,886.00 $ 878 $ 4,563.00 $ 4.29 $ 2,230.80 

24.59 I 122.95 NO BIO NOBIO I 2492 $ 124.60 

22.93 I 114.65 $ 24.96 $ 124.80 I 24.92 $ 124.60 

4.81 $ 144.30 I 11 .70 $ 351.00 I 2.51 $ 75.3C 

4.81 $ 48.10 $ 20.02 S 200.20 S 2.51 I 25.1C 

4.81 I 7215 I 20.02 $ 300.30 S 2.51 I 37.65 

4.81 $ 96.20 S 23.40 S 468.00 S 2.51 I 50.2C 

1.36 I 17.66 $ 2.22 S 28.90 S 2.82 $ 36.66 

1.36 S 8.16 I 222 S 13.34 $ 2.71 $ 16.26 
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July20, 2018 

Annual Contract fO( Veterinary S~plies 

VF 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES 
WITH CUFF, 4.0 mm, VetOne 603029 1 - 6 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 4.5 mm, VetOne 604029 1 - 5 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 5.0 mm, VetOne 605029 1 - 5 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 5.5 mm, VetOne 606029 1 - 5 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 6.0 mm, VetOne 607029 1 - 8 

PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 6.5 mm, VetOne 608029 1 - 5 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 7.0 mm, VetOne 609029 1 - 18 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 7.5 mm, VetOne 610029 1 - 15 

PLASTIC ENDOTRACHEAI.. TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 8.0 mm, VetOne 611029 1 - 15 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 8.5 mm, VetOne 612029 1 - 8 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 9.0 mm, VetOne 613029 1 - 8 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 9.5 mm, VetOne 61 4029 1 each 2 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 10.0 mm, VetOne 615029 1 - 2 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WITH CUFF, 10.5 mm 1 - 2 

PLASTIC ENOOTRACHEAL TUBES, 
WlTH CUFF, 11 .0 mm 1 - 2 
SODASORB CO2 ABSORBENT GRANUALES 
FOR CANISTER REFIU 
Jorgensen J553, 3 lb bag 1 - 520 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

lntervet Inc. cl>a Merck Animal Heallh Midwest Vetemary Supply Inc. 
2000 GaOoping Hil Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Kenilworth, Lakeville, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

512-507'1134 952-894-4350 

NO BIO NO BIO $ 1.24 $ 7.44 $ 

NO BID NO BIO $ 1.24 $ 6.20 $ 

NO BID NOBIO S 1.24 $ 6.20 $ 

NO BID NOBIO $ 1.24 $ 6.20 $ 

NOBID NOBIO $ 1.24 S 9.92 $ 

NOBIO NOBIO S 124 S 6.20 S 

NOBto NO BIO $ 1.24 $ 22.32 S 

NO BID NO BID S 1.24 $ 18.60 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 1.24 $ 18.60 $ 

NO BIO NO BIO $ 1.24 $ 9.92 $ 

NO BID NOBIO I 1.24 $ 9.92 $ 

NO BID NOBIO I 1.24 S 2.48 S 

NOBID NOBIO S 1.24 $ 2 48 $ 

NO BID NO BIO S 7.77 $ 15.54 $ 

NOBID NO BID I 7.77 $ 15.54 $ 

NO BIO NO BIO I 5.95 $ 3,094.00 $ 

APPAREL AND GLOVES • aprons, •yewe•r, glows, gowns, he•dwe •,, l•b coats, masks, scrvbs 

DISPOSABLE SURGEON'S CAP 
BOUFFANT 100 bo, 3 NO BIO NOBIO S 7.70 $ 23.10 S 

TENDER TOUCH NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, 
POWDER FREE, TEXTURED FINGER, LARGE 
SomporMed TTNF204 200 bo, 250 NO BID NOBIO S 10.41 $ 2,602.50 $ 

TENDER TOUCH NITRILE EXAM GLOVES, 
POWDER FREE, TEXTURED FINGER, MEDIUM 
SemperMed TTNF203 200 bo, 420 NO BIO NOBIO $ 10.41 $ 4,372.20 $ 

POWDER FREE, TEXTURED FINGER, SMALL 
SomporMed TTNF202.2 200 bo, 540 NO BIO NOBIO S 10.41 S 5,621.40 $ 

STERILE SURGICAL GLOVES, POWDER-FREE 
LATEX, SZ 6.5 
DemtAssist 133650 50 bo, 240 NO BIO NOBIO $ 19.06 $ 4,574.40 $ 

STERILE SURGICAL GLOVES, 
POWDER-FREE LA TEX SZ 8.5 
OennAssist 133850 50 box 110 NO BIO NO BIO S 19.06 $ 2,096.60 $ 

SURGICAL MASKS, TIE ON 100 bo, 3 NO BIO NO BID $ 4.20 $ 25.20 $ 

20F 9 

NON-lOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

MWI Animal Heallh NAO Global Health LLC Patterson Vet SlWly 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini St , Ste 200 822 7th Street, Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
ID83705 TX 77058 co 80632-1240 

208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703 

1.36 $ 8.16 $ 2.22 $ 13.34 $ 2.94 $ 17.64 

1.36 S 6.80 S 222 $ 11.12 $ 2.82 $ 14.10 

1.36 $ 6.80 $ 2.22 $ 11.12 $ 2.00 $ 10.00 

1.36 S 6.80 $ 2.22 S 11.12 S 2.00 $ 10.00 

1.36 $ 10.88 $ 2.22 $ 17.78 $ 2.00 S 1600 

1.33 $ 6.64 $ 2.22 $ 11 .12 $ 2.00 S 1000 

1.36 $ 24.48 $ 2.22 $ 40.01 $ 2.00 $ 36.00 

1.36 $ 20.40 $ 2.22 $ 33.35 $ 2.00 $ 30.00 

1.36 $ 20.40 $ 2.22 S 33.35 S 2.00 $ 30.00 

1.36 $ 10.88 $ 2.22 S 17.78 $ 2.00 S 1600 

1.36 $ 10.88 S 222 $ 17.78 $ 2.00 $ 16.00 

1.36 $ 2.72 $ 3.90 $ 7.80 $ 2.00 S 4.00 

1.36 S 2.72 $ 2.22 $ 445 S 2.00 $ 400 

3.70 $ 7.41 s 4.03 $ 8.06 $ 7.95 $ 15.90 

3.71 $ 7 43 $ 4.03 $ 8.06 $ 7.95 S 1590 

5.92 $ 3,078.61 s 6.76 $ 3,515.20 $ 7.01 $ 3,645.20 

3.60 $ 10.81 $ 3.2! $ 9.87 $ 4.07 $ 12.21 

9.61 S 2,401 .55 $ 10.88 S 2,720.25 $ 3.79 S 1,895.0C 

9.61 $ 4,034.60 $ 10.88 $ 4,570.02$ 3.79 S 3,183.60 

9.61 $ 5,187.35 $ 10.88 $ 5,875.74 $ 3.79 $ 4,093.2( 

32.41 $ 7,778.78 $ 26.34 $ 6,321.12 S 11.68 $ 5,606.40 

32.41 S 3,565.28 $ 27.08 $ 2,97869 S 11.68 $ 2,569.60 

8.08 $ 24.24 $ 3.69 S 22.15 $ 2.35 $ 14.10 



Opened: July 20, 2018 

For: Annual Contract for Veterinary S~plies 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

lntervet Inc. clla Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. 
2000 GaUoping HiN Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Kenilworth, Lakeville, 
NJ 07033 W< 55044 

6100010480 VF 512-507-8134 952-894-4350 

E CANINE & FELINE BIOLOGICALS - antibodies, bordetella. distemper, lnftuenze, lepto, lyme, p1rvo, rabies 

1 DELETED 

2 DELETED 

3 DELETED 

4 DELETED 

5 DELETED 

CLINICAL SUPPLIES - ,lcohol, cleaners, drains, feeding tubes, soap, needles, pharmacy cOfltainen, sharps collectiOfl , syringes & p•rts , tourniquets, urinary 
F supplln 

ACCEL CONCENTRATE 

1 Ogena Solutions 62407, 1 gallon jug 1 jug 48 NO BID NO BID I 35.60 $ 1,708.80 $ 

ALCOHOL, 70% ISOPROPYL 

2 Vedco VIN-IPA7-160T, 32 oz bottle 1 each 360 NO BID NO BID I 2.98 $ 1,07280 $ 

COBALT PLASTIC PRESCRIPTION VIALS, 13 
3 Dram, Patterson Private Label 07-857-8572 275 ,.,. 2 NO BIO NO BID $ 4355 $ 87.10 $ 

KENDALL SHARPS CHIMNEY-TOP 
4 CONTAINER, Covidien 676236, 4 qt 1 container 6 NO BID NO BID $ 259 S 15.54 $ 

KENDALL SHARPS HINGED SEALING GASKET 

5 LID CONTAINER, Covidien 8980, 8 gallon 1 each 156 NO BID NO BID $ 10.77 $ 1,680.12$ 

6 NEEDLES, 18Gx1' 100 box 480 NOBID NOBIO I 334 S 1,603.20 $ 

MONOJECT STERILE SYRINGE 
7 LUER LOCK TIP, 12ml, Covidien 8881512878 80 box 100 NOBID NOBIO I 17.06 $ 1,706.00 $ 

MONOJECT STERILE SYRINGE 

8 LUER LOCK, 60cc, Kendah Healthcare 560125 20 box 10 NOBID NOBIO I 18.41 $ 184.10 $ 

9 SYRINGES 1cc, TB 25ga x 518' 100 box 1,100 NOBID NOBIO I 8.39 $ 9,229.00 $ 

SYRINGES 3<C LUER LOCK 

10 Blad. Hlil, 22g x 0.75' 100 box 1,100 NOBID NOBIO I 5.81 $ 6,391.00 I 

SYRINGES 6cc, LUER LOCK 
11 No Needle 50 box 500 NOBID NDBIO I 8.59 I 4,295.00 I 

NON-STERILE SYRINGE CAPS, 
POLYPROPLENE, CLEAR, Air-Tile Products 

12 BUCC 1000 bag 12 NOBlD NOBIO I 17.24 $ 1,034 40 $ 

G VITAMINS, MINERALS & SUPPLEMENTS 

PetAg NURSER BOTTLE, 2 OUNCE, Pet-Ag 1nc 
1 99801 12 bag 12 NO BIO NO BID I 8.28 $ 99.36 I 

2 DELETED 

VITAMIN B-12 

3 100ml, 5000m~ml Viii! 1 each 2 NO BIO NO BIO I 14.84 $ 29.88 $ 

VITAMIN K-1 INJECTABLE 

4 K-1 Injectable, 100ml, 10mg/m1Vial 1 each 4 NO BIO NO BIO S 8.72 S 34.88 $ 

VITAMIN K1 • CHEWABLE TABLETS, 

5 50mg 50 bottle 6 NO BIO NO BIO S 17.56 S 105.36 $ 
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NON-LOCAL NON-lOCAL NON-LOCAL 

MWI Animal Health NAO Global Health LLC PattersonVe!St4>ply 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini St. , Ste 200 822 7th Stree~ Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
ID83705 TX 77058 co 80632-1240 

208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703 

37.47 $ 1,798.56 NO BID NO BID $ 35.14 $ 1,686.72 

2.30 $ 826.63 $ 3.56 $ 1,282.32 $ 2.52 $ 907.20 

43.88 $ 96.55 $ 61.49 $ 122 98 $ 32.18 $ 64.31 

2.59 $ 15.54 $ 3.19 $ 19.11 $ 2.09 $ 12.54 

15.25 $ 2,378.38 $ 12.70 $ 1,981.36 $ 8.68 $ 1,354.08 

333 $ 1,600.70 $ 16.38 S 7,862 40 $ 3.41 I 1,636.80 

17.11 $ 1,711 .08 NOBIO NO BIO $ 13.49 I 1,349.00 

18.47 $ 184.73 $ 27.77 $ 277.68 $ 14.56 $ 145.60 

15.76 $ 17,338.09 I 8.H $ 8,980.4C $ 8.59 $ 9,449.00 

5.27 $ 5,795 79 $ 11.17 I 12,283.70 I 5.29 I 5,819.00 

8.61 $ 4,307 .10 I 17.34 $ 4,335.50 I 6.79 $ 3,395.00 

35.41 $ 424.91 I 32.50 $ 390.00 I 22.35 I 268.2'J 

0.70 $ 100.11 I 11.71 $ 140.56 $ 847 S 101 .64 

13.30 I 26.60 NO BIO NO BIO $ 11.36 I 22.72 

9.05 $ 36.22 NO BID NO BID I 12.74 $ 50.96 

13.76 $ 82.56 I 22.82 $ 136.89 I 14.46 $ 86.76 



Opened: July 20, 2018 

Foe Annual Contract fOJ Veterinary St4>plies 

6100010480 VF 

H rv PRODUCTS & FLUIDS - IV accnsorin, catheters, extenston sets, pumps, sets, 

CATHETER FEEDING URETHRAL 
5Fr x 16" • Red Rlilber 

1 Covidien 8890700514 1 each 10 
8Fr x 22" • Red Rltlber 

2 COYidien 8890710810 1 each 10 

3 HYPERTONtC SALINE SOLUTION, 7 .2%, 1 Liter 1 each 24 
SURFLO rl/ CATHETER 

4 14G x 7 , Terumo 145102 50 bo, 1 

SURFLO IV CATHETER 

5 20G x 1', Terumo SROX2025V 50 bo, 24 

SURFLO IV CATHETER 

6 22G x 1". Terumo SROX2225V 50 bo, 30 

SURFLO IV CATHETER 
7 24G x 314", Terumo SROX2419V 50 bo, 24 

IV EXTENSION SET, MALE AND FEMALE LUER 
LOCK, 30" 

8 Jorgensen J0467B 1 '"" 150 

IV INTERMITTENT INJECTION CAP 
9 LUER LOCK, 1• 25 bo, 40 

IV MACRO DRIP SET, LUER LOCK 
10 103", 15drops/ml, 1 injection port 1 each 500 

IV MICRO DRIP SET, LUER LOCK 

11 70', 60 drops/ml, 1 Injection port 1 eech 600 

LACTATED RINGERS lnj USP 

12 LifeCere LRS, Plastic Bag, 12 x 1000mL per case 12 "'' 300 

13 DELETED 

SLIPPERY SAM, TOMKAT URETHRAL 
CATHETER, PTFE, 3.5 fr x 11cm {4") 

14 Smiths Medical TTM35110E 1 each 5 

SODIUM CHLORIDE 0.9% lnj USP LifeCare, 

15 Plastic Bag, 12 x 1000mL per case 12 cos, 300 

SURFLO WI NGED INFUSION SET, 19GA x 3/4", 
16 12" TUBING, Terumo SV198LK box 50 bo, 2 

SURFLO WINGED INFUSION SET, 23GA x 3/4' , 

17 12" TUBING, Terumo SV23BLK 50 bo, 2 

SURFLO WINGED INFUSION SET, 25GA x 3/4", 

18 12"TUBING. TerumoSV25BLK 50 bo, 2 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

lntervet Inc. ctie Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. 
2000 Galoping Hill Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Kenilworth, Lakevine, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

512-507-l!134 952-l!94-4350 

NO BID NOBID $ 0.92 $ 9.20 $ 

NO BID NO BID $ 0.92 $ 9.20 $ 

NOBID NOBID $ 4.68 $ 112.32 $ 

NO BID NOBID $ 60.50 $ 60.50 $ 

NO BID NOBID $ 48.50 $ 1,164.00 I 

NO BID NO BID $ 48.50 $ 1,455.00 $ 

NO BID NOBID $ 48.50 $ 1,164.00 $ 

NO BID NOBID $ 0.99 $ 148.50 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 1.86 $ 1,860.00 $ 

NO BID NO BID $ 273 S 1,365.00 $ 

NO BID NOBID $ 2.67 $ 1,602.00 $ 

NO BID NOBID I 5.82 $ 20,952.00 

NO BID NOBID $ 1239 $ 61 .95 S 

NO BIO NOBID $ 5.24 $ 18,864.00 

NO BID NO BID I 0.38 I 38.00 S 

NO BIO NOBID $ 0.38 $ 38.00 $ 

NO BID NOBID $ 0 38 S 38.00 $ 

I WOUND CARE & MANAGEMENT - Antiseptics, bandages, cotton roll s, sheets & wraps, geuze . 111 kinds, collars, tape, wound w11h & cleaneri, wraps 

CURITY COTTON ROLL, 

1 12·1/2" x 56', 1 lb per roU, Covidien 2287 1 eech 12 NO BID NO BID $ 3.65 S 43.80 $ 

E.COL.LARS, NON.CLICK 
2 Size7.5crn 1 eech 200 NO BIO NOBID S 0 88 S 176.00 $ 

E.COllARS, NON-CLICK 
3 Size 10.0 an 1 each 2100 NO BIO NOBID I 0.98 $ 2,058.00 $ 

E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK 
4 Size 12.5an 1 eech 2400 NO BID NO BID $ 1.11 s 2,664.00 $ 

E.COLLARS, NON-CLICK 
5 Sae 15.0 an 1 eech 2100 NO BID NOBIO S 1.33 $ 2,793.00 $ 

E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK 
6 Size 20.0 an 1 eech 2400 NO BID NOBID $ 207 $ 4,968.00 $ 

E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK 
7 Size 25.0 an 1 eech 3000 NO BID NOBID $ 2.62 $ 7,860.00 S 

E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK 

8 Size 30.0 an 1 eech 1800 NO BID NOBID $ 3.31 $ 5,958.00 $ 
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NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON.LOCAL 

MWI Animal Health NAO Global Health U C Petterson Vet St4>ply 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini St, Ste 200 822 7th Street, Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
1083705 TX77058 co 80632-1240 

205.955.9547 281--886-7876 210-491--8703 

0.93 $ 9.27 $ 1.39 $ 13.91 $ 0.74 $ 7.40 

0.93 $ 9.27 S 1.39 $ 13.91 $ 0.74 $ 7.40 

4.67 $ 112.04 S 6.47 $ 155.38 $ 4.80 $ 115.20 

1.19 S 59.63 $ 79.95 $ 79.95 $ 1.24 S 62.00 

1.01 I 1,217.52 s 64.35 S 1,544.40 $ 0.99 I 1,188.00 

0.96 S 1,441.80 S 64.35 $ 1,930.50 $ 0.99 $ 1,485.00 

1.01 $ 1,206.84 $ 64.35 $ 1,544 40 $ 0.99 $ 1,188.00 

1.03 $ 154.44 $ 1.12 $ 167.70 $ 1.29 $ 193.50 

0.48 $ 481.60 NO BID NO BID $ 1.18 S 1,180.00 

1.28 $ 640 00 S 3.33 S 1,664.00 S 2.41 $ 1,205.00 

1.94 S 1,164.72 S 3.25 S 1,950.00 S 1.96 $ 1,176.00 

NOBID NOBID $ 78.16 I 23,446.80 $ 53.51 $ 16,053.00 

12.57 $ 62.84 S 18.68 $ 93.41 S 12.68 S 63.40 

NO BID NO BID $ 75.97 $ 22,791 .60 S 56.33 $ 16,899.0C 

0.38 $ 37.84 $ 39.00 I 78.00 $ 0.39 $ 39.00 

0.38 $ 37.84 $ 96.51 $ 193.01 S 0.39 $ 39.00 

0.38 $ 37.84 $ 97.99 I 19598 $ 0.39 $ 3900 

3.65 $ 43.75 $ 5.51 S 66.14 $ 2.94 $ 35.28 

2.21 S 442.50 NOBID NO BID S 1.18 $ 236.00 

2.30 $ 4,819.50 NO BID NO BID $ 1.75 $ 3,675.00 

2.45 $ 5,868.00 NO BID NO BID $ 2.22 S 5,328.00 

3.15 $ 6,615.00 NO BID NO BID $ 2.39 $ 5,019.00 

3.39 $ 8,136.00 NOB1D NOBID $ 3.00 $ 7,200.00 

4.07 $ 12,217 .50 NO BIO NO BID $ 3.59 I 10,770.00 

4.55 $ 8,181 .00 NO BID NO BID $ 4.46 $ 8,028.00 
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For: Annual Contract for Veterinary Sl4)plies 

6100010480 VF 

E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK 
9 Size35.0 an 1 aach 

E-COLLARS, NON-CLICK 

10 Size40.0 an 1 each 
GAUZE SPONGE, NON,WOVEN,'POLY 

11 3" x 3", 4 Ply, Henry Schein Private label 019924 200 pack 

STERILE, 2" x 75" UNSTRETCHED, 4.1 YARDS 
12 STRETCHED, Henry Schein Private label 12 bag 

NON-STERILE, 3" X 75" UNSTRETCHED, 4.1 
13 YARDS STRETCHED, Henry Schein Private 12 bag 

KENDALL CURITY STANDARD POROUS TAPE 
14 1", Covidien 2531C 12 pack 

KENDALL SURGI-DRAPE 
15 38.5' wide x 100 yards, Covidien 2345 1 each 

NON-ADHERENT GAUZE PADS 

16 3,4 100 bo, 

ROLLED GAUZE, NON-STERILE, 2 PLY, NON-

17 WOVEN, 2" x 5 ya,ds, Dukal Products 402 12 bag 

18 VET WRAP, 2" x 5 yards, assorted colors 24 case 
WEBGLUE '"' SURGICAL ADHESIVE 

19 Henry Schein Private I.abet 031477, 2ml bottle 1 -

200 

200 

6 

90 

90 

12 

52 

35 

300 

4 

365 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

lnt8f\let Inc. dJa Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. 
2000 Gadq,ing Hil Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Kenilworth, Lakeville, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

512-507-8134 952-894-4350 

NO BID NO BID S 4.30 $ 860.00 

NO BID NO BID S 4.78 $ 956.00 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 2.87 S 17.22 

NO BID NOBID S 4,83 $ 434.70 S 

NO BID NOBIO S 7.01 $ 630.90 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 11.76 $ 141 .12 S 

NO BID NO BID S 74.45 $ 3,871.40 S 

NO BID NO BID S 16.52 $ 578.20 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 1.11 I 333.00 $ 

NO BID NOBID S 20.69 $ 110.35 S 

NO BIO NOBID S 10.29 S 3,755.85 S 

J SURGERY PRODUCTS & ACCESSORIES • 1dhesiw,, autocl1v1, clip,, drape,, forceps, hook,, ,tapHng, preps, 5UIUtH 

AUTOCLAVE STEAM INDICATOR TAPE 
3/4', Henry Schein Private Label 037282, 3/4" x 

1 60yards 1 "'h 26 NO BID NO BID I 3.22 $ 83.72 

SURGICAL BLADE (SCALPEL), STAINLESS 
STEEL, STERILE, SIZE 10 

2 H«vy Scher\ Private Label 007319 100 bo• 145 NO BID NO BID S 1149 $ 1,666.05 $ 

SURGICAL BLADE (SCALPEL), STAINLESS 
STEEL, STERILE, SIZE 22, Henry Schein Private 

3 Label 007325 100 bo, 100 NO BID NO BID S 11.49 S 1,149.00 S 

SKIN STAPLER, 35 REGULAR STAPLES 

4 (5.4mm x 3.6mm after closure), VetOne 618029 1 each 50 NO BID NO BID S 8.97 I 448.50 $ 

SELF-SEAUNG STERILIZATION POUCH, 5" x 

5 10.5", Henry Schein Private Label 037275 200 box 16 NO BID NOBID S 10.17 $ 162.72 $ 

SUTURE 1KJ MAXON (C-9) - 112 Circle Rev Cut 
37mm, JO" Green Polyglycooate 

6 Medtronic VET -OTC-MW000824 36 bo, 75 NO BID NOBID S 160 99 $ 12,074 .25 $ 

SUTURE #2-0 MAXON (GS-11) - 1!2 Circle Rev 
Cut 37mm, 30" Green Polygtyoonate, Covidien 

7 8886675561 36 box 185 NO BtD NOBID $ 160.99 $ 29,783 .15$ 

SUTURE #3-0 MAXON (C-14) - 3/8 Circle Rev 
Cut 24mm / 30" Green Polyglyoonate, Covidien 

8 8886664141 36 box 90 NO BID NOBID S 165.66 $ 14,909.40 $ 

K CONTROLLED DRUGS 

1 DELETED 

BEUTHANASIA D - Special RX 

2 100ml, C3N Bottle 1 - 5 $ 52 .15 S 260.75 S 45.74 $ 228.70 

BUTORPHANOL 

3 Injectable, 10mg/ml 1 - 145 NO BID NOBIO S 151.12 S 21 ,912.40 S 

INJECTABLE (OEXDOMITOR@), 0.5m~ml - 10 

4 ml Vial, Zoetis 10002752 1 - 850 NO BID NOBID $ 124.97 $ 106,224.50 

FATAL PLUS SOLUTION C-2N 

5 250 ml 1 - 50 NO BID NOBID S 82.00 I 4,100.00 $ 
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NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

MWI Animal Health NAO GIOOal Health LLC PattersonVa1Sl4)pl\l 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini Sl, Ste 200 822 7th Street, Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
1083705 TX TT058 co 80632-1240 

208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703 

NOBID NOBID NOBID ND BID NOBID NOBID 

9.53 $ 1,906 .50 NOBIO NO BID I 9.16 I 1,832.00 

NO BID NOBID $ 1.3< $ 8.03 $ 1.94 $ 11 .64 

1.88 $ 169.29 $ 1.74 $ 156.78 $ 0,83 $ 74.70 

2.79 $ 251.10 $ 1.39 S 12519 $ 1.11 S 99.90 

13.04 $ 156.49 $ 14.26 S 171.13 $ 9.48 $ 113.76 

67.06 $ 3,487 .10 $ 112.74 $ 5,862.27$ 59.11 $ 3,073.72 

613 $ 214.61 $ 8.01 $ 280.28 $ 0.98 $ 1715 

5.14 I 1,541.70 $ 2.37 I 709.80 $ 1.87 $ 561.00 

14.99 $ 59.95 $ 32.20 $ 85.87 $ 22.02 $ 58.72 

11.70 S 4,270.50 S 16.25 S 5,931 .25 S 824 $ 3,007.6' 

NO BID NOBID $ 151.39 S 140.57 I 3.29 S 85.54 

10.00 $ 1,450.00 $ 20.48 $ 2,968.88 S 21.76 S 3,155 20 

22.40 $ 2,240.13 $ 123.50 $ 1,235.00 S 22.35 $ 2,235.00 

9.49 I 474.29 $ 15.69 $ 784.55 $ 8.51 $ 425.50 

9.97 $ 159.49 $ 9.11 S 145.81 $ 20.92 $ 334.72 

162.16 $ 12,509.44 $ 242.78 S 18,208 13 S 125.42 $ 9,4065( 

162.15 S 29,997.75 $ 242.78 $ 44,913.38$ 125.42 $ 23,202.70 

166.87 $ 15,018.19 $ 249.82 $ 22,483.89 $ 129.06 S 11 ,615.4' 

NO 810 NOBID NO BID NO BID $ 52.15 $ 260.75 

58.42 S 8,470.58 NO BIO NO BID S 151 .12 $ 21 ,912.40 

NO BID NOBID NO BIO NO BID $ 108.68 $ 92 ,378.00 

67.78 S 3,389.20 NO BID NO BID $ 81 .00 $ 4,050.00 
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VF 

TRAMADOL HCL TABLETS C-IV 
50mg, 500 per Bottle Amneal (Roond) 500 bol1le 200 
ZETAMINE KETAMINE 
100mg/ml, 10ml CJN Vial 1 each 1.575 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

lntervet Inc. <ha Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. 
2000 Gaft~ing Hil Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Kerilworth, lakevile, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

512-507-8134 952-894-4350 

NO BID NO 810 S 11 .77 S 2,354.00 $ 

NO BIO NO BID I 6.15 $ 9,686.25 $ 

PHARMACEUTICALS • analgulcs, antsthetics, antibiotics, anti-fungal, and'"'Aral, decongestants, dermatologlc, electrolyte, heartwork 
preventivesftreatments,insecticides, nutritlonal, otic, vitamins 

ACEPROMAZINE INJECTABLE 
10mg/ml 50mL Vial, Ve!One 501075 1 each 6 NO BIO NO BIO $ 18.70 S 112 20 $ 

ACEPROMAZINE TABLETS 
25mg 100 bolt• 3 NO BID NOBID I 45.95 I 137.85 $ 

ACETYLCYSTEINE SOLUTION 
USP 20%, 30mL 1 each 30 NOBID NOBID I 36.20 $ 362.00 I 

ADAMS PLUS FLEA & TICK MIST WITH 
PRECOR, 32oz Bottte 1 each 4 NO BIO NOBIO $ 11 .25 $ 45.16 $ 

AMINOPHYLLINE INJECTABLE 
25mg 110ml Vial 1 each 40 NO BID NOBID $ 12.45 $ 498.00 
AMOXICILLIN ORAL, 250mg 
100 ml per bottle 1 each 10 NO BID NO BID $ 1.50 $ 15.00 $ 

200 mg / 28.5 mg per 5ml 
100 mLperbottle 1 each 72 NO BID NO BID $ 3.45 $ 248.40 $ 

400mg/57mgper5ml 
50 mLperbottle 1 each 72 NO BIO NO BID $ 3.33 $ 239.76 

AMOXI-CLAV TABLETS, 
875mg/125mg 100 bol1le 36 NO BID NOBID I 24.49 S 881.64 $ 

ANIMAX OINTMENT 
DectvaVetProdtJds, 15m1Tube 1 each 11 NOSID NOBIO S 6.06 S 66.66 I 

AZITHROMYCIN ORAL SUSPENSION 
200mg/5ml, 30ml bottle 1 each 120 NO BID NO BIO $ 12.45 $ 1,49400 S 

DELETED 

CAAPROFEN (RIMADYL), 100mg 
Zoelis 10000333 180 bol1le 25 NO BIO NOBID I 61.06 I 1,526 50 $ 

CARPROFEN (RIMADYL), 25mg 
Zoetis 10000329 180 bottle 25 NO BID NOBID I 40.36 I 1,009.00 $ 

CARPROFEN (RIMADYLJ, 75mg 
Zoetis 10000331 180 bol1le 25 NO BID NOBID I 49.90 S 1,247.50 S 

CARPROFEN (RIMADYL) INJECTABLE 
50 mg/ml - 20 ml vial, Zoetis 10000319 1 each 675 NO BID NO BID I 58.86 $ 39,730.50 

CEFPOOOXlf.E PROXETIL, 100mg 
Putney Inc 26637033110 100 - 30 NO BID NOBID I 41 .69 $ 1,250.70 I 

CEFPODOXlt.E PROXETIL, 200mg 
Putney lnc 26637033210 100 - 30 NOBID NO BID $ 8312 I 2,493.60 $ 

CEPHALEXIN CAPSULES, 250mg 
Midwest Vet Generics 191.32020.3 500 - 24 NOBID NO BID I 18.70 $ 448.80 $ 

CEPHALEXIN CAPSULES, 500mg 
Midwest Vet Generics 191.32060.3 500 - 24 NO BID NO BID $ 25.93 $ 718.32 $ 

DELETED 

CHLORHEXIDINE SCRUB 4%, 
Gallon, Clipper Distributing 1280012 1 1 gallon jug 75 NO BIO NOBID I 17.53 $ 1,314.75$ 

CHLORHEXIOINE SOLUTION 4% 
Gallon 1 1 gellonjug 120 NO BID NOBID I 6.09 $ 730.80 $ 

DELETED 

DELETED 

CLAVAMOX TABLETS 
125mg, Zoetis 10000483 210 - 12 NOBID NDBID $ 116.06 $ 1,392.72 

CLAVAMOX TABLETS 
250mg, Zoetis 10000484 210 bottle 6 NOBID NOBID $ 191.13 $ 1,146.78 
CLAVAMOX TABLETS 
375mg, Zoetis 10000486 210 - 6 NOBID NOBIO S 273.11 S 1,638.66 
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MWI Animal Health NAO Global Health LLC PattersonVetSl4)ply 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini St.. Ste 200 822 7th Street, Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
1083705 TX 77058 co 80632-1240 

208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703 

17.56 $ 3,511 .68 NO BID NO BIO $ 12.01 $ 2,402.00 

4.90 $ 7.712.78 NO BID NO BID $ 4.24 $ 6,6780( 

1673 $ 100.39 $ 24.49 $ 146.92 S 18.11 $ 108.66 

42.36 $ 127.09 $ 61.96 $ 185.89 $ 45.82 $ 137.46 

11 .26 $ 337.72 $ 57.33 $ 573.30 $ 11.44 $ 343.20 

11 .99 $ 47.95 $ 18.69 $ 74.76 NO BID NOBID 

NO BID NOB10 S 17.84 $ 713.44 $ 12.74 S 509 60 

1.56 $ 15.57 NOBID NO BID $ 2.21 $ 22.10 

2.97 I 213.70 NOBID NO BID $ 4.06 $ 252.32 

NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID I 3.70 $ 266.40 

4.83 $ 869.76 NO BIO NO BID $ 5.76 $ 1,036.80 

5.74 $ 63.10 $ 9.60 $ 105.64 $ 5.65 $ 62.15 

11.21 $ 1,344.67 NOBID NO BID I 12.31 $ 1,477.20 

67.84 $ 1,696.00 $ 250.71 $ 7,267.15 $ 55.48 S 1,387 0( 

44.84 $ 1,121 .00 $ 200.69 $ 5,017.25 $ 36.71 $ 917.75 

55.44 $ 1,386 .00 $ 246.12 I 6,153.00 $ 45.18 $ 1,129.5( 

NOBID NOBID $ 163.24 $ 110,187.00 $ 51.75 $ 34,931 .25 

58 50 $ 1,755.00 $ 81.90 $ 2,457.00 $ 52.65 $ 1,579.50 

111.75 $ 3,352.50 $ 156.45 $ 3,911 .25 $ 100.58 $ 3,017.40 

22.26 $ 534.24 S 36.12 $ 866.88 $ 19.97 $ 47928 

32.36 I 776.64 $ 50.26 $ 1,206.24 $ 31 .06 S 745.44 

25.19 $ 1,888.99 $ 21.34 I 1.60020 $ 17.94 S 1,345.50 

6.88 $ 825.56 NO BID NO BID $ 6.18 $ 741.60 

NOBIO NOBID I 238.00 I 2,856.00 I 170.00 $ 2,040 00 

NO BID NOBID I 391.93 $ 2.351 .58 $ 279.95 I 1,679.70 

NO BIO NO BID $ 560.00 $ 3,360.00 $ 400.00 S 2,400.00 



Opened: .July20, 2018 

For: Annual Contract for Veterinary S14Jpties 

6100010480 
25mglml , 20ml Bolde, Henry Schein Generic 

29 014619 1 

30 DELETED 

OEXAMETHASONE INJECTABLE 

31 2 mg/mt, 100ml Vial, VetOne 501012 1 

DEXTROSE 50% SOLUTION 
32 500ml Bottle, VetOne 501053 1 

33 DOXYCYCLINE CAPSULES, 100mg 500 

34 ENALAPRIL TABLETS, 20mg 100 

35 ENALAPRJL TABLETS, 5mg 100 

EPI-TIC©ADVANCED EAR CLEANER, 

36 Virbac 003108, 8 ounce bottle 1 

31 EPINEPHRINE INJECTION 1:1000, 50ml vial 1 

FUROSEMIDE INJECTABLE, 50m~ml, 100ml 
38 vial, Vedco VEOC209 1 

39 GABAPENTIN TABLETS, 300mg 500 

40 GABAPENTIN TABLETS, 100mg 500 

41 DELETED 

GENTMIClN SOLUTION, 100mg/ml vial, VetOne 
42 510209 1 

43 HEPARIN INJECTABLE, 30ml vial 1 

44 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 3%, Gallon 1 

45 ISOFLOURANE, 250ml Bottle 1 

lVERMECTIN 1 %, 250ml Vial, 
46 Norbrook 6460810670 1 

41 KETOCONAZOLE TABLETS, 200mg 100 

KWIK STOP STYPTIC POWDER with 
BENZOCAINE, 14 i,ams per jar, 

48 ARC laboratories 1 

49 LevETIRAcetam, 250mg tablets 120 

50 LevETtRAcetam, 500mg tablets 120 
LIOUI-TINlCr .. , 4x GALLON SUSPENSION, PRN 

51 Pharmaca1 30022022, 1 Gallon Jug 1 

MANNITOL 25% INJECTABLE (OSMITROLJ, 

52 12.5 gl50ml vial, Pfizer NOC 00409403101 1 

MARCAINE Multi-Dose Vial (MDV) 0.5%, 50ml 

53 vial 1 

MELOXICAM (METACAM©) INJECTABLE 
54 5 mg/ml 10ml, Boehringer 136327 1 

MELOXIDYL ORAL SUSPENSION, 15 mg/ml, 

55 100mlbotde 1 

56 ~ RONIDAZOLE TABLETS, 250mg 250 

51 METRONIOAZOLE TABLETS, 500mg 500 

VF - 70 

- 8 

- 8 

bottle 24 

bottle 5 

bottle 5 

- 15 

each 6 

each 2 

bottle 12 

bottle 12 

- 6 

- 12 

1 gallon jug 22 - 300 

- 12 

100/bottle 12 

- 12 

bottle 3 

bott• 3 

1 galkmjug 3 

each 12 

- 20 - 100 

- 10 

botto 16 

bottle 16 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON.t.OCAL NON-LOCAL 

Interval Inc. <ha Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. 
2000 Galq>ing Hil Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Kenilworth, Lakevine, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

512-507-8134 952-894-4350 

NOBID NOBID S 2.69 $ 188.30 S 

NOBID NOBID I 3.91 $ 31 .28 $ 

NO BID NOBIO S 2.85 $ 22.80 $ 

NOBID NOBID S 36.85 $ 884.40 S 

NOBID NOBID S 8.54 $ 42.70 $ 

NOBID NOBIO S 1.58 $ 31.90 $ 

NOBID NOBID S 8.96 $ 134.40 

NOBID NOBID I 13.32 $ 79.92 $ 

NOBID NOBIO S 14.41 $ 28.82 $ 

NOBID NOBIO $ 11.14 $ 205.68 $ 

N081D NOBID I 9.00 $ 108.00 S 

NO BID NO BID S 19.03 $ 114.18 $ 

NO BIO NO BID S 4.68 $ 56.16 $ 

NO BID NOBID S 4.64 $ 102.08 S 

NO BID NOBID S 21 .84 $ 6,552.00 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 32.13 $ 385.56 

NO BIO NOBID S 51 .11 $ 620.52 

NO BID NOBID S 4.02 $ 48,24 S 

NO BID NOBID S 13.54 $ 40,62 S 

NO BID NOBID $ 7.87 $ 23.61 $ 

NO BID NO BID I 112.11 $ 338.31 $ 

NO BID NOBID S 7.46 $ 89.52 $ 

NO BID NOBID S 2.45 S 49.00 $ 

NO BID NOBID S 63.45 $ 6,345.00 

NO BID NOBIO S 44.04 $ 440.40 S 

NO BID NOBID S 15.23 $ 121.84 $ 

NOBID NO BIO S 26.68 S 426.88 S 

7 OF 9 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

MW1 Animal Health NAO Global Health LLC Pattel'SOnVelS14Jpty 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini Sl, Ste 200 822 7th Street, Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
1083705 TX 77058 co 80632-1240 

208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-3703 

2.65 $ 185.75 $ 10.57 S 739.90 $ 2.65 $ 185.5( 

3.14 $ 29.95 S 5.75 $ 46.03 $ 3.11 $ 29.68 

2.69 $ 21.53 $ 4.35 $ 34.83 $ 3.00 $ 24.00 

60.81 $ 1,459 .39 $ 60.55 S 1,453.20 $ 51,24 $ 2,747 .52 

10.32 $ 51.61 NOBID NO BID S 11.00 S 55.00 

) ,88 $ 39.42 $ 12.38 $ 61 .88 $ 6.38 S 31.90 

NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID $ 8.60 S 129.00 

12.13 $ 72.75 $ 18.37 $ 110.21 $ 12.79 $ 76.74 

18.39 $ 38.17 NO BID NO BID $ 14.00 $ 28,00 

33.04 $ 396.45 S 27.99 S 1,679.16 $ 19.18 $ 230.16 

18.33 $ 219.91 NO BID NO BIO $ 10.00 $ 120.00 

19.23 S 115.37 NO BlD NOBID S 19.72 $ 118.32 

7.65 $ 91 .74 NO BID NO BIO $ 1.48 $ 89.76 

3.46 $ 76,03 $ 5.13 S 125.91 $ 4.35 S 95.10 

21 .72 $ 6,517 .44 S 29.89 S 8,961.00 $ 21.35 $ 6,405,0C 

NOBID NOBID $ 61.84 $ 142.06 $ 44.36 $ 532.32 

NO BID NOBID $ 1367 $ 884.02 $ 55.29 $ 663.46 

4.23 S 50.70 NO BID NOBID S 4.16 $ 4992 

10.21 $ 30.62 NO BID NO BID $ 7.74 S 23.22 

11.95 $ 35.84 $ 21 .21 $ 63.63 $ 1257 $ 3).71 

115.71 $ 347.14 $ 199.88 $ 599.63 $ 142.11 S 42831 

2.41 $ 28.90 NOBID NO BIO $ 3.05 $ 3660 

4,93 $ 98.56 NO BID NO BIO $ 5.36 $ 10720 

NOBIO NO BID $ 136.08 $ 13,608.00 $ 60.58 s 6,058.0C 

48.93 $ 489.30 $ 81.89 $ 818.86 S 43.16 $ 431.6' 

14.98 $ 239.75 NO BID NOBID $ 14.99 $ 239.84 

46.12 $ 731.90 S 66.85 $ 1,069.60 $ 40.13 $ 65168 



Opeoed: July 20, 2018 

F0<· Annual Contract f« Veterinary S1.4>plies 

6100010480 
NON-SPERMICIDAL, STERILE LUBRICATING 
JELLY 

56 5 ounce PEif ti.be, Firat Priority Ll.1040 1 

NEOMYCIN OPHTHALMIC OINTMENT, 

59 3.5gm per ti.be 1 

NITROFURAZONE DRESSING, VEOCO VINV• 

60 NITR--01LB, 1lbjar 1 

5mL DROPPER BOTTLE, Pacific Phanna NOC 
61 60758--0188--05 1 

62 DELETED 

PANACUR SUSPENSION (FENBENOAZOLE) 

63 10%, gaRon jug 1 

64 DELffiD 

65 PRAZOSIN HYDROCHLORIDE, 1mg 100 

66 PREONISONE, 20mg, Generic 100 

67 PREDNISONE, 5mg, Generic 100 

PRAZIQUANTEL INJECTABLE 

68 50 ml Vial. 56.8 mg/ml, Bimeda 1PRA004 1 

PENJECT (PENICILLIN G PROCAINE) 

69 INJECTABLE, 250ml Vial 1 

70 DELETED 

71 DELETED 

72 DELETED 

73 DELETED 

74 DELETED 

SILVER SULFADIAZINE CRtAM 1%, 400 GRAM 

75 JAR, Ascend Laboratories NOC 67877-124-40 1 

AQUAUTE SODIUM CHLOHIOe ,oR 

76 IRRIGATION, 0.9%, 1000ml per bottle 1 

PYRANTEL PAMOATE LIQUID, :;o MG/Ml, 
77 CokJmbia Labs 13824, 32 02 bottle 1 

TUBE, not roll-on, 1 oz Tl.be, .lofgensen 

78 ..ll276PGS 1 

TETANUS ANTITOXIN, 1500 Units (Purified), 1-

79 Dose/ 2mL, Professional Biological 63611 1 

TOXIBAN® SUSPENSION - 10.4% ACTIVATED 
CHARCOAL 

80 Lloyd Inc of Iowa 1151, 240ml per bo!Ue 1 

81 DELETED 

82 OELETEO 

M HOSPIT Al ANO LAB SUPPLIES 

1 ""haTRAK 2 TEST STRIPS, Zoetis 10014535 50 

DUAL SCALE DIGITAL THERMOMETER, 10 
2 second read, VetOoe 601013 1 

FECAL LOOP, PUPPY & KITTEN, 114'W 
3 Jorgensen J147P 1 

FECAL LOOP, STANDARD, 3/8" W 

4 Jorgensen J147 1 

VF 

- 72 

each 480 

each 12 

each 100 $ 

1 gallon jug 16 

- 10 

bott• 5 

bottle 5 

each 6 

each 175 

each 24 - 20 

each 24 

each 10 

each 20 

each 6 

... 15 - 40 

- 25 - 25 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON•LOCAL 

lntervet Inc. d:>a Merck Animal Health Midwest Veterinary Supply Inc. 
2000 Gaflq>ing Hin Rd. 21467 Ho~oke Ave 

Kenilworth, Lalc:eviUe, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

512-507-8134 952-894-050 

NO BID NOBID I 1.42 S 102.24 S 

NO BIO NOBID I 4.24 $ 2,035.20 

NO BID NOBID I 7.21 S 88.52 S 

89.90 S 899.00 S 2.11 S 211 .00 S 

NO BID NOBID S 114.32 $ 1,829.12 

NO BIO NOBID I 37.87 S 378.70 S 

NO BIO NOBID I 86.61 S 43.31 S 

NO BID NOBID I 50.83 S 25.42 S 

NO BIO NO BIO S 310.34 S 1,882.04 S 

NO BIO NOBID I 7.64 S 1,337.00 S 

NO BID NOBID S 28.82 $ 691 .68 S 

NO BID NO BID I 3.37 S 67.40 

NO BID NO BID S 22.10 S 530.40 S 

NO BIO NO BID I 1563 S 156.30 S 

NO BID NOBID I 17.24 $ 34.48 $ 

NO BIO NOBID I 12 20 S 73.20 S 

NO BID NO BIO S 51 .60 $ 774.00 S 

NO BID NO BID S 4.79 $ 191 .60 $ 

NO BID NO BIO $ 2.87 S 71 .75 S 

NO BIO NO BID S 2.87 $ 71.75 S 

8 OF 9 

NON•LOCAL NON-lOCAL NON-LOCAL 

MWI Animal Health NAO Glcilal Health LLC PattefSOnVetS'-"ply 
3041 W Pasedena Drive 700 Gemini St , Ste 200 822 7th Street, Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
1083705 TX 77058 co 80632-1240 

208-S55-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703 

1.56 S 112.13 S 3.29 S 236.88 S 1.94 S 139.68 

NO 810 NOBID I 8.39 $ 4,025.28 S 7.45 S 3,576.00 

7.60 S 91 .26 NO BID NO BID I 6.95 S 83.4( 

2.81 S 281.00 NOBID NO BID I 3.47 S 347.00 

NO BID NOBIO I 451 .60 S 7,225.57 S 322.57 $ 5,161.12 

35.54 S 355.44 NO BID NO BIO I 44.65 $ 44650 

10.39 S 51 .94 S 229.39 $ 114.70 S 18.71 I 9355 

8.38 $ 41.90 $ 143.01 $ 71 .51 S 901 S 45.05 

396.97 $ 2,381 .82 I 409.54 S 2,457.25 S 301.48 S 1,608.81 

8.42 S 1,473.19 NO BID NO BID I 9.80 S 1,715.00 

26.05 I 625.19 S 53.48 S 1,283.52 $ 33.31 I 799.44 

NO BIO NOBIO $ 8.23 S 164.64 $ 4.09 S 81.80 

21 .21 S 508.98 S 35.60 $ 854.45 S 22.62 S 542.88 

5.99 S 59 90 S 7.00 S 70.00 I 5.88 S 58.8C 

4.83 $ 96.63 NO BID NOBID $ 21.76 S 43.52 

12.13 $ 72.77 S 16.67 S 100.04 $ 12.48 $ 74.88 

51.63 S 774.52 S 76.76 $ 1,151 .43 $ 52.98 S 794.70 

3.14 S 125.56 NOBID NO BIO $ 3.91 $ 156.40 

2.98 $ 74.60 S 3.50 S 87.50 S 2.94 S 73.50 

2.98 S 74.60 $ 3.50 S 87.50 S 2.94 S 73.50 



Opened: July20, 2018 

Foc AMoal Contract for Veterina,y S~plies 

6100010480 VF 
FECA-t,EO PRE-MIXED SOLUTION 

5 gallon, VetOne 601038 1 each 13 
1-GLO FLUORESCElN SODIUM OPHTHALMIC 
STRIPS 

6 JooetJ1191 100 box 3 

MICROSCOPE COVER SLIPS, GIASS 

7 22mmx22mm 160 bo, 45 

MICROSCOPE SLIDES, 3' x 1', CLEAR, 

8 Henry Schein Private Label 037993 72 box 62 

PET PILLERS, WHITE WITH BlUE TIPS 

9 Jorgensen labs ..Kl384 12 pack 4 

10 PILL ENVELOPE 1000 box 2 

11 POVIDONE IODINE SOLUTION 7.5%, gallon jug 1 1 galbnjug 16 

12 DIGITAL THERMOMETER PROBE COVERS 250 box 10 

TONGUE DEPRESSORS, 6" LENGTH, SMOOTH 
13 EDGED, Patterson Private L!lbet PV..J588 500 box 12 

WITNESS CANINE HEARTWORM PF ANTIGEN 

14 TEST, Zoetis 3205 10 box 350 

GROUP 2: CATALOG DISCOUNT FOR ITEMS NOT IN GROUP 1 

TERMS 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL AWARD 

DELETED: ITEMS E1-E5, G2, G13, K1, L 12, L24, ll5, l30, L41 , l62, LU, L70, L71 , L72, L73, 
L74, l81, L82 Tie Bids 
OElffiD: ITEM l11, Received No Bids 

NAS: MILLER VET; DID NOT SIGN BID 

CITY OF SAN ANTONIO 
BID TABULATION 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

lnlE!fYel Inc. cl>a Merci( Animal Health Mi~est Vetema,y Supply Inc. 
2000 Ganoping Hil Rd. 21467 Holyoke Ave 

Kenilworth, Lakevine, 
NJ 07033 MN 55044 

512-507-8134 952-894-4350 

NO BIO NOBIO S 6.70 $ 87,10 $ 

NO BID NOBID I 9.20 $ 27.60 S 

NO BIO NOBIO S 207 S 149.04 S 

NO BID NOBID I 2.28 $ 141 .36 $ 

NO BIO NOBID S 10.21 $ 40.84 

NO BIO NO BIO S 16.09 $ 32 .18 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 20.57 $ 329,12 $ 

NO BID NO BID S 903 $ 90.30 S 

NO BID NO BIO I 3.90 $ 46.80 $ 

NO BIO NO BID S 83.13 I 11 ,638.20 

NOBID NOBIO 

NET30 NET30 

$0.00 I 70,114.76 

9 Of 9 

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL 

MWIAnimal Health NAO Glob• Health ll~I Patterson Vet S~ly 
3041 W Pasadena Drive 700 Gemini St, Ste 200 822 7th Stree~ Ste 740 

Boise, Houston, Greeley, 
!083705 TX 77058 co 80632-1240 

208-955-9547 281-886-7876 210-491-8703 

6,24 $ 81 .12 NO BIO NO BIO I 6,36 S 82.68 

9.60 $ 28.81 s 11 .20 $ 33.60 $ 1200 $ 36.00 

3.58 S 257.59 $ 2.52 S 113.40 $ 3.04 $ 218.88 

2.19 $ 135.76 NOBIO NOBIO S 2.44 $ 151 .28 

NOBIO NO BID $ 15.68 S 62.72 $ 13.18 $ 52,72 

17,40 $ 69.59 NO BID NO BID $ 16.47 $ 32.94 

18.54 $ 296.67 S 26.50 S 42403 $ 19.74 $ 315.84 

5.68 I 142.12 $ 22.53 I 112.63 $ 9.25 $ 92.50 

3,94 $ 47.27 $ 8.95 I 107.35 $ 3.53 $ 42.36 

NOBIO NOBIO NOBIO NO BIO $ 252.00 I 8,82000 

NOBIO NOBIO NO BID 

NET30 NET3C NET30 

I 36,991 .28 I 9,257.51 I 265,818.62 



City of San Antonio 
Bid Tabulation 

Opened: November 9, 2018 

For: Annual Contract for Feline and Canine Biologicals for ACS 

6100010938 

Item Description 

1 Nobivac 1-DAPPV, Item# 065288 
Unit Cost 
Total Cost 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Tray 

2 Nobivac 3-Rabies, Item # 065448 
Unit Cost 
Total Cost 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer PartNumber 
Quantity per Tray 

3 Nobivac Feline 1-HCPCh, Item# 065266 
Unit Cost 
Total Cost 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Tray 

4 Nobivac lntra-Trac-3, Item# 065313 
Unit Cost 
Total Cost 
Manufacturer Name 
Manufacturer Part Number 
Quantity per Tray 

Terms 

Estimated Annual Total 
Estimated Annual Award 

Page 1 of 1 

Non-Local 
lntervet, Inc., 
dba Merck Animal Health 

VF 2000 Galloping Hill Rd . 

Estimated Kinilworth , 
Annual NJ 07033 

Quantity 800-521-5767 

432 $69.50 
$30,024.00 
lntervet Inc 

065288 
25 Dose per Tray 

480 $51 .50 
$24,720.00 
lntervet Inc 

065448 
50 Dose per Tray 

384 $53.25 
$20,448.00 
lntervet Inc 

065266 
25 Dose per Tray 

576 $68.00 
$39,168.00 
lntervet Inc 

065313 
25 Dose per Tray 

Net 30 

$114,360.00 
$114,360.00 


