City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Description: Executive Level: Final Size 8.5" x 11" 28#
Cranes Crest, fluorescent white, gold foil embossed (7/8 left
to right - 1 3/16 top to bottom), art file & die to be provided by
Citv. 500 sheets per box.

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American |Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated |San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
A LETTERHEAD
Description: Final Size 8.5" x 11" 24# Chadwick Bond or
similar, arctic white, 25% cotton with watermark, 500 sheets
per box.
1 One sided, Black or 1 Pantone Matching System (PMS) color
ink to be determined, tight registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 50 $42.00 $54.00 $58.50 $55.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $2,100.00 $2,700.00 $2,925.00 $2,750.00
2 One sided, 2 PMS color ink, to be determined, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 50 $47.00 $65.00 $67.00 $65.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $2,350.00 $3,250.00 $3,350.00 $3,250.00
3 One sided, Full color ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 25 $52.00 $65.00 $67.00 $67.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,300.00 $1,625.00 $1,675.00 $1,675.00
Description: Executive Level: Final Size 8.5" x 11" 28#
Cranes Crest, fluorescent white, 500 sheets per box.
4 One sided, Black or 1 Pantone Matching System (PMS) color
ink to be determined, tight registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 25 $92.00 $129.00 $144.50 $90.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $2,300.00 $3,225.00 $3,612.50 $2,250.00
5 One sided, 2 PMS color ink, to be determined, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 10 $99.00 $139.00 $149.00 $114.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $990.00 $1,390.00 $1,490.00 $1,140.00
6 One sided, Full color ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 5 $62.00 $139.00 $155.60 $165.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $310.00 $695.00 $778.00 $825.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity |210-692-1927 210-732-3232 |210-341-5904 |210-690-8338
7 One sided, Black or 1 Pantone Matching System (PMS) color
ink to be determined, tight registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 25 $247.00 $229.00 $285.90 $160.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $6,175.00 $5,725.00 $7,147.50 $4,000.00
8 One sided, 2 PMS color ink, to be determined, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 10 $252.00 $239.00 $296.85 $215.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $2,520.00 $2,390.00 $2,968.50 $2,150.00
9 One sided, Full color ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Box 5 $270.00 $239.00 $307.15 $335.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,350.00 $1,195.00 $1,535.75 $1,675.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY A $19,395.00 $22,195.00 $25,482.25 $19,715.00
B NOTEPADS
1 Description: Notepads/Stationary, 8.5” x 5.5, 24# Chadwick
Bond, or similar, arctic white, 25% cotton with watermark, 500
sheets per box,
10 One sided, Black or 1 PMS color ink to be determined, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Pad 50 $26.00 $20.00 $32.20 $27.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,300.00 $1,000.00 $1,610.00 $1,350.00
11 One sided, 2 PMS color ink, to be determined, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Pad 50 $27.50 $25.00 $33.40 $33.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,375.00 $1,250.00 $1,670.00 $1,650.00
12 One sided, two color ink to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/ bleeds
Unit Price per Pad 50 $27.62 $25.00 $45.35 $40.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,381.00 $1,250.00 $2,267.50 $2,000.00
13 One sided, Full color ink, tight registration w/o bleeds
Unit Price per Pad 25 $28.00 $30.00 $34.65 $33.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $700.00 $750.00 $866.25 $825.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY B $4,756.00 $4,250.00 $6,413.75 $5,825.00
C BUSINESS CARDS

DELETED*
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
D ENVELOPES
Description: No Window Envelopes #10, 24 Ib White Wove
Envelopes. Finished product must comply with USPS
specifications. 500 per box.
62 Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink to be determined by requestor,
tight registration w/o bleeds.
Unit price per Box 100 $30.00 $25.00 $28.50 $20.72
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $3,000.000 $2,500.00 $2,850.00 $2,072.00
63 Two color ink 2/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 50 $32.00 $40.00 $44.30 $46.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,600.00 $2,000.00 $2,215.00 $2,300.00
64 Full color ink 4/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 10 $64.00 $60.00 $51.60 $85.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $640.00 $600.00 $516.00 $850.00
Description: Window Envelopes #10, 24 Ib White Wove
Envelopes. Finished product must comply with USPS
specifications. 500 per box.
65 Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink to be determined by requestor,
tight registration w/o bleeds.
Unit price per Box 200 $31.00 $27.00 $29.15 $20.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $6,200.00 $5,400.00 $5,830.00 $4,000.00
66 Two color ink 2/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 50 $33.00 $45.00 $44.00 $45.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,650.00 $2,250.00 $2,200.00 $2,250.00
67 Full color ink 4/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 10 $66.00 $65.00 $54.00 $80.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $660.00 $650.00 $540.00 $800.00
Description: No Window Envelopes #9, 24 Ib White Wove
Envelopes. Finished product must comply with USPS
specifications. 500 per box.
68 Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink to be determined by requestor,
tight registration w/o bleeds.
Unit price per Box 100 $30.00 $24.00 $35.00 $19.00
Extended Price (Unit price x guantity) $3,000.00 $2,400.00 $3,500.00 $1,900.00

3/13



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
69 Two color ink 2/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 50 $32.00 $40.00 $43.00 $45.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,600.00 $2,000.00 $2,150.00 $2,250.00
70 Full color ink 4/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 10 $64.00 $65.00 $40.00 $78.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $640.00 $650.00 $400.00 $780.00
Description: Executive Level: No Window Envelopes #10, 28
Ib Cranes Crest, Fluorescent White. Gold foil embossed (3/4
left to right - 1 1/16 top to bottom). Art file and die to be
provided bv Citv. 500 per box.
65 Black or 1 PMS Color 1/0 ink to be determined by requestor,
tight registration w/o bleeds.
Unit price per Box 200 $306.50 $225.00 $197.00 $177.50
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $61,300.00 $45,000.00 $39,400.00 $35,500.00
66 Two color ink 2/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 50 $325.00 $240.00 $197.00 $220.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $16,250.00 $12,000.00 $9,850.00 $11,000.00
67 Full color ink 4/0 to be determined by requestor, tight
registration w/o bleeds
Unit price per Box 10 $360.00 $260.00 $197.00 $358.00
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $3,600.00 $2,600.00 $1,970.00 $3,580.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY D $100,140.00 $78,050.00 $71,421.00 $67,282.00
E FORMS/FLYERS/SELF-MAILERS
Description: Forms/Flyers Final size 8.5" x 11" white 70 Ib
Bond, One sided, black ink or 1 PMS color TBD w/o bleed
68 Form
Unit price per 8.5x11 sheet 10,000 $0.07 $0.10 $0.16 $0.06
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $700.00 $1,000.00 $1,600.00 $600.00
Description: Forms/Flyers Final size 8.5" x 11" white 70 Ib
Bond, One sided, 2 PMS color ink TBD w/o full bleed
69 Form
Unit price per 8.5x11 sheet 10,000 $0.75 $0.11 $0.16 $0.07
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $7,500.00 $1,100.00 $1,600.00 $700.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
Description: Forms/Flyers final size 8.5 x 11, white 70 Ib bond,
one sided, 2 PMS color ink TBD with full bleed
70 Form
Unit price per 8.5x11 sheet 10,000 $0.10 $0.10 $0.18 $0.07
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,800.00 $700.00
Description: Forms/Flyers Final size 8.5" x 11" white 70 Ib
Bond, 2 sided, 2 PMS color TBD w/o full bleed
71 Form
Unit price per 8.5x11 sheet 10,000 $0.10 $0.13 $0.29 $0.085
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,000.00 $1,300.00 $2,900.00 $850.00
Description: Forms/Flyers Final size 8.5" x 11" white 70 Ib
Bond, 2 sided, full color PMS ink TBD w/o full bleed
72 Form
Unit price per 8.5x11 sheet 250,000 $0.0713 $0.13 $0.29 $0.0394
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $17,825.00 $32,500.00 $72,500.00 $9,850.00
Description: Forms/Flyers Final size 8.5" x 11" white 70 Ib
Bond, 2 sided, full color PMS ink TBD with full bleed
73 Form
Unit price per 8.5x11 sheet 250,000 $0.0713 $0.13 $0.31 $0.0394
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $17,825.00 $32,500.00 $77,500.00 $9,850.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY E $45,850.00 $69,400.00 $157,900.00 $22,550.00
F NCR FORMS
Description: Finish size 8.5" x 11", carbon-less paper, one
sided one color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
74 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.13 $0.18 $0.45 $0.1220
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $3,250.00 $4,500.00 $11,250.00 $3,050.00
75 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.19 $0.27 $0.66 $0.1941
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $4,750.00 $6,750.00 $16,500.00 $4,852.50
76 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.29 $0.38 $0.83 $0.2640
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $14,500.00 $19,000.00 $41,500.00 $13,200.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
2 Description: Finish size 8.5" x 11", carbon-less paper, one
sided two color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
77 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.14 $0.18 $0.45 $0.1276
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $3,500.00 $4,500.00 $11,250.00 $3,190.00
78 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.20 $0.27 $0.66 $0.2014
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $5,000.00 $6,750.00 $16,500.00 $5,035.00
79 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.30 $0.38 $0.83 $0.2712
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $15,000.00 $19,000.00 $41,500.00 $13,560.00
3 Description: Finish size 8.5" x 11", carbon-less paper, two
sided, one color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
80 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.19 $0.25 $0.73 $0.1537
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $4,750.00 $6,250.00 $18,250.00 $3,842.50
81 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.24 $0.34 $1.08 $0.2412
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $6,000.00 $8,500.00 $27,000.00 $6,030.00
82 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.33 $0.45 $1.38 $0.3256
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $16,500.00 $22,500.00 $69,000.00 $16,280.00
4 Description: Finish size 8.5" x 11", carbon-less paper, Two
Sided, Two color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
83 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.20 $0.25 $0.73 $0.1626
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $5,000.00 $6,250.00 $18,250.00 $4,065.00
84 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.25 $0.34 $1.08 $0.2526
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $6,250.00 $8,500.00 $27,000.00 $6,315.00
85 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.33 $0.45 $1.38 $0.3366
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $16,500.00 $22,500.00 $69,000.00 $16,830.00
5 Description: Finish size 8.5" x 14", carbon-less paper, One

Sided, One color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
86 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.18 $0.14 $0.45 $0.1440
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $4,500.00 $3,500.00 $11,250.00 $3,600.00
87 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.26 $0.22 $0.70 $0.2309
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $6,500.00 $5,500.00 $17,500.00 $5,772.50
88 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.34 $0.30 $0.90 $0.3183
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $17,000.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $15,915.00
Description: Finish size 8.5" x 14", carbon-less paper, One
Sided, Two color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
89 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.19 $0.14 $0.45 $0.1502
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $4,750.00 $3,500.00 $11,250.00 $3,755.00
90 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.27 $0.22 $0.70 $0.2393
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $6,750.00 $5,500.00 $17,500.00 $5,982.50
91 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.35 $0.30 $0.90 $0.3267
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $17,500.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $16,335.00
Description: Finish size 8.5" x 14", carbon-less paper, Two
Sided, One color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
92 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.28 $0.21 $0.73 $0.1761
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $7,000.00 $5,250.00 $18,250.00 $4,402.50
93 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.40 $0.29 $1.12 $0.2789
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $10,000.00 $7,250.00 $28,000.00 $6,972.50
94 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.53 $0.37 $1.44 $0.3810
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $26,500.00 $18,500.00 $72,000.00 $19,050.00
Description: Finish size 8.5" x 14", carbon-less paper, Two
Sided, Two color PMS TBD, without bleed, padded
95 Two Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.29 $0.21 $0.73 $0.1858
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $7,250.00 $5,250.00 $18,250.00 $4,645.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
96 Three Part
Unit price per set 25,000 $0.41 $0.29 $1.12 $0.2913
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $10,250.00 $7,250.00 $28,000.00 $7,282.50
97 Four Part
Unit price per set 50,000 $0.54 $0.37 $1.44 $0.3933
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $27,000.00 $18,500.00 $72,000.00 $19,665.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY F $246,000.00 $245,000.00 $751,000.00 $209,627.50
G BROCHURES
Description: Flat Size 8.5"x11", 80 Ib. Gloss Text, Two sided,
Fold TBD
98 One Color, With Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.134 $0.15 $0.36 $0.059
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $3,350.00 $3,750.00 $9,000.00 $1,475.00
99 One Color, Without Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.132 $0.15 $0.36 $0.059
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $3,300.00 $3,750.00 $9,000.00 $1,475.00
100 Two Color, With Bleed 25,000 $0.144 $0.15 $0.36 $0.0608
Unit Price $3,600.00 $3,750.00 $9,000.00 $1,520.00
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity)
101 Two Color, Without Bleed 25,000 $0.142 $0.15 $0.36 $0.0608
Unit Price $3,550.00 $3,750.00 $9,000.00 $1,520.00
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity)
102 Full Color, With Bleed 25,000 $0.185 $0.15 $0.36 $0.0622
Unit Price $4,625.00 $3,750.00 $9,000.00 $1,555.00
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity)
103 Full Color, Without Bleed 25,000 $0.18 $0.15 $0.36 $0.0622
Unit Price $4,500.00 $3,750.00 $9,000.00 $1,555.00
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity)
Description: Flat Size 8.5"x14", 80 Ib. Gloss Text, Two sided,
Fold TBD
104 One Color, With Bleed 25,000 $0.185 $0.25 $0.59 $0.0810
Unit Price $4,625.00 $6,250.00 $14,750.00 $2,025.00
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity)
105 One Color, Without Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.18 $0.25 $0.59 $0.0810
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $4,500.00 $6,250.00 $14,750.00 $2,025.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
106 Two Color, With Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.195 $0.25 $0.59 $0.0831
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $4,875.00 $6,250.00 $14,750.00 $2,077.50
107 Two Color, Without Bleed 25,000 $0.19 $0.25 $0.59 $0.0831
Unit Price $4,750.00 $6,250.00 $14,750.00 $2,077.50
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity)
108 Full Color, With Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.235 $0.25 $0.59 $0.0844
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $5,875.00 $6,250.00 $14,750.00 $2,110.00
109 Full Color, Without Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.23 $0.25 $0.59 $0.0844
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $5,750.00 $6,250.00 $14,750.00 $2,110.00
Description: Flat Size 11"x17", 80 Ib. Gloss Text, Two sided,
Fold TBD
110 One Color, With Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.205 $0.30 $0.90 $0.0888
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $5,125.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,220.00
111 One Color, Without Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.20 $0.30 $0.90 $0.0888
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,220.00
112 Two Color, With Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.215 $0.30 $0.90 $0.0909
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $5,375.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,272.50
113 Two Color, Without Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.21 $0.30 $0.90 $0.0909
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $5,250.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,272.50
114 Full Color, With Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.255 $0.30 $0.90 $0.0917
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $6,375.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,292.50
115 Full Color, Without Bleed 25,000
Unit Price $0.25 $0.30 $0.90 $0.0917
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $6,250.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2,292.50
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY G $86,675.00 $105,000.00 $277,500.00 $35,095.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
H FOLDERS
Description: Flat Size 19.5"x16", Finished size 9"x12", 100 Ib
Silk Cover (or approved equal), One Sided, 4/0, 2 Standard
Pockets 4" alued, includes 2 business cards slits
116 Per Folder, Without UV/Aqueous Coat 25,000 No Bid No Bid $0.2951
Unit Price $5.50 $0.2951
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $137,500.00 $7,377.50
117 Per Folder, With UV/Agqueous Coat 25,000
Unit Price $6.00 $0.3013
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $150,000.00 $7,532.50
Description: Flat Size 19.5"x16", Finished Size 9"x12", 100 Ib
Silk Cover (or approved equal) Two Sided, 4/4, 2 Standard
Pockets 4" alued, Includes 2 business cards slits
118 Per Folder, Without UV/Aqueous Coat 25,000
Unit Price $7.50 $0.3289
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $187,500.00 $8,222.50
119 Per Folder, With UV/Aqueous Coat 25,000
Unit Price $8.00 $0.3416
Extended Price (Unit Price x Quantity) $200,000.00 $8,540.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY H $675,000.00 $31,672.50
I DOOR HANGERS
Description: Finished Size 4.25"x11", and White 100 |b Cover No Bid
Stock, Two Sided, Four Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped,
Full Bleed
120 Per Door Hanger without UV/Agqueous Coat
Unit price 10,000 $0.079 $0.19 $0.0850
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $790.00 $1,900.00 $850.00
121 With UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 15,000 $0.07 $0.230 $0.075
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,050.00 $3,450.00 $1,125.00
Description: Finished Size, 4.25” X 14”, White 100 Ib Cover,
Two Sided, Four Color Process, Die Cut and wrapped, Full
Bleed.
122 Per Door Hanger without UV/Agqueous Coat
Unit price 10,000 $0.122 No Bid $0.11
Extended Price (Unit price x qguantity) $1,220.00 $1,100.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
123 With UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 15,000 $0.115 $0.10
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,725.00 $1,500.00
Description: Finished Size 4.25” X 17”7, and White 100 Ib
Cover Two Sided, Four Color Process, and Die Cut and
wrapped, Full Bleed
124 Per Door Hanger without UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 10,000 $0.126 No Bid $0.1160
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,260.00 $1,160.00
125 With UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 15,000 $0.12 No Bid $0.1065
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,800.00 $1,597.50
Description: Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 117, 110 |b
Color Cover Stock, Two Sided Black ink, Die Cut and
wrapped, Full Bleed
126 Per Door Hanger without UV/Aqueous coat
Unit price 10,000 $0.096 $0.23 $0.0854
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $960.00 $2,300.00 $854.00
127 With UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 15,000 $0.091 $0.28 $0.0791
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,365.00 $4,200.00 $1,186.50
Description: Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 14”, 110 Ib
Color Cover Stock, Two Sided Black ink, Die Cut and
wrapped, Full Bleed
128 Per Door Hanger without UV/Agueous coat
Unit price 10,000 $0.123 No Bid $0.1171
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,230.00 $1,171.00
129 With UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 15,000 $0.115 No Bid $0.1126
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,725.00 $1,689.00
Description: Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.25” X 17”7, 110 Ib
Color Cover Stock, Two Sided Black ink, Die Cut and
wrapped, Full Bleed
130 Per Door Hanger without UV/Aqueous coat
Unit price 10,000 $0.135 No Bid $0.1179
Extended Price (Unit price x guantity) $1,350.00 $1,179.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity 210-692-1927 210-732-3232 210-341-5904 210-690-8338
131 With UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 15,000 $0.125 No Bid $0.114
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $1,875.00 $1,710.00
Description: Door Hanger, Finished Size 4.375” X 13", 100 Ib
Gloss Cover Stock, Two Sided 4/4, Die Cut and wrapped
(each version/zone boxed and labeled), Full Bleed
132 Per Door Hanger without UV/Agueous coat
Unit price 500,000 $0.058 No Bid $0.045
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $29,000.00 $22,500.00
133 With UV/Aqueous Coat
Unit price 500,000 $0.064 No Bid $0.045
Extended Price (Unit price x quantity) $32,000.00 $22,500.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY | $77,350.00 $60,122.00
J WIDE FORMAT
DELETED*
K LABOR RATE AND ADDITIONAL SERVICES BASED ON
8.5" X 11" SHEET
169 Formatting
Price Per Hour 10 $25.00 $20.00 $30.00 No Bid
Extended Price $250.00 $200.00 $300.00
170 Folding
Price Per Mil 25 $10.00 $9.00 $13.00
Extended Price $250.00 $225.00 $325.00
171 Scoring
Price Per Mil 25 $8.50 $17.50 $20.00
Extended Price $212.50 $437.50 $500.00
172 Numbering
Price Per Mil 25 $20.00 $17.50 $12.00
Extended Price $500.00 $437.50 $300.00
173 Perforating
Price Per Mil 25 $10.00 $17.50 $18.00
Extended Price $250.00 $437.50 $450.00
174 Collating
Price Per Mil 25 $15.00 $12.50 $8.00
Extended Price $375.00 $312.50 $200.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Supplemental Printing Services
LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL
Cellisco dba Lopez Printing, |Rush American [Smith Print
Accu-print Inc Printing, Inc.
3503 Crosspoint (427 Lombrano [10912 Wye St. |333 Burnet St
6100010882 HH
Estimated [San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Description Annual |TX 78217 TX 78207 TX 78217 TX 78202
Category Quantity |[210-692-1927 210-732-3232 |210-341-5904 |210-690-8338
175 Die Cut
Price Per Mil 25 $40.00 $30.00 $35.00
Extended Price $1,000.00 $750.00 $875.00
176 Cutting
Price Per Mil 25 $10.00 $5.00 $10.00
Extended Price $250.00 $125.00 $250.00
177 Punching
Price Per Mil 25 $5.00 $5.00 $4.00
Extended Price $125.00 $125.00 $100.00
178 Padding
Price Per Mil 25 $20.00 $20.00 $8.00
Extended Price $500.00 $500.00 $200.00
179 Coil Binding
Price Per Mil 25 $15.00 $12.50 $20.00
Extended Price $375.00 $312.50 $500.00
180 Shrink Wrap
Price Per Mil 25 $10.00 $12.50 $3.00
Extended Price $250.00 $312.50 $75.00
181 Inserting
Price Per Mil 25 $12.00 $8.00 $5.00
Extended Price $300.00 $200.00 $125.00
182 Stapling
Price Per Mil 25 $15.00 $20.00 $15.00
Extended Price $375.00 $500.00 $375.00
183 Graphics
Price Per Hour 10 $40.00 $30.00 $30.00
Extended Price $400.00 $300.00 $300.00
184 UV Coating
Price Per Mil 25 $40.00 $249.00 $40.00
Extended Price $1,000.00 $6,225.00 $1,000.00
SUBTOTAL CATEGORY K $6,412.50 $11,400.00 $5,875.00
Prompt Payment Discount Net 30 2%, 10 Days Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $1,261,578.50 $535,295.00| $1,295,592.00| $451,889.00
Estimated Annual Award $19,395.00 $4,250.00 $5,875.00| $426,349.00

Categories C & J: Deleted and will be rebid at a later date.
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