City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company [Western BRW - Bosworth
. . . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated [San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity [210-599-9600 877-274-0968
1 RECYCLED
la 100% Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper
la.l 8.5x 11 1,141 $47.60 $48.90
Manufacturer Boise Aspen Rolland Enviro 100
Manufacturer P/N 582659 5101
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $54,311.60 $55,794.90
la.2 8.5x 14 119 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer
Manufacturer P/N
Weight
# of Reams per Case
Price Total
la.3 11x 17 198 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer
Manufacturer P/N
Weight
# of Reams per Case
Price Total
1b 30% Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper
1b.1 85x 11 4,256 $36.30 $41.25
Manufacturer Boise Essential Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 517012 3160
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $154,492.80 $175,560.00
1b.2 8.5 x 11 3-Hole Punched 14 No Bid $47.40
Manufacturer Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 3161
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $663.60
1b.3 8.5x 14 119 $51.89 $57.80
Manufacturer International Paper|| Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 517010 3162
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $6,174.91 $6,878.20
1b.4 11x 17 198 $41.91 $45.45
Manufacturer International Paper]] Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 517003 3163
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 5 10
Price Total $8,298.18 $8,999.10
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company [Western BRW - Bosworth
. . . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated |San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity [210-599-9600 877-274-0968
1c 30% Recycled Multi-Purpose Colored
lc.1 8.5 x 11 Blue 26 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81199
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $1,144.00
1c.2 8.5 x 11 Cherry 13 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81205
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $572.00
1c.3 8.5 x 11 Goldenrod 13 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81203
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $572.00
1c.4 8.5 x 11 Green 18 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81197
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $792.00
1c.5 8.5x 11 Ivory 39 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81201
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $1,716.00
1c.6 8.5 x 11 Pink 4 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81198
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $176.00
1c.7 8.5 x 11 Salmon 34 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81206
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $1,496.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company [Western BRW - Bosworth
. . . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated [San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity [210-599-9600 877-274-0968
1c.8 8.5x 11 Yellow 20 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81196 - Canary
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $880.00
2 NON-RECYCLED
2a Non-Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper
2a.l 8.5x 11 15 $30.51 $36.80
Manufacturer International Paper| Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 516329 2750
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $457.65 $552.00
2a.2 8.5 x 11 3-Hole Punched 10 $33.76 $39.10
Manufacturer Glatfelter Go! Copy, Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 58262034 2751
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $337.60 $391.00
2a.3 8.5x 14 15 $43.94 $49.75
Manufacturer Glatfelter Go! Copy,| Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 58262032 2752
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $659.10 $746.25
2a.4 11x 17 10 $32.63 $39.10
Manufacturer Glatfelter Go! Copy,| Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 58262033 2753
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 5 5
Price Total $326.30 $391.00
2b Multi-Use Premium Copy Paper
2b.1 8.5x 11 25 $30.83 / $5.138333* $52.96 / $6.620000*
Manufacturer (150 reams) Boise Polaris Domtar Lynx Opaque
Manufacturer P/N 586602 630800
Weight 28 28
# of Reams per Case 6 8
Price Total $770.75 $993.00
3 INDEX CARD STOCK
3a Index Card Stock - White
3a.l 8.5x 11 20 $5.81 $6.90
Manufacturer (160 packs) Springhill Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 216900 81038
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $929.60 $1,104.00
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company [Western BRW - Bosworth
. . . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated [San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity [210-599-9600 877-274-0968
3a.2 11x 14 1 $16.24 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 216500
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $129.92
3a.3 11x 17 2 $12.22 $14.44
Manufacturer (16 packs) Springhill Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 216500 81208
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $195.52 $231.04
3a.4 12 x 18 1 $21.90 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 216902
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $175.20
3a.5 13x 19 2 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer (16 packs)
Manufacturer P/N
Weight
# of Sheets per Pack
Price Total
4 INDEX CARD STOCK
4da Index Card Stock - Colors
4a.1 8.5 x 11, Blue 1 $6.11 $7.22
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 215900 81048
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $48.88 $57.76
4a.2 11 x 14, Blue 1 $20.95 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 216700
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $167.60
4a.3 8.5 x 11, Buff 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215907
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company [Western BRW - Bosworth
. . . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated [San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity [210-599-9600 877-274-0968
4a.4 8.5 x 11, Canary 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215906
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.5 8.5x 11, Cherry 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215901
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.6 8.5x 11, Green 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215904
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.7 8.5 x 11, Grey 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215903
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.8 8.5 x 11, Ivory 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215902
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.9 8.5x 11, Salmon 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215905
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
Payment Terms 1% Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $227,817.77 $8,011.60
Estimated Annual Award $227,817.77 $8,011.60

*Adjusted for Evaluation Purposes only
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