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ORDINANCE 2019-05-09 (0378

APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS ESTABLISHING UNIT
PRICES FOR GOODS AND SERVICES FOR AN ESTIMATED ANNUAL
COST OF $471,000.00, AVAILABLE AND INCLUDED IN THE
RESPECTIVE DEPARTMENTS’ FY 2019 ADOPTED BUDGETS: (A) SUN
BADGE COMPANY FOR SAPD BADGES; (B) CLAMPITT PAPER CO.
AND WESTERN BRW - BOSWORTH FOR COPIER PAPER AND CARD
STOCK; AND (C) HERC RENTALS, INC. FOR CONSTRUCTION
EQUIPMENT RENTALS.

& & & & b3

WHEREAS, the City is able to obtain significant savings by purchasing various materials and
services on an annual contract basis; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves the following contracts: (A) Sun Badge Company for
badges for the San Antonio Police Department (SAPD badges); (B) Clampitt Paper Co. and
Western BRW - Bosworth for copier paper and card stock; and (C) Herc Rentals, Inc. for
construction equipment rentals; and

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code section 271.102 provides for the City’s
participation in cooperative purchasing programs and such purchases satisfy any state law
requiring competitive bidding; and

WHEREAS, the bids submitted by Bankson Group LTD dba Alamo Tees, China Maple Leaf
Industrial Development Limited, Nardis Public Safety (Items 3-4.1, silver tone badges), and
Symbol Arts (Items 3-4.1, silver tone badges) failed to meet the City’s specifications and/or
requirements for SAPD badges; and

WHEREAS, this ordinance approves three low responsive bid contracts and one cooperative
purchasing program contract; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids to furnish the City with goods and services on an annual basis
as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent
upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and
endorsements: (A) Sun Badge Company for SAPD badges; (B) Clampitt Paper Co. and Western
BRW - Bosworth for copier paper and card stock; and (C) Herc Rentals, Inc. for construction
equipment rentals. The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all
purposes as Exhibit I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the
Purchasing Division of the Finance Department.
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SECTION 2. Funds will be encumbered upon issuance of purchase orders, and payment is
authorized to the vendors identified herein. All expenditures will be in accordance with the
Fiscal Year 2019 budget, and such other appropriations necessary to fund the contracts through
their terms as evidenced by subsequent ordinances.

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that the bids submitted by Bankson Group LTD
dba Alamo Tees, China Maple Leaf Industrial Development Limited, Nardis Public Safety
(Items 3-4.1, silver tone badges), and Symbol Arts (Items 3-4.1, silver tone badges) failed to
meet the City’s specifications and/or requirements for SAPD badges.

SECTION 4. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 9" day of May, 2019.

A Y
Ron Nirenberg
ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:
Teticia M. Vace Clty Clerk \ 7 /JMI‘GW S{govia, City Attorney



Agenda Item: 4 (in consent vote: 4,5,8,9,10,11,12,13)

Date: 05/09/2019

Time: 09:30:27 AM

Vote Type: Motion to Approve

Description: Ordinance approving the following contracts establishing unit prices for goods and services for an

estimated annual cost of $471,000.00, available and included in the respective departments' FY 2019
Adopted Budget: (A) Sun Badge Company for SAPD badges; (B) Clampitt Paper Company and
Western BRW - Bosworth for copier paper and card stock; and (C) Herc Rentals, Inc. for construction
equipment rentals. [Ben Gorzell, Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer,

Finance]
Result: Passed
Voter Group p Nt Yea Nay Abstain Motion Second
resent
Ron Nirenberg Mayor X
Roberto C. Trevifio District 1 X X
Art A. Hall District 2 X X
Rebecca Viagran District 3 X
Rey Saldafia District 4 X
Shirley Gonzales District 5 X
Greg Brockhouse District 6 X
Ana E. Sandoval District 7 X
Manny Pelaez District 8 X
John Courage District 9 X
X

Clayton H. Perry District 10
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Exhibit I



City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation Exhibit I
Opened: June 27, 2018 NAS NAS
Annual Contract For SAPD Badges NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Sun Badge Company Bankson Group LTD, DBA Celebrate Excellence China MapleLeaf, Industrial
. Alamo Tees Development Limited
RM 903, Duobao Mansion, No.
1 Building, Tangjiawan Rd.,
6100010393 AAS 2248 S. Baker Avenue 12814 Cogbumn Ave. 2130 Jackson Keller Rd. Tianning District
Estimated |Ontario San Antonio San Antonio Changzhou, Jiangsu
Item Description Annual [CA 91761 TX 78249 TX 78213 China 213003
Quantity |909-930-1444
1 Gold Tone - Badges For Supervisors 25
Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Iltem Number P14 CSTBADGE SAPD-01 ML-C066G
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12 -14
Price Each - Base Term $63.50 $20.95 $62.00 $23.80
Price Total $1,587.50] $523.75 $1,550.00 $595.00
1:1 Gold Tone - Badges For Supervisors 22
Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Item Number P14 CSTBADGE SAPD-01 ML-C066G
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12 -14
Price Each - Option Term $68.50] $20.95 $63.85 $24.80
Price Total $1,507.00) $460.90 $1,404.70 $545.60
2 Gold Tone - Hat Badges For Supervisors 25
Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Item Number P31 CSTBADGE SAPD-02 ML-C056G
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12-14
Price Each - Base Term $45.50 $19.50 $54.00 $19.80
Price Total $1,137.50] $487.50 $1,350.00 $495.00
2:1 Gold Tone - Hat Badges For Supervisors 22
Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Item Number P31 CSTBADGE SAPD-02 ML-C056G
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12-14
Price Each - Option Term $49.50 $19.50 $55.70 $20.80
Price Total $1,089.00) $429.00 $1,225.40 $457.60
3 Silver Tone - Badges For Officers And Investigators 110
Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Iltem Number P14 CSTBADGE SAPD-03 ML-C066S
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12 -14
Price Each - Base Term $63.50) $20.95 $63.90 $23.60
Price Total $6,985.00) $2,304.50 $7,029.00 $2,596.00
31 Silver Tone - Badges For Officers And Investigators 105
Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Item Number P14 CSTBADGE SAPD-03 ML-C066S
Metal Gauge 12] 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12 -14
Price Each - Option Term $68.50 $20.95 $65.80 $24.60
Price Total $7,192.50 $2,199.75 $6,909.00 $2,583.00
4 Silver Tone - Hat Badges For Officers And Investigators 110
Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Item Number P31 CSTBADGE SAPD-04 ML-C056G
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12-14
Price Each - Base Term $45.50 $19.50 $54.00 $18.80
Price Total $5,005.00] $2,145.00 $5,940.00 $2,068.00




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27,2018 NAS NAS
Annual Contract For SAPD Badges NON-LOCAL LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL

For: Sun Badge Company Bankson Group LTD, DBA Celebrate Excellence China MapleLeaf, Industrial

Alamo Tees Development Limited
RM 903, Duobao Mansion, No.
i 1 Building, Tangjiawan Rd.,
6100010393 AAS 2248 S. Baker Avenue 12814 Cogburn Ave. 2130 Jackson Keller Rd. Tianning District
Estimated |Ontario San Antonio San Antonio Changzhou, Jiangsu
Iltem Description Annual |CA 91761 TX 78249 TX 78213 China 213003
Quantity |909-930-1444
41 Silver Tone - Hat Badges For Officers And Investigators 105

Brand EACH Sun Badge Custom Custom Custom Made
Item Number P31 CSTBADGE SAPD-04 ML-C056G
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 Brass Alloy 0.10 12-14
Price Each - Option Term $49.50 $19.50 $55.70 $19.80
Price Total $5,197.50 $2,047.50 $5,848.50 $2,079.00
Delivery 45 Days 60 Days 60 Days 30 Days
Prompt Payment Discount % 1%, 10 Days| 0% 0% 0.005%
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 .005%, 20 Days
Total Cost $59,402.00 $21,195.80 $62,513.20 $22,838.40
Total Cost less Prompt Payment Discount $58,807.98 $22,826.98
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid NA NA 6.3% NA
LPP Price Differential NA NA $3,705.22 NA

Estimated Annual Award

$14,715.00




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

-0.059271002
Opened: June 27, 2018 NAS NAS
Annual Contract For SAPD Badges NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL OFFICE NON-LOCAL
For: Entenmann-Rovin, Company |GT Distributors, Inc. Nardis Public Safety Symbol Arts
6100010393 AAS 2425 Garfield Ave 2545 Brockton Drive, Suite 100 (4818 IH-10 East 6083 S. 1580 E
Estimated |Los Angeles, Austin San Antonio Ogden
Item Description Annual |CA 90040 TX 78758 TX 78219 UT 84405
Quantity
1 Gold Tone - Badges For Supervisors 25
Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VVH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number Custom made B2092 B2092 B-79D
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 12-14 3/32"
Price Each - Base Term $65.80 $61.47 $59.65 $51.75
Price Total $1,645.00 $1,536.75 $1,491.25 $1,293.75
11 Gold Tone - Badges For Supervisors 22
Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number Custom made B2092 B2092 B-79D
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 12-14 3/132"
Price Each - Option Term $65.80 $61.47 $59.65 $51.75
Price Total $1,447.60 $1,352.34 $1,312.30 $1,138.50
2 Gold Tone - Hat Badges For Supervisors 25
Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number Custom made B3411 B3411 B-37 BJ
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 12-14 3/32"
Price Each - Base Term $51.10 $48.67 $47.65 $37.75
Price Total $1,277.50 $1,216.75 $1,191.25 $943.75
2.1 Gold Tone - Hat Badges For Supervisors 22
Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number Custom made B3411 B3411 B-37BJ
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 1214 3/32"
Price Each - Option Term $51.10 $48.67 $47.65 $37.75
Price Total $1,124.20 $1,070.74 $1,048.30 $830.50
3 Silver Tone - Badges For Officers And Investigators 110 NAS NAS
Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number #242 Gold B2092 B2092 B-79D
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 12 -14 3/32"
Price Each - Base Term $62.30 $61.47 $59.65 $51.75
Price Total $6,853.00 $6,761.70 $6,561.50 $5,692.50
3.1 Silver Tone - Badges For Officers And Investigators 105 NAS NAS
Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number #242 Gold B2092 B2092 B-79D
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 12-14 3/32"
Price Each - Option Term $62.30 $61.47 $59.65 $51.75
Price Total $6,541.50 $6,454.35 $6,263.25 $5,433.75
4 Silver Tone - Hat Badges For Officers And Investigators 110 NAS NAS
Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number # 242 Silver B3411 B3411 B-37 BJ
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 1214 3/32"
Price Each - Base Term $65.80 $48.67 $47.65 $37.75
Price Total $7,238.00 $5,353.70 $5,241.50 $4,152.50




City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 27, 2018
Annual Contract For SAPD Badges NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL

For: Entenmann-Rovin, Company |GT Distributors, Inc. Nardis Public Safety Symbol Arts

6100010393 AAS 2425 Garfield Ave 2545 Brockton Drive, Suite 100 |4818 IH-10 East 6083 S. 1580 E

Estimated |Los Angeles, Austin San Antonio Ogden
Item Description Annual |CA 90040 TX 78758 TX 78219 UT 84405
Quantity
41 Silver Tone - Hat Badges For Officers And Investigators 106 NAS NAS

Brand EACH Entenmann-Rovin Blackinton VH Blackinton Symbol Arts
Item Number # 242 Silver B3411 B3411 B-37BJ
Metal Gauge 12 12-14 12-14 3/32"
Price Each - Option Term $65.80 $48.67 $47.65 $37.75
Price Total $6,909.00 $5,110.35 $5,003.25 $3,963.75
Delivery 30 Days 60 Days 45 Days 60 Days
Prompt Payment Discount % 0% 0% 0% 0%
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total Cost $66,071.60 $57,713.36 $56,225.20 $46,898.00
Total Cost less Prompt Payment Discount $66,071.60 $57,713.36 $56,225.20 $46,898.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
LPP Price Differential N/A N/A N/A N/A
Estimated Annual Award




City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company |Western BRW - Bosworth
p , ) 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated |San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity |210-599-9600 877-274-0968
1 RECYCLED
1a 100% Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper
1a.1 8.5x 11 1,141 $47.60 $48.90
Manufacturer Boise Aspen| Rolland Enviro 100
Manufacturer P/N 582659 5101
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $54,311.60 $55,794.90
1a.2 8.5x14 119 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer
Manufacturer P/N
Weight
# of Reams per Case
Price Total
1a.3 1M xA7 198 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer
Manufacturer P/N
Weight
# of Reams per Case
Price Total
1b 30% Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper
1b.1 8.5 x 11 4,256 $36.3(T|| $41.25
Manufacturer Boise Essential| Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 517012 3160
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $154,492.80 $175,560.00
1b.2 8.5 x 11 3-Hole Punched 14 No Bid $47.45€I
Manufacturer Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 3161
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $663.60
1.3  [85x14 119 $51.89 $57.80
Manufacturer International Paper]| Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 517010 3162
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10 10
Price Total $6,174.91 $6,878.20
1b.4 11 x17 198 $41.91 $45.45
Manufacturer International Paper| Domtar Husky Copy 30
Manufacturer P/N 517003 3163
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 5i 10
Price Total $8,298.18 $8,999.10
I
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company |Western BRW - Bosworth
. . . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated |San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity |210-599-9600 877-274-0968
1e 30% Recycled Multi-Purpose Colored
1cA 8.5 x 11 Blue 26 No Bid $44‘0(%]
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81199
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $1,144.00
1¢:2 8.5 x 11 Cherry 13 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice]
Manufacturer P/N 81205
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $572.00
1c.3 8.5 x 11 Goldenrod 13 No Bid $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice]
Manufacturer P/N 81203
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $572.00
1c.4 8.5 x 11 Green 18 No Bid $44.00}
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81197
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $792.00
1c.5 8.5 x 11 Ivory 39 No Bid| $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice]
Manufacturer P/N 81201
Weight 20|
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $1,716.00
1c.6 8.5 x 11 Pink 4 No Bid| $44.00
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice]
Manufacturer P/N 81198|
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10j
Price Total $176.00
17 8.5 x 11 Salmon 34 No Bid $44.00]
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81206
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10,
Price Total $1,496.00
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City of San Antonio

Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company |Western BRW - Bosworth
. ) y 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated |San Antonio, Austin,
Annual |TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity [210-599-9600 877-274-0968
1c.8  [8.5x 11 Yellow 20 No Bid $44‘06|
Manufacturer Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 81196 - Canary|
Weight 20
# of Reams per Case 10
Price Total $880.00
2 NON-RECYCLED
2a Non-Recycled Multi-Use Copy Paper
2aA1 8.5x 11 15 $30.51 $36.80
Manufacturer International Paper Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 516329 2750
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10j 10
Price Total $457.65 $552.00
2a.2 8.5 x 11 3-Hole Punched 10 $33.76 $39.10
Manufacturer Glatfelter Go! Copy| Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 58262034 2751
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10j 10
Price Total $337.60 $391.00
2a.3 8.5x 14 15 $43.94) $49.75
Manufacturer Glatfelter Go! Copy Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 58262032 ’ 2752
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 10j 10
Price Total $659.10 $746.25
2a.4 11 x17 10 $32.63 $39.10
Manufacturer Glatfelter Go! Copy| Domtar Copy
Manufacturer P/N 58262033 2753
Weight 20 20
# of Reams per Case 5 5
Price Total $326.30 $391.00
2b Multi-Use Premium Copy Paper
2b.1 8.5x11 25 $30.83 / $5.138333" $52.96 / $6.620000*
Manufacturer (150 reams) Boise Polaris Domtar Lynx Opaque
Manufacturer P/N 586602 630800
Weight 28 28
# of Reams per Case 6 8
Price Total $770.75 $993.00
3 INDEX CARD STOCK
3a Index Card Stock - White
3a.1 8.5x 11 20 $5.81 $6.90
Manufacturer (160 packs) Springhill Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 216900 81038
Weight 110 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $929.60 $1,104.00

Page 3 of 5



City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company |Western BRW - Bosworth
; i . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bidg 9, Suite 200
Estimated |San Antonio, Austin,
Annual [TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity [210-599-9600 877-274-0968
3a.2 11 x14 1 $16.24] No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 216500
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $129.92
3a.3 11 x17 2 $12.22 $14.44
Manufacturer (16 packs) Springhill Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 216500 81208
Weight 110, 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $195.52 $231.04
3a.4 12x18 1 $21.90 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 216902
Weight 110,
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $175.20
3a.5 13x19 2 No Bid No Bid
Manufacturer (16 packs)
Manufacturer P/N
Weight
# of Sheets per Pack
Price Total
4 INDEX CARD STOCK
4a Index Card Stock - Colors
4a.1 8.5 x 11, Blue 1 $6.11 $7.22
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill Domtar Earthchoice
Manufacturer P/N 215900 81048
Weight 110] 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250 250
Price Total $48.88 $57.76
4a.2 11 x 14, Blue 1 $20.95 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 216700
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $167.60
4a.3 8.5 x 11, Buff 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill p
Manufacturer P/N 215907
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88|
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 18, 2019
For: Annual Contract for Copier Paper and Card Stock Non-Local Non-Local
Clampitt Paper Company [Western BRW - Bosworth
) ) . 6301 E. Stassney Ln,
6100011187 VF 3550 Ridgeside Drive Bldg 9, Suite 200
Estimated |San Antonio, Austin,
Annual [TX 78217 TX 78744
Item Description Quantity |210-599-9600 877-274-0968
4a.4 8.5 x 11, Canary 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215906
Weight 110}
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.5 8.5 x 11, Cherry 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215901
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.6 8.5 x 11, Green 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215904
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.7 8.5 x 11, Grey 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215903
Weight 110]
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.8 8.5 x 11, Ivory 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215902
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88
4a.9 8.5 x 11, Salmon 1 $6.11 No Bid
Manufacturer (8 packs) Springhill
Manufacturer P/N 215905
Weight 110
# of Sheets per Pack 250
Price Total $48.88]
Payment Terms 1% Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $227,817.77 $8,011.60
Estimated Annual Award $227,817.77 $8,011.60

*Adjusted for Evaluation Purposes only
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 12, 2019 US Communities
For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
1 Aerial - Boom Lifts
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)]
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%)
2 Aerial - Platform Lifts
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
3 Aerial - Towable Manlifts
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
4 Aerial — Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)|
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
5 Air Filtration
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month
6 Air Moving Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
7 Air Moving Equipment - Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
8 Air Tools & Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%

Prepared by Purchasing 4/5/2019
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 12, 2019 US Communities
For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
9 Cable Power Temp
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
10 |Cleaning and Restoration
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
1 Climate & Heating Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
12 |Climate & Heating Equipment - Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
13 [Compaction Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price listf
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
14 |Compressors
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
15 |Concrete and Masonry Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
16 [Cranes
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
17  |Demolition Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

US Communities

HERC Rentals Inc.
668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,

TX 78219
210-661-4281

Opened: March 12, 2019
For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment
6100011200 AJ
Item Description
18 |Earth Moving Equipment - Tractors
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
19 |Earth Moving Equipment — Backhoe Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
20 |Earth Moving Equipment - Dozers
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
21 Earth Moving Equipment — Excavator Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
22 |Earth Moving Equipment — Excavators
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
23 |Earth Moving Equipment - Loader Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
24 |Earth Moving Equipment — Skidsteer Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
25 |Earth Moving Equipment - Tractor Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month
26 |Earth Moving Equipment — Wheel Loaders
Minimum Percent Discount Offered
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.:
published price list, catalog, etc.):
1-day
1-Week
1-Month

10%

minimum 10% discount from
our published price list]

10%

10%

10%

10%

minimum 10% discount from|
our published price list]

10%

10%

10%

10%,

minimum 10% discount from|
our published price list

10%)

10%)

10%

10%

minimum 10% discount from|
our published price list]

10%

10%

10%

10%

minimum 10% discount from
our published price list]

10%

10%

10%

10%

minimum 10% discount from
our published price list|

10%

10%

10%

10%

minimum 10% discount from
our published price list|

10%

10%

10%

10%

minimum 10% discount from|
our published price list

10%

10%

10%

10%

minimum 10% discount from
our published price list|

10%

10%

10%
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 12, 2019

US Communities

For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
27  |Earth Moving Equipment — Backhoes
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%]
1-Month 10%
28 |Earth Moving Equipment — Skidsteers
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
29 |Earth Moving Equipment — Track Loaders
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
30 |Floor Care and Surface Prep
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
31 Forklift Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
32 |Forklifts - Construction
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
33 |Forklifts — High Reach
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%)
34 |Forklifts - Industrial/Warehouse
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
35 |Fuel Tanks
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 12, 2019

US Communities

For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
36 |Generators
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
37 |Glass Installation
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%]
1-Week 10%)|
1-Month 10%]
38 |Ground Protection
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%)|
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%|
39 |Ground Support Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%!
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%!
1-Week 10%!
1-Month 10%]
40 |Landscaping
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%|
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)|
1-Month 10%!
41 Lighting Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
42 |Load Banks
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
43 |Motor Graders
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
44  |Paving Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 12, 2019 US Communities
For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
45 |Power Distribution
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)|
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%)
46 |Pumps and Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price IisH
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
47 |Saws and Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
48 |Scaffolding
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
49 [Small Tools — Air and Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
50 |Small Tools — Air Tools and Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%)
51 [Small Tools - Drill Equipment and Tools
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
52 |Small Tools - Electrical Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%)
53 |Small Tools — Grinding and Planning Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation
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Opened: March 12, 2019 US Communities
For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
54  [Small Tools — Hand Tools
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
55 |Small Tools — Hoist and Lifting Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%)
56 [Small Tools — Impact Wrenches and Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)]
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from)
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
57 |Small Tools — Ladders and Scaffold
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
58 |Small Tools — Miscellaneous
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
59 |Small Tools - Piping Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%)
60 [Small Tools - Sanding Equipment and Tools
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
61 Storage Trailers
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
62 |Surveillance
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%,
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 12, 2019

US Communities

For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
63 [Traffic Safety
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
64 |Trenching Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
65 |Trolleys
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
66 |Truck - Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%
Trucks — Box Dump, Flatstake, Flatbed, Utility,
67 |Water and Specialty
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)
68 |Utility Vehicles and Carts
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)|
1-Week 10%)|
1-Month 10%)
69 |Vehicles — Pickup Trucks, Vans, SUVs
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list|
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
70 |Vehicles - Trailers and Accessories
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%)
1-Week 10%
1-Month 10%
71 |Welding Equipment
Minimum Percent Discount Offered 10%)
Price Schedule on which discount is based (i.e.: minimum 10% discount from|
published price list, catalog, etc.): our published price list]
1-day 10%
1-Week 10%)
1-Month 10%)

Prepared by Purchasing 4/5/2019

Page 8



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 12, 2019 US Communities
For: Annual Contract Rental of Construction Equipment HERC Rentals Inc.
6100011200 AJ 668 N WW White Rd
San Antonio,
Item Description TX 78219
210-661-4281
72 |Delivery (per hour, per truck load, each way) $125.00
Payment Terms Net 30|
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